
Milk: Cases cannot exceed 50 cartons
Delivery multiple times weekly to the following kitchen sites: Bohn, Central, Freiler, 
Hirsch, Jacobson, Kelly, Kimball, McKinley, Monte Vista, North, Poet, South, Stein, 
Tracy High, Villalovoz, West High and Williams

Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit

Estimated  
Annual 
Usage

Price
Distributor

Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor

Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor

Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor

Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

 HOMOGENIZED,  CHOCOLATE, GRADE A, FAT-FREE, CARDBOARD CONTAINER 1/2 PINT 50  8 OZ CARTON 775,000 $0.37 160114 2 days $0.45 68031
Corrugated 

Cardboard 50ct
$15.56 203029 27/8OZ 2 Days NO BID

WE CAN NOT 
MEET DELV REQ

 HOMOGENIZED, WHITE, GRADE A, 1%, CARDBOARD CONTAINER, 1/2 PINT 50 8 OZ CARTON 375,000 $0.36 160088 2 days $0.45 67635
Corrugated 

Cardboard 50ct
$14.65 203000 27/8OZ 2 Days NO BID

WE CAN NOT 
MEET DELV REQ

Miscellaneous Dairy

SOUR CREAM,  LOW FAT 6 PINT CASE 500 $1.75 160189 2 days $2.65 356 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SOUR CREAM,  LOW FAT 2 5# CASE 5 $6.50 160180 2 days $8.80 SOCR5P 4/5# $9.73 305793 4/5LB 15 Days $8.50 5020193

Awarded Item = 

CRYSTAL 
CREAMERY

DAYLIGHT GOLD STAR SYSCODAIRY PRODUCTS



EVALUATION CRITERIA
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

CRYSTAL CREAMERY DAYLIGHT GOLD STAR SYSCO

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15 15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points)

20 20 5 5

Product Availability 
(30 points)

30 30 8 8

Price 
(35 points)

35 30 8 8

TOTAL 100 95 36 36

Daylight:
minus 5 points price

Gold Star:
minus 15 points product specs, 3 of 4 items not fresh product
minus 22 points product availabilty, do not offer 3 of the 4 items
minus 27 points price, prices quoted for 3 of the 4 items were for unequivalent product

Sysco:
minus 15 points product specs, 3 of 4 items no bid
minus 22 points product availabilty, cannot meet the delivery requirement for 3 of the 4 items bid
minus 27 points price, prices quoted for only 1 of the 4 items

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Fresh Milk Award Analysis



ITEMS
Estimated 

Usage
Size

Purchase 
Unit

Purchase 
Unit

Price
Distributor 

Product 
Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Extended 
Price

Price
Distributor 

Product 
Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Extended 
Price

Price
Distributor 

Product 
Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Extended 
Price

Price Distributor Product Code 
Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Extended 
Price

Price
Distributor 

Product 
Code 

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Extended 
Price

APPLE SLICES, FRESH, INDIVIDUAL BAGS TO EQUAL 1/2 CUP SERVING 750 100 2 OZ CASE  $  28.40 APPSL1SC $21,300.00 $25.37 7347256 $19,027.50 $25.97 800479 5 Days $19,477.50 $26.82 Apples, Sliced Red IW 1 week $20,115.00 $53.00 6473 N/A $39,750.00
APPLES, FRESH, FUJI, GALA, GRANNY SMITH, RED DELICIOUS, GOLDEN DELICIOUS, 138 CT 350 1 40# CASE  $  26.10 APPRS131 $9,135.00 $32.27 7192089 $11,294.50 $31.45 820017 5 Days $11,007.50 $28.67 Apples, Gala 163 ct/cs 40lb 1 week $10,034.50 $26.00 10237 N/A $9,100.00
APPLES, FRESH, FUJI, GALA, GRANNY SMITH, RED DELICIOUS, GOLDEN DELICIOUS, 198 CT 50 1 40# CASE  $  26.10 APPRS186 $1,305.00 $32.40 6303788 $1,620.00 $31.95 820021 5 Days $1,597.50 $28.67 Apples, Gala 1 week $1,433.50 $26.00 6586 N/A $1,300.00
BANANA, CONVENTIONAL, 3-4 COLOR 800 1 40# CASE  $  23.10 BANGT $18,480.00 $26.21 1158542 $20,968.00 $21.74 820059 5 Days $17,392.00 NO BID $24.00 3655 N/A $19,200.00
BELL PEPPER, SWEET, MINI 200 1 12# PKG  $  29.07 PEPSWE $5,814.00 $58.31 1748650 $11,662.00 $35.20 823294 5 Days $7,040.00 NO BID $28.00 10161 N/A $5,600.00
BROCCOLI, CUT, FLORETS 200 4 3# CASE  $  27.80 BROPI $5,560.00 $34.85 1675859 $6,970.00 $26.95 822330 5 Days $5,390.00 $21.53 Broccoli Florets 1 week $4,306.00 $26.50 200095 N/A $5,300.00
BROCCOLI, CUT, FLORETS, IW 50 100 2 OZ CASE  $  61.20 100BRO $3,060.00 $19.52 9999999 50/2OZ $976.00 $52.95 NEW ITEM 5 Days $2,647.50 $23.48 Broccoli Florets IW 50/2.2oz 1 week $1,174.00 $61.00 tbd N/A $3,050.00
CARROT, MATCH STICKS 80 4 5# CASE  $  17.78 CARMA $1,422.40 $17.72 1675750 $1,417.60 $22.20 823279 5 Days $1,776.00 NO BID $20.00 18840 N/A $1,600.00
CARROT, MINI PEELED PACKS, INDIVIDUAL BAGS TO EQUAL 1/2 CUP SERVING 400 100 2.6OZ CASE  $  23.10 CAR26 $9,240.00 $23.29 7071249 $9,316.00 $23.70 820188 5 Days $9,480.00 $32.94 Carrots, Baby 100/2.6oz 1 week $13,176.00 $26.00 12140 N/A $10,400.00
CARROTS, SHREDDED 15 4 5# CASE  $  18.90 CARSH $283.50 $17.72 1675750 $265.80 $21.95 820154 5 Days $329.25 $17.38 Carrots, Shredded 1 week $260.70 $26.00 6491 N/A $390.00
CAULIFLOWER, FLORETS 100 4 3# CASE  $  32.10 CAUPI4 $3,210.00 $31.11 1750041 2/3 LB $3,111.00 $41.95 NEW ITEM 5 Days $4,195.00 $26.29 Cauliflower, Florets 1 week $2,629.00 $35.00 5497 N/A $3,500.00
CELERY, STICKS, INDIVIDUAL BAGS TO EQUAL 1/2 CUP SERVING 100 50 3OZ CASE  $  43.80 9053 $4,380.00 $25.59 9999999 $2,559.00 $27.55 800511 5 Days $2,755.00 $20.68 Celery, Sticks 1 week $2,068.00 $29.95 18192 50/2.28 N/A $2,995.00
CUCUMBER, MINI, PERSIAN 260 1 20# CASE  $  23.60 CUCPER $6,136.00 $62.53 2680163 1/22 LB $16,257.80 $30.45 822365 5 Days $7,917.00 $45.00 Cucumber, Mini Persian 1 week $11,700.00 $39.00 13640 18# case N/A $10,140.00
CUCUMBER, WHOLE, UNPEELED 25 1 5# CASE  $    3.96 CUC12 $99.00 $9.04 7410640 $226.00 $8.95 822392 5 Days $223.75 $8.48 Cucumbers, Bulk 1 week $212.00 $5.50 14002 6 each N/A $137.50
CUCUMBER, WHOLE, UNPEELED 100 1 36 CT CASE  $  19.90 CUC $1,990.00 $9.04 7410640 1/5 LB $904.00 $20.45 820092 5 Days $2,045.00 $18.64 Cucumbers, Bulk 1 week $1,864.00 $22.00 1670 N/A $2,200.00
FAJITA MIX, GREEN/RED BELL PEPPER & ONION 100 1 5# CASE  $  22.86 143171 $2,286.00 $18.88 9080714 $1,888.00 $12.45 800598 5 Days $1,245.00 NO BID $19.75 7383 N/A $1,975.00
GRAPES, INDIVIDUAL BAGS TO EQUAL 1/2 CUP SERVING 200 100 3 OZ CASE  $  69.70 GRARE100 $13,940.00 $49.47 9999999 $9,894.00 $49.95 800233 5 Days $9,990.00 $46.97 Grapes, Grape Escape 100/2.75oz 1 week $9,394.00 $59.25 13086 50/3 oz N/A $11,850.00
GRAPES, LUNCH BUNCH 100 1 21# CASE  $  29.67 GRALB $2,967.00 NO BID NO BID $30.45 820033 5 Days $3,045.00 $40.20 Grapes, Green Lunch Bunch 1 week $4,020.00 $34.00 7285 bulk red grapes N/A $3,400.00
GRAPES, RED SEEDLESS 65 1 18# CASE  $  33.40 GRARE $2,171.00 $41.22 0668873 1/CTN $2,679.30 $30.95 823283 5 Days $2,011.75 $26.78 Grapes, Red 1/5# tray 1 week $1,740.70 $34.00 7285 N/A $2,210.00
KIWI, WHOLE 150 1 20# CASE  $  49.46 KIWBU $7,419.00 $62.04 7613748 1/117 CT $9,306.00 $40.95 820034 5 Days $6,142.50 $36.60 Kiwi, Green 1 week $5,490.00 $39.00 9322 N/A $5,850.00
LETTUCE, GREEN LEAF CROWNS, PRE-WASHED, 170 LEAVES 150 1 10# CASE  $  27.36 LETGRCR $4,104.00 $34.37 6640569 $5,155.50 $20.99 800595 5 Days $3,148.50 $19.64 Green Leaf Fillet 2/5# bags 1 week $2,946.00 $25.50 186 N/A $3,825.00
LETTUCE, ROMAINE, CHOPPED, PRE-WASHED 850 6 2# CASE  $  22.69 LETCR $19,286.50 $39.44 2189819 $33,524.00 $18.45 820174 5 Days $15,682.50 $16.18 Lettuce, Romaine Chopped 1 week $13,753.00 $25.00 19554 N/A $21,250.00
LETTUCE, SPRING MIX 200 1 3# BAG  $    8.70 MES $1,740.00 $9.86 9516907 $1,972.00 $7.80 820283 5 Days $1,560.00 $6.10 Lettuce, Spring Mix 3/1# 3lb 1 week $1,220.00 $11.50 23130 N/A $2,300.00
MANDARIN OR TANGERINES,  LARGE 400 1 100 CT CASE  $  24.05 MANDSAT $9,620.00 $38.13 1192600 10/3 LB $15,252.00 $26.70 821098 5 Days $10,680.00 $25.01 Mandarins 84 ct/cs 25lb 1 week $10,004.00 $31.50 14711 N/A $12,600.00
MELON, WATERMELON, SEEDLESS 125 1 40# CASE  $  31.05 WATS4 $3,881.25 $48.67 8825018 1/4-6 CT $6,083.75 $38.45 820774 5 Days $4,806.25 $18.30 Watermelons Seedless 5 ct/cs 68lb 1 week $2,287.50 $25.00 147 30# case N/A $3,125.00
NECTARINES, WHOLE, 64-72 CT 50 1 25# CASE  $  26.95 NECTY64 $1,347.50 $35.77 8880258 $1,788.50 $30.95 820552 5 Days $1,547.50 $23.18 Nectarines, Yellow 1 week $1,159.00 $29.00 11960 N/A $1,450.00
ORANGES, WHOLE, 138 CT 100 1 38# CASE  $  28.10 ORA138 $2,810.00 $38.96 7651967 $3,896.00 $26.50 820047 5 Days $2,650.00 $26.84 Oranges, Navel 40lb 1 week $2,684.00 $32.00 14730 N/A $3,200.00
PEA, SUGAR SNAP 60 1 10# BAG  $  41.68 SNAP $2,500.80 $44.50 1312743 $2,670.00 $38.95 820288 5 Days $2,337.00 $35.69 Snap Peas 1/5# tray 1 week $2,141.40 $39.00 2770 N/A $2,340.00
PEACHES, YELLOW, SIZE 80 50 1 25# CASE  $  26.95 PEACY120 $1,347.50 $35.88 7670203 $1,794.00 $30.95 822820 5 Days $1,547.50 $23.18 Peaches, Yellow 1 week $1,159.00 $29.00 12325 N/A $1,450.00
PEAR, RIPE, BARTLETT, RED BARTLETT, D'ANJOU, RED D'ANJOU, 110 CT 100 1 40# CASE  $  39.10 PEARD142 $3,910.00 $35.76 3745443 1/CS $3,576.00 $36.95 820732 5 Days $3,695.00 $29.28 Pears, Brown 1 week $2,928.00 $29.75 10767 N/A $2,975.00
PLUM, PURPLE, RED, OR BLACK, SIZE 45 & 50, 2 IN DIAMETER 75 1 28# CASE  $  26.10 PLU $1,957.50 $38.49 5048442 1/20 LB $2,886.75 $37.45 800522 5 Days $2,808.75 $24.40 Plums, Black 1 week $1,830.00 $37.00 13322 N/A $2,775.00
SALAD MIX, ROMAINE BLEND, BAG, TOSSED, FRESH 200 4 5# CASE  $    7.05 SALROM $1,410.00 $39.14 1649193 $7,828.00 $25.45 820623 5 Days $5,090.00 $25.31 Lettuce Romaine Blend 1 week $5,062.00 $28.00 867 N/A $5,600.00
SPINACH, PRE-WASHED, PRE-CUT 25 4 2.5# CASE  $  16.90 SPICL4 $422.50 $23.13 1675925 $578.25 $17.20 820184 5 Days $430.00 $14.64 Baby Spinach 1 week $366.00 $19.00 19694 N/A $475.00
STRAWBERRIES, CLAMSHELL 1000 8 1# CASE  $  24.20 STR $24,200.00 $31.73 6235501 $31,730.00 $26.45 820270 5 Days $26,450.00 $19.52 Strawberries 1 week $19,520.00 $23.00 15750 N/A $23,000.00
TOMATOES, CHERRY 350 1 12 CT CASE  $  23.10 TOMCH $8,085.00 $31.02 2203024 $10,857.00 $28.95 820140 5 Days $10,132.50 $23.22 Tomatoes, Cherry/Grape 1 week $8,127.00 $24.00 5160 N/A $8,400.00
TOMATOES, GRAPE 100 1 10# CASE  $  18.10 TOMBU10 $1,810.00 $21.87 6017370 $2,187.00 $19.99 820138 5 Days $1,999.00 $31.96 Tomatoes, Cherry 20# 20lb 1 week $3,196.00 $21.00 1291 N/A $2,100.00

Totals $208,630.45 $262,121.25 $210,271.75 $168,000.30 $236,812.50

Awarded Item =   

FRESH PRODUCE GOLD STAR AG LINK GENERAL PRODUCEDAYLIGHT SYSCO



EVALUATION CRITERIA 
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

DAYLIGHT SYSCO GOLD STAR AG LINK GENERAL PRODUCE

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15 15 15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points)

20 20 20 15 20

Product Availability 
(30 points)

30 30 30 25 30

Price 
(35 points)

30 20 25 35 25

TOTAL 95 85 90 90 90

Daylight:
minus 5 points price

Sysco:
minus 15 points price

Gold Star:
minus 10 points price

Ag Link:
minus 5 points product specs, no bid on 4 items 
minus 5 points product availability, no bid on 4 items

General Produce:
minus 10 points price

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Fresh Produce Award Analysis



FRUIT Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer 
Product Code 

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Dry 
APPLESAUCE, CUP, UNSWTND NATURAL 72 4.5 OZ CASE MOTTS 10065615 250 $41.53 4161475 $21.89 $5,472.50 209163 7 NO BID
MIXED FRUIT, EX LIGHT SYRUP 6 #10 CASE DEL MONTE 2004733 75 $55.33 2183368 SYS CLS 6/#10 $42.59 210241 CHH 6/#10 21 NO BID
PEACHES, DICED, EX LIGHT SYRUP 6   #10  CASE DEL MONTE 2002349 75 $54.77 2181705 SYS CLS 6/#10 $42.87 260307 PACIFIC COAST 6/#10 2 NO BID
PEARS, DICED, EX LIGHT SYRUP 6 #10 CASE DEL MONTE 2002352 75 $64.82 2182091 SYS CLS 6/#10 $40.34 210243 CHH 6/#10 7 NO BID
RAISINS, IW 144 1.33 OZ CASE SUNMAID 002020 50 $39.99 9387317 SYS PRM 144/1.5 OZ $34.46 $1,723.00 202545 BOGHOSIAN 144/1.5OZ 2 $40.89 2020 SUNMAID 14-DAY
ROLLUP, FRUIT, BLASTIN' BERRY, RED SUG, IW 96 0.5 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 1600011566 2000 $25.81 $51,620.00 5946629 $26.04 200824 12 NO BID
Frozen
BLUEBERRIES, UNSWEETENED, IQF 2 5# CASE PACKER LABEL 341761 50 $26.64 1359496 SYS CLS 2/5 LB $22.76 $1,138.00 140163 2 NO BID
STRAWBERRIES, SLICED, UNSWEETENED, IQF 2 5# CASE WAWONA 033020-00 50 $23.98 7394822 21 $24.45 $1,222.50 149914 2 $24.90 033020-00 WAWONA 14-DAY

VEGETABLES Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Dry 
BEANS, GARBANZO 6 #10 CASE LODI CANNING CO 2013 50 $31.71 4062337 SYS CLS 6/#10 $29.75 NEW TEASDALE 6/#10 7 NO BID
BEANS, KIDNEY, RED, LS 6 #10 CASE BUSH'S 1745 50 $39.34 0075079 $37.16 $1,858.00 203072 7 NO BID
HUMMUS, ORIGINAL, DIP CUP, LARGE 96 4.5 OZ CASE ZEE ZEES A5050 20 $66.84 7151987 30 $67.17 $1,343.40 410063 7 $76.21 A5050 SPECIAL ORDER
HUMMUS, ORIGINAL, DIP CUP, SMALL 120 3 OZ CASE ZEE ZEES A5000 20 $65.74 7086364 30 $66.07 $1,321.40 409693 14 $76.21 A5000 SPECIAL ORDER
POTATO PEARLS W/ VIT C, LOW SODIUM 12 26.5 OZ CASE BASIC AMERICAN FOODS 10426 50 $72.24 0315335 $71.65 403324 7 NO BID
SALSA, DIP CUPS 84 3 OZ CASE RED GOLD REDSC2ZC84 75 $37.71 $2,828.25 7002707 $38.53 404013 12 NO BID
Frozen
CORN, WHOLE KERNEL CUT, IQF 1 30 # CASE SUN LEAF 07931 50 $34.28 3533486 SYS CLS 1/30LB $29.97 $1,498.50 140101 7 NO BID
ONION RING, BREADED, WG 175 2.69 OZ CASE TASTY BRANDS 33504 25 $81.99 1580834 6 $83.29 $2,082.25 133801 7 NO BID
PEAS, GREEN, IQF 1 20 # CASE SUN LEAF 12312 50 $39.81 3608353 SYS CLS 1/30 LB $23.61 $1,180.50 101474 7 NO BID
POTATOES, STRAIGHT CUT FRIES, 3/8", SEASONSED 6 5 # CASE MCCAIN FOODS MCX03621 600 $47.53 $28,518.00 9714239 $48.28 401942 7 NO BID
POTATOES, TATER TOTS, REDUCED SODIUM 6 5 # CASE SIMPLOT 004189 300 $31.12 $9,336.00 5246846 $31.58 403489 26 NO BID

GRAIN Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

 Dry 
CEREAL BOWL, CINNAMON CHEX, WG, GF 60 2 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 14883000 700 $41.17 $28,819.00 7072203 $39.42 248631 2 NO BID
CEREAL BOWL, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH, WG 60 2 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 14886000 950 $41.17 $39,111.50 7072170 $39.42 248634 2 NO BID
CEREAL BOWL, HONEY CHEERIOS, WG, GF 60 2 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 18448000 900 $41.17 $37,053.00 7190086 $39.42 253535 2 NO BID
CHIPS, TORTILLA, YELLOW, ROUND, WG, IW 100 2 OZ CASE LA TAPATIA 77009 525 $27.39 2458570 $28.72 $15,078.00 202976 2 $30.55 77009 14-DAY
COOKIE, FORTUNE, WG, IW 400 0.16 OZ CASE ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS 79203 500 $35.11 3793357 $32.20 $16,100.00 209081 2 NO BID
CRACKER, CHEEZITS, WG, IW 175 0.75 OZ CASE KELLOGG'S 24100-79263 100 $36.52 2098269 $35.30 $3,530.00 203137 2 NO BID
CRACKER, CHURRO CRUNCH & CRAVE, WW, IW 160 1 OZ CASE J & J SNACK FOODS 204193 1000 $37.60 7136350 $35.27 $35,270.00 251279 2 $37.72 204193 14-DAY
CRACKER, GOLDFISH, CHEDDAR WG, IW 300 0.75 OZ CASE PEPFARM 18105 50 $73.65 6599405 $66.44 $3,322.00 200290 2 NO BID
GRANOLA, BULK, OATS & HONEY 4 44 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 12772000 135 $50.15 0832501 $48.45 $6,540.75 254516 12 NO BID
RICE KRISPIES TREATS, MINI, WG 600 0.42 OZ CASE KELLOGG'S 38000-14540 500 $78.41 3910542 $76.52 $38,260.00 208213 2 NO BID
RICE, BROWN, LONG PARBOILED, WG 1 25 # BAG PRODUCERS/ PAR EXC R2PX25QC0 50 $17.28 $864.00 2047177 $16.25 203005 RICELAND 25LB 2 NO BID
 Frozen
BAGELS, MINI, STRAWBERRY, WG, IW 72 2.43 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 38413 150 $40.07 3282809 $36.68 $5,502.00 134813 2 NO BID
BUN, HAMBURGER, 4", WG, FROZEN 144 2.07 OZ CASE SHANNON'S SB-444 2000 $41.39 0360234 $42.27 113514 2 $35.87 $71,740.00 SB-444 14-DAY
COOKIE DOUGH, CHOCOLATE CHIP, WG 168 1.75 OZ CASE FAT CAT BAKERY WGCCC168-AS 800 $50.94 7047318 $48.92 138751 7 $50.19 $40,152.00 WGCCC168-AS 14-DAY
COOKIE, CHOCOLATE CHIP, WG, IW 140 1.2 OZ CASE FAT CAT BAKERY WGCCC1401SW 1000 $47.89 3381177 $45.46 138516 7 $48.95 $48,950.00 WGCCC1401SW 14-DAY
FRUDEL, APPLE-FILLED STRUDEL, WG, IW 72 2.29 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 127852 275 $39.59 8162673 $36.68 $10,087.00 112999 2 NO BID
PANCAKES, BLUEBERRY, WG, IW 80 3 OZ CASE THE MAX 94643-04443 100 $44.89 653604 16 $43.30 $4,330.00 141161 26 NO BID
ROLL, DINNER, WG, IW 120 2 OZ CASE SHANNON'S SB-2000 500 $46.32 3901388 $48.34 140273 2 $51.43 SB-2000 14-DAY
ROLL, HOAGIE, WG 108 2.5 OZ CASE SHANNON'S SB-822 100 $43.43 $4,343.00 1628415 $44.31 133927 2 $46.75 SB-822 14-DAY
ROLLS, MINI CINNAMON, WG, IW 72 2.29 OZ CASE PILLSBURY 33686 1400 $39.59 0139610 $36.76 $51,464.00 113361 2 NO BID
TOAST, TEXAS GARLIC, RF, BULK, WG 120 1.31 OZ CASE BAKE CRAFTERS 1605 375 $40.22 7838026 $38.85 $14,568.75 134558 2 $45.19 1605 14-DAY
TORTILLA, FLOUR, WHITE WHOLE WHEAT, 10", WG 12 10 CT CASE MI RANCHO 100850 400 $40.66 7106624 MISSION 12/12 CT $23.97 $9,588.00 139774 2 NO BID
WAFFLE, BUTTERY MAPLE, WG, IW 96 2.4 OZ CASE ARLINGTON VALLEY FARMS 53363-00001 / 00110 175 $49.02 7136170 SNCKWAF 96/2.4 OZ 8 $49.02 $8,578.50 141470 2 $53.79 53363-0000/0110 14-DAY

PROTEIN, M/MA Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Dry
BEAN, DIP CUPS 96 4.5OZ CASE ZEE ZEES A5750 275 $73.02 7151990 $67.37 $18,526.75 252673 13 $76.21 A5759 14-Day
CHEESE, SAUCE CHEDDAR, BULK 6 106 OZ CASE LAND O LAKES 39945 100 $79.62 $7,962.00 7196024 $81.88 410080 7 NO BID
CHEESE, SAUCE CHEDDAR, DIP CUPS 140 3 OZ CASE LAND O LAKES 39911 135 $86.71 7000927 $86.05 $11,616.75 403651 7 NO BID
CHEESE, SAUCE WHITE, BULK 6 106 OZ CASE LAND O LAKES 39947 25 $89.12 7196023 8 $89.82 $2,245.50 410082 7 NO BID
SUNFLOWER SEEDS, HONEY ROASTED, IW 150 1 OZ CASE SUNRICH 1231780 / 1252554 110 $45.05 7340525 $43.73 $4,810.30 208261 7 NO BID
TUNA, CHUNK LITE IN WATER, POUCH, REDUCED SODIUM 6 43 OZ CASE STARKIST 514540 60 $69.15 3117498 8 $62.27 $3,736.20 239326 12 NO BID
Refrigerated
CHEESE, CHEDDAR MILD, YELLOW, SHRED, BAG 4 5 # CASE LAND O LAKES 41749 40 $63.16 $2,526.40 0557074 $64.28 401146 2 NO BID
CHEESE, PARMESAN, SHREDDED 4 5 # CASE PACKER LABEL 24144-5/492137 30 $53.96 4067033 AREZIMP 2/5 LB $99.73 $2,991.90 305578 7 NO BID
CHEESE, STRING, LITE MOZZ 168 1 OZ CASE LAND O LAKES 59703 360 $40.60 $14,616.00 5274891 LOL 59701 $40.96 401172 7 NO BID
YOGURT, PARFAIT PRO, VANILLA, RS, BULK 6 64 OZ CASE GENERAL MILLS 10070470208241 275 $30.76 7274886 $30.29 $8,329.75 306272 2 NO BID
YOGURT, STRAWBERRY BLAST, CRUSH CUP, FF 48 4 OZ CASE DANNON COMPANY, INC. 73463 1100 $12.98 8653952 $14.35 300453 2 NO BID
Frozen
BEEF, BURGER PATTY, SEASONED, FULLY COOKED 90 3 OZ CASE INTEGRATED N32300B-NF 450 $93.62 7002963 $97.20 113284 26 NO BID
BEEF, CHEESEBURGER, TWIN SLIDERS, WG, IW 75 4.35 OZ CASE INTEGRATED 470220 540 $110.20 1766472 $112.23 406519 26 NO BID
BEEF, SEASONED TACO MEAT, 100% BEEF 6 5# CASE JTM 5249CE 100 $195.17 2801668 25 $195.15 149836 26 NO BID
BEEF, SLICED, SEASONED, FULLY COOKED 1 20 # CASE ADVANCE PIERRE 59995 100 $141.85 7377639 15 $142.58 158944 26 NO BID
BREAKFAST, SANDWICH, PANCAKES & BEEF SAUSAGE, WG, IW 100 2.61 OZ CASE INTEGRATED 990120 225 $100.34 $22,576.50 7078583 $102.37 143794 26 NO BID
BREAKFAST, SCRAMBLER, EGG & CHEESE, WG, IW 72 3.28 OZ CASE PILLSBURY 113924000 225 $60.87 7333403 $60.21 $13,547.25 156407 7 NO BID
CHEESE, BITES, WG, IW 60 4 OZ CASE WILD MIKES 11113 500 $80.65 $40,325.00 7155843 $82.36 409781 2 NO BID
CHEESE, BREADSTICKS, WG 100 4.2 OZ CASE BEACON STREET CAFE 73338 215 $78.17 0807996 $75.03 $16,131.45 402127 2 NO BID
CHEESE, ENCHILADAS, WG, IW 35 7.0 OZ CASE MICHAEL B'S CCE12 350 $60.37 7135689 $59.89 406591 2 $60.90 $21,315.00 CCE12 14-DAY
CHEESE, FRENCH BREAD, GARLIC, BULK, WG 60 4.29 OZ CASE TONY'S 78359 850 $59.52 $50,592.00 0664013 $59.53 403487 7 NO BID
CHEESE, MACARONI, RF, RS, WG 6 5 # CASE LAND O LAKES 43274 625 $81.47 $50,918.75 7000903 $85.01 403780 7 NO BID
CHEESE, PIZZA CRUNCHERS, WG 72 5.48 OZ CASE RICH'S 65225 330 $86.45 $28,528.50 8713350 $87.65 401960 2 NO BID
CHEESE, PULL APARTS, WG, IW 72 3.88 OZ CASE PILLSBURY 12317 350 $67.92 7150133 $64.36 $22,526.00 143752 7 NO BID
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, THREE CHEESE, WG, IW 72 4.8 OZ CASE TRUE  NATURAL FOODS 9702-2 225 $95.78 2411763 IFS 100/4.10OZ MFG DISC 410033 19 $99.86 $22,468.50 9702-2 14-DAY

SYSCO GOLD STAR CLEARBROOK FARMS RICH CHICKSGROCERY ITEMS



CHICKEN, CHUNK, WHOLE MUSCLE, BREADED, WG 1 30 # CASE GOLD KIST 7518 425 $108.32 2420350 $103.71 $44,076.75 403671 2 NO BID
CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED, WG 92 4.4 OZ CASE TYSON 666010 450 $97.17 2746405 $96.43 405424 2 NO BID
CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE JR, WG 192 3.6 OZ CASE YANG'S 15555-5 1100 $170.04 2819973 $154.03 403886 2 $155.80 $171,380.00 15555-5 14-DAY
CHICKEN, PATTY, CRISPY, WHOLE MUSCLE, BREADED, WG 78 4.10 OZ CASE RICH CHICKS 13440 90 $93.04 7170366 15 $94.99 $8,549.10 410242 2 NO BID $88.39 $7,955.10 13440 RICH CHICKS 78 SVG, 4.10 OZ 14 DAYS
CHICKEN, PATTY, SPICY, WHOLE MUSCLE, BREADED, WG 120 3.75 OZ CASE TYSON 70312 900 $114.22 2194474 $114.56 403682 2 NO BID $89.19 13410 RICH CHICKS 78 SVG, 4.10 OZ 14 DAYS
CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY, WHOLE MUSCLE, BREADED, WG 120 4.14 OZ CASE TYSON 10703320928 500 $116.58 $58,290.00 2188045 $116.92 404684 7 NO BID $88.39 $44,195.00 42424 RICH CHICKS 78 SVG, 4.10 OZ 14 DAYS
CHICKEN, TENDERS, HOT & SPICY, WHOLE MUSCLE, BREADED, WG 121 4.11 OZ CASE TYSON 70342 950 $123.31 $117,144.50 2189201 $123.67 404685 2 NO BID $89.19 $84,730.50 43404 RICH CHICKS 78 SVG, 4.10 OZ 14 DAYS
CHICKEN, THIGH, BREADED, WG 75 4.70 OZ CASE TYSON 44195 75 $101.18 7228040 13 $103.36 410301 26 NO BID
CHICKEN, WINGS, SPICY 1 30 # CASE TYSON 10000038942 650 $140.19 7165324 $139.13 $90,434.50 406920 7 NO BID
EGGS, LIQUID, WHOLE, CF, FRZN 6 5# CASE MICHAEL FOODS 14616-51100-00 80 $67.55 5088852 13 $69.37 $5,549.60 406923 2 NO BID
PIZZA, 16", CHEESE, PRIMO, PAR-BAKED, PRE-SLICED, WG 72 5.13 OZ CASE BIG DADDY 68586 800 $76.91 5213115 $71.92 $57,536.00 406318 2 NO BID
PIZZA, 16", CHEESE, PRIMO, WG 72 5.18 OZ CASE BIG DADDY 78637 1000 $79.73 2607824 $74.21 $74,210.00 403783 2 NO BID
PIZZA, 16", PEPPERONI, PRIMO, PAR-BAKED, PRE-SLICED, WG 72 5.13 OZ CASE BIG DADDY 68582 700 $77.77 5306657  $72.77 $50,939.00 406444 7 NO BID
PIZZA, 16", PEPPERONI, PRIMO, WG 72 5.18 OZ CASE BIG DADDY 78638 1500 $82.41 2728238 $76.95 $115,425.00 403833 2 NO BID
PIZZA, 4" ROUND, CHEESE, WG, IW 72 4.46 OZ CASE TONY'S 78366 275 $68.69 0748531 $65.86 $18,111.50 403232 2 NO BID
POLLOCK, BUFFALO, BREADED, WG 40 3 OZ CASE TRIDENT 429077 130 $39.04 7156217 23 $38.55 $5,011.50 410029 19 NO BID
POLLOCK, NACHO CHEESE, BREADED, WG 40 3 OZ CASE TRIDENT 429078 450 $50.21 7155185 23 $40.89 $18,400.50 410010 19 NO BID
SANDWICH, BBQ BEEF RIB, WG, IW 75 4.36 OZ CASE INTEGRATED 460007 400 $73.88 $29,552.00 1914524  $115.51 143299 26 NO BID
SANDWICH, SOY BUTTER & JELLY, WG, IW 40 4.6 OZ CASE ALBIE'S 608 2500 $46.32 $115,800.00 2850463 $47.70 134776 2 $50.62 608 14-DAY
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND TWO CHEESE, WG, IW 72 4.4 OZ CASE TASTY BRANDS 700019 500 $88.89 $44,445.00 4223398  $89.82 406082 7 NO BID
TAMALE, CHEESE AND CHILI, WG 72 5 OZ CASE MICHAEL B'S TC12 50 $110.90 8917959 $93.72 $4,686.00 406857 7 $96.24 TC12 14-DAY
TAMALE, CHICKEN, RED SAUCE, WG 48 5 OZ CASE DEL REAL 767 750 $57.18 3822424 $52.83 138025 7 $54.36 $40,770.00 767 14-DAY
TAQUITOS, CHICKEN, WG, IW 50 4.7 OZ CASE MICHAEL B'S CTB43W 300 $64.36 7027487 $63.83 113678 7 $60.75 $18,225.00 CTB43W 14-DAY
TURKEY, BACON, SLICED, FULLY COOKED 12 50 CT CASE JENNIE-O 271106 80 $107.96 $8,636.80 5654425 $108.98 400978 2 NO BID
TURKEY, SHREDDED & GRAVY 112 4 OZ CASE JENNIE-O 2847-28 100 $109.43 7067628 $110.22 400984 2 NO BID
VEGETARIAN, BURGER PATTY, GRILLERS PRIME 48 2.5 OZ CASE MORNINGSTAR (KELLOGG'S) 28989-10409 215 $30.60 $6,579.00 7177149  $30.70 144043 2 NO BID
VEGETARIAN, CHILI, 3-BEAN 120 4 OZ CASE JTM 5383 175 $65.20 $11,410.00 3943600 $65.88 403993 2 NO BID
VEGETARIAN, KICKIN' TENDERS 2 5 # CASE REBELLYOUS FOODS KTFC21 80 $38.57 $3,085.60 7215321 $39.66 149613 2 NO BID

BEVERAGES Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

JUICE, 100% FRUIT, APPLE 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 400305 7500 $7.02 3902978 $7.76 239171 2 $7.56 $56,700.00 400305
JUICE, 100% FRUIT, CRAN RASPBERRY 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 402300 4000 $7.02 7202792 $7.76 248411 2 $7.56 $30,240.00 402300
JUICE, 100% FRUIT, FRUIT PUNCH 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 400805 7500 $7.02 3903038 $7.76 249239 2 $7.56 $56,700.00 400805
JUICE, 100% FRUIT, ORANGE TANGERINE 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 402405 3500 $7.02 4193837 $7.76 249258 2 $7.56 $26,460.00 402405
JUICE, 100% FRUIT, STRAWBERRY KIWI 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 402600 7000 $7.02 7061810 $7.76 248410 2 $7.56 $52,920.00 402600
JUICE, 100% FRUIT, VERY BERRY 40 4.23 OZ CASE SUNCUP 402505 4000 $7.02 3903048 $7.76 249259 2 $7.56 $30,240.00 402505
MILK, LACTOSE FREE, SHELF STABLE 27 8 OZ CASE GOSSNER 947150 15 $17.02 7414815 MODPNTR 27/8 OZ 21 $15.23 $228.45 258357 2 $21.60 10458 MODPNTR 14-DAY
MILK, WHITE, 1%, SHELF STABLE 27 8 OZ CASE GOSSNER 947130 100 $14.63 7418694 MODPNTR 27/8 OZ 21 $14.65 $1,465.00 203000 2 $12.96 10459 MODPNTR 14 DAY
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, SHELF STABLE 27 8 OZ CASE GOSSNER 950050 600 $16.17 7272427 MODPNTR 27/8 OZ 21 $14.46 $8,676.00 203476 2 $13.77 10473 MODPNTR 14-DAY
SOYMILK, VANILLA, ORG SMART 24 8 OZ CASE KIKKOMAN 06184 50 $20.64 7002196 $25.04 $1,252.00 207889 7 NO BID

DRESSINGS/OILS/CONDIMENTS Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

GRAVY MIX, ROASTED CHICKEN, LS, WG 6 14 OZ CASE PIONEER 212645 10 $35.93 2110902 15 $15.97 248699 26 NO BID
MAYONNAISE, LIGHT 4 1 GAL CASE KRAFT 643018 10 $42.55 $425.50 3716685 $38.91 248716 19 NO BID
OIL, VEGETABLE 6 1 GAL CASE AVO V1128 5 $54.83 7356805 LA SPAG 6/1 GAL $73.75 $368.75 210233 2 NO BID
PACKETS, BBQ SAUCE 200 12 GM CASE KRAFT HEINZ 533802 650 $12.86 $8,359.00 4889507 $13.23 258504 7 NO BID
PACKETS, HOT SAUCE 500 7 GM CASE TAPITO 77885-00193 200 $36.30 $7,260.00 5032149 $36.66 202268 2 NO BID
PACKETS, KETCHUP STANDARD 1000 9 GM CASE KRAFT HEINZ 984800 600 $23.16 $13,896.00 4136768 $24.69 405304 2 NO BID
PACKETS, MAYONNAISE  200 9 GM CASE PPI 21570 450 $10.64 $4,788.00 5786942 $10.74 201892 2 NO BID
PACKETS, MUSTARD 200 5.5 GM CASE PPI 05380 110 $13.69 4394417 $12.70 251281 4 IN ONE 500/5.5GR 7 NO BID
PACKETS, RANCH, BUTTERMILK DRESSING 200 12 GM CASE PPI 22810 1700 $12.31 6009625 $12.61 $21,437.00 201896 2 NO BID
PACKETS, TAJIN SEASONING, LOW SODIUM 1000 0.035 OZ CASE TAJIN 28805 150 $58.67 7011742 $55.50 $8,325.00 209157 2 NO BID
PACKETS, TARTAR SAUCE 200 12 GM CASE PPI 7160374381000 50 $15.80 $790.00 4533535 $14.42 253419 PORTION PAC 200/12GR 19 NO BID
PICKLES, DILL, 1/8" 4 1 GAL CASE MRS KLEIN PICKLE 65041 160 $35.85 7063304 BBRLCLS 4/1GAL $26.36 $4,217.60 249294 7 NO BID
POUCHES, CHIPOTLE RANCH 60 1.5 OZ CASE T. MARZETTI 81299 100 $17.89 $1,789.00 3895966 $18.00 208262 7 NO BID
POUCHES, ROYAL CAESAR 60 1.5 OZ CASE T. MARZETTI 82000 130 $17.43 $2,265.90 5686860 $17.53 201614 7 NO BID
POUCHES, BUTTERMILK RANCH 120 1.5 OZ CASE T. MARZETTI 81992 200 $27.91 $5,582.00 5274899 $28.10 201612 2 NO BID
SAUCE, MARINARA DIP CUP 250 1 OZ CASE REDGOLD REDNA1Z 200 $34.90 $6,980.00 8185804 $35.69 401764 26 NO BID
SAUCE, TERIYAKI 6 4.9 # CASE NIPPON SHOKKEN 00003 10 $51.06 0801403 10 $46.04 $460.40 239365 7 NO BID

SEASONINGS/COOKING INGREIDENTS/MISC Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price Extended Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

GARLIC, GRANULATED 1 10 OZ CASE PACIFIC SPICE COMPANY 1GG1212 5 $120.57 6639165 IMP/MCC 6/26OZ $9.69 $48.45 202056 2 NO BID
PAN COATING SPRAY, AEROSOL 6 17 OZ CASE PAM 6414463111 60 $27.68 4583290 8 $26.08 $1,564.80 209378 7 NO BID
PEPPER, BLACK GROUND 1 1 # CASE PACIFIC SPICE COMPANY PEPBG12I 5 $103.53 5229273 IMP/MCC 6/1 LB $13.27 $66.35 202014 7 NO BID
SEASONING, SALT-FREE 1 20 OZ CASE LAWRY'S 2150080606 15 $107.74 4982963 $19.16 $287.40 209312 15 NO BID
SEASONING, TACO MIX, NO MSG 6 9 OZ CASE LAWRY'S 2150080110 40 $23.23 $929.20 4069217 $25.77 202875 KENT 6/9OZ 12 NO BID
VINEGAR, WHITE DISTILLED 4 1 GAL CASE AVO V20001 5 $14.63 4113049 SYS CLS 4/1 GAL $17.47 $87.35 210234 2 NO BID

$868,545.40 $886,934.90 $688,260.50 $136,880.60

Awarded Item =

No Award =



EVALUATION CRITERIA 
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

SYSCO GOLD STAR CLEARBROOK FARMS RICH CHICKS

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15 15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points)

15 20 10 5

Product Availability 
(30 points)

25 30 15 5

Price 
(35 points)

35 35 35 35

TOTAL 90 100 75 60

Sysco:
minus 5 points product specs, many Sysco brand items bid are not Buy American compliant
minus 5 poins product availability, several non-stocked items with lead time

Clearbrook Farms:
minus 10 points product specs, only bid 30 of 128 items
minus 15 points product availability, only bid 30 of 128 items Awarding multiple line items to each:

Sysco - 37 items 
Rich Chicks: Gold Star - 60 items
minus 15 points product specs, only bid 4 of 128 items Clearbrook Farms - 14 items
minus 25 points product availability, only bid 4 of 128 items

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Grocery Items Award Analysis



Estimate 
Annual 
Usage

Pack Size Purchase Unit Brand
Manufacturer 
Product Code 

Price
Extended 

Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor 

Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from 

Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

DAWN, MANUAL POT & PAN LIQUID DETERGENT, CONCENTRATED 80 4 1 GAL CASE DAWN 57445 $68.47 1781224 DAWN D 4/1GAL YES- 8 DAY LEAD $85.06 NEW ITEM P&G 4CT 7-14 Days
DELIMER CLINGING LIME-A-WAY 5 6 32 OZ CASE ECOLAB 6115210 $75.04 $375.20 6103311 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
DELIMER CLINGING LIME-A-WAY, CONCENTRATED 10 4 1 GAL CASE ECOLAB 6101131 $53.22 $532.20 3976277 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
DETERGENT, DISHMACHINE, SOLID METAL PRO 15 4 8 #  CASE ECOLAB 6110751 $119.63 $1,794.45 5426283 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
DETERGENT, DISHMACHINE, SOLID POWER XL 5 4 9 #   CASE ECOLAB 6100185 $132.61 $663.05 8265585 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
OVEN CLEANER, GREASESTRIP PLUS 5 6 32 OZ CASE ECOLAB 6129777 $55.03 $275.15 5883574 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
OVEN CLEANER, SPECIALITY, HEAVY DUTY, RTU 5 1 2.5 GAL CASE ECOLAB 6100704 $61.30 $306.50 3031880 YES- 8 DAY NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
OVEN RINSE, SPECIALITY, RTU 5 1 2.5 GAL CASE ECOLAB 6100705 $52.85 $264.25 3031834 YES- 8 DAY NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
RINSE AID, DISHMACHINE, HEAVY DUTY, TRUPOWER 10 4 1 GAL CASE ECOLAB 6102448 $279.11 $2,791.10 7236541 YES- 8 DAY NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
RINSE AID, DISHMACHINE, ALL PURPOSE, TRUPOWER 5 1 4.5 GAL CASE ECOLAB 6115172 $122.31 $611.55 5061247 ECOLAB 1/5 GAL NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
SANITIZER, DISHMACHINE, LOWTEMP, ULTRA, TRUPOWER 5 1 5 GAL  CASE ECOLAB 6113961 $56.11 $280.55 5061239 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days
SANITIZER TABLET, QUAT-TAB 100 6 100 CT CASE STERAMINE 6-Q $36.04 $3,604.00 5256670 $54.10 NEW ITEM STERAMINE 6CT 7-14 Days
TOWEL WIPES, SANI-HAND SANITIZNG 5 6 300 CT CASE NICEPAK P92084 $44.76 $223.80 7930783 $62.80 NEW ITEM SANI 1800CT 7-14 Days
WINDOW GLASS CLEANER 5 4 32 OZ CASE KEYSTONE 6100067 $25.31 $126.55 7682790 NO BID NO BID 7-14 Days

Total $11,848.35

Awarded Item =

No Award =

SYSCO GOLD STARCHEMICALS



EVALUATION CRITERIA 
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

SYSCO GOLD STAR

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points) 20 5

Product Availability 
(30 points) 30 7

Price 
(35 points) 35 8

TOTAL 100 35

Gold Star:
minus 15 points product specs, only 3 of 14 items bid
minus 15 points product availbility, only 3 of 14 items bid
minus 27 points price, only 3 of 14 items bid

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Chemical Award Analysis



Manufacturer 
Product Code 

Pack Size Purchase Unit Brand
Estimate Annual 

Usage
Price

Extended 
Price

Distributor 
Product Code 

Brand Bid 
(if different from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Extended 

Price
Distributor 

Product Code 
Brand Bid 

(if different from Spec)
Pack Size Bid 

(if different from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Extended 

Price
Distributor 

Product Code 
Brand Bid 

(if different from Spec)
Pack Size Bid 

(if different from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

ANTIBACTERIAL THERMOMETER PROBE WIPE F2449PKT 1 1000 CASE DIAMOND 50 $17.60 $880.00 F2449PKT DIAMOND WIPES INT'L INC       DIAMOND WIPES INT'L INC       1-2 Business Days $43.13 2,156.50$        7486610 CDN INC 1/200 CT $32.91 1,645.50$        NEW ITEM CFS BRANDS 10CT 7-14 Days
BAG, BUN PAN COVERS, 27X37 303679979 1 200 ROLL HANDGARDS 20 $12.25 $245.00 303679979 HANDGARDS INC.                HANDGARDS INC.                1-2 Business Days $32.82 656.40$            4358958 SYS CLS 200/27X37 $32.86 657.20$            NEW ITEM IBS 200CT 7-14 Days
BAG, BUN PAN RACK COVER, HIGH DENSITY, 6 MIL, 52" x 80" 303679971 1 50 CASE HANDGARDS 70 $12.20 $854.00 303679971 HANDGARDS INC.                HANDGARDS INC.                1-2 Business Days $28.91 2,023.70$        5854377 SYS CLS 50/52X80 $21.07 1,474.90$        NEW ITEM IBS 50CT 7-14 Days
BAG, FREEZER, 1 GALLON 20-FH60 1 250 CASE FOOD HANDLER 10 $13.00 $130.00 20FH60FH FOODHANDLER INC.              FOODHANDLER INC.              1-2 Business Days $34.63 346.30$            7863634 SYS CLS 1/250CT $32.31 323.10$            NEW ITEM IBS 250CT 7-14 Days
BAG, PAPER, BROWN, #8 VB8SOB 1 500 CASE VICTORIA BAY 50 $14.00 $700.00 VB8SOB VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $15.47 773.50$            7273247 $18.12 906.00$            NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - DURO 500CT 7-14 Days
BAG, PAPER, BROWN, 8x4.25x10.25 IN, WITH HANDLE TEMPO 1 250 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $43.25 $432.50 TEMPO VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID $25.69 256.90$            NEW ITEM EMPRESS 250CT 7-14 Days
BAG, PAPER, BROWN, 13X7X13 IN, WITH HANDLE JRMART 1 250 CASE VICTORIA BAY 15 $57.75 $866.25 JRMART VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID $48.97 734.55$            NEW ITEM EMPRESS 250CT 7-14 Days
BAG, POLY, UTILITY BAG ON ROLL W/ TWIST TIES, 10X14 303679975 1 1000 ROLL HANDGARDS 5 $12.45 $62.25 303679975 HANDGARDS INC.                HANDGARDS INC.                1-2 Business Days $34.99 174.95$            7862002 SYS CLS 1/1000CT $25.21 126.05$            259938 IBS 1000CT 7-14 Days
BAG, SADDLE, DELI, 7x10 DP0710 1 2000 CASE LK PACKAGING 5 $16.35 $81.75 DP0710 LK PACKAGING                  LK PACKAGING                  1-2 Business Days NO BID $27.50 137.50$            NEW ITEM ELKAY PLASTICS 2000CT 7-14 Days
BOWL, BLACK, ROUND, 20 OZ VBBWP20B 6 84 CASE  VICTORIA BAY 75 $43.30 $3,247.50 VBBWP20B ANCHOR PACKAGING              ANCHOR PACKAGING              1-2 Business Days NO BID $61.15 4,586.25$        NEW ITEM ANCHOR PACKAGING 500CT 7-14 Days
BOXES, CHINESE TAKEOUT STYLE, PAGODA, NO METAL HANDLE, 16 OZ 16FP-PMW 1 450 CASE  PURECO USA 160 $37.15 $5,944.00 16FPPMW PURECO USA, LLC               PURECO USA, LLC               1-2 Business Days $33.76 5,401.60$        1423211 $32.33 5,172.80$        260116 GOLDEN WEST 450 CT 7-14 Days
CONTAINER, CLAMSHELL, HINGED, CLEAR, 8" 341548 2 125 CASE SOL-PAK 80 $61.00 $4,880.00 CHC8x1 SOL-PAK SOL-PAK 1-2 Business Days $32.49 2,599.20$        2310102 $56.54 4,523.20$        NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - PACTIV 200CT 7-14 Days
CONTAINER, CLAMSHELL, HINGED, CLEAR, 8" X 2.25" (wrap) YCI81048 2 125 CASE PACTIV 160 $29.20 $4,672.00 YCI81048 PACTIV-SAN BERNARDINO         PACTIV-SAN BERNARDINO         1-2 Business Days NO BID $59.62 9,539.20$        NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - PACTIV 250CT 7-14 Days
CONTAINER AND LID, RECTANGULAR, BLACK, 16 OZ VBPPREC16 1 150 CASE VICTORIA BAY 25 $17.80 $445.00 VBPPREC16 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID $35.72 893.00$            NEW ITEM FP LP 150CT 7-14 Days
CONTAINER AND LID, RECTANGULAR, BLACK, 24 OZ VBPPREC24 1 150 CASE VICTORIA BAY 130 $19.25 $2,502.50 VBPPREC24 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID $36.91 4,798.30$        NEW ITEM FP LP 150CT 7-14 Days
CUP, COLD, COMPOSTABLE, 8OZ CU-SU-8 1 1000 CASE WORLD CENTRIC 10 $69.50 $695.00 CUSU8 WORLD CENTRIC                 WORLD CENTRIC                 1-2 Business Days NO BID $87.72 877.20$            NEW ITEM PRIMEWARE 1000CT 7-14 Days
CUP, PARFAIT, 12 OZ VBCCSPET12 20 50 CASE VICTORIA BAY 25 $33.65 $841.25 VBCCSPET12 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $132.88 3,322.00$        8562027 COMET 12/20 CT NO BID
CUP, PORTION, CLEAR, PLASTIC, 5.5 OZ VB550PC 1 2500 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $32.90 $329.00 VB550PC VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $49.27 492.70$            7064615 SYS REL 8/250CT $56.53 565.30$            NEW ITEM EMPRESS 2500CT 7-14 Days
FOIL, ALUMINUM, FOOD SERVICE WRAP, 18"X1000' 11803 1 1 roll ROLL  VICTORIA BAY 20 $43.90 $878.00 11803 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $83.65 1,673.00$        6938377 SYS CLS 1/18IN $67.19 1,343.80$        NEW ITEM EMPRESS 1 RL 7-14 Days
FOIL WRAP, CHECK BLUE, 10.5X14 VB844 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 15 $68.50 $1,027.50 300844 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID $193.67 2,905.05$        NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - BAGCRAFT 2000CT 7-14 Days
FOIL WRAP, CHECK GREEN, 10.5X14 VB845 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 15 $68.50 $1,027.50 300845 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID $200.63 3,009.45$        NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - BAGCRAFT 2000CT 7-14 Days
FOIL WRAP, CHECK RED, 10.5X14 VB842 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 20 $68.50 $1,370.00 300842 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID $193.67 3,873.40$        NEW ITEM NOVOLEX - BAGCRAFT 2000CT 7-14 Days
FOIL WRAP, CHECK YELLOW, 10.5X14 VB828 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $68.50 $685.00 300828 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID NO BID
FOIL WRAP, MEXIWRAP, 10.5 X 14 VB028 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 50 $126.30 $6,315.00 400028 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID NO BID
FOIL WRAP, PLAIN, 10.5X14 VB315 1 2000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $68.50 $685.00 300815 NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          NOVOLEX BAGCRAFT INC          1-2 Business Days NO BID $103.05 1,030.50$        260262 EMPRESS 2500CT 7-14 Days
GLOVE, VINYL, CLEAR, EXTRA LARGE, PF 64V3000PFXL 10 100 CASE VICTORIA BAY 30 $18.75 $562.50 64V3000PFXL VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $43.62 1,308.60$        0952018 SYS REL 10/100CT NO BID
GLOVE, VINYL, CLEAR, LARGE, PF 64V3000PFL 10 100 CASE VICTORIA BAY 130 $18.75 $2,437.50 64V3000PFL VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $43.55 5,661.50$        0952004 SYS REL 10/100 CT $22.61 2,939.30$        259917 EMPRESS 1000CT 7-14 Days
GLOVE, VINYL, CLEAR, MEDIUM, PF 64V3000PFM 10 100 CASE VICTORIA BAY 150 $18.75 $2,812.50 64V3000PFM VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $43.48 6,522.00$        0951998 SYS REL 10/100CT $22.61 3,391.50$        259916 EMPRESS 1000CT 7-14 Days
GLOVE, VINYL, CLEAR, SMALL, PF 64V3000PFS 10 100 CASE VICTORIA BAY 5 $18.75 $93.75 64V3000PFS VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $43.43 217.15$            0951980 SYS REL 10/100CT NO BID
HAIRNETS, BROWN, 22", MEDIUM HN400BK 1 144 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $5.85 $58.50 HN400BK VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $192.75 1,927.50$        2099341 SYS CLS 10/144CT $16.09 160.90$            NEW ITEM AMERCAREROYAL 144CT 7-14 Days
HAIRNETS, BLACK, 26", LARGE   HN500BLK 1 144 CASE CELLUCAP 45 $5.85 $263.25 HN500BLK VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $192.83 8,677.35$        2099359 SYS CLS 10/144CT $322.34 14,505.30$      NEW ITEM AMERCAREROYAL 2880CT 7-14 Days
INSERT, PARFAIT, 4 OZ VBCLN4 1 100 CASE VICTORIA BAY 20 $21.75 $435.00 VBCLN4 EATERY ESSENTIALS             EATERY ESSENTIALS             1-2 Business Days NO BID NO BID
LID, CLEAR, FOR 4 & 5.5 OZ PORTION CUP VBPCLID345 1 2500 CASE VICTORIA BAY 10 $16.90 $169.00 VBPCLID345 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $48.15 481.50$            7794656 SYS IMP 25/100 CT NO BID
LID, PARFAIT, FLAT DF98 1 1000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 25 $12.80 $320.00 DF98 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID NO BID
NAPKINS, WHITE, 2 PLY DISPENSER REFILL VBIFNWW 12 500 CASE VICTORIA BAY 100 $20.40 $2,040.00 VBIFNWW VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $41.53 4,153.00$        7371317 SYS REL 20/150 CT $30.23 3,023.00$        NEW ITEM NOVA 6000CT 7-14 Days
PAN LINER, 16X24 2405161  1 1000 CASE  HOFFMASTER 130 $37.95 $4,933.50 VBF25Q NORPAK LLC                    NORPAK LLC                    1-2 Business Days $54.38 7,069.40$        5974290 SYS CLS 1000/16X24 $55.78 7,251.40$        NEW ITEM NOVA 1000CT 7-14 Days
PAN LINER, FULL PAN 4", NYLON OVENABLE 42001 1 100 CASE M&Q PACKAGING 75 $51.05 $3,828.75 42001 M & Q PACKAGING CORP          M & Q PACKAGING CORP          1-2 Business Days $36.64 2,748.00$        7096468 SYS CLS 1/50 CT NO BID
PAN LINER, FULL PAN 6", NYLON OVENABLE 42002 1 50 CASE M&Q PACKAGING 40 $28.95 $1,158.00 42002 M & Q PACKAGING CORP          M & Q PACKAGING CORP          1-2 Business Days $57.16 2,286.40$        4037198 PANSAVR 50/34X18 NO BID
PAN LINER, HALF PAN 6", NYLON OVENABLE 42636 1 100 CASE PAN SAVER 5 $32.75 $163.75 PL42636 M & Q PACKAGING CORP          M & Q PACKAGING CORP          1-2 Business Days $41.83 209.15$            4897302 PANSAVR 100/23X14 NO BID
PLATE, SUGARCANE, NATURAL, 9" VB9PBPPPF 4 125 CASE VICTORIA BAY 25 $31.60 $790.00 VB9PBPPPF VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $90.56 2,264.00$        7127835 ECOPROD 10/50 CT $41.33 1,033.25$        NEW ITEM EMPRESS EARTH 500CT 7-14 Days
SCOUR PAD, HEAVY DUTY, GREEN, 6X9 7000045876 1 20 CASE 3M SCOTCH-BRITE 15 $6.70 $100.50 OC86 3M SCOTCH-BRITE 3M SCOTCH-BRITE 1-2 Business Days $2.03 30.45$              1376862 SUPPCLS 1/18CT NO BID
SCOUR PAD, LIGHT DUTY, WHITE VB98LSP 1 20 CASE  VICTORIA BAY 5 $5.60 $28.00 VB98LSP JANICO INC                    JANICO INC                    1-2 Business Days $28.86 144.30$            4842765 SUPPCLS 1/40 CT $13.22 66.10$              NEW ITEM PERFORMANCE PLUS 18CT 7-14 Days
SCRUBBER, STAINLESS STEEL VBSSSCRU50 1 12 CASE VICTORIA BAY 5 $4.40 $22.00 VBSSSCRU50 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $26.15 130.75$            5793872 SUPPCLS 1/12CT $45.28 226.40$            259973 ACS 72CT 7-14 Days
TRAY, 2 # FOOD, RED PLAID 35122042 1 1000 CASE HUHTAMAKI 850 $18.85 $16,022.50 RC200 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $31.68 26,928.00$      1998465 SYS REL 4/250CT $26.21 22,278.50$      NEW ITEM NOVA 1000CT 7-14 Days
TRAY, 3 # FOOD, RED PLAID 35122045 1 500 CASE HUHTAMAKI 250 $15.35 $3,837.50 RC300 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $25.97 6,492.50$        1998477 SYS REL 2/250CT $22.32 5,580.00$        NEW ITEM NOVA 500CT 7-14 Days
TRAY, 5 # FOOD, RED PLAID 35122048FT5 2 250 CASE HUHTAMAKI 700 $18.15 $12,705.00 RC500 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days NO BID $25.69 17,983.00$      259976 NOVA 500CT 7-14 Days
TRAY, 5 COMPARTMENT, NATURAL VBGS5COMPPPF 1 500 CASE VICTORIA BAY 2500 $34.25 $85,625.00 VBGS5COMPPPF VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $26.84 67,100.00$      7187671 CHINET 1/240 CT $41.02 102,550.00$    NEW ITEM GOLDEN PANTRY 500CT 7-14 Days
UTENSIL, FORK, WHITE, HEAVY DUTY, PLASTIC 20601 20 50 CASE GOLDMAX 140 $18.85 $2,639.00 20601 GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES INC        GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES INC        1-2 Business Days $18.09 2,532.60$        7947304 SYS CLS 1/1000CT $19.35 2,709.00$        NEW ITEM EMPRESS 1000CT 7-14 Days
UTENSIL, SPOON, WHITE, HEAVY DUTY, PLASTIC 20611 20 50 CASE GOLDMAX 130 $18.85 $2,450.50 20611 GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES INC        GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES INC        1-2 Business Days $18.09 2,351.70$        8003422 SYS CLS 1/1000CT $19.84 2,579.20$        NEW ITEM EMPRESS 1000CT 7-14 Days
UTENSIL, SPORKETTE Lunch Kit, med. wt., with napkin, 5 3/4" milk straw SPORKMK 1 1000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 900 $11.45 $10,305.00 SPORKMK VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $40.24 36,216.00$      2915645 PRAIRIE 1/1000CT $15.93 14,337.00$      NEW ITEM GOLDEN PANTRY 1000CT 7-14 Days
WRAP, PAPER, CHECK RED, 12X12 COB01008 5 1000 CASE VICTORIA BAY 5 $82.00 $410.00 COB01008 VICTORIA BAY VICTORIA BAY 1-2 Business Days $64.69 323.45$            8775318 BAGCRFT 1/2000CT $132.03 660.15$            NEW ITEM NORPAK 5000CT 7-14 Days

Totals $194,007.00 205,395.15$   250,653.15$   

Awarded Item =

 P& R  SYSCO  GOLD STAR  PAPER 



EVALUATION CRITERIA 
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

P & R SYSCO GOLD STAR

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points)

20 15 15

Product Availability 
(30 points)

30 20 20

Price
(35 points)

35 30 25

TOTAL 100 80 75

Sysco:
minus 5 points product specs, only bid 34 out of 51 items
minus 10 points product availability, only bid 34 out of 51 items
minus 5 points cost

Gold Star:
minus 5 points product specs, only bid 39 out of 51 items
minus 10 points product availability, only bid 34 out of 51 items
minus 10 points cost

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
Paper Award Analysis



GRAIN
Estimated 

Annual 
Usage

Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer 
Product Code 

Price
Distributor 

Code

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor 

Code

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

 Frozen
BUN, HAMBURGER, GLUTEN FREE, IW 5 24 3.2 OZ CASE UDI'S 80644 $35.04 140159 2 Days $39.35 0758401 UDISHFD 24/1EA

PROTEIN, M/MA
Estimated 

Annual 
Usage

Pack Size
Purchase 

Unit
Brand

Manufacturer's 
Product Code #

Price
Distributor 

Code

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Price
Distributor 

Code

Brand Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Pack Size Bid 
(if different 
from Spec)

Lead Time 
Special Order
(non-stocked)

Frozen
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE, GLUTEN FREE, IW 5 12 5.5 OZ CASE AMY'S 42272-00353-2 $35.97 149810 12 Days $35.23 4289847 AMYS 12/5.5 OZ 8
BURRITO, BEAN & RICE, DAIRY FREE, GLUTEN FREE, IW 5 12 5.5 OZ CASE AMY'S 352-622606 $35.97 113948 2 Days $35.23 1617999 AMYS 12/5.5 OZ 8
CHICKEN, TENDERS, GLUTEN FREE 10 2 5 # CASE BRAKEBUSH 5810 $43.39 134325 7 Days $40.18 1960473 BRKBUSH 2/5 LB 8

Awarded Item =

GOLD STAR SYSCOGLUTEN FREE 



EVALUATION CRITERIA 
(100 POINTS TOTAL)

GOLD STAR SYSCO

Customer Service
Past Experience 

(15 points)
15 15

Product Specifications
 (20 points) 20 20

Product Availability 
(30 points) 30 22

Price 
(35 points) 33 35

TOTAL 98 92

Gold Star:
minus 2 point price

Sysco:
minus 8 points product availability, 3 out of 4 items bid are special order

2026-2027 TRACY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
Gluten Free Items Award Analysis
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