INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO
CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER

FROM: TED HUNYADI é
DIRBCTOR QF FACILITIES AND SECURITY z (
% (4/?

SUBJECT: BID RESULTS - BID # 26-018 BOE
CUSTODIANS & MAINTAINERS UNIFORMS

DATE: APRIL 21, 2026

Elio,

This is to inform you that Bid #26-018 BoE for Custodian and Maintainer Uniforms has been
reviewed. A total of two vendors submitted proposals: '

¢ Feury Image Group
¢ Hanover Uniform Company

Based on the bid tabulation and pricing analysis, Feury Image Group submitted the lowest pricing
for the majority of items across both custodial and maintainer uniforms.

Additionally, Feury Tmage Group is the district’s current uniform provider and has consistently met
all contract requirements over the past three years. Their performance has been reliable in terms of
product quality, order accuracy, and timely delivery of uniforms to staff,

Given both their competitive pricing and proven service record, I recommend awarding Bid #
26-018 BoE to Feury Image Group.

Please let me know if you require any additional information.

Sincerely,

Ted Hunyadi
Director of Facilities

Westport Public Schools, 110 Myrtie Ave., Westport, CT 06880




WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS BID # 26-018- BOE CUSTODIANS UNIFORMS

FEURY IMAGE GROUP

HANOVER UNIFORM

BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR SIZE BRAND PROPOSED / SPECIFICATIONS 2006-2007 2007-2028 2028-2029 BRAND PROPOSED / SPECIFICATIONS 2006-2027 2007-2028 2008-2029
HATS HATS HATS
1 Baseball Cap NAVY MULTIPLE BASEBALL CAP - 4199 $ 9.01 | $ 843 | % 9.56 PORT AUTHORITY CP80 $ 9.95 | $ 1045 | $ 10.97
2 Beanie NAVY MULTIPLE ACRYLIC BEANIE - 4243 $ 8.18 | $ 8.18 | $ 8.68 PORT AUTHORITY CP90 $ 850 | $ 893 | $ 9.37
BELT BELT BELT
3 |15" Genuine Leather Belt BLACK MULTIPLE 15" GENUINE LEATHER BELT LA-1288 E 19.00 | $ 1957 [ 8 20.16 | |RED KAP AB12 BK E 2275 | $ 2389 | $ 25.08
BOOTS BOOTS BOOTS
4 XPRT 2.0 Tactical 2.0 Boot BLACK MULTIPLE XPRT 2.0 TACTICAL 2.0 BOOT - 12443 ABR $ 17187 | $ 177.03 | $ 182.34 5.11 - #12401 $ 115.95 | $ 121.75 | $ 127.83
5 Women's A.T.A.C. 2.06 Boot BLACK MULTIPLE WOMEN'S AT.A.C. 2.03 BOOT - 12405 $ 116.98 | $ 120.49 | $ 124.10 5.11 - #12405 $ 11595 | $ 12175 | $ 127.83
6 AT.A.C 2.06 Boot BLACK MULTIPLE AT.A.C.2.03 BOOT - 12401 $ 116.98 | $ 120.49 | $ 124.10 5.11 - #12394 $ 11450 | $ 120.23 | $ 126.24
PANTS PANTS PANTS
7 Pantsuit NAVY MULTIPLE DICKIES PREMIUM IND. CARGO PANT - LP72 $ 3333 | $ 3433 | $ 35.36 NO BID $ - $ - $ -
8 Cargo Pant NAVY MULTIPLE RED KAP MEN'S IND. CARGO PANT - PT88 $ 3789 | $ 39.03 | $ 40.20 REDKAP PT88 CARGO PANT $ 29.00 | $ 3045 | $ 31.97
9 Cotton Work Pant NAVY MULTIPLE RED KAP COTTON WORK PANT - PC20 $ 3858 | $ 3074 | $ 40.93 REDKAP PC20 COTTON PANT $ 3250 | $ 3413 | $ 35.83
10 Pant NAVY MULTIPLE RED KAP MEN'S DURAKAP IND. PANT PT20 $ 2153 | $ 2218 | $ 22.84 REDKAP PT20 WORK PANT $ 23.00 | $ 2415 | $ 25.36
HOODED / SWEATSHIRT HOODS HOODS
11 Thermal Zipper Sweatshirt NAVY MULTIPLE THERMAL ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT - 131 $ 9283 | $ 9561 | $ 98.48 CORNERSTONE CS620 $ 69.00 | $ 72.45 | $ 76.07
12 Hooded Pullover NAVY MULTIPLE UNISEX HOODED SWEATSHIRT 998MR $ 26.58 | $ 27.38 | $ 28.20 CORNERSTONE CSF630 $ 4200 | $ 4410 | $ 46.31
JACKETS JACKETS JACKETS
13 Yukon Parka NAVY MULTIPLE PARKA - 3100 $ 26491 | $ 272.86 | $ 281.04 GAME 3 IN 1 PARKA #3100 $ 136.25 | $ 143.06 | $ 150.22
14 Bomber Jacket NAVY MULTIPLE BOMBER JACKET - 505M $ 5751 | $ 59.24 | $ 61.01 TACT SQUAD BOMBER #1001 $ 65.00 | $ 68.25 | $ 71.66
15 3in 1 Parka MIDNT MULTIPLE 3IN 1 PARKA WOTH DOBBY TRIM - 88007 $ 135.07 | $ 139.12 | $ 143.30 GAME 3 IN 1 PARKA #3100 $ 136.25 | $ 143.06 | $ 150.22
16  |Zip off Hood Parka NAVY MULTIPLE ZIP OFF HOOD PARKA - 568M $ 76.65 | $ 78.95 | $ 81.32 TACT SQUAD BOMBER #1011 $ 69.00 | $ 7245 | $ 76.07
SOCKS SOCKS SOCKS
17 |Socks BLACK MULTIPLE ROTHCO ATHLETIC CREW SOCK - 6429 $ 265 |$ 273 | $ 2.81 CARNHART CTSC4223 (3) PAIR PACK $ 16.50 | $ 1733 | $ 18.19
18 Socks WHITE MULTIPLE ROTHCO ATHLETIC CREW SOCK - 9439 $ 265 | 3% 273 | $ 2.81 CARNHART CTSC4223 (3) PAIR PACK $ 16.50 | $ 1733 | $ 18.19
19 Cold Weather Socks NATURAL ROTHCO HEAVYWEIGHT THERMAL - 6149 $ 530 | $ 546 | $ 5.62 5.11 DUTY SOCK WOOL # 10053 $ 20.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 22.05
THERMAL CLOTHES THERMAL CLOTHES THERMAL CLOTHES
20 Thermal Bottom MULTIPLE ROTHCO THERMAL BOTTOM - 6454 $ 1393 | $ 1435 | $ 14.78 5.11 THERMAL BOTTOM # 40184 $ 48.00 | $ 50.40 | $ 52.92
21 Thermal Hooded Sweatshirt NAVY MULTIPLE CORNERSTONE HOODED SEATHSHIRT CS620 $ 65.81 | $ 67.78 | $ 69.82 CORNERSTONE HOOD WITH ZIP $ 65.95 | $ 69.25 | $ 72.71
22 Thermal Top MULTIPLE ROTHCO THERMAL TOP - 6446 $ 20.22 | $ 20.83 | $ 21.45 5.11 THERMAL UNDERSHORT LS #42194 $ 58.00 | $ 60.90 | $ 63.95
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JERZEES / SHIRTS/ POLOS - H.C. AND AHC ONLY wear white color JERZEES / SHIRTS/ POLOS JERZEES / SHIRTS/ POLOS
23 |Timberline Microfiber Pique NAVY MULTIPLE SPORT-TEK L/S POSICHARGE TEE - ST350LS $ 14.40 | $ 1483 | $ 15.28 PORT AUTHORITY K200 PIQUE SS POLO $ 2050 | $ 2153 | $ 22.60
24 Shirt NAVY MULTIPLE COOL & DRY SPORT L/S PERF. TSHIRT- 8422 $ 1181 | $ 1216 | $ 12.53 PORT &CO 100% COTTON TEE PC54 $ 1150 | $ 12.08 | $ 12.68
25 Gildan 50/50 Jersey Polo NAVY MULTIPLE UNISEX DRYBLEND JERSEY POLO - 8800 $ 1834 | $ 18.89 | $ 19.46 GILDAN 50/50 POLO # 8800 $ 2050 | $ 2153 1|$ 22.60
26 60/40 Pocket Polo NAVY MULTIPLE PORT AUTHORITY POLO W/POCKET - K500P $ 2435 | $ 25.08 | $ 25.83 PORT AUTHORITY 60/40 POLO K100P $ 2095 | $ 2200 | $ 23.10
27 Ultra Cttn Pocket Tee NAVY MULTIPLE UNISEX ULTRA COTTON POCKET TSHIRT -2300 $ 1578 | $ 16.25 | $ 16.74 PORT &CO POCKET COTTON TEE PC54P $ 1475 | $ 15.49 | $ 16.26
28 50/50 Tee NAVY MULTIPLE UNISEX DRYBLEND T-SHIRT - 8000 $ 12.28 | $ 1265 | $ 13.03 PORT &CO 50/50 SS TEE PC55 $ 1250 | $ 1313 | $ 13.78
29 Micro Crewneck S/S Tee NAVY MULTIPLE SPORT TEK COMPETITOR TEE - ST350 $ 1284 | $ 1323 | $ 13.62 JERZEE PREMIUM 50/50 CREWNECK #560M $ 13.00 | $ 1365 | $ 14.33
30 Timberline Microfiber Pique WHITE MULTIPLE SPORT TEK POSICHARGE TEE - ST350 $ 1284 | $ 1323 | $ 13.62 PORT AUTHORITY K200 PIQUE SS POLO $ 20.50 | $ 2153 | $ 22.60
31 Shirt WHITE MULTIPLE RED KAP INDUSTRIAL WORK TSHIRT - SP14 $ 22311 % 2298 | $ 23.67 PORT &CO 100% COTTON TEE PC54 $ 1150 | $ 12.08 | $ 12.68
32 Polo Shirt WHITE MULTIPLE PORT&CO CORE BLEND PIQUE POLO KP155 $ 1731 $ 1783 | $ 18.36 GILDAN 50/50 POLO # 8800 $ 2050 | $ 2153 1|$ 22.60
33 60/40 Pocket Polo WHITE MULTIPLE UNISEX DRYBLEND JERSEY POLO - 8300 $ 1834 | $ 18.89 | $ 19.46 PORT AUTHORITY 60/40 POLO K100P $ 2095 | $ 2200 1% 23.10
34 Jerzee 50/50 Crewneck WHITE MULTIPLE NUBLEND CREWNECK SWEATSHIRT - 562MR $ 1713 | $ 1764 | $ 18.17 PORT &CO POCKET COTTON TEE PC54P $ 1475 | $ 15.49 | $ 16.26
35 50/50 Tee WHITE MULTIPLE UNISEX DRYBLEND T-SHIRT - 8000 $ 1151 | $ 11.86 | $ 12.21 PORT &CO 50/50 SS TEE PC55 $ 1250 | $ 1313 | $ 13.78
36 Micro Crewneck S/S Tee WHITE MULTIPLE SPORT TEK COMPETITOR TEE - ST350 $ 1284 | $ 13.23 | $ 13.62 JERZEE PREMIUM 50/50 CREWNECK #560M $ 13.00 | $ 1365 | $ 14.33
GLOVES GLOVES GLOVES
37 Leather Glove BLACK MULTIPLE ROTHCO INSULATED GLOVE - 3559 $ 2877 | $ 2963 | $ 30.52 5.11 LEATHER PATROL GLOVE # 59800 $ 65.00 | $ 68.25 | $ 71.66
38 Cold Weather Glove BLACK MULTIPLE ROTHCO STREET SHIELD GLOVE - 4436 $ 2726 | $ 28.08 | $ 28.92 CARNHARDT THERMAL GLOVE #CTGF0622 $ 3550 | $ 3728 | $ 39.14
LOWER BIDS 2026-2027 # ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 25
HANOVER UNIFORM 13
LOWER BIDS 2027-2028 # ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 26
HANOVER UNIFORM 12
LOWER BIDS 2028-2029 # ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 28
HANOVER UNIFORM 10
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS BID # 26-018- BOE MAINTAINERS UNIFORMS

\ Q"ggg"fl -
3 FEURY IMAGE GROUP HANOVER UNIFORM
ITEM DESCRIPTION (EZPUEEL'FCL‘;’;TE'?PESR) COLOR SIZE BRAND PROPOSED / SPECIFICATIONS le(?zg. ';('];E BZ'OE;:_ ';(;SBE BZ'(?Z;’_ ';(']ZCQE BRAND PROPOSED / SPECIFICATIONS leo.ég. ':éch BZ'OE;:_ ';(')SSE le0ng ;;ngE
PANTS / BELTS PANTS / BELTS PANTS / BELTS
1 |Belt CARNHARDT BRN MULTIPLE 15" GENUINE LEATHER BELT - LA1288 $ 19.00 | $ 1957 $ 20.16 NO BID $ s T s -
2 |Relaxed Fit Jean DICKIES INDI MULTIPLE DICKIES IND. RELAXED FIT JEAN - CR39 $ 27.79 | $ 2862 | $ 2948 | |DICKIES CR39 $ 30.00 | $ 3150 | $ 33.08
3 |Traditional Fit Jean DICKIES SNB MULTIPLE DICKIES IND. REGULAR FIT JEAN - CR993 $ 2779 | $ 2862 | $ 2948 | |DICKIES 1329 $ 30.00 | $ 3150 | $ 33.08
4 |Carpenter Jean DICKIES SNB MULTIPLE DICKIES CARPENTER JEAN - 1099 $ 3316 | $ 3415 | $ 3518 | |DICKIES 1999 $ 35.00 | $ 36.75 | $ 38.50
5 |Carpenter Pants DICKIES NAVY MULTIPLE DICKIES PREMIUM IND. CARGO PANT - LP72 $ 3333 | $ 3433 | $ 3536 | |DICKIES 1933 $ 3500 | $ 36.75 | $ 38.59
6 |Relaxed Fit Jean LEVI 560 BLUE MULTIPLE WRANGLER RELAXED FIT JEAN - 35001A1 $ 4937 | $ 50.85 | $ 5238 | |REDKAP PD60 $ 27.00 | $ 2835 | $ 29.77
7 |Flanel Lined Jean CARNHARDT DST MULTIPLE CARNHARTT FLANEL LINED JEAN - 104942 $ 5330 | $ 54.90 | $ 56.55 NO BID $ s T s }
8 9.5" Relaxed Fit Jean Short DICKIES SNB MULTIPLE ARIAT FIT DENIM SHORTS - 10073835 $ 40.89 | $ 4212 | $ 43.38 NO BID $ - $ - $ -
9 |13" Cargo Short DICKIES DNSV MULTIPLE RED KAP PRO SHORTS PX52 $ 39.78 | $ 4097 | $ 42.20 | |DICKIES WP90 $ 4250 | $ 4463 | $ 46.86
10 |11" Cargo Short DICKIES NV MULTIPLE 11' IND. CARGO SHORT - LR42 $ 28.70 | $ 2956 | $ 3045 | |DICKIES LROO $ 25.25 | $ 2651 | $ 27.84
11 |8.5" Relaxed Fit Jean Short CARNHARDT DST MULTIPLE ARIAT DENIM UTILITY SHORTS - 10039286 $ 4164 | $ 4289 | $ 4418 NO BID $ - s - s -
HOODS /| HATS HOODS / HATS HOODS / HATS
12 |Sherpa Lined Zip Hoodie DICKIES DB MULTIPLE SHERPA LINED ZIP HOODIE - 52101 $ 68.52 | 7058 | $ 72.69 | |DRI-DUCK FLEECE ZIP HOODY #7035 $ 7125 | $ 7481 $ 78.55
13 |Thermal Lined Zip Hoodie CARNHARDT BRN MULTIPLE THERMA; LINED UP ZIP HOODIES - 131 $ 9283 | $ 95,61 | $ 9848 | |CORNERSTONE CS620 $ 69.00 | $ 7245 | $ 76.07
14 |Knit Hat CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE CARNHARTT WATCH CAP 2.0 - CT104597 $ 27.80 | $ 2863 | $ 2949 | |CARNHARTT KNIT HAT #CT104597 $ 2450 | $ 25.73 | $ 27.01
JERZEES / SHIRTS/ POLOS JERZEES | SHIRTS/ POLOS JERZEES / SHIRTS/ POLOS
15  |Long Sleeve Twill Shirt CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE LONG SLEEVETWILL SHIRTS - SHMHLS $ 1807 | $ 1861 | $ 1917 | |CARNHARTT CT105291 DARK KHAKI $ 69.00 | $ 7245 $ 76.07
16 |Long Sleeve T-Shirt CARNHARDT MCH MULTIPLE GILDAN L/S T-SHIRT G2400 $ 15.66 | $ 16.13 | $ 1661 | |CARNHARTT CTK126LS TEE WITH POCKET $ 3300 | $ 3465 | $ 36.38
17 |Henly Shirt CARNHARDT BRN MULTIPLE HENLY SHIRTS - N3165 $ 1336 | $ 13.76 | $ 1417 | |CARNHARTT HENLEY LS TEE CTK128 $ 3500 | $ 36.75 | $ 38.59
18 |Pocket T-Shirt CARNHARDT MCH MULTIPLE CARNHARTT POCKET S/S TSHIRT - CTK87 $ 2777 | $ 28.60 | $ 2946 | |CARNHART SS TEE WITH POCKET $ 30.00 | $ 3150 | $ 33.08
19 |Port Authority Polo DARK MULTIPLE PORT AUTHORITY SILK TOUCH POLO - K500 $ 2179 | $ 2244 | $ 2312 | |BLUE GEN. (TAN) SS POLO BG7500 $ 21.00 | § 2205 | $ 23.15
20 |Port Authority Pocket Polo STONE MULTIPLE PORT AUTHORITY POLO WITH POCKET - K500P $ 2435 | $ 2508 | $ 2583 | |BLUE GEN. SS POLO WITH POCKET BG7501 $ 24.00 | $ 2520 | $ 26.46
21 |Hanez 90z Sweat Shirt DBR MULTIPLE GILDAN HEAVY BLEND CREWNECK - 18000 $ 1963 | $ 2022 | $ 20.83 | |HANES P160 ARMY BROWN CREW $ 21.00 | $ 2205 | $ 23.15
JACKETS JACKETS JACKETS
22 |Sandstone Artic Jacket CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE DUCK DETROIT JACKET - CT 103828 $ 13874 | $ 13874 | $ 14290 | |CARNHARTT 106674 $ 130.00 | $ 13650 | $ 14333
23 Santa Fe Jacket CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE THERMAL - LINED ACTIVE JACKET - CT106678 $ 113.88 | $ 117.30 | $ 120.82 REDKAP JT50 $ 58.00 | $ 60.90 | $ 63.95
24 |Active Jacket with Hood CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE QUILTED LINED ACTIVE JACKET CT106677 $ 12455 | $ 12829 | $ 13214 | |CARNHARTT 106673 $ 121.00 | $ 127.05 | $ 133.40
25 |Sandstone Vest CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE CARNHARTT DUCK VEST - CT106676 $ 88.36 | $ 91.01 | $ 9374 | |CARNHART CT 106676 $ 95.00 | $ 99.75 | $ 104.74
26 |Sandstone Artic Hood CARNHARDT DKB MULTIPLE RED KAP SNAP-ON HOOD - HD20BD $ 3212 | $ 3308 | $ 3408 | |CARNHART CT 102368 $ 2300 | $ 2415 | $ 25.36
THERMAL CLOTHES / SOCKS THERMAL CLOTHES / SOCKS THERMAL CLOTHES / SOCKS
27 |Thermal Bottom NAT MULTIPLE ROTHCO THERML KNIT BOTTOM - 6454 $ 1393 | $ 1435 $ 1478 | |2.11 THERMAL BOTTOM #40184 $ 4800 | $ 50.40 | $ 52.92
28 |Thermal Top NAT MULTIPLE ROTHCO THERMAL KNIT TOP - 6446 $ 2022 | $ 2083 | $ 2145 | |5.11 THERMAL UNDERSHIRT LS #42194 $ 58.00 | $ 60.90 | $ 63.95
29 |Artic Boot Sock CARNHARDT GRY MULTIPLE ROTHCO HEAVYWEIGHT THERMAL SOCK - 6149 | $ 530 | $ 546 | $ 562 | |5.11 DUTY SOCK WOOL #10053 (1) PAIR $ 20.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 22.05
30 |Boot Sock CARNHARDT WHITE MULTIPLE ROTHCO ATHLETIC CREW SOCK - 6439 $ 265 273 $ 281 | |5.11 DUTY SOCK WOOL #10053 (1) PAIR $ 20,00 | $ 21.00 | $ 22.05
31 |Crew Sock MULTIPLE ROTHCO ATHLETIC CREW SOCK - 9439 $ 265 | % 273 | $ 281 | |CARNHARTT CTSC4223 (3) PAIR PACK $ 1650 | $ 1733 % 18.19
FIRE RATED PANTS FIRE RATED PANTS FIRE RATED PANTS
32 |Straight Fit Jeans W/Strech SANDED DENIM | MULTIPLE BULWARK STRAIGHT FIT JEAN - PSJ4 $ 87.10 | $ 80.71] $ 9240 | |#PSl4 $ 95.00 | $ 99.75 | $ 104.74
33 |Relaxed Fit Jeans W/Strech SANDED DENIM | MULTIPLE BULWARK RELAXED FIT BOOTCUT JEAN -PSJ2 $ 91.28 | $ 9402 | $ 96.84 | |#PSI2SD $ 97.00 | $ 10185 | $ 106.94
34 |Pre Washed Denim Jeans BLUE DENIM MULTIPLE BULWARK PREWASHED DENIM JEAN - PEJ4 $ 59.31 | $ 61.00 | $ 62.92 | |#PEJ $ 82.00 | $ 86.10 | $ 90.41
35  |Cargo Pocket Work Pants NAVY MULTIPLE BULWARK CARGO POCKET WORK PANT - PLC2 $ 84.44 | $ 86.97 | $ 89.58 | [#PMU2 $ 11500 | $ 12075 | $ 126.79
36 |Stone Wash Denim MULTIPLE BULWARK STONE WASH DENIM - PEJ8 $ 88.80 | $ 91.46 | $ 9421 | |#PEJS $ 95.00 | $ 99.75 | $ 104.74
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FIRE RATED SHIRTS FIRE RATED SHIRTS FIRE RATED SHIRTS
37 |LS Tagless Henley Shirt KHAKI MULTIPLE BULWARK LONG SLEEVE HENLEY SHORT -SEL2 | $ 7429 | $ 7652 | $ 78.81 #SML2 (KHAKI/TAN) $ 140.00 | $ 147.00 | $ 154.35
38 |LS Comfort Knit Polo KHAKI MULTIPLE BULWARK LS COMFORT KNIT POLO - QT12 $ 96.48 | $ 99.37 | $ 102.36 #SMP2 (KHAKI/TAN) $ 140.00 | $ 147.00 | $ 154.35
39 |SS Comfort Knit-T-Shirt KHAKI MULTIPLE PORT &CO ESSENTIAL TEE - PC61 $ 9.89 | $ 10.19 | $ 10.49 #102903 (KHAKI/TAN) $ 75.00 | $ 7875 | $ 82.69
40 |LS Comfort Knit T-Shirt KHAKI MULTIPLE PORT &CO LONG SLEEVE TEE - PC61LS $ 14.04 | $ 14.46 | $ 14.90 #SMT8 (KHAKI/TAN) $ 60.00 | $ 63.00 | $ 66.15
41 |Button Frontwork Shirt KHAKI MULTIPLE BULWARK BUTOON FRONT WORK SIRT - SLW2 $ 7782 | $ 80.15 | $ 82.56 #STG4 (KHAKI/TAN) $ 100.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 110.25
FIRE RATED JACKETS FIRE RATED JACKETS FIRE RATED JACKETS
42 |Comfortouch Linen Bomber Jacket BROWN DUCK | MULTIPLE BULWARK BOMBER JACKET - JLH4 $ 250.87 | $ 258.40 | $ 266.15 107076 - FR BROWN JACKET $ 275.00 | $ 288.75 | $ 303.19
43 |Lined Bomber Jacket BROWN DUCK | MULTIPLE BULWARK LINED BOMBER JACKET - JLB6 $ 24257 | $ 249.85 | $ 257.34 107076 - FR BROWN JACKET $ 275.00 | $ 288.75 | $ 303.19
44 |Heaviweight FR Insulated Hooded Jacket BROWN DUCK | MULTIPLE HEAVYWEIGHT FR INSU. HOOD JACKET - JLH6 $ 254.45 | $ 262.08 | $ 269.95 UFRA48 - FLAME QUILT LINE FR JACKET $ 180.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 198.45
FIRE RATED RAINWEAR FIRE RATED RAINWEAR FIRE RATED RAINWEAR
45  [Hi-Visibility Flame-Resistant Rainwear YELLOW MULTIPLE HI-VISIBILITY FLAME RESISTANT -JXN4 - BXN4 |s 915.76 | $ 94323 % 269.95 NO BID |s E E -
LOWER BIDS 2026-2027 #ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 34
HANOVER UNIFORM 11
LOWER BIDS 2027-2028 #ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 35
HANOVER UNIFORM 10
LOWER BIDS 2028-2029 #ITEMS
FEURY IMAGE GROUP 38
HANOVER UNIFORM 7
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