MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Final Tabulation
RFB 5823 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: April 29, 2025

Appendix C.1
Group A: EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY) with CLUB RECREATION PROGRAM

. . North America Central School Bus . . .
Sites Program First Student, Inc. L;lfizscfﬁsglusl;scd Lamers Bus Lines, Inc. Durham sih;’)o' Services, Intermediate Holding Co., LLC dba Safeway Trans];‘olnl—:? tion Wisconsin
o o 1llinois Central School Bus, LLC
Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run S 285.00 no bid S 250.00 no bid no bid S 189.00
SCE:SSS?E;R Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run S 350.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 199.00
Gaenslen (ESY) Small Bus cost for single tier run S 260.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 198.79 | $ 192.08 | $ 189.00
Small Bus Cost for paired tier run 5 325.00 no bid no bid S 99.39 | $ 247.00 | S 199.00
CLUB Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid 5 275.00 no bid no bid S 194.00
RECREATION |Small Bus cost for single tier run S 270.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 165.66 | S 192.08 | $ 201.00
Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid 5 250.00 no bid no bid S 189.00
S(?:I%SSB?;R Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run S 350.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 199.00
MACL (ESY) Small Bus cost for single tier run S 260.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 198.79 | $ 192.08 | $ 189.00
Small Bus Cost for paired tier run 5 325.00 no bid no bid S 99.39 | $ 247.00 | S 199.00
CLUB Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid S 275.00 no bid no bid S 194.00
RECREATION |Small Bus cost for single tier run S 270.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 165.66 | $ 192.08 | $ 201.00
Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid S 250.00 no bid no bid S 189.00
SCI‘:I—)I((-)F(I;:E”\)(::E],)AR Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run S 350.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 199.00
Clement (ESY) Small Bus cost for single tier run S 260.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 198.79 | $ 192.08 | $ 189.00
Small Bus Cost for paired tier run S 325.00 no bid no bid S 99.39 | $ 247.00 | S 199.00
CLUB Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid S 275.00 no bid no bid S 194.00
RECREATION |Small Bus cost for single tier run S 270.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 165.66 | $ 192.08 | $ 201.00
Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run 5 285.00 no bid S 250.00 no bid no bid S 189.00
SCI‘:I—)I((-)F(I;:E”\)(::E],)AR Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run S 350.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 199.00
WCLL (ESY) Small Bus cost for single tier run S 260.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 198.79 | $ 192.08 | $ 189.00
Small Bus Cost for paired tier run S 325.00 no bid no bid S 99.39 | $ 247.00 | $ 199.00
CLUB Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run S 285.00 no bid S 275.00 no bid no bid S 194.00
RECREATION |Small Bus cost for single tier run S 270.00 no bid S 250.00 | $ 165.66 | S 192.08 | $ 201.00
Maximum Total Number of Orthopedically Equipped Small 30 No Bid a 0 0 No Limit
Buses Available on Any Day

Awarded to:

First Student, Inc.

Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus Intermediate Holding, LLC dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC



MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Final Tabulation
RFB 5823 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: April 29, 2025

Appendix C.2
Group C & D: SUMMER CLUB REC FIELD TRIPS & SUMMER ACADEMY FIELD TRIPS

- . Lakeside Buses of . . North Al:nerica Cfnlral School Bus Safeway Transportation
Sites / Address First Student, Inc. Wisconsin, Inc. Lamers Bus Lines, Inc. |Durham School Services, L.P. Inler'm?dlale Holding Co., LLC dba Wisconsin LLC
Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
AMF Bowlero
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
AMC Theaters
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Betty Brinn
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Cool Waters
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | S 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Festa Italiana
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | S 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Hawthorn Glen
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | S 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Kayla's Playground
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | S 204.54 | S 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Lakeshore Park
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 565.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 565.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid $ 565.00
Milwaukee County Zoo
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Milwaukee Public Museum
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Cinema
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 204.54 | $ 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
Wehr Nature Center
Cost per Large Bus| $ 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 21872 | $ 365.00
Cost per Small Bus| $ 275.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 265.05 | $ 218.72 | $ 375.00
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus| $ 325.00 no bid S 363.00 no bid no bid S 398.25
**Specific locations awarded to vendors, as indicated by highlight —

Awarded to:
First Student, Inc.
North America Central School Bus Intermediate Holding, LLC dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Final Tabulation
RFB 5823 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
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Appendix C.3
Group E: SUMMER CLC EXCEL PROGRAM

North America Central School Bus
Location First Student, Inc. L:\kli:i:sz I:s[:s:l' Lamers Bus Lines, Inc. | DUrham Sﬂ;‘_" Services, Intermediate Holding Co., LLC dba Safe;‘,’g;:::‘:‘:’:?"""
Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Silver Spring Neighborhood Center
small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid [s 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid [s 414.00 no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 365.00
Hayes Bili
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 no bid [s 414.00] no bid [s 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 365.00
Carver School 3D Printing
small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid [s 199.60 | $ 408.75
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid [s 414.00 no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 408.75
Carver School 3D Graphic Design
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 I no bid I $ 414.00 | no bid I $ 199.60 | $ 408.75
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid ['s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 408.75
Vincent/North/South/MacDowell
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid [s 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 I no bid I S 414.00 | no bid I S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Washi High School
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 I no bid I $ 414.00 | no bid I $ 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid ['s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 365.00
Troubadour Bakery
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 [ no bid [s 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 I no bid I S 414.00 | no bid I S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Urban Ecology Center - Riverside Park
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 I no bid I $ 414.00 | no bid I $ 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid ['s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 365.00
Urban Ecology Center - Washi Park
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 [ no bid [s 199.60 | $ 375.00
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 I no bid I S 414.00 | no bid I S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Travels to Schools (H20)
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 no bid [s 199.60 | $ 398.80
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid ['s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 398.80
Travels to Schools (Dance)
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 270.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid [s 199.60 | $ 398.98
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | no bid [s 414.00 | no bid ['s 199.60 | $ 398.80
**Specific locations awarded to vendors, as indicated by highlight —
Awarded to:

North America Central School Bus Intermediate Holding, LLC dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



MILWAUKEE
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Opening Date: April 29, 2025

Appendix C.4
Group F: SUMMER STARS TEEN PROGRAM

Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Day 65
Passenger Bus
North America Central School Bus
Location First Student, Inc. L&ll(iessci::si“sl‘;s:f Lamers Bus Lines, Inc. Durham Sclfu;ol Services, Intermediate Holding Co., LLC dba Safwi;iys;l;)r;rilislpsitgtion
. o Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
COA Youth & Family Center
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00] § 360.00 | 10 bid | 10 bid B 199.60 | $ 365.00
COA Goldin Center
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | § 360.00 | 1o bid | 10 bid B 199.60 | $ 365.00
Neighborhood House
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | § 360.00 | 1o bid | 10 bid [s 199.60 | $ 365.00
Northcott Neighborhood House
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | $ 360.00 | no bid | no bid | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
New Concept Self Development Center
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | $ 360.00 | no bid | no bid | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
‘Washington High School
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | $ 360.00 | no bid | no bid | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Andrew Douglas
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | $ 360.00 | no bid | no bid | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Obama High School
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | $ 360.00 | no bid | no bid | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Madison High School
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00] § 360.00 | 1o bid | 1o bid B 199.60 | $ 365.00
Bay View High School
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | § 360.00 | 1o bid | 1o bid B 199.60 | $ 365.00
Additonal sites within City of Milwaukee Limits
Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day| $ 285.00 | § 360.00 | 1o bid | 1o bid B 199.60 | $ 385.00
**Specific locations awarded to vendors, as indicated by highlight —
Awarded to:

North America Central School Bus Intermediate Holding, LLC dba lllinois Central School Bus, LLC



MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Final Tabulation
RFB 5823 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: April 29, 2025

Appendix C.5
Group G: SUMMER PLAYGROUND TRAVELING ADVENTURES

Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from
Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus
. . North America Central School Bus .
Location First Student, Inc. L:l/(iesii‘;i:s:iusl;scof Lamersll:: s Lines, | burham 5':“;“ Services, Intermediate Holding Co., LLC dba safe:\z;;:?:’:’: Ca tion
[ ) o Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Stonefire Pizza S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 | $ 275.60 | $ 365.00
Kids in Motion S 285.00 no bid S 375.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Wisconsin Brewing Company Park S 285.00 | $ 520.00 | $ 383.75 | $ 265.05 | $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
American Family Field S 285.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 498.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Franklin Field S 285.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 375.75 [ $ 265.05 | $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Cool Waters Outdoor Pool S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 375.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Brown Deer Pond S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 [ $ 265.05 | $ 223.28 | S 365.00
David F Schultz Aquatic Center S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
JB's on 41 S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Bowlero Wauwatosa S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 223.28 | $ 365.00
Milwaukee County Zoo S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 395.75 [ $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Bounce Milwaukee S 285.00 no bid S 395.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Milwaukee Public Museum S 285.00|$ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Betty Brinn Children's Museum S 285.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Slick City S 285.00 no bid S 373.75 | $ 265.05 [ $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
Big Putts Mini Golf S 285.00 no bid S 373.75 | $ 265.05 | $ 199.60 | $ 365.00
America's Action Territory S 285.00|$ 480.00 | S 373.75 | S 265.05 | S 275.60 | $ 365.00
Busy Barns Adventure Farm S 285.00 S 480.00 S 373.75 $ 265.05 $ 375.60 S 365.00
Blue Harbor Resort S 285.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 | $ 375.60 | $ 365.00
John Muir Trails S 285.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 460.00 | S 265.05 | $ 310.00 | $ 365.00
Destinations Inside of Milwaukee County S 285.00|$ 320.00 | $ 373.75 | $ 265.05 | S 199.60 | $ 365.00
Base Fee per Bus: Base Fee per Bus: N/A ' Base Fee per Bus: Base Fee per Bus: $275.60 Base Fee per Bus: $250
Destinations Outside of Milwaukee County $110 Hourly Rate: $90 no bid $198.20 Hourly Rate: $130 for 3 hours
Hourly Rate: $60 Hourly Rate: $99.10 Hourly Rate: $83.33
Max total number of buses on any day 30 10 15 (65 pass) 5 No Limit No Limit
4(w/c)
**Specific locations awarded to vendors, as indicated by highlight —

Awarded to:
Durham School Services, L.P.
North America Central School Bus Intermediate Holding, LLC dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



