
Destination

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside 

Buses of 

Wisconsin, 

Inc.

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America 

Central School Bus 

dba Illinois Central 

School Bus, LLC

Safeway 

Transportation 

Wisconsin LLC

America’s Action Territory 555.00$          336.00$           265.05$              284.41$                    412.00$             

American Family Field 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Alverno College 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

AMF Bowlero Lanes 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              234.19$                    412.00$             

AMF South Park Lanes 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

AMF West Allis Lanes 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

AMF West Lanes 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Art Museum 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Audubon Nature Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Betty Brinn Museum 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Boerner Botanical Gardens 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Bradley Symphony  Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              284.41$                    412.00$             

Butler Skateland 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Carroll University 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Cathedral Square 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

College Access Ctr. – North 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

College Access Ctr. – South 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Cool Waters 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

County Grounds Park 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Dave & Buster’s 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Discovery World 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

First Stage - Milwaukee Youth Arts Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Fiserv Forum 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Growing Power 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Harley Davidson Museum 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Havenwoods State Forest 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Hawthorne Glen 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Health Education Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Incredi-Roll 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              234.19$                    412.00$             

Italian Community Ctr. 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Jewish Museum 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Jones Island 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Junior Achievement 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Keep Greater Milwaukee Beautiful 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Klotsche Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Lynden Sculpture Garden 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Marcus Performing Arts Center  283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Marcus Theatre Menomonee Falls 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Marquette University 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

MATC  Downtown 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

MATC  Mequon 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

MATC  Oak Creek 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

MATC  West Allis 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              234.19$                    412.00$             

McGovern Park 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Medical College of WI 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Meir Festival Park 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Mequon Nature Preserve 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

MIAD 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Yellow Bus – Drop and Go
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Milwaukee Chamber Theatre 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee County Zoo 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library- Atkinson 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Bay View 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Capitol 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Center Street 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Central 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – East 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Forest Home 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Martin Luther King 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Mill Road 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Silver Spring 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Tippecanoe 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Villard Square 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Washington Park 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Zablocki 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Market 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Museum/ IMAX 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Repertory Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Youth Symphony Orchestra 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Youth Theatre 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Mitchell Park/Domes 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Mount Mary University 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

MSOE 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Oriental Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Pabst/Riverside Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

UW-Milwaukee Panther Arena 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Peace Action Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Peace Learning Center of Milwaukee 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Petit Ice Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Planetariums 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Potter Forest 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Potter Forest (WheelchairBus) 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Skylight Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

South Milwaukee Performing Arts Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Starbase Camp 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Survive Alive House 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Swan’s Pumpkin Farm 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              284.41$                    412.00$             

The Elegant Farmer 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              284.41$                    412.00$             

Todd Wehr Theater 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Urban Ecology Ctr.- Menom 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Urban Ecology Ctr.- Riverside 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Urban Ecology Ctr.- Wash 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

UWM Campus (Various Drop-Offs) 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

Whitnall Park/Wehr Nature Center 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

WI Center District 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              209.08$                    412.00$             

Wisconsin State Fair Grounds 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              234.19$                    412.00$             

Milwaukee Public Schools (All High Schools) 283.00$          336.00$           265.05$              259.30$                    412.00$             

**Specific locations awarded to five vendors, as indicated by highlight

Pre-approved vendors for all locations not listed on bid: 

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc. 

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC
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Destination

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside 

Buses of 

Wisconsin, 

Inc.

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America 

Central School 

Bus dba Illinois 

Central School 

Bus, LLC

Safeway 

Transportation 

Wisconsin LLC

America’s Action Territory 555.00$           567.00$           800.00$              528.82$              412.00$             

Apple Holler 555.00$           1,134.00$        800.00$              528.82$              412.00$             

Art Institute of Chicago 590.00$           No Bid 800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

Camp Edwards 555.00$           567.00$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Camp Matawa & Ice Age 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Camp Minikani 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Camp Palmyra 555.00$           661.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Camp Upham Woods 555.00$           750.00$           800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

Camp Whitcomb/Mason 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Field Museum of Natural History 590.00$           No Bid 800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

Jelly Belly 555.00$           661.50$           800.00$              550.22$              412.00$             

Lapham’s Peak 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Museum of Contemporary Art, Chicago 555.00$           No Bid 800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

Museum of Science and Industry 555.00$           No Bid 800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Nature’s Classroom 555.00$           567.00$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Navy Pier 590.00$           No Bid 800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Oak Ridge Farm 555.00$           567.00$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Old World Wisconsin 555.00$           661.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

River Edge Nature Center 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              712.00$             

Shalom Wildlife 555.00$           472.50$           800.00$              550.22$              412.00$             

Shedd Aquarium 590.00$           661.50$           800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

State Capitol 575.00$           661.50$           800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

UW Madison 575.00$           661.50$           800.00$              603.82$              712.00$             

**Specific locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight

Pre-approved vendors for all locations not listed on bid: 

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc. 

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC

Yellow Bus – Stay with Group

With the Possibility of Pick-Up before 9:00 AM and/or Return after 2:00 PM 

Final Tabulation

RFB 5827 Busing Transportation for Field Trips

Opening Date: August 6, 2025

Appendix  C.2

District-Sponsored Field Trips 

Page 3 of 6



Destination

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside 

Buses of 

Wisconsin, 

Inc.

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America 

Central School 

Bus dba Illinois 

Central School 

Bus, LLC

Safeway 

Transportation 

Wisconsin LLC

America’s Action Territory 555.00$           377.00$           450.00$              390.98$              402.00$             

Boerner Botanical Gardens 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Discovery World 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Junior Achievement 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library- Atkinson 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Bay View 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Capitol 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Center Street 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Central 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – East 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Forest Home 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Martin Luther King 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Mill Road 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Silver Spring 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Tippecanoe 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Villard Square 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Washington Park 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Library – Zablocki 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Milwaukee Public Museum 283.00$           377.00$           450.00$              255.98$              402.00$             

Oak Ridge Farm 555.00$           377.00$           450.00$              390.98$              402.00$             

**Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight 

Pre-approved vendors for all locations not listed on bid: 

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc. 

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC

With Pick-Up before 9:00 AM and/or Return after 2:00 PM 

Yellow Bus – Drop and Go

Final Tabulation

RFB 5827 Busing Transportation for Field Trips

Opening Date: August 6, 2025

Appendix  C.3

District-Sponsored Field Trips 
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Destination

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside 

Buses of 

Wisconsin, 

Inc.

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America 

Central School 

Bus dba Illinois 

Central School 

Bus, LLC

Safeway 

Transportation 

Wisconsin LLC

Boerner Botanical Gardens 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Discovery World 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Junior Achievement 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library- Atkinson 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Bay View 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Capitol 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Center Street 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Central 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – East 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Forest Home 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Martin Luther King 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Mill Road 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Silver Spring 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Tippecanoe 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Villard Square 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Washington Park 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Library – Zablocki 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Milwaukee Public Museum 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

Oak Ridge Farm 375.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$              

**Specific locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight 

No Bid received from:

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Pre-approved vendors for all locations not listed on bid: 

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc. 

Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC

With the Possibility of Pick-Up before 9:00 AM and/or Return after 2:00 PM 

Yellow Orthopedic Bus – Drop and Go

Final Tabulation

RFB 5827 Busing Transportation for Field Trips

Opening Date: August 6, 2025

Appendix  C.4

District-Sponsored Field Trips 
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Destination

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside 

Buses of 

Wisconsin, 

Inc.

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America 

Central School 

Bus dba Illinois 

Central School 

Bus, LLC

Safeway 

Transportation 

Wisconsin LLC

Al McGuire Center 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

AMF West Lanes 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

Cedarburg High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

Homestead High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

Nathan Hale High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

New Berlin West High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

North Division High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

Riverside High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

South Division 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

UW Oshkosh 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

Vincent High School 290.00$          378.00$          No Bid No Bid 488.00$               

**Specific locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight 

No Bid received from:

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Pre-approved vendors for all locations not listed on bid: 

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc. 

Safeway Transportation Wisconsin LLC

Special Olympics – Drop and Go

Final Tabulation

RFB 5827 Busing Transportation for Field Trips

Opening Date: August 6, 2025

Appendix  C.5

District-Sponsored Field Trips 

With the Possibility of Pick-Up before 9:00 AM and/or Return after 2:00 PM 
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