
NORTH REGION: COUNTY LINE RD-CAPITOL DR

Item # Item Description

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside Buses of 

Wisconsin, Inc.

Lamers Bus 

Lines, Inc.

MC 

Transportation 

Bus Company, 

LLC

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America Central 

School Bus dba Illinois 

Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation 

Services Corporation 
1 Single Tier (1 run per day)  $                125.00  $                                195.00 No Bid 120.00$                  134.02$                 94.41$                                       No Bid

2 Paired Tier (2 runs per day)  $                210.00  $                                290.00 No Bid 240.00$                  219.69$                 188.82$                                     No Bid

Total of Extended Line Items 335.00$             485.00$                           No Bid 360.00$              353.71$             283.23$                               No Bid

Number of Buses Offered: 25 15 0 0 20 23

Awarded to: 

CENTRAL REGION: CAPITOL DR-I94 FREEWAY

Item # Item Description

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside Buses of 

Wisconsin, Inc.

Lamers Bus 

Lines, Inc.

MC 

Transportation 

Bus Company, 

LLC

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America Central 

School Bus dba Illinois 

Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation 

Services Corporation 
1 Single Tier (1 run per day)  $                125.00  $                                195.00 No Bid 120.00$                  165.66$                 92.60$                                       No Bid

2 Paired Tier (2 runs per day)  $                210.00  $                                290.00 No Bid 240.00$                  282.96$                 185.20$                                     No Bid

Total of Extended Line Items 335.00$             485.00$                           No Bid 360.00$              448.62$             277.80$                               No Bid

Number of Buses Offered: 20 0 0 2 20 10

Awarded to: 

SOUTH REGION: I94 FREEWAY-GRANGE AVE

Item # Item Description

First Student, 

Inc.

Lakeside Buses of 

Wisconsin, Inc.

Lamers Bus 

Lines, Inc.

MC 

Transportation 

Bus Company, 

LLC

Durham School 

Services, L.P.

North America Central 

School Bus dba Illinois 

Central School Bus, LLC

Safeway Transportation 

Services Corporation 
1 Single Tier (1 run per day)  $                125.00  No Bid 84.95$                   120.00$                  181.48$                 89.91$                                       No Bid

2 Paired Tier (2 runs per day)  $                210.00  No Bid 169.00$                 240.00$                  314.60$                 179.82$                                     No Bid

Total of Extended Line Items 335.00$             No Bid 253.95$             360.00$              496.08$             269.73$                               No Bid

Number of Buses Offered: 20 0 13 6 20 23

Awarded to: 

First Student, Inc.

Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.

MC Transportation Bus Company LLC

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

Opening Date: June 25, 2025

RFB 5824 Mid-Day Transportation Services

Final Bid Tabulation
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