PARISH PuBLIC SCHoOOLS

PROJECT

Slidell High School
Termite Damage Repairs at Interior Hallway — Phase |

STPSB Project No. 1992

DATE

March 3, 2025 - 3:00 p.m.

FRANK J. JABBIA

Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.
Covington, LA 70433

985.892.2276 + Fax 985.898.3267

BIDDER LI%EON'SE B;\IT;E ALTl\IlEg!\IiATE
ABG Contractors, Inc. 71264 NO BID NO BID
All American Construction Management 60735 NO BID NO BID
Ashley Smith Construction, LLC 66433 NO BID NO BID
B.E.T. Construction, Inc. 27797 NO BID NO BID
Brunt Construction 6328 NO BID NO BID
BSD Construction, LLC 39998 $542,000.00 $55,480.00
CDX Construction LLC 62427 NO BID NO BID
CT Wainwright Construction 35960 NO BID NO BID
Dixon Contracting Group, LLC 61971 $439,995.00 $57,400.00
Dynamic Constructors, LLC 55104 NO BID NO BID
E.C.O. Builders, Inc. 30638 $578,000.00 $88,000.00
Parish Construction and Roofing 78890 NO BID NO BID
Roof Tech, LLC 26099 $576,041.00 $45,042.00
Sage Construction LLC 71684 NO BID NO BID
Smith Construction Co. 33374 $468,311.00 $66,855.00
Steele-R Development 55757 NO BID NO BID
Valor Contracting, LLC 71885 NO BID NO BID
Wilco Construction 71367 $602,200.00 $54,997.00

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION
WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A
PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST.
TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN

ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.

Leonning t6 Lowt o Lafetime.



