BID #26-002
Treated/Untreated Rock Salt & Bagged Salt
Bid Tabulation

Bagged Salt Rock Salt
Peladow™ Premier Snow
Item Sizzle™ Ice Melter #50 and Ice Melter #50 Total Treated Rock Salt | Untreated Rock Salt Total Total Bid
Vendor Quantity 1,250 Bags 1,250 Bags Bagged Salt 250 Tons 150 Tons Rock Salt Bid Award
Arlington Power Equipment Brand Sizzle (Brown Bag) Peladow N/A N/A
(Palatine, IL) Unit Price S 735(S 14.97 S 113.00 | $ 96.00
! Total Cost S 9,187.50 | $ 18,712.50 | $ 27,900.00 | $ 28,250.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 42,650.00] $ 70,550.00
. Brand DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID
Cargill Inc S S $ S
Unit Price - - - -
North Olmsted, OH
( ) Total Cost S - 5 - S - s - S - $ - $ - $ -
. Brand DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID
Compass Minerals
Unit Price
Overland Park, KS
( ) Total Cost S - S - $ - $ - $ - s -
Conserv ES Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A
Unit Price S 7.85|S 14.10 S 112.00 | $ 91.00
(Wauconda, IL)
Total Cost S 9,812.50 | S 17,625.00 | S 27,437.50 | $ 28,000.00 | S 13,650.00 | $ 41,650.00| S 69,087.50 | $ 27,437.50
Government MLO Supplies USA Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A
Inc. Unit Price S 10.86 | $ 20.34 S 110.00 | $ 96.30
(Bethesda, MD) Total Cost S 13,575.00 | $ 25,425.00 | $ 39,000.00 | $ 27,500.00 | $ 14,445.00 | $ 41,945.00] S 80,945.00
MVP 3- NO BID N/A N/A
* Midwest Salt, LLC Brand way / /
. Unit Price S 1489 | $ - S 102.89 | S 91.89
(West Chicago, IL)
Total Cost S 18,612.50 | $ - S 18,61250) S 25,722.50 | 13,783.50 | $ 39,506.00 | S 58,118.50
Morton Salt, Inc. Brand NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
(Chica - |L) Unit Price S - S - s 100.41 5 80.41
e Total Cost S - S - S - S 25,102.50 | S 12,061.50 | $ 37,164.00] S 37,164.00 | $ 37,164.00
Sizzl Pelad N/A N/A
Russo Power Equipment Brand lzzle eladow / /
. Unit Price S 750 (S 14.50 S 128.00 | S 108.00
(Schiller Park, IL)
Total Cost S 9,375.00 | S 18,125.00 | $ 27,500.00 | $ 32,000.00 | S 16,200.00 | $ 48,200.00 | S 75,700.00
** SiteOne Landscape Supply Brand NO BID Peladow NO BID NO BID
(Cleveland OH) Unit Price S - S 16.25
! Total Cost S - S 20,312.50 | $ 20,312.50 ] $ - S - $ - $ 20,312.50
* At this time, we are not willing to accept alternative products for bagged salt. BID TOTAL S 64,601.50
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