
Cooperative Milk, Dairy Products Juices WFL 2026-11-R SUPPLIES CATALOG Effective: AWARD – August 31, 2026

2 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $28.005 2970

3 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.3634 50 units per case 3962

4 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.383 50 units per case 4962

5 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.4009 50 units per case 2962

6 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.4195 50 units per case 5982

7 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.4309 50 units per case 5968

8 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.435 50 units/case 5969

9 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $1.355
Whole Milk, 2% White Milk, Vanilla, Chocolate, Strawberry LF 
Chocolate, Vanilla Cappucino, Orange Juice and Seasonal Flavors 12 
units per case

1928 2935 5129 5829 5886 6849

10 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $4.855 4001

2% Corregated Milk, 20 Quart, 3 Day Delivery

White Skim Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

1% Low Fat Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

2% Low Fat Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

Fat Free Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

1% Low Fat Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

Fat Free Starwberry Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

16 oz PLASTIC BOTTLES, 2% Low Fat Milk, Low Fat Chocolate, Low Fat Strawberry, Intense Chocolate,, Capuccino (Mocha or Vanilla), 

1% Low Fat Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery

MILK (Subject to monthly USDA AMS Federal Milk Marketing Order (FMMO) pricing adjustments)
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Cooperative Milk, Dairy Products Juices WFL 2026-11-R SUPPLIES CATALOG Effective: AWARD – August 31, 2026

11 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $5.155 2001

12 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $5.3337 1001

14 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $11.855 9367

15 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $1.755 4525

16 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $11.855 9367

17 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

18 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. BOX $16.505 400 CT 7203

19 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $2.355 5521

20 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $5.755 5325

21 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.825 Milk for Life 1% - 8oz 12 units per case 4170

Homogenized Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery

2% Low Fat Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery

4% Cottage Cheese, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Deliver

Buttermilk, Quart, 3 Day Delivery

Cottage Cheese - Low Fat, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery

Half & Half - Fat Free, QT, 3 Day Delivery

Half & Half Creamer, 402 ct., 3/8 oz each, 3 Day Delivery

Half & Half, QT, 3 Day Delivery

Heavy Cream, Quart, 3 Day Delivery

Lactaid, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery

DAIRY PRODUCTS (Subject to USDA AMS milk-based pricing adjustments.)
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Cooperative Milk, Dairy Products Juices WFL 2026-11-R SUPPLIES CATALOG Effective: AWARD – August 31, 2026

22 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

23 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $2.755 12 units per case 9439

24 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $13.505 4 units per case 9369

25 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

26 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.4278 48 units per case

21026 Cherry Vanilla 21029 Vanilla 
21023 Peach 21045 Blueberry 21024 
Straw/Ban, 21025 Strawberry, 21046 
Mango

27 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

28 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.4278 48 units per case

21026 Cherry Vanilla 21029 Vanilla 
21023 Peach 21045 Blueberry 21024 
Straw/Ban, 21025 Strawberry, 21046 
Mango

29 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.855 One Flavor per case 12 units per case
21056 Strawberry, 21052 Blueberry, 
21 054 Peach , 21053 Cherry Vanilla , 
21055 Straw/Banana

Lactaid, Quart, 3 Day Delivery

Sour Cream, 1 Pound, 3 Day Delivery

Sour Cream, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery

String Cheese: NYS, Low-Moisture, Part Skim, Mozzarella Cheese. 168/1 oz. per cas

Yogurt - Fat Free Flavored Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Low Fat, Flavored, Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Flavored, Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Flavored, Variety, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery
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Cooperative Milk, Dairy Products Juices WFL 2026-11-R SUPPLIES CATALOG Effective: AWARD – August 31, 2026

30 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $0.855 One Flavor per case 12 units per case
21056 Strawberry, 21052 Blueberry, 
21 054 Peach , 21053 Cherry Vanilla , 
21055 Straw/Banana

31 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $8.505 4 units per case 21063

32 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EACH $8.505 4 units per case 21064

33 Vendor Item Number
Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. EA $8.505 4 units per case 21064

35 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

36 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

37 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

38 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

39 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

40 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

41 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

Yogurt - No Fat, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Strawberry, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Vanilla, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery

Yogurt - Low Fat, Vanilla, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery

Juice: Apple, Orange, Grape, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery, Must Meet Buy American Provision Requirements.

Orange Drink, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery

JUICE (Subject to monthly Consumer Price Index (CPI) adjustments.)

Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery

100% Fruit Juice, 4 oz. Cup, (Note to Bidder:  Specify Brands/Juice Available), 3 Day Delivery

Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 8 oz, 3 Day Deliver

Orange Juice, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Fruit Punch, 1/2 Pint, 3 Day Delivery
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Cooperative Milk, Dairy Products Juices WFL 2026-11-R SUPPLIES CATALOG Effective: AWARD – August 31, 2026

43 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

44 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

45 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

46 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

47 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

48 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

49 Vendor Item Number
No Bid Received

Fruit Punch, 1/2 Pint, 3 Day Delivery

JUICE (Fixed Price)

Juice: Apple, Orange, Grape, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery, Must Meet Buy American Provision Requirements.

Orange Drink, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery

Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery

100% Fruit Juice, 4 oz. Cup, (Note to Bidder:  Specify Brands/Juice Available), 3 Day Delivery

Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 8 oz, 3 Day Deliver

Orange Juice, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery
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