
SCHOOL BUS ENGINES: REPLACEMENT INSTALLATION RFP #18-816
JUNE 25, 2018

TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
FY19 GENERAL FUND

PURCHASE AS NEEDED

1 OF 2

W.W. Williams Company, LLC
2610 Augusta Road

West Columbia, SC 29169
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PRICE

1A
Remanufactured drop-in 6.7 ISB Cummins engine 
with installation $15,631.00

1B Radiator for item 1 A with installation $685.00
1C Starter for item 1A with installation $335.00
1D Glow Plug harness for Item 1A with installation NO BID

1F
Remanufactured drop-in 6.7 ISB Cummins engine 
(PURCHASE ONLY) $11,291.00

2A
Remanufactured drop-in 8.3 Cummins engine with 
installation $14,232.00

2B Radiator for item 2A with installation $685.00
2C Starter for item 2A with installation $335.00
2D Glow Plug harness for Item 2A with installation NO BID

2F
Remanufactured drop-in 8.3 Cummins engine 
(PURCHASE ONLY) $9,892.00

3A
Remanufactured drop-in 444E International diesel 
engine with installation $11,007.00

3B Radiator for item 3A with installation $635.00
3C Starter for item 3A with installation $350.00
3D Glow Plug harness for Item 3A with installation NO BID

3F
Remanufactured drop-in 444E International diesel 
engine (PURCHASE ONLY) $6,667.00

4A
Remanufactured drop-in 3126 Caterpillar  diesel 
engine with installation $17,135.00

4B Radiator for item 4A with installation $575.00
4C Starter for item 4A with installation $335.00
4D Glow Plug harness for Item 4A with installation NO BID

4F
Remanufactured drop-in 3126 Caterpillar  diesel 
engine (PURCHASE ONLY) $12,795.00

5A
Remanufactured drop-in C-7 Caterpillar  diesel engine 
with installation $19,178.00

5B Radiator for item 5A with installation $685.00
5C Starter for item 5A with installation $350.00
5D Glow Plug harness for Item 5A with installation NO BID

5F
Remanufactured drop-in C-7 Caterpillar  diesel engine 
(PURCHASE ONLY) $14,838.00
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6A
Remanufactured drop-in C-7 Acert Caterpillar  diesel 
engine with installation NO BID

6B Radiator for item 6A with installation NO BID
6C Starter for item 6A with installation NO BID
6D Glow Plug harness for Item 6A with installation NO BID

6F
Remanufactured drop-in C-7 Acert Caterpillar  diesel 
engine (PURCHASE ONLY) NO BID

7A
Remanufactured drop-in DT-466 International  
engine with installation $14,771.00

7B Radiator for item 7A with installation $635.00
7C Starter for item 7A with installation $350.00
7D Glow Plug harness for Item 7A with installation NO BID

7F
Remanufactured drop-in DT-466 International  
engine (PURCHASE ONLY) $10,431.00

8A
Remanufactured drop-in MBE 900 7.2 Mercedes Benz 
diesel engine  with installation $30,015.00

8B Radiator for item 7A with installation $685.00
8C Starter for item 7A with installation $295.00
8D Glow Plug harness for Item 7A with installation NO BID

8F
Remanufactured drop-in MBE 900 7.2 Mercedes Benz 
diesel engine  (PURCHASE ONLY) $25,675.00

W.W. Williams Company provides a two year unlimited mileage warranty for all remanufactured  
engines and a 1 year warranty for the radiators and starters installed with the remanufactured 
engines.

W.W. Williams was the only bidder.  They are our current provider.  We are only purchasing engines 
with installation.  Requesting approval for individual pricing because purchases will only be made as 
needed.
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