EXECUTIVE
SESSION

CHANGE
IN THE AGENDA

ANNOUNCEMENTS
&
POINTS OF PRIDE

ORCHARD PARK CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT
BOARD OF EDUCATION

Regular Meeting June 10, 2025
Middle School Auditorium
60 S. Lincoln Ave., Orchard Park, NY 14221

Board of Education
Members Present: Dr. Jennifer Rogers, President
Mr. Ryan Anderson, Vice President
Mr. Steven Comeau
Mr. Ed Draves
Mrs. Karen Sreniawski
Mr. Luke Lippitt, Student Ex-Officio

Members Excused: Mr. Tom Provost
Mr. Ty Romanello

Others Present: Mr. David Lilleck, Superintendent of Schools
Mrs. Sarah Hornung, Assistant Superintendent — Curriculum
Dr. Dean Ramirez, Assistant Superintendent — Personnel
Mrs. Cheryl Connors, District Clerk

Estimated Audience: 40
Dr. Rogers called the meeting to order at 7 pm.

Executive Session

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to enter executive session at 7 pm to discuss the
employment history of a particular person(s) and contractual negotiations.

Yes —Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Comeau and Draves

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to adjourn executive session at 7:13 pm.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Comeau and Draves

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Dr. Rogers called the meeting back to order at 7:15 pm and led all present in the Pledge of Allegiance.
Change in the Order of Agenda Items

Dr. Ramierz requested the following be removed from Consensus Personnel: Under 3.5.B.7.1 remove
Tina Frisch, Laura Johnson, Brenda O’Neill, MaryKay Overfield and Danielle Tocin.

Announcements & Points of Pride
Mr. Lilleck shared the following:
e Last Days of Attendance for elementary students is a half day on June 26, 2025.
e The class of 2025 visited their former elementary schools. They reconnected with old
teachers, walked familiar hallways, and celebrated with the elementary students.
e Thanked the Orchard Park Foundation for the Kindergarten ready toolkits that are being
distributed to students at kindergarten screening and in PreK classrooms.
e Congratulated the retiree’s who have a combined 420 years of service. He shared the district
is grateful for their legacy.
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e  Congratulated Dr. Missy Szczesniak on her work to receive her doctoral degree.
e  Thanked Luke Lippitt, Student Ex-Officio Member 2024-25 Board of Education for

his service to the district and the Board.

e  Luke Lippitt congratulated and presented the Board of Education an award from the
National School Board’s Association for Advancing Student Representation.

e  Shared the sad news of the recent passing of Dr. Charles L. Stoddart, Superintendent
of Orchard Park CSD from 1983-2004. He is one of very few individuals to be a
student, a teacher, a principal and superintendent in the same district. He was honored
as the NYS Superintendent of the Year in 2001. Requested a moment of silence in
Dr. Stoddart’s honor.

Consensus Items

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District, upon
the recommendation of the Superintendent, hereby approves the following consensus items:

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0
Consensus Minutes

> May 6,2025

Consensus Financials (attachments #1)

» Treasurers Treasurer’s Report — April 2024, Revenue Budget Detail — April 2024,
Appropriations — May 2024, Warrant Report — May 2024, Budget Transfers Over

$20,000 and Health and Welfare Rates (attached)

Consensus Personnel

Personnel Considerations — Teachers and Administrators

Appointments — Tenure (Teachers and Administrators)

Current Tenure Effective Certification
Name Location Area Date Certification Area Status
Ellicott Elementary School Building
Diana Nigro Elementary Principal 7/12/2025 | Leader Professional
House School Building
Brandon Hafner High School Principal 7/26/2025 | Leader Professional
Brittany Ellicott Elementary
Fenimore Elementary Education 8/30/25 Childhood Ed (1-6) Professional
Adam Brignone High School Music 8/31/2025 | Music Professional
Special Students with Dis (7-
Maria Coats High School Education 8/31/2025 12) Professional
Special Students with Dis (7-
Christina Fettes High School Education 8/31/2025 12) Professional
Windom Elementary
Matthew Hauser | Elementary Education 8/31/2025 | Childhood Ed (1-6) Professional
Eggert Special Students with Dis (1-
Hannah Healy Elementary Education 8/31/2025 | 6) Professional
Lisa Schuler Middle School | Math 8/31/2025 | Mathematics (7-12) Permanent
Special
Marcia Tolman High School Education 8/31/2025 | Special Ed Permanent
Ellicott Elementary
Jennifer Wright Elementary Education 8/31/2025 Pre K, K, Grades 1-6 Permanent
Ellicott Elementary
Helen Danciu Elementary Education 9/1/2025 Childhood Ed (1-6) Professional
Business and
Barbara Downs High School Business 9/1/2025 Distributive Ed Permanent
Windom Elementary
Charles Filipski Elementary Education 9/1/2025 Pre K, K, Grades 1-6 Permanent
Special Students with Dis (5-9,
Kevin Fuller Middle School | Education 9/1/2025 7-12) Social Studies Professional
Windom Elementary Nursery, K, Grades 1-
Sandra Jensen Elementary Education 9/1/2025 6 Permanent
Ellicott Elementary
Eileen Kubiak Elementary Education 9/1/2025 Pre K, K, Grades 1-6 Permanent

June 10, 2025

CONSENSUS
ITEMS

MINUTES

FINANCIALS

PERSONNEL



Appointments — Tenure (Teachers and Administrators) Cont’d.

Effective Certification
Name Current Location Tenure Area Date Certification Area Status
South Davis Elementary Early Childhood Ed (B-
Hannah Lapenta Elementary Education 9/1/2025 2) Initial
Elementary Early Childhood Ed (B-
Julia Pitt Eggert Elementary Education 9/1/2025 2) Professional
Vanessa Snowden-
Fargeat High School English 9/1/2025 ELA (7-12) Professional
Elementary
Amy Zelasko Ellicott Elementary Education 9/1/2025 Childhood Ed (1-6) Professional
School
Charity Burlingame | High School Counselor 9/19/2025 | School Counselor Permanent
Patrick McMillan Middle School Social Studies 9/26/25 Social Studies (7-12) Professional
Allison Weiler Middle School Psychologist 9/27/2025 | School Psychologist Permanent
Appointments - Probationary and Regular Substitute
Initial Type / Effective
Name Title Cert Area / Status Tenure Area Location | Date Salary
School *Probationary
Glowacki, Building 8/27/25-8/26/29
Theresa Principal SBL / Initial Leader (SBL) WE Resignation Johnson $122,500
School *Probationary
Pawlowski, Assistant Building 7/1/25-6/30/29
Pamela Principal SBL / Initial Leader (SBL) MS Resignation Knight $92,500
Speech and Language *Probationary
Cawthorn, Speech Disabilities / 8/27/25-8/26/29
Amelia Teacher Professional Speech WE BUDGET NEW 2 M (60)
Special Social Studies (7-12) / * :
- Ed/Social Professional Special Ed HS 8/21;2]53?;/32??9 - | 2M@s)
Gian, Studies Students w/ Disabilities p )
Matthew Teacher (7-12) / Professional Retirement Henault
Students w/ *Probationary
Gross, 12:1:1 Special | Disabilities (1-6) / 8/27/25-8/26/29
Taylor Class Teacher | Initial Special Ed WE BUDGET NEW 2 M (50)
Special Students w/ Disabilities " .
Ed/Social (All Grades) / nitial Probationary
Kamery, Studies Social Studies (5-9, 7- 8/27/25-8/26/29 -
Hope Teacher 12) / Initial Special Ed MS Retirement Hill 1B (25
*Probationary
8/27/25-8/26/29
Strong, Supervene
Emily Art Teacher | Visual Arts / Initial Art SD Kreutinger 2 M (45)
*Probationary 2 M (60)
Quinn, Social 8/27/25-8/26/29 - salary
Jennifer Worker School Social Worker | Social Worker MS Retirement Kajfasz amended
Special Students with *Probationary
Ed/Math Disabilities (7-12) / 8/27/25-8/26/29
Gawlak, Erin | Teacher Professional Special Ed HS TOSA Josker 2 M (30)
*Probationary
Nicolia, Reading Literacy (B-2, 5-12) / 8/27/25-8/26/29 3 M (40)
Anna Specialist Professional Reading HS Resignation Buck
. *Probationary
Delsignore, | Reading /Lllﬁifly (All Grades) 8/27/25-8/26/29 2 M (35)
Mallory Specialist Reading MS Retirement Hill
*Probationary
7/1/25-6/30/29
Elem Ed Child Ed Gr 1-6 / Resignation
Joyce, Erin Teacher Initial Elem Ed MS Panepinto 7M (40)
. 1 B (15) -
Special . Part Year Reg Sub
;;‘I‘)‘l‘i’n o | EdMath Math (39 7-12)/ Math HS 224/25-6/1225 | Proraed end
Teacher LOA Chavanne
amended

* This expiration date is tentative and conditional only. Except to the extent required by the applicable provisions of Section 3012 of the
Education Law, in order to be granted tenure the teacher must receive composite or overall annual professional performance review ratings
pursuant to Section 3012-c and/or 3012-d of the Education Law of either effective or highly effective in at least three (3) of the four (4)
preceding years, and if the teacher receives an ineffective composite or overall rating in the final year of the probationary period the teacher shall
not be eligible for tenure at that time.
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Appointments — Mentors (Teachers and Administrators)

Effective Employee | Salary/
Name Title / Activity Dates Group Stipend
Block, Erin Mentor for Alivia Murray - coach Spring 2025 OPTA $520
Michael, Greg Mentor for Isaac Johnson - coach Spring 2025 OPTA $520
Schermerhorn,
Brittany Mentor for Tyler Bonilla - coach Spring 2025 OPTA $520
Appointments — Extra Class Activity Advisors (Teachers and Others)
Effective Employee
Name Title / Activity Dates Group Stipend
QMB Associate
Bean, Scott Director Fall 2025 OPTA $2275.00 Group I11/Step 4
QMB Associate Spring
Bean, Scott Director 2026 OPTA $2275.00 Group I11/Step 4
QMB Woodwind Community
Bodnar, Eric Instructor Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV/Step 4
Boucounis, Marching Band Winter Community
Nicholas Choreographer 2025 Member $2275.00 Group I11/Step 4
QMB Percussion Community
Brady, Griffin Instructor Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV Step 4
Brignone,
Adam QMB Director Fall 2025 OPTA $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
Brignone, Winter
Adam QMB Director 2025 OPTA $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
Brignone, Spring
Adam QMB Director 2026 OPTA $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
Chafee, Community
Benjamin QMB Brass Instructor | Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV/Step 4
Giangreco-
Marotta, QMB Assistant Color Community | $1509.00 Group I'V/Step
Salvatore Guard Director Fall 2025 Member 3
Giangreco-
Marotta, QMB Assistant Color Winter Community | $1509.00 Group I'V/Step
Salvatore Guard Director 2025 Member 3
Community
Graham, Skylar | Drill Instructor Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV/Step 4
Griffith, QMB Percussion Community
Cameron Instructor Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV/Step 4
QMB Percussion Community | $1509.00 Group IV/Step
Hanna, James Instructor Fall 2025 Member 3
QMB Percussion Community | $1375.00 Group IV/Step
Mark, Gabriel Instructor Fall 2025 Member 2
QMB Assistant Color Community
Morrow, Traci | Guard Director Fall 2025 Member $1827 Group IV/Step 4
QMB Color Guard Winter Community
Morrow, Traci | Director 2025 Member $2275.00 Group III/Step 4
Winter Community
Morrow, Traci QMB Choreographer 2025 Member $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
QMB Director Community
Pellitieri, Adam | Program Fall 2025 Member $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
QMB Associate Community
Pellitieri, Adam | Director Fall 2025 Member $2275.00 Group III/Step 4
Community
Rainforth, Gena | QMB Choreographer Fall 2025 Member $2982.00 Group II/Step 4
QMB Color Guard Community
Rainforth, Gena | Director Fall 2025 Member $2275.00 Group III/Step 4
Winter Community
Rainforth, Gena | QMB Choreographer 2025 Member $2275.00 Group I11/Step 4
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Appointments — Community Education (Teachers and Others)

A

Effective Salary /
Name Title / Activity Dates Employee Group Stipend
Lawley, Jake Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Weiss, Jeffrey Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Kozar, David Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Cieslik, Michael Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Frankowski,
Christopher Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Michael, Gregory Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Frankowski,
Matthew Football Conditioning Summer 2025 | Community Member | $35/hour
Senn, Charles Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Ferrarra, Matthew Football Conditioning Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Frankowski,
Christopher Boys Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Walter, Thomas Boys Basketball Camp Summer 2025 | Community Member | $35/hour
Kozar, David Boys Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Janas, Gary Girls Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Chudy, Susan Girls Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Brown, Christin Girls Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Dena, Brian Girls Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Weber, Megan Girls Basketball Camp Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Strength & Conditioning for
Block, Erin Female Athletes Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Strength & Conditioning for
Guzzino, Abigail Female Athletes Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Strength & Conditioning for
Graffeo, Michael Female Athletes Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Strength & Conditioning for
Norvilitis, Bret Female Athletes Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Sereday, Chelsie Introduction to Field Hockey | Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Markarian, Emily Introduction to Field Hockey | Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Hardenburg,
Whitney Introduction to Field Hockey | Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Dewald, Evan 5-Hour Pre-Licensing Course | Summer 2025 OPTA $40/hour
Girls Volleyball Pwer
Fabbro, Kathleen Sessions Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Girls Volleyball Pwer
Putt, Kristen Sessions Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Girls Volleyball Pwer
Dena, Brian Sessions Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Bean, Scott Community Summer Band Summer 2025 OPTA $35/hour
Dewald, Evan Driver Education Summer 2025 OPTA $40/hour
Bella, Joseph Driver Education Summer 2025 OPTA $40/hour
ppointments — Coordinators & Instructional Leaders (Teachers and Administrators)
Employee Salary /
Name Title / Activity Effective Dates Group Stipend
Biondo, Charline ELA Primary Coordinator May - June 2025 OPTA $899.40
Athletic Coach Mentor Co-
Brown, Christin Coordinator 2024/25 prorated OPTA $328.00
Carson, Bradley PK-12 Music Coordinator April - June 2025 OPTA $1,349.10
Filsinger, Rebecca PK-12 Music Coordinator April - June 2025 OPTA $1,349.10
Athletic Coach Mentor Co-
Graffeo, Michael Coordinator 2024/25 prorated OPTA $328.00
$6295.80 -
September 2024 - March stipend
Leary, Nathan PK-12 Music Coordinator 2025 - dates amended OPTA amended
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Appointments — Per Diem Substitutes (Teachers and Others)

Name Title / Activity Effective Dates Certification
Brodie, Liam Substitute Teacher 5/23/25-6/30/25 Uncertified
Juzdowski, Cameron | Substitute Teacher 5/20/25-6/30/25 Uncertified
Appointments — Coaching (Teachers and Others)
Effective | Employee
Name Title / Activity Dates Group Step / Stipend
Soccer - Girls Assistant
Adamec, Joseph Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Baldauf, Maxwell Head Chap/Ticket Manager Fall 2025 OPTA $2,275
Basketball — Modified, 7th Winter Community
Bartolotti, Achie Boys 2025 Member Step 4 / $6125
Cross Country - Assistant
Betrus, Christopher | Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Winter
Betrus, Christopher | Winter Track — Varsity 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Volleyball - Girls Assistant
Beyer, Susan Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Biondo, Joseph Golf - Girls Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Winter
Biondo, Joseph Bowling — Boys 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Bird, Jeffrey Soccer - Girls Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Block, Erin Soccer - Girls Assistant JV Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Winter
Caligiuri, Kim Bowling - Girls 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Catalano, Lawrence | Soccer - Boys Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Field Hockey - Assistant
Chojnacki, Natalie Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 1/ $3393
Basketball — Program Winter
Chudy, Susan Assistant 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Cieslik, Michael Football - Varsity Head Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $8086
Winter Community
Collesano, Stanley Wrestling - Varsity Assistant 2025 Member Step 4 / $6468
Dannecker, Joshua | Soccer - Boys Varsity Head Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Ice Hockey — Varsity Head, Winter
Dannecker, Joshua | Boys 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Wrestling — Varsity Head Winter
DeLucia, Steven Girls 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Volleyball - Girls Assistant
Dena, Brian Program Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Volleyball - Girls Assistant
Dena, Brian 1\ Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Winter
Dena, Brian Basketball — Modified, Girls 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $6125
Dillsworth, Steven Cross Country - Varsity Head | Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Volleyball - Girls Varsity
Fabbro, Katie Head Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Ferrara, Matthew Football - Assistant JV Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5954
Winter
Ferrentino, Steven Ice Hockey — Assistant, Boys 2025 OPSRPA Step 4 / $6469
Frankowski,
Christopher Football - Assistant Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5954
Frankowski, Basketball - Varsity Head, Winter
Christopher Boys 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Cheerleading - Assistant
Gaeta, Nicolette Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Cheerleading - Assistant Winter
Gaeta, Nicolette Modified 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $6125
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A

ppointments — Coaching (Teachers and Others) Cont’d.
Effective
Name Title / Activity Dates Employee Group | Step / Stipend
Community
Gavigan, Patrick Basketball — JV, Boys Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6469
Volleyball - Boys Assistant Community
Gembar, Michael 1\ Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $4826
Wrestling — Varsity Head Community Step 4 /
Glinsky, Joseph Boys 1/2 Winter 2025 Member $8085.50
Graffeo, Michael Soccer - Girls Varsity Head Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Grossman, Amy Unified Bocce Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $3741
Grossman, Amy Unified Bowling Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $3741
Guzzino, Abigail Tennis - Assistant, Girls Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Football - Assistant Community
Haggerty, Kevin Freshman Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $5954
Wrestling - Varsity Head Community Step 4 /
Hull, Drew Boys 1/2 Winter 2025 Member $8085.50
Soccer - Boys Assistant
Janas, Gary Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Basketball — Varsity Head,
Janas, Gary Girls Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Football - Assistant
Johnson, Leif Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $5632
Johnson, Leif Rifle -Varsity Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Football - Assistant
Kozar, David Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $5632
Basketball — Modified, 8th
Kozar, David Boys Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $6125
Football - Assistant
Lawley, Jake Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5632
Leary, Nathan Golf - Boys Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Community
Manka, Jill Cheerleading - Varsity Head Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $6469
Cheerleading — Varsity Community
Manka, Jill Head Winter 2025 Member Step 4/ $9703
Markarian, Emily | Field Hockey - Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
McGowan, Molly Field Hockey - Assistant JV Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Michael, Greg Football - Assistant Varsity Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5954
Community
Mueller, Jennelle Cheerleading - Assistant JV Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $4826
Cheerleading — Assistant Community
Mueller, Jennelle IV, 1/2 Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $4826
Swimming- Assistant Community
Murray, Alivia Varsity, Boys Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6002
Swimming - Varsity Head,
Norvilitis, Brett Girls Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Norvilitis, Brett Swimming —Modified, boys | Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Gymnastics - Program
Nowak, Michaela Assistant Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5532
Football - Assistant Community
Paolini, Ryan Freshman Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $5954
Paternostro, Derek | Cross Country - Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Phillips, Alison Tennis - Varsity Head, Girls Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Volleyball - Girls Assistant
Putt, Kristen IV Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Volleyball - Girls Assistant
Putt, Kristen Program Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Rosentreter, Swimming — Varsity Head, Community
Morgan Boys Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $8282
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Appointments — Coaching (Teachers and Others) Cont’d.

Effective Employee
Name Title / Activity Dates Group Step / Stipend
Volleyball - Boys
Russell, Chance Assistant Program Fall 2025 OPTA Step 1/ $4826
Community
Sanelli, Alyssa Cross Country - Modified Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $4337
Winter Track — Varsity Community
Sanelli, Alyssa Assistant Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6468
Cheerleading - Assistant Community
Schugardt, Lauren Program Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $4826
Cheerleading — Program Community
Schugardt, Lauren Assistant Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6469
Football - Assistant
Senn, Chuck Modified Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $5632
Field Hockey - Assistant
Sereday, Chelsie Program Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Ice Hockey - Varsity
Sereday, Chelsie Head, Girls Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4/ $9703
Gymnastics - Varsity Community
Skalski, Chelsea Head Fall 2025 Member Step 4 / $5532
Soccer - Boys Assistant
Smith, Emerson Vv Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4826
Swimming — Modified,
Specht, Lindsey girls Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $4337
Basketball - Program Community
Walter, Thomas Assistant Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6469
Weber, Megan Basketball — JV, Girls Winter 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $6469
Weiss, Jeffrey Football - Assistant JV Fall 2025 OPTA Step 4 / $5954
Winter Track- Varsity Community
Wolford, Michael Assistant Winter 2025 Member Step 4 / $6468
Appointments — Summer — Psych
Name Title / Position Rate
Adamec, Joseph Psychologist (HS) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Hartney, Jocelyn Psychologist (EL) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Mydzian, Jenny Psychologist (WE) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Pettis, Antonique Psychologist (DO) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Roberts, Lynn Psychologist (WE) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Russell, Chance Psychologist (EG) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Tashjian, Kathryn Psychologist (DO) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Weiler, Allison Psychologist (MS) up to 20 days @ 1/200th
Appointments — Summer — Counselor
Name Title / Position Rate
Behm, Michael School Counselor (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Bove, Aaron School Counselor (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Burlingame,
Charity School Counselor (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Cervoni, Annemarie | School Counselor (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Clark, Bernadette School Counselor (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Hutschenreuter,
Kristen School Counselor (WE) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Krempa, Angela School Counselor (EG) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Lunduski, Kali School Counselor (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Nobel, Elizabeth School Counselor (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
See, Amy School Counselor (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th

Stahl, Jennifer

School Counselor (HS)

up to 12 days @ 1/200th
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Appointments — Summer — Social Worker

Name Title / Position Rate
Chadwell, Ashley Social Worker (WE) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Duffet, Elizabeth Social Worker (EG) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Klube, Amy Social Worker (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Kron, Charles Social Worker (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Kumro, Julie Social Worker (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Mohler, Amanda Social Worker (HS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Mulawka-Baumgartner, Maryanne | Social Worker (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Pietrantone, Bridget Social Worker (SD) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Quinn, Jennifer Social Worker (MS) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Wagner, Kelly Social Worker (EL) up to 12 days @ 1/200th
Appointments — Summer (ESY)
Name Title/Position Rate
Buskey, Allison Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Bystrak, Elizabeth

Reading Specialist

up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

DeMarco, Claire

SLP

up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Diedrich, Allison SLP up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Evans, Shannon PT up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Gilham, Derek Phys Ed up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Building Based Sub:

Gribbins, Maura Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Healy, Hannah Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Hogan, Sean

Classroom Teacher

up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Hutchenreuter, Kristen PPS up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Joyce, Erin Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Koellner, Hannah SLP up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Kruszka, Kelly Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Mariano, Amy

Reading Specialist

up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Martorana, Kathryn

Classroom Teacher

up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Michener, Joy PT up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Panfil, Samantha PT up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Reeves, Kimberly Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Setera, Rebecca

Behavior Specialist

up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Shields, Christine

oT

up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Simchick-Walkowski,
Deenah

Classroom Teacher

up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Stelley, Marcee SLP up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Toth, Susan Classroom Teacher up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9

Van Remmen, Jonathan Phys Ed up to 32 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Ward, Karen oT up to 14 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Wooton, Bryanna oT up to 20 days- 6.25 hrs/day @OPTA §3.3.9
Lillis, David Building Guard Up to 32 days @ $27.11/hour Salary Schedule F
Alessi, Annie Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Avino, Joelle Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $19.72/hour Salary Schedule H
Chernogorec, Barbara Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $20.27/hour Salary Schedule G
D'Anthony, Reilly Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $17.17/hour Salary Schedule M
Dionne, Jocelyn Teacher Aide Up to 16 days @ $18.18/hour Salary Schedule K
Gilbert, Ann Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Guadagno, Hailey Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Gugino, Sarah Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.18/hour Salary Schedule K
Haseley, Susan Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $21.90/hour Salary Schedule D
Haun, Theresa Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @28.04/hour Salary Schedule A
Hering, Deanna Teacher Aide Up to 16 days @ $19.20/hour Salary Schedule I
Howard, Mallory Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $16.69/hour Salary Schedule M
Kalita, Victoria Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ substitute rate of pay 25/26
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Appointments — Summer (ESY) Cont’d.

Name Title/Position Rate

Kothe, Zoe Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $17.67/hour Salary Schedule L
Krue, Julia Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $19.20/hour Salary Schedule I
Larkman, Emma Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ substitute rate of pay 25/26
Obrochta, Denise Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $21.90/hour Salary Schedule D
Poloncarz, Lynn Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $23.12/hour Salary Schedule B
Polonkiewicz, Emily | Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Polonkiewicz, Sarah | Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Ramsey, Lori Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.18/hour Salary Schedule K
Roberts, Nicole Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $16.69/hour Salary Schedule M
Stacharczyk, Carol | Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $18.69/hour Salary Schedule J
Stahl, Samuel Clerical Aide Up to 31 days @ $16.69/hour Salary Schedule M
Tweed, Jane Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $19.72/hour Salary Schedule H
Wick, Michelle Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $20.27/hour Salary Schedule G
Wick, Victoria Teacher Aide Up to 31 days @ $17.17/hour Salary Schedule M

Banks, Rebecca

Registered Professional
Nurse

Up to 20 days @ $33.59/hour Salary Schedule E

Krawczyk, Brenda

Registered Professional
Nurse

Up to 20 days @ $34.55/hour Salary Schedule D

Testa, Robert Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed @ $18.18/hour Salary Schedule K
Schwarz, Jody Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed @ $28.04/hour Salary Schedule A
Matthews, Karen Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed substitute rate of pay 25/26
Carroll, Linda Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed substitute rate of pay 25/26
Holland, Kathleen Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed @ $21.30/hour Salary Schedule E
Stahl, Thomas Substitute Teacher Aide | As needed @ Salary Schedule A
Appointments — Summer — Literacy

Name Title/Position Rate

Up to 15 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4
Batchen, Stacy Director hours) @OPTA §3.3.9
Bermingham, 2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Theresa Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Chelus, Nicole Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Connors, Maureen Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Finger, Suzanne Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Kent, Kimberly Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
LaPenta, Eileen Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
LaPenta, Hannah Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Noe, Anne Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Rachko, Lisa Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Senn, Jennifer Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Tortorice, Julie Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9

2 full days (6.25 hours) and 20 half days (4 hours)
Weber, Emily Teacher K-4 @OPTA §3.3.9
Axelson, Jennifer Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9
Fabbro, Kathleen Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Flascher, Sarah

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9
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ppointments — Summer — Literacy Cont’d.

Name

Title/Position

Rate

Hardenburg, Whitney

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Jensen, Sandy

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Joynt, Catherine

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Mariano, Amy

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Muldowney, Brianna

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Neureuter, Margaret

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Putt, Kristen

Substitute Teacher

as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Richards, Allison Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Sollecito, Mollie Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Vivian, Mary Claire Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Zoldos, Mary Substitute Teacher as needed @OPTA §3.3.9

Elliott, Emily Teacher Aide Salary Schedule I

Martin, Courtney Substitute Teacher Aide As needed @ Salary Schedule J

Winters, Holly Substitute Teacher Aide As needed @ Salary Schedule F

Leaves of Absence (Teachers and Administrators)
Name Position Effective Dates Comment
Keem, Lisa Special Education Teacher 8/27/25-1/26/26 Unpaid LOA § 4.6.6
Speech Language
Lutz, Libby Pathologist (SLP) 2025/2026 Unpaid LOA § 4.6.6
Elementary Kindergarten
Sulski, Catherine Teacher 2025/2026 RESCIND
Position Management (Teachers and Administrators)
Type / Tenure
Position Location Area Effective Date
Abolishment of 6.0 6.0 Probationary
FTE Teaching Teaching Assistant
Assistants 1.0 @ SD 1.0 @ EG 2.0 @ MS 2.0 @ EL | Tenure Area 07/01/2025
Establish Preferred These person/s in the Teaching Assistant tenure area will be laid off and placed on
Eligibility List (PEL) "PEL" with recall rights for up to seven (7) years, effective 07/01/2025 (#1 being
for Teaching the least senior): 1. Mary Krasowski 2. Beth Krawczyk 3. Cheryl Kellner 4.
Assistants Christine Stafford 5. Joy Stoddard 6. Roseanne Sanchez
1.0 Probationary

Abolishment of 1.0 Library Media
FTE Library Media Specialist Tenure
Specialist 1.0 @ MS Area 07/01/2025
Establish Preferred
Eligibility List (PEL) These person/s in the Library Media Specialist tenure area will be laid off and
for Library Media placed on "PEL" with recall rights for up to seven (7) years, effective 07/01/2025
Specialist (#1 being the least senior): 1. Amy Smith

Resignations and Retirements (Teachers and Administrators)

Name Position Effective Dates Comment

Sulski, Catherine Elementary Kindergarten Teacher 7/1/2025 Resignation

Contractual and Other (Teachers and Administrators) (attachments #2)

» RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute a MOA
with the Orchard Park School Related Professionals Association, the Orchard Park Principals Association,
and the Orchard Park Central Office Administrators in regards to "Summer 2025 Work Schedules".
RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute a MOA
with the Orchard Park Principals Association in regards to Dr. Missy Szczesniak and Mrs. Diana Nigro.
RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute a MOA
with the Orchard Park Teachers Association in regards to "Teacher on Special Assignment".
RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute a MOA
in regards to a grievance filed by OPTA.

RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute a MOA
with the Orchard Park Teachers Association in regards to "Pre-Kindergarten/Kindergarten Screening".

vV V V VY
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Personnel Considerations — Support Staff

Appointments (Support Staff)

Position (Initial Type of Effective | Compensation (Initial
Name Location) Appointment Date Schedule)
Roberts, Part-time 10-month Bus $26.33/hr Salary
Jeffrey Driver (BG) Probationary | 4/28/2025 | Schedule M
Full-time 12-month Principal $30.25/hr Salary
Riter, Eileen | Clerk Typist (DO) Probationary | 7/1/2025 | Schedule B
Part-time 10-month $33.58/hr Salary Schedule
Krawczyk, Registered Prof. Nurse 5/19/25- | D (up to 16 add'l hrs/week
Brenda (DW) Temporary 6/30/25 as needed)
Hudak, Full-time 12-month Senior $24.19/hr Salary
Michelle Clerk Typist (SE) Probationary 7/1/25 Schedule E
Totaro, Part-time 10-month Senior $22.38/hr Salary
Annmarie Clerk Typist (SE) Probationary 7/1/25 Schedule H
Jenny, Full-time 12 month Auto $23.22/hr Salary M
Michael Mechanic (BG) Probationary 6/2/25 Schedule
Pendrak, Part-time 10 month Bus $26.33/hr Salary
Jeffrey Driver (BG) Probationary 6/3/25 Schedule M
Perry, Part-time 10 month Bus $26.33/hr Salary
William Driver (BG) Probationary 5/23/25 Schedule M
Brock, Full-time 12 month Principal $30.25/hr Salary
Melissa Clerk Typist (BG) Probationary 7/1/25 Schedule B
Appointments — Leaves of Absence (Support Staff)
Name Title Activity Effective Dates Comment
Guslawski, Part-time 10 month Teacher Unpaid leave of
Mikhayla Aide (EL) 5/28/25-5/30/25 absence
Leave of absence until
successful completion of
Hudak, Full-time 12 month Clerk 7/1/2025 et S e No.
Michelle Typist (SE) 3.5.B.4.4
Appointments — Mentors (Support Staff)
Effective Employee Salary /
Name Title / Activity Dates Group Stipend
Randon, Mentor to Part-time 10-month
Alana Cleaner Glenn Dubel 5/5/25-5/4/26 | OPSRPA $500
O'Neill, Mentor to Part-time 10-month
Tammy Bus Driver Brittany Lelonek 5/2025-4/2026 | OPSRPA $500
Mentor to Part-time 10-month
Brady, Ryan | Cleaner Hayden Van Hauwaert 5/5/25-5/4/26 | OPSRPA $500
Mentor to Part-time 10-month
Brady, Ryan | Cleaner Lee Terwilliger 5/2025-4/2026 | OPSRPA $500
Clinton, Mentor to Part-time 10-month 5/1/25-
Eileen Teacher Aide Thomas Stahl 10/31/25 OPSRPA $300
Chryniewicz, | Mentor to Part-time 10-month
Theresa Bus Driver Jeffrey Pendrak 6/3/25-6/2/26 | OPSRPA $500
Karaszewski, | Mentor to Full-time 12-month
Aaron Auto Mechanic Michael Jenny 6/2/25-6/1/26 | OPSRPA $500
4/3/25-4/29/26
Petrinec, Mentor to Full-time 10-month (rescind $0 (rescind
Alicia Cleaner Cynthia Snyder appointment) | OPSRPA stipend)
1/6/25-4/23/25
Baldo, Mentor to Part-time 10-month (amend $200 (amend
Phyllis Teacher Aide Samuel Stahl appointment) | OPSRPA stipend)
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Resignations and Retirements (Support Staff)

Effective
Name Position Dates Comment
Part-time 10-month Bus Driver
Nason, Dale (BG) 6/30/2025 | Retirement 11 years of service
Snyder, Full-time 10-month Cleaner
Cynthia (B&GR) 5/6/2025 | Resignation
Full-time 10-month Registered
Finn, Kelly Prof. Nurse (SD) 5/9/2025 | Resignation
Jakubowski, Part-time 10-month Bus
Karen Attendant (BG) 6/30/2025 | Retirement 29 years of service
Kazimer, Full-time 12-month Senior
Laurie Account Clerk (DO) 5/30/2025 | Resignation
Full-time 10-month Cleaner
Pagan, Stacy (B&GR) 5/26/2025 | Resignation
Resignation contingent upon appointment to
Full-time 12-month Senior Full-time 12-month Principal Clerk Typist.
Riter, Eileen Clerk Typist (DO) 6/30/2025 | See Item No. 3.5.B.1.2
Part-time 10-month School
Gardina, Gail | Monitor (WE) 6/30/2025 | Retirement 4.75 years of service
Resignation contingent upon appointment to
Totaro, Part-time 10-month Clerk Part-time 10-month Senior Clerk Typist. See
Annmarie Typist (SE) 6/30/2025 | Item No. 3.5.B.1.5
Resignation contingent upon appointment to
O'Neill, Full-time 12 month Senior Full-time 12-month Confidential Principal
Brenda Account Clerk Typist (DO) 6/11/2025 | Clerk Typist. See Item No. 3.5.B.7.1
Part-time 10 month Teacher
Werner, Lori | Aide (MS) 8/14/2025 | Retirement 24.50 year of service
Resignation contingent upon appointment to
Brock, Full-time 12 month Senior Full-time 12-month Principal Clerk Typist.
Melissa Clerk Typist (Registrar) 6/30/2025 | See Item No. 3.5.B.1.9
Position Management (Support Staff)
Effective
Position Location Type/Status Date
Creation of 4.0 FTE Principal Clerk Typist(s) District Office Complex Probationary 6/1/2025
Creation of 1.0 FTE Graphic Artist District Office Complex Probationary 7/1/2025

Contractual and Other (Support Staff)
» RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute personal
employment agreements for District Office Confidential Employees, Cheryl Connors, Nanette Wagner and
Melissa Vecere, effective July 1, 2025 to June 30, 2028.
» RESOLVED THAT, the Board of Education authorizes the Superintendent of Schools to execute personal
employment agreement for Kate Zimmerman as Graphic Artist.
» Appointment of the attached list of Teacher Aides to receive a $300 stipend per Section 6.9.2. of the
Collective Bargaining Agreement. (Attachment #2)
Appointments - Seasonal (Support Staff)

Compensation

Name Position Type/Status Effective Date (Initial Schedule)

Bosinski, Jack Laborer Seasonal 5/12/25-6/30/25 $18.34/hour

Bosinski, Jack Laborer Seasonal 7/1/25-8/30/25 $18.87/hour

Totaro, Ann Senior Clerk Typist Seasonal up to 15 days Salary H Schedule
Appointments - Summer Guard Help

Building Title / Position Rate

Ellicott Elementary Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay

Eggert Elementary Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay

South Davis Elementary Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay

Windom Elementary Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay

Middle School Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay

High School Building Guard up to 5 days @ current rate of pay
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Appointments — Seasonal - Nurses

Name Title/Position Rate

Banks, Rebecca Registered Professional Nurse (EG) | up to 40 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule E
Johnson, Sarah Registered Professional Nurse (WE) | up to 40 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule C
Krawczyk, Brenda | Registered Professional Nurse up to 20 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule D

Odrzywolski, Melissa Registered Professional Nurse (EL) | up to 40 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule I

Lucidi, Michelle Registered Professional Nurse (HS) | Up to 30 hours (HS) and 70 hours

(Athletics) @ OPSRPA Schedule F

Niewczyk, Karen Registered Professional Nurse (MS) | up to 40 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule L

Sulski, Katherine | Registered Professional Nurse (SD) | up to 40 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule

Schnorr, Mary Registered Professional Nurse (NP) | up to 24 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule K

Ippolito, Jeanette | Registered Professional Nurse (NP) | up to 10 hours @ OPSRPA Schedule M

Special Education (attachment #3)
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Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for Annual Reviews of One Hundred
Twenty-One (121) Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for the Program Review of Nineteen (19)
Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for Re-Evaluation of Twenty-Four (24)
Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for the Initial Educational
Placement of Eight (8) Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for Amendments of Forty-Six (46) Resident
Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for the Declassification Support Services of
One (1) Resident Child

Recommendation by the Committee on Special Education for Declassification of Three (3) Resident
Children

Recommendation by the 504 Committee for the Accommodation Plan of Thirty-Seven (37) Resident
Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Preschool Special Education for the Preschool Annual Review of
Twenty-Two (22) Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Preschool Special Education for the Preschool Initial Educational
Placement of Fourteen (14) Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Preschool Special Education for the Preschool Amendments of
Four (4) Resident Children

Recommendation by the Committee on Preschool Special Education for the Preschool Declassification of
Two (2) Resident Children

Textbook Adoption (attachment #3)

>

World History, by Jackson J. Spielvogel Ph.D, published by McGraw Hill,
copyright 2023, High School, Global History & Geography 9th & 10™

Comments/Discussion on Consensus and/or Consideration of Items Withdrawn

from Consensus and Reports & Presentations

>
>

Dr. Ramirez congratulated the retirees’ and the newly tenured teachers.

Mr. Lippitt, student ex-officio member, shared that STAP-Comm inaugurations
for the 2025-26 school year where held. He represented the district on the Erie
County Association of School Boards for training new school board members.
Honored to be first student to be the master of ceremonies for the annual
ECASB awards ceremony this year. He shared he has been working with the
NYSSBA on an annual training for student ex-officio members.

Mrs. Hornung reported on the District Leadership meeting. During the final
meeting they held a special five-minutes of fame where each coordinator proudly
reported out on the work of their department. Professional learning committee
met and discussed plans for next year and reflected on this year's professional
learning opportunities.

Presentation — High School Data: Mr. Patk and Mr. Grupka presented data on
student regents testing results and other data points.
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DISCUSSION

ACTION

ACCEPTANCE
OF

MAY 20, 2025

VOTE RESULTS

Discussion

>
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May 20, 2025 Vote/Election Results — Mrs. Connors stated that the Chief Inspector and the
Permanent Chairperson have certified the election and the official results are ready to be
accepted by the Board.

Re-Adoption of the 2025-26 School Calendar — Mr. Lilleck shared that he is recommending
moving the half day on September 22, to September 18, 2025 (Bills Thursday night game
against Miami) and move March 13, Superintendents Conference Day to March 20, 2026.
Annual Board of Education Organizational Meeting — Mrs. Connors stated the suggested
date is July 1 and the meeting will be held at the district office conference and learning center
beginning at 6:30 pm.

BOCES IPA Resolutions for Instructional Hardware — Mr. Lilleck shared the resolutions are
for the purchase of new hardware, the items are budged for and the district will receive aid from
the state.

Final Read of Changes to Policy 1210 - Board Members: Nomination and Election,
Deletion of Policy 1131 and First Read of Policy 7317: Student Use of Personal
Technology — Mr. Lilleck reviewed the changes to the policies including the first read of the
new law regarding no student use of personal technology during the school day.

Donation of a Fender Guitar from Kevin King — Mr. Lilleck shared that the community
member would like to donate a guitar valued at $175 to the district.

Surplus Library Books from the Middle School — Mr. Lilleck stated that this is the annual
weeding of the library books.

Athletic Supplies and Reconditioning Bid Award — Mr. Lilleck shared that the bid awards are from
several companies who have the lowest bid, meeting all requirements.

District-Wide Print Quote Bid Award — Mr. Lilleck shared that the bids are awarded to the
lowest bidder who met all specifications as set forth in the bid document.

NYSSBA Resolution Kit — Mrs. Connors reviewed the process and suggested a read of a
previously submitted resolution regarding required legal notices.

ACTION

Motion

by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:

RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District, upon
the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby accepts the May 20, 2025 Vote

Results, as presented and verified by the Chief Inspector and Permanent Chairperson.
‘ Public Prop. No. 1 Prop. No.2
Machine 2
Vote BUDGET BUSES CANDIDATES (Elect 2)
Write -
IA | 2A [ 3A | 4A | s
. ; S |BEE|EE| &
; Y s | 2 |2z |E&| %
Total | YES NO & YES NO g = g5 |5 s
3 S sz | 2
1" (87| &
1 533 435 93 528 | 436 90 526 423 414 76 96 3
2 522 420 99 519 | 434 85 519 411 407 71 103 7
3 339 | 281 s6 | 337 | 280 | s6 | 336 | 265 | 261 58 66 1
TOTALS [ 1394 | 1136 | 248 | 1384 | 1150 | 231 | 1381 | 1099 | 1082 | 205 | 265 14

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a
Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0
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Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District,
upon the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby re-adopts the 2025-
26 school calendar as follows:

ORCHARD PARK CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT
2025-2026 SCHOOL CALENDAR

AUGUST 2025 [ FEBRUARY 2026
M| T | w|TH|F 8/27-8/28 Conference Doy - Mo Studant: M| T|w|TH|F 2/16-2/20 Mo Schoal - Winger Break
1 | oz[ = 4 s| ¢ 7 213 Pre-K & Blementary Half Day
al a4 s[ & 7| af ¢ al #| 1o] | 12f as] e 2/13 Middle School Half Day
o 11] 12| 13| 14| 15| 14 15| 18] 17 18| 19| 20| 213 High 3chool Eory Dismissal
17| 18] 19| 20| 21| 22| = 22| 23| 24| 25] 28| 27| 2 (2117 lunar new year]
EREBEEEEE
=
SEPTEMBER 2025 MARCH 2026
m|T|w|TH|F 91 Mo School - Labor Day M| T|w|TH|F 3/20 Corfer=nce Day - Ho Studenis
1 H 3| 4| 5| 4 | oz| =] 4] 5| & »
I L I I 9/3 Firct Student Day al #| 1of 1| 12f 13| e
14| 15| 18| 17| 18| 19| =) #/18 Pre-tl & Bementary Holf Day 15| 18] 17 18| 19| 20|
21| 22| 23| 24| 25| 26| ] #/18 Middle 3chool Holf Day 22| 23| 24| 25| 26| 27| =
2 27| 30 #/18 High Scheol Early Dismiszal 28| 30| =1
2]
OCTOBER 2025 APRIL 2024
M| T | w|TH|F M| T |w|TH|F 4/3-4/10 No School - Spring Break
1 QH: 10/13 Mo choel - Indigenous Peaple Day 1| 2| 8] « 4/24 High ichool Eary Dismissal
s & 7| B[ Fl¢[ N 10/20 Conference Day - Mo Students il & 7| @& ®f 19| 0
12| 15] 14| 15) 16[ 17| 18 12 13 14 15[ 1s) 17| e
15| 20| 21| 22| 23| 24| 25 19| 20| 21| 22| 23| 24| =
2| 27| 23| 2¢| 30| M1 24| 27| 28| 29| 30
NOVEMBER 2025 MAY 2026
M| T w|TH|F M| T|w|TH|F /22 High School Eary Dismiszal
1 11/11 Ho School - Veterans Day 1| 2 5/25 No School - Memornial Holiday
2| 2| 4] s| &| 7[ & 11/28-11/28 No Sehool - Thanksgiving al 4 s| & 7| 8] @
g 1wof 11| 12| 13| 14| 1) 11/14 Pret & Hementary Half Day | 1] 12| 13| 14| 15| 18
18| 17| 18| 17| 20| 21| = 11/14 Middle School Holf Day 17| 18| 19| 20| 21| 22| =
2] 24| 25| 28| 27| 28| 2| 11/14 High Scheol Early Dismissal 21| 25| 26| 27| 28| 27| ®
3 777
DECEMBER 2025 12/4 Pr=¥ & Hementary Half Day JUNE 2024 4/9-6/10 Regent: Exam
M| T|(W|TH|F 12/4 Middle 3cheol Half Day M| T|W|TH| F &/17-4/26 Regents Exams
1 2| 3| 4| s ¢ 12/5 Pret. & Bementary Holf Day 1 2| 2| < s| & 417 *Potenbial Last Blem Student Day
I L I I 12/5 Middle School Half Day ilosl | o] | 1z] &/1% Mo Schosl - Juratesnih
14| 15| 18| 17| 18| 19| ™) 12/5 High School Early Dismiszal 14| 18] 1] 17| 18 19| 2 4/24 Lozt Middle School Student Day
21| 22| 23( 24| 25| 26| | 12/2212/31 No Schocl - Winter Breck 21| 22| 23| 24| 25| 26| > 4/26 Lost Teocher Day
2| 29| ao| a1 28| 27| a0
JANUARY 2024 187 *Last scheduled elementary student
M| T|W|TH| F 1/1-1/2 Ho School - Winter Break day contingent upon snow days used
1 2| 3 1119 No School - MLE Jr. Day
5| 8| 7| B[ 9| 10 1/20-1/23 HE Regent: Exam Wask BOE Adoptlion: 3/11/25
| 1z 13| 14| 15| 18] 17| BOE Re-Adopfion: 4/10/25
#| 17| 20| | 22| 23| 24
25| 26| 27| 26| 27| 30| M

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a
Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District
hereby schedules the annual organizational meeting for July 1, 2025 at 6:30 pm in the
Conference and Learning Center, 2240 Southwestern Blvd, West Seneca, NY 14224.
Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0
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ADOPTION OF
E1CC BOCES
EQUIPMENT
PURCHASE
RESOLUTIONS

RE-ADOPTON
OF PLICY 1210
AND DELETION

OF POLICY 1131

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:

RESOLVED that the Board of Education of the Orchard Park CSD hereby agrees to enter into the
attached contract with the Erie 1 BOCES for a three-year period commencing on July 25, 2025 to
authorize the Western New York Regional Information Center to furnish certain computer services to
the District pursuant to Education Law 1950 (4) (JJ) for an amount not to exceed $175,902.84 and
authorizes 36- monthly payments to be made to Erie 1 BOCES in the amount not to
exceed $4,886.19 per month. Be it further RESOLVED, that the Board of Education of the Orchard
Park CSD hereby authorizes the Board President or the District Clerk to execute the contract on behalf
of the District. RESOLVED that the Board of Education of the Orchard Park CSD hereby agrees to
enter into the attached contract with the Erie 1 BOCES for a three-year period commencing on June 25,
2025 to authorize the Western New York Regional Information Center to furnish certain computer
services to the District pursuant to Education Law 1950 (4) (JJ) for an amount not to exceed
$213,445.08 and authorizes 36- monthly payments to be made to Erie 1 BOCES in the amount not to
exceed $5,929.03 per month. Be it further RESOLVED, that the Board of Education of the Orchard
Park CSD hereby authorizes the Board President or the District Clerk to execute the contract on behalf
of the District.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District, upon the
recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby re-adopts policy 1210: Board of Education
Members as written and deletes policy 1131: Student Serving as Ex-Officio Member of the School
Board.
POLICY 1210: BOARD OF EDUCATION MEMBERS: NOMINATION AND ELECTION
a)  Candidates for the office of member of the Board of Education shall be nominated by a petition directed to
the District Clerk which is signed by at least 25 qualified voters of the District, or by 2% of the number of voters
who voted in the previous annual election, whichever is greater. Petitions must state the residence of each signer,
the name and residence of each candidate.
b)  The notice of the Annual District Meeting must state that petitions nominating candidates for the Board of
Education must be filed with the Clerk of the District no later than 30 days before the Annual or Special District
Meeting at which the School Board election will occur, between 9 a.m. and 5 p.m.
¢)  Voting will be by machine, and provision shall be made for the election by "write-in-vote" of any candidate
not previously nominated. The position of candidates on ballots shall be determined by lot at a drawing conducted
by the District Clerk on the day after the last filing. Candidates or their proxies may be present for the drawing.
d)  The hours of voting shall be as indicated by Board resolution.
e) The candidates receiving the largest number of votes shall be declared elected in accordance with Education
Law.
f) At least ten days prior to the election, the Board will appoint at least two inspectors of election for each
voting machine or ballot box, and set their salary.
g)  The District Clerk shall oversee the election. The Clerk shall give notice immediately to each person
declared elected to the Board, informing him/her of the election and his/her term of office.
h)  Only qualified voters as determined by Education Law Section 2012 may vote at any District meeting or
election.
i) No electioneering will be allowed within 100 feet of the polling place.
1) When a term of office expires at the end of a school year and the office has become vacant at the time of
election, the person elected to fill the new full term vacancy also fills the remaining days of the previous term,
beginning his/her term of office immediately upon election and the taking and filing of the oath of office.
Selecting Ex Officio Student Board Members
To be designated as an ex officio student Board member the student must have attended a District high
school for at least one year prior to selection and must be a member of the senior class.
The ex officio student members of the Board may be any of the following:

a. The student that has been duly elected as student president of the high school;

b. A student duly elected by the student body;

c. A student selected by the high school student government;

d. A student selected by the high school principal,;

June 10, 2025



e. A student selected by the Superintendent; or
f. A student selected by a majority vote of the Board.
The District will take into consideration the number of high schools within the District and provide a
mechanism which allows for fair representation among the schools.
Education Law Sections 1702, 1703, 1804, 1901, 1950, 2004, 2012, 2018, 2025, 2029, 2031-
a, 2031, 2032,2034,
2105(14), 2121, 2502, 2602, 2608(1), and 2610

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a
Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District,
upon the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby accepts the donation
of a Fender guitar from Kevin King.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District,
upon the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby declares the library
books from the middle school as presented as surplus. (attachment #5)

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District,
upon the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby awards the Athletic
Supplies/Equipment/Reconditioning Bids to the vendors as presented at the amounts
listed totaling $47,362.90.

1. | Award of BSN Sports $2,671.16

2. | Award of Laux Sporting Goods, Inc. $3.376.40

3. | Award of Longstreth Sporting Goods $214.92

4. | Award of Medco $2,284.55

5. | Award of M-F Athletic Company $0

6. | Award of Plaques and Such $2,064.75

7. | Award of Jostens, Inc. $0

8. | Award of The Nixon Company, Inc. $0

9. | Award of Pioneer Revere No bid returned

No bid returned Estimated $27,000 (includes
10. | Award of Riddell reconditioning of equipment, per piece pricing)
11. | Award of Sportsman's $7,727.05
12. | Award of Henry Schein Performance No bid returned
13. | Award of Varsity Athletic Apparel, Inc. No bid returned
14. | Award of Collins Sports Medicine $513.38
15. | Award of School Specialty, Inc. No bid returned
16. | Award of Gopher Sport No bid returned
17. | Award of Pyramid School Products $1,510.69
18. | Officials Warehouse No bid returned
TOTAL BID AWARD: $47,362.90
Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0 June 10, 2025
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Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to approve the following:
RESOLVED: That the Board of Education of the Orchard Park Central School District, upon
the recommendation of the Superintendent of Schools, hereby awards the District-wide Printing
Bids to the following vendors in the amount listed totaling $10,789.83:

e Award of Southtowns Print = $2,101.30, Award of Gallagher Printing, Inc. = $6,275.53,

Award of Xoar Communications = $2,413.00

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a
Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Public Comment / Correspondence
» Mrs. Connors shared a thank you from Mr. Lowrey for the Board support of his
candidates for NYSSBA area 1 director.
» Mrs. Connors shared that Mr. Romanello has completed his required educational
courses during his first year on the Board as required by law.

Executive Session

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to enter executive session at 8:20 pm
to discuss the employment history of a particular person and contractual negotiations.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to adjourn executive session at
9:28 pm.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau

No —n/a

Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Dr. Rogers called the meeting back to order at 9:28 pm.

Adjournment
Motion by Mr. Anderson, seconded by Mrs. Sreniawski, to adjourn at 9:28 p.m.

Yes — Rogers, Anderson, Sreniawski, Draves and Comeau
No —n/a
Motion Unanimously Carried 5-0

Respectfully submitted,

Cheryl A. Connors
District Clerk

Minute Attachments
1. Financials
2. MOA’s: OPPA, OPCOA & SRP’s; OPPA; OPTA (3); and SRP attachment
3. Special Education
4. Textbook Adoption
5. Surplus MS Library Books
Other Attachments
Official Meeting Announcement
Agenda
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