Custodial Supplies RFQ - Simi va"ey USD, 2025-2026 Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor 5 Vendor 6 Vendor 7 Vendor 8 Vendor 9 Vendor 10 Vendor 11 Vendor 12 Vendor 13 Vendor 14 Vendor 15 Vendor 16 Vendor 17 Vendor 18 Vendor 19
vt DESCRIPTION
002450 |BLADE, X-ACTO: FITS TYPE A HANDLES, #1 ASSORTMENT 0.00 No Bid NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 7.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
INCLUDES 5 BLADES- 2 OF #11 FINE POINT, #10 CURVED, #16 No Bid NO BID NO BID 0 EPIXZ3601
SCORING. #17 LIGHTWEIGHT CHISELING (X-ACTO X231) No Bid 0 NA EPIXZ3601
002922 |BLEACH: *** CUSTODIAL USE ONLY *** 5.25% BLEACH, 1 GALLON 0.00 No Bid 3.29 4.00 3.60 4.73 3.23 3.09 3.79 . 4.57 0.00 9.02 3.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.98 PER
(ULTRA CLEAN 52412), (S6) No Bid 1620-8884 PBB-24060206 TTB 34371 KIKBLEACH6 170018 KIK PUREBRIGHTG 857478 30966 1205-01 GALLON
No Bid KIK International PURE Purox ESSENDANT KIKBLEACH6 KIK KIKBLEACH6 L SP RICHARDS CLOROX, 30966 Globus BR25
BRIGHT2406020 RECEIVABLES, #11003428431 Kik International KIK8635042 AROCEP
6 KIKBLEACH6 11008635042 ULTRA
002942 (BROOM HEAD: PUSH BROOM HEAD, 18", W/O HANDLE, 0.00 No Bid 15.49 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.17 11.70 10.95 9.06 18.49 12.99 14.21 11.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FINE/MEDIUM TAMPICO FIBER (BLACK) (TOUGH GUY 1A842) No Bid 1638-8757 24420774 2055102 BWK20218 4018JAN 9110561 BH11003 24420785 NXT 27068-6
No Bid Carlisle COASTWIDE MALISH BWK20218 Janico 4018 GLOBE ABCO BH11003 | COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP
3621921803 CW57735 #2055102 COMMERCIAL CW57735 27068-6
PRODUCTS INC
4550EA
002977 |BROOM HEAD: PUSH BROOM HEAD, 24", GARAGE, PALMYRA, 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 8.87 13.07 12.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 11.75 9.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
W/O HANDLE, (S12) No Bid 2667-2257 24420774 2055210 BWK20224 NO BID 0 24420774 NXT 27100-6
No Bid Carlisle COASTWIDE MALISH BWK20224 0 NA COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP
3621912400 CW57737 #2055210 CW57737 27100-6
002943 |BROOM HEAD: PUSH BROOM HEAD, 24", W/O HANDLE, BLACK 0.00 No Bid 23.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.19 15.58 12.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 13.51 13.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BLENDED HORSEHAIR/POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES (CARLISLE No Bid 1682-8257 24420778 2055006 BWK20324 NO BID 0 24420778 NXT 20683-6
4503103), (S12) No Bid Carlisle 4507303 COASTWIDE MALISH BWK20324 0 NA COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP
CW57733 #2055006 CW57733 20683-6
002940 |BROOM, CORN BLEND: NO 6 SEWN, WAREHOUSE (PREMIER 0.00 No Bid 8.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.55 11.95 0.00 12.69 12.99 9.40 10.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
60303), (S6) No Bid 1641-8461 2051161 BWK932CEA NO BID 291566 B412 24420777 NXT 6122-6
No Bid ABCO Mop & PREMIER BWK932CEA ESSENDANT ACS B412 COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP
Broom #60303 co CW57664 6122-6
BWKO32YEA
200177 |BROOM: ANGLED: 12IN. WIDE, 48" METAL HANDLE, (MFG# 0.00 No Bid 4.99 0.00 10.30 0.00 4.95 7.30 5.95 5.97 15.99 5.29 NO BID 7.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
PREMIER #60812) (CARLISLE 4165000) No Bid 2695-7528 BB997 24420007 2055501 BWKBRMAXIL BIG-BRUT 898719 BR1024MH NXT 098-12
No Bid ABCO Mop & COASTWIDE MALISH BWKBRMAXIL Janico 4050 SP RICHARDS ABCO NEXTSTEP 098
Broom CW61070 #055906 GJO09570 BR1024MH 12
BR-1024MH
002955 |BRUSH, CLEANING: COUNTER BRUSH, 8", GREY, (CARLISLE 0.00 No Bid 4.89 6.77 5.30 0.00 2.51 10.73 4.95 4.69 28.09 3.98 NO BID 2.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3621123), (S12) No Bid 2677-8530 CL-3621123 BR114908 24418472 2066205 BWK5408 114908 5586819 00100 NXT 96421-12
No Bid Carlisle 3621123 CARLISLE COASTWIDE MALISH BWK5408 Malish Corp TUNDRA ABCO 00100 NEXT STEP
3621123 CW56791 #2066205 RESTAURANT 96421-12
SUPPLY LLC
83161
002957 [BRUSH, CLEANING: DRINKING FOUNTAIN, DOUBLE END, 12" 0.00 No Bid 5.39 0.00 0.00 0.00 15.99 0.00 3.69 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 6.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
OVERALL LENGTH (CARLISLE #4015400) No Bid 2647-2112 2475513 NO BID 4067500 NO BID 0 C 4015400
No Bid Carlisle 4015400 CARLISLE 4067500 0 NA CARLISLE.
83150 4015400
002985 [BRUSH, TOILET: 15" HANDLE, WHITE (RUBBERMAID 0.00 No Bid 243 0.00 2.90 0.00 0.88 2.38 1.99 2.38 3.55 2.39 247 1.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FG631000WHT) No Bid 1678-7107 BRBCC BWKO00160EA 2060671 6310 6310RM 1127970 FG6310 6310WE NXT 96301-12
No Bid Tolco 280102 BOARDWALK | RUBBERMAID RCP6310 Ruibbermaid NEWELL RUBBERMAID | RUBBERMAID, NEXT STEP
BWKO00160EA |#FG631000WHT FG631000WHT BRANDS FG6310 FG631000WHT 96301-12
DISTRIBUTION
LLC
FG631000WHT
002987 [BRUSH, TOILET: SWAB MOP HEAD, URINAL BOWL, WHITE 0.00 No Bid 8.69 0.00 3.57 0.00 6.58 2.36 1.59 0.00 1.24 6.99 NO BID 1.09 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(UNGER BSRHR 2/PACK) No Bid 2648-1364 BRRBB BSRHR 2060442 BWKO00160EA NO BID 8417689 BSRHR NXT 96303-100
No Bid Unger BSRHR UNGER BSRHR | UNGER BSRHR | BWKO00160EA ESSENDANT | UNGER BSRHR NEXT STEP
co 96303-100
BWKO00160EA
002986 |BRUSH, TOILET: TOILET, URINAL, 26" OVERALL LENGTH, INCL 0.00 No Bid 16.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 16.05 16.00 14.95 60.83 0.00 14.98 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TWO 3-1/2" NYLON BRISTLE HEADS, CURVED HANDLE (UNGER No Bid 2634-3537 BBCOR 2060118 UNGBBCOR BBCOR 0 BBCOR NO BID
#UNG-BBCOR ONLY), (S5) No Bid Unger BBCOR UNGER BBCOR UNGER UNGBBCOR Unger BBCOR 0 NA UNGER BBCOR
#BBBOR
002991 |BUCKET, MOP, DIRTY WATER, RED, RUBBERMAID #660254 0.00 No Bid 26.52 0.00 23.84 0.00 0.00 16.63 29.95 0.00 34.29 10.99 36.69 36.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 1668-3409 MDBD 666115 RCP2064907 NO BID 9869624 FG2963RED 24357598* RCP2064907
No Bid Rubbermaid RUBERMAID RCP2064907 ESSENDANT | RUBBERMAID | RUBBERMAID, Rubbermaid
F2064907 #F2064907 co FG2963RED 2064907 RCP2064907 18
RCP2064907 at Red
018204 [CAUTION TAPE: YELLOW, 3" X 1000FT 0.00 No Bid 4.98 0.00 11.04 0.00 9.28 11.79 12.95 4.87 16.50 5.99 14.45 8.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 1649-5210 ROL GSN10379 791470 GNS10379 CAUTION 876042 T15101 422712 CWC 059328.
No Bid X-Guard 151429 GREAT NECK [IMPACT #7328W GNS10379 Lindstrom LLC ESSENDANT CORDOVA EMPIRE LEVEL,| CWC 059328.
GSN10379 CAUTION CO GNS10379 T15101 272-71-1001
001968 |CLEANER, ABSORBENT: OOPS DEODORIZER,12 OZ (MISSION 0.00 No Bid 0.00 3.87 96.97 0.00 1.34 3.16 3.69 3.74 7.97 0.00 NO BID 4.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1360-24), (S24) No Bid 1629-8248 MKP-1360 BDO FAOSM12 910740 1360-24 13602412 648189 2487-12
No Bid Mission MISSION FIRST AID MISSION 1360-24 Mission Sweep ESSENDANT Kleensweep
Kleensweep KLEENSWEEP ONLY FAOSM12| KLEENSWEEP 1360 co
1360-24 1360 #1360-24 FRS614SSEA
003925 [CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 13L FRESH SCENT DEODORIZER, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 103.99 61.55 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GRAY CAP, 2 LITRE (3M ID 70071683158), (S6) *NO No Bid 13L 325555 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100051405 3M N/A 0 NA
#5004801120121
9
003961 |CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 16L QUAT SANITIZER, GRAY CAP, 2 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 18.29 0.00 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
LITER (MFG# 16L, 3M ID 70-0708-4016-3), (S6) *NO No Bid 16L NO BID N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100134357 N/A 0 NA
096220 |CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 20L GLASS CLEANER HEAVY DUTY, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 24.57 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GRAY CAP, 2 LITRE (MFG# 3M ID 70071683562), (S6) *NO No Bid 325422 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid N/A 0 NA
#5004801123357
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200179 |CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 23L NEUTRAL QUAT DISINFECTANT, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 30.42 14.66 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GRAY CAP, 2 LITER, MFG# 23L (MFG# 3M ID 70071315009), (S6), No Bid 325582 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
*NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100134549 3M N/A 0 NA
#5004801126057
5
003954 [CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 24H 3 IN 1 FLOOR CLEANER, GRAY 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 49.64 42.16 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CAP, 2 LITRE (MFG# 24H, 3M ID 70-0716-8317-4), (S6) *NO No Bid 24H 325576 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100053804 |3M #7100053804 N/A 0 NA
003923 [CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 26L DEGREASER, INDUSTRIAL 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 53.21 32.35 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
STRENGTH, GRAY CAP, 2 LITRE (#MFG 26L, 3M ID 70-0715-9448- No Bid 325784 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
8), (S6) *NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100122450 |3M #7010385967 N/A 0 NA
096224 (CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 2L MULTI-SURFACE CLEANER, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 37.40 22.70 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
HEAVY DUTY, GRAY CAP (MFG# 2L, 3M ID 70-0716-8365-3), (S6) No Bid 2L 325430 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
*NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 70071683653 N/A 0 NA
#5004801119202
9
003930 |CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 34H PEROXIDE CLEANER, GRAY 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 19.88 16.52 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CAP, 2 LITRE (3M ID 70071683737), (S6) *“NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 34H 325586 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid 3M 7100074297 N/A 0 NA
#5001801120200
1
016281 [CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 34L PEROXIDE CLEANER, 2 LITRE, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 19.88 15.62 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GRAY CAP (MFG# 34L, 3M ID 70071683729), (S6) *NO No Bid 325785 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100055372 [3M #7010315335 N/A 0 NA
003924 [CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL, 3H NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 38.85 18.34 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GRAY CAP, 2 LITRE (MFG# 3H, 3M ID 7100048759), (S6) *NO No Bid 3H 325440 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 3M 7100048759 N/A 0 NA
#5001801120200
1
200245 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 18.39 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 325520 N/A 0
No Bid N/A 0 NA
#5004801119212
8
0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 18.39 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 325510 N/A 0
No Bid 3M N/A 0 NA
#5004801119211
1
003966 |CLEANER: AIRX 66, ODOR DIGESTER AND STAIN REMOVER, 7.73 No Bid 7.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.80 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
GALLON, (S4) *SEASONAL, NO SUBSTITUTIONS* 155804 No Bid 2629-7123 162071 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
Maintex - 1558 No Bid Empire Cleaning WHOLE EARTH N/A 0 NA
Solutions LAB
Enzyme Odor
Diaester
003967 |CLEANER: AIRX 80, CARPET SANITIZER, (S4) *SEASONAL, NO 10.99 No Bid 20.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 16.29 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBSTITUTIONS* 156404 No Bid 1608-6237 1070660 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
Maintex - 1564 No Bid Bioesque NILDOR INC N/A 0 NA
Botanical #WS128SBN
Sanitizer for
carpets
003926 |CLEANER: CARPET SPOTTER, QUART (CHAMPION OR ULTRA 1.87 No Bid 2.20 0.00 240 0.00 2.68 4.72 6.39 3.00 4.95 0.00 NO BID 3.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CLEAN/FLOKEM CC701/EMPIRE CLEANING 573550), (S12) 114532 No Bid 1669-8235 CAPSQ BWK4821EA 1070400 RAC97402EA G00416 8283354 2205-32
Maintex - 1145 No Bid Empire Cleaning Pro Spotter BOARDWALK | FOLEX CO #12- [ RAC97402EA Victoria Bay LIGHTHOUSE TCHEM 2205
Solutions Hot BWK4821EA 1 G00416 FOR THE BLIND American Carpet
Spot 573550 SF 504RTUEA Spotter
002905 [CLEANER: CHEWING GUM REMOVER; AEROSOL, 6.5 OZ CAN, 0.00 8.02 2.85 4.58 3.61 0.00 3.45 3.42 4.29 3.64 87.39 3.25 NO BID 3.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SPRAYPAK 433-4107), (S12) 6101161 2622-6112 $88-21224 AG 653324 1070451 BWK353AEA F00177B 8441396 433-4107 2245-20
ECOLAB Empire Cleaning | TRIPLE-S 21224 Champion AMRA18312 AMRER INC BWK353AEA Victoria Bay ESSENDANT [SPRAYPAK 433- CHASE 5165.
REVITALIZE Solutions, #1015807 F00177 co 4107 SprayPak
CHEWING GUM| Aerosol Gum & DV095628817C
REMOVER (12-| Candle Wax T
50Z) Remover 2622-
6112
020354 |CLEANER: DRY ERASE SURFACE, 1 GAL BOTTLE (MFG# EXPO 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.88 29.60 26.55 26.56 18.69 30.99 24.09 39.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SAN81800), (S4) No Bid 364141 320010 SAN81800 USSAN81800 127731 81800 81800* SAN81800
No Bid EXPO 81800 NP&PC SAN81800 EXPO 81800 NEWELL EXPO 81800 EXPO, 81800 EXPO
ESSENDANT BRANDS SAN81800
#SAN81800 DISTRIBUTION
LLC 81800
200238 [CLEANER: ENVIROX H2 ORANGE, 2 GALLONS (#A-112-02B-CL) 0.00 No Bid 149.80 39.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 141.15 N/A 160.24 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
*NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 2608-4210 EO-112-02H-CA 170154CA N/A A11202BEA 0 NO BID
No Bid Envirox A-112- | ENVIROX 112 ENVIROX LLC N/A Envirox A-112- 0 NA
02B-CL #A-112-02B-CL 02B
096225 |CLEANER: FLOOR NEUTRALIZER RINSE AGENT; GALLON 5.28 32.24 6.89 6.95 0.71 0.00 0.00 9.38 14.95 7.52 0.00 0.00 NO BID 6.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BOTTLE (MFG# GENLABS 01013), (S4) *SEASONAL* 114704 6191402 1668-8931 HSS-82001 ST729 320024 1013 302904 0 1760-01
Maintex - 1147 | Ecolab Prep Pak | GenlLabs 1013- CHEMCHOR GENLAGS 1013 Spartan 302904 0 NA TCHEM 1760.
Neutralizer/Condi 04 82001 #038220401W Brite Back

tioner (2 packs of
qty 90-0.5 oz
packs per case)

Neutral Floor
Cleaner Citrus
Scent
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003922 |CLEANER: FLOOR STRIPPER, 5 GAL PAIL, FINISH & SEALER 26.43 108.00 36.99 9.42 101.00 0.00 85.27 43.44 39.50 115.18 85.83 0.00 NO BID 41.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
REMOVER (GEN LABS 01095-5/EMPIRE FAST STRIP 537816) 114105 6101154 1656-8937 HSS-01095 CLsSQ@s5 888B500 320812 1095 95386176 7163942 1731-05
*SEASONAL* Maintex - 1141 | BRIGHT BLAST | Empire Cleaning GENLABS BETCO 888B500 GENLABS 1095 Diversey DIVERSEY TCHEM 1731
LOW ODOR Solutions #055550105W 95386176 95115958 EZ Strip Heavy
FLOOR Faststrip 537816 Duty
STRIPPER 5
GAL
003932 |CLEANER: GRAFFITI REMOVER, MEETS PROPOSITION 9 7.95 No Bid 8.99 25.00 5.74 0.00 11.24 12.37 8.95 8.39 1565.30 0.00 NO BID 13.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
REQUIREMENTS, NON AEROSOL, HEAVY DUTY (SPARTAN 3171), 1C42032 No Bid 1615-8558 SP-3171-12 AVS 936563 410263 MOT40901CT 3171 1454392 MOT40903
(812) Champion No Bid Spartan 3137-12 SPARTAN MOT41103 ESSENDANT MOT40901CT | Spartan 317103 BETCO Motsenbocker's
Chemical - 420 #MOT41103 CORPORATION Lift-Off Liquid
0152300 MOT40903ESS3
003965 |CLEANER: MINERAL DEPOSIT REMOVER, GALLON (LIME GONE 8.71 15.70 14.35 11.10 15.50 0.00 9.22 15.45 11.95 12.35 20.70 0.00 NO BID 8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MFG# GEN LABS 2068), (S4) 113004 6101131 1660-8844 CC-40801 CLO1 SMP1700128 870114 2068 K01067 9628026 1960-01
Maintex - 1130 |Ecolab Limeaway| GenlLabs 2068- CHEMCHOR HD Chem SIMPLE GREEN GENLABS 2068 Victoria Bay SP RICHARDS TCHEM 1960.
4-1GL 04 LIME GONE 1700128 #020680401W K01067 JELFMCLR1284 Lime X Descaler
40801 P
003929 |CLEANER: PORCELAIN, TILE, CHROME & BATHROOM CLEANER 1.71 No Bid 2.88 2.60 9.58 0.00 5.35 3.10 3.89 2.54 3.07 0.00 NO BID 4.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CUSTODIAL, QUART (GEN LABS #3119), (S12) 145232 No Bid 1606-8951 HSS-03119-12 TT1720 TOLCO 926 870061 3119 L01232 350762 193232
Maintex - 1452 No Bid GenLabs 3119- | GENLABS 3119 HD Chem TOLCO 926 GENLABS 3119 Victoria Bay SP RICHARDS Complete R/IR
12 #031191232W L01232 ZPEZUALL32 Cleaner Cherry
Scent
TCHEM 1930
Wintermint
TCHEM 1932.
Cherrv
003931 [CLEANER: SUPER BOWL TOILET BOWL CLEANER, QUART (GEN 223 6.82 2.35 1.79 277 0.00 227 2.90 2.95 232 5.64 0.00 2.48 3.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
LABS #2071-12), (S12) 133032 6100487 2627-7222 HSS-02071-12 SanoBrite 24517461 1030191 2071 L01207 6646617 24517461 1919-32
Maintex - 1330 |Ecolab CBC Plus| GenlLabs 2071- | GENLABS 2071 McCalla COASTWIDE GENLABS 2071 Victoria Bay SP RICHARDS COASTWIDE, | Emulsion Heavy
Bowl Cleaner 12 CW112RU32-A | #020711232W L01207 ZPEZUATBC32 CW112RU32-A | Duty 23% Acid
Bowl Cleaner
TCHEM 1919
200213 |CLEANER: WAXIE-GREEN SOLSTA 330 FRESH MIST LIQUID 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 25.02 349.00 12.27 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MICROBES, 3 LITERS (MFG# 160115), (S4) *NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 160115 160115 S00121 0 NO BID
No Bid WHOLE EARTH 160115 Victoria Bay 0 NA
LAB S00121
#WEFMS_CASE
003960 |CLEANSER, POWDERED: 21 OZ CAN , OXYGEN BLEACH 0.00 No Bid 1.54 1.39 249 0.00 1.25 1.52 1.61 1.37 1.99 1.71 2.18 1.83 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CLEANSER HEAVY DUTY FORMULA (AJAX #14278), (S24) No Bid 1689-0752 CP-14278 TTAJ CPC14278CT 870296 14278 AJAXB 466037 P752088 14278 1270-21
No Bid Ajax 14278 COLGATE AJAX AJAX 14278 ESSEDANT 14278 Colgate- SP RICHARDS | BABO P752088 | AJAX, 214278 Ajax Cleanser
PALMOLIVE #CPC14278CT Palmolive 14278 CPC214278 CPC14278
14278
003928 |DEFOAMER: QUART (GEN LABS #2053-12), (S12) 5.99 No Bid 3.98 0.00 2.03 0.00 6.04 5.02 4.29 9.12 48.42 0.00 NO BID 8.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
152504 No Bid 2637-0383 CAKOP 502620 1071005 2053 D00014BR 8440690 2301-01
Maintex - 1525 No Bid GenLabs 2053- Knockout DIVERSEY DIVERSEY 2053 Victoria Bay ESSENDANT TCHEM 2301
12 DVO95002620 |  #95002620 D00014 co
DV095002620
020944 [DISPENSER (SINGLE ROLL) FOR CORELESS TOILET TISSUE 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 712 NO CHARGE 10.00 0.00 21.28 0.00 1.41 29.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
JUMBO ROLL; SMOKE, FITS CORELESS JRT TISSUE KC 07006 No Bid 504078 851225 9602 0C09602 397728 504078 KCC09602
SVUSD #020941, (MFG# KIMBERLY CLARK 09602) No Bid KCC09602 KIMBERLY- 9602 Kimberly Clark ESSENDANT SCOTT, 09602 | Kimberly Clark
CLARK #09602 09602 CO _KC(C09602 KCC09602
020942 [DISPENSER, (DUAL ROLL) FOR CORELESS TOILET TISSUE 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 10.28 NO CHARGE 10.00 0.00 36.39 0.00 11.74 36.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
JUMBO ROLL: SMOKE, FITS CORELESS JRT TISSUE KC 07006 No Bid S$88-76111 821252 851222 9608 0C09608 586683 821252 KCC09608
SVUSD #020941, (WAXIE 851222, MFG# KIMBERLY-CLARK 09608) No Bid S$88-76111 KCC09608 KIMBERLY- 9608 Kimberly Clark ESSENDANT SCOTT, 09608 | Kimberly Clark
CLARK #09608 09608 CO _KC(C09608 KCC09608
004951 [DISPENSER, CLEANER: 3M TWIST'N FILL; 16 X 16 X 8, INCLUDES 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO CHARGE N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
HOSES; GRAY UNIT (MODEL 70-0708-3201-2) (70-0713-1519- No Bid 2767121 325400 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
9)(BAR CODE: 5 00 48011 23592 4) DISPENSERS ARE FREE No Bid 3M 7100135687 3M N/A 0 NA
#5004801123592
4
019918 |DISPENSER, HAND SANITIZER: FITS ECOLAB SANITIZER 0.00 Free with No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO CHARGE N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
#6100730 SVUSD STORES ITEM #019919 (ECOLAB CLASSIC purchase of hand 5492023093 N/A NO BID 0 1082-06NV
WHITE #92023093) soap/sanitizer ECOLAB N/A 0 NA TCHEM 1082
92023093 #92023093 "Cartridge" 1000
Ecolab NEXA ml Hand
Classic Manual Foam Sanitizer
Dispenser-White Clear
012147 |DISPENSER, HAND SOAP: ANTIMICROBIAL, FITS ECOLAB 0.00 Free with No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO CHARGE N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SOAP#6100714 SVUSD STORES ITEM #012146, (ECOLAB CLASSIC purchase of hand 5492023091 N/A NO BID 0 1081-06NV
BLACK #92023091) soap/sanitizer Ecolab N/A 0 NA TCHEM 1081.
92023091 #92023091 "Cartridge” 1000
Ecolab NEXA ml.  Hand
Classic Manual Foam Soap
Dispenser-Black Antimicrobial
020960 |DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL: MANUAL, SMOKE, USES TOWELS 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO CHARGE 50.00 0.00 64.34 0.00 NO BID 48.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
KC 25702 SVUSD #200252, (MFG# KIMBERLY-CLARK 34346) No Bid S$88-76122 855159 34346 34346 677207 3775-44
No Bid TRIPLE-S 76122 KIMBERLY- 34346 Kimberly Clark KIMBERLY CDL 418W
CLARK #34346 34346 CLARK
PROFESSIONAL
34346
020962 |DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL: MOD SLIMROLL, MANUAL, SMOKE, 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.56 NO CHARGE 10.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 48.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
USES MOD SLIMROLL TOWELS KC 12388 SVUSD #020961, (MFG# No Bid S$S88-76109 24575316 855113 36016 47092 0 3775-44
KIMBERLY-CLARK 36016) No Bid TRIPLE-S 76109 KCC47092 KIMBERLY- 36016 Kimberly Clark 0 NA CDL 418W
CLARK #47092 47092
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vt DESCRIPTION
004954 |DISPENSER, SOAP: WHITE, FOR AZURE REFRESH SOAP SVUSD 0.00 No Bid No Charge 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
STOCK #019954, (SCJ 4000000525) No Bid 1614-8177 NO BID SJN91128EA 91627 0 1042-06NV
No Bid SC Johnson/DEB SJN91128EA SCJ 91627 0 NA TCHEM 1042.
91627 Cartridge. 6
Refills/ 1000
ml/Case. Hand
Foam Soap Plum
003000 [DISPENSER, TOILET SEAT COVER: W/SCREWS, WHITE 0.00 No Bid 5.98 0.00 8.67 0.00 6.18 8.54 18.95 0.00 22.99 0.00 NO BID 9.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(HOSPECO HG-1-2) No Bid 1679-8353 TSSP 072213 851560 BWKKD100 NO BID 5639732 3938-01
No Bid Mosaic 081250 COASTWIDE HOSPECO BWKKD100 HOSPECO HG- CDL 381W
CW24778 #WAXIE-1 1-2
200240 [DISPENSER: ENVIROX 112 SINGLE WALL 0.00 No Bid 0.00 o 0.00 0.00 0.00 39.33 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 2625-2027 EO-AP-252-112 328515 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid Envirox A-252- | ENVIROX 112 ENVIROX LLC N/A 0 NA
112 AP #4-252-117
008947 [DUST MOP TREATMENT: GALLON (AIRKEM #61017024) (SPARTAN 0.00 No Bid 10.99 0.00 22.31 0.00 24.48 27.55 33.00 9.44 0.00 0.00 25.38 35.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3013), (S4) No Bid 1698-8949 PWDMT 801509 180414 AMR1003411 301304B 0 AMR103411EA 2086-12
No Bid Spartan 3013-04 AMREP MISTY GENLABS AMR1003411 Spartan 301304 0 NA MISTY, 1003411 Misty D/M
AEPR8114 #020580401W Treatment
Grapefruit scent
AMR1003411
016932 |DUST PAN: HEAVY DUTY, 16" WIDE X 10" DEEP, METAL ONLY, 0.00 No Bid 15.90 0.00 17.02 0.00 9.95 8.20 14.95 14.02 0.00 19.95 7.09 10.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
NO BEND HANDLE (IMPACT 4216) No Bid 2621-1146 DP1093 IMP4216 190020 IMP4216 IMP4216 0 4216 421290 2730-01
No Bid Imapct 4216 IMPACT IMPACT IMP4216 Impact 4216 0 NA IMPACT 4216 | IMPACT, 4212 | IMPACT 4216
IMP4216 #4216
016934 |DUST PAN: UPRIGHT, LOBBY STYLE, BLACK, PLASTIC 0.00 No Bid 8.99 12.50 25.56 0.00 6.58 10.43 14.95 9.10 15.26 10.98 16.87 11.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(CONTINENTAL 912BK) (COASTWIDE CW62116), (S6) No Bid 2658-3474 DMI-9378LIP DP1168 24580902 190070 BWK02600 B452 7852454 DP000204EH 24580902 NXT96208
No Bid ABCO DP-0204 DELAMO COASTWIDE IMPACT BWK02600 Janico 1085 ESSENDANT ABCO COASTWIDE, NXT 96208
9378LIP CW62116 #2600W CO_BWK02600 DP00204EH CW62116
016930 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 8.45 0.00 0.00 4.94 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid DP4212 190010 0
No Bid IMPACT 0 NA
#4212
008946 |DUSTER COVER: YELLOW, PRO DUSTER SLEEVES, 50/PKG 0.00 No Bid 31.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 10.60 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 10.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(MFG: PROTEAM 101533) No Bid 2602-3414 440740 N/A NO BID 0 2642-50
No Bid Proteam 101533 HOSPECO N/A 0 NA HOSPECO # N-
#2925 DSMQPY2
200199 |DUSTER, COMPRESSED AIR: 10 OZ (ULTRA DUSTER UDS10P1) 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.79 0.00 4.95 0.00 8.92 4.98 3.48 4.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 24401448 NO BID IVR10010 NO BID 911220 DPSXL 712196 IVR10016
No Bid UDS-10P1 IVR10010 AW PRODUCT | ADVANTUS QUILL, Q10521 Innovera.
SALES & MKTG DPSXL IVR10016
INC ODP-10MS
008945 [DUSTER: 42" LAMBS WOOL, LAMBSKIN (IMPACT 312FH), (S12) 0.00 No Bid 5.49 0.00 3.76 0.00 4.73 3.20 7.20 6.43 13.70 4.99 9.53 6.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 1613-8051 FDLWM 24418467 180160 BWKL3850 3073DUSTER 3213757 312FH 24418467 2586-44
No Bid Lambskin COASTWIDE LAMBSKIN BWKL3850 Janico 3073 SP RICHARDS LAMBSKIN COASTWIDE, | IMPACT 350EX
Specialties CW56799 #312FH IMP3106 SPEC CW56799
312FH
008942 |EASY CLEAN SCRUB EXPRESS MOP STICK: HOLDER & STICK 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 54.87 36.03 79.00 58.33 0.00 0.00 NO BID 5.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(MFG: 3M #59051 #651235) No Bid 59051 651235 MMM59051 0C59051 0 2864-71
No Bid 3M 7100134539 3M MMM59051 3M 59051 0 NA Wiper Central
#48011590516 M700071
008943 |EASY CLEAN SCRUB EXPRESS SQUEEZE BOTTLE, 11.5 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 24.66 16.71 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 26.30 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0Z.,12/PKG (MFG: 3M #59056) No Bid 59056 651237 N/A NO BID 0 2864-90
No Bid 3M 7100133191 N/A 0 NA Wiper Central.
#5004801159056 M700090
6
008944 [EASY CLEAN SCRUB FLAT MOP: 18", GREEN, 10/PKG (MFG: 3M 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 4.92 0.00 62.50 60.83 12.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 25.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
#59027) No Bid MF18RG 59027 651230 18"GREEN NO BID 0 2866-18G
No Bid 3M 7100135689 3M 18"GREEN 0 NA Wiper Centrral
#48011555942 M830018G
016918 [FLOOR PAD, BLACK STRIPPING: 19" DIA, 1" THICKNESS, HEAVY 3.03 No Bid 3.39 3.92 0.00 0.00 278 4.07 3.95 2.15 27.21 3.19 NO BID 5.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
DUTY W/POPPED OUT CENTER (AMERICO 400119), *SEASONAL*, 2255199 No Bid 1656-8255 S$88-31035 BWK4019BLA 260140 4019BLA VB19BSTP 996401 72-19 3206-19
(S5) Americo - No Bid Americo 400119 AMERICO BOARDWALK 3M BWK4019BLA Victoria Bay 3M CO 7200N- ACS 72-19 ACS #72-19
400119 BWK4019BLA |#5004801108381 VB19BSTP 19
5
200192 |FLOOR PAD, BLUE CLEANER: 14" X 20", RECTANGULAR (MFG 4.10 No Bid 4.69 4.89 4.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.95 0.00 0.00 4.41 NO BID 6.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
AMERICO 40041420), (S5) 2254122 No Bid 1653-8555 S$S8-31244 FP01328 NO BID 41420 NO BID 0 53-14X20 ACS53-14x20
Americo - No Bid Americo AMERICO AM740041420 0 NA ACS 53-14X20 ACS #53-
40041420 40041420 14x20
200193 |FLOOR PAD, MAROON PREPARATION: 14" X 20", RECTANGULAR, 8.54 No Bid 7.90 7.15 0.00 0.00 7.64 10.95 11.90 120.09 3.09 NO BID 6.15 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FOR SQUARE SCRUB MACHINE (AMERICO 42071420), (S10) 2201420 No Bid 1671-8557 S$88-31269 269720 71420 OCSPP14X20 4585390 47-14X20 3225-20
Americo - No Bid Americo AMERICO AMERIICO AMF42071420 | 3M 7000052694 | 3M CO SPPP- | ACS 47-14X20 ACS # 57-FPP-
42091420 42071420 #42071420 14X20 14x20
016919 |FLOOR PAD, MAROON PREPARATION: 20" DIA, PAD FOR REV 6.23 No Bid 6.79 6.20 6.38 0.00 0.00 8.00 7.50 9.59 109.99 3.20 NO BID 8.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MACHINE (AMERICO 420720), *SEASONAL* (S10) 225420 No Bid 1674-8550 S$88-31267 FP20HP 264132 20720 OCSPP20 2302632 47-20 ACS57-20
Americo - No Bid Americo 420720 AMERICO 3M 48011295923 AM7420720 3M 700002195 | 3M CO SPP20- ACS 47-20 ACS #57-20
420720 CA
200262 |FLOOR PAD, NORA PAD #2: 20" (NORA 501701) (C4-WATCH 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
QUANTITY) *NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid NO BID N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid N/A 0 NA
016920 |FLOOR PAD, RED BUFFING: 20" DIA, 1" THICKNESS, HEAVY DUTY 3.27 No Bid 3.69 4.23 4.61 0.00 2.65 243 4.14 2.29 21.22 2.99 NO BID 5.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
W/POPPED OUT CENTER (AMERICO 404420), “SEASONAL* (S5) 2252200 No Bid 1662-8657 §88-31101 FP20R 663603 262031 4020RED VB20RBFP 3182063 51-20 3213-20
Americo - No Bid Americo 404420 AMERICO COASTWIDE BWK4020RED Victoria Bay AMERICO ACS 51-20 ACS #51-20
404420 Cw22984 #5004801159763 VB20RBFP MANUFACTURI
3 NG COMPANY

404420
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016917 |FLOOR PAD, WHITE POLISHING: 20" DIA, 1" THICKNESS, HEAVY 3.27 No Bid 3.69 4.22 461 0.00 2.65 4.24 3.95 229 33.00 2.99 NO BID 5.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
DUTY W/POPPED OUT CENTER (AMERICO 401220), *SEASONAL* 2253200 No Bid 2666-0631 S$88-31119 FP20W 663605 261340 4020WHI VB20WSPP 874830 41-20 3214-20
(S5) Americo - No Bid Americo 401220 AMERICO COASTWIDE 3M BWK4020WHI Victoria Bay SP RICHARDS ACS 41-20 ACS #41-20
401220 CW22986 #5004801108483 VB20WSPP MMMO08484
6
200195 [FLOOR PAD: BLUE DOODLE SCRUB DRIVER: 5.25" X 10.5", 0.00 No Bid 28.90 0.00 5.33 0.00 5.45 1.51 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
RECTANGULAR (SQUARE SCRUB P0511BLU), (S18) No Bid 1698-4888 HPDBF 280157 266004 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid Square Scrub TOLCO 280157 SQUARE N/A 0 NA
P0511BLU SCRUB #SS
P0511BLU
200194 |FLOOR PAD: BLUE DOODLE TILE & GROUT: 4.75" X 10", 0.00 No Bid 27.90 0.94 26.78 0.00 1.88 25.96 1.95 0.00 46.99 1.09 NO BID 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
RECTANGULAR (SQUARE SCRUB PO511TGBV) No Bid 1693-5278 S$SS-31448 8242 266048 BWK402 NO BID 1410246 626 2516-01
No Bid Square Scrub | TRIPLE-S 31448 3M 7100340526 SQUARE BWK402 3M CO 8242-CT ACS 626 ACS # 626
P0511TGBV SCRUB
#SS P0511TGBV
200196 |FLOOR PAD: SQP DOODLE SCRUB: 5.25" X 10.5", RECTANGULAR 0.00 No Bid 106.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1.77 9.64 1.95 0.00 0.00 1.09 NO BID 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SQUARE SCRUB P0511SQP), (S60) No Bid 1699-4889 8541 260501 BWK403 NO BID 0 626 2518-05
No Bid Square Scrub 3M 7100341164 SQUARE BWK403 0 NA ACS 626 ACS # 631
P0511SQP SCRUB
# SS P1420SQP
019919 |FOAMING HAND SANITIZER FOR FOOD SERVICE : NON-ALCOHOL 0.00 17.78 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 16.75 N/A 30.05 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.69 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BASED, 1250ML, FITS IN ECOLAB CLASSIC WHITE DISPENSER 6100730 546100730 N/A 6100730 0 1078-06 NV
SVUSD STOCK #019918 (MFG# ECOLAB 6100730), (S4,SHLF4) *NO Ecolab Food ECOLAB N/A Ecolab 6100730 0 NA TCHEM. # 1078.
SUBSTITUTIONS* Service Foam #6100730 Sani Foam
Hand Soap (4- 1000 ML/ 6
1250 mL) Refills
007943 |GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY: ORANGE, MEN'S SIZE EXTRA LARGE 0.00 No Bid 1.79 0.00 7.79 0.00 0.00 1.30 1.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SAFETY ZONE GRFO-XL-1SF) No Bid 1617-8372 GNXL 790207 ORXL NO BID 0 4756-10PR
No Bid Johnson Wilshire HOSPECO # ORXL 0 NA Hospeco #
GRFP-XL-1SF GRFO-XL-1SF
007941 |GLOVES, HEAVY WEIGHT: ORANGE, MEN'S, SIZE MEDIUM, 0.00 No Bid 1.79 0.00 7.79 0.00 0.00 1.30 1.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 225 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SAFETY ZONE) (PROGUARD 8340M), (S12) No Bid 1617-8374 GNM 790200 ORM NO BID 0 4756-08PR
No Bid Johnson Wilshire HOSPECO # ORM 0 NA Hospeco #
9208 GRFO-MD-1SF GRFO-M-1SF
007942 |GLOVES, HEAVY WEIGHT: ORANGE; MEN'S, SIZE LARGE 0.00 No Bid 1.79 0.00 7.79 0.00 0.00 1.30 1.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SAFETY ZONE GRFO-LG-1SF), (812) No Bid 1615-8373 GNL 790205 ORL NO BID 0 4756-09PR
No Bid Johnson Wilshire HOSPECO ORL 0 NA Hospeco #
#GRFO-LG-1SF GRFO-LG-1SF
007945 |GLOVES, RUBBER: MEN'S;SIZE LARGE, NON-ALLERGENIC 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 6.96 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
LATEX, 18 GAUGE, MED WEIGHT, UNLINED, FLEXIBLE, 144 No Bid GBL NO BID NO BID 0 NO BID
PR/CS. JOHNSON #602850. (S12) No Bid 0 NA
007948 |GLOVES: EXTRA LARGE, 1 PAIR, POLYURETHANE, ANSI LEVEL 3 0.00 No Bid 5.34 Pair 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CUT RESISTANT, HIGH-PERFORMANCE LINING, GRAY No Bid 2654-0930 NO BID BB454 NO BID 0 CWC # 0510699
(PROFORCE SENTRY OR HONEYWELL WE300) No Bid ProForce Sentry BB454 0 NA CWC # 0510699
007947 |GLOVES: LARGE, 1 PAIR, POLYURETHANE, ANSI LEVEL 3 CUT 0.00 No Bid 5.34 Pair 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
RESISTANT, HIGH-PERFORMANCE LINING, GRAY (PROFORCE No Bid 2653-0939 NO BID BB455 NO BID 0 CWC # 0510698
SENTRY OR HONEYWELL WE300) No Bid ProForce Sentry BB455 0 NA CWC # 0510698
007946 |GLOVES: MEDIUM, 1 PAIR, POLYURETHANE, ANSI LEVEL 3 CUT 0.00 No Bid 5.34 Pair 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
RESISTANT, HIGH-PERFORMANCE LINING, GRAY (PROFORCE No Bid NO BID BB456 NO BID 0 CWC # 0510329
SENTRY OR HONEYWELL WE300) No Bid ProForce Sentry BB456 0 NA CWC # 0510329
016929 |GRABBER, EZ REACHER REPLACEMENT CUPS: 2/SET (MFG# 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.18 1.18 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
ARCMATE RC-1PR) No Bid RC-1PR 293485 NO BID 0 RCP1PR
No Bid ARCMATE RC- ARCMATE 0 NA ARCMATIE # RC{
1PR MANUFACTUR 1PR
#RC-1PR
016931 [GRABBER, E-Z REACHER: 32" (WAXIE#293486, ARCMATE #32S-PS-| 0.00 No Bid 10.89 10.00 13.95 0.00 7.65 7.65 28.95 11.39 18.60 14.98 NO BID 13.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
12), (812) No Bid 1611-8958 AR-32-S-DC12 AIEG 328 293486 UNGNTO080 ARC32SPS 150341 90001 32PPS
No Bid ArcMate 32S ARCMATE ARCMATE 328 ARCMATE UNGNTO080 EZ Reacher MEDLINE ABCO 90001 ARCMATIE #
MANUFACTUR ARC32SPS INDUSTRIES 32PPS
#32S-PS-12 INC
MDS86031RCEH
008910 [HANDLE, BROOM: FOR BRISTLE BRUSH, 6 FT, HARDWOOD, 0.00 No Bid 4.79 5.85 3.86 0.00 3.42 5.00 6.95 0.00 13.49 0.00 9.46 4.83 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SCREW TYPE THREADED W/METAL TIPS (SUPREME #606900) No Bid 1668-8564 CL-4526700 BHMT BWK136 2050941 BWK136 NO BID 406800 24420789 NXT 97160-12
(WAXIE 2050941), (S12) No Bid ABCO Mop & CARLISLE BOARDWALK PREMIER BWK136 ESSENDANT COASTWIDE, | NEXT STEP #
Broom 02113 4526700 BWK136 #70305 CO BWK136 CW57741 97160-12
008949 [HANDLE, DUST MOP: QUICK CHANGE, WOOD HANDLE, SWIVEL, 0.00 No Bid 7.09 7.84 9.12 0.00 6.68 14.65 9.95 4.88 22.19 6.99 11.76 9.42 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5 FT (GOLDEN STAR HQC160) (TRIPLE S 37378) No Bid 1615-8863 S$S88-37378 DMH 24418776 651181 1490 SNSTK 5124071 01406MB 24418776 NXT 96163-12
No Bid ABCO Mop & | TRIPLE-S 37378 COASTWIDE RUBBERMAID BWK1490 Janico 4360 ESSENDANT | ABCO 01406NB | COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP #
Broom 01406 CW56769 #FGM 146000000 CO BWK1490 CW56769 96163-12
008909 |HANDLE, WEDGE MOP: DUST MOP HANDLE/FRAME, USE WITH 0.00 No Bid 4.95 0.00 7.89 0.00 6.30 5.71 4.95 8.82 0.00 0.00 NO BID 5.87 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MOP HEAD SVUSD STOCK #008952 (SUPREME #575900) No Bid 1616-8763 DMWF 24418788 651202 1492 4361EA 0 PM53201
(BOARDWALK BWK1492) No Bid ABCO Mop & COASTWIDE PREMIER BWK1492 Janico 4361 0 NA Premier Mop #
Broom 25001 CW56768 #53201 53201
008914 |HANDLE, WET MOP: SPRING-LOK, WOOD 5 FT, (PREMIER 40512) 11.51 No Bid 12.69 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.35 11.73 4.95 0.00 18.27 0.00 NO BID 17.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(MAINTEX 210830), (S12) 210830 No Bid 1660-8756 BWK610 650153 1492 NO BID 921833 PM40502
No Bid ABCO Mop & BOARDWALK | GOLDEN STAR BWK1492 ESSENDANT Premier Mop #
Broom 01203 BWK610 KL650153 CO RCPH115 PM40502
012918 |HOSE, 5/8" DIA X 50 FT, RED RUBBER COMMERCIAL HOT WATER 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 68.00 0.00 49.25 46.80 59.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 58.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
HOSE, 500 PSI (APEX 8695-50) No Bid WHR 855738 890360 RUBS50 NO BID 0 FLXPR5850R
No Bid JACKSON Teknor 1079136 RUBS50 0 NA FLXPR5850R

0274003600
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011911 |KEY CHAIN, RETRACTABLE: W/LEATHER POUCH FOR PUTTY 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19.09 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
KNIFE, KEY-BAK #9, (WEST COAST 0009-002,WAXIE#630030) No Bid 630030 N/A NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid WEST COAST N/A 0 NA
CORPORA
#0005-002
011910 [KEY CHAIN, RETRACTABLE: WITH BELT HOOK, KEY-BAK #5 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.19 10.45 15.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(WEST COAST 0005-011), (S12) No Bid 2622162 630010 KEYBACK NO BID 0 NO BID
No Bid ADVANTUS WEST COAST KEYBACK 0 NA
AVT75553 CORP  #0005-
011
002916 |LINER, SANISAC: KRAFT LINER; 500/CASE, WALL MOUNT 0.00 No Bid 21.90 26.18 31.54 0.00 18.58 19.10 25.50 18.56 35.68 24.99 24.26 2717 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(ROCHESTER MIDLAND #77) (HOSPECO KL-260) No Bid 1689-8280 HOS-KL260 LN260 239835 820765 HOS260 260SANBAG 533329 KL260 239835 3992-50
No Bid Hospeco KL260 | HOSPECO 260 HOSPECO HOSPECO HOS260 Hospeco KL260 HOSPECO HOSPECO HOSPECO, HOS| Hospeco 260
KL/260 #KL BRANDS KL260 KL
GROUP
25025088
019993 [LINER, TRASH CAN: 10 MICRON; 20-30 GAL, 30 X 37, HI-DENSITY, 18.67 No Bid 18.17 22.67 0.00 0.00 27.95 20.45 18.55 20.86 28.61 0.00 NO BID 16.95 15.50 24.82 21.24 21.24 $17.66
50 BAGS/RL, 10 ROLL/CS, 500/CS (TRIPLE S #12436) (ROLLPAK 248471 No Bid 2628-6688 S88-12436 814904 704525 N303710CR 303710C 791333 4431-37 UPC As per sample As per sample As per sample CASE
#RH-1037), (T10) Maintex - No Bid Republic Bag ROLL-PAK COASTWIDE HERITAGE N303710CR Victoria Bay PITT PLASTICS TY Plastics UPC303710N #019993A #019993B #019993B 7303710
N303710CR Can Liners CwW18197 #Z6037MNIRO1 303710C INC 791333 #303710N INT-3037-Med INT-3037-Reg INT-3037-Reg | REPUBLIC
N303710CR Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | 30X37-10M
ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack
078409 |LINER, TRASH CAN: 14 MICRON; 33 GAL, 33 X 40, HI-DENSITY, 25 16.13 No Bid 15.99 16.07 18.77 0.00 25.50 18.87 14.87 20.14 20.35 0.00 NO BID 14.85 13.25 17.32 15.82 13.84 $17.48
BAGS/RL, 10 ROLL/CS, 250/CS (TRIPLE S #12960) (ROLLPAK #RH- 2491162-S No Bid 2623-6582 S$SS-12442-RB L33 814906 704534 N334014CR HD334013R 791471 4431-40B UPC As per sample | As per sample | As per sample CASE
1440) (REPUBLIC N334014CR), (T10) Maintex - No Bid Republic Bag | REPUBLIC BAG COASTWIDE HERITAGE N334014CR Victoria Bay | PITT PLASTICS TY Plastics UPC334014N #078409A #078409B #078409C 7334016
XN334016CR Can Liners N334014CR Cw 18200 #26640VNIRO1 HD334013R INC 791471 #334014N INT-3340-X-Hvy INT-3340-H INT-3340-Med | REPUBLIC
N334014CR Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | 33X40-14M
ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack
019995 [LINER, TRASH CAN: 16 MICRON; 40-45 GAL, 40 X 48, HI-DENSITY, 2247 No Bid 23.40 23.40 46.78 0.00 36.20 21.27 22.25 18.25 24.52 0.00 NO BID 24.85 20.95 25.24 22.92 20.24 $23.98
25 BAGS/RL, 10 ROLL/CS, 250/CS (REPUBLIC N404816CR), (P70) 2491230 No Bid 2620-6983 S88-12447-RB L46H 814872 704460 N404816CR R4048N16 791237 4431-57 UPC As per sample As per sample As per sample CASE
Maintex - No Bid Republic Bag REPUBLIC COASTWIDE HERITAGE N404816CR Victoria Bay PITT PLASTICS TY Plastics UPC404814N #019995A #019995B #019995C 7404816
N404814CR Can Liners BAGS CW18204 #Z8048MNIR03 R4048N16 INC 791237 #404816N INT-4048-XH | INT-4048-X-Hvy INT-4048-H REPUBLIC
N404816CR N404816CR Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | 40X48-16M
ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack
078401 |LINER, TRASH CAN: 8 MICRON; 12-16 GAL, 24 X 33, HI-DENSITY, 22.85 No Bid 21.98 21.02 13.54 0.00 32.72 23.98 20.81 18.05 39.05 0.00 NO BID 18.99 0.00 21.32 14.74 14.74 22.26 CASE
50 BAGS/RL, 20 ROLLS/CS, 1000/CS, (TRIPLE S #12434) (ROLLPAK 249111 No Bid 2624-6684 S$8S-12434-RB L24 888979 704515 N243308CR R2433N8 790649 4431-33 As per sample | As per sample | As per sample 7243308
#RH-833) (REPUBLIC N243308CR), (T10) Maintex - No Bid Republic Bag REPUBLIC COASTWIDE HERITAGE N243308CR Victoria Bay PITT PLASTICS TY Plastics. # #078401A #078401B #078401B REPUBLIC
N243308CR Can Liners BAGS CW50709 #Z4833LNIRO1 R2433N8 INC 790649 24338N INT-2433-Reg INT-2433-L INT-2433-L 24X33-8M
N243308CR N243308CR Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop | Mfr:IBS/Pitt/Glop
ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack ak/Hvmopack
002900 [LUBRICANT: TRI-FLOW SUPERIOR, AEROSOL, 12 OZ CAN (TRI- 0.00 No Bid 5.49 0.00 11.07 0.00 5.82 0.00 10.95 0.00 0.00 4.25 NO BID 4.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FLOW TF20006), (S6) No Bid 1657-8763 WD40 AMR1033585 NO BID 490040 NO BID 0 5158 4385-58
No Bid Spartan Lubeall MISTY WDF490040EA 0 NA CHASE 5158 Chase 5158
6730-00 AMR1033585
013086 [MAT, FLOOR: CHARCOAL, 3' X 5' (MFG# CATALINA OLEFIN 1437M- 0.00 No Bid 34.99 48.77 49.50 0.00 50.15 0.00 59.00 0.00 26.47 43.99 NO BID 42.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
L35) No Bid 1636-8045 MA-100-3X5-13C M35C 2611332 NO BID 1437 NO BID 162684 55-546- 4501-05CHAR
No Bid Cactus Mat 1437 | M+A MATTING Catalinia CROWN MAT 1437 APACHE MILLS 3X5CHAR Cactus Mat. #
CWNET0035CH INC SSP- APACHE 55-546- 1437M-L35
CLI3660 3X5 CHAR
008952 |MOP HEAD, WEDGE MOP REFILL: MEDIUM (SUPREME #575800) 3.25 No Bid 3.79 0.00 5.05 0.00 6.35 2.58 3.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 2.88 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(PREMIER 51701) (MAINTEX 2617501), (S12) 2617501 No Bid 1614-8266 DMRR 24418788 650129 1491 AWE303ITW 0 2626-01
No Bid ABCO Mop & COASTWIDE | GOLDEN STAR BWK1491 Janico 3512 0 NA Next Step # 9600
Broom 25001 CW56768 #KL 650129
008953 |MOP HEAD, WET: BLEND, SMALL, GREEN, LOOPED 5" WIDE 0.00 No Bid 3.89 0.00 2.55 0.00 6.46 2.83 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 5.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
HEADBAND (PREMIER #12101) (RELIABLE V04335) No Bid 2647-1995 DMWR BWKS503GNEA 650031 N/A NO BID 0 2863-16
No Bid ABCO Mop & BOARDWALK PREMIER N/A 0 NA Premier Mop
Broom 303SWG BWKS503GNEA #2311416 #12101
008951 |MOP HEAD, WET: LARGE, BLUE, LOOPED, 5" WIDE HEADBAND, 0.00 No Bid 4.79 4.00 6.07 0.00 6.46 9.10 4.95 542 10.99 5.49 10.90 5.54 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
ALL COTTON BLENDS (ELIM SUPPLY EL0203BL), (S12) No Bid 1695-8530 $88-37037 WMBL BWKS503BLEA 650350 503BL 3042BLUE 6612663 CLM303LWB 24420787 2861-24
No Bid Golden Star | TRIPLE-S 37037 BOARDWALK PREMEIR 503BL Janico 3042 ESSENDANT ABCO COASTWIDE, Next Step #
ASB5LB BWKS503BLEA #11803 co CLM303LWB CW57750 97157
BWKMWTMB
008955 [MOP HEAD, WET: LARGE, BLUE/WHITE, LOOPED, FINISH WAX,1- 0.00 No Bid 6.89 6.65 7.62 0.00 0.00 10.57 7.96 3.51 121.81 5.99 NO BID 7.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1/4" WIDE HEADBAND, RAYON , NYLON, SYNTHETIC BLEND, No Bid 1622-8140 S$S88-37049 WMW 650390 503BLB LGSWINGER 415704 LM203LCSNB 2858-32
MFG# PREMIER 13503 No Bid ABCO Mop & | TRIPLE-S-37049 PREMIER 503BLB Tuway American| ESSENDANT ABCO Next Step #
Broom 203LCS #17103 BRK-FM20-5 | CO BWK542CT | LM203LCSNB 97313
002995 |MOP WRINGER BUCKET COMBO: 35 QT POLYPROLENE BUCKET, 0.00 No Bid 74.90 100.00 94.44 0.00 51.60 75.74 69.00 193.11 72.49 77.98 109.79 69.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3" CASTERS, YELLOW, DOWN PRESS WRINGER (NOT SIDE No Bid 1683-8664 DMI-8035DP MB2637 BWK2635COMB 660252 DOWNP 7577RM 4358879 T01009DPW 24366885* 2922-24YEL
PRESS), HEAVY DUTY (ABCO T01009DPW) No Bid Delamo 8035-DP DELAMO OYEL RUBBERMAID DOWNP Rubbermaid ALPINE ABCO RUBBERMAID, CDL Combo
8035DP BOARDWALK | #FG758088YEL FG757788YEL INDUSTRIES T01009DPW FG758088YEL | Downpress 35qt
BWK2635COMB 462 Yellow
OYEL
020959 [PAPER TOWEL: 7.5"X1150"/RL, WHITE, FITS DISPENSER KC 34346 0.00 No Bid No Bid 44.82 76.60 0.00 102.44 72.78 95.00 73.06 78.42 0.00 86.39 62.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SVUSD #020960, 6RL/CS (WAXIE 850107, MFG# KIMBERLY-CLARK No Bid S$S88-76310 P25702 850893 25702 25702 189974 25702 BT1150-17
25702), (P45) No Bid TRIPLE-S 76310 KCC25703 KIMBERLY- 25702 Kimberly Clark | SP RICHARDS SCOTT, 25702 | APPLE PAPER
CLARK #25702 25702 KCC25702 BT1150-17
020961 |PAPER TOWEL: MOD SLIM ROLL, 580/RL, WHITE, FITS MOD 0.00 No Bid No Bid 34.15 42.55 0.00 54.12 39.36 49.00 40.09 57.59 0.00 48.53 38.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SLIMROLL DISPENSER SVUSD #020962, 6RL/CS (WAXIE 850661, No Bid S$88-76307 P47035 850661 12388 12388 667473 12388Q BT580-17
MFG# KIMBERLY-CLARK 12388) No Bid TRIPLE-S 76307 KCC12388 KIMBERLY- 12388 Kimberly Clark KIMBERLY SCOTT, 12388 | APPLE PAPER
CLARK #12388 12388 CLARK BT580-17
PROFESSIONAL
KCC12388
016945 |PLUNGER, PLUMBER'S: FORCE CUP, FLAT BOTTOM, HEAVY 0.00 No Bid 3.99 4.04 4.16 0.00 3.28 5.03 4.95 3.83 5.65 5.79 NO BID 6.92 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
DUTY, 6 IN. (BOARDWAL BWK09201) No Bid 1694-8441 DMI-8891 BWK09201EA 2030931 09201EA 520PLUNG 6893055 280174 1996-01
No Bid Tolco 280174 DELAMO 8891 BOARDWALK IMPACT BWK09201EA Janico 1065 ESSENDANT | TOLOC 280174 NEXT STEP
BWK09201 #9200W CO_IMP9201 4740
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002918 |PONCHO: VINYL, RED OR YELLOW, 52" X 80", 10 MIL THICKNESS 0.00 No Bid 3.89 0.00 0.00 0.00 26.88 0.00 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 13.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(PIONEER #DSPS 2804) No Bid 1632-9409 1059588 NO BID N/A NO BID 0 HD 49107/0SRC
No Bid Elite Protective NEESE 35 UNIV N/A 0 NA HD 49107/0SRC
Yellow YP810 Y
016984 [(PUMP & SPRAY BOTTLE: 560Z. (FLOMASTER, MODEL #1998TL, 0.00 No Bid 16.95 0.00 17.58 0.00 48.36 29.66 0.96 0.00 0.00 64.95 NO BID 12.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
LOWES 36943) No Bid A96893 SSP 2406342 890140 32 NO BID 0 6500 HDX #56HDX
No Bid HydroForce IMPACT IMPACT BWKO00032 0 NA HOSPECO 6500 HDX. #56HDX
AS01 IMP6500 #7501PW
011960 [PUTTY KNIFE: 1 1/4" BLADE; STIFF BLADE (HYDE #02050) (RED 0.00 No Bid 1.89 0.00 1.77 0.00 1.52 3.25 2.95 1.09 13.93 1.99 4.43 1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
DEVIL #4201) No Bid 1692-8448 SP180 GNS15PKS 290078 15PKS 1.50PUTKN 911794 280244 15PKS 3046-01
No Bid Hyde 2140 GREAT NECK IMPACT GNS15PKS Tolco ORS NASCO | TOLCO 280244 | GREAT NECK, Next Step #
GNS15PKS #T0005-00 1.50PUTKN INC 630-4101 GNS15PKS 93126-12
018910 [RAGS, WIPING: TURKISH, ALL COTTON, NOT SHREDDED, 0.00 No Bid 28.99 27.75 212 0.00 0.00 29.52 N/A 43.94 0.00 0.00 NO BID 19.65 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
HEMMED SECONDS, 10 LB BOX,10# (MFG: AA) No Bid 1620-8086 AA-A04810 770010 N/A T58220 0 FNWTTD10N.
No Bid Wiper Central AA WIPERS WIPER N/A Peerless Material 0 NA Wiiper Central
FNWBT10N CENTREAL USA T58220 FNWTTD10N.
#FSW25N
002964 |RAZOR BLADE: SINGLE-EDGED, REPLACEMENT FOR WINDOW 0.00 No Bid 5.95 0.00 6.49 0.00 4.34 16.85 N/A 0.00 19.67 9.99 22.68 12.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SCRAPER, .009 GAUGE, CARBON STEEL,100/BOX No Bid 1684-6990 WTB 594796 290980 N/A NO BID 290670 280113 6995370RS 3048-10
No Bid Hydro-Force GARVEY 091461 IMPACT N/A ART SUPPLY | TOLCO 280113 |RED DEVIL, 630-| NEXT STEP
#3410B NETWORK 3272 #93114
43912
018913 [RECEPTACLE, SANITARY: SANISAC, WALL TYPE (ROCHESTER 0.00 No Bid 23.98 28.70 39.42 0.00 17.49 38.40 25.50 18.89 33.02 27.99 18.44 19.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MIDLAND #RMC25125200) (HOSPECO 250-201W), (S6) No Bid 1681-8243 HOS-250201W TP270 239836 820705 HOS260 1100 4903272 250-201W HOS250201W 3990-19
No Bid Hospeco 250- HOSPECO HOSPECO 250- BOBRICK HOS260 Janico 1100 SP RICHARDS | HOSPECO 250- | HOSPECO, 250-| Impact # 1102
201W. 201W 201N #270 IMP1102 201W 201W
200217 [SAFETY GLASSES: EYEGLASS PROTECTOR, CLEAR LENS (MGF 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 1.21 0.00 0.00 1.40 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 1.64 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
#HDX 1004307683, VS-265) No Bid AIPG 791361 N/A NO BID 0 4839-03
No Bid HOSPECO N/A 0 NA MCR
#7340 CRWSS110
002963 [SCRAPER, WINDOW: FOR SINGLE EDGED RAZOR BLADE (WAXIE 0.00 No Bid 225 0.00 1.49 0.00 242 1.53 N/A 2.89 4.39 2.94 6.30 1.69 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
290970, MFG#W3410) No Bid 1674-8651 SCs 637719 290970 N/A SR50 291984 280114 7005440RS 3047-01
No Bid Ettore 4286 UNGER SR500 IMPACT N/A Unger SR50 SP RICHARDS | TOLCO 280114 |RED DEVIL, 630- Next Step
#W3410 UNGSRS50 3222 #93112  Maxi
Rough
012146 |SOAP, HAND: ANTIMICROBIAL, 1250 ML (MFG# ECOLAB 0.00 8.10 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.93 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 9.14 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
#6101420), (S4) 6101420 546101420 N/A NO BID 0 1081-06NV
Ecolab Advanced ECOLAB N/A 0 NA TCHEM 1081.
Antibacterial #6101420 "Cartridge" 1000
Clean & Smooth ml.  Hand
(4-1250mL) Foam Soap
Antimicrobial
019954 [SOAP, HAND: REFRESH AZURE FOAM SOAP; LITRE, GREEN TIP 0.00 No Bid 7.68 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.95 7.70 0.00 0.00 NO BID 8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(SC JOHNSON AZU1LG), (S6,P480) *NO SUBSTITUTIONS* No Bid 1632-8268 NO BID SJINAZU1L AZU1ILG 0 1042-06NV
No Bid SC Johnson/DEB SJINAZU1L SCJ AZU1ILG 0 NA TCHEM 1042.
AZU1L Cartridge. 6
Refills/ 1000
ml/Case. Hand
Foam Soap Plum
019960 |SPONGE: ALL PURPOSE; 6 X 3.5 X 1-1/2 CELLULOSE (HYDRA 0.00 No Bid 1.39 0.00 1.23 0.00 0.78 0.00 1.29 1.00 3.32 1.39 NO BID 1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
W3PKA C) (BOARDWALK BWKCS2), (S24) No Bid 1620-8769 HP74 BWKCS2 NO BID CS1A BWKCS2 542196 W3PKA BWKCS2
No Bid Americo 6AU BOARDWALK BWKCS1A BOARDWALK | 3M CO 7288- [HYDRA W3PKA BWKCS2
BWKCS2 BWKCS2 MCS-9 NEW #661
016925 [SPONGES, CLEANING: HAND, LIGHT DUTY SCRUBBING SPONGE, 0.00 No Bid 19.00 0.80 1.25 0.00 24.60 12.20 14.95 14.81 41.45 19.98 NO BID 28.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
20/BOX (KLEENLINE #350464) No Bid 2630-1337 $88-75122 HP63 350464 BWK174 VB63LSS 1448902 SC400-20 2501-01
No Bid Americo 551011 | TRIPLE-S 75122 3M 7010029004 3M BWK174 Victoria Bay 3MCO 63 ACS SC400-20 ACS #63-614
#48011181936 VB63LSS Light Duty
White/ &
019972 |SPRAYER, BOTTLE (ONLY): 1 QUART PLASTIC (TOLCO 120125), 0.00 No Bid 0.95 0.88 0.87 225 1.01 0.83 0.85 0.68 14.79 0.72 1.44 0.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(S84) No Bid 1672-7606 S§88-5032WG SB32 91245 796495 890050 9229 120125 3958450 5032WG UNS32 2386-32
No Bid Tolco 120125 | TOLCO 120125 NORTH 5032WG24 IMPACT BWK09229 Tolco 120125 ESSENDANT HOSPECO IMPACT, Tolco
AMERICAN #890050 co 5032WG 5032WG24
CORP, 952904 IMP5032WGDZU
N
019973 [SPRAYER, TRIGGER SPRAYER ONLY: FOR 1 QUART HAND 0.00 No Bid 0.90 1.00 0.68 225 0.58 0.55 0.85 0.56 1.89 0.74 1.33 0.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SPRAYER (TOLCO 110246), (S200) No Bid 1689-8239 TOL-110502 SH 91246 BWKO09229 890040 9229 110508 485597 4902 UNS9229 2370-09
No Bid Tolco 110246 | TOLCO 110502 NORTH BOARDWALK IMPACT BWKO09229 Tolco 110508 CCP NEWCO |HOSPECO 4902 [IMPACT, 490624 Tolco
AMERICAN BWKO09229 #5902W LLC 902RW7EA
CORP. 265065
019958 |SQUEEGEE HANDLE: FOR 16" SQUEEGEE CHANNEL, BRASS 0.00 No Bid 6.95 0.00 8.73 0.00 16.21 597 14.95 0.00 0.00 15.99 NO BID 17.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(MFG: UNGER GS000) No Bid 1636-8019 SQP16 812898 290120 GS00 NO BID 0 GS00 2991-01
No Bid Ettore 1324 UNGER ETTORE UNGGS00 0 NA UNGER GS000 Unger UNGGS00
UNGPR400 #1324
019989 |SQUEEGEE, CHANNEL AND RUBBER ONLY: 16", WINDOW, 0.00 No Bid 8.99 0.00 9.22 0.00 9.98 7.36 11.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 11.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
WITHOUT HANDLE (MFG: ETTORE #1140) No Bid 2644-0091 SQ16Ch UNGPRO0O 290060 NE45 NO BID 0 2990-16
No Bid Ettore 1140 UNGER ETTORE UNGNE45 0 NA Unger
UNGPRO0O #1140 Golden Channel
& Rubber 16"
019990 [SQUEEGEE, RUBBER BLADE ONLY: WINDOW, BLADE, 16", REFILL 0.00 No Bid 2.89 0.00 247 0.00 31.33 2.87 8.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 12.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
ONLY (MFG# ETTORE 290430) No Bid 1625-8840 SQ16R UNGRT40 NE45C NO BID 0 2992-16
No Bid Ettore 1422 UNGER ETTORE #1422 UNGNE45C 0 NA Unger.
UNGRT40 UNGNE40
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028170 |TISSUE, FACIAL: 100 COUNT, 2-PLY, 7.5" x 8", (LIFE GUARD 4800), 0.53 No Bid 0.54 0.67 24.38 1.34 13.98 17.96 0.55 0.47 25.23 0.94 1.85 0.71 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $.55 BOX
(S30) 320000 No Bid 2663-1770 SPC-11513 P1516 1044026 GEN6501 855607 4800 VBFACIAL 411851 BWK6500B 378137* 3801-05 #4800
Maintex - 320000 No Bid Mosaic Facial SOLARIS Livi HEALTH GIANT, [ GEN GEN6501 TEH TUNG 4800 Victoria Bay CASCADES BOARDWALK KLEENEX, CDL LIFEGUARD
Tissue PAPER 11513 FTR030 CORP VBFACIAL TISSUE GROUP| BWK6500B KC21400 4800
#855607 SALES 4624
020941 [TOILET PAPER: CORELESS JRT, SCOTT, 2 PLY, 9" DIAM, 3-7/8" 0.00 No Bid 0.00 35.81 55.44 0.00 64.73 51.80 39.95 52.88 57.22 0.00 66.00 38.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $40.25 PER
WIDE, 1150'/RL, FITS DUAL ROLL DISPENSER SVUSD #020942 OR No Bid S$S8S-76306 P7006 503405 851227 7006SUB 7006KC 586782 07006Q 3862-29 CASE
SINGLE ROLL DISPENSER SVUSD #020944, CASE OF 12 (MFG# No Bid TRIPLE-S 76306 KCCO07006 KIMBERLY- 7006SUB Kimberly Clark KIMBERLY SCOTT, 07006 | APPLE PAPER REPCJRT11
KIMBERLY-CLARK 07006), (P36) CLARK #07006 07006 CLARK JT1150-12 JRT 50
PROFESSIONAL ROYALTY
07006 REPCJRT11
50
020946 |TOILET PAPER: CORELESS, STANDARD, SCOTT; SURPASS, 0.00 No Bid 0.00 52.97 53.59 0.00 60.80 49.98 28.95 50.90 58.67 0.00 NO BID 36.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $31.80 PER
WHITE, 4"X3.94", 1000SHT/RL, 5" DIAM, STANDARD HOUSEHOLD No Bid S88-76304 P4007 812375 851202 SMCRSUB 4007 397624 3862-33 CASE
ROLL FOR ADA BATHROOMS, CASE OF 36 (MFG# KIMBERLY No Bid TRIPLE-S 7630- KCC04007 SCOTT #04007 SMCRSUB Kimberly Clark KIMBERLY APPLE PAPER 4607
CLARK 04007) 4 04007 CLARK 3862-33. Mini LAVENDAR
PROFESSIONAL Core 4607
KCC04007
004100 |TOILET SEAT COVER: 5,000/CASE; 250/PKG, 20PKG/CS 22.99 No Bid 26.89 32.64 28.69 0.00 27.87 30.39 26.50 23.95 43.76 36.89 56.39 33.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $29.50 PER
(SANIGUARD #203) (ROYALTY PREMIER) (LIFE GUARD 4500), 370000 No Bid 1633-9501 RD-TSC5000V PSC BWKK5000B 851531 4500 SHIELD 747336 DS5000 72217 3928-05 CASE
(P40) Maintex - 370000 No Bid Empire/Aramsco | ROCHESTER BOARDWALK HOSPECO 4500 Victoria Bay HOSPECO HOSPECO COASTWIDE, Soft Petal TPSC
513500 MIDLAND BWKK5000B #WAXIE-5000 SHIELD BRANDS DS5000 072217 Premium ROYALTY
GROUP OR
25177673 LIFEGUARD
4500
003914 | TRASH CAN: PLASTIC, 20 GAL, WITH LID, GRAY (RUBBERMAID 0.00 No Bid 27.45 0.00 21.04 0.00 26.20 34.43 33.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 CAN: $38.25 32.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BRUTE #2620 CAN & #2619 LID ONLY) (IMPACT GC200103 CAN & No Bid 2620-3772 TC20 IMPGC200103 & | 730510-Can 263200GR NO BID 0 LID: $19.99 |4352-20GRY. &
GL200203 LID) No Bid Impact Products IMPGC200203 730540-Lid RCP262000GR 0 NA CAN: 2620GRA | 4354-20 GRY
Receptacle IMPGC200103 & | RUBBERMAID LID: 962285 NEXT STEP.
200103, Lid IMPGC200204 | #FG262000GRA RUBBERMAID: Bronco #
200203 Y CAN: 84102023.
#FG261960GRA FG262000GRAY Bronco. #
Y LID: 34102123
FG261960GRAY
003912 | TRASH CAN: PLASTIC, 32 GAL, ROUND, NO LID, GRAY 0.00 No Bid 28.98 30.35 30.35 0.00 35.31 26.12 27.50 29.31 25.89 0.00 90.49 34.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(CONTINENTAL- HUSKEE #3200 GRAY) (IMPACT GC320103), (S8) No Bid 75382 CL-84103223 TC32 432463 730610 32GLW 84103223 6612164 2632GY 4353-32GRY
No Bid Impact Products CARLISLE RUBBERMAID | RUBBERMAID | BWK32GLWRG CFS Brands SUNCAST RUBBERMAID, BRONCO
320103 84103223 RCPFG263200G | #FG263200GRA 84103223 COMMERCIAL FG263200GRAY 84103214
RAY Y TCU32
200243 [URINAL SCREEN: ANTI SPLASH, ROUND, 60 DAY DEODORIZER- 0.00 No Bid 4.98 3.82 1.36 0.00 233 3.79 4.95 0.00 19.59 4.73 22.06 2.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
COTTON BLOSSOM, BLUE (WAXIE KLEENLINE TIDAL WAVE No Bid 2653-5245 S$S88-67013 BDUSBB BET987D700 166021 TWDSCB NO BID 7497150 TWDSCB 2801455 1331-11
166021), (S36) No Bid Fresh Tidal TRIPLE-S 67013 BETCO FRESH FRSTWDSCB HOSPECO TIDAL WAVE FRESH CDL3D No
Wave Cotton BET987D700 PRODUCTS AWSFUS237-BX DWDSCB PRODUCTS, [Splasjh. Cotton
Blossom TWDS- #TWDS-P- 2801455 Blossom
F-0061036M-06 0061036M-06-
AAV45-00
020958 [URINAL SCREEN: BLUE, MISC. #25164787-10005, MFG# 0.00 No Bid 1.10 1.43 0.95 0.00 0.88 0.82 1.89 0.57 18.33 1.35 NO BID 1.32 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CONTINENTAL CON-164-4, (S72) No Bid 1645-7350 S$8S8-67119 BDUS BWK1002 160201 3905 FRS12DSCF 1629559 03904 1333-01
No Bid Empire/Aramsco | TRIPLE-S 67119 BOARDWALK IMPACT HOS03904 Fresh Products ESSENDANT HOSPECO CDL Urinal Blue
522775 BWK1002 #Q1402N FRS12DSCF CO _HOS03904 03901
200120 |VACUUM BAG FOR CLEANMAX ZOOM: PACK OF 6 (MFG# CLH-6) 0.00 No Bid 17.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.82 24.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
No Bid 2607-2280 588414 CLH-6 NO BID 0
No Bid CleanMax Zoom Tacony CLH-6 0 NA
90039 #CLH-6
002913 [VACUUM BAG: ADVANCE VACUUM CLEANER BAGS WITH 0.00 No Bid 19.89 0.00 0.00 0.00 8.83 19.69 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
ADHESIVE, FOR ADVANCE BACKPACK VAC, 10 PER PACKAGE No Bid A74160 286475 575514 N/A NO BID 0
(#1472097510-10) (JAN 87710) No Bid Nilfisk Advance APCJAN PTMV2| NILFISK 147 N/A 0 NA
1471097510 1097 510
002919 [VACUUM BAG: FOR "PRO CLEAN" VACUUM, INTERCEPT MICRO 0.00 No Bid 19.49 0.00 8.78 0.00 0.00 13.16 14.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FILTERS, WHITE, 10/PKG (PROTEAM 104544) (WAXIE 573225), No Bid 1672-8432 PT107666 573225 NO BID 0
(S20) No Bid ProTeam 104544 PROTEAM 0 NA
#104544
002921 [VACUUM BAG: FOR "SUPER COACH" BACK PACK; INTERCEPT 0.00 No Bid 11.98 0.00 0.00 0.00 11.00 10.97 14.55 15.18 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MICRO FILTERS, WHITE,10/PKG (PRO TEAM INC #100331) No Bid 40491 812348 573130 100331 0
No Bid ProTeam 100331 PROTEAM PROTEAM Proteam 100331 0 NA
100331 #100331
002923 |VACUUM BAG: FOR CORDLESS VAC PACK, 10 PER PACK 0.00 No Bid 10.41 7.84 0.00 0.00 9.09 9.07 14.55 15.18 0.00 0.00 10.22 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(PROTEAM BAG #107314) No Bid 1630-1780 JAN-PTSCP6 553959 573138 107314 0 553959PTM
No Bid ProTeam 107314 JANITIZE PROTEAM ProTeam 10734 Proteam 107314 0 NA PROTEAM,
107314 107314
200225 |VACUUM BAG: FOR PROTEAM CORDLESS UPRIGHT, PACK OF 10 0.00 No Bid 16.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 18.26 14.25 14.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(PROTEAM FREE FLEX 107502), (S20) No Bid 2654-3482 24392223 588577 NO BID 0
No Bid Proteam 107502 PROTEAM PROTEAM 0 NA
107502 #107502
002915 [VACUUM BAG: FOR WINDSOR "VAC-PAC" VP10, VACUUM BACK 0.00 No Bid 12.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 8.83 38.63 12.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
STYLE, PAPER, WHITE, 10/PKG (WINDSOR #WI-68005) (APC JAN- No Bid 1682-0755 286475 575677 NO BID 0
PTMV-2) No Bid APC JAN-14155 APCJAN PTMV2 KARCHER 0 NA
#8.619-885.0
002911 [VACUUM BAG: FOR WINDSOR "VAC-PAC" VP6, VACUUM BACK 0.00 No Bid 12.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.88 37.21 14.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
STYLE, PAPER, WHITE, 10/PKG (WINDSOR #WI-68075) (JAN- No Bid 1605-2274 161755 575671 NO BID 0
WIVP6-2), (S10) No Bid APC JAN-WIVP6 GREEN KLEAN KARCHER 0 NA
GKVP6P #8.619-891.0
002917 [VACUUM BAG: FOR WINDSOR VERSAMATIC UPRIGHT VACUUM, 0.00 No Bid 17.25 0.00 0.00 0.00 9.45 13.89 14.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
PAPER, FOLDED, 5" X 20", 10/PKG (WIN2003), (S10) No Bid 2658-3183 514006 574657 NO BID 0
No Bid Windsor 9.840- GREEN KLEAN KARCHER# 0 NA
641.0 2003P 9.840-641.0
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002914 |VACUUM BAG: VACUUM BAGS WITH TWO EXHAUST FILTERS, 0.00 No Bid 16.98 0.00 10.07 0.00 0.00 8.89 14.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
FOR ADVANCE SPECTRUM UPRIGHT VACUUM, 10 PER PACKAGE No Bid 1620-7250 PT107314 574355 NO BID 0
(#1471058500-10) (#002914), (S10) No Bid Nilfisk Advance GREEN KLEAN 0 NA
1471058500 # GK-CMASTR
002912 |VACUUM EXHAUST FILTER: FOR ADVANCE BACKPAC VAC 0.00 No Bid 13.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.94 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(1471089500-3) (ADVANCE #575514) No Bid AB8789 575514 NO BID 0
No Bid Nilfisk Advance NILFISK 0 NA
1471089500 #1471097510
002920 |WASTE BASKET: PLASTIC, 28 QT; 14-3/8 X 10-1/4 X 15" TALL, 0.00 No Bid 6.49 7.54 10.79 0.00 6.28 6.80 8.95 7.57 119.29 6.79 8.59 8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BEIGE (CONTINENTAL #8756BEE), (S12) No Bid 1691-8548 DMI-88288G TCR28B RCP295600BG 730110 295600 2956BLK 9815274 FG2956BEI 29560 4338-28BLK
No Bid Continentnal DELAMO RUBBERMAID | RUBBERMAID | RCP295600BK Rubbermaid SP RICHARDS | RUBBERMAID | COASTWIDE, NEXT STEP
2818-BEI 88288G RCPFG295600B | #FG295600BEIG FG295600BLA | RCP295600BGC| FG2956BEI CCW56430 6810. 28 qt
G T
200149 [WAX, FLOOR: 5-GAL PAIL (SPARTAN I-SHINE #405505) 77.50 No Bid 84.99 94.97 0.00 0.00 0.00 77.45 0.00 78.33 0.00 0.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
*SEASONAL* *NO SUBSTITUTION* 1C8205 No Bid 1663-8759 93545505 4055/5 0 NO BID
Champion No Bid Spartan 4055-05 Spartan #545505 Spartan 405505 0 NA
Chemical - 82
002907 |WIPES, CLEANING: ALL PURPOSE; *NO TRAINING REQUIRED*, 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 24.20 9.30 6.24 0.00 4.66 3.16 6.26 71.98 NO BID 5.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
MFG# SANI NICA580FW, CLOROX 30380, (S12) No Bid WICW85 49188 NICQ55172 NO BID 580FW A580FW 8970770 NICA580FW NICA580FW
No Bid CLOROX, HCH SANPRO 580FW CFS Brands |CLOROX SALES| SANIHANDS SANI
15949 NICQ55172 37665 COMPANY NICA580FW NICA580FW
10044600324866
002906 |WIPES, DISINFECTANT: *TRAINING REQUIRED*, 75 COUNT, 7" X 0.00 No Bid 4.95 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.28 8.39 N/A 3.92 3.58 5.35 NO BID 4.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8" (BOARDWALK 454W75), (S6) No Bid 2684-0557 BWK455W75 388810 N/A BWK454W75 237154 BWK454W75 BWK455W75
No Bid Boardwalk Fresh BOARDWALK | PROGRESSIVE N/A Boardwalk CASCADES BOARDWALK BOARDWALK
Scent 454W75 BWK455W75 PRODUCT BWK454W75 [TISSUE GROUP| BWK454W75 454W75
#33803 SALES 69065
200203 |WIPES: MULTI-PURPOSE, ALCOHOL 75%; “TRAINING REQUIRED*, 0.00 No Bid 255 0.00 3.05 0.00 3.33 18.82 0.00 9.16 12.99 0.00 NO BID 1.87 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
50 COUNT, 6 X 8 (MFG# GERMISEPT G01440), (S24) No Bid 2609-0340 WIAPW BWK45W753PK 170296 G0J0903106 9208940 1203-12
No Bid Germisept BOARDWALK Suretec 580 Gojo 9031-06 | SP RICHARDS KLENLII 1203-
G01440 BWK45W753PK Innovation GOJ903106 12. Sweetcare
#80001
002901 [WRENCH KEY, FOR WATER VALVE: 4-WAY, SILCOCK KEY 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 N/A 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID 11.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
(PLUMBMASTER #36332) No Bid NO BID N/A NO BID 0 X001-AU
No Bid N/A 0 NA HANPEX. # X001/

AU




