Westport Public Schools

Memo

To: Elio l.ongo

From: Natalie Carrignan »/(
cc: Mary Youngling AWM é% l -
: 74
Date: TM7125 /) 4

Re: Partial award of bid #26-004-BOE - Laptops

Below are the resuilts of the laptop portion of bid #26-004-BOE for the purchase of faptops, desktops, and
Chromebooks, We announced during the bid process that we were looking at three different models; a
Dell, a Lenovo, and an HP model. We also announced that we would only pick one of the models in the
end. | recommend awarding the bid of the Lenovo model to Y&S Technolagies. They were the lowest,
respansive bidder. Please contact me with any questions.

Accumotors LLC S 759,000.00 NoBid{ S 690,000.00
Bit Direct S 228,148.50 S 219,624.70 | 5 358,990.90
Brightcentra No Bid $ 241,730.00 No 8id
COW-G No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concourse Teck No Bid S 257,045.70 No Bid
Dell Incamplete bid package

Derrade Express 3 287,53450 | $ 24685670 | $ 317,869.20
Goldens LLC 5 304,083.00 3 259,971.30 | § 335,116.90
Gov Tech Specialists/CDW-G S 366,850.00 NoBid | S 379,270.00
HP! International- Government

Goads Ink No Bid NoBid | § 226,674.20
HyperTech USA Na Bid NoBid | § 248,160,80
Malor & Co, $ 189,007.10 Withdrew Pricing { $ 178,758.30
Milliard Tek S 270,877.90 S 271,393,104 § 245,124.80
Princeton IT Services No Bid $ 232,969.30 No 8Bid
Riverside Technologies No Bid NoBid| S 230,000.00
Southern Computer Warehouse | $ 264,435.60 NoBid | S 318,485.60
Thatford Management No Bid NoBid | § 207,000.00
Trafera LLC No Bid s 417,220.00 No Bid
Virtucom No Bid 5 178,250.00 | 5 227,470.00
WorthAveGroup/The Repair

Depot LLC S 270,250.00 No Bid No Bid
Y&S Tech No Bid $ 175,623,401 S 206,995.40
Zones No Bid S 246,518.60 No Bid




Westport Public Schools

Memo

To: Elio Longo
From: Natalie Carrignan WJ/

i afifzs
cc: Mary Youngling

Date: 7/15/2025

Re: Partial award of bid #26-004-BOE - Deskiops

Below are the results of the desktop portion of bid #26-004-BOE for the purchase of laptops,
desktops, and Chromebooks. | recommend awarding the bid to Y&S Technologies. They were
the lowest, responsive bidder for the desktops. Please contact me with any questions.

Accumotors LLC S 150,000.00
Bit Direct S 59,337.75
Brightcentra S 51,825.00
CDW-G No Bid
Concourse Teck S 52,653.00
Dell Incomplete Bid Package
Derrade Express S 57,983.25
Golden5 LLC $ 57,274.50
Gov Tech Specialists/COW-G S 61,875.00
HPI Internation- Government Goods Ink Na Bid
HyperTech USA No Bid
Malor & Co. S 58,290.75
Miiliard Tek $ 53,711.25
Princeton IT Services S 56,256.00
Riverside Technologies S 55,500.00
Southern Computer Warehouse \ S 52,583.25
Thatford Management S 45,150.00
Trafera LLC S 44,325.00
Virtucom S 44,250.00
WorthAveGroup/The Repair Depot LLC S 52,125.00
Y&S Tech § 38,098.50
Zaones S 52,701.75
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