
KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

BUS FLUIDS 2025-2026

COMMODITY CODE ITEM BRAND  COST UOM BRAND  COST UOM BRAND  COST UOM BRAND  COST UOM BRAND  COST UOM BRAND  COST UOM

$8.79 GALLON  $        9.08 GALLON  $      11.94 GALLON GALLON  $        9.00 GALLON  $        9.23 GALLON

 $ 1,873.14 55-GALLON  $ 1,720.00 DRUM

GALLON  $      23.50 GALLON  $      34.57 GALLON GALLON  $      31.27 GALLON  $      29.85 GALLON

QUART QUART  $        5.36 QUART QUART QUART  $        7.03 QUART

$399.99 55 GALLON  $    350.00 55 GALLON  $    526.43 55 GALLON NO BID 55 GALLON 55 GALLON  $    305.93 55 GALLON

120 POUND  $    250.00 120 POUND  $ 1,144.00 120 POUND 120 POUND  $    875.00 120 POUND  $    309.00 120 POUND

400 POUND 400 POUND 400 POUND 400 POUND 400 POUND  $ 2,440.75 400 POUND

DRUM

55 GALLON 55 GALLON  $    280.16 55 GALLON 55 GALLON  $    186.04 55 GALLON  $    102.43 55 GALLON

 $ 1,385.00 TOTE

 $        1.79 GALLON GALLON  $        3.33 GALLON  $        2.40 GALLON  $        4.20 GALLON  $        1.64 GALLON

STORE 

DISCOUNT: 0% 5% 20% 0% 0% 0%

Recommendation:

CHEVRON 

DELOGEAR 

EP-5 

85W140

SHELL 

GADUS S3 V 

220 C3 

DURAFLOW 

WWF 

WINTER-20

BLUE SKY 

DEF

NO BID 

PERFORMA

NCE PLUS 

NO BID

VALOR OIL

DURAFLOW 

15W40

PETRO 

CANADA 

DURADRIVE 

HD SYN 668

HAVOLINE 

POWER 

STEERING 

DURAFLOW 

HD AF 

PRECHRG 

PURPLE 

50/50

MANSFIELD 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

PERFORMA

NCE PLUS 

SAFETY-CLEAN SYSTEMS-CLEAN 

HARBOR

PERFORMA

NCE PLUS 

PERFORMA

NCE PLUS 

NO BID

Award the Bus Fluids Bid as indicated in the YELLOW highlighted sections. 

FLU-10060
Gear Oil – 85W-

140
NO BID 

FLU-10070 Chassis Grease

NO BID 

FLU-10100
Diesel Exhaust 

Fluid MUSKET

FLU-10085

Windshield 

Washer Solvent 

Pre-mix
NO BID 

NO BID

NO BID

CLARKE POWER SERVICES

PHIILIPS 

ALLISON

VALVOLINE

FLU-10030
Power Steering 

Fluid
NO BID 

APOLLO OIL

FLU-10000
Engine Oil – 15W-

40 SHELL

FLU-10015

Automatic 

Transmission Fluid 

Allison TES-668

NO BID

BILLS BATTERY CO. 

CASTROL 

CRBCK4

CASTROL 

TRANSYND618

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CASTROL 

RADICOOL SF-0

FLU-10110

Antifreeze – Fully 

Formulated Glycol 

Base Engine 

Coolant – PURPLE 

ONLY
SHELL 

NO BID

BLUE LEAF 

CASTROL AP 

GEAR250.00

NO BID

VALVOLINE

VALVOLINE

NO BID

DETROIT

FLEET PRIDE
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