
To: Darin Crawford

Assistant Superintendent for Support Services

From: James Briscoe

Director of Procurement Services

Date:

Re: Automotive Parts and Labor

Annual Contract #25-07-5600R-RFP

a 
No Award

Recommendation:

Estimated Expenditure:

Contract Term: 

Renewal:

Award selected vendors per line item as listed at the minimum discount and/or 
price noted.

$1,750,000.00

July 1, 2025 -  June 30, 2026

4 Years

td

May 14, 2025

The following proposals were received and opened at 10:00 a.m., Wednesday, April 23, 2025, as advertised and 

specified in documents concerning Annual Contract #25-07-5600R-RFP Automotive Parts and Labor. The proposals 

received and the final evaluation summary are located on pages 2-6.

APPROVED 06/23/2025
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Line 1

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 2

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Line 3

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $432.40

Line 4

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $557.40

Line 5

Supplier QTY UOM Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $55.00

Line 6

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Mac Haik Ford LTD 1 Percentage Discount 30.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 7

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $125.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Line 8

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $275.00

Line 9

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $125.00

Line 10

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 50.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

List percent of discount for Blue Bird Corporation OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for Blue Bird, if labor is offered.

List price for module flashing at Contractor's site.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at CFISD site.

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for Ford Motor OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for Ford Motor Company, if labor is offered.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at Contractor's site.

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for International Bus OEM Parts.
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Line 11

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Hour $200.00

Line 12

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $350.00

Line 13

Supplier QTY UOM Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $1.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $55.00

Line 14

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 50.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 15

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Hour $200.00

Line 16

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $350.00

Line 17

Supplier QTY UOM Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $1.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $55.00

Line 18

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 19

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Hour No Bid
a

Line 20

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

Line 21

Supplier QTY UOM Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $55.00

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for International Truck OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for International Truck, if labor is offered.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at Contractor's site.

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for Thomas Bus OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for Thomas Bus, if labor is offered.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at Contractor's site.

Additional charges.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at Contractor's site.

List hourly shop rate for International Bus, if labor is offered.
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Line 22

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 23

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $125.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 Hour $185.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Hour $209.88

Line 24

Supplier QTY UOM Price

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $185.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $209.88

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $275.00

Line 25

Supplier QTY UOM Price

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $185.00

Line 26

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $20.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $69.95

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $125.00

Line 27

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 28

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $145.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Hour $229.88

Line 29

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $190.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $229.88

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $295.00

a Line 30

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA No Bid

Mac Haik Ford LTD 1 EA No Bid

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA No Bid

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA No Bid

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 EA No Bid

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA No Bid

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA No Bid

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 EA No Bid

BATTERSON TRUCK EQUIPMENT 1 EA No Bid

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA No Bid

List price for module flashing and computer programming at CFISD site.

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for General Motors Medium Duty OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for General Motors Medium Duty, if labor is offered.

List price for module flashing at and computer programming Contractor's site.

List price for module and computer programming flashing at CFISD site.

List price for module flashing and computer programming at Contractor's site.

List percent of discount for General Motors OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for General Motors, if labor is offered.
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Line 31

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $69.95

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $145.00

Line 32

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 Percentage Discount 55.0%

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 Percentage Discount 41.0%

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 25.0%

Batteries Plus (Kingdom Alliance LLC) 1 Percentage Discount 20.0%

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Percentage Discount 0.0%

Line 33

Supplier QTY UOM Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $125.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Hour $200.00

Line 34

Supplier QTY UOM Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O‘Reilly Automotive Stores, INC) 1 EA $0.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $1.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $55.00

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $125.00

Line 35

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Hour $67.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $95.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Hour $105.00

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $110.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $110.00

Line 36

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 Hour $65.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Hour $67.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $95.00

Line 37

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $159.95

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $200.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $300.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $425.00

Line 38

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Elite Auto Experts 1 EA $99.95

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $139.95

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $169.95

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $300.00

Line 39

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 EA $120.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $200.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $209.88

Line 40

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $185.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $209.88

List rate for Alignment for heavy duty vehicles.

List rate for Alignment for light duty vehicles.

List rate for Transmission Rebuild for heavy duty vehicles.

List rate for Transmission Rebuild for light duty vehicles.

List hourly rate for BODY SHOP and FRAME WORK labor for light duty vehicles.

Additional charges.

List percent of discount for Cummins OEM Parts.

List hourly shop rate for Cummins, if labor is offered.

Additional charges.

List hourly rate for BODY SHOP and FRAME WORK labor for heavy duty vehicles.
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Line 41

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 EA $170.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $200.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $209.88

Line 42

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $165.00

BECK & MASTEN BUICK GMC TRUCK 1 EA $185.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $209.88

Line 43

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 1 EA $0.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 EA $25.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA $25.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $50.00

Chalk's Truck Parts 1 EA $55.00

Line 44

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 Hour $165.00

Rush Bus Center, San Antonio, Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P.) 1 Hour $170.00

Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 Hour $200.00

LONESTAR CHEVROLET (SONIC AUTOMOTIVE) 1 Hour $209.88

List percent of discount for Air Conditioning Repair Parts for Busses

List rate for Air Conditioning Repair Labor for Busses

List rate for Engine/Motor Rebuild for heavy duty vehicles.

List rate for Engine/Motor Rebuild for light duty vehicles.
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Average Score
Overall 

Ranking

Batteries Plus 93.26 86.66 98.26 92.73 4.00

Batterson Truck Equipment N/A N/A

Beck & Masten Buick GMC Truck 91.04 82.04 82.04 85.04 8.00

Buck's Wheel & Equipment 94.40 93.60 99.40 95.80 1.00

Chalk's Truck Parts 95.00 92.00 100.00 95.67 2.00

Elite Auto Experts 74.96 71.66 68.47 71.70 10.00

Holt Truck Centers 99.10 82.10 88.10 89.77 5.00

Lonestar Chevrolet 93.98 78.18 87.98 86.71 7.00

Mac Haik Ford, LTD 92.90 84.30 85.40 87.53 6.00

Nationwide Bus Parts, Inc. 66.20 78.90 67.20 70.77 11.00

O'Reilly Auto Parts 100.00 82.00 100.00 94.00 3.00

Rush Bus Center 83.36 80.06 84.86 82.76 9.00

25-07-5600R-RFP Automotive Parts and Labor

TEAM SCORE SUMMARY



DATE: Wednesday, May 21, 2025

TO: James Briscoe
Director of Procurement Services

FROM: Robert Williams
Assistant Director of Transportation

SUBJECT: Contract 25-07-5600R-RFP Award Recommendation Automotive Parts and Labor

After careful review and evaluation of the proposals submitted for Contract 25-07-5600R-RFP, it is
recommended that any and all vendors scoring seventy percent (70%) or higher on the Evaluation Matrix shall 
be granted the contract.  This recommendation is based on a vendor’s ability to offer the best value to the district.

The contract will be valid for one (1) year through June 30, 2026.  Unless either party provides a written notice 
of non-renewal at least thirty (30) days in advance of the termination date, the contract will automatically renew 
for four (4) consecutive one (1) year terms through June 30, 2030.  Upon mutual agreement, proposed prices
may be extended beyond the firm price offer date.  This extension will be on a month-to-month basis for up to 
six (6) months.

The following recommended vendors will supply automotive parts and labor services to Cypress-Fairbanks 
ISD’s vehicles and equipment:

1. Elite Auto Experts and Lonestar Chevrolet will provide light duty body repairs. These services will 
address the current gap in the district’s capabilities to repair units involved in major incidents as well as 
ensuring timely completions of external repair needs. 

2. Rush Truck Center will provide parts and services specific to BlueBird school bus(es) and other vehicles 
associated with our fleet.

3. Holt Truck Centers will provide parts and services specific to International school bus(es) and other 
vehicles associated with our fleet. 

4. Beck & Masten Buick GMC Truck will provide parts and services specific to Chevrolet and GMC as well as 
other vehicles associated with our fleet. 

5. Mac Haik Ford will provide parts and services specific to Ford and other vehicles associated with our fleet. 

6. O’Reilly Auto Parts will provide parts only. These parts are associated with and may not be specific to the 
manufacturer. This includes small non-stocking parts. 

7. Chalks Truck Parts will provide alternative options for engine parts, brakes, suspension parts, and generic 
bus parts. 

8. Bucks Wheel and Equipment will provide alternative options for engine parts, brakes, suspension parts, 
generic bus parts, and specialized safety equipment for special needs transportation. 

9. Batteries Plus will provide alternative options for batteries associated with fleet vehicles and associated 
equipment. 

In the event that specific components are unavailable due to inventory shortages and/or backorders, these 
vendors will offer viable alternatives as a resolution. This flexibility will enable the district to maintain service 
continuity while optimizing cost through comparative pricing and available evaluations.

Should you require any additional information and/or have any further questions regarding this 
recommendation, please do not hesitate to contact me.




