BID TABULATION
#25-028 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

BID AWARD SUMMARY

Vendor Category 1 Category 2 Category 3 Category 4 Total Award
Big Red Distribution, LLC $ i
(Chicago, IL)
Daxwell $ )
(Houston, TX)
Durable Packaging
(Wheeling, IL) $ 94,124.25 $ 94,124.25
Form Plastics $ )
(St. Charles, IL)
Gordon Food Service
(Wyoming, MI) $ 78,875.00 $ 20,433.00 | $ 99,308.00
MyEcoPlanet $ -
(Houston, TX)
Plastic Connections
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) $ 16,068.25 $ 16,068.25
Platinum Packaging Group $ )
(Paramount, CA)
Wallace Packaging, LLC $ i
(Tuscon, AZ)

TOTAL 2025-2026 AWARDS| $ 209,500.50




BID TABULATION
BID #25-028 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

CATEGORY 1 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

1A 1B 1C
Aluminum Foil Aluminum Foil Aluminum Foil Total
. Casserole Trays Hamburger Trays Hot Dog Trays
Quantity (cs) 200 400 25
Big Red Distribution, LLC Brand/Product # . . . )
(Chicago, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Daxwell Brand/Product # . . . .
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Durable Packaging Brand/Product # 94.124.25
(Wheeling, IL) Per Unit Cost $ 149.22 | $ 150.90 | $ 156.81 e
Extended Cost $ 29,844.00 | $ 60,360.00 | $ 3,920.25
Form Plastics Brand/Product # . . . .
(St. Charles, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Gordon Food Service Brand/Product # . . . .
(Wyoming, MI) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
MyEcoPlanet Brand/Product # . . . .
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plastic Connections Brand/Product # . . . .
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Platinum Packaging Group Brand/Product # . . . .
(Paramount, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Wallace Packaging, LLC Brand/Product # . . . .
(Tuscon, AZ) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Extended Cost




BID TABULATION
BID #25-028 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

CATEGORY 2 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

2A
T
Carry Tray Total
SQP #6195
Quantity (cs) 2,500
Big Red Distribui LLC Brand/Product #
ig Red Distribution, - . .
(Chicago, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
D " Brand/Product #
axwe - . .
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Durable Packaal Brand/Product #
urable Packaging - . .
(Wheeling, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
F Plasti Brand/Product #
orm Plastics - . .
(St. Charles, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Gordon Food Servi Brand/Product # 537465
ordon Food Service -
(Wyoming, MI) Per Unit Cost $31.55 $78,875.00
Extended Cost $78,875.00
MvEcoPlanet Brand/Product # SQP6195
yEcoPlanet * -
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost $29.95 $74,875.00
Extended Cost $74,875.00
Plastic C " Brand/Product #
astic Connections - . .
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plati Packading G Brand/Product #
atinum Packaging Group - . .
(Paramount, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Wall Packaai LLC Brand/Product #
allace Packaging, - . .
(Tuscon, AZ) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost

* MyEcoPlanet: No samples provided. Per
bid specifications, samples were required.



BID TABULATION

BID #25-028 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

CATEGORY 3 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

3A 3B 3C 3D 3E 3F
Nonperforated Perforated Polyester
Perforated Polyester Polypropylene Polypropylene Pol e:ter Liddin Lidding Film - 15" Perforated Polyester
Lidding Film - 15" (hot| Lidding Film - 15" | Lidding Film - 11.25" yF"m o 9 with Lidding Film - 16" (hot Total
pack) (cold pack) (cold pack) 2-Color Graphic pack) ota
(hot pack)
(hot pack)
Quantity (Lbs.) 1,500 725 440 10 rolls 50 rolls 10 rolls
Big Red Distribution, LLC Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Chicago, IL) Extended Cost
Daxwell Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Houston, TX) Extended Cost
Durable Packaging Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Wheeling, IL) Extended Cost
- - 7.88

Form Plastics Per Unit Cost $ 1339 $ 7819 No Bid No Bid No Bid 29,214.45
(St. Charles, IL) Extended Cost $ 20,085.00 | $ 5,662.25 3,467.20
Gordon Food Service Per Unit Cost - . No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,673.75
(Wyoming, MI) Extended Cost $ 1,096.50 | $ 577.25
MyEcoPlanet Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Houston, TX) Extended Cost
Plastic Connections ** Per Unit Cost $ 265 $ 195| $ 1.95 | $ 220 s 565 | $ 28 16,068.25
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Extended Cost $ 3,975.00 | $ 1,413.75| $ 858.00 | $ 638.00 | $ 8,362.00 | $ 821.50 DR
Platinum Packaging Group Per Unit Cost $ 355] % 207] % 20719 3.20 No Bid No Bid 8.907.75
(Paramount, CA) Extended Cost $ 5,325.00 | $ 1,500.75 | $ 910.80 | $ 1,171.20
Wallace Packaging, LLC Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(Tuscon, AZ)

Extended Cost

** Category 3 is Awarded by Category: Plastic Connections is the only vendor who proposed items and pricing for the entire category.




BID TABULATION
BID #25-028 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

CATEGORY 4 - AWARDED BY LINE ITEM

4A 4B 4C 4D
Case Count 1000/cs 1500/cs 1500/cs 1000/cs
Utensil Pak One (1) Compartment 6 oz. Hinged 10 oz. Clear
Total A d
Spork Plastic Container Container Square otal Awar
Quantity (cs) 1,550 50 50 100
Big Red Distribution. LLC Brand/Product #
ig Red Distribution, ) . . .
(Chicago, IL) Per Unit Cost $ 18.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  28,442.50
Extended Cost $ 28,442.50
Brand/Product # 6043
Daxwell i $ 15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  24,025.00
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost . X X
Extended Cost $ 24,025.00
Durable Packagi Brand/Product #
urable Packaging ) . . . .
(Wheeling, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
F Plasti Brand/Product # 6043 21960 SB1
orm Plastics ) .
(St. Charles, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid $ 16190 | $ 11271 $ 90971 $ 22,827.50
Extended Cost $ 8,095.00 | $ 5,635.50 | $ 9,097.00
Brand/Product # 225363 760981 516210 444997
Gordon Food Service .
(Wyoming, MI) Per Unit Cost $ 6.95( $ 2559 | $ 63.90 | $ 5186 | $ 20,433.00
Extended Cost $ 10,772.50 | $ 1,279.50 | $ 3,195.00 | $ 5,186.00
MYEcoPlanet Brand/Product #
yEcoPlane . ) . . .
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plastic C " Brand/Product #
astic Connections . ) . . .
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plati packaging G Brand/Product #
atinum Packaging Group . ) . . .
(Paramount, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Brand/Product # #3600/1000per case
Wallace Packaging, LLC . . . :
(Tuscon, AZ) Per Unit Cost $ 13.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  21,421.00
Extended Cost $ 21,421.00
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