
Item Sizzle™ Ice Melter #50

Peladow™ Premier Snow 

and Ice Melter #50 Total Treated Rock Salt Untreated Rock Salt Total Total Bid

Vendor Quantity 1,250 Bags 1,250 Bags Bagged Salt 250 Tons 150 Tons Rock Salt Bid Award

Brand NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

Unit Price -$                                                 -$                                         91.98$                     77.15$                           

Total Cost -$                                                 -$                                         -$                22,995.00$             11,572.50$                   34,567.50$     34,567.50$     34,567.50$    

Brand NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

Unit Price 110.64$                   87.87$                           

Total Cost -$                                                 -$                                         27,660.00$             13,180.50$                   40,840.50$     40,840.50$     

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.25$                                               12.50$                                     107.25$                   87.25$                           

Total Cost 9,062.50$                                       15,625.00$                             24,687.50$    26,812.50$             13,087.50$                   39,900.00$     64,587.50$     24,687.50$    

Brand Contractor Melt holds 931 bags Max Melt holds 912 bags N/A N/A

Unit Price 5.95$                                               12.30$                                     108.90$                   94.65$                           

Total Cost 5,539.45$                                       11,217.60$                             16,757.05$    27,225.00$             14,197.50$                   41,422.50$     58,179.55$     

Brand Brown Bag, 50 lb bag Peladow NO BID NO BID

Unit Price 5.50$                                               13.39$                                     

Total Cost 6,875.00$                                       16,737.50$                             23,612.50$    -$                          -$                               -$                 23,612.50$     

Brand MVP 3-way Excel Calcium Pellet N/A N/A

Unit Price 8.75$                                               12.65$                                     104.00$                   89.00$                           

Total Cost 10,937.50$                                     15,812.50$                             26,750.00$    26,000.00$             13,350.00$                   39,350.00$     66,100.00$     

Brand NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

Unit Price -$                                                 -$                                         95.60$                     80.60$                           

Total Cost -$                                                 -$                                         -$                23,900.00$             12,090.00$                   35,990.00$     35,990.00$     

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.25$                                               12.99$                                     123.25$                   103.25$                        

Total Cost 9,062.50$                                       16,237.50$                             25,300.00$    30,812.50$             15,487.50$                   46,300.00$     71,600.00$     

Brand

Safe step 4300 Dual Blend 

w/blue dye #50 Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.60$                                               13.96$                                     133.50$                   109.50$                        

Total Cost 9,500.00$                                       17,450.00$                             26,950.00$    33,375.00$             16,425.00$                   49,800.00$     76,750.00$     

* At this time, we are not willing to accept alternative products for bagged salt. 59,255.00$    

BID #25-003

Treated/Untreated Rock Salt & Bagged Salt

Bid Tabulation

BID TOTAL

Rock SaltBagged Salt

Morton Salt, Inc.

(Chicago, IL)

Compass Minerals

(Overland Park, KS)

* CTLC/CGB

(Covington, LA)

* Midwest Salt, LLC

(West Chicago, IL)

Russo Power Equipment

(Schiller Park, IL)

* SiteOne Landscape Supply

(Cleveland, OH)

Conserv FS 

(Wauconda, IL)

* Martenson Turf Products 

(Waterman, IL)

Cargill Inc

(North Olmsted, OH)


