WILLIAMSVILLE CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT PRINTING MAILING SERVICES - BID # 2025-15 JOBS A+ B

VENDOR: BNP Empowered Print Orffeo Printing Zenger Group

2 Color 1st 30,000 [Add. 1,000 1st 30,000 [Add. 1,000 1st 30,000 [Add. 1,000
Job A - 8 pg No Bid No Bid $3,818.00 $201.00 $5,390.00 $160.00
Job A-12pg No Bid No Bid $6,375.00 $249.00 $7,560.00 $212.00
Job A - 16 pg No Bid No Bid $8,600.00 $290.00 $8,450.00 $250.00
Job A (8pg + 12pg) No Bid No Bid $10,193.00 $12,950.00
Option Full Color 1st 30,000 /Add. 1,000 1st 30,000 [Add. 1,000 1st 30,000 [Add. 1,000
Job A - 8 pg No Bid No Bid $4,600.00 $235.00 $5,650.00 $176.00
Job A-12pg No Bid No Bid $6,900.00 $295.00 $8,180.00 $221.00
Job A -16 pg No Bid No Bid $8,600.00 $340.00 $9,430.00 $263.00
Job A Mail Prep/M No Bid No Bid $44.00 $51.00
Mail Total 30,000 x 2 No Bid No Bid $2,640.00 $3,060.00
Total Job A -2 Color $0.00 $0.00 $12,833.00 $16,010.00
Job B - 4 pg (5,500 qty) No Bid No Bid $1,221.00 $1,980.00
Mail Prep/M No Bid No Bid $44.00 $35.00
Mail Total No Bid No Bid $242.00 $192.50
Total Job B $0.00 $0.00 $1,463.00 $2,172.50

| | |
Total Job A -2 Color & Job B $0.00 $14,296.00 $18,182.50

| | |
Award for sheet press is based on projection of: Job A in two color, one 8 page issue and one 12 page issue plus Job B and mail prep.
Award in total for printing & mailing services for Job A & B - Newsletters to Orffeo Printing
The number of pages, issues or color choices may be subject to change dependent upon budget restraints.
Contract Term : July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026
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WILLIAMSVILLE CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT PRINTING MAILING SERVICES - BID # 2025-15 JOB C

Vendor: BNP Empowered Print Orffeo Printing Zenger Group
Cost Example Ea Add. 500 Cost Example Ea Add. 500 Cost Example Ea Add. 500

Fall 64pg $9,425.00 $76.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winter Spring  64pg $9,425.00 $76.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Summer Kids  32pg $5,786.00 $47.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Summer Adults 24pg $5,061.00 $40.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Job C - Black only $29,697.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fall 64pg $11,596.00 $99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winter Spring  64pg $11,596.00 $99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Summer Kids  32pg $6,883.00 $49.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Summer Adults 24pg $5,565.00 $42.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Job C - Black + 1 Color $35,640.00 $0.00 $0.00
Mail Prep 30,000 $1,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mail X 2 $2,390.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mail Summer $760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mail Total $3,150.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Job C - Black Only w/Mail $32,847.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Job C - Black + 1 Color w/Mail $38,790.00 $0.00 $0.00
Job C - Four (4) color cover on 35# premi‘um 80 with black o‘nly inside
Award in total for printing & mailing services for Job C - Community Education Brochure to BNP Empowered Print
The number of pages, issues or color choice\s may be subject to change dependent upon budget.
Contract Term : July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026
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