WESTPORT PUBLIC SHOOLS
AWARD VENDOR LIST - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25-005-BOE

A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES

I"\I'AE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES Cl'j‘l?lllz'l'/ I;?é/ ITEM AWARDED TO NOTES
1 |[Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant 32 fl. oz. spray bottles 9 bottles per case NO SUBSTITUTION CASE STAPLESggsIABACT AND LOWEST BID
2 |Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant wipes, 155 wipes per bottle, 6/ per. case NO SUBSTITUTION CASE STAPLESSS&H?ACT AND LOWEST BID
3 [Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Spray Disinfectant 32 fl. Oz. spray bottles, 6/ Case — Part# 3341-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
4 |Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Spray Refill Disinfectant 1 Gallon refill bottle — 4/ case — Part# 4341-04 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE QUILL LOWEST BID
5 |Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Wipes 7797, 110 wipes per canister, 6/case — Part# 9341-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
6 |Purell Healthy Soap Healthy Mild Foam Soap, 2000mp, 2/ case — Part# 5213-02 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
7 |Purell Hand Sanitizer — Gel Bottles Tabletop bottles, 120z gel, 12/case — Part# 3659-12 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
8 |Purell Hand Sanitizer Dispensed Foam Hand Sanitizer Foam, 1200, 2/ case — Part# 1851-02 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
9 |Purell Healthy Foam Soap Dispenser FMX-20 Manual Dispenser, 2000ml, 6/ case — Part# 5234-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
10 |Purell Hand Sanitizer Dispensed Foam Dispenser Hand Sanitizer Foam, 1200 1/case - Part# 7820-01 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
11 |Clorox Tilex Mildew Remover 32 fl. Oz spray bottles — 9 per case CASE STAPLES gg'\’\/ll-:\TACT AND LOWEST BID
12 |Environmelt Wise Solution Ice Melt 50 Ib bag (40 bags per pallet) SKID DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
13 |Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/case SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE K&S LOWEST BID
14 |Prozime #121 Cleaner and Odor Eliminator, Equal or better, 2 units per case CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
15 |[Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Wipes Must have 3" party green seal or Eco logo, 6 cans / case, CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
16 |Lysol Foam Disinfectant Cleaner or equivalent Foam Cleaner — 12/ case CASE K&S LOWEST BID
17 |Vandalism Mark & Stain Remover Must have Green Seal or Eco Logo, 6-22 oz./cs. CASE W.B. MASON AWARDBEESTB?E\QVSBA“,QQSSE'\‘L?QSE_?%N PRIOR
18 |Absorbent Powder for Liquid Spills For Liquid Spills CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
19 |Kaiblooey Kaiblooey Solution 4/1 Gallon per case) CASE W.B. MASON AWARD;BST,\?E\Q/SBA'\QQSSSL?QSE?%N PRIOR
20 [Dusts Mop Treatment Aerosol 12 / 20 oz. CASE K&S LOWEST BID
21 |Distilled Water 1 Gallon — 4/ Case UNIT W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
22 |Spit Shine- Ultra High Speed Kleen and Burnish 1 gallon 4 per case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
23 [Flex 1 Clean Rubber Floor Cleaner & Grease Remover 1 Gallon — 4/ Case CASE K&S LOWEST BID
24 [Carpet Shampoo 1 Gallon — 4/ Case CASE K&S LOWEST BID
25 |SC Johnson RTU Carpet Sotter 30 oz Spray Bottles, 6/Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
26 |Baseboard Stripper Aerosol Baseboard Stripper, 12 Cans/Carton CASE K&S LOWEST BID
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SHOOLS
AWARD VENDOR LIST - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25-005-BOE

B. BROOMS, MOPS AND BRUSHES

II/IE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CS,\SIIIE_I_/ I;?é/ ITEM AWARDED TO NOTES
27 CR:grt;]btfgmald Wave Break Down Press Bucket & Wringer 35 QT - Yellow UNIT USA CORP. LOWEST BID
28 |Johnny Mops White plastic handle with swab & cone UNIT PATIFCO LOWEST BID
29 [Angled Brooms Large Broom with 11” sweep face — 12/ Case CASE PYRAMID LOWEST BID
30 [Lobby Brooms Small Black Angled Broom - 24/case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
Rubbermaid Commercial Products Dustpan with Long Handle,
31 [Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pans Plastic, Black, Compatible with Any Broom for‘Lobby/ Restaurant / UNIT W.B. MASON AWARD;EST,\?E\QVSBA“,GQSF?SL?QSE?%N PRIOR
Office / Home / Dog Pooper Scooper, 12.50” Wide
32 |Boardwalk Wet Mop Handle ifj;fi‘;vj::, i',?zti;égssx?f(;fgﬁe for 5 Wide Mop Heads, EACH STAPA"NES SS,WACT LOWEST BID
33 |Rubbermaid Dust Mop Handle Commercial Snap-On Wood Dust Mop Handle, 60 in., Natural EACH PYRAMID LOWEST BID
C. PAPER PRODUCTS
II/IE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CS\SIIET/ Fé?él ITEM AWARDED TO NOTES
34 [Facial Tissue, Green seal certified 100 tissues / bx, 30 boxes/case Equal or Better 7.9 x 7.1 in. SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
35 [Tork Matic Hand Towel Paper Roll , White hand towel #29 00 89 , 1 ply 700 feet (equal ), 6/cs CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
36 |Tork Matic Dispenser Tork Hand Towel Paper Dispenser UNIT IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
37 [North River Toilet Tissue - Green Seal Certified 2 ply Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
38 [Fort James or San Mar 9" Dial Jumbo Bath Tissue Dispenser %:éé#gi;iﬁg;t:l:e;t?n James (#58250) or Sam Mar UNITS IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
39 [Enmotion Hand Towel Paper Roll White hand towel 1 ply 6 rolls per case CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
40 [Multifold Hand Paper Towel Hand towel paper, 250 sheets per pack, 16pk per case CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
D. UTILITY ITEMS
II/IE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CG“SIIET/ i?é/ ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON
41 |20” Scrubbing brush 20 ““ Polypropylene Grout Block for Swing Machine UNIT DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
42 120” 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pad 20” White Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
43 |20” 3M Scrubbing Pads 20” Blue Scrubbing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SHOOLS
AWARD VENDOR LIST - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25-005-BOE

44 120” 3M Natural Fiber Pads 20 Natural Fiber Buffing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
45 |27” 3M High Speed Polishing Padsq. 27” High White Polishing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
46 |27” 3M Pink Pads 2” High Speed Pink Polishing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
47 |27” 3M Natural Fiber Pads 27” Natural Fiber Buffing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
48 |Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad 20” MDS STETCO Equal or Better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE WB MASON PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
49 |28x14x1 Americo Floor Pad Buffing Pads, 28w x 14h, Red, 5/CT SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE DUMOUCHEL PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
50 |28x14x1 Americo Floor Pad EcoPrep EPP Specialty Pads, 28w x 14h, Maroon, 5/CT SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE PYRAMID LOWEST BID
. . STAPLES CONTRACT
51 |3M Scrubbing Sponges Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 CASE AND COMM. LOWEST BID
52 |[Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200 Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better 200 / cs SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE K&S PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
53 |Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad MDS 20 in. STETCO Equal or Better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE WB MASON PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
54 Interplast Pitt P|f’iStICS Performance HD Liners, 30x36 size, 20 Heavy Strength, 500/pkg - 20/25 rolls/case Item# HR20HHC SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE INTERBORO LOWEST BID
30 gallons, 13 Microns
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners, 40x46 size, |Extra Heavy, 250/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 10/25 rolls per
. AMPLE REQUIRED CASE LOWEST BID
% 40-45 gallons, 15 Microns case, Item # HR40XHC S QU INTERBORO OWES
56 |Interplast Pitt Plastic Performance HD Liners — 60 Gallons 60 Gallons SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE INTERBORO LOWEST BID
57 |Probe Vacuum Cleaner Bags Replacement Vacuum Bags, 10 bags/pack CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
58 [Rubbermaid Brute Dolly 2640-43 Quiet dolly Ref # FG264043 Black UNIT DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
. . . STAPLES CONTRACT
59 [Rubbermaid Recycling Container RCP #3536-06 Blue UNIT AND COMM. LOWEST BID
60 [Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 1/2 cubic yd. Measurements-56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, Alternate #9T17 UNIT PATIFCO LOWEST BID
61 [Rubbermaid Trolleys Ref #3551-88 Slim Jim UNIT STAPLESSSI\’\/‘IIARACT AND LOWEST BID
. AWARDED TO WB MASON BASED ON PRIOR
62 [Rubbermaid Wastebaskets 14 gt wastebasket, ref # 2958 or equal UNIT WB MASON BUSINESS AND RELIABILITY.
. . . STAPLES CONTRACT
63 [Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent UNIT AND COMM. LOWEST BID
64 |[Stripping boots Multiple Sizes, SAMPLE REQUIRED UNIT BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWEST BID
65 [The Champ One Wipes bRC?)]:ei ?)i?ii’s:ea\,y DRC wipe, 9"x12" wiper, 225 wipes per box, 4 SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE WB MASON PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
66 |[Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Carpet Bonnets 21 inch, reversible 6 units per case, CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
67 |Urinal Screens Deodorizer 100 Active Materials, to contain quarts, 12 units per case CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
68 |Food Service Wipers 13”x24” Disposable Cloths SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE IMPERIAL BAG LOWEST BID
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SHOOLS
AWARD VENDOR LIST - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25-005-BOE

69 [22” Water Squeegee UNIT PATIFCO LOWEST BID
70 |Unger Long Handled Light Duty Scraper Unger Long Handled Light Duty Scraper with 4" blade or Eq. EACH PYRAMID LOWEST BID
71 [Unger 4’ Scraper Replacement Blades or Eq. Unger 4’ Scraper Replacement Blades or Eq. UNIT PYRAMID LOWEST BID
72 |Doodlebug Pad Holder with Stick Doodlebug Pad Holder with Stick EACH W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
73 [6”X4” Green Scrubbing Pad 67X4” Green Scrubbing Pad CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
74 16”X4” White Scrubbing Pad 67X4” White Scrubbing Pad CASE ALL STAR LOWEST BID
75 [10” Squeegee Kit Kit - Handle & Blade UNIT DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
76 [10” Squeegee Replacement Blades UNIT DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
77 |First Aid Kit, Indoor Emergency kit indoor for up to 25 people KIT QUILL LOWEST BID
78 |Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Axcess 10 Pack - EPW8628790 NO SUBSTITUTION PATIFCO LOWEST BID
79 |Filter Bag Vacuum Tennant 1210869 ( BAG, DUST, PAPER[L PICK=1 PKG]) NO SUBSTITUTION STAPALNES ggl\'\'ALFfACT LOWEST BID
80 [Filter Bad Vacuum Speedster 1000 HSKU Number SSS 56009-10 96 CASE PATIFCO LOWEST BID
81 [NSS Pacer 30 Supersuction Part# 32-9-029-1 CASE K&S LOWEST BID
82 |Filter Bag for Probe Vacuum Z1 Prob P/5 Part# 423742 K&S LOWEST BID
83 |Windsor Chariot 2 Filter Bags Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Axcess 10 Pack - EPW8628790 PATIFCO LOWEST BID
E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT

I-':—/IE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSfIIIE'I'/ E?é/ ITEM AWARDED TO NOTES

84 |Nitrile Gloves ?h‘/‘lzzf:;iﬂfgglg(vf Z;Qﬁ)p er box, 10 boxes / case — Multiple Sizes | - ¢\ 1o) £ reqUIRED CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
85 |Vinyl Gloves 1,000 Count Vinyl Gloves in Multiple Sizes (Medium, Large & XL) SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE USA CORP. LOWEST BID
86 |Rubbermaid Mobile Barrier Yellow “Caution” Barrier with Flexible Panels UNIT PATIFCO LOWEST BID
87 |Rubbermaid Plastic Floor Sign Yellow “Caution” Floor Sign UNIT W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
88 |Safety Glasses Clear Plastic CASE W.B. MASON LOWEST BID
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SHOOLS
AWARD VENDOR LIST - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25-005-BOE

F. FEMININE PRODUCTS

I"\I'AE PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSIIE'I'/ I;?é/ ITEM AWARDED TO NOTES

89 [Sanitary Napkins Size #4 Absorbent Feminine Pads SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE WB MASON LOWEST BID

90 |Tampons Individually Wrapped for Dual Hygiene Dispenser SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE WB MASON PRICE AND SAMPLE PROVIDED
91 |Dual Hygiene Dispensers Dispenses (14) units size #4 & (22) units of tampons SPECS REQUIRED UNIT CITRON BASED ON SPECS AND QUALITY
92 |Disposal Bags for Feminine Sanitary Products Personal disposal single use bags compatible for receptacles CASE PYRAMID LOWEST BID

93 |Feminine Hygiene Receptacles Receptacle Sani Disposal Metal Wall Mount Small Unit UNIT STAPLESggsIABACT AND LOWEST BID

94 |Paper Disposable Toilet Seat covers Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers CASE STAPLES g gsIA?ACT AND LOWEST BID

95 |Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers Dispensers Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers Dispensers UNIT DUMOUCHEL LOWEST BID
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25 - 005 - BOE

A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES ABCO ALL STAR IN%EUN#QI’\‘ES JANE%%IAL CENTRAL POLY CITRON DUMOUCHEL | IMPERIAL BAG INTERBORO K&S PATIFCO PYRAMID QUILL SOSE cosrg'grik’; & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON
ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSFT(BE(?E/ BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
1 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant 32 fl. oz. spray bottles 9 bottles per case NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID $66.60 $61.84 $73.29 NO BID NO BID $56.81 $54.77 NO BID $57.74 $56.13 $69.98 $67.10 NO BID $52.00 NO BID $58.11 $61.30
2 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant wipes, 155 wipes per bottle, 6/ per. case NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID $46.58 $43.37 $51.27 NO BID NO BID $39.84 $39.23 NO BID $40.38 $40.23 $50.99 $40.95 NO BID $38.70 NO BID $40.64 $42.62
3 Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Spray Disinfectant 32 fl. Oz. spray bottles, 6/ Case — Part# 3341-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID $35.00 $32.64 $33.90 NO BID NO BID $26.00 $23.12 NO BID $30.40 $23.77 $39.98 $38.99 NO BID $27.10 NO BID $31.37 $21.35
4 Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Spray Refill Disinfectant 1 Gallon refill bottle — 4/ case — Part# 4341-04 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $49.56 $53.64 NO BID NO BID $39.00 $36.53 NO BID $47.38 $38.67 $79.98 $16.34 NO BID $41.30 NO BID NO BID $35.07
5 Purell Professional Surface Sanitizing Wipes 779", 110 wipes per canister, 6/case — Part# 9341-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $63.24 $65.83 NO BID NO BID $52.81 $50.80 NO BID $61.04 $55.17 $71.98 $57.17 NO BID $53.00 NO BID $63.99 $44.34
6 Purell Healthy Soap Healthy Mild Foam Soap, 2000mp, 2/ case — Part# 5213-02 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $51.52 $51.39 NO BID NO BID $38.00 $27.00 NO BID $50.50 $28.99 $60.97 $50.99 NO BID $46.98 NO BID NO BID $34.28
7 Purell Hand Sanitizer — Gel Bottles Tabletop bottles, 120z gel, 12/case — Part# 3659-12 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE $63.00 $73.00 $65.52 $73.83 NO BID NO BID $59.00 $50.27 NO BID $50.38 $53.84 $69.25 $68.99 NO BID $55.25 NO BID $61.62 $49.49
8 Purell Hand Sanitizer Dispensed Foam Hand Sanitizer Foam, 1200, 2/ case — Part# 1851-02 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $88.51 $94.53 NO BID NO BID $68.10 $61.69 NO BID $83.13 $79.72 $89.98 $92.99 NO BID $72.70 NO BID NO BID $54.07
9 Purell Healthy Foam Soap Dispenser FMX-20 Manual Dispenser, 2000ml, 6/ case — Part# 5234-06 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $1.82 $15.00 NO BID NO BID NO CHARGE FRTWVX;[?AP NO BID $10.75 $2.00 $80.85 $18.47 NO BID $53.90 NO BID NO BID NO CHARGE
10  |Purell Hand Sanitizer Dispensed Foam Dispenser Hand Sanitizer Foam, 1200 1/case - Part# 7820-01 NO SUBSTITUTION CASE NO BID NO BID $35.04 $15.00 NO BID NO BID NO CHARGE FREAEWVX:[?AP NO BID $34.35 $0.50 $40.99 $21.59 NO BID $30.81 NO BID NO BID NO CHARGE
11 |Clorox Tilex Mildew Remover 32 fl. Oz spray bottles — 9 per case CASE $51.99 $64.47 $54.90 $68.28 NO BID NO BID $54.00 $51.89 NO BID $52.82 $53.00 $69.95 $56.16 NO BID $20.92 NO BID NO BID $54.70
12 |Environmelt Wise Solution Ice Melt 50 Ib bag (40 bags per pallet) SKID NO BID NO BID $655.20 $739.50 NO BID NO BID $13.50 $648.00 NO BID $395.00 $545.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $580.00 NO BID NO BID $497.99
13 |Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/case SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID $60.20 $52.44 $51.97 NO BID NO BID $46.68 $49.44 NO BID $29.45 $35.26 $39.99 NO BID NO BID $44.44 NO BID NO BID $50.27
14 Prozime #121 Cleaner and Odor Eliminator, Equal or better, 2 units per case CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.00 NO BID NO BID $60.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.02
15 |Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Wipes Must have 3" party green seal or Eco logo, 6 cans / case, CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.78 NO BID NO BID $48.99 $60.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.27
16  |Lysol Foam Disinfectant Cleaner or equivalent Foam Cleaner — 12/ case CASE NO BID $49.00 $44.82 $56.28 NO BID NO BID $38.81 $42.00 NO BID $33.60 $35.59 $38.99 $46.49 $40.12 $38.90 NO BID $33.41 $42.96
17 |Vandalism Mark & Stain Remover Must have Green Seal or Eco Logo, 6-22 oz./cs. CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $87.50 NO BID NO BID $51.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.29
18 |Absorbent Powder for Liquid Spills For Liquid Spills CASE $63.00 $62.79 $53.50 $82.73 NO BID NO BID $63.81 $45.00 NO BID $41.87 $38.73 $59.99 NO BID NO BID $47.20 NO BID NO BID $38.74
19 |Kaiblooey Kaiblooey Solution 4/1 Gallon per case) CASE NO BID $103.00 NO BID $129.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID $104.96 NO BID $43.32 $30.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.89
20  |Dusts Mop Treatment Aerosol 12 /20 oz. CASE NO BID $87.00 $53.94 $63.26 NO BID NO BID $51.57 $58.31 NO BID $38.65 $50.21 $40.98 NO BID $64.05 NO BID NO BID $58.00 $50.22
21 |Distilled Water 1 Gallon — 4/ Case UNIT NO BID NO BID $13.54 $12.68 NO BID NO BID $14.42 $10.10 NO BID $16.10 $11.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.54
22 |Spit Shine- Ultra High Speed Kleen and Burnish 1 gallon 4 per case CASE $54.00 $36.70 $75.04 $80.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.54 NO BID $56.38 $43.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.45
23 |Flex 1 Clean Rubber Floor Cleaner & Grease Remover |1 Gallon — 4/ Case CASE $59.95 $37.66 $62.66 $50.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00 NO BID $36.75 $37.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.32
24 |Carpet Shampoo 1 Gallon - 4/ Case CASE NO BID $50.68 $62.39 $57.13 NO BID NO BID $54.36 $41.73 NO BID $39.05 $39.08 NO BID $44.54 $40.67 $33.50 NO BID NO BID $41.05
25 |SC Johnson RTU Carpet Sotter 30 oz Spray Bottles, 6/Case CASE NO BID $50.68 $43.68 $38.92 NO BID NO BID $40.00 $35.40 NO BID $41.18 $32.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.89
26 Baseboard Stripper Aerosol Baseboard Stripper, 12 Cans/Carton CASE NO BID NO BID $52.40 $57.73 NO BID NO BID $49.20 $47.20 NO BID $32.94 $51.99 $39.55 $153.79 $67.90 $40.11 NO BID $29.53 $80.40
B. BROOMS, MOPS AND BRUSHES ABCO ALL STAR Y e CENTRAL POLY CITRON DUMOUCHEL IMPERIAL BAG INTERBORO K&S PATIFCO PYRAMID QUILL SOSE cosr\?:kgi & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON
INDUSTRIES | JANITORIAL BT
ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSIIE'I'/.BE?I'EI BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
27 wr?::g“é:)dmvg;ve Break Down Press Bucket & 35 QT - Yellow UNIT $59.90 $83.79 $72.22 $138.40 NO BID NOBID $75.00 $85.14 NO BID $115.00 $71.88 $112.99 $109.79 NO BID $140.51 NO BID $56.24 $80.95
28 Johnny Mops White plastic handle with swab & cone UNIT $1.70 $1.50 $2.76 $1.24 NO BID NO BID $2.35 $1.60 NO BID $1.08 $0.82 $1.89 NO BID $4.25 NO NID NO BID NO BID $0.83
29 |Angled Brooms Large Broom with 11” sweep face — 12/ Case CASE NO BID NO BID $76.80 $93.52 NO BID NO BID $6.95 $97.80 NO BID $7.52 $59.39 $52.68 NO BID $9.12 $58.16 NO BID NO BID $59.39
30 Lobby Brooms Small Black Angled Broom - 24/case CASE NO BID NO BID $97.92 $117.23 NO BID NO BID $5.35 $5.32 NO BID $5.00 $3.90 $78.96 NO BID $8.80 $48.20 NO BID NO BID $6.05
Rubbermaid Commercial Products Dustpan with Long Handle,
31 |Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pans Plastic, Black, Compatible with Any Broom for Lobby / UNIT NO BID $11.00 $12.63 $16.01 NO BID NO BID $11.49 $17.02 NO BID $10.07 $3.53 $12.98 $24.59 $25.50 $16.62 NO BID NO BID $3.53
Restaurant / Office / Home / Dog Pooper Scooper, 12.50” Wide
32 |Boardwalk Wet Mop Handle i‘l’:lr“di:’::i F;',?S(’;ifgse'\é?wfgxle for 5 Wide Mop Heads, EACH NOBID $9.65 $9.25 $35.73 NOBID NOBID $7.81 $8.77 NOBID $9.45 $24.66 $8.98 NO BID $17.09 $5.40 NOBID NO BID $8.03
33 |Rubbermaid Dust Mop Handle Commercial Snap-On Wood Dust Mop Handle, 60 in., Natural EACH NO BID $9.45 $20.36 $33.26 NO BID NO BID $7.75 $25.70 NO BID $9.45 $7.83 $6.89 $11.01 $25.10 $11.60 NO BID NO BID $11.63
C. PAPER PRODUCTS ABCO ALL STAR BENMAN CEC CENTRAL POLY CITRON DUMOUCHEL | IMPERIAL BAG INTERBORO K&S PATIFCO PYRAMID QUILL SOSE cosn?:;? & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON
INDUSTRIES | JANITORIAL CoMM
ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSIET/_BE?EI BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
34 |Facial Tissue, Green seal certified 100 tissues / bx, 30 boxes/case Equal or Better 7.9 x 7.1 in. SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $19.19 $33.91 $19.98 NO BID $17.50 $27.06 NO BID $22.22 $20.93 $27.98 NO BID NO BID $14.34 NO BID $13.31 $22.90
35 |Tork Matic Hand Towel Paper Roll , White hand towel #29 00 89, 1 ply 700 feet (equal ), 6/cs CASE $51.00 $63.75 $61.20 $64.56 NO BID NO BID $52.72 $44.95 NO BID $55.05 $45.10 NO BID $51.60 $64.28 $54.05 NO BID $71.93 $46.20
36  |Tork Matic Dispenser Tork Hand Towel Paper Dispenser UNIT - NO BID $49.20 $15.00 NO BID NO BID $5.00 FREEV‘{/VA:'SPER NO BID $50.00 $12.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.11 $54.84
37 |North River Toilet Tissue - Green Seal Certified 2 ply Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $44.99 $43.25 $28.00 NO BID $19.31 $17.50 NO BID $17.96 $16.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.09 NO BID $16.53 $18.23
38 E?Sr;:zrs‘:s or San Mar 8" Dial Jumbo Bath Tissue %:ég#g%iﬁ:aﬁflge;t?” James (#58250) or Sam Mar UNITS NOBID $36.58 $60.29 $34.90 NOBID NOBID $37.81 $20.00 NOBID $25.00 $24.99 NOBID NO BID NOBID $25.19 NOBID $144.86 $29.89
39 Enmotion Hand Towel Paper Roll White hand towel 1 ply 6 rolls per case CASE $40.00 $70.97 $54.34 NO BID $49.66 NO BID $67.81 $68.71 NO BID $45.18 $41.19 NO BID $99.89 NO BID $80.20 NO BID $36.00 $67.93
40 Multifold Hand Paper Towel Hand towel paper, 250 sheets per pack, 16pk per case CASE $24.99 $33.60 $24.19 $33.71 $25.00 NO BID $24.50 $19.76 NO BID $19.78 $18.68 NO BID $28.58 $24.32 $23.90 NO BID $17.98 $19.97
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25 - 005 - BOE

D. UTILITY ITEMS ABCO ALL STAR INI?DEUNS¥QI’\‘ES ) AN::T%% AL |CENTRALPOLY|  cITRON DUMOUCHEL | IMPERIALBAG | INTERBORO K&s PATIFCO PYRAMID QuILL SOSE cosggrgﬂkéi & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON
ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSFT/,BE%/ BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

41 |20” Scrubbing brush 20 “ Polypropylene Grout Block for Swing Machine UNIT NO BID NO BID $228.82 $212.08 NO BID NO BID $125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.59
42 |20” 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pad 20” White Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $19.39 $20.93 $45.08 NO BID NO BID $17.36 $35.36 NO BID NO BID $10.84 $13.29 NO BID NO BID $15.16 NO BID NO BID $12.59
43 |20” 3M Scrubbing Pads 20” Blue Scrubbing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $19.00 $22.87 $39.29 NO BID NO BID $17.36 $14.97 NO BID NO BID $10.84 $13.29 $32.43 NO BID $15.16 NO BID NO BID $12.59
44 |20” 3M Natural Fiber Pads 20” Natural Fiber Buffing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $19.40 $23.10 $45.08 NO BID NO BID $38.95 $14.97 NO BID NO BID $10.84 $12.29 $35.19 NO BID $15.80 NO BID NO BID $12.59
45 |27”3M High Speed Polishing Padsg. 27" High White Polishing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $42.56 $45.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.95 $66.35 NO BID NO BID $24.29 $36.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.17
46 [27”3M Pink Pads 2" High Speed Pink Polishing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $43.47 NO BID $100.18 NO BID NO BID $38.95 $71.46 NO BID NO BID $24.38 $36.98 NO BID NO BID $71.00 NO BID NO BID $28.17
47 |27” 3M Natural Fiber Pads 27" Natural Fiber Buffing Pads or Equal — 5/ Case CASE NO BID $43.47 $50.48 $100.18 NO BID NO BID $38.95 $38.41 NO BID NO BID $24.38 $36.98 NO BID NO BID $31.33 NO BID NO BID $28.17
48 |Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad 20" MDS STETCO Equal or Better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID $26.31 NO BID $78.48 NO BID NO BID $18.98 NO BID $21.40 $13.50 $19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.49
49 |28x14x1 Americo Floor Pad Buffing Pads, 28w x 14h, Red, 5/CT SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID $31.76 $67.73 $90.00 NO BID NO BID $29.00 $62.45 NO BID $38.50 $74.50 $38.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70.82
50 |28x14x1 Americo Floor Pad EcoPrep EPP Specialty Pads, 28w x 14h, Maroon, 5/CT SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID $141.44 $115.70 $184.68 NO BID NO BID $124.00 $180.00 NO BID $66.36 $74.80 $40.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $145.33
51 [3M Scrubbing Sponges Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 CASE NO BID s}iﬁéﬁfﬁkﬁﬂ $29.39 $25.29 NO BID NOBID $17.81 $15.00 NO BID NOBID $13.11 $25.99 NO BID NO BID $6.79 NO BID NO BID $14.61
52 |Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200 Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better 200 / cs SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NOBID NO BID $81.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 NO BID $17.88 $17.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $73.84
53 |Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad MDS 20 in. STETCO Equal or Better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID SEE #48 $35.54 $78.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.98 NO BID $21.40 $13.50 $19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.49
54 :Zt:”;lgsgg g;;:i:?gi:g?g::ﬂce HD Liners, 30x36 || v Strength, 500/pkg - 20/25 rollsfcase Item# HR20HHC | SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.66 $17.97 NO BID $27.81 $19.97 $17.34 NO BID $18.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.20 NO BID $26.64
55 ;"thri"'gsz: giaﬁ:)a:scfspaifg:g‘znce HD Liners, 40x46 E::'caasH:al‘gm isgg’zg;(’;‘_{%mx' Shrink Wrap Only, 1025 rolls | ¢ \\1o1 ¢ reqUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $44.17 $39.20 $17.99 NO BID $33.85 $23.98 $17.72 NO BID $21.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.25 NO BID $29.89
56 g;l‘fnl:“ Pitt Plastic Performance HD Liners =60 64 ayi0ng SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $31.97 $38.50 $18.76 NO BID $31.00 $18.65 $16.82 NO BID $24.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.16
57 Probe Vacuum Cleaner Bags Replacement Vacuum Bags, 10 bags/pack CASE NO BID NO BID $82.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.55 NO BID $12.60 $12.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 |Rubbermaid Brute Dolly 2640-43 Quiet dolly Ref # FG264043 Black UNIT NO BID NO BID $33.26 $139.95 NO BID NO BID $13.25 $35.08 NO BID $31.50 $28.88 $46.99 $110.99 NO BID $33.99 NO BID $28.09 $67.41
50 |Rubbermaid Recycling Container RCP #3536-06 Blue UNIT NO BID NO BID $78.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.83 $62.99 NO BID NO BID $44.59 NO BID NO BID $45.87
60  |Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 1/2 cubic yd. Measurements-56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, Alternate #9T17 UNIT NO BID NO BID $828.50 $939.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID $747.73 NO BID NO BID $400.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID $425.52 NO BID $676.35 $400.73
61  |Rubbermaid Trolleys Ref #3551-88 Slim Jim UNIT NO BID NO BID $113.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $88.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
62  |Rubbermaid Wastebaskets 14 qt wastebasket, ref # 2958 or equal UNIT NO BID NO BID $9.17 $10.50 NO BID NO BID $6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.03 $5.99 $5.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.03

63 |Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent UNIT NO BID $14.50 $7.38 $9.85 NO BID NO BID $13.25 $7.00 NO BID $5.88 $5.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.70 NO BID NO BID $6.64

64 |Stripping boots Multiple Sizes, SAMPLE REQUIRED UNIT NO BID $44.43 $38.18 $68.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.97 $49.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 |The Champ One Wipes Eg;'#fgff; ;?H&ERC wipe, 97x12" wiper, 225 WipeS Per | ¢\ \1p| £ REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $79.57 $104.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.00 NO BID NO BID $49.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.38
66 |Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Carpet Bonnets 21 inch, reversible 6 units per case, CASE NO BID $66.98 $228.89 $148.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.88 NO BID NO BID $66.06 $125.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 Urinal Screens Deodorizer 100 Active Materials, to contain quarts, 12 units per case CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.17 NO BID NO BID $11.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.92 NO BID NO BID $12.40
68  |Food Service Wipers 137x24” Disposable Cloths SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.01 NO BID $76.50 $18.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.88 NO BID NO BID $32.39
69 |22” Water Squeegee UNIT NO BID $20.70 $35.51 $17.00 NO BID NO BID $7.95 $18.01 NO BID NO BID $15.76 NO BID $18.87 NO BID $15.10 NO BID NO BID $23.52
70 Unger Long Handled Light Duty Scraper Unger Long Handled Light Duty Scraper with 4" blade or Eq. EACH NO BID $26.00 $26.11 $31.61 NO BID NO BID $17.81 $20.73 NO BID NO BID $23.03 $9.98 $24.33 $20.90 $19.10 NO BID NO BID $23.03
71 Unger 4’ Scraper Replacement Blades or Eq. Unger 4’ Scraper Replacement Blades or Eq. UNIT NO BID $10.70 $9.49 $1.12 NO BID NO BID $16.81 $10.04 NO BID NO BID $8.87 $5.99 NO BID $13.50 $7.70 NO BID NO BID $8.89

72 |Doodlebug Pad Holder with Stick Doodlebug Pad Holder with Stick EACH NO BID $17.00 $12.60 $13.07 NO BID NO BID $10.62 $34.25 NO BID NO BID $12.04 $10.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.46

73 |6"X4” Green Scrubbing Pad 67X4” Green Scrubbing Pad CASE NO BID $7.38 $18.00 $57.49 NO BID NO BID $15.55 $7.27 NO BID $10.15 $12.43 $16.98 NO BID $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.50

74 |6"X4” White Scrubbing Pad 67X4” White Scrubbing Pad CASE NO BID $7.38 NO BID $58.07 NO BID NO BID $15.55 $16.31 NO BID NO BID $12.37 $17.98 NO BID $29.95 $44.90 NO BID NO BID $21.28
75 |10” Squeegee Kit Kit - Handle & Blade UNIT NO BID $18.73 NO BID $24.52 NO BID NO BID $5.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.46
76 |10” Squeegee Replacement Blades UNIT NO BID $7.00 $5.47 $3.11 NO BID NO BID $1.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 First Aid Kit, Indoor Emergency kit indoor for up to 25 people KIT NO BID NO BID $20.12 $46.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.00 NO BID NO BID $15.70 NO BID $14.46 NO BID $15.04 NO BID NO BID $15.71
78 Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Axcess 10 Pack - EPW8628790 NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.55 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 |Filter Bag Vacuum Tennant 1210869 ( BAG, DUST, PAPER[1 PICK=1 PKG]) NO SUBSTITUTION NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.72 NO BID $27.50 $16.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |Filter Bad Vacuum Speedster 1000 HSKU Number SSS 56009-10 96 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.00 $13.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81  |NSS Pacer 30 Supersuction Part# 32-9-029-1 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00 $2,050.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 |Filter Bag for Probe Vacuum Z1 Prob P/5 Part# 423742 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.25 $29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |Windsor Chariot 2 Filter Bags Filter Bag Vacuum Windsor Axcess 10 Pack - EPW8628790 NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.55 $15.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BID RESULTS - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 25 - 005 - BOE

E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT ABCO ALL STAR IN?DEU’\;’\‘II'IQII\‘ES JAN:?rgc‘)(;{IAL CENTRAL POLY CITRON DUMOUCHEL IMPERIAL BAG INTERBORO K&S PATIFCO PYRAMID QUILL SOSE coﬁiﬁ%\? & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSIIIET/BE(?él BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
84 Nitrile Gloves g‘;z:e(;\ﬂigﬁrefg::ixlf(;pze;qbf))x’ 10/boxes / case ~ Multiple SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID $33.25 $48.35 $114.80 NO BID NO BID $33.00 $34.13 $29.00 $42.00 $25.99 $43.90 NO BID $38.00 $3.44 $27.40 $25.69 $26.00
85  |Vinyl Gloves ;’E?O Count Vinyl Gloves in Multiple Sizes (Medium, Large & | ¢\ \1o) £ pequIRED CASE $17.50 $22.00 $28.40 $52.92 NO BID NO BID $22.81 $18.00 $17.90 $21.18 $17.19 $31.90 NO BID $21.00 $24.88 $23.60 $17.10 $17.20
86 Rubbermaid Mobile Barrier Yellow “Caution” Barrier with Flexible Panels UNIT NO BID NO BID NO BID $605.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $383.26 NO BID NO BID $322.17 $389.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $354.35
87 Rubbermaid Plastic Floor Sign Yellow “Caution” Floor Sign UNIT NO BID $10.34 NO BID $23.99 NO BID NO BID $10.10 $15.15 NO BID $8.08 $8.18 $12.98 $21.59 NO BID $10.25 NO BID NO BID $7.48
88 Safety Glasses Clear Plastic CASE $1.69 $1.87 $63.00 $2.10 NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1.65 NO BID NO BID $1.42 $22.68 $13.24 NO BID $0.92 NO BID NO BID $0.91

F. FEMININE PRODUCTS ABCO ALL STAR EENMAD ce CENTRAL POLY CITRON DUMOUCHEL IMPERIAL BAG INTERBORO K&S PATIFCO PYRAMID QUILL SOSE cosr\?gkg? & UNIPAK USA CORP. W.B. MASON
INDUSTRIES JANITORIAL COMM.

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES CSSIIET/B;?E/ BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
89 Sanitary Napkins Size #4 Absorbent Feminine Pads SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $127.00 $58.78 NO BID $62.40 $58.43 $48.72 NO BID $46.00 $44.12 $50.99 NO BID NO BID $42.79 NO BID NO BID $38.37
90 Tampons Individually Wrapped for Dual Hygiene Dispenser SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID $89.96 $100.02 NO BID $93.60 $74.00 $71.03 NO BID $80.35 $77.10 $80.99 NO BID NO BID $75.16 NO BID NO BID $67.39
91 Dual Hygiene Dispensers Dispenses (14) units size #4 & (22) units of tampons SPECS REQUIRED UNIT NO BID NO BID $316.98 $400.09 NO BID $124.00 $300.00 $312.00 NO BID NO BID $123.99 $299.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00
92 Disposal Bags for Feminine Sanitary Products Personal disposal single use bags compatible for receptacles CASE NO BID $34.80 $19.44 $29.71 NO BID $97.87 $26.25 $20.75 NO BID $20.60 $19.68 $18.98 $36.29 NO BID $19.25 NO BID NO BID $20.89
93 Feminine Hygiene Receptacles Receptacle Sani Disposal Metal Wall Mount Small Unit UNIT NO BID NO BID $59.11 $27.38 NO BID NO BID $35.55 $61.86 NO BID $33.93 $22.05 NO BID $39.81 NO BID $19.69 NO BID NO BID $39.85
94 Paper Disposable Toilet Seat covers Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers CASE NO BID $54.85 $52.43 $37.18 NO BID NO BID $32.13 $31.50 NO BID $28.95 $33.98 $37.99 $25.92 NO BID $8.72 NO BID $29.10 $31.39
95 Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers Dispensers Paper Disposable Toilet Seat Covers Dispensers UNIT NO BID $16.40 $11.59 $18.82 NO BID NO BID $7.50 $9.10 NO BID $14.25 $9.13 $8.99 $8.17 NO BID $12.45 NO BID NO BID $9.14
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