COMMUNITY H.S. DIST 99

‘ RECYCLED PAPER

By Location Staples Garve, Quill Murnane Paper Midland Paper Contract Paper
ASC| NORTH SOUTH_|Total Quantity Bid Unit Price | _Bid Total | Bid Unit Price | _Bid Total | Bid Unit Price | _Bid Total | Bid Unit Price | _Bid Total | Bid Unit Price| _Bid Total | Bid Unit Price | _Bid Total _|Total Ouantit
SIZE/COLOR
WHITE 20LB 81/2X 11 35 0 320 355 $11,768.25 | $34.36 10ct | $12,197.80 $52.67 $18,697.85 $34.80 $12,354.00 $34.95 $12,407.25 $44.20 $15,691.00 355
NATURAL CHOICE UNACCEPTABLI 11 X 17 2 0 0 2 $43.30 $86.60 $42.99 10ct $85.98 $65.35 $130.70 $77.00 $77.80 $42.50 $85.00 2
81/2X 14 2 0 0 2 $55.50 $111.00 $52.99 10ct $105.98 $79.62 $108.00 $99.60 $55.00 $110.00 2
For Mosaic 81/2x 11- 60lIbf 0 2 0 2 $122.10 $244.20 | $66.13 8ct/50 |  $132.26 NO BID NO BID 126 8ct/500 $252.00 NO BID NO BID 2
Aged 0 0 0 0 0
COLORED PAPER 20LB 81/2 X 11
BLUE 0 5 2 7 $51.00 $357.00 $63.33 10ct $443.31 $65.45* $458.15 $342.30 $52.90 $370.30 $53.40 $373.80 7
BUFF 0 0 0 0 0
CANARY 0 5 2 7 $51.00 $357.00 $63.33 10ct $443.31 $65.45* $458.15 $342.30 $52.90 $370.30 $53.40 $373.80 7
CHERRY 0 0 0 0 0
CREAM 0 0 0 0 0
GOLDENROD 0 0 0 0 0
GRAY 0 5 0 5 $255.00 $63.33 10ct $316.65 $65.45* $260.00 $52.90 $264.50 $53.40 $267.00 5
GREEN 0 0 2 2 $51.00 $102.00 $63.33 10ct $126.66 $65.45* $97.80 $52.90 $105.80 $53.40 $106.80 2
ORCHID 0 0 0 0 ‘ 0
PINK 0 5 2 7 $51.00 $357.00 $63.33 10ct $443.31 $65.45* $342.30 $52.90 $370.30 $53.40 $373.80 7
SALMON 0 2 2 4 $204.00 $63.33 10ct $253.32 NO BID NO BID $52.00 $208.00 $52.90 $211.60 $53.40 $213.60 4
TAN 0 0 0 0 0
COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11
ASTROPARCHE BLUE 0 0 0 0 0
ASTROPARCHE NATURAL 0 0 0 0 0
OPAQUE CREAM 0 0 0 0 0
ASTROPARCHE WHITE 0 0 0 0 0
COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11
BRIGHT GREEN 0 4 0 4 $386.00 95.80 8ct. $383.20 _ |11.39* Ream/2¢[11.39/Ream/25( $107.50 $430.00 $118.00 $472.00 $105.00 $420.00 4
FIREBALL FUSCIA 0 0 0 0 0
COSMIC ORANGE 0 5 0 5 $482.50 95.80 8ct. $479.00  |11.18* Ream/?fhl 39/Ream/25| $107.50 $537.50 $118.00 $590.00 $105.00 $525.00 5
COLORED PAPER 90LB 81/2 X 11
BLUE 0 3 0 3 $66.50 $199.50 83.56 10ct. $250.68 NO BID NO BID $66.90 $161.70 $65.40 $196.20 3
BUFF 0 0 0 0 0
CANARY 0 5 0 5 $66.50 $332.50 93.56 10ct $467.80 NO BID NO BID $66.90 $269.50 $65.40 $327.00 5
CHERRY 0 0 0 0 0
CREAM 0 0 0 0 0
GREEN 0 6 0 6 $66.50 $399.00 83.56 10ct $501.36 NOBID NOBID $323.40 $65.40 $392.40 6
GOLDENROD 0 4 0 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $192.80 NO BID NO BID 4
ORCHID 0 5 0 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $464.50 NO BID NO BID 5|
PINK 0 0 0 0 0
SALMON 0 3 0 3 $66.50 $199.50 $83.56 10ct $250.68 NOBID NOBID $76.90 $161.70 NOBID NOBID 3
WHITE BRITE 0 0 3 3 $58.07 $174.21 $83.56 8ct $250.68 NOBID NOBID $61.00 $183.00 $155.70 $61.00 $183.00 3
39 59 333 431 431




