District 99 Grounds Annual Bid Request - *NOTE - CASE COUNTS Conserv FS FilterBuy Incorporated Pioneer Athletics
SPEC SIZE QTY QTY
SOUTH NORTH District Total Bid Unit Bid Unit

DESCRIPTION COMMENTS (Cases) (Cases Cases Bid Unit Price | _Unit Size Bid Total Price Unit Size Bid Total Price Unit Size Bid Total
Chalk Field Marking Non-caustic dry line | **all deliveries to must include forklift 50 Ib bags
Material marking chalk. Bright | capable of stacking material two (2)

white color pallets high. South will call for product.

We cannot store full order Deliver within
4wks of order. 0 60 $357.00 NO BID NO BID

White Field Marking Paint Brite Stripe white **all deliveries to must include forklift. 5 gal pail

Mfg by Pioneer Mfg
Co. No substitutes

Stack material ONLY two (2) pallets high

& shrink wrap. South will call for product.

We cannot store full order Deliver within
4wks of order.

$52.50 -
TruStripe Paint

5 gallon

$2,625.00

5 gal pail

$3,585.00

100% Rock **all deliveries must include forklift 50 Ib bags
Salt/Sodium Chloride | capable of stacking material two (2)
pallets high. South will call for product.
We cannot store full order Deliver within
4wks of order. 490 735 50# bag $6.063.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calcium Chloride 100% Calcium **all deliveries to must include forklift 50 Ib bags
Chloride capable of stacking material two (2)
pallets high. South will call for product.
We cannot store full order Deliver within
4wks of order. 55 0 50# bag $756.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Commercial Strength Ice Melt 4 way blend of - 50 Ib bags/49 0 294 50# bag $2,631.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calcined Clay PRO's Choice/ Must be in plastic bags only -no paper **all delive] 50 Ib bags 80 80 50# bag $1,912.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calcined Clay PRO's Choice Rapid |Must be in plastic bags only - no paper **all deliv| 50 Ib bags 40 40 50# bag $1,036.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Grass Seed 70% Kentucky capable of stacking material two (2) 50 Ib bags 0 16 50# bag $1,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sports Turf Fertilizer One AP 30-0- Pro AP Products - No| capable of stacking material two (2) 50Ib bags 0 10 50# bag $479.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fertilizer 22-0-5 + Herbicide With post emergent | **all deliveries to must include forklift 50Ib bags
broadleaf control w/ capable of stacking material two (2)
Trimec 30% pcscu & | pallets high. South will call for product.
1% Fe - No We cannot store full order Deliver within
Phosphate 4wks of order. $520.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fertilizer 25-0-5 50% duration, 35% n | _capable of stacking material two (2) 50lb bags $1,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
\
\
\
Packing Clay Pros Choice - Easy 50Ib bags 40# Bag $2,712.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pro's Choice - 100% 304 blocks per
Mound Master Clay Blocks virain clayv hincks pallet 0 2 Pallet $1,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brite Stripe oragne 5 gallon pail
Orange field marking paint hﬂtg b)f limferl\{ltg *No 0 10 10] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $912.50
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