
DESCRIPTION

SPECS/BRAND/NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS 

# FILTERS 

per BOX

DGS case 

count

DGN case 

count Total Cases Bid Unit Price Unit Size Bid Total Bid Unit Price Unit Size Bid Total Bid Unit Price Unit Size Bid Total Bid Unit Price Unit size Bid Total Bid Unit Price Unit Size Bid Total Bid Unit Price Unit Size Bid Total

9 X 33 X 1 MERV 8/ 12 0 0 0         

9 X 41 X 1 MERV 8/ 12 1 0 1 $13.20 each filter $158.40 $9.65 each filter $115.80 $10.05 each filter $120.60 $7.91 each filter $94.92 $12.86 each filter $154.32 $23.95 each filter $287.35

9 X 45 X 1 MERV 8/ 12 1 0 1 $13.84 each filter $166.08 $15.54 each filter $186.48 $10.05 each filter $120.60 $8.17 each filter $98.04 $13.49 each filter $161.88 $24.95 each filter $299.35

9 X 60 X 1 MERV 8/ 12 0 0 0     

16 X 25 X 1 MERV 8/ 12 4 0 4 $3.44 each filter $165.12 $3.29 each filter $157.92 $3.03 each filter $145.44 $6.03 each filter $289.44 $3.12 each filter $149.76 $4.30 each filter $206.28

20 X 25 X 1- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 2 2 4 $3.88 each filter $186.24 $3.79 each filter $181.92 $3.37 each filter $161.76 $6.95 each filter $333.60 $3.53 each filter $169.44 $4.97 each filter $238.72

12 X 30 X 1- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 0 0 0     

14 X 20 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 3 2 5 $4.19 each filter $251.40 $3.95 each filter $237.00 $3.32 each filter $199.20 $6.79 each filter $407.40 $3.80 each filter $228.00 $5.08 each filter $304.85

16 X 20 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 13 19 32 $3.48 each filter $1,336.32 $3.15 each filter $1,209.60 $2.46 each filter $944.64 $6.36 each filter $2,442.24 $3.43 each filter $1,317.12 $3.87 each filter $1,484.16

20 X 20 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 5 26 31 $3.90 each filter $1,450.80 $3.64 each filter $1,354.08 $3.27 each filter $1,216.44 $6.95 each filter $2,585.40 $3.81 each filter $1,417.32 $4.95 each filter $1,839.85

20 X 25 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 20 16 36 $4.42 each filter $1,909.44 $4.17 each filter $1,801.44 $3.75 each filter $1,620.00 $7.56 each filter $3,265.92 $4.31 each filter $1,861.92 $5.69 each filter $2,457.72

16 X 25 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 1 7 8 $3.90 each filter $374.40 $3.58 each filter $343.68 $3.22 each filter $309.12 $6.95 each filter $667.20 $3.81 each filter $365.76 $5.24 each filter $503.36

12 X 24 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 3 6 9 $3.45 each filter $372.60 $3.14 each filter $339.12 $3.02 each filter $326.16 $6.36 each filter $686.88 $3.39 each filter $366.12 $9.46 each filter $1,021.59

24 X 24 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 6 6 12 $4.84 each filter $696.96 $4.65 each filter $669.60 $3.99 each filter $574.56 $8.32 each filter $1,198.08 $4.74 each filter $682.56 $7.50 each filter $1,080.00

20 X 30 X 2- Wirebacked MERV 8/ 12 0 0 0     

20 X 24 X 2 MERV 8/ 12 3 1 4 $4.51 each filter $216.48 $4.28 each filter $205.44 $3.97 each filter $190.56 $7.56 each filter $362.88 $4.41 each filter $211.68 $6.07 each filter $291.24

16 X 20 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 11 38 49 $7.26 each filter $2,134.44 $6.09 each filter $1,790.46 $4.70 each filter $1,381.80 $12.07 each filter $3,548.58 $6.38 each filter $1,875.72 $23.68 each filter $6,960.45

16 X 25 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 13 20 33 $6.36 each filter $1,259.28 $6.55 each filter $1,296.90 $5.23 each filter $1,035.54 $13.11 each filter $2,595.78 $6.80 each filter $1,346.40 $29.35 each filter $5,811.63

20 X 20 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 5 36 41 $6.92 each filter $1,702.32 $6.51 each filter $1,601.46 $5.21 each filter $1,281.66 $13.11 each filter $3,225.06 $6.62 each filter $1,628.52 $29.35 each filter $7,220.51

20 X 25 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 30 19 49 $7.84 each filter $2,304.96 $7.48 each filter $2,199.12 $5.77 each filter $1,696.38 $15.23 each filter $4,477.62 $7.52 each filter $2,210.89 $32.65 each filter $9,598.61

24 X 24 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 8 0 8 $9.01 each filter $432.48 $8.55 each filter $410.40 $6.18 each filter $296.64 $15.53 each filter $745.44 $7.93 each filter $380.64 $32.97 each filter $1,582.72

12 X 24 X 4 MERV 8/ 6 8 0 8 $6.75 each filter $324.00 $5.67 each filter $272.16 $4.65 each filter $223.20 $11.18 each filter $536.64 $5.93 each filter $284.64 $23.89 each filter $1,146.80

30 X 40 Ring link Panel 3 ply 0 0 0       

20x80  Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 8 0 8 $23.45 each filter $187.60 $22.31 each filter $178.48 $18.50 each filter $148.00 $25.83 each filter $206.64 $20.24 each filter $242.88 No Bid each filter No Bid

25 x 80 Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 6 0 6 $26.98 each filter $161.88 $22.48 each filter $134.88 $21.90 each filter $131.40 $28.40 each filter $170.40 $26.02 each filter $156.12 No Bid each filter No Bid

25 x 60 Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 9 0 9 $20.20 each filter $181.80 $16.86 each filter $151.74 $16.42 each filter $147.78 $24.29 each filter $218.61 $20.78 each filter $332.48 No Bid each filter No Bid

24 x 90  Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply  0 0 0       

30 X 50 Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 6 0 6 $40.68 each filter $244.08 $69.55 each filter $417.30 $19.62 each filter $117.72 $24.08 each filter $144.48 $40.70 each filter $244.20 No Bid each filter No Bid

20x25  Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 0 7 7 $6.70 each filter $46.90 $5.88 each filter $41.16 $5.12 each filter $35.84 $9.03 each filter $63.21 $7.38 each filter $177.12 No Bid each filter No Bid

20x20  Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 0 4 4 $5.85 each filter $23.40 $5.58 each filter $22.32 $4.62 each filter $18.48 $8.45 each filter $33.80 $6.44 each filter $154.56 No Bid each filter No Bid

48x30 Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 0 1 1 $40.68 each filter $40.68 $35.67 each filter $35.67 $19.28 each filter $19.28 $15.91 each filter $15.91 $41.85 each filter $41.85 No Bid each filter No Bid

24 X 96   Unit count Ring link panel 3 ply 1 3 0 3 $29.08 each filter $87.24 $28.78 each filter $86.34 $21.96 each filter $65.88 $29.97 each filter $89.91 $29.92 each filter $179.52 No Bid each filter No Bid

14 x 20 x 2 PRE FILTER FIBER 12 0 0 0  

13 1/2X 17 X 1 FIBERGLASS 30 0 0 0  

9 x 36 x 2 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 0 0 0 0  

9 x 60 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 2 2 $13.84 each filter $332.16 $17.17 each filter $412.08 $10.05 each filter $241.20 $14.06 each filter $337.44 $15.36 each filter $368.64 $24.95 each filter $598.70

9.25 x 21.75 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

9.25 x 36 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

9.75 x 48.25 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

9.75 x 48.25 x 2 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 1 1 $14.56 each filter $174.72 $18.35 each filter $220.20 $11.26 each filter $135.12 $14.21 each filter $170.52 $12.94 each filter $155.28 $26.00 each filter $312.00

9.75 x 60 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0     

10 x 48 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 2 2 $12.98 each filter $311.52 $15.54 each filter $372.96 $9.75 each filter $234.00 $8.52 each filter $204.48 $14.45 each filter $346.80 $24.95 each filter $598.70

10 x 60 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 7 7 $14.56 each filter $1,223.04 $19.31 each filter $1,622.04 $10.23 each filter $859.32 $10.48 each filter $880.32 $16.22 each filter $1,362.48 $25.61 each filter $2,151.10

10 x 72 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 3 3 $14.56 each filter $524.16 $19.31 each filter $695.16 $12.14 each filter $437.04 $15.61 each filter $561.96 $16.22 each filter $583.92 $31.73 each filter $1,142.28

10.25 x 26 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0      

13.5 x 17 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 4 4 $5.85 each filter $280.80 $7.77 each filter $372.96 $4.97 each filter $238.56 $6.74 each filter $323.52 $6.12 each filter $293.76 $12.57 each filter $603.24

13 x 54 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 1 1 $14.56 each filter $174.72 $19.31 each filter $231.72 $11.09 each filter $133.08 $13.55 each filter $162.60 $16.22 each filter $194.64 $25.61 each filter $307.30

13 x 66 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 3 3 $17.10 each filter $615.60 $21.49 each filter $773.64 $13.38 each filter $481.68 $15.04 each filter $541.44 $19.04 each filter $685.44 $33.73 each filter $1,214.28

13 x 77 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 2 2 $17.89 each filter $429.36 $23.07 each filter $553.68 $41.23 each filter $989.52 $16.42 each filter $394.08 $19.92 each filter $478.08 $37.38 each filter $897.08

15.25 x 53.5 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 1 1 $17.10 each filter $205.20 $21.49 each filter $257.88 $11.40 each filter $136.80 $13.73 each filter $164.76 $19.04 each filter $228.48 $26.31 each filter $315.73

15.25 x 77.5 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

16 x 20 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

20 x 20 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 0 0  

16 x 25 PAD 20 0 7 7 $1.25 each filter $175.00 $2.85 each filter $399.00 $3.22 each filter $450.80 $8.25 each filter $1,155.00 No Bid each filter No Bid No Bid each filter No Bid

20 x 20 PAD 20 0 2 2 $1.25 each filter $50.00 $2.85 each filter $114.00 $3.27 each filter $130.80 $8.25 each filter $330.00 No Bid each filter No Bid No Bid each filter No Bid

20 x 25 PAD 20 0 8 8 $1.25 each filter $200.00 $3.16 each filter $505.60 $3.75 each filter $600.00 $8.83 each filter $1,412.80 No Bid each filter No Bid No Bid each filter No Bid

30 x 48 PAD 20 0 0 0      

12 X 20 X 2 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 1 0 1 $4.42 each filter $53.04 $3.25 each filter $39.00 $3.02 each filter $36.24 $6.79 each filter $81.48 $4.15 each filter $49.80 $4.58 each filter $54.97

12 X 24 X 2 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 3 0 3 $3.45 each filter $124.20 $3.14 each filter $113.04 $3.02 each filter $108.72 $6.36 each filter $228.96 $3.39 each filter $122.04 $5.38 each filter $193.62

15 X 20 X 2 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 4 0 4 $3.95 each filter $189.60 $3.34 each filter $160.32 $3.34 each filter $160.32 $6.79 each filter $325.92 $3.71 each filter $178.08 $5.20 each filter $249.72

18 x 24 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 1 0 1 $4.70 each filter $56.40 $4.07 each filter $48.84 $3.49 each filter $41.88 $7.40 each filter $88.80 $4.28 each filter $51.36 $5.14 each filter $61.62

20 X 24 X 4 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 6 7 0 7 $6.32 each filter $265.44 $7.51 each filter $315.42 $5.87 each filter $246.54 $15.23 each filter $639.66 $7.66 each filter $321.72 $30.81 each filter $1,294.02

12 X 24 X 12 By unit count MERV 8 Pleated Filter 1 16 0 16 $54.66 each filter $874.56 $72.14 each filter $1,154.24 $55.54 each filter $888.64 $59.92 each filter $958.72 $51.61 each filter $825.76 No Bid each filter No Bid

24 X 24 X 12 By unit count MERV 8 Pleated Filter 1 12 0 12 $71.70 each filter $860.40 $89.23 each filter $1,070.76 $63.50 each filter $762.00 $132.73 each filter $1,592.76 $69.81 each filter $837.72 No Bid each filter No Bid

16 x 24 x 1 MERV 8 Pleated Filter 12 0 1 1 $4.92 each filter $59.04 $4.27 each filter $51.24 $3.37 each filter $40.44 $6.03 each filter $72.36 $4.49 each filter $53.88 $5.12 each filter $61.46
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