Hancock County Schools - Bus Maintenance Bid Tabulation 2024-2025

Vehicle
Item Maintenance Brake &
No. Item Program Best One Tires O'Reilly American Bus Busler SynEnergy Boyd Truck Wheel Key Oil Valor Oil
I. Filters
A. Oil Filters (Hastings/Fleetguard/Baldwin/Donaldson/Racor)
BD7250 HV-Maxx Force Int
1 Immediate Delivery 371 45.71 41.81 31.67 36.28
Order as Needed through the Year 40.58
Car Quest 85791
2 Immediate Delivery 9.18 11.69 10.89 7.84 9.22
Order as Needed through the Year 10.04
Car Quest 84182
4 Immediate Delivery 9.62 12.35 11.65 8.35 9.71
Order as Needed through the Year 10.52
B. Fuel Filters (Hastings/Fleetg in/Donaldson/Racor)
FF63009 CUMMINS
5 Immediate Delivery 33.15 39.23 32.87 25.47 29.75
Order as Needed through the Year 36.25
DDE R61709 CUMMINS FF
6 Immediate Delivery 33.12 26.99 33.95 27.57 31.56
Order as Needed through the Year 36.21
A0000904851
7 Immediate Delivery 70.38 81.71 78.84 60.36 68.41
Order as Needed through the Year 76.96
BF7362 CAT |
8 Immediate Delivery no bid 13.75 26.29 14.48
Order as Needed through the Year no bid
Crank Case Filter CV52001
9 Immediate Delivery 93.39 67.25 138.71 84.99 51.52
Order as Needed through the Year 102.12
86813 Cat C7/Car Quest
10 Immediate Delivery 32.42 34.67 31.16 25.86 27.04
Order as Needed through the Year 35.45
86966- Car Quest
" Immediate Delivery 15.37 19.85 18.15 76.91 15.12
Order as Needed through the Year 16.80
86813-0 Car Quest
12 Immediate Delivery 23.51 34.67 31.16 21.72 31.06
Order as Needed through the Year 25.70
B46169-0 Baldwin [
13 Immediate Delivery no bid 35.60 100.52 76.91 87.22
Order as Needed through the Year no bid
[FS1098 Baldwin | | [
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14 Immediate Delivery| 5147 | [ 57.85 [ 4800 41,65
Order as Needed through the Year| 5628 | | |
C. Air Filters (Hastings/Fleetguard/Baldwin/Donaldson)
AF2376-CAT
15 Immediate Delivery 58.12 69.17 60.38 4517 53.14
Order as Needed through the Year 63.55
RS3517-CAT
16 Immediate Delivery 36.18 44.03 39.92 30.80 34.64
Order as Needed through the Year 39.56
87809 Thomas C2
17 Immediate Delivery 58.12 69.17 58.70 45.47 53.14
Order as Needed through the Year 63.55
93786 Int/Cummins/Car Quest
18 Immediate Delivery 137.32 126.41 113.68 98.64
Order as Needed through the Year 150.16
P623400 Donaldson
19 Immediate Delivery 137.32 126.41 85.83 142.74
Order as Needed through the Year 150.16
83519 Car Quest
20 Immediate Delivery 48.88 61.01 49.93 40.10 44.30
Order as Needed through the Year 53.45
P634594 Donaldson
21 Immediate Delivery 48.88 61.01 49.93 40.10
Order as Needed through the Year 53.45
D. Transmission Filters (Hastings/Fleetguard]| in/Donaldson)
94282 Car Quest
22 Immediate Delivery 16.25 19.19 17.95 14.79 14.95
Order as Needed through the Year 17.77
P560971 (Donaldson)
23 Immediate Delivery 70.77 85.79 80.39 63.06 67.86
Order as Needed through the year 77.38
E. Water Pumps
Cummins 2881688
24 Immediate Delivery 71.73 57.74 NLA Bad Number 120.96
Order as Needed through the year 86.78
CAT 20R0586
25 Immediate Delivery 162.34 277.32 115.96
Order as Needed through the Year
Il. Brake Parts-2 shoes and hardware kit
A. Brake linings (New or OEM) ( Asbestos Free)
4702D
26 Immediate Delivery 70.52 57.45 66.09
Order as Needed through the Year
4707D
27 Immediate Delivery 70.71 56.09 64.75
Order as Needed through the Year
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4703 EXL TQC
28 Immediate Delivery 70.53 86.96
Order as Needed through the Year
ABS Sensor 801538
29 Immediate Delivery 39.99 32.20
Order as Needed through the Year 44.44
ABS Sensor $441-032-108-0
30 Immediate Delivery 57.79 3742
Order as Needed through the Year 64.20
B. Drums(Meritor or OEM E )
3600AX
31 Immediate Delivery 340.92 165.00 115.47
Order as Needed through the Year
3800X
32 Immediate Delivery 371.01 150.00 147.13
Order as Needed through the Year
3774X
33 Immediate Delivery 371.01 240.00 21547
Order as Needed through the Year
568648
34 Immediate Delivery 189.85 165.00 115.47
Order as Needed through the Year
61225X
35 Immediate Delivery NLA Bad Number 169.02
Order as Needed through the Year
lll. Clamps
A. Muffler Clamps (Heavy Duty)
7
36 Immediate Delivery 7.60 15.00
Order as Needed through the Year
4" Band Clamp
37 Immediate Delivery 13.29 15.00
Order as Needed through the Year
IV. Windshield Wipers
A. Windshield Wipers
[38 J20 3.1913.77 2.99 for 10+ or 4.50 3.01 295 5.92
24" 3.19/3.77 2.99 for 10+or 6.36 3128] 3.64 7.49
26" 3.77/4.15 2.99 for 10+ or 7.00 529 17.75
28" 3.77/4.15 2.99 for 10+ or 7.77 5.29 17.75 7.80
V. Lights, Bulbs & Lenses (Wagner/Sylvania)
A, Headligt
H6054
39 Immediate Delivery 9.86 4+7.99 or 9.17 13.69 ea 12.58
Order as Needed through the Year
[9005Xs
40 | Immediate Delivery 438 8.39 6.58 ea 5.50
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Order as Needed through the Year

9006XS
4 Immediate Delivery 443 8.39 6.58 ea 5.75
Order as Needed though the Year
9007
42 Immediate Delivery 3.59 6+3.99 or 6.86 377 ea 7.33
Order as Needed though the Year
B. Bulbs (Wagner/Syl
194
43 Immediate Delivery .37 3+2.15 bx 0r3.79 bx 3.40/10 pk 0.26
Order as Needed through the Year
1156
44 Immediate Delivery 43 3+4.07bx 0r6.41 bx 5.10/10 pk 0.50
Order as Needed through the Year
1157
45 Immediate Delivery 42 3+ 2.41bx or 3.73 bx| 4.10/10 pk 0.55
Order as Needed through the Year
3157
46 Immediate Delivery .56 3+ 5.61bx or 10.05 bx 9.70/10 pk 0.90
Order as Needed through the Year
H3
47 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 3.37 4.10 2.50 3.93ea 4.25
Order as Needed Through the Year
C. Strobe Lights
Ecco - 655C
48 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 137.77 32.29 79.17 125.00
Order as Needed Through the Year
VI. Tires and Tubes - Must be one price per item
A. New Tires - Price General or Michelin
22.5 X 8.25 tubeless tire rim White 95 +10
49 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase Black 132 +10 150.00
Order as Needed Through the Year W 105/B 140
295-75R22.5
50 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase
Order as Needed Through the Year
275-80R 22.5
51 Immediate Delivery 503.70
Order as Needed through the Year 503.70
VII. Oils, Fluids and Conditioners Delivery truck must have lift gate
A. Qil
Bulk QOil 15W 40 Oil must meet Cummins & CAT Specs Vendor supply container
52 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 19.99 gal 9.25 gal 9.37 29.00 10.78 10.00/150 gal min
Order as Needed Through the Year
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Bulk DEF
53 Immediate Delivery 9.99 gal 1.70 1.69 8.00 2.00gal 1.90/150 gal min
Order as Needed through the Year
B. Ti ission Fluid
SPIRAX S6
54 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 19.43 26.43 1650.00/31.00 17.58/966.90 [ 1539.91/55 gl drum
Order as Needed Through the Year
C. Anti Freeze
Extended Life, Pre-Diluted, 55 gallon drums
55 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 9.99 gal 266.94 287.65 625.00/12.50 355.92 7.80/429.00  [484.22/drum
Order as Needed Through the Year
NITRIDE FREE OAT 50/50 55 gallon drums
56 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6+ 11.59 gal 376.20 435.60 625.00/12.50 8.63/474.65 [487.20/drum
Order as Needed Through the Year
D. Diesel Fuel Conditioner
Diesel Fuel Winter Treat (Howes or Power Services) 55 gallon drum
57 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6+10.49 qt or 11.99 1508.76 2200.00/drum
Order as Needed Through the Year
E. Grease
Multi-Purpose Grease case-tubes
58 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6+6.89 ea Or 7.99 34.07/10 14 oz 39.65 69.00/6.00 37.37 37.20/10 140z
Order as Needed Through the Year
VIIl. MUSCELLANEOUS
A. Windshield Washer Solvent (Freeze Proof to -20 degrees F)
55 gallon drum
59 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6+ 3.29 gal or 4.26g| 107.36 118.80 305.00/6.00 139.54 2.05/112.75 |110.00 drum
Order as Needed Through the Year
B. Windshield Ice R (Dupont No. 7 Winshield De-lcer)
(12) 12.3 ounce cans per case
60 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 399 10 0zcen 37.73
Order as Needed Through the Year
Brakleen
61 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 12+3.49 or 3.77 31.98
Order as Needed Through the Year
C. Mirrors
| 6 [ Crossview Fender RPS2365 53.47 41.48 48.76
| g3 | Drivers - Rearview (outside)
Thomas 279.17
Thomas 264.83
D. Batteries (31-950T)
(Alliance/Fleetpride)
64 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 136.45 3150.00/87.99
Order as Needed Through the Year

XI. Engines, Transmissions, Alternators and Starters
A. Rebuilt Tr issions and Installati
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AT545
65 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 2950.00
Order as Needed Through the Year
MT643
66 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 4500.00
Order as Needed Through the Year
Allison MD 3060P
67 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6200.00
Order as Needed Through the Year
B. Alternators - Rebuilt
[[68 [ Leece-Neville 160 AMPS 200.00
| Leece-Neville 200 AMPS 250.00
['69_]Turbo Charger
New 6.7 Cummins 35500.00
Rebuilt 6.7 Cummins 31500.00
X. Clean Up
Absorbent Mat PIG
70 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 26.99 120.11 72.29/per 100
Order as Needed Through the Year
Window Cleaner
7 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 6+5.99 or 6.99 38.04
Order as Needed Through the Year
Shop Towels
Wipe All
72 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 14.39 16.38 15.75/bx 200
Order as Needed Through the Year
Blue Rolls
73 Immediate Delivery-Bulk Purchase 30+ rolls 3.99 /5.49 2.81 107.40 cs 30 rolls
Order as Needed Through the Year [ [
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