PRODUCT

Floor Finish
Johnson Complete or
Equivalent

25% OR HIGHER SOLIDS

All Purpose Cleaner - Spitfire
All Purpose Cleaner - Fastball

Floor Finish Stripper for Extreme Buildup
Non-Ammonias

* should easily lift dirt, soap

wax for easy pick-up

Carpet Extraction
Cleaner

Dust Mop Treatment

Toilet Bowl Cleaner, RTU no more than
11% HCL, pleasant scent,
EPAregistered. To clean lime, soap
scum, hard water, uric acid, etc

Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner
** Concentrated daily
maintenance cleaner and
deodorizer for toilet bowls,
urinals, bathtubs, sinks,
shower stalls, and other
hard non-porous surfaces.

Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate
Neutral germicidal cleaner

and deodorizer that provides
both cleaning and disinfection.
Effective against HIV-1, HBV,
and HCV, CA-MRSA and kills
Pandemic 2009 HIN1 Influenza
Avirus (formally called swine flu)
Will not dull or damage floor
finishes. For use on hard non-
porous surfaces such as floors,
walls, metal surfaces, tables,
chairs, countertops, porcelain
and sinks.

Hydrogen Peroxide
Cleaner/Degreaser
*Concentrated formulated with
natural citrus oils and hydrogen
peroxide. Should quickly
penetrate, then oxidizes and
effectively removes a wide range
of soils from carpets and hard
surfaces.

Glass & Multi-Surface Cleaner
**Concentrated with a blend of
ingredients that dissolves greasy
film, fingerprints and smears
leaving glass and other hard
surfaces smudge-and streak free.
Versatile product to effectively
clean mirrors, glass, Plexigals,
acrylic, stainless steel, chrome
countertops, tabletops and other
hard surfaces.

Floor Cleaner (Neutral Ph)
** Concentrated Cleaner

that removes soil without the
use of harsh chemicals.
Formulated for use on all types
of finished floors, painted walls,
Formica, vinyl, plastic and metal
surfaces. This extremely
versatile product can be used

in autoscrubbers, mop buckets
and spray bottles.

MEDIUM - Wet Mop Heads (cotton/syn blend)

Blended, Colored Loop End
Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

BID ONLY STANDARD BRAND, FIRST QUALITY MATERIALS

Kenway Distributors Quill

Bid cost/end use cost

79.60/5 gal pail no bid
74.99 69.94 - 349.70
discontinued no bid
45.11 no bid
62.90/cs 4 gal no bid
no bid 2538 - 15228
no bid no bid

30.63/cs 12qt 26.40 - 132.00
57.47/cs 23L no bid
75.49/cs 4 gl no bid
43.27/cs 12 190z no bid
37.28/cs 4 gal 40.59 - 811.80
43.38/cs 12 828

Bid costlend use cost

Unifirst Cintas

Bid cost/end use cost  Bid costlend use cost

no bid no bid
43.80/2units no bid
21.00/ 1 unit no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
59.70/2 units no bid
65.10/ 2 units. 1.00
no bid no bid
49.80/ 2 units. 2.00 per unit
43.80/ 2 units 80 per unit
84.10/10 units 1.20

Central Poly Bag Corp.

Bid cost/end use cost

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Baumnann Paper Co.

Bid cost/end use cost Bid costlend use costid cost/end use cos Bid cost/end use cost

79.99 - 16.00 gal

33.99-2.83qt

34.99-2.92qt

53.00 - 10.80gal

32.99-8.25 gal

32.99-8.25 gal

no bid

26.99 - 2.25qt

34.99-8.75 gal

59.99 - 15.00 gal

34.99 - 2.92 can

28.99-7.25 gal

5.99/10 ea

Hillyard

102.33/p!

61.35/cs 5.11 gt

61.35/cs 5.11 gt

56.45/pl

83.65/20.91 gal

132.52/33.13 gal

31.14 cs/ 2.59qt

88.37cs/.51 dil. gal

82.52 cs/.48 dil. gal

122.03cs/1.06 dil. gal

4064 cs/3.39 ea

157.78 cs/.23 dil. gal

358 ea

Barrett Fisher Co.

108.11

81.09

81.24

37.86

40.16

27.27

64.51

81.25

48.0012

44.16

53.66



LARGE - Wet Mop Heads (cotion/syn blend)
Blended, Colored Loop End

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

MEDIUM - Wet Mop Heads

Micro Fiber

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

LARGE - Wet Mop Heads

Micro Fiber

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

Floor Machine Pads for Polishing
(White Pads)

Floor Machine Pads for Polishing (Burnish) 20"
(Beige Pads)

Floor Machine Pads for Stripping (Black) 20"
Liquid Carpet Spotter

Plastic Bags
250 per case
30 gallon size
30"x 36"

Plastic Bags
100 per case
55 gallon size
38" x 58"
Plastic Bags

1000 per case or supplied
12 gallon size

Soap Pads
Ex: Brillo

Pistol Grip Spray and Bottle
Complete

Bleach
Dust Mop Heads

only

Dust Mop Frames and
Handles

Lotion Hand Soap (Bulk)

Sealer
Johnson's Technique or
Equivalent

Liquid Concentrate Spray
Deodorant

Disinfectant Spray

Floor Finish Spray Buff to be used
with high speed buffer

Urinal Screens

Premium All Purpose Wipes
Medium Duty Industrial

Wypalls L40 Jumbo Rolls

Carpet Shampoo Extractor Concentrate

BID ONLY STANDARD BRAND, FIRST QUALITY MATERIALS

Kenway Distributors Quill Unifirst

Bid costlend use cost  Bid costlend use cost  Bid cost/end use cost

63.35cs 12 13.04 95.40/10 units
117.78/cs 12 7.30 71.60/ 10 units
139.38/cs 12 no bid 84.80/ 10 units
15" 13.29 15" __no bid 15" nobid__
17"_1557 17" _no bid, 17" __no bid
20" 2019 20"__30.79 20" ___nobid,
20" 2019 20"_37.18 20" _no bid,
20" 20"_36.26. 20" __nobid
513 /615605 12qt no bid no bid
22.08/cs 200 no bid 12.96/ 301 cases
26.4/cs 100 4354 9,558 /300 cases
17.86/cs 1000 41.49 354.72/12 cases
no bid no bid no bid
1.90 389 75.00/ 50 units
4.60gall27.60 cs 6 gal no bid no bid
18" __6.78 18" _4.07 18" 85.40/ 10 units
24" 801 24" 3.90 24" 94.50/ 10 units
36"__10.98 5.46, 36" 119.70/ 10 units
48" 1463 _6.97. 48" 143.70/ 10 units

18" _3.81 18" 60.90/ 10 units
24" _541 24" 72.20/ 10 units.
36" __6.06, 36" 93.20 /10 units.
48" _10.02, 48" 106.40/ 10 units
39.26 no bid 1050.00/120 units
89.8/cs 22,5 gal no bid no bid
70.68/cs 12 qt no bid no bid
49.66/cs 12 19 0z no bid 32.55/ 1 unit
no bid no bid no bid
14.88 11.94 - 238.80 2256.00/ 20 cases.
99.79 no bid 3771.12/ 57 cases.

os 18 56¢t boxes 73.67 91.11-1093.32 303.48/ 12 rolls

66.77 cs 4 gal no bid no bid

Cintas

Bid cost/end use cost

1.20

15"0 bid
17"n0 bid
20"no bid
20"no bid

20"no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

18" no bid
24"1.00
36" 1.10
48" 115

18" no bid
24" free
36" free
48" free

no bid

no bid

1.00 per unit

no bid

1.00

5.00 per box

30.00 per roll

no bid

Central Poly Bag Corp.

Bid cost/end use cost

no bid

no bid

no bid

15" no bid
17" no bid
20" no bid
20" no bid

20"no bid

no bid

34.00

38.00

34.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

18" no bid
24" no bid
36" no bid
48" no bid

18" no bid
24" no bid
36" no bid
48" no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Baumnann Paper Co.

Bid cost/end use cost Bid costlend use costid cost/end use cos Bid cost/end use cost

6.99/10 ea

12.99/ 10 ea

13.99

15"11.99/5
17"13.99/5
20"17.99/5
20"20.95/5

20" 18.99/5

28.95/cs 1 qt

24.99

18.99

33.99

52.95

7.99/3

23.50/ 6 1gal case

18" 499 ea
24599 ea
36"8.99 ea
48"9.99 ea

18" 3.99 ea
24"4.99 ea
36"5.99 ea
48"8.99 ea

23.99/4 1gal

79.99 /5 gal

27.99/12-1gt

45.99/12-2007 cans

34.99/ 4gal cs

119.99/2.00 screen

Hillyard

5.39 ea

7.95 ea

851ea

15" 14.59
17"17.00
20"22.12
20" 2053

2020.12

76.35 cs 12 qt

38.09 s

47.75¢cs

28.96 os 250 bags cs

52.62 cs of 180

198ea

25.73 cs/ 6.43 gal

18" 5.41ea
24"7.13ea
36"10.13 ea
48" 12.35 ea

18" 2.98ea
24" 3.36ea
36"4.09 ea
48"5.49 ea

39.35 1 galdcs

113.36 pl

90.60cs/ 7.55qt

54.300s/4.52 ea

89.65 cs / 22.41 gal

20.57cs /2.06 ea

75.99 110b0x-10 box cs | 26.13cs / 100bx,4cs

69.99 roll

82.99/4-1gal

71.56 cs/ 4ply.4cs.

19.68 gal

Barrett Fisher Co.

71.01

207.60

207.60/12

15" 14.53
17" 18.81
20" 24.80
20" 24.93

20" 24.93

35.97

17.07

23.71

34.37

no bid

no bid

30.15/6

18" 5.09
247675
36" 11.89
48" 16.90

18" 3.25
24348
36"4.05
48"7.97

26.35

no bid

58.56

46.45

5.07/pk of 2

no bid

59.57

55.46



Tile Floor Machine Cleaner

Disinfecting Wipes

Dry Erase Board Cleaner (whiteboard)

XTRALARGE - Vinyl Disposable Gloves
LARGE - Vinyl Disposable Gloves
MEDUIM - Vinyl Disposable Gloves

Eraser Sponge

Stainless Steel Cleaner and Polish

Floor Cleaner/Polish
(remove soil and leave shine on floor)

Cleaner/Degreaser
- all natural ingredients.
- no bleach, ammonia, phospahtes, acids

Laundry Detergent
Furniture Polish

Hand Soap widispenser
1200 - 2000 ml cartridge
Hand Sanitizer widispenser
1200- 2000 ml cartridge
Roll Paper Towels

Bathroom Tissue (2 ply perforated)

YELLOW FOR THE LOWEST BID

BID ONLY STANDARD BRAND, FIRST QUALITY MATERIALS

Kenway Distributors

Bid cost/end use cost

63.00/cs 4 gal

36.84/cs 6 75ct

49.17/cs 1219 0z

27.86/cs 10 100ct bx
27.86/cs 10 100 ct bx
27.86/cs 10 100 ct bx

18.40

59.46/cs 12 160z cans

101.89/cs 4 gal

56.03/cs 2 3L bottles

85.98/cs 4 gal

58.53/cs 12 180z cans

48.10/cs 6 1000m!

65.16/cs 6 1000

52.75/cs 6 1l 8'x1000"

49.24/cs 121l 2ply

Quill

Bid costlend use cost

no bid

no bid

28.33-113.32

28.34-113.36

28.37-26.48

26.48 - 105.92

64.09 - 256.36

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

30.80 - 9240.00

51.39 - 15417.00

Unifirst

Bid cost/end use cost

43.80/ 2 units.

958.80/ 10 cases

no bid

130.40/4 cases

195.60/6 cases

130.40/4 cases

no bid

21.90/ 1 unit

21.90/ 1 unit

21.00/ 1 unit

no bid

no bid

14000.00/ 200 cases

18032.00/ 200 cases

18504.00/ 300 cases

22218.00/ 300 cases

Cintas

Bid costlend use cost

no bid

28.00 per

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

1.00 per unit

no bid

no bid

2,00 per unit

2.00 per unit

7.00 per roll 8001t

4.00 per roll/1000ft

Central Poly Bag Corp.

Bid cost/end use cost

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Baumnann Paper Co. Hillyard

Bid cost/end use cost Bid costlend use costid cost/end use cos Bid cost/end use cost

29.99/ 5 gal 29.00 cs / 7.25gal
49.99/6 cans case | 59.36cs /9.89 ot
78.99/12 percase  40.80 cs/ 340 ea
2.99 2.03
2.99 203
2.99 2,03
36.99 /36 cs 26.89cs/1.12ea

36.99/12 1qt 58.02cs / 4.84ea
63.99/4 gal 29.00/7.25 gal
39.99/4 gal 138.72cs/ 34.68 gal

no bid 27.45 gal
41.99/12-200zcans  48.90cs / 4.08ea

31.99/4cs 44.84cs [ 11.21ea

39.99/4cs 61.27ea/ 15.32ea

31.75/ 6 rolls per case |48.33cs 800 ft roll 6es.

29.99/8rolls case  44.48cs 36 per case

Barrett Fisher Co.

4384 /12qt cs

4458

no bid

20.25
2025
20.25

44.26/36

48.96

56.53

64.98

no bid

4024

4821

49.81

37.50



BID ONLY STANDARD BRAND, FIRST QUALITY MATERIALS

Kenway Distributors Quill Unifirst Cintas Central Poly Bag Corp.  Baumnann Paper Co. Hillyard Barrett Fisher Co.

Bid costlend use cost  Bid costlend use cost  Bid cost/end use cost  Bid costlend use cost

costlend use cost  Bid costlend use cost Bid costlend use costid cost/end use cos Bid costlend use cost



