
Item Sizzle™ Ice Melter #50

Peladow™ Premier Snow 

and Ice Melter #50 Total Treated Rock Salt Untreated Rock Salt Total Total Bid

Vendor Quantity 1,250 Bags 1,250 Bags Bagged Salt 250 Tons 150 Tons Rock Salt Bid Award

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 6.14$                                            13.99$                                   109.99$                  90.99$                         

Total Cost 7,675.00$                                     17,487.50$                           25,162.50$  27,497.50$            13,648.50$                 41,146.00$    66,308.50$    

Brand No Bid No Bid N/A N/A

Unit Price 106.40$                  86.40$                         

Total Cost -$                                              -$                                       26,600.00$            12,960.00$                 39,560.00$    39,560.00$    

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.45$                                            12.90$                                   109.00$                  91.00$                         

Total Cost 9,312.50$                                     16,125.00$                           25,437.50$  27,250.00$            13,650.00$                 40,900.00$    66,337.50$    

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 9.45$                                            14.25$                                   107.00$                  95.11$                         

Total Cost 11,812.50$                                   17,812.50$                           29,625.00$  26,750.00$            14,266.50$                 41,016.50$    70,641.50$    

Brand No Bid No Bid N/A N/A

Unit Price 96.21$                    81.21$                         

Total Cost -$                                              -$                                       -$              24,052.50$            12,181.50$                 36,234.00$    36,234.00$    36,234.00$  

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.51$                                            15.59$                                   115.64$                  94.25$                         

Total Cost 9,387.50$                                     19,487.50$                           28,875.00$  28,910.00$            14,137.50$                 43,047.50$    71,922.50$    

Brand Sizzle Peladow N/A N/A

Unit Price 7.00$                                            12.69$                                   118.25$                  98.25$                         

Total Cost 8,750.00$                                     15,862.50$                           24,612.50$  29,562.50$            14,737.50$                 44,300.00$    68,912.50$    24,612.50$  

Brand Sizzle Peladow No Bid No Bid

Unit Price 9.67$                                            13.25$                                   

Total Cost 12,087.50$                                   16,562.50$                           28,650.00$  -$                        -$                             -$                28,650.00$    

60,846.50$  

BID #24-001

Treated/Untreated Rock Salt & Bagged Salt

Bid Tabulation

BID TOTAL

Rock SaltBagged Salt

Morton Salt, Inc.

(Chicago, IL)

Arlington Power Equipment

(Palatine, IL)

Ninja De-Icer, LLC

(Green Bay, WI)

Compass Minerals

(Overland Park, KS)

Conserv FS 

(Wauconda, IL)

Warehouse Direct

(DesPlaines, IL)

Midwest Salt, LLC

(West Chicago, IL)

Russo Power Equipment

(Schiller Park, IL)


