BID TABULATION

BID #24-022 CAFETERIA PACKAGING

BID AWARD

Vendor Category 1 Category 2 Category 3 Category 4 Total Award
Big Red Distribution, LLC $ 10,562.25 | $ 10,562.25
(Chicago, IL)
Daxwell $ 22,072.00 | $ 22,072.00
(Houston, TX)
Durable Packaging 35,970.72 $ 35,970.72
(Wheeling, IL)
Form Plastics $ 33,436.25 | $ 33,436.25
(St. Charles, IL)
GFS $ -
(Wyoming, MI)
|GQ ] $ 86,625.00 $ 86,625.00
(Union City, CA)
New Wave Converting $ -
(Fontana, CA)
North American $ 7,755.00 | $ 7,755.00
(Glenview, IL)
Pathway Solutions Inc. $
(Dublin, OH) ]
Plastic Connections 6,286.10 $ 6,286.10
(Santa Fe Springs, CA)
Platinum Packaging Group $ -
(Paramount, CA)
Wallace Packaging, LLC $ -
(Tuscon, AZ)

TOTAL 2024-2025 AWARDS | $202,707.32




CATEGORY 1 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

Aluminum Foil

Aluminum Foil

Casserole Trays Hamburger Trays Total
Quantity (cs) 160 104
Brand/Product # HFA Subbing
Big Red Distribution, LLC * 2059-30-1000 Black Plastic $ 35.884.96
(Chicago, IL) Per Unit Cost $ 1291 | $ 171.34 T
Extended Cost $ 18,065.60 | $ 17,819.36
D " Brand/Product #
axwe . . . .
(Houston, TX) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Durable Packaging | Durable Packaging
Durable Packaging Brand/Product # #205-30-1000 #225-30-1000 $ 35.970.72
(Wheeling, IL) Per Unit Cost $ 135.65 | $ 137.18 o
Extended Cost $ 21,704.00 | $ 14,266.72
Form Plastics Brand/Product #
(St. Charles, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
GFS Brand/Product #
(Wyoming, MI) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
IGC Brand/Product #
(Union City, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
New W c i Brand/Product #
ew Wave Converting . . . .
(Fontana, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
North A . Brand/Product #
o merican . . . .
(Glenview, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Pathway Solutions Inc Brand/Product #
(Dublin, OH) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plastic Connections Brand/Product #
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Brand/Product #
Platinum Packaging Group . . . .
(Paramount, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Wall Packagi LLC Brand/Product #
3 ace] ackaging, Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid

(Tuscon, AZ)

Extended Cost

* Big Red: Alternate item
specified does not meet
specifications.



CATEGORY 2 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

. Carry Tray Total
Quantity (cs) 2,500
Big Red Distribution, LLC Brand/Product # | SQP #6195
(Chicago, IL) ’ Per Unit Cost $44.14 $110,350.00
Extended Cost $110,350.00
Brand/Product #
I(?_?;(:;?;Im ) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Brand/Product #
Durable Packaging - . .
. P t t No Bid No Bid
(Wheeling, IL) Erfondes Gos
Form Plastics Brand/Product #
(St. Charles, IL) Ei{eﬁggfgztst No Bid No Bid
GFS Brand/Product #
(Wyoming, MI) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
IGC Brand/Product # PT-500K
3 : Per Unit Cost $34.65 $86,625.00
U City, CA ’
(Union City, CA) Extended Cost $86,625.00
Brand/Product #
New Wave Converting - . .
(Fontana, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
North A . Brand/Product # Pactiv #DBRLT
Glenviow, 1Ly Per Unit Cost $44.39 $110,975.00
Extended Cost $110,975.00
. Brand/Product #
FSSEK‘@‘;'“““S Inc- Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
' Extended Cost
Plastic Connections Brand/Product #
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Brand/Product #
Platinum Packaging Group - . .
(Paramount, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
. Brand/Product #
Wallace Packaging, LLC Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid

(Tuscon, AZ)

Extended Cost




CATEGORY 3 - AWARDED BY CATEGORY

Perforated Polyester Polypropylene Polypropylene
Lidding Film - 15" Lidding Film - 15" |Lidding Film - 11.25" Total
(hot pack) (cold pack) (cold pack) ota
Quantity (Lbs.) 1,500 725 440
Big Red Distribution, LLC * Per Unit Cost $ 534 | % 352 | $ 3.44
: 12,075.60
(Chicago, IL) Extended Cost $ 8,010.00 | $ 2,552.00 | $ 1,513.60
Daxwell Per Unit Cost . . . .
(Houston, TX) Extended Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Durable Packaging Per Unit Cost . . . .
(Wheeling, IL) Extended Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Form Plastics Per Unit Cost . . . .
(St. Charles, IL) Extended Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GFS ** Per Unit Cost $ 6.09 | $ 360 |$ 3.31 13.201.40
(Wyoming, Ml) Extended Cost $ 9,135.00 | $ 2,610.00 | $ 1,456.40 T
IGC Per Unit Cost . . . .
(Union City, CA) Extended Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Wave Converting, Inc. Per Unit Cost $ 3191 $ 2.00 | $ 2.00 7.115.00
(Fontana, CA) Extended Cost $ 4,785.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 880.00 e
North American Per Unit Cost . . . .
(Glenview, IL) Extended Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pathway Solutions, Inc. Per Unit Cost $ 475 | $ 280 | $ 2.80 10.387.00
(Dublin, OH) Extended Cost $ 7,125.00 | $ 2,030.00 | $ 1,232.00 T
Plastic Connections Per Unit Cost $ 265 | $ 1.98 | $ 142 6,286.10
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Extended Cost $ 3,975.00 | $ 1,43550 | $ 875.60 T
The Platinum Packaging Group |Per Unit Cost $ 315 | $ 3.00|$ 3.00 8.220.00
(Paramount, CA) Extended Cost $ 472500 | $ 2,175.00 | $ 1,320.00 ’ ’
Wallace Packaging, LLC Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(Tuscon, AC)

Extended Cost

* Big Red: No samples provided. Per bid specifications, samples were required.
** GFS: No samples provided. Per bid specifications, samples were required.




CATEGORY 4 - AWARDED BY LINE ITEM

4A 4B 4C 4D 4E 4F 4G 4H
Case Count 1000/cs 1000/cs 1500/cs 1500/cs 1500/cs 300/cs 1500/cs 1000/cs
Utensil Pak Utensil Pak One (1) Compartment Two (2)_Compar_tment Two (2)_Compar_tment Hinged, Extra 6 oz. Hinged 10 oz. Clear
Spork Knife/Fork Plastic Container Plastic Container Plastic Container Shallow Container Container Square Total Award
Nacho Tray Hamburger Tray
Quantity (cs) 1,550 250 100 50 50 100 50 100
Big Red Distribution, Brand/Product # 2400 units/cs - 63 cases C56 NTZ Dart 1,000/cs - 75 cases GP 567 1,000/cs - 75 cases CH8 DEF 200/cs - 150 cases | ADO6 400/cs - 188 cases 2,400/cs - 42 cases
LLC * Per Unit Cost $ 2247 | $ 1414 | § 157.79 | $ 56.98 | $ 5191 [ $ 4446 | $ 59.36 | $ 157.80 | $ 10,562.25
(Chicago, IL) Extended Cost $ 34,828.50 | $ 3,535.00 | $ 9,940.77 | $ 4,273.50 | $ 3,893.25 | $ 6,669.00 | $  11,159.68 | $ 6,627.60
Brand/Product # B10000527 B10003052
(El)_ia:;?c:ln X) Per Unit Cost $ 1424 | § 11.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 22,072.00
' Extended Cost $ 22,072.00 | $ 2,895.00
Durable Packaging BrandI.Product # . ’ . . . . . .
(Wheeling, IL) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
. Brand/Product # #6043-1500 #6263-1500 #6273-1500 21960 AIL5010H-158500 | SB1 Alt:5042-151700
::sot"grgﬁ::ﬁ) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid $ 161.90 | $ 158.76 | $ 158.76 No Bid $ 1271 $ 87.93 | $ 33436.25
) ' Extended Cost $ 16,190.00 | $ 7,938.00 | $ 7,938.00 $ 8,453.25 | $ 8,793.00
- Brand/Product # 225363 516482 44098 846459 846592 392127 422023 322943
t\;/\ll:ysoming M1y Per Unit Cost $ 695 | $ 4519 | $ 55.40 | $ 104.12 | § 51.88 78.99 $ 64.99 | $ 47.99
’ Extended Cost $ 10,772.50 | $ 11,297.50 | $ 5,540.00 | $ 5,206.00 | $ 2,594.00 | $ 7,899.00 | $ 3,249.50 | $ 4,799.00
IGC Brandlf’roduct # ) . ) . ‘ _ _ ‘
(Union City, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
New Wave Converting Brand/?roduct # . ; ; ) . . . .
(Fontana, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
. Brand/Product # | Pactiv FKQWSCHLCH | Pactiv FKFKWNCH Pactiv YCI880620000
x::vg'xeltfa" Per Unit Cost $ 20.00 10.17 No Bid $ 34.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  7,755.00
' Extended Cost $ 31,000.00 | $ 2,542.50 $ 5,212.50
Pathway Solutions Inc. BrandI.Product # : . . . . . . .
(Dublin, OH) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Plastic Connections Brand/?roduct # ; . . . . . . .
(Santa Fe Springs, CA) Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Cost
Platinum Packaging Brand/Product # #6043 Alt: 6550 #6263 Alt: 3472 #6273 Alt: 3124
Group *** Per Unit Cost No Bid No Bid $ 161.98 | $ 138.80 | $ 161.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Paramount, CA) Extended Cost $ 16,198.00 | $ 6,940.00 | $ 8,099.00
Wallace Packaging, Brand/Product # 3600 3612
LLC **** Per Unit Cost $ 1168 | $ 12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Tuscon, AZ) Extended Cost $ 18,104.00 | $ 3,000.00
Total Category 4 Award: | $ 73,825.50
North American: Form Plastics:

* Big Red: 4B, 4D, 4H - do not meet specifications (4B spoon contained, but not needed, 4H incorrect size).
** GFS: No samples provided. Per bid specifications, samples were required. Also 4C is the wrong item.

*** Platinum Packaging: 4D - Alternate items specificed does not meet specifications.
**** \Wallace: No samples provided, samples were required.

Case count is 500,

150 cases needed. 150
x $34.75 =

$5,212.50

Case count is
1000, 75 cases
needed. 75 x
$112.71 =
$8,453.25
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