
White Pigeon Community Schools
YOUR COMMUNITY INVESTMENT 

VOTE! TUESDAY, MAY 6TH

Chief Pride!

Why Your Support Matters for White Pigeon Community Schools

● Over half of our 
funding—56%—comes from local 
taxes, compared to just 14%–30% 
in neighboring districts.

● Why so high? White Pigeon's tax 
base includes a large number of 
non-homestead properties—like 
second homes, businesses, and 
farmland—which significantly 
contribute to our operating millage.

● That means this millage directly 
supports the everyday operations 
of our schools. From classroom 
teachers to student programs, it 
funds what our children rely on 
every single day.

● If this millage is not renewed, 
White Pigeon Community Schools 
will lose more than half of our 
total revenue—with no possible 
way to replace it.

● The result? Drastic cuts to staff 
forcing increased class sizes. Cuts 
to academic and athletic programs, 
student supports, and essential 
services for students.

Get the FACTS
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