REGULAR MONTHLY MEETING
APRIL 25, 2017

The St. Bernard Parish School Board met in a Regular Monthly Meeting on
Tuesday, April 25, 2017 at 6:00 p.m. in the St. Bernard Parish School Board
Office. Following the Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance, the Secretary called the
roll. Present were, Mrs. Diana B. Dysart, President, Mrs. Darleen P. Asevedo, Mr.
Donald D. Campbell, Mr. William H. Egan, Mr. Carl W. Gaines, Jr., Mr. Clifford
M. Englande, Mrs. Katherine K. Lemoine, Dr. Henderson Lewis, Jr., Mr. Joseph
V. Long, Sr., and Mr. Sean K. Warner. Dr. Hugh C. Craft was absent.

On a point of privilege, Mrs. Dysart mentioned that Dr. Craft asked her to thank all
of the people who wished him well during his recent hospital stay. She noted that
he only missed tonight’s School Board meeting because of another meeting he had
to attend, so he is back on his feet and taking care of business as usual.

There were no community concerns to be addressed by the Board.

Mrs. Dysart next welcomed Ms. Mary Lumetta to introduce the National Academic
Games Team. Ms. Lumetta noted that the students chosen for this national team
have earned the top scores in all the games at the tournaments that are held
throughout the year. The coaches of the teams will also be recognized. Ms.
Lumetta announced that the national tournament will be held in Wheeling, West
Virginia from April 28, to May 1, 2017 with over 2000 participants. Mrs. Lumetta
shared that the Academic Games League of America strives to develop character
and integrity in players, and she feels that our National Team players have
exhibited both during the entire competition season. She also thanked parents for
their support and also thanked Chalmette Refining-PBF Energy for their financial
support which defrays the cost of students attending the national competition. Ms.
Lumetta then introduced Chalmette Refining-PBF Energy representatives
Elizabeth Ellison-Frost, Ms. Dorothy Steele Hills and Mr. Jerry Forstell, Refinery
Manager, was not in attendance but was thanked in his absence.

Ms. Ellison-Frost of Chalmette Refining-PBF Energy stated that on behalf of the
company she was happy to submit to the Board a check for $15,000 to assist in
sending the students to nationals. Ms. Ellison-Frost wished the team well and
expressed how proud she was of their accomplishments.

Ms. Lumetta stated that she would present to the Board tonight the top five players
of each division of Academic Games who earned the opportunity to participate in

the Academic Games National Tournament in Atlanta, Georgia.

The members of the Academic Games National Tournament teams for the St.
Bernard Parish Schools are:

The Elementary Coach is Melinda Hall.
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Elementary Division — Colby Gilchrist, Selina Li, Ava Volante, Andrew Wei and
Tania White

The Middle Division coach is Ms. Gena Asevedo.

Middle Division: Ethan Gilchrist, Brandon Jackson, Jedell Lafuente, Landin
Sanborn and Anthony Wei

Senior and Junior Team Coaches are Ms. Jillian Chrisman, Ms. Leigh Peterson and
Mr. Gerardo Vasquez.

Junior/Senior Division: Ahmad Alkurd, Kenny Nguyen, Danton Vu, Kelsey
Billiot, Austin Billiot, Eryn Loria, Antony Vu, Erik Gangi, Grace Bartholomae and
Leanne Dacula.

Ms. Lumetta then recognized attorney, Ryan Gregoire, who assists in coaching at
all levels.

Ms. Voitier and Mrs. Dysart congratulated the students and thanked the parents
and coaches for these excellent competitors and fine representatives of our
community. Additional thanks was given to Chalmette Refinery/PBF Energy for
their support.

Mrs. Dysart presented the next agenda item to present the 2017 Chalmette High
District 8-AAAAA Championship Basketball Team. Coach Butch Stockton
thanked the Board and Ms. Voitier for recognizing the team tonight. Special
recognition was given to Mitchell Robinson who was first team all-state, MVP in
District, All Metro Team, High School All-American, Ranked #9 in the nation,
Max Preps All-American Honorable Mention and has signed a scholarship to the
University of Western Kentucky. Recognition was also given to Glenshawn Amos
as being named First Team All-District and he made the All-Metro Team. Carlton
Campbell was also name to the All-District Team. Special mention was also given
to Josh Williams for being named as an Academic All-State Basketball player for
class 5A. Coach Stockton also thanked his Assistant Coaches Al Gauthier, John
Stogner and Joe Tolis.

Mrs. Dysart thanked all the parents for supporting these young men in this
endeavor. Ms. Voitier also congratulated the coaches and players and expressed
her hopes that this successful experience will carry them through many future life
experiences. Proclamations were presented to the following players and Coaches:
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Chalmette High School
2016-17 Varsity Basketball

Players Glenshawn Amos
Larry Bentley
Michaund Blaise
Carlton Campbell
Marlon Decoud
Edwin Fernandez
Jaylen Green
Laterrel Hill
Dane Kiersey
Corey Picquet
Mitchell Robinson
Jeremiah Sumler
Hayden Tucker
Chadrick Williams
Josh Williams

Coaches Butch Stockton
Al Gauthier
John Stogner
Joe Tolis
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On motion of Mr. Warner and seconded by Mrs. Asevedo, the Board voted by a
unanimous roll call vote of the members present to incorporate the April 11, 2017
General Committee Report into the minutes of the April Regular Monthly meeting.

GENERAL COMMITTEE REPORT
TUESDAY, APRIL 11, 2017

The St. Bernard Parish School Board met as a Committee of the Whole on
Tuesday, April 11, 2017 at 6:00 p.m. in the Board Room of the St. Bernard Parish
School Board Office. Following the Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance, the
Secretary called the roll. Members present were, President, Mrs. Diana B. Dysart,
Mrs. Darleen P. Asevedo, Mr. Donald D. Campbell, Mr. William H. Egan, Mr.
Carl W. Gaines, Jr., Mr. Clifford M. Englande, Mrs. Katherine K. Lemoine and
Mr. Sean K. Warner. Dr. Hugh C. Craft, Dr. Henderson Lewis, Jr, Mr. Joseph V.
Long, Sr. were absent.

On a point of privilege, Mrs. Katherine Lemoine wanted to congratulate all the
high school seniors who were awarded scholarships at the previous night’s award
ceremony including Ms. Nicole Maridiaga who received the School Board
Scholarship. Mrs. Lemoine also thanked all the community members and civic
groups who funded scholarships.
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Mrs. Dysart began the meeting by welcoming Mrs. Alex Schneider to present this
month’s Super News. Mrs. Schneider first announced a list of upcoming events
which included: Celebrating Our School Community Banquet on April 12™; Relay
for Life on April 22"%; AdvancEd Exit Report, May 3", CHS Honors Banquet, May
5t St. Bernard Day at the Capital and the Chalmette High School Graduation on
May 11, At this time, Mrs. Schneider shared the Super News Video which
included news on; Special Olympics, Central Office VVolunteer of the Year, Alvin
Jones for his assistance with Special Olympics, Chalmette High Voices Glitter and
Gloves Revue where the summer production of the Little Mermaid was announced
and National Academic Games Tournament winners who will compete in
Wheeling, West Virginia at the National Competition. Teacher Features included;
Shelby Baird at Gauthier Elementary School, Jenny Maldonado of Andrew
Jackson Middle School and Yvonne Ben who is stationed at Arabi Elementary
School. The News closed with reminders about state testing.

Mrs. Dysart thanked Mrs. Schneider for her presentation and offered
congratulation to our students and teachers who excel.

Mr. Wayne Burgess of the LSU Ag Center appeared before the Committee to
review last year’s Ag Center contributions and the upcoming Ag Magic
Presentation. Mr. Burgess explained some of the contributions to the schools
during the previous year which include club activities, educational meetings and
end of the year field trips. The dates for the official student presentation of AG
Magic are Wednesday, May 10, 2017 through Friday, May 13, 2017. The exhibits
will be open to the public on Saturday, May 13, 2017. Admission is free. Mr.
Burgess thanked the Committee and volunteers from St. Bernard for their support
in all these activities.

After all questions and comments were addressed, the Committee thanked Mr.
Burgess for their presentation and their efforts during the entire year.

Mr. Gaines as Education Committee chair welcomed Mrs. Beverly Lawrason to
present an update on the preparations for our AdvancEd Review which will take
place on April 30, May 1, 2 and 3, 2017 which will offer a school district-wide
accreditation. The six member team will visit Arabi and Davies Elementary
Schools, Trist Middle School and Chalmette High. Board Members, parents,
students, teachers and community partners will be interviewed. A special Board
Meeting will be called on May 3, 2017 at 3:00 p.m. for an exit review that will
disclose their findings and whether or not accreditation will be recommended.
Mrs. Lawrason stated that preparations have been taking place at all of the schools
by providing timelines of milestones to meet every month as the review date
approaches. Mrs. Lawrason also stated that the review process has been rewarding
In the positive feedback that has been collected from all facets of educational
partners within and outside of our school community.
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Mr. Gaines thanked Mrs. Lawrason for her presentation.

Mr. Granberry addressed Personnel changes for the month of April. All questions
and comments from Committee members were addressed by Mr. Granberry.
Congratulations were offered to retirees Gail Calato and Kathleen Bauer. Ms.
Voitier also announced that Mr. Tony Morales was chosen to be the new Assistant
Principal of St. Bernard Middle School. Congratulations were offered to Mr.
Morales on his new position.

Mrs. Joni Blum next appeared before Mr. Englande as Finance Committee chair to
present the bid tabulation for Small Food Service Equipment. Mrs. Blum noted
that all low bids are noted on the bid tabulation.

Mr. Warner moved to recommend to the Board to recommend to the Board to
accept the bid tabulation for Small Food Service Equipment as presented by Mrs.
Blum. Seconded by Mr. Gaines, the motion passed unanimously by a roll call vote
of the members present.

Mr. Fernandez presented to the Finance Committee for their review the 2016-2017
Revised General Fund, Special Revenue Fund and Lunch Fund Budgets.
Questions and comments from Committee members which followed were
addressed by Mr. Fernandez.

Mrs. Dysart made a motion to recommend to the board to approve the revisions
made to the 2016-2017 General Fund, Special Revenue Fund and Lunch Fund
Budgets. Seconded by Mrs. Lemoine, the motion passed unanimously by a roll
call vote of the members present.

At this time a motion was made by Mr. Englande to go into executive session to
discuss potential negotiations. Seconded by Mr. Warner, the motion passed
unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present. Upon completion of the
aforementioned executive session, Mr. Warner moved to return to open session,
seconded by Mrs. Lemoine, the motion passed by a unanimous vote of the
members present and open session was resumed.

Under Superintendent’s Recommendations Ms. Voitier stated that at the May 23
2017 Regular Monthly School Board Meeting the Board will levy the 2017 tax
millages. Ms. Voitier asked everyone to check school calendars for events at each
school. She also wished everyone a Happy Easter and safe travels during the
break.

There being no further business, on motion of Mrs. Asevedo, seconded by

Campbell and passed by a unanimous vote of the members present, the Committee
adjourned.

*hkkkhkkkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkhkhkkhkhkhkhkhkkikhkhkhkhkkikkikikhkikkk
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Mr. Granberry shared the following Personnel changes as shown below for April
2017. Congratulations and best wishes were also offered by Mrs. Dysart for retiree
Gail Calato and Kathleen Bauer.

ST. BERNARD PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

MINUTES OF APRIL 25, 2017

CHANGES FOR BOARD MEMBERS INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE ONLY:

PERSONNEL CHANGES — TEACHERS

APPOINTMENTS

Caroline Miller
Gabrielle Dinet
Brittany Hodges
Britni Nations
Lauren Weidie
Jeanie Bacon
Marilyn Donoho
Holli Jessee
Jason Smith

Paul Wilson
Nicholas Kerth
Joseph Tolis
Mallory Feraci
Jamie Netto
Shannon Fitzgerald
Denise St. Amant
Jeanine Guercia

Danielle Lewis
Ashley Shinpoch
Melissa Turner
Gabrielle Rizzo

Tia Domingo
Magen Arabie
Tatiana D’ Antoni
Whitney Asevado
Teri Rhodes

LaMinda Pilie

Ann Costanza
Craig DeHarde
Krissy Gadwaw
Catherine Duhy
Margot Ballina

Arabi Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-High School Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-High School Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-High School Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-Business Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-High School Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-Special Education Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High-Special Education Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Davies Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Davies Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Gauthier Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Gauthier Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary/Coach Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Lacoste Elementary-Special Education Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Lacoste Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher (2017-18 School Year)

Meraux Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Meraux Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
St. Bernard Middle-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
St. Bernard Middle-Special Education Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Smith Elementary-Special Education Teacher

(2017-18 School Year)

Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)

Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher/Coach (2017-18 School Year)
Trist Middle-Special Education Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
Trist Middle-School Counselor (2017-18 School Year)

Special Education-Speech Therapist (2017-18 School Year)
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PERSONNEL CHANGES — TEACHERS 4/25/17 CONT’D

TRANSFERS
Lauren Frazier

Sonja Brown
Lana Breaux
Alisha Atkinson
Kathleen Doody
Casey Browne
Katie Asevado
Natasha Ballard
Carl Landry

Crystal Davis

MEDICAL LEAVES

Casey Ivory

Corinne Perez

Sarah Morales

FAMILY LEAVE
Ray Raymond

RESIGNATIONS
Flora Cabili

Alicia Becnel
Clinton Jorn
Michelle Nicholson
Eric Siemens
Patterson Willis
Sarah deGruy
Katedra Williams
Jessica McAllister
Maxwell Oberlander

RETIREE
Gail Calato

SUPPORT PERSONNEL

RESIGNATION
Carla Campbell

RETIREE
Kathleen Bauer

From Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher to Davies
Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
From Chalmette Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher to Meraux
Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher (2017-18 School Year)

From Davies Elementary-Elementary Teacher to Meraux
Elementary-School Counselor (2017-18 School Year)
From Davies Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher to Meraux
Elementary-Kindergarten Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
From Davies Elementary-Elementary Teacher to Meraux
Elementary-School Librarian (2017-18 School Year)
From Meraux Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher to Meraux
Elementary-Kindergarten Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
From St. Bernard Middle-Elementary Teacher to
Chalmette High-High School Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
From Smith Elementary-Elementary Teacher to Andrew
Jackson Middle-School Counselor (2017-18 School Year)
From Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher to Meraux
Elementary-Elementary Teacher (2017-18 School Year)
From Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher to
Chalmette High-High School Teacher

(2017-2018 School Year)

Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Shanon Collins replaced Casey Ivory)
Smith Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Tori Simpson replaced Corinne Perez)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Casie Belaire replaced Sarah Morales)

Chalmette High-Special Education Teacher

Chalmette Elementary-Special Education Teacher 8/01/17
Chalmette High-High School Teacher 8/01/17

Chalmette High-High School Teacher 8/01/17

Chalmette High-Gifted/Talented Teacher 8/01/17
Chalmette High-High School Teacher 8/01/17

Chalmette High-High School Teacher 8/01/17

Gauthier Elementary-Elementary Teacher 8/01/17
Rowley Alternative-High School Teacher 4/21/17

Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher 8/01/17

Chalmette High-High School Teacher 5/27/17

Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher 5/27/17

Arabi Elementary-Part-Time Cafeteria Technician 4/21/17

Transportation Department-Bus Driver 11/29/16

kkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkhhkkhkkihkkrhkhkhhhihkihkkikhihiiiikkx

Page 7



Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting Page 8

On recommendation from the Committee, Dr. Lewis moved to approve revisions to
the 2016-2017 General Fund and Special Revenue Fund Budgets. Seconded by
Mrs. Lemoine, the motion passed by the roll call vote shown below.

ROLL CALL VOTE

YEAS: Mrs. Darleen P. Asevedo, Mr. Donald D. Campbell, , Mr.
William H. Egan, Mr. Carl W. Gaines, Jr., Mrs. Katherine K.
Lemoine, Mr. Clifford M. Englande, Mrs. Diana B. Dysart, Dr.
Henderson Lewis, Jr., Mr. Joseph V. Long, Sr., and Mr. Sean

K. Warner
NAYS: None
ABSENT: Dr. Hugh C. Craft

kkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkhkkikhkkhkkhkkhkkhkhkikkhkkhkkhkkhkkikkikkikhkhkikikk

ST. BERNARD PARISH SCHOOL BOARD
GENERAL FUND
REVISED STATEMENT OF PROJECTED REVENUES, EXPENDITURES
AND CHANGES IN FUND BALANCE

FOR THE PERIOD ENDED JUNE 30, 2017

FUND BALANCE - JUNE 30, 2016 $18,606,823
PROJECTED REVENUES 68,037,625
PROJECTED EXPENDITURES (69,592,013)

OTHER FINANCING SOURCES:

Transfers of Indirect Costs 600,000
Sales of Fixed Assets 20,000
Operating Transfer Out (500,000)
Transfers to Other Educational Agencies (123,772)
TOTAL OTHER FINANCING SOURCES (USES): (3,772)

17,048,663

PROJECTED FUND BALANCE - JUNE 30, 2017

Reserved/Designated:
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Media Services 799,336
Contribution 1,307,752
Self Insurance Retention 400,000
Insurance Retention - Property 2,500,000
Telecommunications Services 1,156,165
Undesignated 10,885,410

$17,048,663
ST. BERNARD PARISH SCHOOL BOARD
LUNCH FUND
COMPARISON OF 2016-2017 CURRENT BUDGETED
TO 2016-2017 REVISED BUDGETED AMOUNTS
2016-2017 2016-2017
CURRENT REVISED
BUDGET BUDGET
PROJECTED REVENUES:
Local $271,000 $271,000
State 615,650 615,650
Federal 3,202,774 3,273,334
USDA Commodities 200,000 311,811
TOTAL REVENUES 4,289,424 4,471,795
PROJECTED EXPENDITURES:
Salaries 1,194,127 1,229,255
Employee Benefits 998,275 1,025,857
Food Costs 1,821,565 1,939,960
Material & Supplies - Cafeteria 100,000 100,000
Staff Development 6,000 6,000
Contracted Services 55,000 55,000
Equipment Repairs 60,000 60,000
Utilities, Telephone 34,400 34,400
Advertising, Postage, Audit 14,000 14,000
TOTAL EXPENDITURES 4,283,367 4,464,472
EXCESS (DEFICIENCY) OF REVENUES
OVER EXPENDITURES 6,057 7,323
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 460,050 460,050
ENDING FUND BALANCE 466,107 467,373




Special Revenue Funds Budgets
2016-2017

REVENUES

Federal
State
Total Revenues

EXPENDITURES
Instruction
Pupil Support Services
Instructional Staff Support
General Administrative
Services
Plant Services
Transportation Services
Total Expenditures

Excess of Revenues Over
Expenditures

Transfer Out - Indirect Cost

Fund Balance - July 1, 2016

Fund Balance - June 30, 2017
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SPECIAL
EDUCATION/

PRESCHOOL/ ADULT VOCATIONAL

TITLE | TITLE I TITLE IlI ESYP HEADSTART LA 4 TANF EDUCATION EDUCATION
$4,142,896 $553,895 $30,903 $2,140,514 $845,367 $668,953 $120,529 $105,650
- - - 0 - - 74,128 -
4,142,896 553,895 30,903 2,140,514 845,367 668,953 194,657 105,650
2,935,266 412,731 30,138 1,584,268 608,224 623,038 191,657 105,650
- - 0 217,828 82,400 - - -
913,520 103,146 0 205,358 87,519 - - -
900 - 0 500 1,000 - - -
8,851 - 0 - - - - -
- - 0 3,711 5,000 - - -
3,858,537 515,877 30,138 2,011,665 784,143 623,038 191,657 105,650
284,359 38,018 765 128,849 61,224 45,915 3,000 -
(284,359) (38,018) (765) (128,849) (61,224) (45,915) (3,000) -
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As recommended by the Committee, Mr. Englande moved to approve the lowest
bidder for each item on the Small Food Service Equipment bid tabulation.
Seconded by Mr. Campbell, the motion passed unanimously by a roll call vote of
the members present. That bid tabulation is shown below.
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ECONOMICAL

LAFAYETTE PUEBLO
ITEM# | cLass | SHORT DESCRIPTION LONG DESCRIPTION ALACK JANITORIAL | EQUIPMENT |\ ,mrpre | RESTAURANT HOTEL
CULINARY AND PAPER | CONCEPTS SoaELY IS
SUPPLIES & DESIGNS
PLATFORM TRUCK
Rubbermaid brand, BLACK OR
GRAY COLOR. 321/2"L
x201/2 W . UPRIGHT FOR $ $ $ ALACK
131 13 | PLATFORM TRUCK PUSHING ANGLED FOR 141.00 152.66 NO BID NO BID 185.00 NO BID CULINARY
PULLING, FLAT FORUS AS A
DOLLY, NON SKID SURFACE
500LB. CAPACITY
CUTTING BOARD SAF-T-
GRIP 6 BOARD
CONVENIENCE PACK 12X18
CUTTING BOARD COLOR COATED FOR s DOES NOT s ALACK
132 13 | CONVIENCE PACK DIFFERENT FOODS 10000 MEET BID NO BID NO BID P 550 NO BID o Ry
COLOR CODED POLYCARBONATE ' SPECIFICATIONS '
MATERIAL SAN JAMAR
CBG1218KC OR APPROVED
EQUAL.
CUTTING BOARD RACK CUTTING BOARD RACK TO $ DOES NOT $ ALACK
13-3 13 | TOFIT SAN JAMAR FIT COLOR COATED SAN 2505 MEET BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID Ry
BRAND JAMAR 34CBI52012 BOARDS : SPECIFICATIONS :
MIXING PADDLE 91/2"X 4
STAINLESS STEEL XING P $ $ $ ALACK
13-4 13 MIXING PADDLE g/]‘}EI)E(L36 LONG. STAINLESS 9.50 10.25 NO BID NO BID 27.99 NO BID CULINARY
STRAINER DOUBLE MESH $ $ $ ALACK
135 13 | STRAINER CONSTRUCTION, ALUMINUM i A NO BID NO BID P NO BID A Ry
FRAME 10-1/4" DIAMETER. : : :
COLANDER 14 QT.
CAPACITY CONSTRUCTED
OF HEAVY GAUGE
STAINLESS STEEL.
COLANDER 14 QT. DIMENSIONS; 16-1/2" $ $ $ $ ALACK
13-6 13| capaciTy DIAMETER 7" INSIDE DEPTH 21.50 44.02 22.00 NO BID 34.35 NO BID CULINARY

VOLLRATH 47974
COMMERCIAL ALUMINUM
CO. 1524 OR APPROVED
EQUAL
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13

FOOD PROCESSOR

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

COMMERCIAL FOOD
PROCESSOR, 3 1UART,
CLEAR POLYCARBONATE
BOWL WITH HANDLE,
KIDNEY SHAPED OPENING,
VEGETABEL PREP
ATTACHEMENT WITH
EXTERNAL EJECTION,
INCLUDES: 1 S BLADE, 1-
2MM GRATING DISC, 1 4MM
SLICEING DISK, CONTINOUS
FEED, BOWL ATTACHMENT
DESIGNED FOR VERTICAL
CUTTING AND MIZING,
ON/OFF AND PULSE
SWITCH, SINGLE SPEED,
1725 RPM, 120V/60/1-PH, 7
AMPS, 1 HP, CETLUS, ETL-
SANITATION.ROBOT COUPE
R2N CLR OR PREAPROVED
EQUAL

$
941.50

NO BID

$
1,335.00

NO BID

$
1,095.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-8

13

STORE-N-POUR SYSTEM

STORE-N-POUR SYSTEM
COMPLETE WITH
CONTAINER NECK SPOUT
AND CAP. QUART SIZE.
SILITE OR CALICO 34PS601N
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

27.28

NO BID

NO BID

7.60

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13

SHAKER OR DREDGER 10
OZ. W/ COLORED LID

SHAKER OR DREDGER 10
OZ. CLEAR
POLYCARBONATE WITH
SNAP ON COLOR CODED
TOP..

2.00

1.36

NO BID

NO BID

8.60

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-10

13

FUNNEL

FUNNELL HI-INTENSITY
POLYETHYLENE
DISHWASHER SAFE. 6-3/4"
320Z.

0.75

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

4.60

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-11

13

FUNNEL

FUNNELL HI-INTENSITY
POLYETHYLENE
DISHWASHER SAFE. 5-1/4"
16 OZ.

0.60

NO BID

3.00

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-12

13

KITCHEN TIMER

TIMER LONG INSISTANT
SIGNAL UP TO 18 SECONDS
DURATION. WHITE PLASTIC
CASE SLANTED FACE LUX
#1928 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

NO BID

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS
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13

OVEN THERMOMETER
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OVEN THERMOMETER ALL
STAINLESS STEEL BACK
STANDS OR HANGS IN OVEN
4-7/8" X 2-1/4". TAYLOR
#5921 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

8.35

2.03

4.50

NO BID

9.85

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-14

13

REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER
THERMOMETER

REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER
THERMOMETER DIAL TYPE
HANGS OR STANDS 2-3/4" X
3-1/2" HIGH RANGE FROM
35 DEGREES TO 75
DEGREES FAREINHEIT.
TAYLOR #5974 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

NO BID

9.45

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-15

13

MEAT/COOKING
THERMOMETER

MEAT/COOKING
THERMOMETER 2" ROUND
DIAL 8" STAINLESS STEEL
POINTED STEM AND CASE
RANGE FROM 100 DEGREES
TO 220 DEGREES
FARENHEIT. TAYLOR #6081-
8 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

8.60

3.40

NO BID

13.95

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-16

13

PITCHER BOUNCER
BEVERAGE PITCHER

PITCHER BEVERAGE WITH
ICE LIP 48 OZ CAPACITY
RUBBERMAID OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

3.70

NO BID

NO BID

16.85

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-17

13

MAGNETIC KNIFE
HOLDER

MAGNETIC KNIFE HOLDER,
MAGNETIC BAR, 18", 12"w X
2-3/8 "D X 3/4 "H, RECESSED
MAGNETS, REAR KEYHOLD
MOUNTING SLOTS,
BAMBOO. MERCER
CULINARY MODEL
M30731BM OR APPROVED
EQUAL

21.75

14.00

NO BID

13.25

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-18

13

BRAZIER PAN WITH
HANDLES, 18 QUART

PROFESSIONAL BRAIZER, 18
QUART, 16-3/8" X5 1/2 ",
WITHOUT COVER,
REINFORCED RIM, 3/16"
THICK (4.0MM), 3003 SUPER
ALUMINUM, NSF

31.60

36.10

69.00

NO BID

147.45

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

Page 14



13-19

13

BRAZIER PAN WITH
HANDLES, 24 QUART

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

PROFESSIONAL BRAIZER, 24
QUART, 18-3/8" X 5 3/4 ",
WITHOUT COVER,
REINFORCED RIM, 3/16"
THICK (4.0MM), 3003 SUPER
ALUMINUM, NSF

37.70

43.09

89.00

NO BID

194.35

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-20

13

BRAZIER PAN WITH
HANDLES, 35 QUART

PROFESSIONAL BRAIZER, 35
QUART, 21.7" X 6 ", WITHOUT
COVER, REINFORCED RIM,
3/16" THICK (4.0MM), 3003
SUPER ALUMINUM, NSF

62.25

119.93

109.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-21

13

SKIMMER

SKIMMER STAINLESS
STEEL DIAMETER OF
BLADE 6-3/8" HOOKED
HANDLE 12-3/4" LONG.
WEAR EVER OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

10.00

NO BID

13.20

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-22

13

ROLLING PIN 13" X 18"

ROLLING PIN 13" X 18"
CONSTRUCTED OF
HARDWOOD BALL BEARING
2-3/3" DIAMETER CYLINDER
MODEL #3653

NO BID

NO BID

16.05

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-23

13

POTATO MASHER

POTATO MASHER HEAVY
GAUGE WIRE 5" X 5" BASE
24" LONG.

NO BID

NO BID

12.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-24

13

BASTER ALL PURPOSE

BASTER ALL PURPOSE
NYLON TUBE RUBBER
ENDS 11" LENGTH.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-25

13

BUN PAN RACK

BUN PAN RACK, FOR
PROOF, STORE AND
TRANSPORT ; "18"X26", END
LOAD HOLDS 20 PANS ON 3"
SPACING, HEAVY DUTY
ALUMINUM WITH WELDED
ANGLE SLIDES. 4

POLY URETHANE SWIVEL
LOCKING CASTERS; 21"W x
26"L X 69 1/2 " H.

182.00

117.21

159.00

NO BID

285.00

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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13-26

13

BUN PAN RACK COVER
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RACK COVER, 23" WIDE X
28" DEEP X 62" HIGH,
REINFORCED PVC
UNIVERSAL LOADING
COVER WITH CLEAR
INFORMATION POCKET,
HANGER LOOP,
TRANSLUCENT WHITE

38.00

19.93

79.00

NO BID

35.30

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-27

13

ICE SCOOP-ALUMINUM
CAPACITY

ICE SCOOP ALUMINUM ONE
PIECE CAST ALUMUNIM
CONSTRUCTION. CAPACITY
STAMPED ON SECURE GRIP
HANDLE, VOLLRATH
MODEL# 46892 OR
APPROVED EQUAL

3.00

2.85

NO BID

NO BID

16.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-28

13

SIFTER

SIFTER 20" DIAMETER
CONSTRUCTED OF
ALUMINUM. WEAR EVER
#5272 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

16.55

18.30

NO BID

NO BID

16.80

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-29

13

FRY PAN 10"

FRY PAN 10" DIAMETER,
WITHOUT LID, RIVETED
HANDLE, ROUND,
ALUMINUM, NAMTURAL
FINISH, WITH BLUE
SILICONE SLEVE, NSF

9.65

10.80

23.00

NO BID

18.30

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-30

13

FRY PAN 12"

FRY PAN 12" DIAMETER,
WITHOUT LID, RIVETED
HANDLE, ROUND,
ALUMINUM, NAMTURAL
FINISH, WITH BLUE
SILICONE SLEVE, NSF

12.65

14.30

31.00

NO BID

21.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-31

13

FRY PAN 14"

FRY PAN 14" DIAMETER,
WITHOUT LID, RIVETED
HANDLE, ROUND,
ALUMINUM, NAMTURAL
FINISH, WITH BLUE
SILICONE SLEVE, NSF

16.45

18.64

41.00

NO BID

24.30

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13-32

13

SILICONE BASTING
BRUSHES

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

PASTRY BRUSHES 11/2"
OVERALL LENGTH 11"
PLASTIC AND SILICON HIGH
TEMP.UP TO 600DEGREES
F. OXO OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

3.30

NO BID

2.00

NO BID

12.66

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-33

13

SAUCE POT WITH
HANDLES, 8 QUART

SAUCE POT, 8 QUART,
9.8"X6.5" WITHOUT COVER,
RIVETED HANDLE,
REINFORCED RIM, 1/4*
THICK (6.0 MM), EXTRA
HEAVY ALUMINUM, NSF

26.50

30.87

22.00

NO BID

43.05

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-34

13

SAUCE POT WITH
HANDLES, 14 QUART

SAUCE POT, 14 QUART,
11.8" X 7.7", WITHOUT
COVER, REINFORCED RIM,
1/4" THICK (6.0MM), EXTRA
HEAVY ALUMINUM, NSF

37.20

43.28

30.00

NO BID

52.30

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-35

13

SPATULA- 9 5/8"

THERMOPLASTIC BLADE
ANDMOLDED
POLYPROPYLENE HANDLE
.NSF LISTED. HOLDS SHAPE
UP TO 212 DEGREES F.
VOLLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL

1.00

141

2.80

NO BID

12.30

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-36

13

SPATULA 13 5/8"

THERMOPLASTIC BLADE
AND MOLDED
POLYPROPYLENE HANDLE
NSF LISTED. HOLDS SHAPE
UP TO 212 DEGREES F.
VOLLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL

1.50

4.00

NO BID

14.05

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-37

13

SPATULA TURNING

SPATULA TURNING
POLISHED STAINLESS
STEEL SOLID 14 1/4"
VOLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL

4.00

1.01

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-38

13

TURNER

SPATULA TURNING
POLISHED STAINLESS
STEEL SLOTTED 14 1/4"
VOLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL

4.00

1.01

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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13-39

13

HAMBURGER TURNER

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

HAMBURGER TURNER
POLISHED STAINLESS
STEEL IMPACT , WEAR AND
TEMPERATURE RESISTANT
6" X3" DEXTER RUSSELL
SANI-SAFE OR APPROVED
EQUAL

8.60

NO BID

NO BID

14.95

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-40

13

FRENCH HOTEL WHIP

FRENCH HOTEL WHIP 18/8
GAUGE STAINLESS STEEL
INCLUDING HANDLE. 14"
LENGTH. VOLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

2.00

197

5.50

NO BID

14.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-41

13

STEP STOOL

STEP STOOL EXTRA LARGE
TOP AND STEP WITH
SAFETY THREAD.
SUPPORTS UP TO 350 LBS
RUBBERMAID OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

80.10

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

NO BID

95.25

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-42

13

STAINLESS STEEL
UTILITY CART; 3 TIER

UTILITY CART, 3 TEIR, 48"W
X 25 3/4 "D X 37 3/8
"H,STAINLESS STEEL
CONSTRUCTION, OPEN
BASE U FRAME WITH
ANGELED STAINLESS
STEEL, 24"X42" 14 GUAGE
SHELVED WITH
REINFORCED EDGES, 11
3/8" SHELF CLEARANCE,
1"0.D. TUBE PUSH HANDLE
WITH BUMPERS, (2) 6"
BUMPERS RIVETED TO THE
FRONT LEGS, 1000LB.
CAPACITY, (2) 5"
REINFORCED SWIVEL
PLATE CASTERS & (2) 8"
FIXED CASTERS WITH NON-
MARKING PLOYURETHANE
WHEELS, NSF/ 1 EACH
CASTERS, 5" ALL SWIVEL 2
WITH BRAKES

$
1,502.00

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13-43

13

STAINLESS STEEL
UTILITY CART; 2 TIER

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

UTILITY CART, 2 TEIR, 42"W
X257/8"D X 37 3/8
"H,STAINLESS STEEL
CONSTRUCTION, OPEN
BASE U FRAME WITH
ANGELED STAINLESS
STEEL, 24"X 36" 14 GUAGE
SHELVED WITH
REINFORCED EDGES, 21"
SHELF CLEARANCE, 1"0.D.
TUBE PUSH HANDLE WITH
BUMPERS, (2) 6" BUMPERS
RIVETED TO FRONT LRGS,
1000 LB. CAPACITY, (2) 5"
REINFORCED SWIVEL
PLATE CASTERS AND (2) 8"
FIXED CASTERS WITH NON-
MARKING POLYURETHANE
WHEELS, NSF /1 EACH 5"
ALL SWIVEL 2 WITH BRAKES

$
1,220.00

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-44

13

DUNNAGE RACK

DUNNAGE RACK, SLOTTED
TOP, 1500 LB LOAD
CAPACITY, 21"D X 30"W X
12" H, POLYPROPYLENE,
ONE PIECE, SEAMLESS
DOUBLE WALL
CONSTRUCTION, INCLUDES,
4: SQUARE LEGS,
SPECKLED GRAY, NSF

118.45

109.10

NO BID

NO BID

125.75

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-45

13

DUNNAGE RACK

DUNNAGE RACK, SLOTTED
TOP, 3000 LB LOAD
CAPACITY, 21"D X 48"W X
12" H, POLYPROPYLENE,
ONE PIECE, SEAMLESS
DOUBLE WALL
CONSTRUCTION, INCLUDES,
4: SQUARE LEGS,
SPECKLED GRAY, NSF

153.00

142.01

NO BID

NO BID

157.25

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-46

13

SAUCE PAN WITH ONE
HANDLE

SAUCE PAN, 4 1/4 QUART,
9"X4.5", WITHOUT COVER,
3.0MM HEAVYWEIGHT
ALUMINUM,NSF

10.10

11.11

16.30

NO BID

18.15

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-47

13

COVER FOR 4 1/4 QUART
SAUCE PAN

COVER WITH HANDLE,
MADE OF HEAVYWEIGHT
ALUMINUM TO FIT SAUCE
PAN LISTED ABOVE (1341)

3.50

4.00

NO BID

9.85

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13-48

13

SAUCE PAN WITH ONE
HANDLE AND HELPER
HANDLE

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

SAUCE PAN, 10 QUART,
11.4"X 5.7", WITHOUT
COVER, 3.0MM
HEAVYWEIGHT
ALUMINUM,NSF

16.74

17.94

26.00

NO BID

23.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-49

13

COVER FOR 10 QUART
SAUCE PAN

COVER WITH HANDLE,
MADE OF HEAVYWEIGHT
ALUMINUM TO FIT SAUCE
PAN LISTED ABOVE (1342)

NO BID

11.45

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-50

13

FLATWARE HOLDER AND
CYLINDERS

STAINLESS STEEL
CONTAINER FOR FLATWARE
AND SHALL INCLUDE 8
STAINLESS STEEL
CYLINDERS.

38.20

36.36

33.00

NO BID

51.15

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-51

13

CYLINDER FOR
FLATWARE SYSTEM

CYLINDER FOR FLATWARE
SYSTEM 4" DIAMETER 5-1/2
"H STAINLESS STEEL

2.00

1.87

3.00

NO BID

5.45

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-52

13

FOOD BLENDER

BLENDER, BAR BLENDER,
480Z. CAPACITY, TWO
SPEED MOTER,
POLYCARBONATE
CONTAINER, WITH
REMOVABLE BLADE
ASSEMBLE, CHOME ZINC
DIE-CAST BASE, WITH LID,
HEAVY DUTY STAINLESS
STEEL BLADE, NSF, CUL
AND UL LISTED 120V/ 50/60/1
PH STANDARD

294.00

NB

NO BID

NO BID

435.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-53

13

MEASURING CUP, 2
QUART

MEASURING CUP, 2 QUART,
CLEAR WITH HANDLE AND
MARKED WITH
GRADUATIONS
POLYCARBONATE, NSF

5.25

6.45

NO BID

15.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-54

13

MEASURING CUP, 4
QUART

MEASURING CUP, 4 QUART,
CLEAR WITH HANDLE AND
MARKED WITH
GRADUATIONS
POLYCARBONATE, NSF

7.95

11.50

NO BID

16.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13-55

13

MEASURING CUP, 1
QUART

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

MEASURING CUP , 1 QUART,
CLEAR WITH HANDLE AND
MARKED WITH
GRADUATIONS
POLYCARBONATE, NSF

3.00

3.46

2.00

NO BID

9.95

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-56

13

MEASURING CUP, 1 PINT

MEASURING CUP, 1 PINT,
CLEAR WITH HANDLE AND
MARKED WITH
GRADUATIONS
POLYCARBONATE, NSF

2.25

2.35

3.00

NO BID

12.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-57

13

FOOD CONTAINER,
SQUARE WITH COVER

FOOD STORAGE
CONTAINER WITH COVER.
TRANSLUCENT, GREEN
GRADUATION,
POLU=YPROPYLENE,
DISHWASHER SAFE, 2
QUART. CAMBRO
2SFSPP190, LID SFC2452

NO BID

NO BID

10.30

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-58

13

COOKS FORK

CARVING FORK, 10"
STRAIGHT TINES, HIGH
CARBON/NO STAIN BLADE,
RED POLYACETAL HANDLE.

19.00

12.00

NO BID

25.40

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-59

13

KITCHEN SCISSORS

ALL PURPOSE SHEARS, 8
1/2", KNIFE EDGE BLACK

26.75

12.00

NO BID

14.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-60

13

CROCKS 1.2 QUARTS
WITH LID

CROCKS 1.2 QUARTS WITH
LID POLYTUF FABRICATED
WITH POLYPROPYLENE.
CONTINENTAL PLASTICS
#0341 CAMBRO CP12 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.45

NO BID

NO BID

8.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-61

13

CROCKS 2.7 QUARTS
WITH LID

CROCKS 2.7 QUARTS WITH
LID POLYTUF FABRICATED
WITH POLYPROPYLENE.
CONTINENTAL PLASTICS
#0342 CAMBRO CP27 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

NO BID

NO BID

10.95

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-62

13

UTILITY TONGS 6"
LENGTH

UTILITY TONGS 6" LENGTH
STAINLESS STEEL
VOLLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

1.50

0.96

NO BID

NO BID

5.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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UTILITY TONGS 9" LENGTH
UTILITY TONGS 9" STAINLESS STEEL $ $ $
13-63 13 | [ENGTH VOLLRATH OR APPROVED 1.60 1.05 NO BID NO BID 6.73 NOBID ECONOMICAL
EQUAL.
UTILITY TONGS 9-1/2"
" LENGTH HEAVY DUTY
13-64 13 t’g,'\'l-gTT_ITONGS 9172 STAINLESS STEEL. L 2‘5 1$29 NO BID NO BID 6$75 NO BID éb’?‘_fNKARY
VOLLRATH #47110 OR : : :
APPROVED EQUAL.
" UTILITY TONGS 16" LENGTH
13-65 13 t’g,'\'l-gTLTONGS 16 VOLLRATH 47116 OR L ?o 1$58 NO BID NO BID :50 NO BID ECONOMICAL
APPROVED EQUAL. : : -
LADLES HOOKED HANDLE
LADLES HOOKED $ $ $ ALACK
13-66 13| HOLES HOOK 80Z CAPACITY STAINLESS Lo AR NO BID NO BID o NO BID A Ry
LADLES HOOKED HANDLE
LADLES HOOKED $ $ $ ALACK
13-67 13 | HOLES HOOK 40Z CAPACITY STAINLESS Lo o NO BID NO BID o0 NO BID A Ry
LADLES 2 OZ. CAPACITY
13-68 13 hﬁ?\:ﬁ% 20Z. HOOKED | \3OKED HANDLE o 39;5 3589 NO BID NO BID 7$90 NO BID ECONOMICAL
STAINLESS STEEL : : :
FORGED COOK'S FORK
OVERALL LENGTH 13"
. SUPER STAINLESS STEEL
13-69 13 Eg.'?_‘éﬁ%?gw S FORK POLYPROPYLENE HANDLE. . 32‘5 9$11 fz 00 NO BID ;; o5 NO BID éIL-JTI:NKARY
NSF APPROVED. SANI-SAFE . . . .
#5205 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.
SPOON PERFORATED
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
13-70 13 gga,?_ng.ERFORATED 13" LENGTH. VOLLRATH L go :73 NO BID NO BID f " NO BID ECONOMICAL
#46975 OR APPROVED . . .
EQUAL.
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13-71

13

SPOODLES SLOTTED
COLORED 4 OZ.
CAPACITY

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

SPOODLES 4 OZ. CAPACITY
STAINLESS STEEL
PERFORATED SPOONS
PORTION CONTROL
VOLLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

1.75

NO BID

NO BID

14.00

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-72

13

SPOODLES SLOTTED
COLORED 2 0Z.
CAPACITY

SPOODLES 2 OZ. CAPACITY
STAINLESS STEEL
PERFORATED SPOONS
PORTION CONTROL
VOLLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

NO BID

NO BID

13.75

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-73

13

SPOODLES SLOTTED
COLORED 602Z.
CAPACITY

SPOODLES 6 OZ. CAPACITY
STAINLESS STEEL
VOLLRATH OR

APPROVED EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

15.25

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-74

13

SPOON SOLID BOWL 15"

LENGTH

SPOON SOLID BOWL 15"
LENGTH STAINLESS STEEL
VOLLRATH #46981 CALICO
#3446981 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

1.25

0.77

3.00

NO BID

6.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-75

13

SPOON SOLID BOWL 11"

LENGTH

SPOONS SOLID BOWL 11"
LENGTH STAINLESS STEEL
VOLLRATH #46961 CALICO
#3446961 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

1.25

0.64

2.00

NO BID

5.30

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-76

13

BOWL STAND UNIT FOR
SECTIONIZER

BOWL STAND UNIT FOR
SUNKIST SECTIONIZER
TUBULAR CONSTRUCTION
WITH ROUNDED CORNER.
WHEEL LOCKS HOLD STAND
IN STATIONARY POSTION.
VOLLRATH #7930 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

83.75

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

810.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-77

13

PARING KNIVES

PARING KNIVES WHITE
POLYPROPYLENE FORMED
HANDLES. 3" CARBON
STEEL RAZOR EDGE BLADE.
NSF.

$5.21/ PACK OF
2

NO BID

7.50

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS
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13

BONING KNIVES
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BONING KNIVES WHITE
POLYPROPYLENE HANDLE
WITH 5/8" NARROW FLEX
CARBON STEEL BLADE.
BLADE LENGTH 6" LONG.
NSF

8.60

4.00

NO BID

11.20

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-79

13

FRENCH COOK'S KNIFE

FRENCH COOK'S KNIFE
WHITE POLYPROPYLENE
HANDLE STAINLESS STEEL
BLADE; LENGTH-8". NSF

14.00

NO BID

32.95

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-80

13

CHEF'S KNIFE

CHEF'S KNIFE CARBON
STEEL BLADE WHITE
POLYPROPYLENE
HANDLE.LENGTH 8" NSF

8.25

7.54

NO BID

18.45

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-81

13

CHEF'S KNIFE

CHEF'S KNIFE CARBON
STEEL BLADE WHITE
POLYPROPYLENE
HANDLE.LENGTH 10" NSF

10.10

NO BID

19.95

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-82

13

SLICER 8"LENGTH

SLICER 8"LENGTH
SCALLOPED EDGE. WHITE
POLYPROPYLENE HANDLE
STAINLESS STEEL
BLADE.NSF

9.50

5.89

4.50

NO BID

24.90

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-83

13

TOMATO SLICER

TOMATO SLICER KNIFE
BLADES CONSTRUCTED OF
STAINLESS STEEL. BLADE
SUPPORT AND PUSHER
ANODIZED ALUMINUM 18"
DEEP 9-3/4" WIDE AND 11-
1/2" HIGH TOMATO TAMER
PREFERRED OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

207.00

107.47

120.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-84

13

EGG SLICER

EGG SLICER HIGHLY
POLISHED ALUMINUM
ALLOY. RUSTPROOF STEEL
MUSIC WIRES. .

5.00

NO BID

7.65

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-85

13

VEGETABLE PEELER

NEE ACTION PEELERS
DOUBLE EDGE STAINLESS
STEEL BLADES.

1.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS
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13

ELECTRIC KNIFE
SHARPENER
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ELECTRIC KNIFE
SHARPENER EDLUND #395
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

386.00

NO BID

425.00

NO BID

525.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-87

13

CARTON OR CASE
OPENER

CARTON OR CASE OPENER ;

SUBMIT SAMPLE OR
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
QUOTED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-88

13

CAN OPENER MANUAL
WITH STAND

CAN OPENER MANUAL

CAST IRON CONSTRUCTION.

INCLUDE STAND WITH THE
BID. EDLUND MODEL #1 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

112.75

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

136.00

NO BID

125.05

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-89

13

CAN OPENER ELECTRIC

CAN OPENER ELECTRIC
WITH CLEANING TOOL
TABLE MODEL CAN OPENER
THAT OPENS 700 #10 CANS
PER HOUR DUAL SPEED
WITH HEAVY DUTY MOTOR;
STAINLESS STEEL HOUSING
SPRING LOADED;
REPLACEABLE GEAR AND
KNIFE. EDLUND #66 OR
APPROVED EQUAL. 115
VOLT AC-DC 60 H.P.

$
1,500.00

NO BID

$
1,575.00

NO BID

$
2,165.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-90

13

6" DEEP STEAM TABLE
PAN

6" DEEP STEAM TABLE PAN
MADE OF STAINLESS STEEL
FOR UNIFORM HEATING
WITH NO INTERIOR RIVETS
OR WELDS. FULL SIZE 20-
3/4" LONG X 12-3/4" WIDE X
6" DEEP 20 GAUGE
STAINLESS STEEL.
VOLLRATH #2006-2 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

18.50

21.70

22.00

NO BID

22.15

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

4" STEAM TABLE PAN
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4" STEAM TABLE PAN MADE
OF STAINLESS STEEL FOR
UNIFORM HEATING WITH
NO INTERIOR RIVETS OR
WELDS TO COLLECT FOOD
PARTICLES. FULL SIZE PAN
20-3/4" LONG X 12-3/4" WIDE
20 GAUGE STAINLESS
STEEL VOLLRATH #2004-5
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

13.95

16.22

17.50

NO BID

18.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-92

13

2-1/2" STEAM TABLE PAN

2-1/2" STEAM TABLE PAN
MADE OF STAINLESS STEEL
FOR UNIFORM HEATING
WITH NO INTERIOR RIVETS
TO COLLECT FOOD
PARTICLES. FULL SIZE
PANS 20-3/4" X 12-3/4" WIDE
OF 20 GAUGE STAINLESS
STEEL. VOLLRATH #2002-5
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

10.75

12.47

14.00

NO BID

14.95

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-93

13

FULL SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS; PERFORATED

FULL SIZE STEAM TABLE
PERFORATED PANS 17-3/4"
X 12-3/4" X 20"X 4"
VOLLRATH #1802-3 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

14.00

11.48

16.00

NO BID

14.40

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-94

13

1/4 SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS

1/4 SIZE STEAM TABLE PANS
, 18/8, GAUGE STAINLESS
STEEL 6-3/8" X 10-3/8" X 6"
DEEP. VOLLRATH #2046-2
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

10.45

12.00

NO BID

18.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-95

13

1/2 SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS

1/2 SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS, 22 GA. HEAVY
WEIGHT,18/8 STAINLESS
STEEL, ANTI JAMING 21/2"
DEEP

NO BID

16.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-96

13

1/2 SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS

1/2 SIZE STEAM TABLE
PANS, 22 GA. HEAVY
WEIGHT,18/8 STAINLESS
STEEL, ANTI JAMING 4"
DEEP

8.50

9.36

10.50

NO BID

14.70

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

PERFORATED 2-1/2" DEEP
PANS
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PERFORATED 2-1/2 PANS
CONSTRUCTED OF
STAINLESS STEEL.
OVERALL DIMENSIONS 20-
3/4" X 12 3/4" X 2-1/2"
VOLLRATH #2004-3 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

10.75

11.48

14.95

NO BID

18.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-98

13

SHEET BUN PANS

SHEET BUN PANS 25 3/4" X
17-3/4" X 1" ONE PIECE
CONSTRUCTION WITH
SANITARY OPEN HEAD
APPROVED BY NSF IN PLAIN
FINISH. WEAR EVER #53115
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

6.50

15.87

12.90

NO BID

14.80

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-99

13

BAKE/ROAST PANS

BAKE/ROAST PANS 17-3/4"
X 25-3/4" X 2-1/4" NSF
APPROVED CONSTRUCTED
OF DENT RESISTANT
ALUMINUM ALLOY. WEAR
EVER #5312 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

26.30

28.96

NO BID

NO BID

45.40

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-100

13

LOAF PAN

LOAF PAN HEAVY DUTY
ALUMINUM 6 LB. CAPACITY
10-3/8" X 5-1/2" X 4"

24.90

NO BID

NO BID

28.90

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-101

13

MUFFIN/CUP CAKE PANS

MUFFIN/CUP CAKE PANS 24
CUPS PER PAN. CUP SIZE 2-
3/4" PAN SIZE - 14-7/8" X 20-
3/4" X 1-1/4". TO BE
CONSTRUCTED OF
ALUMINUM. WEAR EVER
#5327 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

15.70

17.68

22.00

NO BID

19.74

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-102

13

DISH/UTILITY PAN 21
QUARTS

DISH/UTILITY PAN 21
QUARTS STAINLESS STEEL
WITH HANDLES. NSF
APPROVED WEAR EVER OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

59.80

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

DISH/UTILITY PAN 27
QUARTS

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

DISH/UTILITY PAN 27
QUARTS STAINLESS STEEL
WITH HANDLES. NSF
APPROVED WEAR EVER OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

$
109.45

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-104

13

DISH/UTILITY PAN 40
QUARTS

DISH/UTILITY PAN 40
QUARTS STAINLESS STEEL
WITH HANDLES. NSF
APPROVED WEAR EVER OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

103.60

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-105

13

FOOD STORAGE
CONTAINER WI/LID

FOOD STORAGE
CONTAINER WITH LID.
WHITE 8 QUART
RUBBERMAID #2608
(CONTAINER) AND #2668
(LID)

11.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-106

13

SAUCE POTS 2 QUART
CAPACITY

SAUCE POTS 2 QUART
CAPACITY STANDARD
WEIGHT NSF APPROVED
WITH SLOPING SLIDES
LONG HANDLE AND FLAT
BOTTOM MADE OF
ALUMINUM. WEAR EVER
#4342 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

19.00

8.50

NO BID

NO BID

14.25

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-107

13

HALF-SIZE COVERS

HALF-SIZE COVERS WITH
DEEP RECESS TO FORM A
TIGHT SEAL. WITH
HANDLES. VOLLRATH #7502-
5 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

16.30

4.86

NO BID

7.82

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-108

13

STEAM TABLE PAN
COVERS

FULL SIZE WITH DEEP
RECESS AND HANDLES TO
FORM A TIGHT SEAL.
VOLRATH OR APPROVED
EQUAL

28.00

12.00

NO BID

12.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-109

13

SUNKIST SECTIONIZER

FRUIT SECTIONIZER WITH
6/1 BLADE CAPACITY AND
BOWL SLICED MODEL OR
WEDGES

241.20

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

250.00

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

BOWL STAND UNIT FOR
SECTIONIZER

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

BOWL STAND UNIT FOR
SUNKIST SECTIONIZER
TUBULAR CONSTRUCTION
WITH ROUNDED CORNER.
WHEEL LOCKS HOLD STAND
IN STATIONARY POSTION.
VOLLRATH #7930 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

83.75

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-111

13

SUNKIST FRUIT
SECTIONIZER

FRUIT SECTIONIZER WITH
BOWL 4/1 BLADES SLICED
MODEL OR WEDGES

241.20

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-112

13

BAKERS BEAM SCALE 16
LB. CAP.

BAKERS BEAM SCALE
BALANCE BEAM SCALE
EQUIPPED WITH
REMOVABLE STAINLESS
STEEL SCOOP. STAINLESS
STEEL SLIDING POISE WITH
KNIFE EDGE SIS PIVOTS.
COMPTE WITH WEIGHTS
AND PLATES. BEAM IS
CALIBRATED 1/4 OZ. GRAD.
16 LB. CAPACITY. PELOUSE
BD16SC OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

$
495.00

NO BID

345.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-113

13

INDIVIDUAL PORTION
CONTROL SCALE

INDIVIDUAL PORTION
CONTROL SCALE RAIAL
PLASTIC DIAL PRINTING 1/4
OZ. GRADUATIONS WITH
ROTATING POINTER LARGE
EASY TO READ NUMERALS.
ACCURATE TO 1/8 OZ.
EDLUND SR-2 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

108.00

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

95.00

NO BID

149.00

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-114

13

KITCHEN SCALE 25 LBS.

KITCHEN SCALE 25 LB.
MAXIMUM WEIGHT.
GRADUATED IN 1/4 POUND
STEEL HOUSING;
ADJUSTABLE DIAL.NSF
EDLUND BRAND OR
APPROVED EQUAL

48.75

28.69

39.00

NO BID

99.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-115

13

GALLON GRADUATED
MEASURE

GALLON GRADUATED
MEASURE STANDARD
GAUGE PLASTIC CAMBRO
OR APPROVED EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

16.25

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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13

HALF GALLON
GRADUATED MEASURE

Minutes of April 25, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

HALF GALLON GRADUATED
MEASURE STANDARD
GAUGE STAINLESS STEEL
VOLLRATH #95640 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

53.00

DOES NOT
MEET BID
SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

NO BID

75.80

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-117

13

MEASURING CUP

MEASURING CUP
SEAMLESS ALUMINUM ONE
CUP MEASURE EMBOSSED
"THIRD" AND "FOURTH" CUP
GRADUATION. CONFORM
TO U.S. BUREAU OF
STANDARDS.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-118

13

MEASURETTE SET

MEASURETTE SET
STAINLESS STEEL 4 CUPS
PER SET; 1 1/2 1/4 AND 1/3
CUPS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-119

13

MEASURING SPOON SET

MEASURING SPOON SET
STAINLESS STEEL
CAPACITIES: U.S.
STANDARD 1/4 1/2 1
TEASPOON AND 1
TABLESPOON.
TABLESPOON-16 GAUGE
AND OTHER SPOONS 18
GAUGE.

151

NO BID

NO BID

5.50

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-120

13

DISHERS #6 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #6 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-121

13

DISHERS #8 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #8 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

DISHERS #10 SIZE
COLOR CODED
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DISHERS #10 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

5.75

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-123

13

DISHERS #12 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #12 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-124

13

DISHERS #16 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #16 SIZE SOID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-125

13

DISHERS #20 SIZE
COLOR COATED

DISHERS #20 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITHCOLORED PLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-126

13

DISHERS #24 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #24 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-127

13

DISHERS #30 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #30 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY
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13

DISHERS #40 SIZE
COLOR CODED
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DISHERS #40 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITH COLOREDPLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE

SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

4.50

5.37

NO BID

13.50

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-129

13

DISHERS #60 SIZE
COLOR CODED

DISHERS #60 SIZE SOLID
BOWL STAINLESS STEEL
WITHCOLORED PLASTIC
HANDLE AND REPLACEABLE
SPRINGS. HAMILTON
BEACH VOLLRATH OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

10.25

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

EQUIPMENT
CONCEPTS

13-130

13

DISH TOWELS 20" X 40"

DISH TOWELS 20" X 40"
100% COTTON TERRY
CLOTH. WEIGHT 4 IBS. /DOZ
CALICO OR APPROVED
EQUAL. PRICEPER
DOZEN SUBMIT A
SAMPLE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDDER

13-131

13

DISH CLOTHS 18" X 14"

DISH CLOTHS 15" X 18".
100% COTTON TERRY
CLOTH MEDIUM SOZE
TERRY BLOTTER-LIKE
ABSORBENCY WEIGHT 20
0Z /DOZ CALICO OR
APPROVED EQUAL.
SUBMIT A SAMPLE

PRICE PER DOZEN

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-132

13

POT HOLDERS 10" X 11"

POT HOLDERS 8" X 11".
100% COTTON TERRY
CLOTH CALICO PAW
GUARD BRAND OR
APPROVED EQUAL
PRICE PER DOZEN

23.00

31.97

25.00

NO BID

DOES NOT
MEET
SPECIFICATIONS

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-133

13

OVEN GLOVES 18"
TERRY CLOTH

OVEN GLOVES 18" TERRY
CLOTH CALICO 29G19 OR
500 PLUS  TUCKER BURN
GUARD. OR
PREAPPROVEDEQUAL.

3.25

10.82

$15.00/
PAIR

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-134

13

RUBBER GLOVES 18"
LENGTH

RUBBER GLOVES 18"
LENGTH 22 MIL THICKNESS
SIZE 9 OR MEDIUM EDMONT
WILSON #17301 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

10.00

5.00

NO BID

NO BID

45.10

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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BRUTE CONTAINERS 44
GALLON
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BRUTE CONTAINERS
44GALLON COLOR -
YELLOW RUBBERMAID OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

45.00

22.40

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-136

13

DISHWASHER RACK
PLATE/TRAY

DISHWASHER RACK ALL
PURPOSE PLATE AND TRAY
RACK 19-3/4" X 19-3/4" X 4~
1/8". VOLLRATH #52671
METRO P41M STERWOOD
33SA1 OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

18.20

12.61

17.00

NO BID

26.60

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-137

13

DISHWASHER RACK
FLATWARE

DISHWASHER RACK
FLATWARE 19-3/4" X 19-3/4"
X 4-1/8". VOLLRATH #52671
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

18.20

12.61

17.00

NO BID

26.60

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-138

13

CONVERSION DOLLY

CONVERSION DOLLY FOR
44 GALLON RUBBERMAID
BRUTE QUIET DOLLY OR
APPROVED EQUAL.
PROVIDE SPECS OF
BRANDS OTHER THAN
RUBBERMAID.

36.20

16.13

NO BID

NO BID

39.40

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-139

13

44 GALLON CONTAINER
FOR TRASH REMOVAL

ALL PLASTIC
PROFESSIONAL GRADE
CONSTRUCTION .NSF
CERTIFIED. ,24 DIAMETER X
31 1/2 "HEIGHT. ONLY RED,
BLUE OR GRAY.
RUBBERMAID BRUTE
CONTAINER OR APPROVED
BRAND. SUPPLY SPECS OF
BRANDS THAT ARE NOT
RUBBERMAID BRUITE
ROUND CONTAINER.

40.00

22.40

NO BID

NO BID

66.20

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-140

13

FLAME RETARDENT
MITTS 15"

FLAME RETARDENT MITTS
15" LENGTH.

$8.00/PAIR

$7.47/PAIR

$8.00/PAIR

NO BID

17.99

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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CLEAN-UP BRUSH SHORT
HANDLE
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CLEAN-UP BRUSH SHORT
HANDLE WITH BRUSH FACE
4-1/2" LONG X 5" WIDE WITH
PISTOL GRIP HANDLE
WHITE TYNEX NYLON
BRISTLES SPARTA 45S
CALICO 30BR12 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.
PROVIDE SAMPLE

3.70

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-142

13

CLEAN UP BRUSH LONG
HANDLE

CLEAN UP BRUSH LONG
HANDLE WITH BRUSH FACE
5" LONG X 5-1/2" WIDE
HANDLE LENGTH 20" WHITE
TYNEX NYLON BRISTLES.
SPARTA 20-45 CALICO
30BR12A OR APPROVED
EQUAL. PROVIDE SAMPLE

5.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-143

13

WIRE BRUSH

WIRE BRUSH OFFSET
PLASTIC HANDLE 4 X 16
ROWS OF 1" TUFTS SPARTA
#2840 CALICO 30BR19 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.

10.20

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-144

13

VEGETABLE BRUSH
CIRCLE SHAPE

VEGETABLE BRUSH CIRCLE
SHAPE WHITE NYLON
BRISTLES PLASTIC
HANDLE. CALICO 30BR402
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

8.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ECONOMICAL

13-145

13

OVEN BRUSH

OVEN BRUSH HANDLE
SHOULD BE INCLUDED. 8" X
2-7/8" X 1-1/4" SPARTA 420N
OR APPROVED EQUAL.

4.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-146

13

6/1 SUNKIST
SECTIONIZER BLADES

6/1 SUNKIST FRUIT
SECTIONIZER WEDGE OR
SLICE BLADES

35.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-147

13

4/1 SUNKIST
SECTIONIZER BLADES

4/1 SUNKIST FRUIT
SECTIONIZER WEDGE OR
SLICE BLADES

35.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ALACK
CULINARY

13-148

13

MIXING BOWL, 3 QUART

STAINLESS STEEL MIXING
BOWL , HEAVY DUTY
SEAMLESS ONE PIECE
STAINLESS STEEL
CONSTRUCTION

3.50

NO BID

NO BID

7.80

NO BID

ECONOMICAL
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STAINLESS STEEL MIXING
BOWL , HEAVY DUTY

13-149 13 MIXING BOWL, 5 QUART SEAMLESS ONE PIECE 4 gO 553 NO BID NO BID ]:sb 85 NO BID ECONOMICAL
STAINLESS STEEL ) ' '
CONSTRUCTION
STAINLESS STEEL MIXING
BOWL , HEAVY DUTY $ $ $
13-150 13 MIXING BOWL,8 QUART SEAMLESS ONE PIECE 6.70 6.48 NO BID NO BID 14.60 NO BID ECONOMICAL
STAINLESS STEEL ) ’ .
CONSTRUCTION
STAINLESS STEEL MIXING
BOWL , HEAVY DUTY $ $ $
13-151 13 MIXING BOWL,16 QUART SEAMLESS ONE PIECE 11.50 10.79 NO BID NO BID 16.00 NO BID ECONOMICAL
STAINLESS STEEL ) ’ '
CONSTRUCTION
STAINLESS STEEL MIXING
BOWL , HEAVY DUTY $ $ $
13-152 13 MIXING BOWL, 20 QUART SEAMLESS ONE PIECE 12.80 11.98 NO BID NO BID 19.80 NO BID ECONOMICAL

STAINLESS STEEL
CONSTRUCTION
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There were no items to be placed on the Agenda of the next committee meeting.

Under Superintendent’s recommendation Ms. Voitier mentioned that students are
in the middle of state wide assessment. She then noted that this week progress
reports will go home and during the following week the AdvancEd team will be
visiting for our district wide accreditation. Ms. Voitier relayed that May 6" is Job
Fair, May 10" is St. Bernard Day at the Capital, High School Graduation is May
11" and the St. Bernard School Board Lions Club Golf Tournament will be held
during the upcoming weekend. Ms. Voitier also asked that parents be aware of all
the end of year activities and ceremonies that will be taking place in May.

On motion of Mrs. Asevedo, seconded by Mr. Gaines and passed by a unanimous
voice vote, the meeting was adjourned.

Diana B. Dysart/s Doris Voitier/s
DIANA B. DYSART DORIS VOITIER
PRESIDENT SECRETARY




