REGULAR MONTHLY MEETING
JUNE 27, 2017

The St. Bernard Parish School Board met in a Regular Monthly Meeting on
Tuesday, June 27, 2017 at 6:00 p.m. in the St. Bernard Parish School Board
Office. Following the Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance, the Secretary called
the roll. Present were, Mrs. Diana B. Dysart, President, Mr. Donald D.
Campbell, Dr. Hugh C. Craft, Mr. William H. Egan, Mr. Clifford M.
Englande, Mr. Carl W. Gaines, Jr., Mrs. Katherine K. Lemoine, Dr.
Henderson Lewis, Jr., Mr. Joseph V. Long, Sr., and Mr. Sean K. Warner.
Mrs. Darleen P. Asevedo was absent.

Mr. Englande asked for a point of privilege to acknowledge the success of the
recent production of “The Little Mermaid” at the Chalmette High School
Cultural Arts Center. Mr. Englande encouraged those who have not seen it
yet to get tickets for the upcoming weekend performances. Many Board
Members agreed with Mr. Englande about the professional quality of the
stage, sets, costumes, and student performances.

No one wished to address the Board under Community Concerns.

Mrs. Dysart addressed the next agenda item concerning the recognition of
Chalmette High School as an Advanced Placement Program of Distinction.
Principal of Chalmette High School, Wayne Warner, Assistant Principal,
Carole Mundt and Assistant Principal, Kelli Watson appeared before the
Board regarding this honor. Ms. Voitier explained that during the previous
week, the BESE Board (Board of Elementary and Secondary Education) and
the Board of Regents met and honored a few school systems as being
Advance Placement Programs of Distinction. The distinction lies in the
number of students who are taking these advanced placement courses and
scoring high enough to earn college credit for them.

At this time Ms. Voitier invited the school administrators to explain the
advanced placement program. Mrs. Watson explained that students are
identified as being able to participate in the advanced courses based on
previous performance and their desire to excel in those courses. She states
that the courses definitely gives the student the ability to experience the rigor
within the college course and determine if that setting is comfortable for them
before they actually go to college. She also stated that the number of students
participating in these courses is on the rise and scoring very well at the
conclusion. Mrs. Watson was also proud to announce that one particular
component within the program that assisted in gaining the recognition was the
fact that a large percentage of the AP students were minorities. Mrs. Watson
very proudly announced that 4 out of 7 of the AP exams showed students
scored higher than the state average within private and public schools. Mrs.
Watson gave a lot of credit to teachers who do a great job of teaching these
college credit courses to high school students.

Dr. Craft was proud in saying that when his grandson left Chalmette High he
went on the Louisiana State University as a sophomore having gained enough
credits from his AP courses in high school. Mrs. Dysart noted that more than
half of the 400 students who graduated last year left with some type of college
credit. She commended Chalmette High for their hard work and passed on to
the administrators the award letter for their being named an Advance
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Placement Program of Distinction.
A short break was taken to take photos.

At this time Mrs. Dysart called Mrs. Beverly Lawrason up to the podium to
receive recognition for her service upon her retirement. To recognize Mrs.
Lawrason, Mrs. Dysart thanked her for her years of service as a teacher,
educator, administrator and a friend. Mrs. Dysart wished her a happy
retirement and presented to her a plaque honoring her dedication and service
to the children of St. Bernard Parish from 1973 to 2017.

Mrs. Lawrason thanked the Board for this recognition and reminisced about
her years as an employee and even as a daughter of a teacher. She thanked
Ms. Voitier for allowing her to be her assistant and reminded the Board as to
how wonderful a Superintendent we have in Ms. Voitier. Mrs. Lawrason
thanked the Board for their leadership and for the privilege to serve them.

On a motion by Dr. Lewis seconded by Mr. Warner, the Board voted by a
unanimous roll call vote of the members present to incorporate the Report of
the June, 2017 General Committee Meeting into the Minutes of the June
Regular Monthly meeting.

GENERAL COMMITTEE REPORT
TUESDAY, JUNE 13, 2017

The St. Bernard Parish School Board met as a Committee of the Whole on
Tuesday, June 13, 2017 at 6:00 p.m. in the Board Room of the St. Bernard
Parish School Board Office. Following the Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance,
the Secretary called the roll. Present were, Mrs. Diana B. Dysart, President,
Mrs. Darleen P. Asevedo, Mr. Donald D. Campbell, Mr. William H. Egan,
Mr. Carl W. Gaines, Jr., Mr. Clifford M. Englande, Mrs. Katherine K.
Lemoine, Mr. Joseph V. Long, Sr., and Mr. Sean K. Warner. Dr. Hugh C.
Craft and Dr. Henderson Lewis, Jr. were absent.

Mrs. Dysart welcomed Mr. Jason Brown of the St. Bernard Voice to the
meeting.

Mrs. Dysart next welcomed Ms. Alex Schneider to present the June 2017
edition of Super News. She began by highlighting a few upcoming events
such as the Performing Arts Academy production of “The Little Mermaid”
which will run from June 22" through July 2" at the CHS Cultural Arts
Center and the Maumus Center Planetarium public showings which are
scheduled throughout June and July.

Ms. Schneider next proceeded to topics within the Super News Video. The
topics covered this month included CHS Graduation, Kindergarten, 5" Grade
and 8" Grade exit ceremonies, Coroner Reading and Writing awards
presentation, Summer swim lessons, The Little Mermaid production,
Methodist School Based Health Center Clinic 10 Year Anniversary, School
Board Financial Reporting Awards for Excellence, Special Olympics State
Olympic participation and recognition as a Program of Distinction, Smith
Elementary Beta Club heads to Disney World for the National Beta
Competition, Academic Games Nationals participants head to Wheeling, West
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Virginia to compete and Teacher Features on Michelle Foland of Rowley
Alternative, Tiffani Glapion Assistant Principal at Davies Elementary,
Melissa Collins of Lacoste Elementary School, Beverly Brumfield also of
Lacoste Elementary, Jodi Crifasi of Smith Elementary School and Kailyn
Lotz of Arabi Elementary School. The last bit of info announced the Maumus
Center Planetarium shows for the summer.

Dr. Craft arrived at the meeting during the Super News presentation.

Mrs. Dysart thanked Ms. Schneider, Barry Lemoine and Jack Jackson for
their Super News production.

Mrs. Dysart turned the meeting over to Mr. Gaines as the Education
Committee Chair and he welcomed Mr. Conrad Browne, Technology
Coordinator, to update the Board on Erate and Technology in the School
System.

Regarding Erate, Mr. Browne explained that this is a federal program that is
available for schools and libraries who can received a discount on your
telecommunications bills based upon your free and reduced lunch population
with 90% being the maximum that can be covered by Erate. The information
shown below was presented to the Board.

Erate

Overview of Erate Program

Current Telecommunications Provider is Cox

Includes data lines, Internet Access and Phone Service
Contract is for 3 Years 2016-2019 with 2 voluntary extensions
(2021)

Meraux is added to upcoming funding year

Current Discount Rate is 90%

Pre-discount amount: $164,813.28

Erate share: $148,331.95

Our Share: $16,481.33

Regarding technology in the district, Mr. Browne provided the following
information.

Technology

3348 Desktop Computers
600 Teacher Laptops
800 iPads
1600 Chromebooks
Last Summer:
o Projectors at 9" Academy, Middle Schools, Rowley
and Smith
o Wireless was upgraded at 3 Middle Schools (Access
Point in each classroom)
o 260 Desktops were replaced
o Replaced 60 Teacher Laptops
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e This Summer:
o Projectors at Arabi, Chalmette Elementary, Lacoste
and Gauthier
o Wireless upgrade at all Elementary Schools and
Rowley
o Replace 75 Teacher Laptops
e 2500 Chromebooks on order for the new school year:
o 1 Cart Every 5" Grade Class
o 1 Cart Every 6-8 ELA, Science and Social Studies
classrooms
o 1 Cart Every EOC classroom
e June 1 and June 2, 28 teacher leaders received Google Level 1
training
e Week of June 5, 28 teachers took the exam to become Google
Level 1 certified. Long term goal is to complete Level 2
certification then the trainer certification. This would allow these
28 leaders to be Google Certified to train others.
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After all questions were addressed, Mr. Gaines thanked Mr. Brown for his
Erate and Technology Review.

Dr. Craft continued with Executive Committee business and invited Mr.
Granberry to share the Personnel Changes for June 2017. Mrs. Dysart and
Mr. Gaines congratulated retiree Elizabeth Lauga from Chalmette Elementary
and thanked her for her years of service. Dr. Craft thanked Mr. Granberrry for
the information.

As Finance Committee Chair, Mr. Englande welcomed Dr. Charles Raviotta,
Curriculum Supervisor, to present a request to approve the Head Start request
for expenditure of a COLA increase. Dr. Raviotta explained that a notice was
received regarding a Head Start COLA increase of $8,301.00 which he is
requesting to dedicate toward supplies.

Dr. Craft moved to approve the Head Start request for expenditure of the
$8,301.00 COLA increase on supplies. Seconded by Mr. Warner, the motion
passed unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present.

Mr. Englande then welcomed Mr. Fernandez to discuss the Official Journal
bid tabulation. The only proposal was from the St. Bernard Voice at the cost
of $2.94 per columnar inch and $2.94 per square to publish all minutes and
public notices. Mr. Fernandez stated that the Administration recommends the
St. Bernard Voice as its Official Journal.

Mrs. Dysart moved to recommend to the Board to accept the proposal of the
St. Bernard Voice as the School Board’s Official Journal for the fiscal year
2017-2018. Seconded by Mr. Long, the motion passed by a roll call vote of
the members present with no objections.

Mr. Fernandez next presented the tabulation of bids for Vehicle painting and
body repairs for July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018. Two bids were
submitted. The Administration recommends the low bidder — Car Craft Inc.
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On motion of Mr. Gaines and seconded by Mrs. Asevedo, the Committee
voted by a unanimous roll call vote of the members present to recommend to
the Board to accept the Administration’s recommendation of Car Craft as the
provider of Vehicle painting and body repairs for School Board vehicles for
July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018.

Mr. Fernandez next presented the Committee with the tabulation of bids for
gasoline, diesel, lubricating oil, antifreeze and transmission fluid for the fiscal
year July 1, 2017 — June 30, 2018. Mr. Fernandez stated that FleetCor was
the low bidder for both gasoline and diesel fuel and therefore was the
Administration’s recommendation. Mr. Fernandez noted that for lubricating
oil the award goes to Davison Oil based on their bulk price of 825 gallons and
the price of a single 55 gallon drum. For Anti-freeze the Administration
recommended Safety Kleen with a low bid of $5.33 per gallon and $293.00
per 55 gallon drum. As the low bidder for transmission fluid, Safety Kleen
was the low bidder with a price of $10.48 per gallon and $576.24 per 55
gallon drum.

Dr. Craft moved to recommend to the Board to accept the recommendation by
the Administration to have the low bidders; Fleetcor provide gasoline and
diesel, Davison Oil provide lubricating oil, Safety Kleen provide antifreeze
and transmission fluid for the fiscal year of July 1, 2017 through June 30,
2018. Seconded by Mr. Warner, the motion passed by a unanimous roll call
vote of the members present.

Mr. Fernandez next presented the bid tabulation for paper, cleaning and
custodial supplies. He stated that the Administration recommend accepting
the lowest responsive bidder in each category.

With a motion by Mr. Warner and seconded by Mrs. Dysart, the Committee
voted unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present to recommend
to the Board to approve the lowest responsive bidder in each category of the
paper, cleaning and custodial product bid tabulation.

Under Superintendent Recommendations Ms. Voitier noted that at the June
27" meeting the Administration is going to ask the Board to announce that at
the August 22" meeting the Board consider adopting a resolution ordering the
call of an election to be held on November 18, 2017 for the purpose of
renewing currently levied operational millages. She also noted that she was
so pleased with the summer offerings of the Swim Lessons, Summer Skills,
the Planetarium shows, athletic programs and the stage production of Little
Mermaid which enrich the lives of the children in the parish and also
professional development offered for employees.

On motion of Mr. Campbell, seconded by Mrs. Asevedo and passed by a
unanimous voice vote, the meeting was adjourned.

k,kkhkkhkkhhkhhkkhkkhhkhhkhkhkhkhhkkihkhhkhhkhkrhihkkihkihkhhkhkikhihihkikhihihkiikkx

Ms. Lemoine moved to approve the minutes of the April 25, 2017 Regular
Monthly Meeting as published on June 16, 2017. Seconded by Mr. Gaines,
the motion passed unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present.

Mr. Englande moved to approve the minutes of May 3, 2017 Special Meeting
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as published on June 23, 2017. Seconded by Dr. Craft, the motion passed
unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present.

Mr. Campbell moved to approve the May 9, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting
minutes as published on June 23, 2017. Seconded by Mr. Long, the motion
passed unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present.

Mrs. Dysart next welcomed Ms. Voitier to present the June 2017 Personnel
changes. Mrs. Dysart congratulated Elizabeth Lauga on her retirement and
thanked her for her years of service.

ST. BERNARD PARISH SCHOOL BOARD
MINUTES OF JUNE 27, 2017

CHANGES FOR BOARD MEMBERS INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE
ONLY:
PERSONNEL CHANGES — TEACHERS

APPOINTMENTS
Jared Trevor Smith
Elena Hodges

Mallory Scott

Sandra D’ Arensbourg
Rebecca Milliman
Anjel Magee

Cody Palazzolo
James Hamilton
Zachary Howarth
Samantha Torres
Khadijah Wilson
Claire Smith

My (Linda) Colombo
Danielle Broadhead
Allie Pigrenet
Rozetta Millner
Daniel Munch

Abbie Cates

Mary Fenney

Administration Office-Computer Service Manager
Chalmette High School-Home Economics Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Meraux Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Gauthier Pre-School-Pre-K Teacher

(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Andrew Jackson Middle-Special Education Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High School-High School Teacher
Chalmette High School-High School Teacher
Chalmette High School-High School Teacher
Chalmette High School-High School Teacher

St. Bernard Middle-Elementary Teacher

Gauthier Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Meraux Elementary-Special Education Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Lacoste Elementary-Kindergarten Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High School-Gifted High School Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette High School-High School Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher
(Temporary Assignment 2017-18 School Year)
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RESIGNATIONS

Krystle Carbuccia Meraux Elementary-Elementary Teacher 8/1/17

Laura Barwick Davies Elementary-Librarian 8/1/17

Ashley Shinpoch Andrew Jackson Middle-Elementary Teacher 8/1/17

Angela Thomas Lacoste Elementary-Kindergarten Teacher 8/1/17

Elizabeth Hebert Chalmette Elementary-Kindergarten Teacher 8/1/17

Hanna Sherlock Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher 8/1/17

Dale Seminara Andrew Jackson Middle-Special Education Teacher
8/1/17

Amy Aucoin-Byrd Trist Middle-Elementary Teacher 6/24/17

Shannon Wilkes Davies Elementary-Elementary Teacher 8/1/17

RETIREE

Elizabeth Lauga Chalmette Elementary-Elementary Teacher 5/27/17

SUPPORT PERSONNEL
APPOINTMENTS

Frances McLeod Davies Elementary-Part-Time Cafeteria Tech
Lois Major Rowley Alternative-Paraeducator

TRANSFER

Jonel Perez From Smith Elementary-Paraeducator to Meraux
Elementary 12 Month School Secretary

MEDICAL

Joyce Bayhi Davies Elementary-Custodian

k,kkhkkkhkhkhkhkhkkhkhhkihhkhhkhkhkhkkhhkkihkkikkhhkkihhhkhhhihkikiixkx

As recommended by the Committee, Dr. Lewis moved to approve the Head
Start request for expenditure of their COLA increase. Seconded by Mr.
Gaines, the motion passed unanimously by a roll call vote of the members
present.

On recommendation from the Committee and on motion of Mrs. Lemoine,
seconded by Mr. Campbell and passed by a roll call vote of the members
present with no objections, the Board voted to approve the St. Bernard Voice,
as the Official Journal of the St. Bernard Parish School Board for July 1, 2017
through June 30, 2018, at a cost of $2.94 per column inch.

On recommendation from the Committee, Mr. Long moved to approve the
Administration’s Recommendation to choose Car Craft Incorporated for bus
painting and minor body repairs for the fiscal year, July 1, 2017 through June
30, 2018. Seconded by Mr. Gaines, the motion passed by a unanimous roll
call vote of the members present.
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Painting & Minor Body Repairs
July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018

BID TABULATION

Vendor Car Craft Fradella's
PAINT / BODY BID HOURLY RATES HOURLY RATES
Body Labor 48.00 50.00
Mechanic Labor 28.00 25.00
Frame Labor 24.00 25.00
Re-Finish (Paint Labor) 48.00 50.00
Paint Materials 28.00 28.00
TOTALS 176.00 178.00

As recommended by the Committee, Mr. Warner offered a motion to approve
the low bidders, Fleetcor to provide gasoline and diesel, Davison Qil to
provide lubricating oil, Safety Kleen for antifreeze and Safety Kleen for
transmission fluid for the fiscal year of July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018.
Seconded by Mr. Englande, the motion passed without objection by a roll call
vote of the members present.
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St. Bernard Parish School Board
Gasoline, Diesel, Lubricating Oil, AntiFreeze, and Transmission Fluid
July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018
Vendor Retif Oil Davison Oil Siarc Oil Safety Kleen FIIetCorrfFueIma Winning Bid

Unleaded Gas 87 FleetCor

OPIS Average Price 1.452

Service Fees NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.129

Non Exempt Tax 0.2111

Total Price 1.7921 $1.79
Diesel #2 Low Sulfur FleetCor

OPIS Average Price 1.4847

Service Fees NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.199

Non Exempt Tax 0.2111

Total Price 1.8948 $1.89
Lubricating QOil Davison Oil

Trade Name Naviguard Fleet CAM 2 Super HD Rubia TIR 7900 Performance

15w/40 15w/40 15w40 Plus SAE 15w40
825 Gallons in Bulk $5.98 $5.74 $8.68 $6.27 NO BID $5.74
55 Gallon Drum $383.9/$6.98 $359 / $6.53 $573.55/$10.43 $405.33 / $7.37

$359.00
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Vendor Retif Oil Davison Oil Siarc Ol Safety Kleen FIIetCorr{FueIma Winning Bid
AntiFreeze Safety Kleen
Trade Name Hightech 50/50 MajorBrand Red 50/50 Total HDLL Coolant Unlvgrsal Rt
Anti-Freeze
55 Gallon Drum 398.00 475 701.66 293.30 NO BID
$ $ $ $ $293.30
Per Gallon $6.98 $8.65 $5.33 $5.33 $5.33
Transmission Fluid -220
Gal Davison Oil
Hyperion HD Syn , Total Fluro-matic Syn Multi-Vehicle
Trade Name Trans Eluid Shell Spirax S6ATF295 NA ATE
220 Gallons in Bulk $13.98 $30.68 $15.75 $13.43 NO BID $30.68
$576.24 / $1687/
55 Gallon Drum $819/$14.89 $1687 / $30.67 $866.09 / $15.75 $10.48 $30.67

* Davison Oil is the winner for Transmission Fluid. All other vendors did not meet bid specifications.
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On recommendation of the Board Mrs. Lemoine moved to approve the
Administration’s recommendation to approve the low bidder for Paper,
Cleaning and Custodial Supplies for the fiscal year July 1, 2017 to June 30,
2018 as shown in the bid tabulation below. Seconded by Mr. Warner, the
motion passes unanimously by a roll call vote of the members present.



Minutes of the June 27, 2017 Regular Monthly Meeting

SHORT

ITEM# | CLASS DESCRIPTION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
DETERGENT POWDERED
DETERGENT FOR HAND OR MACHINE $ .
CL102 11 POWDERED WASHING. TIDE BRAND BUCKET NO BID NO BID NO BID 2164 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
OR EQUAL 1 /50# PACK
EASY NAP DISPENSER
NAPKINS P'XQEE Illz\gl_#gé%)élvzv: E\I\/E’x DOES NOT $ DOES NOT
CL106 11 " - CASE MEET NO BID NO BID NO BID MEET NO BID Economical
STANDARD 1) 6.5" X 5", 6000 COUNT SPECIEICATIONS 33.95 SPECIEICATIONS
PER CASE, 24 PACKAGES
IN THE CASE .
STRAWS MILK 6 INCHES
LONG INDIVIDUALLY $
CL107 11 STRAWS MILK WRAPPED MEDIUM CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
DIAMETER INDICATE :
12000 CT.
STRAWS MILK 7 3/4
JUMBO INCHES LONG $ $
CL108 11 DRINKING INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.95 NO BID 34.00 NO BID Economical
STRAWS LARGE DIAMETER ! ’

INDICATE NO./CASE

Page 12
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-I ON LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
DISPOSABLE CLOTH
TOWEL MADE WITH 100%
ORLON/RAYON CLOTH
FIBERS 13 1/2" X 24" 300
CL110 11 D'?g‘ﬁéi"'z PER CASE WHITE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 29%9 NO BID NO BID 56.95 | Economical
W/DARK STRIPES :
KIMBERLY CLARK
WYPALL #05925 OR
APPROVED EQUAL.
POLY GLOVES CLEAR
MED. LGTH SMALL,
MED,LG AND X LARGE. )
CcL112 11 POLgL(é;%VES SIZE APPROX 11' LG. CASE . j7 NO BID s fo s iz BlggFI’EESC’\Ilg-CrL\\ATEIgLS NO BID 419 D'SSpO\fe N
DISPOSABLE 100/ROLL OR : : : ave
BOX 10 BOXES PER CASE
PRICS.
LATEX EXAM GLOVE
WITH POWDER 1000
CLilz' 11 LATGEL)E)E/EAM CASE, SIZES SMALL, 10/100 31$18 NO BID 27%0 26$73 25%0 29%0 39.90 | Interboro
MEDUIM, LARGE AND X : ' : : :
LARGE NSF APPROVED
LATEX EXAM GLOVES
LATEX GLOVES 1000 PER CASE s s s s s
CL112A 1 -NON- \WITHOUT POWDER 1000/CS NO BID 36.90 | Economical
POWDERED SIZES SMALL. MED 31.28 29.00 26.73 28.50 33.00
LARGE AND X LARGE.
VINYL GLOVES—- | NON LATEX GLOVES/
NON- LATEX VINYL 1000 PER CASE , $ $ $ $ $ -
CLi1zse 1 GLOVES/ SIZES SMALL, MEDIUM , 1000/Cs 31.28 NOBID 18.00 16.85 17.40 22.00 22.90 | Economical
GLOVES LARGE AND X LARGE

Page 13
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHR?PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
NON-LATEX NON-LATEX GLOVES/
cL VINYL GLOVES VINYL WITHOUT $ $ $ $ $
11 POWDER, 1000 PER CASE, | 1000/CS NO BID 22.90 | Economical
112C WITHOUT 31.28 20.40 17.43 19.80 22.00
COWDER SIZES SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE AND X LARGE.
LIGHT WEIGHT RUBBER
GLOVE SIZES SMALL,
MEDIUM, LARGE OR X
LIGHT WEIGHT LARGE SUITABLE FOR $ :
CL113 11 RUBBER GLOVE LIGHT  CLEAN.UP DOZ/PER NO BID NO BID NO BID aea NO BID NO BID 538 | Economical
DUTIES ; 12 PK, FOOD
SERVICE RUBBERMAID
OR APPROVED EQUAL.
NYLON LIGHTWEIGHT
NYLON ,FIRE .
cL114 11 H"‘,\\l's’t'gLS . RETARDANT DARK 144/BAG NO BID NO BID 10$35 11$5 . BIB(SDF',EES‘C’\I'SE /’;\"TEIELS NO BID NO BID D'SSP;\?: N
BROWN OR BLACK ; 144 : :
CT.
HAIR NETS-
INSTITUTIONAL
HAIR NETS - BOUFFANT CAP; NON $ .
CL117 11 NON WOVEN WOVEN PAPER FABRICLO CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 1765 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
BOXES/CASE 100PER BOX
1000 CASE.
CHOICE 2 0Z. CLEAR
CL117- 2 0Z PLASTIC POLYSTYRENE SOUFFLE $ $ .
N 11 PORTION CUPS CUP/ PORTION CUP CASE 2758 NO BID NO BID 2260 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

2400/CASE
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ITEM# CLASS DESSCHR?PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
CHOICE CLEAR
POLYSTYRENE LID OR 2
CLéﬂ_ 11 CLECASPPSRDEON OZ CLEAR POLYSTYRENE CASE 22%8 NO BID NO BID 19$60 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SOUFFLE CUP/ PORTION i !
CUP 2400 /CASE
DISPOSABLE
POLYETHYLENE.
COMPONENT
CL 117- POLYETHYLENE MATERIALS. MINIMUM $
c 11 BIB DISPOSABLE 1.5 MIL THICK COMPLY 500/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.23 NO BID NO BID 32.90 Economical
APRONS WITH FDA FOOD '
CONTACT
REGULATIONS. 28 W X
46 1. 500 PER CASE
CUPS, SOUFFLE, 5.5 OZ.
CUPS SOUFFLE PAPER 5000/ CASE ; $ $ .
CL118 11 5507, PAPER GENPAK F550 OR SOLO 5000/ case 67.61 NO BID NO BID 65.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SCC550
CUPS, SOUFFLE 1.25 0Z
PAPER SOUFFLE/PORTION
CL119 1 S e CUP 5000/CASE 5000/case 37%0 NO BID NO BID 36%6 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
: ’ GENPAKKF 1/20Z OR ! !
SOLO 125-2050 / 5000/CASE
SOUFFLE CUPS SOUFFLE CUPS 1/2 OZ. $ $ .
CL120 11 12 0Z. 5000 PER CASE 5000/case 29.59 NO BID NO BID 28.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

Page 15
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
CUPS STYRO
CUPS STYRO HOT $ $ .
CL121 11 HOT C%l;FEE 10 COEFEE 10 OZ. CASE 23.47 NO BID NO BID 2965 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CUPS STYRO HOTAND
CUPS STYRO
CL121- COLD COFFEE 16 OZ , BIG $ $ .
A 11 HOT Cg;FEE 16 DRINK CUPS {J CUP:DART CASE 37.42 NO BID NO BID 36.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
PREF. BRAND}
LIDS TO FIT PLASTIC UNIVERSAL LID
CL121- STYRO HOT TO FIT STYRO HOT $ $
B 11 COEEEE 16 0Z COFFEE 16 OZ. BID DRINK CASE 15.74 NO BID NO BID 1754 NO BID NO BID NO BID A&L
cup CUPS (JCUP:DART PREF. ’ ’
BRAND);1000 PK
CUPS 16 0Z CUPS 16 OZ. COLD DRINK $ $
CL122 11 ) CLEAR SOFT PLASTIC; CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
COLD DRINK 1000 PK 35.70 34.85
JUICE CUPS 6 OZ. $
CL123 11 JUICE CUPS COATED PAPER BOARD CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
1000 PER CASE ’
BOWLS DESSERT 40Z.
DISPOSABLE FOR
BOWLS HOT/COLD FOOD CLEAR,
WHITE PLASTIC COATED $ $ .
CL125 11 DDEISS?)IE)Z‘LSSEZ PAPER OR STYROFOAM. 1000/CS 15.22 NO BID NO BID 1483 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

1000/CASE - DART 4BWWF
OR PREAPPROVED
EQUAL

Page 16
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHR?PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
BOWLS " HoToRcoLd s s
CL126 11 I?:I(')SZ%IS/%\%IEE INSULATED FOAM CASE 33.59 NO BID NO BID 15.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
) BOWLS. 20/50/CS
BOWL 502 BOWL 5 0Z. STYRO, $ $
CL127 11 : WHITE, 20/50/CASE; DART CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
STYRO 15.22 14.83
OR EQUAL
SINGLE SERVING CLEAR
SINGLE PORTION TRAYS; 6 FLUID
SERVING CLEAR OZ OFFER VS SERVE CUP $ $ :
CL128 11 PORTION TRAYS CLEAR. 15 MIL THICK, CASE 37.00 NO BID NO BID 36.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
60Z /31/2" X 31/2" X 11/2" ;
2000/CASE
oL 126. o on” | UNIVERSAL LID, FITS 15 s s
11 ! MIL OFFER VS SERVE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
1 OFFER VS. TRAYS. 2500 PER CASE 47.50 47.15
SERVE TRAYS ’
9" LUNCHEON HEAVY
WEIGHT PLASTIC
CL128- 9" LUNCHEON PLATES, THE CONCORD $ $
P 11 PLATES, CLEAR COLLECTION/ CASE 83.07 NO BID NO BID 4634 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
PLASTIC MARYLAND PLASTICS, ' '

INC. PREFERED. 15 PER
PACK
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
12 OZ SOUP AND SALAD
BOWLS HEAVY WEIGHT
CL-128- 12 OZ. SOUP PLASTIC BOWLS, THE $ $
4 11 AND SALAD CONCORD CASE 50.68 NO BID NO BID 38.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
BOWLS COLLECTION/MARYLAND ’ ’
PLASTICS, INC.
PREFERED. 15 PER PACK.
6" CAKE HEAVY WEIGHT
6" CAKE PLASTIC PLATES, THE
CL128- CONCORD COLLECTION/ $ $ :
3 11 PLAF‘JrLE:.S_(I:‘II&EAR MARYLAND PLASTICS, CASE 105.21 NO BID NO BID 2717 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
INC. PREFERED. 15
PLATES PER PACK
PLATES 7" CLEAR
PLATES 7" PLASIC - PST75 SOLO $ $
CL129 11 CLEAR PLASTIC SUBMIT SAMPLE IF CASE 60.94 NO BID NO BID 39.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
ALTERNATE. PACK =500 ’ ’
10/50
PLATE 6" PLATE 6" STYRO CASE $ $ .
CL130 11 STYROFOAM PACK 1000 20/50 CASE 15.89 NO BID NO BID 15.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
TABLE CLOTH WHITE
rasie cioms | | PLASTICROLL SO0°T : ;
CL131 11 WHIT'E(;’II__I,_ASTIC THICKNESS AT LEAST .08 ROLL NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.95 NO BID 11.00 NO BID Lagniappe
MM. MEASURES 40"X100'
PER ROLL
DOLLIES PAPER WHITE
DOLLIES WHITE " $ $ .
CL132 11 RECTANGLE 18" RECTANGLE 18 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID 132.06 NO BID 70.00 NO BID Lagniappe

PACK 2000 BOX
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
CL132- DOLLIES PAPER DOLLIES PAPER WHITE $ $
1 11 WHITE ROUND ROUND 12" BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.10 NO BID 15.00 NO BID Economical
12" 500 PER BOX ’ '
LINERS GARBAGE
LINERS 44 HEAVY DUTY 44 GAL
GALLON MINIMUM 1.5 MIL , 43 X DOES NOT DOES NOT MEET DOES NOT $ DOES NOT MEET DOES NOT
CL136 11 CONTAINERS 47; BLACK OR WHITE, NO CASE MEET PRODUCT MEET PRODUCT 17.60 BIDSPECIFICATIONS MEET NO BID Economical
200/CASE CLEAR BAGS. 'SUBMIT SPECIFICATIONS | SPECIFICATIONS | SPECIFICATIONS ’ SPECIFICATIONS
SAMPLE' PRIOR TO BID
OPENING 200/CS
LINERS GARBAGE
HEAVY DUTY 32 GALLON
LINERS 32 CAN LINERS , MINIMUM DOES NOT DOES NOT MEET DOES NOT $ DOES NOT MEET DOES NOT
CL137 11 GALLON 1.5 MILS , BLACK OR CASE MEET PRODUCT MEET PRODUCT 11.45 BIDSPECIFICATIONS MEET NO BID Economical
CONTAINER WHITE, NO CLEAR BAGS. SPECIFICATIONS | SPECIFICATIONS | SPECIFICATIONS ’ SPECIFICATIONS
SUBMIT SAMPLE PRIOR
TO BID OPENING; 150 PK
CL141 11 BLEACH BLEACH 6/1 GAL. CASE 6/1 CASE 8 fz NO BID NO BID 7 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SQUEEZE SQUEEZE BOTTLE WITH $ $
CL145 11 SPRAY TYPE CAP 8 0OZ. ONE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
BOTTLE 1.09 0.95
PLASTIC
BROOM BROOM WAREHOUSE $ $ $
CL146 11 WAREHOUSE QUALITY BROOM, CORN, 1EACH 6.05 NO BID NO BID 414 NO BID 495 4.99 Economical

5 TIES METAL BONDED;
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
PARLOR BROOM LIGHT
WEIGHT ; SWEEP 100 % , $ $ DOES NOT
CL146A 11 PARLOR BROOM ALL CORN PARLOR 1 EACH 582 NO BID NO BID 295 NO BID NO BID MEET BID Economical
BROOM; BRISTLE ' ' SPECIFICATIONS
LENGTH 16".
BROOM 18" HEAVY
DUTY PUSH BROOM
PALMYR FILL 4" TRIM $ $ DOES NOT
CL147 11 PUSH BROOM SPARTA #080 WITH 60" ONE 959 NO BID NO BID 719 NO BID NO BID MEET BID Economical
HARDWOOD HANDLE ’ ’ SPECIFICATIONS
(018-60) OR APPROVED
EQUAL
DISINFECTANT DISINFECTANT AEROSOL $ $
CL148 11 AEROSOL SPRAY 12/20CS 27 47 NO BID NO BID 2388 NO BID NO BID $ 25.98 Economical
SPRAY 12/20 CASE ’ ’
GLASS CLEANER, BLUE,
GLASS 4/1 GALLON JUG $ $
CL 150 11 CLEANER (WINDEX PERF. BRAND) CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.92 NO BID 37.05 NO BID Economical
OR PREAPPROVED ’ '
EQUAL.
ALL PURPOSE
DISINFECTING SPRAY
A 11 DISIglPl;EAC;rlNG CONCENTRATE TO BE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 92.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

DISPENSED. OR PRE-
APPROVED EQUAL. 2/1
GALLON
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
FLOOR CLEANER -SPIC &
SPAN LIQUID
FLOOR CONCENTRATED TO
CL152- DISPENSE INTO MOP $ .
A 11 CLEQNSEZ'-\‘SPIC BUCKET USE TO MOP CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 63.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
KITCHEN FLOOR OR PRE-
APPROVED EQUAL; 3/1
GALLON
DEGREASER HEAVY
DEGREASER DUTY CLEANER LIQUID $
CL153 11 HEAVY DUTY PH 10 PREMEASURED 1 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 4154 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CONCENTRATE;72/2.5 OZ. ’
PK
FLOOR CLEANER
CONCENTRATE
CL153- FLOOR DIINFECTANT USE TO $
A 11 CLEANER MOP  FINISHED FLOOR. CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 47.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CONCENTRATE MR. CLEAN OR :
APPROVED EQUAL 3/1
GALLON
STAINLESS STEEL
CLEANER - AEROSOL
STAINLESS CAN; WATER BASED, $ .
CL 154 11 STEEL CLEANER AUTHORIZED FOR EOOD CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 2508 NO BID NO BID 36.98 | Economical
USE 18 OZ.
CANS / CASE
COTTON MOP HEAD 16
OZ. LAYFLAT NO
COTTON MOP TANGLE TO BE ONE $ $
CL155 11 HEAD ATTACHED TOSCREW EACH 101 NO BID NO BID 213 NO BID NO BID 2.79 A&L

TYPE HARDWOOD
HANDLE.
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR'-II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
COTTON MOP HEAD
corronmo | O\LYEeE LAY LT : ;
CL156 11 HLE:\I(DS_'\,IAI:I'Y TYPE. TO BE ATTACHED CASE 218 NO BID NO BID 245 NO BID NO BID NO BID A&L
TO WOOD TYPE SCREW
HANDLE.
MOP HANDLE
MOP HANDLE ONLY $ $ .
CL156A 11 ONL¥Y§’CEREW WOOD SCREW TYPE. EACH 278 NO BID NO BID 271 NO BID NO BID 2.99 | Economical
CL156- MOP HANDLE MOP HANDLE ONLY - $ $
B 11 ONLY - WOOD SCREW TYPE EACH 311 NO BID NO BID 259 NO BID NO BID 2.95 | Economical
SHORTER SHORTER ONE ’ ’
DUST MOP 24: COTTON
MOP HEAD HARDWOOD $ $
CL157 11 DUST MOP HANDLE SPARTA #2829 EACH 958 NO BID NO BID 988 NO BID NO BID NO BID A&L
OR APPROVED EQUAL
DUST MOP DUST MOP HEAD ONLY $ $ :
CL157A 11 HEAD ONLY 24" SPARTA #2829r CASE 526 NO BID NO BID 357 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CL157- DUST MOP DUST MOP HANDLE $ $ .
B 11 HANDE ONLY ONLY EACH 432 NO BID NO BID 393 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
RUST REMOVING
RUST CLEANSER $
CL160 11 REMOVING 12/1 LB. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CLEANSER INSTITUTIONAL SIZE 20.45

12/1LB.
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ITEM#

CLASS

SHORT
DESCRIPTION

LONG DESCRIPTION

UNITS

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

Low Bid

A and L Sales

All American Poly

Dispose N Save

Economical

Interboro

LAGNIAPPE

Pyramid

CL161

11

SCOURING PAD
GREEN NYLON

SCOURING PAD HEAVY
DUTY PADS #86 6X9
THICK HEAVY ABRSIVE
FOR TOUGH JOS SUCH AS
BAKE ON FOOD DEPOSITS
AND HARD TO REACH
PLACES ON FLOORS.
NYLON.

6/10 CS

20.10

NO BID

NO BID

12.54

NO BID

NO BID

11.98

Pyramid

CL161-

11

SCOURING PADS
GREEN

SCOURING PADS GREEN
NYLON GENERAL
PURPOSE 6X9 PACK 6/10
#96 GENERAL PUROSE
CLEAING OF POTS PANS
DISHES COUNTER TOPS.

6/10 CASE

17.26

NO BID

NO BID

9.85

NO BID

9.75

Pyramid

CL161-

11

SCRUBBING
SPONGES

SCRUBBING SPONGES
MEDIUM DUTY SPONGE
WITH MEDIUM GREEN
BACK CLEANS OVENS
WALLSC OUTERTOPS
SINKS BATHROOMS AND
TABLE. WET PACKED
WITH AN ANTI-
BACTERIAL. 20 PK

CASE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

10.00

NO BID

9.85

Pyramid

CL161-

11

SCRUBBER
STAINLESS
STEEL

SCRUBBER STAINLESS
STEEL 400 SERIES 35
GRAM PACK 6/12 WILL
NOT RUST CORRODE
ORSPLINTER MADE
WITH 18 % CHROMIUM
AND 8% NICKLE WIRE.

6/12 CS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

18.45

NO BID

18.45

24.98

Economical

CL162

11

ALUMINUM
FOIL

ALUMINUM FOIL 18" X
500" HEAVY WT.
ALUMINUM: .001" 11
1/2 LB. ROLL.

111/2LB

16.50

NO BID

NO BID

16.20

NO BID

18.00

NO BID

Economical
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHR?PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
CUPS, PAPER CUPS, PAPER MUFFIN s
CL163 11 MUFFIN CUPS | BAKING CUPS 41/2"X2" |  20/500 NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
BAKING X 11/4" '
STAINLESS STEEL
STAINLESS CLEANER - STATE $ .
CL164 1| oot oL EaER SOt CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 2508 NO BID NO BID $ 26.95 | Economical
12/20 0Z. CANS / CASE
CUPS, SOUFFLE | CUPS, SOUFFLE 20Z. $ $ .
CL165 1 o DA et Cas 20/250 A NO BID NO BID 5820 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CUPS SOUFFLE | CUPS SOUFFLE 5 1/2 0Z. $ $ .
CL166 1 S U On PARER EAPLR 20/550 CASE 20/250 6701 NO BID NO BID 6554 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SOUFFLE CUPS | SOUFFLE CUP 3/4 0OZ. 5000 $ $ .
CcL167 11 oy pApen il CASE 05 NO BID NO BID o NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
JUICE CUPS 3 0Z COATED s s
CL168 11 JUICE CUPS PAPER BOARD, 5000 PER CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID A&L
152.00 155.30
CASE
CL169 11 FoogRﬂ;é; #25 | FoOD TRAY #250R20Z. | 4/250CS NO BID NO BID NO BID . 5;’7 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CL170 11 FoogRTz,g; #0 | FOOD TRAY #400R60Z. | 4/250CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 10$82 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
6 COMPARTMENT FOAM
FOOD TRAY /6 SERVING TRAY ; 12.5 x8.5 $ $
CL171 11 COMPARTMENT/ | x1.13, COLOR: WHITE OR 500 CS 25.45 NO BID NO BID 24.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
FOAM SESAME, GENPAK #10600 ’ ’
OR EQUAL
CL171- FOOD TRAY FOOD TRAYS, #500 PAPER $ .
> 11 (BOATS) #500 BOATS : 500 PER PACK. 500 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
FOOD STORAGE BAGS
CLEAR NO-TOXIC .
FOOD STORAGE $ $ DOES NOT MEET Dispose N
CL172 11 BAGS CLEAR POLYE:II'HYI‘_‘ENE "l 1/4 200/Cs NO BID NO BID 10.98 12.22 BIDSPECIFICATIONS NO BID NO BID Save
MIL. 21" X 6" X 35" 200
CASE
MEDUIM WEIGHT
POLYPROPROLENE FORK
PLASTIC REFILL. WHITE 24 $ $
CL173 11 DISPENSER EACH/40 PIECE UNIT/ 960 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.10 NO BID 24.00 NO BID Economical
READY FORKS PER CASE. DESIGNED TO ’ ’
FIT SMART STOCK
DISPENSER OR EQUAL.
MEDIUM WEIGHT
CL173- PLASTIC FORK. BULK $ $ $ ;
A 11 PLASTIC FORKS CASE. CASE 568 NO BID NO BID 5.60 NO BID 569 NO BID Economical

1000 PER CASE.
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
MEDUIM WEIGHT
POLYPROPROLENE
PLASTIC TEASPOON REFILL.
DISPENSER WHITE 24 EACH/40 PIECE $ $ .
CL174 11 READY UNIT/ 960 PER CASE. CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.10 NO BID 24.00 NO BID Economical
TEASPOONS DESIGNED TO FIT SMART
STOCK DISPENSER OR
EQUAL.
PLASTIC MEDIUM WEIGHT $ $ $
CL174A TEASPOONS PLASTIC TE};BSPOON; 1000 CASE 568 NO BID NO BID 560 NO BID 569 NO BID Economical
MEDUIM WEIGHT
PLASTIC POLYPROPROLENEKNIFE
DISPENSER REFILL. WHITE 24 $ $
CL176 11 EACH/40 PIECE UNIT/ 960 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
READY DINNER 21.10 24.00
KNIVES PER CASE. DESIGNED TO
FIT SMART STOCK
DISPENSER OR EQUAL.
DINNER KNIFE PLASTIC $ $ $
CL176A 11 DINNER KNIFE MEDIUM WEIGHT 568 NO BID NO BID 5.60 NO BID 569 NO BID Economical
SERRATED EDGE ’ ’ '
PAPER BAGS PAPER BAGS BROWN #5 $ $ :
CL177 11 BROWN SIZE 500 PER CASE 500/CASE 780 NO BID NO BID 769 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
PLASTIC WRAP
POLYVINYL PLASTIC IN " $ $ $ .
CL179 11 PLASTIC WRAP CUTTER BOX 6-7 18"X1000 10.49 NO BID NO BID 11.90 NO BID 8.00 NO BID Lagniappe

POUNDS 18" X 1000
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
PLASTIC BAGS
POLYETHYLENE WITH $ $
CL180 11 PLASTIC BAGS TUCK-IN TOP SANDWICH 2000/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.80 048 NO BID NO BID Economical
BAG 6" X 8" SIZE 2000 ’ '
PER CASE
PAN SAVER-BUN SHEET
PANLINERS- | illoea rine 10 doo F s
CL181 11 BUN PAN LINER ’ CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
(PLASTIC) 200 PER CASE PAN 34.25
SAVER 42008 OR 42108 OR
APPROVED EQUAL
1 11 BUN(E:;\IEEI)NER PAPER 20.5"X 28.5". 100 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
PER BOX.
PAN SAVER - LINER
CONTOUR FIT - HIGH
PAN SAVER - TEMPERATURE 400 F. $
CL182 11 HOTEL PAN 2" dimensions 34x12 100 per box CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
" 38.00
OR 4 /200 per case Pan Saver #
420010r 42101 OR PRE
APPROVED EQUAL
CLEAR PLASTIC HINGED
FOOD CONTAINER
HINGED CLEAR RECLANGULAR IN SHAPE $ $ $
CL183 11 PLASTIC FOOD PRODUCT # 29130 DESC CASE 26.15 NO BID NO BID 47.98 NO BID 43.00 NO BID Lagniappe
CONT 10075 5.5 X 8.5 X3.5 DEEP ’ ’ '

ULTRA PAC OR PRE-
APPROVED EQUAL
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
COMPARTMENT SCHOOL
LUNCH TRAYS 5
COMPARTMENT COMPARTMENT COATED $
CL184 11 SCHOOL LUNCH PAPER FIBER BOARD 500 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 38.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
TRAY APP. 12' X 9 1/2" X 11 1/4" ’
500 PER CASE; M60-800
ALT KF-22025 OK
CL185 11 COMPARTMENT CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CONTAINER CONTAINER 9X9X31/5 10.05
150/CASE
PAPER BOWLS 12 OZ.
FIBER BOARD PLASTIC
CL186 11 PAPElE g’(ZDWLS COATED 12 OZ. 1 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 56$28 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
' SWEETHEART CUP -OR ’
PRE APROVED BRAND
AJAX CLEANSER 210Z. $ .
CL188 11 AJAX CLEANSER SIZE : 24/210Z PERCASE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.60 NO BID NO BID $ 28.95 Economical
HEAVY WEIGHT RUBBER
GLOVE IS LINED WITH
100% KNITTED COTTON
HEAVY WEIGHT: FOR ADDED COMFORT
HOT COLD AND IS DESIGNED TO $
CL189 11 PROVIDE INSULATION DOZ/PER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
INSULATED 10.20
RUBBER GLOVE AGAINST HEAT AND
COLD. SIZE
MEDIUM/LARGE.
RUBBERMAID OR
APPROVED EQUAL.
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ITEM# CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
RUBBER GLOVES W/
COTTON LINING FOR
CL%BQ- 11 GLO%JE%BEFNED GENERAL USE. SIZES 12 PK NO BID NO BID NO BID 4 ﬁO NO BID NO BID 5.28 Economical
SMALL, MED, LARGE .
AND X LARGE SIZES
OVEN CLEANER 20 OZ.
SPRAY ON. EASY OFF OR
cL192 11 | OVENCLEANER MR. MUSCLE OR e NO BID NO BID NO BID 23$75 NO BID NO BID 24.99 | Economical
PREAPPROVED EQUAL. !
12/20 OZ PK.
BRILLO SCOURING PADS
12 BOXES OF 10 PADS W/ $ .
CL194 11 BRILLO PADS SOAP. BRILLO BRAND OR 12BOXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.32 NO BID NO BID 23.98 Economical
PREAPPROVED EQUAL.
SCRUB BRUSH MADE FOR
SLEANING UNDER
COUNTER AND AROUND
CL195 11 gﬂcléb-g_lés\égh EQUIPMENT IN FOOD NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SERCIE OR INDUSTRIAL !
SETTINGS.; CRIMPED
POLYP
HINGED SANDWICH
CONTAINER WHITE
HINGED FOAM 22500 AM HINGED
SANDWICH LARGE COUNT $ $
CL196 11 5X6X5X6X3.25 PACK 500 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CONTAINER 20.06 18.33
FOAM ITEM # 491213 GENPK
AF-80-600 OR

SWEETHEART HF7Y OR
PRE-APPROVED EQUAL -
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ITEM#

CLASS

SHORT
DESCRIPTION

LONG DESCRIPTION

UNITS

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

Low Bid

A and L Sales

All American Poly

Dispose N Save

Economical

Interboro

LAGNIAPPE

Pyramid

CL197

11

MOP BUCKET &
WRINGER SET

BRUTE MOP BUCKET
AND SIDEWARD
PRESSURE WRINGER 2"
CASTERS BY RUBBER
MAID #7580-00 COLOR
YELLOW OR
PREAPPROVED EQUAL.

EACH

36.19

NO BID

NO BID

34.49

NO BID

NO BID

$ 44.98

Economical

CL197-

11

MOP BUCKET
ONLY

BRUTE MOP BUCKET
ONLY RUBBERMAID
#75800-00 YELLOW 2"
CASTERS. OR APPROVED
EQUAL.

EACH

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

19.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 39.98

Economical

CL197-

11

WRINGER FOR
MOP BUCKET

WRINGER FOR BRUTE
MOP BUCKET
RUBBERMAID #7580-00
SIDEWARD PRESSURE OR
APPROVED EQUAL TO
MATCH MOP BUCKETS
OREDERED.

EACH

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

19.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 39.00

Economical

CL198

11

MOP SMOOTHIE
LINT FREE

MOP SMOOTHIE LINT
FREE FLOOR FINISH WET
MOP WILEN'S -
CONTINUOUS YARN
FILAMENT
SPECIFY EACH - MEDIUM
LARGE EXTRA LARGE
PER DOZEN/ CASE

12/CS

83.88

NO BID

NO BID

m-31.44
1-37.44
xl- 46.20

NO BID

NO BID

m- 106.68
Ig - 141.48

Economical

CL199

11

MOP SMOOTHIE
LINT FREE

MOP-SMOOTHIE LINT
FREE FLOOR FINISH FLAT
MOP SPECIFY
BOTH 18" AND 24"
WILEN'S PER CASE/1
DOZEN

12/ CASE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

18 - 59.15
24 -77.80

NO BID

NO BID

18"-155.88
NO BID FOR 24"

Economical
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHR?PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
ANTIBACTERIAL | BAG, 1000ml, 6/CASE ------- DOES NOT $
CL 203 11 FOAMING HAND | --------m-mmmmmemmemeeeee >MUST CASE MEET NO BID NO BID 35.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SOAP PROVIDE SAMPLE SPECIFICATIONS '
DISPENSER FOR CL 203
CL23- | gy | DISPENSERFOR | SOAP oo > CASE NO COST NO BID NO BID NO COST NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE
CARPET 20 OZ. FOAMING $ $
CL 204 11 AEROSOL SPOT CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CLEANER 27.53 22.90
REMOVER
JUMBO 2 PLY FACIAL
TOILET TISSUE, | QUALITY, 6/CASE ----------- $ $ :
CL 209 11 TWO PLY ROLLS —->MUST PROVIDE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.62 NO BID 15.00 NO BID Economical
SAMPLE
JUMBO TISSUE DISPENSER FOR CL 209 $
CL 210 11 PAPER TOILET TISSUE ------------ > CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

DISPENSER

MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
BURNISHING
PADS FOR HIGH 5X 20 IN., 508 MM AQUA, $ $ .
CL211 11 SPEED 6/BOX CASE 2715 NO BID NO BID 11.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
MACHINES
3-M HIGH-PRO 5X 20 IN., 508 MM, 6/BOX - $ $
CL 212 11 STRIPPERPAD |  ----m--mmemmommommmeeee e CASE 98.39 NO BID NO BID 5255 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
20 INCHES >MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE ’ ’
MOULDED PLASTIC ON $ $ $ ;
CL 213 11 JANITOR CARTS ROLLERS, RUST PROOF EACH 107.13 NO BID NO BID 84.69 NO BID 88.00 NO BID Economical
WATER HOG BLACK RUBBER WITH $ :
CL214 11 MATS HOLES, 4X6FT EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 83.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
cL OUTDOOR 3M $
11 NOMAD BLACK RUBBER EACH NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
214A SCRAPPER 234.95
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ITEM# | CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
GATOR SHOES, RUBBER 28.32 all
CL 217 11 GATOR SHOES WITH EXTRA SOLE, EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID sizes NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
ASSORTED SIZES
BAYWEST WHITE ROLL
TOWEL 8 INCH X 630
WHITE ROLL FEET...6 TO CASE------------ $ $ .
CL218 11 TOWEL CASE 3135 NO BID NO BID 18.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
-->MUST PROVIDE
SAMPLE
TOWEL BAYWEST PAPER TOWEL $ $
CL218A 11 DISPENSER DISPENSER 86500 ----- > EACH 10.00 NO BID NO BID 10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE ’ ’
SPLIT BUCKET
CL 219 11 CLEANING FILMOP MUST PROVIDE EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $ NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
SAMPLE OR DEMO 74.05
SYSTEM
DOUBLE
BUCKET MICROFIBER MUST $ .
CL 220 11 CLEANING PROVIDE SAMPLE EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 122.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

SYSTEM
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ITEM# CLASS DESSCHRCI)PR:II'-ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
NON-LATEX NON-LATEX GLOVE $ $ $ $ .
Ciic | 1 VINYLGLOVE | POWDERFREE 1000 CASE CASE 2043 NO BID NO BID 17.43 18.68 33.00 NO BID Economical
CL189- RUBBER GLOVE $
11 RUBBER GLOVE W/COTTON LINING, DOZ. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
2 454
SM.,MED.,LG.
BURNISHING AQUA BURNISHING PADS $ :
CL211A 11 PAD 13IN. 3-M 13IN. BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID 570 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
STRIPPER PAD BLACK STRIPPER PADS 13 $ $ .
212A 11 13IN. 3-M IN BOX 758 NO BID NO BID 555 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
DISPOSIBLE WYPALL DISPOSIBLE $ $ .
CL111 11 TOWEL TOWELS CASE 2086 NO BID NO BID 29.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
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ITEM# CLASS DESSCHRCI)FI?:II:ION LONG DESCRIPTION UNITS VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR Low Bid
A and L Sales All American Poly Dispose N Save ’ Interboro LAGNIAPPE Pyramid
Economical
RUBBERMAID
CL221 11 GREY RUBBERMAID 44 GALLON EACH $ NO BID NO BID $ NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
TRASH CAN GREY 25.69 20.20
TRASHCAN
RUBBERMAID
RUBBERMAID 7 GALLON $ $ .
CL222 11 WASTE OFFICE WASTE BASKET EACH 6.19 NO BID NO BID 286 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
BASKETS
ADJUSTABLE FLOW
DISPENSING DISPENSING MOP $ :
CL223 11 MOP BUCKET BUCKET FOR FLOOR EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 53.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical
CARE
MOP CLEANING | FLAT MICROFIBER MOPS f{m
CL219A 11 SYSTEM AND HANDLES EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID handle- 6.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID Economical

COMPATIBLE WITH CL219

mop-5.71
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By joint acclimation, the Board voted to approve the following announcement
by Mrs. Dysart, it read as follows:

Notice of Public Meeting — Notice is hereby given that at its meeting to be
held on Tuesday, August 22, 2017 at 6:00 p.m. at the School Board Office,
200 E. St. Bernard Hwy., Chalmette, Louisiana, the Parish School Board of
the Parish of St. Bernard, State of Louisiana, plans to consider adopting a
resolution ordering and calling an election to be held within School District
No. 1 to authorize the renewal/continuation of Ad Valorem taxes.

Dr. Craft asked to put on the agenda of the next Committee meeting a
resolution to be able to purchase off an LSBA contract for goods if they are
lower than any other state contract price.

Under Superintendent’s Recommendations Ms. Voitier noted that the
weeklong in-service for Administrators is being prepared as is the upcoming
school year.

On motion of Mr. Campbell, seconded by Dr. Craft and passed by a
unanimous voice vote, the meeting adjourned.

Diana B. Dysart/s Doris Voitier/s
DIANA B. DYSART DORIS VOITIER
PRESIDENT SECRETARY




