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Message from the Principal

If the nice weather has sparked some spring cleaning,
don't forget about our Planet Aid bin to help support our
PTO. We are also still collecting shoes.

Read More

 

Library Book Acquisition Update

Titles currently under 30-day public review are available
at the link below. Note that this link will always be
available in future Friday Flash editions in the bulleted
list at the bottom. 

Read More

 

Join Students at Earth Day Event

The entire community is invited to join our 6-School
Sustainability Club at Pine Township's Earth Day Event
on Saturday, April 26 , from 11:30 am to 4:00 pm.

Read More

 

Get Ready for Disney Day

https://hance.pinerichland.org/
https://hance.pinerichland.org/
https://hance.pinerichland.org/calendar4
https://pinerichland.nutrislice.com/menu/pine-richland-hance-elementary-school/lunch/2025-03-12
https://www.schoolcafe.com/
https://hance.pinerichland.org/resources/pto
https://linktr.ee/hancepto
https://hance.pinerichland.org/about-us/principal/message-from-the-principal/~board/article-library-principalmrs-giran-42339/post/principals-messagemarch-14-2025-1742404039188
https://hance.pinerichland.org/about-us/principal/message-from-the-principal/~board/article-library-principalmrs-giran-42339/post/principals-messagemarch-14-2025-1742404039188
https://hance.pinerichland.org/library
https://hance.pinerichland.org/library
https://www.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-pine-richland-school-district-39398/post/join-pine-richland-students-for-earth-day
https://www.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-pine-richland-school-district-39398/post/join-pine-richland-students-for-earth-day
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/get-ready-for-disney-day-on-march-27
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/visit-the-new-hpto-website-1741196646157
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/pizza-bingo-43582-13560
https://awardson8.com/hance/
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/the-pto-is-seeking-chairpersons-and-committee-members-1742400570191
https://ybpay.lifetouch.com/Order/SelectJob?jobNumber=15207525
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfp5B9v4KoTjQZwUEhji-tVGxZb5CdZI7yW3nK9gX0RdHbtdg/viewform
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/1yRrql0SwSv2YuVUx2dgpo3PDFBcj1_CxdB2P5uYDwqw/viewform?edit_requested=true
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/pssa-preparatory-after-school-program-1739373367695
https://hance.pinerichland.org/about-us/principal/message-from-the-principal/~board/article-library-principalmrs-giran-42339/post/principals-messageseptember-6-2024
https://www.constantcontact.com/landing1/vr/home?cc=nge&utm_campaign=nge&rmc=VF21_CPE&utm_medium=VF21_CPE&utm_source=viral&nav=4f6e89d5-bfc8-4a90-aa31-b2d44c5c7a8e


Disney Day is on Thursday, March 27. All students are
encouraged to dress in their Disney finest with a sing-
along scheduled at the end of the day.

Read More

 

Art Supplies Needed

Please consider recycling paper towels and tubes,
plastic bags and empty single use water bottles to Ms.
Jankowski's art class.

 

PTO Elections

There was only one person nominated for co-
secretary/social media manager, so congratulations to
Jess Mey! Committee sign-ups remain open, and if not
filled, programs will be cut next year. Please look to see
where you can help.

Read More

 

Final Chance for Pizza Bingo

Join the HPTO on Friday, March 28, for an evening of
pizza, prizes and family fun. Today, March 21, is the
last day to order tickets. Fifteen volunteers are still
needed.

Read More

 

Last Call for Beach Towels

Summer is right around the corner! Order a Pine-
Richland beach towel through March 23 for only
$14.50. Note that this is this year's third-grade gift.

Read More

 

Chick-fil-A Receipts

https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/get-ready-for-disney-day-on-march-27
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/visit-the-new-hpto-website-1741196646157
https://hance.pinerichland.org/news/news-details/~board/headlines-and-features-hance-elementary-school-39408/post/pizza-bingo-43582-13560
https://awardson8.com/hance/


Turn in your receipts from either the Wexford or
Cranberry Chick-fil-A locations and the PTO will receive
20% back to put towards a teacher luncheon.

Read More

 
In Case You Missed It

 

Book Swap Books Needed

Hance will be hosting a book swap in late May. Gently
used books appropriate for grades K-3 can be dropped
in the book collection box in the lobby.

 

Order Your Yearbook

We are hard at work creating this years yearbook at
Hance. Books cost $18.90 and will be distributed at
school in May. Order your copy today!

Read More

 

 

Hance Needs Your Help

State testing regulations require all educational
materials be taken down or covered in halls and testing
locations. Volunteers needed on Thursday, April 3.

Read More

 

Taylor Swift Move Up Night

The PRHS Taylor Swift Club presents a night of
activities to introduce rising fourth-grade students to
each other. Join the fun at Eden Hall on Friday, April
4, from 6:00 pm - 8:00 pm. RSVP by Sunday, March
23.

Read More
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RAMS Way Committee Wish List

We are seeking donations to be used during RAMS
Way assemblies and to reinforce positive behaviors.

Read More

 

Cafeteria Volunteers

Our calendar is open for volunteers to help out for the
remainder of the year. This is a great way to see your
child in action and socialize with our students.

Read More

 

Reminders

Friday Flash submissions are due Wednesdays at 8 am to prnewsletters@pinerichland.org.
Free and Reduced Meal Applications must be submitted each school year.
Check the Friday Flash Archives for past information.
Children's Health Insurance Program  information.
Read our Title I Right to Know letter.
View the breakfast and lunch menus.
Review library book titles under 30-day public review.
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