
A C A D E M I C S

In 2024, Saraland’s arts programs earned top honors
across multiple disciplines. The instrumental and choral
music programs received numerous Superior ratings and
Best in Class awards, while multiple students were
selected for All-State. The Spartan Sound Marching Band,
indoor percussion ensemble, and winter guard ranked
among the top groups in the Southeast and nation. With
visual arts and choral music offered K-12, along with
expanding piano and dance programs at both the middle
and high school levels, students had even more
opportunities to develop their talents. To cap off the year,
the elementary show choir and high school band
performed at Disney, while the middle school took the
stage in Atlanta, continuing Saraland’s tradition of artistic
excellence. Up next, Nashville!
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SPARTANS B U I L D I N G  A
F O U N D A T I O N  F O R

S T U D E N T  S U C C E S S

The Spartans continued their tradition of excellence in
the 2024 season, competing at the highest levels across
multiple sports. A standout player, Ryan Williams, made
significant contributions before graduating early to join
the University of Alabama's football program. Saraland
also made history as the only high school in Alabama to
produce the state's Mr. Football winner three years in a
row. Beyond football, Spartan athletes advanced in
basketball, baseball, softball, volleyball, track, and
wrestling, further cementing Saraland’s reputation for
extending regular season play.

Saraland’s commitment to preparing college- and
career-ready students is reflected in high-quality
instruction delivered in state-of-the-art facilities. The
community's investment in education continues to
yield strong results, consistently evidenced by the
Spartans' state test scores.

A T H L E T I C S

expect more. achieve more.
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