

GROUP I: BOILER MAINTENANCE KITS - FULTON

2	Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Standard, 4-50-SP0403	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
NO BID / NO AWARD				

GROUP II: BOILER MAINTENANCE KITS - AERCO

4	AERCO Boiler 12 Month Low Nox Maintenance Kit, 58025-01	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
NO BID / NO AWARD				

5	AERCO Boiler 24 Month 3.0 LN Maintenance Kit, 58025-04	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
NO BID / NO AWARD				

6	AERCO Boiler 24 Month 2.0 Nozzle Mix Maintenance Kit, 58015-02	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
NO BID / NO AWARD				

7	AERCO Boiler 24 Month 3.0 LN Maintenance Kit, 58015-04	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
NO BID / NO AWARD				

GROUP III: FILTERS - FIBERGLASS

9	Fiberglass Filters 10 x 36 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$6.98	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				275-100-360
				1
				Yes

10	Fiberglass Filters 14 x 20 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$2.63	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				274-140-200
				1
				Yes

11	Fiberglass Filters 14 x 24 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$3.41	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				274-140-240
				1
				Yes

12	Fiberglass Filters 14 x 30 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$3.94	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				274-140-300
				1
				Yes

13	Fiberglass Filters 15 x 77 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$16.86	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				275-150-770-2
				1
				Yes
14	Fiberglass Filters 16 x 25 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$2.83	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				274-160-250
				1
				Yes
15	Fiberglass Filters 16 x 20 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$3.16	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				276-160-200
				1
				Yes
16	Fiberglass Filters 20 x 20 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$3.47	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				276-200-200
				1
				Yes
17	Fiberglass Filters 24 x 24 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$4.19	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				276-240-240
				1
				Yes
18	Fiber Glass Roll, 16" x 90'	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$87.87	Koch Super Fiberglass Rolled Fiberglass Media 85ft
				585-016-085
				1
				Yes
19	Fiberglass Filters 15 3/4 x 53 3/4 x 3/4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	John W Danforth Company	EACH	\$16.12	Koch Commercial/Industrial Fiberglass Disposable Filters
				275-156-536-2
				1
				Yes
GROUP IV: FILTERS - PLEATED				
21	Pleated Filters 14 x 20 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$7.07	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862006 30/30 20 x 14 x 1
				1
				Yes

22	Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$7.37	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862001 30/30 20 x 16 x 1
				Yes
23	Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$9.00	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862004 30/30 25 x 16 x 1
				Yes
24	Pleated Filters 19 x 27 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$22.95	Custom Size - Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				F4072030701 30/30 27 x 19 x 1
				Yes
25	Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$9.12	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862002 30/30 20x20x1
				Yes
26	Pleated Filters 16 x 24 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.24	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862015 30/30 24x16x1
				Yes
27	Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.26	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				054862028 30/30 24 x 18 x 1
				Yes
28	Pleated Filters 12 x 24 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$8.47	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880006 30/30 24 x 12 x 2
				Yes
29	Pleated Filters 14 x 20 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$7.75	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880009 30/30 20 x 14 x 2
				Yes
30	Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$8.87	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880001 30/30 20 x 16 x 2
				Yes

31	Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.69	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880004 30/30 25 x 16 x 2
				Yes
32	Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.45	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880015
				Yes
33	Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.22	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880002 30/30 20 x 20 x 2
				Yes
34	Pleated Filters 20 x 24 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$11.61	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880012 30/30 24 x 20 x 2
				Yes
35	Pleated Filters 20 x 25 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$12.44	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880003 30/30 25 x 20 x2
				Yes
36	Pleated Filters 20 x 30 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$19.54	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				402271007 30/30 20 x 30 x2
				Yes
37	Pleated Filters 24 x 16 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$10.23	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880016 30/30 24 x 16 x 2
				Yes
38	Pleated Filters 24 x 24 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$13.94	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880005 30/30 24 x 24 x 2
				Yes
39	Pleated Filters 25 x 25 x 2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$15.97	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
				049880018 30/30 25 x 25 x 2
				Yes

40	Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$16.45	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		059413004	30/30 20 x 16 x 4	Yes
41	Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$19.07	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		059413005	30/30 25 x 16 x 4	Yes
42	Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$18.94	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		059413009	30/30 24 x 18 x 4	Yes
43	Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$17.41	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		059413003	30/30 20 x 20 x 4	Yes
44	Pleated Filters 24 x 24 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$22.88	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		059413001	30/30 24 x 24 x 4	Yes
45	Univents Inside Pleated Filter, 9 x 42 x 1	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Camfil USA, Inc	EACH	\$17.32	Camfil Farr 30/30 Panel Filter Product Performance Guarantee
		F4072031596	30/30 42 x 9 x 1 E	Yes

GROUP V: MISCELLANEOUS - FILTERS & RELATED ITEMS

47	85% Minpleat Merv 13 w/Header Plastic Frame, Fiberglass Media, 20 x 24 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	John W Danforth Company EACH \$70.17 Pamlico TL4 Elite Merv13 Minipleat	TEC2P19C23C400	1	Yes
48	85% Minpleat Merv 13 w/Header Plastic Frame, Fiberglass Media, 24 x 24 x 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	John W Danforth Company EACH \$75.17 Pamlico TL4 Elite Merv13 Minipleat	TEC2P23C23C400	1	Yes
49	Pocket Filters - RF15-PH, Merv 13, 8 Pockets Minimum, 24 x 24 x 12	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	John W Danforth Company EACH \$38.08 Pamlico Propocket Elite Merv13 (8-Pocket)	250844120810	1	Yes
50	EDCO Dust Collector Cartridge Filter, 13 Dia x 32 L, Clark P/N EDCO 1567069	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	NO BID / NO AWARD			