
LINCOLNWOOD SCHOOL 
DISTRICT 74
BOARD OF EDUCATION
Facilities Committee Meeting 
AGENDA
Tuesday, April 16, 2024 at 6:00 
PM

BOARD OF EDUCATION
Kevin Daly, President

Rupal Shah Mandal, Vice President
John P. Vranas, Secretary

Maxie Boynton
Myra A. Foutris

Jay Oleniczak
Peter D. Theodore

ADMINISTRATION
Dr. David L. Russo, Superintendent of Schools

Dr. Dominick M. Lupo, Assistant Superintendent for 
Curriculum and Instruction

Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO 

Agenda of the Facilities Committee Meeting of the Board of Education of Lincolnwood School District 74,
Cook County, Illinois, to be held in the Marvin Garlich Administration Building

6950 N. East Prairie Road
Lincolnwood, Illinois 60712,
on Tuesday, April 16, 2024.

IN-PERSON PARTICIPATION: It is expected that all members of the Facilities Committee, plus several 
administrators, will be physically present at the Marvin Garlich Administration Building located at 6950 N. East 
Prairie Road, Lincolnwood, IL. The public is welcome.

1. CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL
FACILITIES COMMITTEE MEMBERS
John P. Vranas (BOE), Chair
Rupal Shah Mandal (BOE), Co-Chair   
Myra A. Foutris (BOE)
Wendy Grano, Community Member
Emily McCall, Community Member
Zade Tagani, Community Member

ADMINISTRATORS/STAFF 
Dr. David L. Russo, Superintendent of Schools
Dr. Dominick M. Lupo, Assistant Superintendent for Curriculum and Instruction
Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO
Jim Caldwell, Director of Buildings and Grounds

 
2. AUDIENCE TO VISITORS

 
3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

a. Facilities Committee Meeting Minutes - MARCH 19, 2024 
 
Motion by member:________________ Seconded by:____________________
 

4. DISTRICT ARCHITECT OF RECORD - STUDIOGC architecture+interiors
a. INFORMATION/DISCUSSION/ACTION: StudioGC architecture+interiors Project(s) 

Update
I. Rutledge Hall Furniture - IFB (two attachments)
II. Summer 2024 Construction Allowances
III. StudioGC Programs - 179D Energy Efficiency Tax Deduction
IV. Todd Hall and Rutledge Hall Utilization (attachment)

 
5. OLD BUSINESS
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6. NEW BUSINESS
a. 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling Upgrades Bid
b. Winter 2024-25 & 2025-26 Snow Removal Services Contract with Contour Landscaping 

Inc.
c. Custodial Services Bid

 
7. INFORMATION/DISCUSSION: District Facilities Update 

a. Lincolnwood Public Library Use of Rutledge Hall’s Parking Lot 
b. Lincolnwood Baseball and Softball Association Facilities Rental Fee Waiver Request 

 
8. ADJOURNMENT

 
Motion by member: ______________ Seconded by: _________________
 

Dr. David L. Russo, Superintendent of Schools
Lincolnwood School District 74 is subject to the requirements of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. 
Individuals with disabilities who plan to attend this meeting and who require certain accommodations in order to 
allow them to observe and/or participate in this meeting, or who have questions regarding the accessibility of this 
meeting or facility, are requested to contact the District Office at 847-675-8234 promptly to allow Lincolnwood 
School District 74 to make reasonable accommodations for those persons. 
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LINCOLNWOOD SCHOOL DISTRICT 74
BOARD OF EDUCATION
Facilities Committee Meeting Minutes
Tuesday, March 19, 2024 at 6:00 PM

BOARD OF EDUCATION
Kevin Daly, President

Rupal Shah Mandal, Vice President
John P. Vranas, Secretary

Maxie Boynton
Myra A. Foutris

Jay Oleniczak
Peter D. Theodore

ADMINISTRATION
Dr. David L. Russo, Superintendent of Schools

Dr. Dominick M. Lupo, Assistant Superintendent for Curriculum 
and Instruction

Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO

Minutes of the Facilities Committee Meeting of the Board of Education of Lincolnwood School District 74,
Cook County, Illinois, was held in the Lincoln Hall Large Conference Room - Main Office

6855 North Crawford, Lincolnwood, IL 60712, on Tuesday, March 19, 2024

1. CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL      
Chair Vranas called the Facilities Committee meeting to order at 6:02 p.m.

FACILITIES COMMITTEE MEMBERS
John P. Vranas (BOE), Chair
Myra A. Foutris (BOE)
Wendy Grano, Community Member
Emily McCall, Community Member

FACILITIES COMMITTEE MEMBERS NOT PRESENT
Rupal Shah Mandal (BOE), Co-Chair  
Zade Tagani, Community Member

ADMINISTRATORS/STAFF 
Dr. David L. Russo, Superintendent of Schools
Dr. Dominick M. Lupo, Assistant Superintendent for Curriculum and Instruction
Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO

OTHERS PRESENT
Athi Toufexis, StudioGC
 

2. AUDIENCE TO VISITORS
None
 

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES
a. Facilities Committee Meeting Minutes - FEBRUARY 20, 2024

A motion was made, seconded and passed to approve the February 20, 2024 Facilities Committee meeting minutes.
 

4. DISTRICT ARCHITECT OF RECORD - STUDIOGC architecture+interiors
a. StudioGC architecture+interiors Project(s) Update
I. Rutledge Hall Furniture Review 

Athi Toufexis, StudioGC, presented the Rutledge Hall Furniture Review. The rooms highlighted in blue will be 
receiving new furniture. The Committee discussed the current small group rooms’ furniture. The Committee 
recommended keeping the gray top tables and replacing the wood grain top tables. Athi explained that the Task 
Chair presented was preferred by the teachers that sampled the chairs.  All rooms will have a 7-seat horseshoe 
table, but there are 4 smaller rooms that will receive a smaller horseshoe table. Dr. Russo will clarify with 3



Administration if the chairs that were chosen are still preferred over the wobble stools.

II. Updated draft of the SD74 Master Facilities Plan
Athi Toufexis, StudioGC, presented the updated draft of the SD74 Master Facilities Plan. The Committee expressed 
concern regarding the 2025 Todd Hall projects without knowing what enrollment will be at that time. Dr. Russo said 
that he would meet with Athi to discuss potential plans to add more learning spaces across the District. Dr. Russo 
asked the Committee if there was interest in hiring a professional demographer to create plans. The Committee 
does not recommend a professional demographer at this time.

b. Energy Efficient Deductions Allocation Form 179D
Athi Toufexis, StudioGC, explained how this incentive has existed for a few years. The goal is to incentivize building 
owners for making the buildings more energy efficient. Athi explained that StudioGC could claim 100% of the 
benefit. The Committee asked if there would be a cost benefit to the District if the District moves forward with 
helping StudioGC get the tax benefit.

c. Todd Hall Sensory Paths
After the last Committee meeting, it was requested to only outfit Todd Hall with Sensory Paths. Athi requested 
pricing accordingly. Athi stated that there are different prices listed for different finishes. Courtney stated that the 
Administration prefers Option One because it will exactly follow the drafted design. Athi stated that the 
thermoplastics should adhere tightly to concrete and blacktop for sufficient longevity.

 
A motion was made, seconded, and passed that the Facilities Committee concurs with the Administration’s 
recommendation to the Board of Education to accept Option #1 from Paint the City for the Todd Hall Sensory 
Paths in the amount of $22,60.06 to be completed by July 15, 2024.

5. OLD BUSINESS
None
 

6. NEW BUSINESS
None

7. District Facilities Update 
a. Custodial Services Bid

Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO discussed that the District is currently collecting questions from 
approximately 11 unique custodial service vendors. The deadline for vendors to ask questions is Friday, March 22nd. 
Bids will be submitted on April 2nd and the Administration expects to have a recommendation for the May Board of 
Education meeting.

b. Peeling Vinyl Door Branding 
Courtney explained that the peeling of the vinyl door branding at Lincoln Hall’s entry has been addressed.

c. Stainless Steel Toilet Paper Dispensers for Todd Hall and Lincoln Hall
The toilet paper dispensers have been ordered.

d. Mechanization of Lincoln Hall’s West Wall Basketball Hoops
The Administration received a proposal on this project, and is also looking into some audio-visual solutions. 

e. Lincoln Hall Lobby Video Camera Installation 
The lobby cameras are scheduled to be installed this week.

8. ADJOURNMENT
 
A motion was made, seconded, and passed to adjourn the Facilities Committee meeting at 6:43 p.m. 4



The next Facilities Committee meeting will be held Tuesday, April 16, 2024 at 6:00 p.m. The public is welcome.

 

____________________________________
John P. Vranas, Chair

______________________________________
Rupal Shah Mandal, Co-chair
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DATE: April 16, 2024

TOPIC: District Architect of Record -  StudioGC architecture+interiors Project(s) Update 

PREPARED BY: Courtney Whited, Business Manager/CSBO with

Athi Toufexis, Principal, StudioGC architecture+interiors 

Recommended for:

☐ Action

☒ Discussion

☒ Information

Purpose:

To provide the Facilities Committee an update on StudioGC architecture+interiors District Projects:

1. The furniture portion of the Board-approved Rutledge Hall renovation project will cost 

$129,546.07. A 50% deposit has been requested. The Business Office will proceed with issuing a 

check to IFB in the amount of $64,773.03 to initiate the order. Floorplans and the IFB invoice are 

attached (two attachments).

2. Two allowance authorizations have occurred thus far on the Summer 2024 construction projects. 

The $5,572 allowance is for concrete necessary to make the Lincoln Hall Courtyard accessible and 

the $5,117 allowance is for Rutledge Hall Room 18 cabinetry specifications.

3. Participating in programs such as the prior month’s Section 179D/Energy Efficiency allows 

StudioGC to maintain a competitive pricing structure.

4. Drawings are attached to facilitate a conversation relative to building utilization at Todd Hall and 

Rutledge Hall (attachment).

Facilities Committee Meeting
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FURNITURE PLAN - SECOND FLOOR
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Lincolnwood SD74
2024 Rutledge Hall General Work
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QUOTE
CUSTOMER Rutledge Hall School 

Lincolnwood SD 74

WORKPLACE CONSULTANT Alex Carsi x50 DATE 4/5/2024

CUSTOMER SERVICE Ashley Winkle x30 TERMS 50% Deposit / Net 15

PROJECT

SEQ # QTY DESCRIPTION AMOUNT EXTENDED

Teacher

CH-1 24 Smith System Flavors Mobile Stack Chair 18"H 128.70                 3,088.80              

Shell: Charcoal 

Frame: Platinum 

CH-2A 39 SitOnIt Amplify Chair 396.00                 15,444.00            

Midback, Adjustable Lumbar, Swivel Tilt

Multi Adjustable Arms, Hard Carpet Casters 

Polished Aluminum Base

Mesh: Onyx, Seat: Malibu Charcoal

CH-2B 2 SitOnIt Amplify Chair 413.60                 827.20                 

Midback, Adjustable Lumbar, Swivel Tilt

Multi Adjustable Arms, Soft Casters 

Polished Aluminum Base

Mesh: Onyx, Seat: Malibu Charcoal

CH-3 1 SitOnIt Amplify Stool 451.88                 451.88                 

Midback, Adjustable Lumbar, Swivel Tilt

Multi Adjustable Arms, Hard Carpet Casters 

Polished Aluminum Base

Mesh: Onyx, Seat: Malibu Charcoal

D-1 36 Smith System Cascade Teacher Desk - Single Bullet 793.65                 28,571.40            

Box/Box/File Pedestal - Right Hand 

Laminate: Classic Linen 

1 1/4" Top w/ 3/8" Bmpr Tmold - Persian Blue

Frame: Platinum 

*Casters good on hard floor and carpet

D-2 1 Smith System Cascade Teacher Desk - Rectangle, Double Ped 1,087.45              1,087.45              

Box/Box/File Pedestal - Right and Left Hand 

Laminate: Classic Linen 

1 1/4" Top w/ 3/8" Bmpr Tmold - Persian Blue

Frame: Platinum 

*Casters good on hard floor and carpet

P-1 3 MiEN Mobile Pedestal 562.65                 1,687.95              

Locking Box/Box/File 

Laminate Top: Classic Linen, Base: Silver 

Student Chairs 

CH-4 28 Smith System Flavors Mobile Stack Chair 18"H 128.70                 3,603.60              

Shell: Apple 

Frame: Platinum 

CH-5 44 Smith System Flavors Mobile Stack Chair 16"H 119.60                 5,262.40              

Shell: Apple 

Frame: Platinum 

CH-6 78 MiEN J4F Balancing Stool 18"H 132.55                 10,338.90            

Charcoal Poly, Olive Rim 

No Seat Pad

Collaboration Tables 

TB-1 6 Smith System Half Moon Table 466.70                 2,800.20              

36"D x 72"W 

Laminate: Classic Linen 

1 1/4" Top w/ 3/8" Bmpr Tmold - Persian Blue

Frame: Platinum 

Fixed Height for Casters 

Black Casters

TB-2 18 MiEN F2F Post Leg Shaped Table - Horseshoe 1,273.80              22,928.40            

60"W x 60"D x 26.5-34"H 

Laminate: Classic Linen

Edge: Spectrum Blue

Legs: Silver 

on Casters 

Rutledge Hall Floors 1 & 2

Page 1 of 2
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QUOTE
CUSTOMER Rutledge Hall School 

Lincolnwood SD 74

WORKPLACE CONSULTANT Alex Carsi x50 DATE 4/5/2024

CUSTOMER SERVICE Ashley Winkle x30 TERMS 50% Deposit / Net 15

PROJECT

SEQ # QTY DESCRIPTION AMOUNT EXTENDED

Rutledge Hall Floors 1 & 2

TB-3 1 MiEN Dial Post Leg Roung Table 60"Diameter 1,257.30              1,257.30              

Laminate: Classic Linen

Edge: Spectrum Blue

Legs: Silver 

on Casters 

TB-4 2 Smith System Elemental Round Table, 48"Diameter 349.05                 698.10                 

Laminate: Classic Linen 

1 1/4" Top w/ 3/8" Bmpr Tmold - Persian Blue

Frame: Platinum 

Fixed Height for Casters 

Black Casters

TB-5 2 Smith System Elemental Rectangle Table, 30" x 60" 415.35                 830.70                 

Laminate: Classic Linen 

1 1/4" Top w/ 3/8" Bmpr Tmold - Persian Blue

Frame: Platinum 

Fixed Height for Casters 

Black Casters

1 Freight Estimate 11,045.54            11,045.54            

1 Labor - Prevailing Wage 19,622.25            19,622.25            

To Receive, Deliver, and Install 

During Normal Working Hours M-F 

Area to be free and clear 

Debris Removal included 

Elevator access at no additional cost 

Install after June 1st, 2024

Contracts Used: 

Smith System: E&I  

SitOnIt: OMNIA

MiEN: NCPA

LEADTIMES: Subject to change without notice 

Smith System: 3-8 Weeks

SitOnIt: 2-5 Weeks

MiEN: 4-8 Weeks

This quote includes trips for 1 phase. If additional trips are required

they will be charged at $350.00

Material 98,878.28         

To accept this order please sign and return. -                    

Sales Tax 8.00% -                    

X Freight 11,045.54         

Print Name: Labor 19,622.25         

PO Number: Design -                    

Surcharge -                    

TOTAL 129,546.07$     Product stored longer than 30 days will result in storage fees

Deposit required at time of order - Leasing options available - This quote is valid for 30 days

Storage fees are included for the first 30 days from receipt of product

Page 2 of 2
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MASTER PLANNING
04.08.24 Page 1

TODD HALL
•	 BUILDING UTILIZATION

STAFF / BUILDING SUPPORT CCDC ROOMS

GRADE CLASSROOM  

1ST FLOOR

SMALL GROUP/INTERVENTIONIST ROOMS NTDSE ROOMS

SHARED CURRICULUM ROOMS

LINCOLNWOOD SD74
MASTER PLANNING

 

April 4, 2024

EXISTING

Building Area (GSF) 60,378       
Current Enrollment (2023-2024) 454             

 QUANTITY 
 STUDENT CAPACITY 

PER ROOM (MAX) 
 BUILDING 
CAPACITY 

 TARGET 
UTILIZATION       
(90% TYP.) 

 FUNCTIONAL CAPACITY 

Pre-K Classrooms 2                  24                                48                            90% 43                                          
Kindergarten Classrooms 6                  24                                144                          90% 130                                         
1st Grade Classrooms 6                  28                                168                          90% 151                                         
2nd Grade Classrooms 6                  28                                168                          90% 151                                         
Small Group/Intervention/ESL 10                -                                         
Art Room 1                  -                           -                                         
Music Room 1                  -                           -                                         
STEM Room -              -                           -                                         
Gymnasiums/MPR/Library 3                  -                           -                                         
NTDSE Rooms 2                  -                           -                                         
CCDC Rooms 4                  -                           -                                         

528                       475                                    

UTILIZATION

Current Enrollment (2023-2024)

includes 70 pre-k (half day)

 (CURRENT CAPACITY / BUILDING CAPACITY) 
86%

Project No: XXXXX

BUILDING UTILIZATION

ENROLLMENT TRENDS, PAST 5 YEARS

KK

KK

KK

PRE-K PRE-K

MUSIC ART

GYM

LIBRARY

MPR

1st 1st

1st 1st

1st 1st

2nd

2nd2nd2nd2nd2nd
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MASTER PLANNING
04.08.24 Page 2

RUTLEDGE HALL
•	 BUILDING UTILIZATION

STAFF / BUILDING SUPPORT

GRADE CLASSROOM  

SMALL GROUP/INTERVENTIONIST ROOMS NTDSE ROOMS

SHARED CURRICULUM ROOMS

LINCOLNWOOD SD74
MASTER PLANNING

 

April 4, 2024

EXISTING

Building Area (GSF) 61,500       
Current Enrollment (2023-2024) 369             

 QUANTITY 
 STUDENT CAPACITY 

PER ROOM (MAX) 
 BUILDING 
CAPACITY 

 TARGET 
UTILIZATION       
(90% TYP.) 

 FUNCTIONAL CAPACITY 

3rd Grade Classrooms 6                  28                                168                          90% 151                                         
4th Grade Classrooms 7                  28                                196                          90% 176                                         
5th Grade Classrooms 7                  28                                196                          90% 176                                         
Small Group/Intervention/ESL 13                -                                         
Art Room 1                  -                           -                                         
Music Room 1                  -                           -                                         
STEM Room 1                  -                           -                                         
Gymnasiums/MPR/Library 3                  -                           -                                         
NTDSE Rooms 1                  -                           -                                         

560                       504                                    

UTILIZATION

Current Enrollment (2023-2024)
 (CURRENT CAPACITY / BUILDING CAPACITY) 

66%

Project No: XXXXX

BUILDING UTILIZATION

ENROLLMENT TRENDS, PAST 5 YEARS

2ND FLOOR

1ST FLOOR

MUSIC

ART

GYM

LIBRARY

MPR

5th

STEM

5th 5th

5th 5th

5th
4th

4th

5th

4th

4th

4th

3rd

3rd

3rd

3rd

3rd

3rd

4th4th
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DATE:  April 16, 2024

TOPIC: 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling Upgrades Bid

PREPARED BY: Courtney Whited

Recommended for:

☒ Action

☒ Discussion

☒ Information

Purpose/Background:

The Board of Education approves expenditures over $10,000.

Bids for the Rutledge Hall low voltage cabling project were received at 11:30 a.m. on Thursday, March 28, 2024. 

There were seven (7) bidders of record; two (2) bids were received.

StudioGC performed the bid packet evaluations that led to recommending Applied Communications Group as 

the lowest responsible, responsive bidder. The recommendation, bid tabulation and bid packet follow in the 

attachments.

Fiscal Impact:

$733,045.12 total base bid which includes a $300,000 allowance.

Recommendation:

     The Facilities Committee concurs with the Administration’s recommendation to the Board of

Education to approve this bid from Applied Communications Group for the 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling 

Upgrades project in the amount of $733,045.12 to commence June 10, 2024 and be completed by August 16, 

2024.

Executive Summary
Facilities Committee Meeting
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223 West Jackson Boulevard 

Suite 1200 

Chicago, IL 60606 

Phone: (312) 253-3400  

 

 

 

P:\Lincolnwood SD 74\23039 - 2024 RH General Work\F-Bid Negotiation\Bids 23039A\LReview_23039A-Applied.docx 
 

April 11, 2024 

 

 

Mrs. Courtney Whited 

Business Manager/CSBO 

Lincolnwood School District 74 

6950 N. East Prairie Road 

Lincolnwood, IL 60712 

 

RE: 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling Upgrades 

 Project No. 23039A 

  

Dear Mrs. Whited: 

 

Bids for the above referenced project were received at 11:30 a.m. on Thursday, March 28, 2024. 

There were seven (7) bidders of record; two (2) bids were received. A bid tabulation sheet is herein 

attached for your review.  

 

We have analyzed the bids and the qualifications of the bidders and recommend that the contract 

for the 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling Upgrades project be awarded to the lowest responsible, 

responsive bidder, Applied Communications Group. Their total base bid proposal is for $733,045.12. 

This includes allowance monies in the amount of $300,000.00 which will be returned to the school 

district if not used at the end of the project.  

 

Bids are aligned with cost estimates and project budget. Studio GC will be at the Facilities 

Committee Meeting to further discuss the bid results with the committee. 

 

 

 

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.  

 

Sincerely, 

 

 

 

 

Athi Toufexis, AIA, ALEP, LEED-AP 

 

Enclosure – Bid Tabulation 

cc: Vicki Luczynski, Studio GC 
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223 W. Jackson Blvd. Client:
Suite 1200 Project Name:
Chicago, IL  60606

P:  (312) 253-3400   Project No.:
Bid Date:  
Project Architect:

Total Bid Addendum Bid
Amount #1 #2 Bond

312-701-4492

630-529-1020

NO BID

2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling System Upgrades

23039A

Intellis LLC
312-502-1297

Malco Communications Services

Communication Zone Inc.
630-994-5040

BID TAB WORKSHEET

Contractor Remarks

Andrei Galea

$733,045.12

773-895-2867

Applied Communications Group
X X X

23039A

Athi Toufexis
Thursday, March 28, 2024 @ 11:30 a.m.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

 

$954,000.00 X X X
Stuckey Construction Company
847-336-8575

 

NO BID
RC Systems
847-671-1340

 Page 1 P:\Lincolnwood SD 74\23039 - 2024 RH General Work\F-Bid Negotiation\Bids 23039A\Bid Tab-23039A-Cabling System Upgrades
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

07/26/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE
DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF
INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE
CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this
certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
FEDERATED MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY
HOME OFFICE: P.O. BOX 328
OWATONNA, MN 55060

CONTACT
NAME: CLIENT CONTACT CENTER
PHONE
(A/C, No, Ext): 888-333-4949

FAX
(A/C, No): 507-446-4664

E-MAIL
ADDRESS: CLIENTCONTACTCENTER@FEDINS.COM

INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURER A:FEDERATED MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY 13935

INSURED 429-313-0 INSURER B: 

APPLIED COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, INC.
1015 LUNT AVE
SCHAUMBURG, IL 60193-4418

INSURER C: 

INSURER D: 

INSURER E: 

INSURER F: 

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 0 REVISION NUMBER: 0

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED.
NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE
ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF
SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE ADDL

INSR
SUBR
WVD POLICY NUMBER POLICY EFF

(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EXP

(MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS

A

X  COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

 CLAIMS-MADE X  OCCUR

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

X  POLICY PRO-
JECT  LOC

 OTHER:

N N 1867194 07/26/2023 07/26/2024

EACH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED PREMISES 
(Ea occurrence) $100,000

MED EXP (Any one person) EXCLUDED

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $1,000,000
GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000

PRODUCTS & COMP/OP AGG $2,000,000

A

 AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

N N 1867194 07/26/2023 07/26/2024

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT 
(Ea accident) $1,000,000

X ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per Person)

OWNED AUTOS ONLY SCHEDULED 
AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per Accident)

HIRED AUTOS ONLY NON-OWNED 
AUTOS ONLY

PROPERTY DAMAGE
(Per Accident)

A

X UMBRELLA LIAB X OCCUR

N N 1867195 07/26/2023 07/26/2024

EACH OCCURRENCE $5,000,000

EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $5,000,000

DED RETENTION 

A

WORKERS COMPENSATION 
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/ EXECUTIVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH)
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

Y/N

N/A N 1867197 07/26/2023 07/26/2024

X  PER STATUTE OTHER

E.L EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000

E.L DISEASE ·EA EMPLOYEE $1,000,000

E.L DISEASE · POLICY LIMIT $1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

THIS COPY IS NOT TO BE REPRODUCED FOR ISSUANCE OF CERTIFICATES.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

A CERTIFICATE HAS BEEN FILED WITH EACH OF YOUR 
CERTIFICATE HOLDERS.

0 0 SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED

BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

*+,-.
© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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Business Entity Search

Entity Information

Services and More Information

Choose a tab below to view services available to this business and more information about this business.

Office of the Secretary of State

Entity Name APPLIED COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, INC.

File Number 59414437 Status ACTIVE

Entity Type CORPORATION Type of Corp DOMESTIC BCA

Incorporation

Date

(Domestic)

05-13-1997 State ILLINOIS

Duration Date PERPETUAL

Annual Report

Filing Date 00-00-0000

Annual Report

Year 2024

Agent

Information

MICHAEL MEILAHN

1015 LUNT AVE

SCHAUMBURG ,IL 60193

Agent Change

Date

03-17-2015

Purchase Master Entity Certificate of Good Standing

Purchase Assumed Name Certificate of Good Standing

File Annual Report

Change of Registered Agent and/or Registered Office

Articles of Amendment Effecting A Name Change

Adopting Assumed Name 91

https://apps.ilsos.gov/soar/
https://apps.ilsos.gov/corpagentchange/
https://apps.ilsos.gov/corpamendment/
https://apps.ilsos.gov/corpassumednameadoption/
mmeilahn
Highlight



 

 

 
 

 
 
 
April 8, 2024 
 
 
 
To Whom It May Concern; 
 
RE:  Applied Communications Group, Inc.  – Claim Free 
 
To Whom It May Concern: 
 
Please let this letter serve to advise that there have been no claims received on any 
bonds issued for the captioned contractor in the past 5 years.   
 
Very truly yours, 
 
 
 
Merchants National Bonding, Inc. 
Stephanie Shetler 
Attorney-in-Fact 
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StephanieShetler
New Stamp



8 April 2024
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1050 Lunt Ave, Schaumburg IL 60193   Ph: (630) 529-1020   Fx: (630) 529-1026 

 

 
Athi Toufexis, AIA, ALEP, WELL AP 
223 W Jackson Blvd. | Suite 1200 
Chicago, Illinois 60606 
 

April 8, 2024 
 
 
  

Dear Athi Toufexis, AIA, ALEP, WELL AP, 
Re, 2024 Rutledge Hall Cabling Systems Upgrades 
 
This is confirmation of the following, 

Applied Communications Group, Inc. has never filed for bankruptcy.  
Applied Communications Group, Inc. has never had a contract canceled by a owner or owners 
representative.  
 
If you have any questions or concerns, please contact me at (630) 259-5222. 
 

Regards,  
 
Michael Meilahn 
President 
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i ld

ing
 Ind

ustr y
 Consul t ing Ser vice Inter nat ional

THE PROFESS IONAL DES IGNATION OF

  
I S  AWARDED TO

 
 

by BICSI in recognition of having successfully completed BICSI’s registration and examination requirements.   

Designation Number:   

Registration Start Date:    

Registration End Date:   

REGISTERED COMMUNICATIONS
DISTRIBUTION DES IGNER

 Since  

®

John H. Daniels, CNM, FACHE, FHIMSS  
BICSI Chief Executive Officer

Carol Everett Oliver, RCDD, DCDC, ESS
BICSI Board President

Michael C Meilahn

164559

01-01-2022

12-31-2024 07-11-2009
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Project References

Elmwood Park School District 401
Elmwood Park Elementary
Elmwood Park High School
Installation of Structured Cabling
Tom Kinane
Director of Technology
630-204-0919
kinanet@epcusd401.org
Contract Total, $400,000

Dundee Crown High School #300
Installation of Structured Cabling and Clock Intercom
Josh Martin
Technology Infrastructure Manager
joshua.martin@d300.org
847-551-8399
Contract Total, $875,000

Oregon Community Unit School District 220
Installation of Structured Cabling and Clock Intercom
Contact Shawn Gadow
Director Of Technology, CISSP
Office (815)732-5600
E-mail sgadow@ocusd.net
Contract Total $1,060,000

Antioch SD 34 Oakland and Petty (JOB 30016)
W C Petty Elementary School
Oakland Elementary School
Installation of Structured cable and Clock Intercom Systems
Contract Amount - $725,000

SD86 – Hinsdale Township High School #86
Hinsdale South
Hinsdale Central
Installation of Structured Cabling
Craig Williams, RCDD/NTS
630.656.7366
cwilliams@clientfirstcg.com
$300,000

98
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DATE:  April 16, 2024

TOPIC: Winter 2024-25 & 2025-26 Snow Removal Services Contract with Contour Landscaping Inc.

PREPARED BY: Courtney Whited

Recommended for:

☒ Action

☒ Discussion

☒ Information

Purpose/Background:
The District approves all contracts.

Contour Landscaping, Inc. has been providing valued snow removal services to the District for several 

years. District Legal Counsel reviewed this agreement and Contour accepted all requested changes. 

Although Contour offered the option to add a third year, the District will only contract for two years of service 

to remain below the $35,000 bidding threshold.

Fiscal Impact:
$9,264 for two upcoming winter seasons plus

Per Push Cost After 42" ranging from $579-$1,274 per push.

The District paid $8,566 for two winter seasons: 2022-23 and 2023-24

Recommendation:

     The Facilities Committee concurs with the Administration’s recommendation to the Board of

Education to approve this Contract from Contour Landscaping, Inc. for snow removal services in the 

amount of $9,264 from November 1, 2024 through March 31, 2026.

Executive Summary
Facilities Committee Meeting
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Please Sign and Return One Copy

Date: 3/11/2024
Phone:

Fax:
After Hrs:

Contact:
Email:

     November Payment: $2,037
     December Payment: $2,548

$2,548
     February Payment: $1,529

      2011/2012 Winter Season         $1,529
             Total Seasonal Cost: $10,191

under 4" $637 per plowing per plowing
4"- 6" $1,019 per plowing per plowing

6" & Over $1,401 per plowing per plowing

          Ice Control of Lot and Drive:                                                                                      $665 per application 

3501 Jarvis Ave. Skokie, IL 60076        ●        847.673.5149        ●        Fax  847.673.5655  

Lincolnwood School Dist. #74 847.583.0859
Attn. Jim Caldwell 847.675.4207

Snow Removal Agreement

Agreements approved  before 
5/3/2024

Location: 6950 N. East Prairie Rd., Lincolnwood

6950 N. East Prairie Rd. 
Lincolnwood, IL 60712-2520 Jim Caldwell

jcaldwell@sd74.org

     January Payment: $2,316
$1,390

     March Payment: $1,390

Agreements approved  before 
5/3/2024

$579

$1,852
$2,316

   Contour Landscaping, Inc.

Per Winter Season

Per Occurrence 

$926
$1,274

$9,264

Per Push Cost After 42" Cap      

_____________________________    _3/11/2024  _______________________  _______  
Dave Biskup                                              Date                                                                Authorization                Date 
General Manager

(Due to insurance liability purposes all locations are required to receive ice control after each plowing and snowfalls less than the required 
amount for snow plowing. Conditions will be determined as necessary by Contour Landscaping Inc.)

Please initial___________       YES – I would like to LOCK IN TODAY’S PRICES with a 3-YEAR AGREEMENT 
Please initial___________       No – I do not want the optional 3rd year extension. 
I have read and fully understand the prices and terms on the front and back of this agreement.  I authorize Contour Landscaping,
Inc. to perform these services. 

It is hereby agreed that Contour Landscaping, Inc. will provide plowing services in accordance with the following 
terms for the 2024-2025 and 2025-2026 winter season. Completion Time: Before 7 am Mon.-Sat.
Customer Specifications:

Seasonal Snow Plowing Cost  
This option is a contract for the season broken into 5 monthly installments. If the seasonal snowfall exceeds 42 inches there will be 
an additional charge along with the monthly payments.  Extra charges will be based on the quoted per push basis. Salting, ice 
control, hand shoveling, end loader work and haul away are not included in this rate. 

This proposal may be withdrawn by Contour Landscaping, Inc. if not accepted in 21 days
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Please Sign and Return One Copy

Contour Landscaping, Inc.  Snow Removal Specifications and Terms
General Terms
 Plowing will be provided for each snowfall of 2” or more or at the discretion of Contour Landscaping Inc., unless 

otherwise requested by the District.
 The lot to be plowed should be as clear as possible to facilitate snow removal procedures.  All plowing will be subject 

to time of day, forecast for duration of storm, parked cars and traffic in lots.  The main snow removal operation will 
be completed during non-business hours when the parking lot is most accessible.

 It is understood that everything possible will be done to remove the snow before the designated time.  However, 
during sudden snowfalls the completion time cannot be guaranteed.  During heavier early AM storms and continuous 
snowfalls Contour Landscaping, Inc. will periodically clear aisles to allow reasonable access.

 When temperatures or wind chills fall below zero or during heavy winds and drifting snow, hand shoveling and 
clearing of sidewalks will be suspended until conditions are safe for snow removal staff members.

 Regardless of business hours plowing, hand shoveling and clearing of sidewalks will commence at the end of each 
snowstorm.  This protects snow-covered areas from melting and re-freezing.

 There will be an excess charge of $125.00 per hour (minimum 1 hour charge)per vehicle and $48.00 per hand 
shoveling man hour for extreme drifting or snowfalls that exceed eight inches.  During continuous snowfalls and as 
trucks become available, the snow will be swept off the lots every eight inches (during business or non-business 
hours) to assure proper service.  During heavy snowfalls we reserve the right to dispatch heavy equipment and end 
loaders as necessary.  This would be an additional charge per Contour Landscaping, Inc. customary rates.

 Due to fluctuating fuel prices there may be an additional fuel surcharge if fuel prices go above $4.00 per gallon. 
Surcharge will not exceed 5% of seasonal snow plowing cost.

 Unless otherwise specified, Contour Landscaping, Inc. is not responsible for any hand shoveling, salting of walks, 
stacking of snow, end loader work or hauling of snow away from the area. This will be available at an additional 
charge.

Insurance
 A certificate of insurance is available upon request.  Damage is to be reported as soon as possible or prior to 72 

hours.  
 Due to the nature of snow and ice removal, we have no control over unexpected freezing/thawing, occasional 

localized snow showers, temperature drops, etc.  
 Contour Landscaping, Inc. is not responsible for salt damage to turf or other property.                                                                
Ice Control (Required at all locations)
 Ice Control will take place for any accumulations less than the required amount for snow plowing, freezing rain, ice 

accumulation and after each plowing.  Conditions will be determined as necessary by Contour Landscaping, Inc., 
unless otherwise requested by the District.

 When performing Ice Control services, the type of material and prices are subject to change due to product 
availability, area shortages or price increases.             

Payment Terms
 All accounts are due and payable upon receipt of invoice. We reserve the right to withhold service on any past due 

account.  

This proposal may be withdrawn by Contour Landscaping, Inc. if not accepted in 21 days
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 Contour Landscaping, Inc.
  3501 Jarvis, Skokie  IL   60076   847.673.5149    Fax  847.673. 5655

2024 - 2025 Winter Equipment Hourly Rates

Wheel Loader $265/Hour

Skid Steer Loader $215/Hour

Small Dump Truck (Less than 2 tons) $155/Hour

Large Dump Truck (20+ tons) $285/Hour

Spotter $95/Hour

*Travel time will be charged in both directions for all equipment

**There will be a $15 per cubic yard dumping fee for snow hauled off site in 
addition to the hourly rates for equipment

***Spotter is used when stacking and loading snow to assure safety of operators, 
staff and client’s property

****There will be a minimum charge of four hours for each on-call service.

*****If the service is not time sensitive, a quote can be provided for hauling or 
stacking.  
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DATE: April 16, 2024

TOPIC: Custodial Services Bid

PREPARED BY: Courtney Whited

Recommended for:

☒ Action

☒ Discussion

☒ Information

Purpose/Background:

The District published a custodial services bid notice on February 29, 2024. Thirteen agents representing ten

(10) unique companies attended the pre-bid walk-through on March 12, 2024.

Six (6) vendors submitted bid packets before the April 2, 2024 deadline at 1:00 p.m. No other bid packets

arrived after the deadline. A bid tabulation is attached.

All six (6) bidders completed and signed Exhibit A of the Bid form. The District began to evaluate the bid packets

in order of lowest first-year cost using a rubric consisting of three phases.

The attached Evaluations provide details relative to passing on Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc. and

Multisystem Management Company in favor of recommending GSF USA, Inc. as the lowest responsible bidder.

The District Legal Counsel reviewed the pertinent bid components and found the attachments acceptable.

Fiscal Impact:

$506,445.97 for the first year of custodial services which is a 7.23% increase over last year’s cost.

The District paid $472,288.65 in 2023-24 with GSF USA, Inc.

Recommendation:

The Facilities Committee concurs with the Administration’s recommendation to the Board of

Education to accept the bid from GSF USA, Inc. for three years of District-wide custodial services with the option

to renew for two additional one-year periods. The first year cost will be $506,445.97 commencing August 1,

2024 and ending July 31, 2025. 112



Administration Office Custodial Services Bid
6950 N. East Prairie Rd
Lincolnwood, IL 60712 4/2/2024 at 1:00 PM
847-675-8234

Alpha Building Maintenance $483,825.00 X

City Wide Facility Solutions NO BID

Eco Cleaning Company NO BID

Executive Building Management $598,176.55 X

FBG Facility Services NO BID

GDI Integrated Facility Services $605,480.00 X

GSF-USA, Inc. $506,445.97 X

HES Facilities Management $538,321.85 X

Multisystem Management Company $488,920.00 X

Smith Maintenance Co. NO BID

Project Name:

Bid Date:

Vendor 1st Year Amount All Certifications Remarks

BID TAB WORKSHEET

113



Lincolnwood School District #74
Custodial Services Request for Proposals Due April 2, 2024

Custodial Services Bid Evaluation Matrix, Page 1 of 3

Phase I Evaluation: Lowest Cost Bidder

Phase II Evaluation: Responsible Bidder

Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc. $483,825.00

Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc.

Issue #3:

Lowest Year #1 Cost; Proceed to Evaluation Phase II

Multisystem Management Company $488,920.00
GSF USA, Inc. $506,445.97
HES Facilities Management $538,321.85
EBM $598,176.55
GDI Services, Inc. $605,480.00

Issue #1: In Section 3 of the bid packet, the Memorandum states "THERE HAVE BEEN NO
CONTRACTS THAT HAVE BEEN TERMINATED MID-TERM IN THE LAST 5 YEARS"

Issue #2: In Section 3 of the bid packet, the Memorandum states "THERE IS (SIC) NO LITIGATIONS
THAT ABMS HAS BEEN INVOLVED IN THE LAST 5 YEARS"

Reference check phone calls conducted between April 3-5, 2024

Do NOT proceed to Evaluation Phase III

This is a false statment. Batavia Public School District #101 did cancel mid-term on February
20, 2024 Board of Education meeting. This particular contract began on March 22, 2022 and
was intended to expire on June 30, 2025. (Phone call with SD#101 Administrator on April 5,
2024 at 11:01 AM)

This is a false statment. Eight Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc. janitorial workers
contracted to work in South Holland School District #151 filed a class-action lawsuit based on
accusations that ABMS was "regularly forcing workers to work through unpaid lunch breaks
while requiring them to still clock out, failing to pay some paychecks and failing to pay a
minimum wage for jobs outside their normal duties as required by the contract."  Source:
Chicago Tribune

Five of ABMS's suggested school district references were called. One did not reply, two (2)
gave negative reviews and two (2) gave positive reviews. Three (3) other school districts that
have contracted with ABMS were also called. All four provided negative reviews citing details
to support their stances relative to Alpha Building Maintenance Service.

https://www.chicagotribune.com/2019/06/12/ex-school-custodians-file-class-action-lawsuit-aga
inst-south-suburban-employer-alleging-wage-theft/
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Lincolnwood School District #74
Custodial Services Request for Proposals Due April 2, 2024

Custodial Services Bid Evaluation Matrix, Page 2 of 3

Phase I Evaluation: Lowest Cost Bidder

Phase II Evaluation: Responsible Bidder

Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc. $483,825.00

GSF USA, Inc. $506,445.97
HES Facilities Management $538,321.85
EBM $598,176.55
GDI Services, Inc. $605,480.00

Issue #1: The general requirements specified in the RFP called for "at least three (3) of these references
must be schools, public or private.

Issue #2: Niles Township School District put MMC on notice to terminate the 1-year contract

Issue #3: School district references

Issue #4: Recent Lawsuit - Labor Litigation

Disqualified due to lack of responsibility

Multisystem Management Company $488,920.00

Multisystem Management Company

Points Earned 15 pts.
out of 35

Next Lowest Year 1 Cost; Proceed to Evaluation Phase II

Tentatively proceed to Evaluation Phase III

MMC listed four (4) school districts in their bid's reference section. However, MMC provides
janitorial services to clean ONLY the ADMINISTRATION OFFICES within two (2) of those four (4)
school  districts. Therefore, MMC cited only two (2) school districts in which services are rendered
in the schools and offices.

April 28, 2020: SD70 sent MMC a certified letter citing a breach of contract due to unsatisfactory
service; SD70 finished the start of the Spring 2020 pandemic without any custodial services; MMC
did NOT invoice SD70 beyond April 2020; SD70 Board approved a custodial services contract in
May 2020 with a different vendor.

Of the four school districts MMC listed, two districts provided negative reviews of MMC, one district
cited an average review and one district expressed satisfaction.

Case filed 9/23/2022: Illinois Northern District Court Case #1:22-cv-05194; MCC and Maciej
Cwiertnia listed as defendants in a dispute related to the Fair Labor Standards Act

Phase III Evaluation: Bid Specifications
5 IL references in last 3 years provided (7)
3 IL school district references in the last 3 years provided (7)
Reference feedback: POS=2 pts, MOSTLY POS=1 pt, MOSTLY NEGATIVE=0 pts. (7)
Additional reference checks with school districts that have contracted with this company
General: years, employees, locations, regional/national support (7)
General: organizational chart showing structure, relationships/ranks of officers (7)
General: experience working with organized labor unions; applicable CBAs (7)
General: last 3 years of CAFS
General: explicit statement relative to seeking any bankruptcy protection (7)
Insurance: insurance company has A.M. Best rating of A-X or better (8)
Insurance: comprehensive general liability $1m (8)
Insurance: auto coverage $1m (8)
Insurance: workers' comp $1m (9)
Insurance: umbrella $5m (9)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/fingerprint-based criminal background checks performed (10)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/IL Statewide Sex Offender Database searches performed (10)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/interview incumbent custodians (11)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/wages consistent with local market (11)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/description of company's healthcare plans w/ EE contributions (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's effective method to capture time worked (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's on-going safety training program (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's on-going technical training program (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's uniforms worn by hourly EEs (12)
Gen. Spec.: work/on-site management provided (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./ provide devices to communicate w/ staff (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./ implement a computerized maintenance management system (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  description of company's QC and satisfaction surveys (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  monthly written reports; quarterly meetings w/ regional mngr+ (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  directly employed; disclose any intent to sub-contract (13)
Cust. Op. Spec.: an anticipated staffing plan was provided (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: staffing plan has 3 day, 8 night & 1 sup. F-T during school year (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: staffing plan includes 11 F-T & 1 sup. during breaks/summer (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: sample reports were provided with the bid (15)

1.0
0.5
1.0
0.0
0.5
0.5
1.0
0.5
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
0.0
0.0
0.0
0.0
0.0
0.0
1.0
0.5
0.5
0.5
0.0
0.0
0.5
0.5
0.5
0.0
0.0
0.0
0.0

2.5

3.5

5.0

0.0

2.5

1.5

0.0
Other: Not responsive to bid specifications 0.0

115



Lincolnwood School District #74
Custodial Services Request for Proposals Due April 2, 2024

Phase III Evaluation: Bid Specifications

Custodial Services Bid Evaluation Matrix, Page 3 of 3

Phase I Evaluation: Lowest Cost Bidder

Phase II Evaluation: Responsible Bidder

Alpha Building Maintenance Service, Inc. $483,825.00
Multisystem Management Company $488,920.00

HES Facilities Management $538,321.85
EBM $598,176.55
GDI Services, Inc. $605,480.00

Rationale #1: Recent five (5) years of SD74's experience with GSF

Rationale #2: Recent Lawsuit: May 2022 Decision in GSF's Favor

Rationale #3: School District References

Disqualified due to lack of responsibility

Disqualified due to lack of responsibility

GSF USA, Inc. $506,445.97

GSF USA, Inc.

Points
Earned

35 pts.
out of 35

Next Lowest Year 1 Cost; Proceed to Evaluation Phase II

Proceed to Evaluation Phase III

Consistently excellent; communication is detailed and on-going but not overwhelming;
minimal issues cited are addressed in a timely fashion

Dismissed without prejudice; GSF USA Inc. won its bid to stay a Biometric Information
Privacy Act case pending the resolution of two BIPA cases before the Illinois Supreme
Court, after an Illinois federal judge agreed that the pending cases would impact the
viability of the GSF lawsuit.
Judge Charles P. Kocoras of the US District Court for the Northern District of IL agreed
with GSF

32 unique IL school district references provided; 5 districts contacted; All reviews were
positive

5 IL references in last 3 years provided (7)
3 IL school district references in the last 3 years provided (7)
Reference feedback: POS=2 pts, MOSTLY POS=1 pt, MOSTLY NEGATIVE=0 pts. (7)
Additional reference checks with school districts that have contracted with this company
General: years, employees, locations, regional/national support (7)
General: organizational chart showing structure, relationships/ranks of officers (7)

General: experience working with organized labor unions; applicable CBAs (7)

General: last 3 years of CAFS
General: explicit statement relative to seeking any bankruptcy protection (7)

Insurance: insurance company has A.M. Best rating of A-X or better (8)

Insurance: comprehensive general liability $1m (8)
Insurance: auto coverage $1m (8)
Insurance: workers' comp $1m (9)
Insurance: umbrella $5m (9)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/fingerprint-based criminal background checks performed (10)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/IL Statewide Sex Offender Database searches performed (10)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/interview incumbent custodians (11)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/wages consistent with local market (11)
Gen. Spec.: hiring/description of company's healthcare plans w/ EE contributions (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's effective method to capture time worked (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's on-going safety training program (11)
Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's on-going technical training program (11)

Gen. Spec.: work/description of company's uniforms worn by hourly EEs (12)

Gen. Spec.: work/on-site management provided (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./ provide devices to communicate w/ staff (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./ implement a computerized maintenance management system (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  description of company's QC and satisfaction surveys (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  monthly written reports; quarterly meetings w/ regional mngr+ (12)
Gen. Spec.: comm./  directly employed; disclose any intent to sub-contract (13)
Cust. Op. Spec.: an anticipated staffing plan was provided (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: staffing plan has 3 day, 8 night & 1 sup. F-T during school year (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: staffing plan includes 11 F-T & 1 sup. during breaks/summer (14)
Cust. Op. Spec.: sample reports were provided with the bid (15)
Other: 401k, motivation program,

1.0
1.0
2.0
1.0
1.0
1.0

1.0

1.0
1.0

1.0

1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0

1.0

1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0
1.0

5.0

5.0

5.0

5.0

5.0
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DATE:  April 16, 2024

TOPIC: District Facilities Update

PREPARED BY: Courtney Whited

Recommended for:

     Action

 ☒ Discussion

 ☒ Information

Purpose/Background:

To provide the Facilities Committee an update on ongoing Districtwide project(s):

1. Lincolnwood Public Library District requested the use of Rutledge Hall’s parking lot during 

their Summer Reading Kick Off Party. The party will take place on Friday, June 7 from 4:00 to 

6:00 p.m. The Public Library’s lot will be closed during this event.

2. Lincolnwood Baseball and Softball Association submitted a request to waive facility rental 

fees for the upcoming fiscal year beginning July 1, 2024 and ending June 30, 2025. The 

Finance Committee will send a recommendation to the Board of Education.

Facilities Committee Meeting
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