APPROVED

CYPRESS < FAIRBANKS

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
LEARN © EMPOWER © ACHIEVE e DREAM

To: Kay Alarcon
Assistant Director of Procurement Services

From: Tom Draper
Buyer
Date: December 5, 2024
Re: Automotive Antifreeze

Annual Contract #25-01-5502I1B

The following proposals were received and opened at 10:00 a.m., Friday, November 22, 2024, as specified in documents concerning
Annual Contract #25-01-5502I1B Automotive Antifreeze. The proposals received are located on page 2.

 Does not meet District criteria
Recommendation: A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company)
PetroChoice LLC
Safety-Kleen Systems Inc. (Thermo Fluids, Inc.)
Estimated Expenditure: $15,000.00
Contract Term: January 1, 2025 - December 31, 2025

Renewal: 4 years

td
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| 1 |Automotive Chemicals, Antifreeze, Longlife, 55 gallon drum, Pre-Dilute

Supplier QTY UOM  Unit Price
PetroChoice LLC 1 EA $291.77
Safety-Kleen Systems Inc. (Thermo Fluids, Inc.) 1 EA $340.71
[ALT1] A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA $348.48
Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91°
[ALT1] Garner Qil Company 1 EA $377.91°
ATLANTIC PETROLEUM (Atlantic Petroleum) 1 EA $618.73
Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA No Bid

[ 2 |Automotive Chemicals, Antifreeze, Longlife, 55 gallon drum
Supplier QTY UOM  Unit Price

Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91°
[ALT1] Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91°2
PetroChoice LLC 1 EA $394.62
Safety-Kleen Systems Inc. (Thermo Fluids, Inc.) 1 EA $523.90
[ALT1] A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA $537.82
ATLANTIC PETROLEUM (Atlantic Petroleum) 1 EA $886.90
Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA No Bid

[ 3 JAutomotive Chemicals, Antifreeze, Extended Life, 55 gallon drum
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price

Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91 °
[ALT1] Garner Qil Company 1 EA $377.91°
PetroChoice LLC 1 EA $526.23
Safety-Kleen Systems Inc. (Thermo Fluids, Inc.) 1 EA $541.41
A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA $743.36
ATLANTIC PETROLEUM (Atlantic Petroleum) 1 EA $886.90
Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $1,562.52
[ALT1] Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $1,562.52
| 4 |Automotive Chemicals, Antifreeze, Extended Life, 55 gallon drum, Pre-Dilute
Supplier QTY UOM  Unit Price
Safety-Kleen Systems Inc. (Thermo Fluids, Inc.) 1 EA $342.62
PetroChoice LLC 1 EA $343.58
Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91 °
[ALT1] Garner Oil Company 1 EA $377.91°
A-Line Auto Parts (Arnold Oil Company of Austin, LP) 1 EA $431.67
ATLANTIC PETROLEUM (Atlantic Petroleum) 1 EA $618.73
[ALT1] Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $844.61
Holt Truck Centers (Holt Truck Centers of Texas, LLC) 1 EA $884.61
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