Cooperative Bid Award — Refuse Collection Recycling Services - 2024-16
WCSD BID TABULATION

2024-2025 ALL VENDORS ALL BID MODERN CASELLA WASTE MANAGEMENT*

SERVICE TYPE - YEAR 1 TIPS $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL
Refuse - 10 CY 4188 44.00| 184,272.00 46.00| 192,648.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 8 CY 1302 35.20| 45,830.40 36.80| 47,913.60 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 6 CY 173 26.40 4,567.20 27.60|  4,774.80 0.00 0.00
30 YD ROLL OFF SVC 10 440.00|  4,400.00 441.00]  4,410.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 10 CY 4188 100.00| 418,800.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 8 CY 1302 80.00| 104,160.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 6 CY 173 60.00 10,380.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 10 CY 665 50.50| 33,582.50 47.30| 31,454.50 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 8 CY 640 40.40| 25,856.00 37.84| 24,217.60 0.00 0.00
[TOTAL REFUSE + RECYCLE 298,508.10 305,418.50 REJECTED|
TOTAL REFUSE LAND FILL FREE + RECYCLE 597,178.50 N/A N/A

2025-2026 ALL VENDORS ALL BID MODERN CASELLA WASTE MANAGEMENT*

SERVICE TYPE - YEAR 2 TIPS $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL
Refuse - 10 CY 4188 46.20| 193,485.60 48.30| 202,280.40 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 8 CY 1302 36.96| 48,121.92 38.64| 50,309.28 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 6 CY 173 27.82| 4,812.86 28.98| 5,013.54 0.00 0.00
30 YD ROLL OFF SVC 10 440.00]  4,400.00 441.00]  4,410.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 10 CY 4188 105.00| 439,740.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 8 CY 1302 84.00| 109,368.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 6 CY 173 63.00| 10,899.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 10 CY 665 53.02| 35,258.30 49.67| 33,030.55 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 8 CY 640 42.42| 27,148.80 39.73| 25,427.20 0.00 0.00
[TOTAL REFUSE + RECYCLE 313,227.48 320,470.97 REJECTED?|
TOTAL REFUSE LAND FILL FREE + RECYCLE 626,814.10 N/A N/A

2026-2027 ALL VENDORS ALL BID MODERN CASELLA WASTE MANAGEMENT*

SERVICE TYPE - YEAR 3 TIPS $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL $/TIP TOTAL
Refuse - 10 CY 4188 48.51| 203,159.88 50.72| 212,415.36 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 8 CY 1302 38.80| 50,517.60 40.57| 52,822.14 0.00 0.00
Refuse - 6 CY 173 29.21| 5,053.33 30.43| 5,264.39 0.00 0.00
30 YD ROLL OFF SVC 10 440.00]  4,400.00 441.00]  4,410.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 10 CY 4188 110.25| 461,727.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 8 CY 1302 88.20| 114,836.40 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
Refuse LF FREE - 6 CY 173 66.15| 11,443.95 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 10 CY 665 55.67| 37,020.55 52.15| 34,679.75 0.00 0.00
RECYCLE - 8 CY 640 44.54| 28,505.60 41.72| 26,700.80 0.00 0.00
[TOTAL REFUSE + RECYCLE 328,656.96 336,292.44 REJECTED?|
TOTAL REFUSE LAND FILL FREE + RECYCLE 657,933.50 N/A N/A

* Waste Management of New York provided an alternate bid which only included servicing the Amherst School District and was rejected for not meeting

the requirements of the cooperative bid.

Awarded to : Modern Disposal Services
TERM OF CONTRACT : The contract award is for the period July 1, 2024 — June 30, 2025.

The Districts reserve the right to extend the contract for the term July 1, 2025-June 30, 2026 and the term July 1, 2026 — June
30, 2027, contingent upon each Districts Board of Education providing funding for the service in each of these fiscal years as
well as a decision by each District to continue the service contract with the vendor. The Districts reserve the right to terminate
the contract at any time without cause by providing the vendor a minimum of thirty days’ notice on the cancellation of their
contract or purchase order. Contract termination will not result in any additional fees, loss of service expenses or other
payments to the vendor with the exception of what is owed to the vendor for services that were previously performed for the

district.
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