
February 28, 2022

Ms.Nicole Lawson
Centralpoly
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036

Re:  Freedom of Information Request

Dear Ms. Lawson:

On February 22, 2022 Crystal Lake School District No. 47 received a Freedom of Information Act
(“FOIA”) Request from you via email, in which you requested the following:

● Custodial supplies include the previous bid tabulations & award information.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me 815-788-5000.

Sincerely,

Clare F. Bourne
Freedom of Information Officer
Crystal Lake School District 47

Educational Excellence for All Students is Our Passion and Commitment.



From: Nicole Lawson <nicole@centralpoly.com>
Date: Mon, Feb 21, 2022, 7:13 AM
Subject: Bid request - Custodial Supplies
To: rbkomosa@d47.org <rbkomosa@d47.org>

Good morning,

I’d like to request a copy of the above-referenced bid, please.
Kindly forward via the contact information listed below and, if possible, include the previous bid
tabulations & award information

Educational Excellence for All Students is Our Passion and Commitment.



Group Name/Number

Warehouse 

Direct, 

Des Plaines, IL 

Unique 

Products,

St. Charles, IL

North 

American,

Glenview, IL

Imperial Dade 

/ Kranz,

Racine, Wi

Peterson 

Products,

Lake Forest, IL

Dura

Wax,

McHenry, IL

Group 1- Bags/Can Liners 10,916.37$                     11,192.72$                    no bid no bid 16,241.80$                 no bid

Bag Samples received yes yes no bid no bid yes no bid

Group 2- Scrubbing Pads 1,654.05$                       2,065.15$                      1,952.30$                    1,959.15$                    3,024.00$                    no bid

Group 3- Dust Mops 667.35$                          618.74$                          739.65$                       746.68$                        1,937.90$                    no bid

Group 4- Mops & Buckets no bid 8,936.73$                      6,039.15$                    6,870.30$                    9,086.32$                    no bid

Group 5- Brooms & Brushes no bid 536.14$                          no bid 403.28$                        759.72$                       no bid

Group 6- Misc Chemicals no bid 1,136.98$                      no bid 1,204.20$                    no bid no bid

Group 7- Misc Supplies no bid 10,754.98$                    no bid 5,107.48$                    5,753.48$                    no bid

Cleaning Chemicals 20,130.35$                     27,050.88$                    no bid 22,930.02$                  28,450.16$                 no bid

Hand Soap 7,351.22$                       no bid 6,505.55$                    6,558.46$                    no bid no bid

Paper Products 26,054.40$                     57,645.96$                    no bid no bid 43,275.00$                 no bid

Acknowledge Addendum yes yes yes yes yes no bid

Total Awarded Amount 58,755.17$                     1,755.72$                      12,544.70$                  5,510.76$                    $0.00 no bid

Bid specifications were distributed to a total of 40 companies. 78,566.35$                   

7 companies participated in the mandatory pre-bid meeting on March 2, 2021. total awarded bids

Crystal Lake Elementary District 47

2021-22 Custodial Supplies --  Bid Tab Sheet 

Bid Opening April 6, 2021 at 2:00pm

Suppliers

5 of the 7 companies who attended the mandatory pre-bid meeting submitted the above bids

Groups marked in YELLOW are the lowest qualified bidders for that group
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