
February 11, 2022

Mr. Adam Slade
3825 Edwards Rd. St. 800
Cincinnati, Ohio 45209

Re:  Freedom of Information Request

Dear Mr. Slade:

On February 3, 2022 Crystal Lake School District No. 47 received a Freedom of Information Act
(“FOIA”) Request from you via email, in which you requested the following:

● Plan holders list, estimated cost, start and end dates for project - 2022 Asbestos
Abatement Projects

Please find the attached documents which fulfills our obligation to your FOIA.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me 815-788-5000.

Sincerely,

Clare F. Bourne
Freedom of Information Officer
Crystal Lake School District 47

Educational Excellence for All Students is Our Passion and Commitment.



  Crystal Lake Community Consolidated School District 47 
           300 Commerce Drive, Crystal Lake, IL. 60014 

                                                          Phone:  815‐459‐6070    Fax:  815‐479‐8566 
 
   

   

REQUEST FOR ACCESS TO PUBLIC RECORDS  
PURSUANT TO THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT (5ILCS 140) 

 
Date of Request:  _____________________________    FOIA Record #    _________________________ 
 
Name:       __________________________________    Organization:     _________________________   
 
Address:     __________________________________    Phone Number: _________________________ 
 
      __________________________________ 
 

I HEREBY REQUEST ACCESS TO THE FOLLOWING RECORDS: 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

____________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Within 5 business days of the District receiving your request, you are entitled to a response, or notice that the district is in 
need of addition processing time (not to exceed an additional 5 business days).When our response is complete, we will 
contact you. 
 
The District’s response, including all supporting documents, and FOIA request with all submitted information, will be posted 
online under “Freedom of Information” on the District 47 website.  District 47 provides this service as a public courtesy for 
no fee.  Documents will be posted within 10 business days from our response to your request.  
 
Fees will apply after the initial limited amount of black and white copies are provided.  Actual cost of color or abnormal size 
copies will apply.   
 
 
FOR OFFICE USE ONLY: 
The District’s response and records were accessed by : ____ In House Inspection     _____Pick‐up    _____Mail    _____Fax      _____Email 
 
Date:___________________     Time: __________________ 
 
AMT REC’D:____________    Check#_______      Cash______ 
 
 
FOIA Officer:______________________________________________ 
 
 
Witness:  _______________________________________________ 
 
 

          

Adam Slade ConstructConnect

2/03/2022

3825 Edwards Rd   Ste 800

    Cincinnati, Ohio, 45209

513-458-5854

Plan holders list, Estimated cost, Start and end dates for project 

RFQ Contractor - 2022 Asbestos Abatement Projects



CRYSTAL LAKE SCHOOL DISTRICT #47 HUSMANN ELEMENTARY

SPRING/SUMMER 2022 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT ACTIVITIES BID TALLY

CONTRACTOR
PET INVITED

 (Y/N)

BASE BID 

AMOUNT
ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2

(Selected)
ALTERNATE #3

TOTAL 

WITH ALTERNATE #2 

Valor Technologies

 3 Northpoint Ct, Bolingbrook, IL 60440
Yes

Cove Remediation, Inc.

5316 W. 124th Street Alsip, IL 60803
Yes  $                247,000.00  $                 43,000.00  $                 38,000.00 5,000.00$                   285,000.00$                                           

EHC Industries, Inc.

366 Hollow Hill Dr, Wauconda, IL 60084
Yes  $                169,600.00  $                   5,607.00  $                 13,707.00 2,500.00$                   183,307.00$                                           

High Efficiency Professional Abatement

4501 W Cortez St, Chicago, IL 60651
Yes

Midway Contracting Group

7413 Duvan Dr #2, Tinley Park, IL 60477
Yes  $      101,820.00  $           5,000.00  $           8,900.00 2,500.00$           110,720.00$                            

Abel Plus Services Inc

504 Sundown Rd, South Elgin, IL 60177
No

Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid

Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid

Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid



CRYSTAL LAKE SCHOOL DISTRICT #47 LUNDAHL MIDDLE SCHOOL

SUMMER 2022 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT ACTIVITIES BID TALLY

CONTRACTOR
PET INVITED

 (Y/N)
BASE BID AMOUNT

TOTAL 

WITH ALTERNATE

Valor Technologies

 3 Northpoint Ct, Bolingbrook, IL 60440
Yes 19,600.00$                                                                  19,600.00$                                            

Cove Remediation, Inc.

5316 W. 124th Street Alsip, IL 60803
Yes 43,000.00$                                                                  43,000.00$                                            

EHC Industries, Inc.

366 Hollow Hill Dr, Wauconda, IL 60084
Yes 31,900.00$                                                                  31,900.00$                                            

High Efficiency Professional Abatement

4501 W Cortez St, Chicago, IL 60651
Yes 12,000.00$                                                                  12,000.00$                                             

Midway Contracting Group

7413 Duvan Dr #2, Tinley Park, IL 60477
Yes 25,650.00$                                                                  25,650.00$                                             

Abel Plus Services Inc

504 Sundown Rd, South Elgin, IL 60177
No Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid



CRYSTAL LAKE SCHOOL DISTRICT #47 SOUTH ELEMENTARY

SUMMER 2022 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT ACTIVITIES BID TALLY

CONTRACTOR
PET INVITED

 (Y/N)
BASE BID AMOUNT

TOTAL 

WITH ALTERNATE

Valor Technologies

 3 Northpoint Ct, Bolingbrook, IL 60440
Yes 31,500.00$                                                                  31,500.00$                                            

Cove Remediation, Inc.

5316 W. 124th Street Alsip, IL 60803
Yes 44,700.00$                                                                  44,700.00$                                            

EHC Industries, Inc.

366 Hollow Hill Dr, Wauconda, IL 60084
Yes 33,700.00$                                                                  33,700.00$                                            

High Efficiency Professional Abatement

4501 W Cortez St, Chicago, IL 60651
Yes 33,350.00$                                                                  33,350.00$                                            

Midway Contracting Group

7413 Duvan Dr #2, Tinley Park, IL 60477
Yes 26,350.00$                                                                  26,350.00$                                             

Abel Plus Services Inc

504 Sundown Rd, South Elgin, IL 60177
No Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid



CRYSTAL LAKE SCHOOL DISTRICT #47 WEST ELEMENTARY

SUMMER 2022 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT ACTIVITIES BID TALLY

CONTRACTOR
PET INVITED

 (Y/N)
BASE BID AMOUNT

TOTAL 

WITH ALTERNATE

Valor Technologies

 3 Northpoint Ct, Bolingbrook, IL 60440
Yes 19,800.00$                                              19,800.00$                                                    

Cove Remediation, Inc.

5316 W. 124th Street Alsip, IL 60803
Yes 31,500.00$                                              31,500.00$                                                    

EHC Industries, Inc.

366 Hollow Hill Dr, Wauconda, IL 60084
Yes 18,250.00$                                              18,250.00$                                                    

High Efficiency Professional Abatement

4501 W Cortez St, Chicago, IL 60651
Yes 12,350.00$                                              12,350.00$                                                    

Midway Contracting Group

7413 Duvan Dr #2, Tinley Park, IL 60477
Yes 15,100.00$                                              15,100.00$                                                     

Abel Plus Services Inc

504 Sundown Rd, South Elgin, IL 60177
No Attended Bid Walk/ No Bid
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