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May 10, 2021

Michele Dickinson
Construction Journal

Re: Freedom of Information Request
Dear Ms. Dickson:

On May 3, 2021, Crystal Lake School District No. 47 received a Freedom of Information Act (“FOIA”)
Request from you via email, in which you requested the following:

e We are currently reporting the following project (flooring) which recently bid. May I have the bid
tabulation? If it has been awarded, may I also have the name of the awarded contractor and the
award amount? If not yet available, do you have an anticipated date the bid tab and/or award will
be released?

The Information you are requesting is attached and fulfills our obligation to your FOIA.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me 815-788-5000.

Sincerely,
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Clare F. Bourne
Freedom of Information Officer
Crystal Lake School District 47

300 Commerce Dr. Crystal Lake, IL 60014 815.788.5000
www.d47.org [l D47schools [ crystallakesd47



From: <mdickinson@constructionjournal.com>
Date: Mon, May 3, 2021 at 7:34 AM

Subject: Project Update Request

To: <webmaster@d47.org>

Hi,

We are currently reporting the following project which recently bid. May | have the bid
tabulation? If it has been awarded, may | also have the name of the awarded contractor and
the award amount? If not yet available, do you have an anticipated date the bid tab and/or
award will be released?

Thanks for your help and stay well,
Michele Dickinson

772-781-2144 ext. 445
Construction Journal

2021 Flooring Replacement
Project #:

Crystal Lake, IL
CJ Project #2041251
Bids Due: 03/03/21



Crystal Lake School District 47 - 2021 Flooring Bid
Bid Opening: March 3, 2021, - 2:00 p.m.

. . Benchmark Consolidated Douglas Carpet Lo Destro Michael Kautz Noland Sales Rockford TSI Commercial
é}? Location / Project / Spec. Flooring Flooring One Construction Co. | Carpet & Designs Corp. Pinnacle Flooring | Reef Contractors Carpetland Tiles In Style  |Floor Covering, Inc.] VRC Mgmt., LLC
N
Q‘o Loves Park, IL Addison, IL Addison IL Crystal Lake IL Mount Prospect, IL Wood Dale IL Frankfurt, IL Bolingbook, IL Rockford, IL Willowbrook, IL Champaign, IL
1 Canterbury Elementary School no bid S 103,365.00 no bid no bid no bid S 95,350.00 no bid no bid no bid $ 114,608.38 no bid no bid
2 Glacier Ridge Elementary School $ 97,240.00 | $ 65,343.00 S 86,700.00 $ 94,850.54
3 Indian Prairie Elementary School $ 119,900.00 | $ 67,636.00 S 86,280.00 $ 95,786.00
4 North Elementary School - Flooring $ 52,264.00 | $ 32,061.00 S 34,615.00 $ 56,931.95
North Elementary School - Epoxy no bid $ 13,687.00 S 19,180.00 $ 13,475.00
5 Woods Creek Elementary School S 28,330.00 | $ 24,345.00 S 27,000.00 S 34,626.00
Grand Total| § 297,734.00 | $ 306,437.00 - S - $ - S 349,125.00 | $ - S - - S 410,277.87 | $ - $ -
Documentation Checklist yes yes yes
Bid Bond yes yes yes yes
Acknowledgement of Addendum yes yes yes yes

Bid specifications were distributed to a total of (41) contractors.

Of these (41) contractors, (12) contractors were represented at the mandatory pre-bid walkthrough.
Of these (12) contractors who attended the walk through, (4) submitted bids.
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