, CRYSTAL LAKE ELEMENTARY DISTRICT #47

300 Commerce Drive, Crystal Lake, Illinois 60014 (815) 788-5000
www.d47.0rg
B /D47schools © @crystallakeSD47

DISTRICT

April 26, 2018

Ivy Valencia

Construct Connect

30 Technology Parkway South
Suite 100

Norcross, GA 30092

RE: Freedom of Information Request
Dear Ms. Valencia:

On April 25, 2018, the School District received a Freedom of Information Act (“FOIA”) request from you. You
requested the following information below:

e Bid result or awarded bidder on 2018 flooring replacement projects — bid opening 04/03/2018 at
3:00 pm. CT.

Please find the available information attached. This fulfills our obligation to your FOIA request. | would appreciate
acknowledgment that you received this email and successfully opened the document.

If you have any questions please feel free to contact me 815-788-5000.

Sincerely,
rg, T Wy
Clare F. Bourne

Freedom of Information Officer
Crystal Lake School District 47

Educational Excellence for All Students is Our Passion and Commitment.


http://www.d47.org/
http://www.facebook.com/d47schools
http://www.twitter.com/crystallakesd47

REQUEST FOR ACCESS TO PUBLIC RECORDS
PURSUANT TO THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT (5ILCS 140)

Date of Request: April 25, 2018 FOIA Record #

Name: lvy Valencia Organization: Construct Connect
30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100

Address: Phone Number; 323 6025079

Norcross, Georgia 30092

| HEREBY REQUEST ACCESS TO THE FOLLOWING RECORDS:

Bid Result or Awarded Bidder on 2018 Flooring Replacement Projects -—

Bid Opening: 04/03/2018 at 3:00 PM CT

Within 5 business days of the District receiving your request, you are entitled to a response, or notice that the district is in
need of addition processing time (not to exceed an additional 5 business days).When our response is complete, we will
contact you.

The District’s response, including all supporting documents, and FOIA request with all submitted information, will be posted
online under “Freedom of Information” on the District 47 website. District 47 provides this service as a public courtesy for
no fee. Documents will be posted within 10 business days from our response to your request.

Fees will apply after the initial limited amount of black and white copies are provided. Actual cost of color or abnormal size
copies will apply.

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY:

The District’s response and records were accessed by : In House Inspection Pick-up Mail Fax Email
Date: Time:

AMT REC'D: Check# Cash

FOIA Officer:

Witness:

Crystal Lake Community Consolidated School District 47
300 Commerce Drive, Crystal Lake, IL. 60014
Phone: 815-459-6070 Fax: 815-479-8566
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Crystal Lake School District 47 - 2018 Flooring Bid

Bid Opening: April 3, 2018 - 3:00 p.m.

g Company Integral Flooring Midtown Carpet Tiles In Style Vortex Flooring
."o_-’. Town Woodridge, IL Broadview, IL Willowbrook, IL Addison, IL
a SCHOOL
1 |CORE Center S 9,936.00 No Bid No Bid S 4,858.00
2  |Canterbury Elementary School S 49,350.00 No Bid No Bid S 55,722.00
Canterbury Elementary School-Deduct S 11,721.00 No Bid No Bid S 12,512.00
3  |Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 7 S 60,851.00 No Bid No Bid S 45,493.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 7 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 1,034.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 8 S 59,451.00 No Bid No Bid S 49,138.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 8 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 869.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 9 S 75,104.00 No Bid No Bid S 54,364.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 9 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 1,084.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 10 S 69,638.00 No Bid No Bid S 53,855.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Spec 10 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 2,182.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Alternate Spec 7 S 12,614.00 No Bid No Bid S 10,651.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Alternate Spec 8 S 12,314.00 No Bid No Bid S 11,779.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Alternate Spec 9 S 16,291.00 No Bid No Bid S 12,957.00
Glacier Ridge Elementary School-Alternate Spec 10 S 14,646.00 No Bid No Bid S 12,669.00
Hannah Beardsley Middle School S 39,471.00 No Bid No Bid S 31,005.00
Husmann Elementary School S 50,130.00 No Bid No Bid S 39,042.00
Lundahl Middle School-Specs 1, 2, 4, 6 S 122,456.00 No Bid No Bid S 86,712.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 7 S 64,025.00 No Bid No Bid S 49,081.00
Lundahl Middle Schoo-Spec 7 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 4,551.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 8 S 62,534.00 No Bid No Bid S 49,638.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 8 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 1,408.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 9 S 80,074.00 No Bid No Bid S 55,333.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 9 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 2,024.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 10 S 74,018.00 No Bid No Bid S 54,034.00
Lundahl Middle School-Spec 10 Deduct S - No Bid No Bid S 2,302.00
7 South Elementary School S 19,246.00 No Bid No Bid S 18,924.00
West Elementary School S 28,863.00 No Bid No Bid S 22,867.00
8a. |West Elementary School-Gym S 60,635.00 No Bid No Bid S 67,706.00
West Elementary School-Gym Deduct S 16,383.00 No Bid No Bid S 16,884.00
GRAND TOTAL
Bid Bond: (yes/no) yes yes
Attended pre-bid walk through: (yes/no) yes yes
Acknowledged receipt of addendum(s): (yes/no) yes yes
Bid specifications were distributed to a total of (20) contractors.

Of these (20) contractors, (4) contractors were represented at the mandatory pre-bid walkthrough.

Of these (4) contractors who attended the walk through, (2) submitted bids.

NOTE: This is only a tabulation of the numbers received on the bids at the time of the bid opening. The district will be checking qualifications and bids submitted prior to

determining who will be awarded the bid. Winning bidders will be notified after board approval.
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