, CRYSTAL LAKE ELEMENTARY DISTRICT #47
% 300 Commerce Drive, Crystal Lake, Illinois 60014 (815) 788-5000
www.d47.0rg

B /D47schools © @crystallakeSD47

DISTRICT

May 6, 2016

Bid Desk

Pyramid School Products
6510 N 54th ST

Tampa, FL 33610
recaps@pyramidsp.com

To Whom It May Concern:

This is in response to your Freedom of Information Act Request dated May 3,
2016. The following information serves as fulfillment of obligation to your request.
I would appreciate if you would acknowledge receipt of this FOIA and that you
were able to successfully open all attachments.

If you have any questions please feel free to contact me 815-788-5000

Kind Regards,

[}

Clare F. Bourne
Freedom of Information Officer
Crystal Lake School District 47

Educational Excellence for All Students is Our Passion and Commitment.
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Within 5 business days of the District receiving your request, you are entitled to a response, or notice that the district is in
need of addition processing time (not to exceed an additional 5 business days).When our response is complete, we will
contact you.

The District’s response, including all supporting documents, and FOIA request with all submitted information, will be posted
online under “Freedom of Information” on the District 47 website. District 47 provides this service as a public courtesy for
no fee. Documents will be posted within 10 business days from our response to your request.

Fees will apply after the initial limited amount of black and white copies are provided. Actual cost of color or abnormal size
copies will apply.

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY:

The District’s response and records were accessed by : In House Inspection Pick-up Mail Fax Email
Date: Time:

AMT REC'D: Checkit Cash

FOIA Officer;

Witness:

Crystal Lake Community Consolidated School District 47
300 Commerce Drive, Crystal Lake, IL. 60014
Phone: 815-459-6070 Fax: 815-479-8566




Community Consolidated School Dist #47
Consolidated Vendor Art Supply Bid Response

2015 - 2016
American Paper
Minimum order is Minimum order for
$3000 in full cases Minimum order of  Pacon is $3000 in
only Minimum order of $5 Minimum order of $7 $200 full cases only
CREAM MANILA DRAWING PAPER 50#
Pyramid School INational Art & School Discount School
__Qty Description Great Lakes Clay School Speciaty Products Nasco Supplies Bye-Mo'r Inc Supply Quill S&S Worldwide Triarco Standard Stationery
96 Pkg [9"x 12" 3.55| 340.80 3.37| 32352 3.71| 356.16 5.99| 57504 4.44| 426.24 550/ 528.00 5.75| 552.00 3.35| 321.60
44 Pkg [12"x 18" 7.09] 311.96 6.73| 296.12 7.42| 32648 11.24] 494.56 8.59| 377.96 10.87| 478.28 11.38| 500.72 6.68| 293.92
2 Pkg [18"x 24" 14.18 28.36 156.11 30.22 16.62 33.24 24.37 48.74 25.32 50.64 15.00 30.00
649.86
WHITE DRAWING PAPER - 500 shests per ream, 80# Sax Sulphite Acid Free
No Substitutions
__Qty Description
51 Pkg [9"x12" 7.22| 36822 5.67| 289.17 6.95| 354.45 11.69] 596.19 5.75| 293.25
38 Pkg [12"x 18" 14.31 543.78 11.33] 430.54 13.78| 523.64 13.49| 512.62 11.51] 437.38
15 Pkg [18"x 24" 28.75| 43125 22.67| 340.05 27.71] 415.65 27.52| 412.80 23.03| 34545
1293.74
WHITE DRAWING PAPER -80# Riverside or Storybook Only NO SUBSTITUTIONS
__Qty Description
64 Pkg [9"x12" No Bid 5.67 6.95| 44480 5.75| 368.00
66 Pkg [12"x 18" No Bid 11.33 13.78| 909.48 11.51] 759.66
13 Pkg  [18"x24" No Bid 22.67 27.71] 360.23 23.03] 299.39
1 Pkg  [24"x36" No Bid 45.34 45.34| 63.75 63.75 46.05 46.05
WHITE OAK TAG 150# - 100 shts per pkg. American Paper Container NO SUBSTITUTIONS 1450.71 1778.26
__Qty Description
180 Plg_|§ x12" No Bid 1.92| 345.60 2.33| 41940 3.87| 696.60 1.95| 351.00
90 Pkg [12"x 18" No Bid 3.84| 345.60 4.58| 412.20 7.31] 657.90 3.90/ 351.00
3 Pkg |24" x 36" No Bid 15.41 46.23 18.51 55.53 27.92 83.76 15.65 46.95
737.43
CONSTRUCTION PAPER (9"X12" 50 shts PER PKG.) TRU-RAY BY RIVERSIDE or
COLORBURST by Great Lakes NO SUBSTITUTIONS
_ aty DESCRIPTION
131 Assorted 00SC 3031 1.42| 186.02 1.28| 167.68 1.49| 195.19 1.24| 162.44 1.22 159.82| 1.58| 206.98 | 0.00
288 1.00{ 288.00 1.09] 313.92 1.49| 429.12 1.24| 357.12 1.12 322.5ﬂ 1.48| 426.24 0.98| 283.10
203 Blue 33SC 3022 1.26| 255.78 1.29] 261.87 1.49| 30247 1.24| 251.72 1.12] 227.36 1.42| 288.26 1.16] 235.48
116 Pk Brilliant Lime 10SC 3423 1.25| 145.00 1.36| 157.76 1.49| 172.84 2.35| 27260 1.12| 129.92 1.58| 183.28 1.23| 142.68
27 Pkg [Chartreuse 6SC 3005 1.16 31.32 1.38 37.26 1.29 34.83 1.41 38.07 1.24 33.48
60 Pkg [Dark Brown 50SC 3024 1.12 67.20 1.22 73.20 1.24 74.40 1.12 67.20 1.48 88.80 1.10 66.00
81 Pkg |Dark Green 1.17 94.77 1.28| 103.68 1.29| 104.49 1.42| 115.02 1.15 93.15
216 Pkg |Festive Green 7SC 3006 1.30{ 280.80 1.42| 306.72 1.24| 267.84 1.12| 241.92 1.41 304.56 1.28| 276.48
248 Pkg |Festive Red 83SC 3431 1.14| 282.72 1.24| 307.52 1.49| 369.52 1.24| 307.52 1.12] 277.76 1.58] 391.84 1.12] 277.76
14 Pkg |Gray 55SC 3027 1.10 15.40 1.20 16.80 1.12 15.68] 1.41 19.74 1.08 15.12
45 Pkg |Lilac 24SC 3018 1.07 48.15 1.17 52.65 1.77 79.65 1.12 50.40 1.41 63.45 1.05 47.25
91 Pkg [Magenta 1SC 3000 1.23] 111.93 1.34] 121.94 1.12] 101.92 1.48| 134.68 1.21] 110.11
123 Pkg [Orange 3SC 3002 1.14| 140.22 1.24| 152.52 1.49| 183.27 1.24| 152.52 1.12) 137.76| 1.48| 182.04 1.12| 137.76
46 Pkg _[Pink 14SC 3012 1.15 52.90 1.25 57.50 1.49 68.54 1.24 57.04 1.12 51.52 1.33 61.18 1.13 51.98
36 Pkg [Pumpkin 27SC 3424 1.13 40.68 1.23 44.28 1.29 46.44 1.48 53.28 1.1 39.96
74 Pkg [Red 59SC 3030 1.1 82.14 1.21 89.54 1.49| 110.26| 0.97 71.78 1.12 82.88 1.48| 109.52 1.09 80.66
73 Pkg _[Royal Blue 22SC 3017 1.18 86.14 1.29 94.17 1.24 90.52 1.12 81,7j 1.42| 103.66 1.16 84.68
4 Pkg [Salmon 12SC 3010 1.16 4.64 1.36 5.44 1.49 5.96 1.29 5.16 141 5.64 1.23 4.92
21 Pkg [Scarlet 9SC 3008 1.16 24.36 1.34 28.14 1.29 27.09 1.42 29.82 1.21 25.41
99 Pkg _[Shocking Pink 15SC 3013 1.16] 114.84 1.27| 125.73 1.49| 147.51 1.24| 122.76 1.12] 110.88 1.52| 150.48 1.14] 112.86
157 Pkg [Sky Blue 21SC 3016 1.07| 167.99 1.17] 183.69 1.49| 233.93 1.24| 194.68 1.12] 175.84 141 221.37 1.05| 164.85
30 Pkg |Light Green 0.81 24.30 1.29 38.70 1.12 33.60 1.41 42.30 1.16 34.80
53 Pkg [Tan 49SC 3023 1.05 55.65 1.14 60.42 1.12 59.36 1.41 74.73 1.03 54.59
131 Pkg _[Turquoise 8SC 3007 1.23| 161.13 1.34| 175.54 1.49| 195.19 2.31 302.61 1.12 ’IE‘ 1.41 184.71 1.21 158.51
56 Pkg |Violet 11SC 3009 1.12 62.72 1.22 68.32 1.24 69.44 1.12 62.72| 1.41 78.96 1.10 61.60




88 Pkg _[Warm Brown 51SC 3025 1.05 92.40 1.14 100.32 1.49 131.12| 1.24 109.12 1.29 113.52 1.42 124.96 1.03 90.64
232 Pkg _[White 53S 3026 0.97| 22504 1.07| 248.24 1.49| 345.68 1.24| 287.68 1.12| 259.84 1.41 327.12 0.96] 223.42
153 Pkg [Yellow 5SC 3004 112 171.36 1.22| 186.66 1.49| 227.97 1.24| 189.72 1.12] 171.36 142| 217.26 1.10] 168.30
3313.60
CONSTRUCTION PAPER (12" X 18" - 50 shts per pkg)
TRU-RAY by Riverside OR COLORBURST by Great Lakes NO SUBSTITUTIONS
__Qty Description
389 Pk Black 57SC 3061 1.87| 727.43 2.04| 793.56 2.84 1104A7d 2.46| 956.94 211 820.79 3.01] 1170.89 1.84| 715.76
134 Pk: Blue 33SC 3054 2.25| 301.50 245| 328.30 2.84| 380.56 246| 329.64 211 282.74 2.88| 385.92 221| 296.14
24 Pkg [Chartreuse 6SC 3037 232 55.68 261 62.64 2.60 62.40 2.84 68.16 2.35 56.40
17 Pkg _[Dark Brown 50SC 3056 211 35.87 2.30 39.10 2.46 41.82 2.60 44.20 3.01 51.17 2.07 35.19
25 Pkg [Dark Green 222 55.50 242 60.50 2.60 65.00 2.88 72.00 218 54.50
123 Pkg |Festive Green 7SC 3038 2.48| 305.04 271 333.33 2.84| 349.32 2.46| 302.58 211 259.53 2.88| 354.24 2.44| 300.12
64 Pkg |Gray 55SC 3059 2.04| 130.56 222| 142.08 4.58| 293.12 2.11| 135.04 2.84| 181.76 2.00] 128.00
30 Pkg |Light Green No Bid 245 73.50 211 63.30 2.84 85.20 221 66.30
16 Pkg |Light Yellow 17SC 3046 2.04 32.64 222 35.52 2.60 41.60 2.84 45.44 2.00 32.00
29 Pkg |Lilac 24SC 3050 2.02 58.58 2.20 63.80 3.40 98.60 211 61.19 2.84 82.36 1.99 57.71
28 Pkg [Pink 14SC 3044 217 60.76 2.37 66.36 2.84 79.52 2.50 70.00 211 59.08 2.84 79.52 213 59.64
50 Pk Red 59SC 3062 2.08 104.00 227 113.50 2.84 142.00 3.38 169.00 211 105.50 3.01 150.50 2.04 102.00
36 Pkg _|Royal Blue 22SC 3049 2.25 81.00 245 88.20 246 88.56 211 75.96 2.88| 103.68 221 79.56
18 Pkg _|Shocking Pink 15SC 3045 219 39.42 2.39 43.02 2.84 51.12 2.46 44.28 211 37.98 3.01 54.18 2.15 38.70
166 Pkg _ [Sky Blue 21SC 3048 2.02| 33532 220 365.20 2.84| 47144 2.46| 408.36 211 350.2ﬂ 2.84| 47144 1.99] 330.34
26 Pkg |Tan 49SC 3055 1.99 51.74 217 56.42 211 54.86 2.84 73.84 1.96 50.96
84 Pkg _[Turquoise 8SC 3039 277| 23268 2.54| 213.36 2.84| 238.56 2.46| 206.64 211 177.24 271 227.64 2.29 192.36
21 Pkg _|Violet 11SC 3009 212 44.52 2.31 48.51 3.40 71.40 211 44.31 2.84 59.64 2.08 43.68
55 Pkg _[Warm Brown 51SC 3057 1.98] 108.90 2.16] 118.80 2.84| 156.20 3.78| 207.90 2.60| 143.00 2.84] 156.20 1.95| 107.25
325 Pkg _[White 53SC 3026 1.83| 594.75 1.99| 646.75 2.84| 923.00 2.46| 799.50 211 685.75 2.84| 923.00 1.80| 585.00
166 Pkg |Yellow 5SC 3036 2.12| 351.92 2.31 383.46 2.84| 47144 2.46| 408.36 211 350.26 2.88| 478.08 2.08| 34528
44 Pkg |Assorted 00SC 3063 2.44| 107.36 266| 117.04 2.84| 124.96 246| 108.24 2.33| 102.52 3.20| 140.80 240| 105.60
104 Pkg _|Brilliant Lime 10SC 3425 2.36| 24544 2.57| 267.28 2.84| 29536 3.61 375.44 211 219.44 3.20| 332.80 2.32| 24128
178 Pkg |Festive Red 83SC 3432 2.15| 38270 2.34| 416.52 2.46| 437.88 211 375.58] 3.20| 569.60 211 375.58
22 Pkg |[Magenta 2.32 51.04 2.53 55.66 211 46.42 3.01 66.22 228 50.16
111 Pkg |Orange 3SC 3034 2.15| 238.65 2.34| 259.74 2.84| 31524 2.46| 273.06 211 234.21 3.01 334.11 211 234.21
16 Pkg _[Pumpkin 212 33.92 2.31 36.96 2.60 41.60 3.01 48.16 2.08 33.28
2 Pkg  [Salmon 705-05-4090 2.32 4.64 2.57 5.14 2.84 5.68 2.60 5.20 2.88 5.76 232 4.64
4771.56 73.50
CONSTRUCTION PAPER (24" X 36" - 50 shts per pkg) Tru-Ray by Riverside or Colorburst by Great Lakes (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)
Description
Assorted OOSC 3127 | | | 8.23| 57.61 | | | | | | | 5.00| 35.00| | | | | | | 13.35| 93.45| | ‘
Pkg [Black 57SC 3125 | | | 6,86' 34.30' | | | | | | 5.00| 25.00| | | | | | | | 0.00| | ‘
Railroad Board 6-ply 60.00
__Qty Description
12 Pkg [22" x 28", Assorted colors (100 sheets per pkg) 24.62| 29544 21.56] 258.72 31.90| 382.80 21.93| 263.16
40 Pkg [22" x 28" White (25 sheets per pkg) 5.31 212.40 5.59| 22360 6.58| 263.20 5.94| 237.60
14 Pkg  [22" x 28" Black (25 sheets per pkg; 6.91 96.74 5.89 82.46 7.98 111.72 7.20 100.80
3 Pkg [22"x 28" Blue (25 sheets per pkg) 6.91 20.73 5.89 17.6# 7.98 23.94 7.20 21.60
2 Pkg [22" x 28" Red (25 sheets per pkg) 6.91 13.82 5.89 11.78 7.98 15.96 7.20 14.40
2 Pkg [22"x 28" Green (25 sheets per pkg) 6.91 13.82 5.89 11.78 7.98 15.96 7.20 14.40
ART TISSUE PAPER 606.01
__Qty
8 Pkg _[Apple Green 1.60 12.80 1.72 13.76 1.93 15.44 3.23 25.84 1.60 12.80
78 Pkg [Assorted 1.67| 130.26 1.85| 144.30 1.93] 150.54 2.68| 209.04 1.91] 148.98 1.68] 131.04
8 Pk 1.60 12.80 1.72 13.76 1.93 15.44 1.60 12.80
4 Pk 1.60 6.40 1.72 6.88 1.93 7.72 3.69 14.76 1.60 6.40
20 Pk 1.60 32.00 0.00 1.60 32.00
14 Pk Emerald Green 1.60 22.40 1.72 24.08 1.93 27.02 3.69 51.66 1.60 22.40
12 Pk 1.60 19.20
3 Pk 1.60 4.80
14 Pk 1.60 22.40 1.72 24.08 1.93 27.02 3.23 45.22 1.60 22.40
4 Pk 1.60 6.40 0.00 1.60 6.40
9 Pk 1.60 14.40 1.72 15.48 1.93 17.37 3.69 33.21 1.60 14.40
4 Pk Seal Brown 1.60 6.40 1.72 6.88 1.93 772 3.23 12.92 1.60 6.40
15 Pkg  [Spring Green 1.60 24.00 1.72 25.80 1.93 28.95 3.23 48.45 1.60 24.00




4 Pk Violet 3.23 12.92 1.60 6.40
13 Pk White 0.75 9.75 1.72 22.36 1.64 21.32 2.56 33.28 1.60 20.80
8 Pkg [Orange 1.60 12.80 1.72 13.76 1.93 15.44 3.23 25.84 1.60 12.80
Newsprint Paper Pads (500 shts Per Ream) 312.81 30.40
Qty Description
[ 14 | Ream |9" x 12" Plain | 2.02| 28.28| 1.77| 24.78' | | 2.27| 31 .78| 221 | 30.94' | | 2,48' 34.72| | | 1,80| 25&‘
7 | Ream |9" x 12" Assorted | 6.69| 46.83| 0.00| | | 3.27| 22.89| 6.74| 47.18| | | | | | 2.95| 20.65
TRACING PAPER 28.28 22.89
Qf
'—12 [ Pad [Tracing Paper Pads 11" x 14" (50 sheets per pad) [ 188]  30.08] [ o000 281] 44.96] [ [ [ [ 3e6] 58.56] [ [ 308] 49.28] [ |
30.08
ART PAPER ROLLS 40# 36" x 1000' TRU-RAY NO SUBTITUTIONS
—a Description
10 Roll __[Black 588SP 57 77.96] 779.60 26.18| 261.80 31.12] 311.20 44.99| 449.90 52.52| 52520 28.08] 280.80
5 Roll__[Blue 585SP 33 84.26| 421.30 23.87| 119.35 33.74| 168.70 30.44| 152.20
5 Roll _|Festive Green 583SP 7 92.17| 460.85 23.02 115.10 26.58 132.90 23.38 116.90
4 Roll _|Festive Red 83SP 85.83| 343.32 25.27| 101.08] 35.38| 141.52 127.99] 511.96 2567 102.68
3 Roll __|Orange 581SP 3 86.65| 259.95 28.74 86.22 33.74| 101.22 52.12| 156.36 29.20 87.60
4 Roll_|Pink 634SP 14 81.90] 327.60 27.13 108.52 32.71 130.84 47.24 188.96 27.56 110.24
4 Roll__[Purple 23SP 88.22| 352.88 28.65| 114.60 33.23| 132.92 54.37| 217.48 29.11 116.44
6 Roll __[Sky Blue 635SP 21 81.90| 491.40 27.88| 167.28 33.23| 199.38 59.24 355.4j 28.33| 169.98
9 Roll__|Yellow 582SP 5 84.26| 758.34 29.24| 263.16 33.74| 303.66 48.22| 433.98 29.71 267.39
14 Roll  |White 50# Heavier Deco-rol 587SP 53 80.31| 1124.34 31.89| 446.46 47.00| 658.00
1783.57
BROWN KRAFT PAPER ROLL
Qf
'—;y | Roll  [Kraft Brown Wrapping 36" wide 40# 26.31 184.17 21.72 152.04 18.71 130.97 42.74] 299.18 30.20f 211.40 49.87| 349.09
BRUSHES 130.97
_ay
120 Each _|Golden Tynex Short Handled Flat Brush Style D _1/2" No Bid 0.85 102.00
90 Each |Golden Tynex Short Handled Flat Brush Style D 1" 0.60 54.00 1.90{ 171.00
3 Box__|Fine White Bristle Brush Asst. (72) B-200 Dynasty 26.52 79.56 24.95 74.85 27.71 83.13 10.95 32.85 27.54 82.62
1 Box _|Camel Hair Brush Asst. (144) B-100 Dynasty 26.52 26.52 24.95 24.95 27.71 27.71 22.35 22.35 27.54 27.54
372.80
WATERCOLOR SUPPLIES - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
__Qty
13 Set _|Liquid Watercolor Set of 10 Colors -8 oz Bottle 22.57| 293.41 37.49| 487.37 37.12| 482.56 22.88| 297.44
5 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Blue 2.00 10.00 2.92 14.60 1.88 9.40
5 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Green 2.00 10.00 2.92 14.60 1.88 9.40
6 Each |Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Magenta 2.00 12.00 2.92 17.52 1.88 11.28
5 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Orange 2.00 10.00 2.92 14.60 1.88 9.40
5 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Red 2.00 10.00 2.92 14.60 1.88 9.40
5 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Violet 2.00 10.00 2.92 14.60 1.88 9.40
6 Each |Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Turquoise 2.00 12.00 2.92 17.52 1.88 11.28
6 Each _|Liquid Watercolor - 8 oz Bottle - Yellow 2.00 12.00 2.92 17.52 1.88 11.28
274 Set |PRANG Oval Pan Set of 8 (Non-washable 1.39] 380.86 1.42| 389.08 2.39| 654.86 3.29| 901.46 4.07| 1115.18 2.33| 638.42 1.62] 443.88
1 Dozen |Prang Semi-Moist Pan Refills Oval Pan - Red (DOZEN) 3.30 3.30 249 249 3.44 3.44 3.36 3.36 274 274
1 Dozen |[Prang Semi Moist Pan Refills Oval Pan - Orange (DOZEN) 3.30 3.30 2.49 2.49 3.44 3.44 3.36 3.36 2.74 2.74
5 Dozen |[Prang Semi-Moist Pan Refills Oval Pan - Blue (DOZEN) 3.30 16.50 249 12.45 3.44 17.20 3.36 16.80 2.74 13.70
3 Dozen |[Prang Semi-Moist Pan Refills Oval Pan - Yellow (DOZEN) 3.30 9.90 249 7.47 3.44 10.32 3.36 10.08 274 8.22
1 Dozen |[Prang Semi-Moist Pan Refills Oval Pan - Violet (DOZEN) 3.30 3.30 249 249 3.44 3.44 3.36 3.36 274 274
12 Pkg  [Watercolor Paper Strathmore Series 22" x 30" Pkg. of 10 sheets 10.26| 123.12 0.00 12.20| 146.40 0.00
123.12 416.47 378.28
ALPHACOLOR BIGGIES LARGE CAKE SETS
Qf
29 Sax 9-Color Set | 8.68 251.72| 8.29' 240.41| 6.88 199.52| | | | | | | | | | | 7.35| 213.15‘
n Each | White Biggie refill cake | 1.42 8.52' 0.00| 0.53 3.18| | | | | | | | | 1.41 | 8.46|
8.52 240.41
CANVAS PANELS
Qty
[ 100 | Each |8"x10" Canvas Panels | 0.55 55.00| | 0.00| 0.64| 64.00| | | | | | | | | 0.53| 53.00| | ‘
150 | Each |11"x 14" Canvas Panels | 0.88 132.oo| | 0.00| 1.o4| 156.00| | | | | | | | | 1.oo| 150.00| | ‘

187.00



PRINT MAKING SUPPLIES

Qty Description
Sax Soft Kut Printmaking Blocks 4"x6" NO SUBSTITUTIONS MUST BE SAX
805 Each |ITEM #424663 0.95| 764.75 0.00 0.99| 796.95
26 Pkg [Scratch Foam 9 x 12 (Pkg. Of 12) Board Printing Plate 3.05 79.30 3.95| 102.70 2.86 74.36 3.21 83.46 279 72.54
53 Set Speedball Assorted Blades (5 pc set) 3.22| 170.66 5.39| 28567 3.75| 198.75 ﬂ 3.71 196.63
39 Each [Tooling Aluminum 36 gauge 12" 3.74| 145.86 0.00 2.47 96.33 11.83| 461.37
1160.57
PRINTING INK SPEEDBALL 5 OZ. TUBE NO SUBSTITUTIONS
—Qty
20 Each |Black 3.84 76.80 3.59 71.80 4.47 89.40 4.42 88.40
16 Each |Blue 3.84 61.44 3.59 57.44 4.47 71.52 4.42 70.72
10 Each |Green 3.84 38.40 3.59 35.90 4.47 44.70 4.42 44.20
17 Each |Orange 3.84 65.28 3.59 61.03 4.47 75.99 4.42 75.14
12 Each |Red 3.84 46.08 3.59 43.08 4.47 53.64 4.42 53.04
12 Each _|Violet 3.84 46.08 3.59 43.03 4.47 53.64 4.42 53.04
14 Each |White 3.84 53.76 3.59 50.26 4.47 62.58 4.42 61.88
11 Each _|Yellow 3.84 42.24 3.59 39.49 4.47 49.17 4.42 48.62
2 Each |Gold (tube only) 3.84 7.68 3.59 7.18 4.47 8.94 442 8.84
26 Each |Magenta (tube only) 3.84 99.84 3.59) 93.34 447 116.22 4.42| 114.92
2 Each _|Silver (tube only) 3.84 7.68 3.59 7.18 4.47 8.94 4.42 8.84
11 Each |Turquoise (tube only) 3.84 42.24 3.59 39.49 4.47 49.17 4.42 48.62
549.27
DRAWING SUPPLIES
Qty Description
10 |Box Crayola Jumbo Lift Lid Box 8 Color Assorted 2.31 23.10 1.12 11.20 2.26 22.60 1.33 13.30 2.18 21.80
140 [Box Binney Smith Crayola Standard Size Assorted Box of 24 1.39] 194.60 1.10| 154.00 1.36] 190.40 1.00| 140.00 1.49| 208.60 1.22| 170.80 1.32| 184.80 1.18| 165.20
36 |Box Binney & Smith Crayola, Standard Size- White 1.27 45.72 1.15 41.40 1.24 44.64 1.30 46.80 1.19 42.84 0.62 22.32
66 |Box Binney & Smith Crayola Standard Size- Black 1.27 83.82 1.15 75.90 1.24 81.84 1.30 85.80 1.19 78.54 0.62 40.92
11 Box Crayola Metallic Crayons Standard Size Box of 12 - Gold 1.54 16.94 1.35 14.85 1.49 16.39 1.50 16.50 1.44 15.84
" Box Crayola Metallic Crayons Standard Size Box of 12 - Silver 1.54 16.94 1.35 14.85 1.49 16.39 1.50 16.50 1.44 15.84
75 _|Box Sargent Art Construction Paper Crayons Box of 8 0.27 20.25 0.59 44.25 0.64 48.00 0.87 65.25 0.67 50.25 0.58 43.50
24 Box Sargent Art Construction Paper Crayons Box of 16 0.44 10.56 1.31 31.44 1.01 24.24 1.47 35.28 1.13 27.12 0.98 23.52
387.89
DRAWING SUPPLIES Continued
MARKERS NO SUBSTITUTIONS
_ay
160 Set Crayola Marker Set (Fine Pt.) Set of 8 Colors 211 337.60 1.55| 248.00 2.07] 331.20 1.46| 233.60 277 443.20' 1.85| 296.00 2.00] 320.00 1.75| 280.00
174 Set Crayola Marker Set (Regular) Set of 8 Colors 2.1 367.14 1.53| 266.22 2.07| 360.18 1.46| 254.04 247 429.78 1.85] 321.90 2.00] 348.00 1.76| 306.24
74 Set _|Crayola Tropical Marker - Set of 8 Colors 2.74| 20276 1.95| 144.30 1.92] 142.08 299| 221.26 3.53| 261.22 2.25| 166.50
70 Set Crayola Bold Marker - Set of 8 Colors 211 147.70 1.49| 104.30 2.07| 14490 1.56] 109.20 2.99| 209.30 241 168.70 2.00] 140.00 1.65| 115.50
11 Set Crayola Multicultural Washable Marker Set of 8 2.74 30.14 1.95 21.45 2.68 29.48 2.08 22.88 3.22 35.42 2.59 28.49 2.18 23.98
30 Box__|Crayola Washable Conical Tip Gel Markers Box of 8 2.96 88.80 2.49 74.70 2.89 86.70 2.50 75.00 2.80 84.00
3 Box _|Crayola Washable Conical Tip Gel Markers Class pack Box of 80 25.93 77.79 21.89 65.67 26.00 78.00 25.00| 75.00| 27.00 81.00 |
911.80
27 Set Fluorescent Marker Set (6-color) 272 73.44 1.55 41.85 2.07 55.89 1.56 42.12 2.57 69.39 2.00 54.00 1.64 44.28
189 Set Mr. Sketch-unscented-12 count Asst. Colors w/ plastic tray 5.42| 1024.38 3.95| 746.55 0.00 4.30| 81270 4.80|] 907.20 0.00 4.63| 875.07
788.40
150 Each |Redi-Sharp Non-Toxic Black Marker Fine Tip 97200 ( NO SUBSTITUTIONS) No Bid 0.31 46.50 0.00 0.33 49.80
48 Dozen |Sanford Sharpie Ultra Fine Tip Black _(By Dozen Only) 7.40| 35520 5.09| 24432 7.62| 365.76 5.40| 259.20 8.99| 43152 6.83| 327.84 7.45| 357.60 591 283.68
104 Dozen |Sanford Sharpie Fine Tip Mfg. Black (By Dozen Only) 7.40| 769.60 4.89| 508.56 7.62| 792.48 5.40| 561.60 11.99| 1246.96 6.83] 710.32 7.45| 774.80 5.80/ 603.20
204 Each |Sharpie Chisel Tip Black Marker (Individual No Bid 0.57| 116.28 0.67| 136.68 0.58| 118.32 1.30] 265.20 0.66| 134.64 0.64| 13117
39 Set Sharpie Fine Point Assorted Colors - Package of 24 14.46| 563.94 11.95| 466.05 14.91 581.49 11.65| 454.35 13.55| 528.45 14.73| 574.47 11.52| 449.28
4 Set _|Sharpie Ultra Fine Point Assorted Colors - Package of 12 7.31 29.24 6.49 25.96 7.53 30.12 6.50 26.00 9.74 38.96 7.02 28.08 7.44 29.76 7.19 28.76
10 Set Sharpie Ultra Fine Point Assorted Colors - Package of 24 14.46| 144.60 12.95 ’lm 14.91 149.10 11.65| 116.50 _| 13.55| 135.50 14.73| 147.30 11.52| 115.20
54 Each |Expresso Black Extra Fine Pt. No Bid 0.00| 0.00 1.09 58.86 | 0.00 1.11 59.94
1704.06 655.71
PENCILS Must meet Acceptable Non-Toxic Art Materials Specifications
—aty
160 No Bid 0.63| 100.80 0.00 0.87] 139.20 0.73| 116.80
44 3.11 136.84 2.49| 109.56 3.04| 133.76 2.47| 108.68 2.89| 127.16 297| 130.68 2.63] 115.72
2 251 5.02 1.49 2.98 4.64 9.28 1.32 264
11 7.23 79.53 3.59 39.Ad 8.02 88.22 11.80] 129.80 7.75 85.25
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}725 | Box |Sanford Pink Pearl Erasers Size Medium Box of 24 2 1/4"x3/4"x3/8"
3 Box |Gum Art Erasers - 2" x 1" Box of 12 | 2.77| 8.31 | 3.00| g.oo| 3.os| 9.24| | | | | 2.97| 8.91‘
OIL PASTELS CRA-PAS 404.33
_ay
25 Set _|Cray -Pas Junior Artist Set of 12 Assorted 1.44 36.00 0.00 1.08 27.00 1.28 32.00 1.00 25.00 1.09 27.25
105 Set _|Cray -Pas Junior Artist Set of 25 Assorted 1.96] 205.80 0.00 2.05| 215.25 2.55| 267.75 2.00] 210.00 2.18| 228.90
31 Set Cray-Pas Junior Artist Set of 12 Black 1.44 44.64 0.00 1.48 45.88 1.47 45.57
31 Set Cray-Pas Junior Artist Set of 12 White 1.44 44.64 0.00 1.48 45.88 1.47 45.57
98 Pkg [Crayola Portfolio Series Water Soluble Oil Pastel Pkg of 24 5.25| 514.50 4.45| 436.10 5.14| 503.72 5.07| 496.86 4.88| 478.24 5.02| 491.96
818.10
WATERPROFF INDIA INK - HIGGINS (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)
Qf
3 Each _|Black India (Qt.) |No Bid | | 7.95| 23.85| 25.73| 77.19| | | | 34.89' 104.67| | | 25.75| 77.25| | ]
23.85
SMI PASTELS (Box of 24) NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Q?
11 Set SMI Pastels Set of 24 Assorted Colors |No Bid | | 3.79| 41,69' | 0.00| | | | | | | | | | | l
41.69
ADHESIVES
Qty
107 Each |Masking Tape 1" x 60 yds 4.63| 495.41 0.77 82.39' 0.89 95.23 1.24 132.68' 1.60] 171.20 1.22 130.54 0.70 75.33
57 Masking Tape 2" x 60 yds 9.29| 529.53 1.54 87.78 1.70 96.90 2.48| 141.36 8.47| 48279 2.47| 14079 1.42 80.94
18 Each [Blue Stick Reusable Adhesive Putty 1.04 18.72 0.99 17.82 1.14 20.52 1.87 33.66 247 44.46 1.05 18.90
187.99
GLUE SUPPLIES
Qty
358 ELMER'S All Purpose 8 oz Bottle 1.29| 461.82 1.22| 436.76 1.35| 483.30 | 1.70| 608.60 1.48| 529.84 1.29| 461.82 1.25| 447.50
14 ELMER'S All Purpose _ Gallon 10.67| 149.38 8.95| 125.30 11.00| 154.00 0.34 4.7Q| 9.64| 134.96 12.21 170.94 10.00| 140.00 9.61 134.54
651 Each |White Glue Stick .28 oz. 0.24| 156.24 0.15 97.65 0.18| 117.18 0.32| 208.32 0.29| 188.79 0.31] 201.81 0.25| 162.75 0.09 55.34
404 Each |Elmer's Washable Disappearing Purple Glue Stick 0.77 oz 0.67| 270.68 0.63] 254.52 1.21 488.84 0.62| 250.48 0.69 278.76' 0.67| 270.68 1.17| 472.68 0.63] 253.31
RUBBER CEMENT e
Qf Description
Rubber Cement, 4 oz. can-Ross | 1.21 | 14.52| 1.09| 13.08 1.11 | 13.32| | | | 1.23| 14.76| | | | | 1.02| 12,24‘
Rubber Cement, 1 pt. can-Ross | 3.97| 23.82 4.29 25.74 4.54 27.24 | | | | | | | 4.14 24.84
37.08
PASTE
Qf
'—Z? | Each |Pritl Art Paste (2 0z.) (paper-mache) | 2.12| 50.88| 1.09| 28.16' 2.24| 53.76' | | | | | | | | | 2‘00| 48,00]
MOD PODGE (GLOSS) 26.16
Qf
'—Gly | Each |ModPodge Tissue Glue & Glaze Gallon | 16.86' 101.16| | 0.00| 21.56| 129.36' | | | | | | | 20.63| 123.78' | l
SCISSORS NO SUBSTITUTE NO UNIVERSAL 101.16
__Qty
1 Each _|Fiskars Pointed R.H. 8" Offset Handled No Bid 6.95 6.95 7.49 7.49 5.50 5.50 1.66 1.66
4 Each |Fiskars Pointed L.H. 8" Offset handled No Bid 6.95 27.80 7.49 29.96 12.06 48.24 215 8.60
9 Each _|Dura sharp Deskworks Scissors 7" (for Kids) No Bid 1.59 14.31 2.87 25.83 0.93 8.37
2 Each |Dura sharp Deskworks Scissors 8" straight (teachers No Bid 1.79 3.58 3.10 6.20 1.83 3.66
37 Each |5" Blunt Tip Right / Left Hand Use 0.54 19.98 0.25 9.25 0.56 20.72 1.04 38.48 0.42 15.54 0.66 24.42 0.20 7.40
YARN Order by package 61.89 90.20 29.69
Qty
l 6 [ Each [Trait—Tax. 4 0z. 16 Cone Package Double Weight | 66.25 397.50| 59.95 359A70| | | | | | | | | | | | | ‘
l 2 | Each |Trait-Tax 4 oz 16 Cones Package Jumbo Roving Asst. Bright Colors | 66.25 132.50| 59.95 119.90' | | | | | | | | | | | | ‘
PIPE CLEANER 12" (order by package) No Substitutes 41980
__Qty
115 Pk Assort. colors 1/4" rayon chenille _NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0.72 82.80 0.69 79.35 1.00{ 115.00 1.64| 188.60 1.67| 192.05 0.84 96.60 D.QI 75.90
16 Pk Green 1/8" rayon chenille NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0.69 11.04 0.00 1.15 18.40 1.48 23.68 0.67 10.72
26 Pk Black 1/8" rayon chenille NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0.69 17.94 0.00 1.15 29.90 1.48 38.48 0.67| 17.42
CLAY SUPPLIES  School Smart Non-Hardening Modellng Clay 1 Ib. Boxes e
__Qty
2 Box__[Blue 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48
2 Box _|Brown 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48
2 Box__|Cream 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48
2 Box |Gray 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48
2 Box [Green 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48




2 Box _|Red 0.74 1.48 0.00 1.62 3.24 0.74 1.48
17 Box__|Yellow 0.74 12.58 0.00 1.62 27.54 0.74 12.58
6 Box__|Earth tone Assortment 0.77 4.62 0.00 1.86 11.16 1.62 9.72
6 Box _|Standard Assortment 0.77 4.62 0.00 1.86 11.16 1.63 9.78
MODELING CLAY Asst. 4-1/4# sticks per box (Red, Yellow, Blue, Green) 0.00 1
51 Box  [Red, Yellow, Blue, Green 3.58| 182.58 0.00 2.02 103.02 224 114.24 272 138.72 1.63 83.13 0.74 37.74
GREAT LAKES CLAY e
Qf
'—Z'BY | Box |MCL301 Terra Cotta 50# box | 14.00| 322.00|No Bid | | | | | 0.00| | | | | | | | | | | | | | ‘
‘ 118 | Box |MCL304 White Talc 50# box | 11.50| 1357.00| No Bid | | | | | 0.00| | | | | | | | | | | | | | ‘
1679.00

AMACO LG GLOSS GLAZES - 1 PINT

2 Each 9-351773-705 True Black LG-1 11.96 23.92 9.10 18.20 9.49 18.98 9.50 19.00
4 Each 9-351785-705 Opague White LG-11 9.26 37.04 7.96 31.84 8.30 33.20 8.31 33.24
3 Each 9-351788-705 Gray LG-14 11.59 34.77 8.82 26.46 9.20 27.60 9.20 27.60
9 Each 9-351794-705 Dark Blue LG-21 13.46 121.14 10.24 92.16 10.68 96.12 10.69 96.21
8 Each 9-351797-705 Robin's Egg LG-23 11.59 92.72 8.82 70.56 9.20 73.60 9.20 73.60
1 Each 9-35182-705 Chocolate Brown LG-30 11.96 11.96 9.10 9.10 9.49 9.49 9.50 9.50
2 Each 9-351818-705 Red Brown (Rose) LG-34 13.46 26.92 10.24 20.48 10.68 21.36 10.69 21.38
3 Each 9-351833-705 Emerald Green LG-45 11.59 34.77 8.82 26.46 9.20 27.60 9.20 27.60
7 Each 9-351839-705 Chrome Green LG-48 11.59 81.13 8.82 61.74 9.20 64.40 9.20 64.40
4 Each 9-423482-705 Lilac LG-51 13.46 53.84 10.24 40.96 10.68 42.72 10.69 42.76
1 Each 9-351848-705 Petal Pink LG-53 11.59 11.59 8.82 8.82 9.20 9.20 9.20 9.20
1 Each 9-351857-705 Purple LG-55 15.71 15.71 11.96 11.96 12.47 12.47 12.48 12.48
5 Each 9-351866-705 Canary Yellow LG-61 11.59 57.95 8.82 44.10 9.20 46.00 9.20 46.00
3 Each 9-351872-705 Amber LG-65 13.46 40.38 10.24 30.72 10.68 32.04 10.69 32.07
5 Each 9-406952-705 Brilliant Red F-58 16.46 82.30 11.96 59.80 12.47 62.35 13.07 65.35
6 |Each  [0-406958-705 Vivid Orange F-68 NLA 11.96] 7176 1247|7482
625.12 651.95 580.39
l 2 |Each |9-423483 Amaco Clear Transparent LG10 1 Gallon | 34.50' 69.00| 26.00| 52.00| | 0.00| 31.94| 63.88' | | | | | | | | | | 30.77|  61.54 | ]
52.00
UNDERGLAZE SEMI-MOIST FOR CERAMICS (AMACO) TRAYS
Set #A Contains Colors: Maroon, Lt Yellow, Dk Blue, Blue, Dk Green, Green,
1 Set Black, Lt Brown, White 23.25 23.25 17.79 17.79 0.00 18.67 18.67 18.03 18.03
Set #B Contains Colors: Turquoise, Lilac, Med Blue, Pink, Warm Gray, Bright
1 Set _|Yellow, Irish Green, Mahogany Brown 23.25 23.25 17.79 17.79 0.00 18.67 18.67 18.03 18.03
Set #C Contains Colors: Purple, Lt Blue, Aqua, Rose, Orange, Peach, Sun Tan,
1 Set Chartreuse 23.25 23.25 17.79 17.79 0.00 18.67 18.67 18.03 18.03
Set #D Contains Colors: Electric Blue, Amethyst, Violet, Red, Lt Red, Salmon,
1 Set  |Real Orange, Hunter Green 23.25 23.25 17.79 (id79 0.00 18.67 18.67 18.03 18.03
71.16
Pyramid School lational Art & School Discount School
Great Lakes Clay School Speciaty Products Nasco Supplies Bye-Mo'r Inc Supply Quill S&S i Triarco { y
Totals $1,679.00 $11,110.0 $8,611.39 $1,567.51 $3,359.36 $1,196.38 $987.85

Grand Total $28,511.53
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