
SWEET HOME CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT - ARTS - General Classroom Art Supplies Bid - 2024-25-6 BID # of Items Bid Bid Total Awarded # of Items Bid Total Awarded
Mailed to 20 Cascade 72 $2,929.57 Cascade 2 $285.51
Responded 8 Kurtz Bros 73 $6,943.90 Kurtz Bros 14 $5,117.47
Total Items to bid on 90 Lakeshore 9 $4,013.30 Lakeshore 0 $0.00
Total No Bid 0 Pyramid 10 $146.71 Pyramid 8 $75.05
Total Items awarded 90 Quill 29 $9,081.16 Quill 0 $0.00

School Specialty 80 3,335.97$    School Specialty 27 $996.71
SSWW 39 $1,431.26 SSWW 0 $0.00
WB 51 $1,507.36 WB 39 $1,025.12

Total Awarded $7,499.86
Total # Items Awarded 90

Company NO. ITEM UNIT USE QTY CATALOG # Substitutions Price Total Cost Substitute Catalog #
SUNWORKS HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER PAPER SIZE 9" x 12" No Bid

1 WB 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $1.43 $28.60 PAC6504 Acceptable substitute
Kurtz Bros 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 MODERN $1.78 $35.60 36098 Staff choice
SSWW 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 Pacon Prang $1.86 $37.20 PE1253 Lowest/Awarded
School Specialty 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $1.94 $38.80 Not acceptable Sub
Cascade 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $1.99 $39.80 115865
Lakeshore 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $0.00
Quill 1 ASSORTED 100/PKG 20 1506490 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $1.47 $49.98 PAC6304
Kurtz Bros 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 MODERN $1.78 $60.52 36081
School Specialty 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $1.79 $60.86
Cascade 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $1.99 $67.66 115961
SSWW 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 Pacon Prang $2.06 $70.04 PE1985
Lakeshore 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $0.00
Quill 2 BLACK 100/PKG 34 1506488 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $1.34 $29.48 PAC7404
School Specialty 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $1.60 $35.20
Kurtz Bros 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 MODERN $1.78 $39.16 36030
Cascade 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $1.99 $43.78 115915
SSWW 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 Pacon Prang $2.06 $45.32 PE1996
Lakeshore 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $0.00
Quill 3 BLUE 100/PKG 22 299665 $0.00 NO BID

1 School Specialty 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $1.60 $19.20
Kurtz Bros 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 MODERN $1.80 $21.60 36040
Cascade 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00
Lakeshore 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00
Quill 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00
WB 4 BRIGHT GREEN 100/PKG 12 1506512 $0.00

1 WB 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $1.59 $7.95 PAC6704
Kurtz Bros 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 MODERN $1.78 $8.90 36016
School Specialty 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $1.79 $8.95
Cascade 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $1.99 $9.95 115935
SSWW 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 Pacon Prang $2.06 $10.30 PE1982
Lakeshore 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $0.00
Quill 5 BROWN 100/PKG 5 1506492 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $1.34 $33.50 PAC8004
School Specialty 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $1.60 $40.00
Kurtz Bros 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 MODERN $1.78 $44.50 36043
Cascade 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $1.99 $49.75 115909
SSWW 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 Pacon Prang $2.06 $51.50 PE1990
Lakeshore 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $0.00
Quill 6 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 25 1506504 $0.00 NO BID
Kurtz Bros 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 MODERN $1.78 $5.34 36023

1 School Specialty 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $1.79 $5.37
SSWW 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 Pacon Prang $2.06 $6.18 PE2003
Cascade 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $0.00
Lakeshore 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $0.00
Quill 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $0.00 NO BID
WB 7 HOT PINK 100/PKG 3 1506510 $0.00
Kurtz Bros 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 MODERN $1.78 $12.46 36015

1 School Specialty 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $1.82 $12.74
Cascade 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $1.99 $13.93 115937



Lakeshore 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $0.00
Quill 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $0.00
WB 8 LIGHT BROWN 100/PKG 7 1506494 $0.00

1 WB 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $1.34 $1.34 PAC7004
School Specialty 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $1.60 $1.60
Kurtz Bros 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 MODERN $1.78 $1.78 36021
Cascade 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $1.99 $1.99 115878
SSWW 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 Pacon Prang $2.06 $2.06 PE1995
Lakeshore 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $0.00
Quill 9 PINK 100/PKG 1 1506495 $0.00 NO BID
Kurtz Bros 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 MODERN $1.78 $23.14 36020

1 WB 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $1.82 $23.66 PAC6104
Cascade 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $1.99 $25.87 023757
SSWW 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 Pacon Prang $2.06 $26.78 PE1983
School Specialty 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $2.11 $27.43
Lakeshore 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $0.00
Quill 10 RED 100/PKG 13 1506487 $0.00 NO BID

1 School Specialty 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $1.60 $16.00
WB 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $1.60 $16.00 PAC8704
Kurtz Bros 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 MODERN $1.91 $19.10 36080
Cascade 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $1.99 $19.90 115955
SSWW 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 Pacon Prang $2.06 $20.60 PE1986
Lakeshore 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $0.00
Quill 11 WHITE 100/PKG 10 1506511 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $1.38 $20.70 PAC8404
School Specialty 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $1.60 $24.00
Kurtz Bros 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 MODERN $1.78 $26.70 36050
Cascade 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $1.99 $29.85 115895
SSWW 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 Pacon Prang $2.06 $30.90 PE1997
Lakeshore 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $0.00
Quill 12 YELLOW 100/PKG 15 1506506 $0.00 NO BID

SUNWORKS HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER PAPER SIZE 12" x 18"
1 WB 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $3.15 $75.60 PAC6508

Kurtz Bros 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 MODERN $3.53 $84.72 36198
SSWW 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 Pacon Prang $3.54 $84.96 PE2016
Cascade 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $3.82 $91.68 115965
School Specialty 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $3.87 $92.88
Lakeshore 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $0.00
Quill 13 ASSORTED 100/PKG 24 1506517 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $2.88 $60.48 PAC6308
Kurtz Bros 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 MODERN $3.53 $74.13 36181
School Specialty 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $3.58 $75.18
Cascade 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $3.82 $80.22 116061
SSWW 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 Pacon Prang $3.89 $81.69 PE2018
Lakeshore 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $0.00
Quill 14 BLACK 100/PKG 21 299650 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $2.63 $36.82 PAC7408
School Specialty 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $3.22 $45.08
Kurtz Bros 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 MODERN $3.53 $49.42 36130
Cascade 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $3.82 $53.48 116015
SSWW 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 Pacon Prang $3.89 $54.46 PE2011
Lakeshore 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $0.00
Quill 15 BLUE 100/PKG 14 1506526 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $2.88 $8.64 PAC6708
Kurtz Bros 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 MODERN $3.53 $10.59 36116
School Specialty 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $3.58 $10.74
Cascade 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $3.82 $11.46 116035
SSWW 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 Pacon Prang $3.89 $11.67 PE2021
Lakeshore 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $0.00
Quill 16 BROWN 100/PKG 3 1506519 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $2.63 $39.45 PAC8008
School Specialty 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $3.22 $48.30
Kurtz Bros 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 MODERN $3.53 $52.95 36143



Cascade 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $3.82 $57.30 116009
SSWW 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 Pacon Prang $3.89 $58.35 PE2012
Lakeshore 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $0.00
Quill 17 HOLIDAY GREEN 100/PKG 15 1506530 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $3.21 $6.42 PAC6608
Kurtz Bros 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 MODERN $3.53 $7.06 36160
Cascade 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $3.82 $7.64 115985
School Specialty 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $3.85 $7.70
SSWW 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 Pacon Prang $3.89 $7.78 PE2015
Lakeshore 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $0.00
Quill 18 ORANGE 100/PKG 2 299654 $0.00 NO BID
Kurtz Bros 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 MODERN $3.53 $10.59 36120

1 WB 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $3.61 $10.83 PAC6108
Cascade 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $3.82 $11.46 023755
SSWW 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 Pacon Prang $3.89 $11.67 PE2013
School Specialty 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $4.17 $12.51
Lakeshore 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $0.00
Quill 19 RED 100/PKG 3 1506514 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $2.63 $13.15 PAC7608
School Specialty 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $3.22 $16.10
Kurtz Bros 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 MODERN $3.53 $17.65 36131
Cascade 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $3.82 $19.10 116018
Lakeshore 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $0.00
Quill 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 20 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 5 1506528 $0.00

1 WB 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $2.63 $2.63 PAC7208
School Specialty 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $3.22 $3.22
Kurtz Bros 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 MODERN $3.53 $3.53 36170
Cascade 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $3.82 $3.82 116025
Lakeshore 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $0.00
Quill 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 21 VIOLET 100/PKG 1 1506524 $0.00

1 WB 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $3.17 $38.04 PAC8708
School Specialty 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $3.22 $38.64
Kurtz Bros 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 MODERN $3.80 $45.60 36180
Cascade 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $3.82 $45.84 116055
SSWW 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 Pacon Prang $3.89 $46.68 PE2010
Lakeshore 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $0.00
Quill 22 WHITE 100/PKG 12 1506537 $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $2.63 $31.56 PAC8408
School Specialty 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $3.22 $38.64
Kurtz Bros 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 MODERN $3.53 $42.36 36150
Cascade 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $3.82 $45.84 115995
SSWW 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 Pacon Prang $3.89 $46.68 PE2024
Lakeshore 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $0.00
Quill 23 YELLOW 100/PKG 12 1506532 $0.00 NO BID

 SUNWORKS HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPERPAPER SIZE 18" x 24"
Kurtz Bros 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 MODERN $7.00 $98.00 36298
Cascade 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $8.75 $122.50 116165

1 School Specialty 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $9.98 $139.72 Exact product
Lakeshore 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $0.00
Quill 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $0.00
WB 24 ASSORTED 100/PKG 14 1506562 $0.00
Kurtz Bros 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 MODERN $7.05 $42.30 36281

1 School Specialty 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $8.20 $49.20 Exact product
Cascade 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $8.75 $52.50 116261
Lakeshore 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $0.00
Quill 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $0.00
WB 25 BLACK 100/PKG 6 1506567 $0.00

1 School Specialty 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $3.46 $3.46
Kurtz Bros 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 MODERN $7.05 $7.05 36230
Cascade 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00



Lakeshore 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00
Quill 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00
WB 26 BLUE 100/PKG 1 1506543 $0.00

1 School Specialty 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $4.47 $4.47
Kurtz Bros 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 MODERN $7.05 $7.05 36225
Cascade 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00
Lakeshore 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00
Quill 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00
WB 27 HOLIDAY RED 100/PKG 1 1506549 $0.00

1 School Specialty 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $3.46 $6.92
Kurtz Bros 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 MODERN / LIGHT BLU $7.05 $14.10 36231
Cascade 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00
Lakeshore 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00
Quill 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00
WB 28 SKY BLUE 100/PKG 2 1506553 $0.00

1 School Specialty 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $3.82 $3.82
Kurtz Bros 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 MODERN $7.05 $7.05 36250
Cascade 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $8.75 $8.75 116195
Lakeshore 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $0.00
Quill 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $0.00
WB 29 YELLOW 100/PKG 1 1506557 $0.00

 SUNWORKS HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPERPAPER SIZE 24" x 36"
1 School Specialty 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $12.69 $63.45

Kurtz Bros 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 TRURAY $20.70 $103.50 37399
Cascade 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00
Lakeshore 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00
Quill 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00
WB 30 ASSORTED 50/PKG 5 1506558 $0.00

1 School Specialty 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $17.93 $89.65
Cascade 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00
Kurtz Bros 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00
Lakeshore 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00
Quill 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00
WB 31 BLACK 50/PKG 5 012038 $0.00

KRAFT PAPER ROLL SIZE 36 INCHES x 100 FEET
1 School Specialty 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $14.86 $104.02

Cascade 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $19.45 $136.15 18265
Quill 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $66.15 $463.05 PACON, 05636
Lakeshore 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $92.49 $647.43 PACON,  LX9990
Kurtz Bros 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $0.00
Pyramid 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $0.00
SSWW 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $0.00
WB 32 WHITE ROLL 7 214986 $0.00

COLORED PAPER ROLLS
1 Kurtz Bros 33 BLACK EACH 7 39531 $96.65 $676.55

Quill 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $141.47 $990.29 TRU-RAY, 24509748
Cascade 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00
Lakeshore 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00
School Specialty 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00
WB 33 BLACK EACH 7 11518-2050 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 34 BLUE EACH 6 39528 $87.55 $525.30
Lakeshore 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $110.08 $660.48 PACON,  LX375BU
Quill 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $175.29 $1,051.74 TRU-RAY, 24509765
Cascade 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $0.00
Pyramid 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $0.00
School Specialty 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $0.00



WB 34 BLUE EACH 6 11518-4860 $0.00
1 Kurtz Bros 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 39524 $91.03 $455.15

Lakeshore 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $110.08 $550.40 PACON,  LX375GR  GREEN
Quill 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $181.34 $906.70 TRU-RAY, 24509744
Cascade 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $0.00
Pyramid 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $0.00
School Specialty 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $0.00
WB 35 FESTIVE GREEN EACH 5 11518-7230 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 39525 $88.10 $440.50
Lakeshore 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $110.08 $550.40 PACON,  LX375RD  RED
Quill 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $137.69 $688.45 TRU-RAY, 24509711
Cascade 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $0.00
Pyramid 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $0.00
School Specialty 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $0.00
WB 36 FESTIVE RED EACH 5 11518-3410 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 37 GOLD EACH 5 39533 $87.55 $437.75
Cascade 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00
Lakeshore 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00
Quill 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00 NO BID
School Specialty 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00
WB 37 GOLD EACH 5 11518-4030 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 38 ORANGE EACH 5 39285 $74.88 $374.40
Quill 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $146.83 $734.15 TRU-RAY, 24509746
Cascade 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00
Lakeshore 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00
School Specialty 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00
WB 38 ORANGE EACH 5 11518-4510 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 39 PINK EACH 5 39526 $83.81 $419.05
Cascade 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00
Lakeshore 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00
Quill 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00 NO BID
School Specialty 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00
WB 39 PINK EACH 5 11518-3060 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 40 PURPLE EACH 5 39293 $85.81 $429.05
Cascade 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00
Lakeshore 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00
Quill 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00 NO BID
School Specialty 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00
WB 40 PURPLE EACH 5 11518-5630 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 39527 $86.49 $432.45
Lakeshore 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $110.08 $550.40 PACON,  LX375BU  BLUE
Quill 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $133.10 $665.50 TRU-RAY, 24509745
Cascade 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $0.00
Pyramid 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $0.00
School Specialty 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $0.00
WB 41 SKY BLUE EACH 5 11518-5070 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 42 YELLOW EACH 6 39523 $84.33 $505.98
Lakeshore 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $110.08 $660.48 PACON,  LX375YE 
Quill 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $159.73 $958.38 TRU-RAY, 24509747
Cascade 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $0.00
Pyramid 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $0.00
School Specialty 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $0.00 No Bid
SSWW 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $0.00
WB 42 YELLOW EACH 6 11518-4020 $0.00

DELUXE 80 LB. CONSTRUCTION PAPER-NO SUBSTITUTION WITH LIGHTER WEIGHT
9" x 12" - Tru-Ray

1 WB 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $1.52 $18.24 PAC103029
School Specialty 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $1.79 $21.48
SSWW 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $1.94 $23.28 PE470
Kurtz Bros 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 37081 No Substitutions $2.09 $25.08
Cascade 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $2.24 $26.88 016488
Quill 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $2.39 $28.68 TRU-RAY, 03029
Lakeshore 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID



Pyramid 43 BLACK 50/PKG 12 1006763 No Substitutions $0.00
1 WB 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $1.70 $5.10 PAC103022

School Specialty 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $1.91 $5.73
SSWW 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $1.94 $5.82 PE463
Kurtz Bros 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 37030 No Substitutions $1.96 $5.88
Cascade 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $2.24 $6.72 016491
Quill 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $2.33 $6.99 TRU-RAY, 03022
Lakeshore 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 44 BLUE 50/PKG 3 054027 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $1.57 $1.57 PAC103024
School Specialty 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $1.76 $1.76
SSWW 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $1.94 $1.94 PE465
Kurtz Bros 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 37017 No Substitutions $2.02 $2.02
Cascade 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $2.24 $2.24 016496
Quill 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $2.47 $2.47 TRU-RAY, 03024
Lakeshore 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 45 DARK BROWN 50/PKG 1 054033 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $1.88 $5.64 PAC103006
SSWW 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $1.94 $5.82 PE1908
Kurtz Bros 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 37040 No Substitutions $1.96 $5.88
School Specialty 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $2.12 $6.36
Cascade 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $2.24 $6.72 016490
Quill 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $2.47 $7.41 TRU-RAY, 03006
Lakeshore 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 46 FESTIVE GREEN 50/PKG 3 053976 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $1.60 $4.80 PAC103431
School Specialty 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $1.91 $5.73
SSWW 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $1.94 $5.82 PE508
Kurtz Bros 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 37028 No Substitutions $2.21 $6.63
Cascade 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $2.24 $6.72 016493
Lakeshore 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 47 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 3 054648 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID

1 WB 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $1.71 $1.71 PAC103009
School Specialty 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $1.89 $1.89
Kurtz Bros 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 37070 No Substitutions $1.94 $1.94
SSWW 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $1.94 $1.94 PE451
Cascade 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $2.24 $2.24 016497
Lakeshore 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 48 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 053988 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID

DELUXE 80 LB. CONSTRUCTION PAPER-NO SUBSTITUTION WITH LIGHTER WEIGHT
12" x 18" - Tru Ray

1 WB 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $3.69 $55.35 PAC103063
SSWW 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $4.15 $62.25 PE503
School Specialty 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $4.32 $64.80
Kurtz Bros 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 37199 No Substitutions $4.37 $65.55
Cascade 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $4.42 $66.30 016517
Quill 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $4.67 $70.05 TRU-RAY, 03063
Lakeshore 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 49 ASSORTED 50/PKG 15 054156 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $2.63 $71.01 PAC103061
School Specialty 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $3.73 $100.71
SSWW 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $3.89 $105.03 PE501
Kurtz Bros 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 37181 No Substitutions $4.11 $110.97
Quill 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $4.19 $113.13 TRU-RAY, 03061
Cascade 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $4.42 $119.34 016519
Lakeshore 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 50 BLACK 50/PKG 27 054150 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $3.04 $24.32 PAC103054
School Specialty 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $3.86 $30.88
SSWW 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $3.89 $31.12 PE494
Kurtz Bros 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 37130 No Substitutions $3.93 $31.44
Quill 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $4.36 $34.88 TRU-RAY, 03054
Cascade 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $4.42 $35.36 016522
Lakeshore 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 51 BLUE 50/PKG 8 054129 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $2.90 $14.50 PAC103432
School Specialty 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $3.86 $19.30
SSWW 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $3.89 $19.45 PE509
Kurtz Bros 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 37128 No Substitutions $4.37 $21.85
Cascade 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $4.42 $22.10 016524
Lakeshore 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $0.00



Quill 52 FESTIVE RED 50/PKG 5 054651 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
1 WB 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $3.04 $3.04 PAC103034

School Specialty 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $3.86 $3.86
SSWW 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $3.89 $3.89 PE475
Kurtz Bros 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 37160 No Substitutions $3.92 $3.92
Quill 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $4.33 $4.33 TRU-RAY, 03034
Cascade 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $4.42 $4.42 016525
Lakeshore 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 53 ORANGE 50/PKG 1 054063 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $3.05 $3.05 PAC103041
School Specialty 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $3.73 $3.73
Kurtz Bros 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 37170 No Substitutions $3.87 $3.87
SSWW 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $3.89 $3.89 PE482
Cascade 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $4.42 $4.42 016528
Quill 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $5.00 $5.00 TRU-RAY, PAC103041

Lakeshore 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 54 VIOLET 50/PKG 1 054087 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $2.77 $8.31 PAC103057
School Specialty 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $3.55 $10.65
Kurtz Bros 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 37116 No Substitutions $3.60 $10.80
SSWW 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $3.89 $11.67 PE497
Cascade 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $4.42 $13.26 016532
Quill 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $4.79 $14.37 TRU-RAY, PAC103057

Lakeshore 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 55 WARM BROWN 50/PKG 3 054138 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $2.87 $28.70 PAC103036
School Specialty 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $3.73 $37.30
Kurtz Bros 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 37150 No Substitutions $3.86 $38.60
SSWW 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $3.89 $38.90 PE477
Quill 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $4.18 $41.80 TRU-RAY, 03036
Cascade 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $4.42 $44.20 016520
Lakeshore 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 56 YELLOW 50/PKG 10 054069 No Substitutions $0.00

DELUXE 80 LB. CONSTRUCTION PAPER-NO SUBSTITUTION WITH LIGHTER WEIGHT
18" x 24" - Tru Ray

1 WB 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $6.67 $20.01 PAC103095
Kurtz Bros 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 37299 No Substitutions $8.49 $25.47
Cascade 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $9.19 $27.57 017534
School Specialty 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $9.49 $28.47
Lakeshore 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 57 ASSORTED 50/PKG 3 054933 No Substitutions $0.00

1 WB 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $5.20 $36.40 PAC103093
School Specialty 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $7.39 $51.73
Kurtz Bros 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 37281 No Substitutions $7.58 $53.06
Cascade 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $9.19 $64.33 015986
Quill 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $13.25 $92.75 TRU-RAY, 826097
Lakeshore 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $0.00
SSWW 58 BLACK 50/PKG 7 054939 No Substitutions $0.00

DRAWING PAPER
1 Kurtz Bros 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 35006 $7.35 $51.45

WB 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $7.78 $54.46 PAC4709
Cascade 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $8.24 $57.68 110766
School Specialty 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $9.49 $66.43
SSWW 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $9.73 $68.11 PE101A
Quill 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $15.81 $110.67 PACON, PAC4719
Lakeshore 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 59 EXTRA WHITE 9" x 12" - 60LB 500/REAM 7 053931 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 35007 $14.70 $147.00
WB 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $15.65 $156.50 PAC4712
Cascade 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $16.52 $165.20 110767
School Specialty 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $17.88 $178.80
SSWW 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $19.91 $199.10 PE101B
Quill 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $24.40 $244.00 PACON, 4712QQ
Lakeshore 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $27.74 $277.40 PACON,  TA4412  50LB
Pyramid 60 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 60LB 500/REAM 10 053934 $0.00

1 Kurtz Bros 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 35022 $19.41 $174.69
WB 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $20.68 $186.12 PAC4812
Cascade 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $24.08 $216.72 110787
School Specialty 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $26.12 $235.08
Quill 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $37.18 $334.62 PACON, PAC4812



Lakeshore 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $0.00
SSWW 61 EXTRA WHITE 12" x 18" - 80LB 500/REAM 9 053946 $0.00

1 WB 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $5.10 $25.50 PAC4009
Kurtz Bros 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 35055 $7.06 $35.30
School Specialty 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $7.20 $36.00
SSWW 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 50 pound $7.21 $36.05 PE106A 
Cascade 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $7.47 $37.35 110906
Lakeshore 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $9.24 $46.20 PACON,  TA4109  50LB
Pyramid 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $0.00
Quill 62 MANILA 9" x 12" - 56 LB 500/REAM 5 085559 $0.00 NO BID

22x28 PHOTO MOUNTS - MELTON
1 School Specialty 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $29.44 $176.64

Kurtz Bros 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 40526 $32.50 $195.00
Cascade 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $35.88 $215.28 112106
Lakeshore 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $0.00
Quill 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $0.00
WB 63 BLACK 10/PKG 6 405081 $0.00

TAGBOARD
1 WB 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $3.02 $15.10 PAC5181

Cascade 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $3.34 $16.70 111767
School Specialty 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $4.07 $20.35
SSWW 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $4.79 $23.95 PE1864
Quill 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $31.98 $159.90 PACON, 876026
Kurtz Bros 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $0.00
Lakeshore 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 64 MANILA 9" x 12" 100/PKG 5 085510 $0.00

1 WB 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $6.04 $36.24 PAC5184
Cascade 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $6.68 $40.08 111768
School Specialty 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $8.19 $49.14
Kurtz Bros 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 57813 $8.75 $52.50
Quill 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $9.73 $58.38 PACON, 5184
SSWW 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $9.87 $59.22 PE2154
Lakeshore 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 65 MANILA 12" x 18" 100/PKG 6 085511 $0.00

1 WB 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $12.77 $127.70 PAC5190
Cascade 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $13.86 $138.60 111770
School Specialty 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $17.81 $178.10
Quill 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $33.49 $334.90 PACON, 24491470
Kurtz Bros 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $0.00
Lakeshore 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $0.00
SSWW 66 MANILA 18" x 24" 100/PKG 10 085513 $0.00

1 Cascade 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $27.71 $138.55 111771
School Specialty 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $32.73 $163.65
Quill 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $76.54 $382.70 PACON, 2498151
Kurtz Bros 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $0.00
Lakeshore 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $0.00
SSWW 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $0.00
WB 67 MANILA 24" x 36" 100/PKG 5 085516 $0.00

1 Cascade 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $13.36 $146.96 111774
School Specialty 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $22.33 $245.63
Quill 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $47.49 $522.39 PACON, 881220
Kurtz Bros 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $0.00
Lakeshore 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $0.00
SSWW 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $0.00
WB 68 White Tagboard 18x24 100/PKG 11 1537803 $0.00

TRACING PAPER
1 School Specialty 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $1.52 $21.28

Cascade 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $1.96 $27.44 030783
Kurtz Bros 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 01472 $2.52 $35.28
Quill 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $3.82 $53.48 BIENFANG, 214494
Lakeshore 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $0.00
SSWW 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $0.00
WB 69 9" x 12" 50/PAD 14 248200 $0.00

1 School Specialty 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $21.07 $210.70



Cascade 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00
Kurtz Bros 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00
Lakeshore 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00
Quill 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00
WB 70 12" x 18" 500/REAM 10 205538 $0.00

CELLULOSE SPONGES
1 Kurtz Bros 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 21041 $1.07 $48.15

Pyramid 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 AC #661 $1.09 $49.05
School Specialty 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $1.38 $62.10
Cascade 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $1.92 $86.40 189695
Lakeshore 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $0.00 NO BID
Quill 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $0.00
WB 71 SMALL 6 x 3 1/3 x 1 EACH 45 085831 $0.00

PIPE CLEANERS - CHENILLE
1 School Specialty 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $0.98 $18.62

SSWW 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $1.01 $19.19 CC687
Pyramid 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 PYRAMID 1218841 $1.19 $22.61
Cascade 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $1.43 $27.17 169552
Kurtz Bros 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 42049 $1.63 $30.97
Lakeshore 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $3.69 $70.11 LAKESHORE,  BA7112
Quill 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $0.00 NO BID
WB 72 12" BULK - ASSORTED COLORS 100/PACK 19 085819 $0.00

VERSATEMP TEMPERA PAINT
Cascade 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104867 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 73 BLACK PINT 2 1440686 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104863 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 74 BLUE PINT 2 1440687 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104866 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 75 BROWN PINT 2 1440688 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104862 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 76 GREEN PINT 2 1440689 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104859 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 77 ORANGE PINT 2 1440691 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104858 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00



Quill 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 78 RED PINT 2 1440692 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 143645 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 79 TURQUOISE PINT 2 1440693 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104864 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 80 VIOLET PINT 2 1440694 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $1.48 $4.44 104865 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $2.45 $7.35 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 81 WHITE PINT 3 1440695 No Substitutions $0.00
Cascade 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $1.48 $2.96 104860 PRANG - Not correct product - watered down

1 School Specialty 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $2.45 $4.90 Exact Product - SAX Versatemp - superior product
Kurtz Bros 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00
Lakeshore 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00
Quill 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 82 YELLOW PINT 2 1440696 No Substitutions $0.00

PRANG OVAL PAN REFILL
WB 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00808 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00808 Exact item
Cascade 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 136052
School Specialty 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $4.45 $8.90
Kurtz Bros 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 46069 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26
Lakeshore 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 83 BLACK DOZEN 2 001260 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $3.64 $10.92 DIX00805 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $3.95 $11.85 00805 Exact item
Cascade 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $4.28 $12.84 136049
School Specialty 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $4.45 $13.35
Kurtz Bros 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 46064 No Substitutions $4.63 $13.89
Lakeshore 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 84 BLUE DOZEN 3 001248 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $3.64 $14.56 DIX00807 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $3.95 $15.80 00807 Exact item
Cascade 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $4.28 $17.12 136051
School Specialty 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $4.45 $17.80
Kurtz Bros 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 46068 No Substitutions $4.63 $18.52
Lakeshore 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 85 BROWN DOZEN 4 001254 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00804 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00804 Exact item
Cascade 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 136048
School Specialty 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $4.45 $8.90
Kurtz Bros 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 46065 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26
Lakeshore 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 86 GREEN DOZEN 2 001251 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00802 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00802 Exact item
Cascade 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 136046
School Specialty 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $4.45 $8.90
Kurtz Bros 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 46066 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26



Lakeshore 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 87 ORANGE DOZEN 2 001245 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00801 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00801 Exact item
Cascade 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 136045
School Specialty 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $4.45 $8.90
Kurtz Bros 88 RED DOZEN 2 46062 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26
Lakeshore 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 88 RED DOZEN 2 001239 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00806 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00806 Exact item
School Specialty 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $4.06 $8.12
Cascade 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 13650
Kurtz Bros 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 46067 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26
Lakeshore 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 89 VIOLET DOZEN 2 001281 No Substitutions $0.00
WB 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $3.64 $7.28 DIX00803 Dixon - not correct product

1 Pyramid 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $3.95 $7.90 00803 Exact item
Cascade 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $4.28 $8.56 136047
School Specialty 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $4.45 $8.90
Kurtz Bros 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 46063 No Substitutions $4.63 $9.26
Lakeshore 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
Quill 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $0.00 NO BID
SSWW 90 YELLOW DOZEN 2 001242 No Substitutions $0.00


	Sorted for Web

