
Science Supplies for 2024-25-11
Lowest/Awarded

Information: No Bid

Mailed to 21 BID # of Items Bid Bid Total Awarded
# of Items 
Awarded

Total 
Awarded

Teacher's choice

Responded 3 Fisher Scientific Company LLC 38 $1,765.04 Fisher Scientific Company LL 34 $1,446.76
Returned as 
undeliverable 1 Flinn Scientific, Inc. 19 $2,359.19 Flinn Scientific, Inc. 8 $1,044.76
Total Items to bid on 79 Parco Scientific Company 15 $1,176.00 Parco Scientific Company 7 $355.00
Total Items awarded 49 Grand Total Awarded 49 $2,846.52
Total No Bid 30

COMPANY CATEGORY ITEM DESCRIPTION CATALOG NO. VENDOR QUANTITY Substitute CATALOG # PRICE  TOTAL COST SUBSTITUTE CATALOG 
NB Flinn Scientific 1 Anatomy Duble Injected Fetal Pigs (Pail of 10) 470000-596 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  

Parco Scientific 1 Anatomy Duble Injected Fetal Pigs (Pail of 10) 470000-596 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 1 Anatomy Duble Injected Fetal Pigs (Pail of 10) 470000-596 Wards 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 2 Anatomy Human Torso 470111-076 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 2 Anatomy Human Torso 470111-076 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 2 Anatomy Human Torso 470111-076 Wards 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 3 Anatomy Ward's® simulated ABO and Rh blood-typing kit 470329-246 Wards 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 3 Anatomy Ward's® simulated ABO and Rh blood-typing kit 470329-246 Wards 2 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 3 Anatomy Ward's® simulated ABO and Rh blood-typing kit 470329-246 Wards 2 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 4 AP Biology A Taste of Genetics MiniLab M6013 MiniOne 2 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 4 AP Biology A Taste of Genetics MiniLab M6013 MiniOne 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 4 AP Biology A Taste of Genetics MiniLab M6013 MiniOne 2 -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 5 AP Biology Amino Acid Starter Kit Poster AASKP 3DMolecular Designs 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 5 AP Biology Amino Acid Starter Kit Poster AASKP 3DMolecular Designs 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 5 AP Biology Amino Acid Starter Kit Poster AASKP 3DMolecular Designs 1 -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 6 AP Biology Flow of Genetic Information Kit© - 6-Group Set FGIK-06 3DMolecular Designs 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 6 AP Biology Flow of Genetic Information Kit© - 6-Group Set FGIK-06 3DMolecular Designs 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 6 AP Biology Flow of Genetic Information Kit© - 6-Group Set FGIK-06 3DMolecular Designs 1 -                  No Bid

1 Flinn Scientific 7 AP Biology Giant Panda Problem Kit 17002878EDU BioRad 2 FB2558 189.48                          378.96             
Parco Scientific 7 AP Biology Giant Panda Problem Kit 17002878EDU BioRad 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 7 AP Biology Giant Panda Problem Kit 17002878EDU BioRad 2 -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 8 AP Biology Hemoglobin Poster HGP 3DMolecular Designs 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 8 AP Biology Hemoglobin Poster HGP 3DMolecular Designs 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 8 AP Biology Hemoglobin Poster HGP 3DMolecular Designs 1 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 9 AP Biology Live Brown Hydra, 30 students 470176-554 Ward's 1 12.32                             12.32               S07265ND
Flinn Scientific 9 AP Biology Live Brown Hydra, 30 students 470176-554 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 9 AP Biology Live Brown Hydra, 30 students 470176-554 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 10 AP Biology Live Euglena Acus 30 students 470183-812 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 10 AP Biology Live Euglena Acus 30 students 470183-812 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 10 AP Biology Live Euglena Acus 30 students 470183-812 Ward's 1 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 11 AP Biology Live Green Hydra (Chlorohydra viridissima ) 470176-322 Ward's 1 16.99                            16.99               S07230ND
Flinn Scientific 11 AP Biology Live Green Hydra (Chlorohydra viridissima ) 470176-322 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 11 AP Biology Live Green Hydra (Chlorohydra viridissima ) 470176-322 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 12 AP Biology Live Volvox aureus Culture 470176-360 Ward's 1 9.79                               9.79                 S07487ND
Flinn Scientific 12 AP Biology Live Volvox aureus Culture 470176-360 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 12 AP Biology Live Volvox aureus Culture 470176-360 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 13 AP Biology Live Water Fleas (Daphnia magna ) 470176-562 Ward's 1 12.80                             12.80               S07268ND
Flinn Scientific 13 AP Biology Live Water Fleas (Daphnia magna ) 470176-562 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 13 AP Biology Live Water Fleas (Daphnia magna ) 470176-562 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 14 AP Biology Live Amoeba proteus  cultures 470176-570 Ward's 1 9.79                               9.79                 S07217ND
Flinn Scientific 14 AP Biology Live Amoeba proteus  cultures 470176-570 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 14 AP Biology Live Amoeba proteus  cultures 470176-570 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 15 AP Biology Live Elodea densa  Aquatic Plants 470180-034 Ward's 1 14.94                             14.94               S07497ND
Flinn Scientific 15 AP Biology Live Elodea densa  Aquatic Plants 470180-034 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 15 AP Biology Live Elodea densa  Aquatic Plants 470180-034 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 16 AP Biology Live Paramecium caudatum Culture 470176-580 Ward's 1 9.79                               9.79                 S07220ND
Flinn Scientific 16 AP Biology Live Paramecium caudatum Culture 470176-580 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 16 AP Biology Live Paramecium caudatum Culture 470176-580 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

Results from Bid Opening Awarded Bids
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1 Fisher Scientific 17 AP Biology Live Stentor coeruleus  Culture 470176-584 Ward's 1 9.79                               9.79                 S07223ND
Flinn Scientific 17 AP Biology Live Stentor coeruleus  Culture 470176-584 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 17 AP Biology Live Stentor coeruleus  Culture 470176-584 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 18 AP Biology Micropipette Tips - 2-200 µl – 1000 count (M3134) M3134 MiniOne 1 S39855, Eisco CH0587B 25.17                             25.17               No Bid
Flinn Scientific 18 AP Biology Micropipette Tips - 2-200 µl – 1000 count (M3134) M3134 MiniOne 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 18 AP Biology Micropipette Tips - 2-200 µl – 1000 count (M3134) M3134 MiniOne 1 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 19 AP Biology Mighty Model Channel Protein Collection MMCPC 3DMolecular Designs 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 19 AP Biology Mighty Model Channel Protein Collection MMCPC 3DMolecular Designs 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 19 AP Biology Mighty Model Channel Protein Collection MMCPC 3DMolecular Designs 1 -                  No Bid

1 Flinn Scientific 20 AP Biology pGLO Bacterial Transformation Kit 1660003EDU BioRad 2 FB2565 137.18                           274.36             
Parco Scientific 20 AP Biology pGLO Bacterial Transformation Kit 1660003EDU BioRad 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 20 AP Biology pGLO Bacterial Transformation Kit 1660003EDU BioRad 2 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 21 AP Biology Water bear 470180-260 Ward's 1 15.90                             15.90               S07592ND
Flinn Scientific 21 AP Biology Water bear 470180-260 Ward's 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 21 AP Biology Water bear 470180-260 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 22 Chemistry 1.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-232 Wards 1 5.80                               5.80                 S25356A 
Flinn Scientific 22 Chemistry 1.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-232 Wards 1 H0057 11.25                              11.25               
Parco Scientific 22 Chemistry 1.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-232 Wards 1 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 23 Chemistry 2.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-240 Wards 2 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 23 Chemistry 2.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-240 Wards 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 23 Chemistry 2.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-240 Wards 2 -                  

NB Flinn Scientific 24 Chemistry 6.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-248 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 24 Chemistry 6.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-248 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 24 Chemistry 6.0 M Hydrochloric Acid 1.0 Liter 470301-248 Wards 1 No Substitute -                  

1 Fisher Scientific 25 Chemistry Acrylic Buret, 50 mL 470148-702 Wards 2 No Substitute 9.80                               19.60               S09609B   
Parco Scientific 25 Chemistry Acrylic Buret, 50 mL 470148-702 Wards 2 No Substitute 21.00                          42.00                UN11502
Flinn Scientific 25 Chemistry Acrylic Buret, 50 mL 470148-702 Wards 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  

1 Fisher Scientific 26 Chemistry Bunsen Burner with flame stabilizer 470121-694 Wards 4 17.44                             69.76               S12807    
Flinn Scientific 26 Chemistry Bunsen Burner with flame stabilizer 470121-694 Wards 4 AP8344 25.43                            101.72             
Parco Scientific 26 Chemistry Bunsen Burner with flame stabilizer 470121-694 Wards 4 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 27 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 125 mL (12 pk) 470211-786 Wards 1 No Substitute 8.52                               8.52                 S00071    
Parco Scientific 27 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 125 mL (12 pk) 470211-786 Wards 1 No Substitute 13.00                          13.00                UNDDB125
Flinn Scientific 27 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 125 mL (12 pk) 470211-786 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  

1 Fisher Scientific 28 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 30 mL (12pk) 470175-990 Wards 3 No Substitute 5.73                               17.19               S00084    
Parco Scientific 28 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 30 mL (12pk) 470175-990 Wards 3 No Substitute 8.00                            24.00                UNDDB030
Flinn Scientific 28 Chemistry Dispensing Bottles with Hinged Caps, 30 mL (12pk) 470175-990 Wards 3 No Substitute No Bid -                  

1 Parco Scientific 29 Chemistry Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder Free, Large 470153-394 Ward's 4 6.00                            24.00                ID1004L
Fisher Scientific 29 Chemistry Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder Free, Large 470153-394 Ward's 4 18.25                             73.00               19-149-863
Flinn Scientific 29 Chemistry Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder Free, Large 470153-394 Ward's 4 AP7080 24.30                            97.20               

1 Fisher Scientific 30 Chemistry Mossy Zinc, Reagent, 500 g 470303-090 Wards 1 No Substitute 10.41                              10.41               S25636    
Flinn Scientific 30 Chemistry Mossy Zinc, Reagent, 500 g 470303-090 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 30 Chemistry Mossy Zinc, Reagent, 500 g 470303-090 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 31 Chemistry Neoprene connecting hose, 90 cm 470220-806 Wards 4 No Substitute 15.70                             62.80               S24487    
Flinn Scientific 31 Chemistry Neoprene connecting hose, 90 cm 470220-806 Wards 4 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 31 Chemistry Neoprene connecting hose, 90 cm 470220-806 Wards 4 No Substitute NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 32 Earth Science Calorimetery Cup (set of 6) TD-8825A Pasco 6 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 32 Earth Science Calorimetery Cup (set of 6) TD-8825A Pasco 6 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 32 Earth Science Calorimetery Cup (set of 6) TD-8825A Pasco 6 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 33 Earth Science Glass Hardness Plates 470148-652 Ward's 8 14.00                          112.00              UNGLP3X2-P
Flinn Scientific 33 Earth Science Glass Hardness Plates 470148-652 Ward's 8 No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 33 Earth Science Glass Hardness Plates 470148-652 Ward's 8 -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 34 Earth Science High Peformance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AAA (Box of 24) 470317-630 Wards 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 34 Earth Science High Peformance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AAA (Box of 24) 470317-630 Wards 2 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 34 Earth Science High Peformance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AAA (Box of 24) 470317-630 Wards 2 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 35 Earth Science High Performance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AA (Box of 24) 470145-514 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 35 Earth Science High Performance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AA (Box of 24) 470145-514 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 35 Earth Science High Performance Alkaline Battery 1.5V AA (Box of 24) 470145-514 Wards 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 36 Earth Science Reagent Bottle-Polypropylene 1000 ml 470313-958 Wards 5 No Substitute 4.65                               23.25               S24490    
Flinn Scientific 36 Earth Science Reagent Bottle-Polypropylene 1000 ml 470313-958 Wards 5 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 36 Earth Science Reagent Bottle-Polypropylene 1000 ml 470313-958 Wards 5 No Substitute NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 37 Earth Science TI-108 calculator 470349-982 Wards 40 No Substitute 4.95                               198.00             S43195
Flinn Scientific 37 Earth Science TI-108 calculator 470349-982 Wards 40 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 37 Earth Science TI-108 calculator 470349-982 Wards 40 No Substitute NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 38 Earth Science White Streak plates 470097-452 Ward's 8 5.05                               40.40               S01230
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Flinn Scientific 38 Earth Science White Streak plates 470097-452 Ward's 8 AP5081, 1" x 2" 9.84                               78.72               
Parco Scientific 38 Earth Science White Streak plates 470097-452 Ward's 8 NO BID -                     
Flinn Scientific 39 Forensics Cards Personal Fingerprint Pk100 470020-200 Ward's 1 CSI-313, Pkg. of 50 12.56                             12.56               

1 Fisher Scientific 39 Forensics Cards Personal Fingerprint Pk100 470020-200 Ward's 1 20.29                            20.29               S69015
Parco Scientific 39 Forensics Cards Personal Fingerprint Pk100 470020-200 Ward's 1 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 40 Forensics Cards Print Backing (Latent Print) pk100 470020-202 Ward's 5 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 40 Forensics Cards Print Backing (Latent Print) pk100 470020-202 Ward's 5 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 40 Forensics Cards Print Backing (Latent Print) pk100 470020-202 Ward's 5 -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 41 Forensics Detection of Art Forgery Lab (Kit of 1) 470144-258 Ward's 2 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 41 Forensics Detection of Art Forgery Lab (Kit of 1) 470144-258 Ward's 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 41 Forensics Detection of Art Forgery Lab (Kit of 1) 470144-258 Ward's 2 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 42 Forensics Fingerprint Lifting Tape 1.5 x 10 yards 470001-990 Ward's 5 S99535, 2 in. × 30 ft. 7.43                               37.15               No Bid
Flinn Scientific 42 Forensics Fingerprint Lifting Tape 1.5 x 10 yards 470001-990 Ward's 5 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 42 Forensics Fingerprint Lifting Tape 1.5 x 10 yards 470001-990 Ward's 5 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 43 Forensics Lightening Powder Liquid Glue 470024-626 Ward's 2 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 43 Forensics Lightening Powder Liquid Glue 470024-626 Ward's 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 43 Forensics Lightening Powder Liquid Glue 470024-626 Ward's 2 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 44 Intro Chem Basic bunsen burner 470121-688 wards 2 14.58                             29.16               S12805
Flinn Scientific 44 Intro Chem Basic bunsen burner 470121-688 wards 2 AP1017 23.40                            46.80               
Parco Scientific 44 Intro Chem Basic bunsen burner 470121-688 wards 2 NO BID -                     

1 Fisher Scientific 45 Intro Chem Hooded gas lighters 470005-604 wards 10 2.40                               24.00               S99453
Parco Scientific 45 Intro Chem Hooded gas lighters 470005-604 wards 10 3.50                            35.00                UNGSLT01
Flinn Scientific 45 Intro Chem Hooded gas lighters 470005-604 wards 10 AP8346 35.70                            357.00             

NB Flinn Scientific 46 Living Env DNA Fingerprinting MiniLab (M3004) M3004 theminione.com 10 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 46 Living Env DNA Fingerprinting MiniLab (M3004) M3004 theminione.com 10 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 46 Living Env DNA Fingerprinting MiniLab (M3004) M3004 theminione.com 10 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 47 Living Env Electrophoresis 101 MiniLab (M3001) M3001 theminione.com 6 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 47 Living Env Electrophoresis 101 MiniLab (M3001) M3001 theminione.com 6 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 47 Living Env Electrophoresis 101 MiniLab (M3001) M3001 theminione.com 6 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 48 Living Env Glad Disposable Bakeware Aluminum Pans 12 count https://a.co/d/crsNogb Amazon 4 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 48 Living Env Glad Disposable Bakeware Aluminum Pans 12 count https://a.co/d/crsNogb Amazon 4 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 48 Living Env Glad Disposable Bakeware Aluminum Pans 12 count https://a.co/d/crsNogb Amazon 4 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 49 Living Env Ward's Sterile, Disposable Cell Spreaders (500 pk) 470236-284 Wards 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 49 Living Env Ward's Sterile, Disposable Cell Spreaders (500 pk) 470236-284 Wards 1 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 49 Living Env Ward's Sterile, Disposable Cell Spreaders (500 pk) 470236-284 Wards 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 50 Living Env. Bottle Screw Top Drop Pipet 30 mL pk 12 470012-952 Ward's 8 14.24                             113.92             S27770 
Parco Scientific 50 Living Env. Bottle Screw Top Drop Pipet 30 mL pk 12 470012-952 Ward's 8 16.00                          128.00              UNBDPSC-1OZ
Flinn Scientific 50 Living Env. Bottle Screw Top Drop Pipet 30 mL pk 12 470012-952 Ward's 8 AP1442, square bottle 62.16                             497.28             

1 Fisher Scientific 51 Living Env. Chromatography Solvent 500mL 470300-712 Ward's 4 8.15                                32.60               S25253 
Flinn Scientific 51 Living Env. Chromatography Solvent 500mL 470300-712 Ward's 4 C0422 16.99                            67.96               
Parco Scientific 51 Living Env. Chromatography Solvent 500mL 470300-712 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     

1 Flinn Scientific 52 Living Env. Dialysis tubing 29.6 mmx 45 mm 10 ft roll 470163-408 Ward's 4 AP4353 9.04                              36.16               
Fisher Scientific 52 Living Env. Dialysis tubing 29.6 mmx 45 mm 10 ft roll 470163-408 Ward's 4 9.98                               39.92               S25645B
Parco Scientific 52 Living Env. Dialysis tubing 29.6 mmx 45 mm 10 ft roll 470163-408 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 53 Living Env. DNA Structure and Replication Molecular Model- Class 470014-600 Wards 1 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 53 Living Env. DNA Structure and Replication Molecular Model- Class 470014-600 Wards 1 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 53 Living Env. DNA Structure and Replication Molecular Model- Class 470014-600 Wards 1 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 54 Living Env. Hydrogen Peroxide 6% 500mL 470301-288 Ward's 2 5.44                               10.88               S25361A
Flinn Scientific 54 Living Env. Hydrogen Peroxide 6% 500mL 470301-288 Ward's 2 H0028 9.32                               18.64               
Parco Scientific 54 Living Env. Hydrogen Peroxide 6% 500mL 470301-288 Ward's 2 NO BID -                     

1 Flinn Scientific 55 Living Env. Iodine, Solution, 0.1 M, 500 mL Bottle 470301-310 Ward's 4 I0039 17.60                             70.40               
Parco Scientific 55 Living Env. Iodine, Solution, 0.1 M, 500 mL Bottle 470301-310 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 55 Living Env. Iodine, Solution, 0.1 M, 500 mL Bottle 470301-310 Ward's 4 -                  No Bid

1 Flinn Scientific 56 Living Env. Isopropyl alcohol - 99%, 500 mL bottle (case of 2) 470301-476 Ward's 4 I0019 17.74                              70.96               

Fisher Scientific 56 Living Env. Isopropyl alcohol - 99%, 500 mL bottle (case of 2) 470301-476 Ward's 4

S25372, sold as 1x500ml. Price 
per 500mL is $15.42. Unit price 
reflects 2 each 30.84                            123.36             S25372 

Parco Scientific 56 Living Env. Isopropyl alcohol - 99%, 500 mL bottle (case of 2) 470301-476 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     
1 Fisher Scientific 57 Living Env. Label Tape, White, Write-on, 41.5 yards x 1/2", roll 470204-034 Ward's 2 4.70                               9.40                 15-949

Flinn Scientific 57 Living Env. Label Tape, White, Write-on, 41.5 yards x 1/2", roll 470204-034 Ward's 2 AP1368, 120 ft. 12.65                             25.30               
Parco Scientific 57 Living Env. Label Tape, White, Write-on, 41.5 yards x 1/2", roll 470204-034 Ward's 2 NO BID -                     

1 Flinn Scientific 58 Living Env. Molasses, Dark, 300 mL M0068 Flinn Scientific 10 M0068 8.05                               80.50               
Fisher Scientific 58 Living Env. Molasses, Dark, 300 mL M0068 Flinn Scientific 10 8.20                               82.00               S25753 
Parco Scientific 58 Living Env. Molasses, Dark, 300 mL M0068 Flinn Scientific 10 NO BID -                     

https://a.co/d/crsNogb
https://a.co/d/crsNogb
https://a.co/d/crsNogb


NB Flinn Scientific 59 Living Env. Petri Dish, slippable (pack of 6) 470151-288 Ward's 4 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 59 Living Env. Petri Dish, slippable (pack of 6) 470151-288 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 59 Living Env. Petri Dish, slippable (pack of 6) 470151-288 Ward's 4 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 60 Living Env. pH paper, laboratory, paper, ph 1-14 range, vial/50 470001-956 Ward's 30 3.55                               106.50             S21140 
Flinn Scientific 60 Living Env. pH paper, laboratory, paper, ph 1-14 range, vial/50 470001-956 Ward's 30 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 60 Living Env. pH paper, laboratory, paper, ph 1-14 range, vial/50 470001-956 Ward's 30 NO BID -                     

1 Flinn Scientific 61 Living Env. Pkg of 50 units: Cup, plastic, clear cocktail, 9 oz 470162-902 Ward's 9 AP7294, 10-oz 12.32                             110.88             
Parco Scientific 61 Living Env. Pkg of 50 units: Cup, plastic, clear cocktail, 9 oz 470162-902 Ward's 9 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 61 Living Env. Pkg of 50 units: Cup, plastic, clear cocktail, 9 oz 470162-902 Ward's 9 -                  No Bid

1 Flinn Scientific 62 Living Env. Plastic wrapped straws (pkg of 500) 470146-910 Ward's 2 AP6025, 8" long, 1/4" diameter 11.27                              22.54               
Parco Scientific 62 Living Env. Plastic wrapped straws (pkg of 500) 470146-910 Ward's 2 NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 62 Living Env. Plastic wrapped straws (pkg of 500) 470146-910 Ward's 2 -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 63 Living Env. Starch, Solution, 5% (Aqueous), 500ml bottle 470302-768 Ward's 4 3.84                               15.36               S25579
Flinn Scientific 63 Living Env. Starch, Solution, 5% (Aqueous), 500ml bottle 470302-768 Ward's 4 No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 63 Living Env. Starch, Solution, 5% (Aqueous), 500ml bottle 470302-768 Ward's 4 NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 64 Physics Photogate Timer 7921100 CPO Science 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 64 Physics Photogate Timer 7921100 CPO Science 2 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 64 Physics Photogate Timer 7921100 CPO Science 2 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 65 MS alconox detergent, lab grade 4 lb 842400 Carolina 2 No Substitute 37.79                             75.58               16-000
Flinn Scientific 65 MS alconox detergent, lab grade 4 lb 842400 Carolina 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 65 MS alconox detergent, lab grade 4 lb 842400 Carolina 2 No Substitute NO BID -                     

NB Flinn Scientific 66 MS aquarium gravel, 1 lb 163202 Carolina 9 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 66 MS aquarium gravel, 1 lb 163202 Carolina 9 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 66 MS aquarium gravel, 1 lb 163202 Carolina 9 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 67 MS Carolina small size safety spectaclesv ( goggles ) 646713 Carolina 15 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 67 MS Carolina small size safety spectaclesv ( goggles ) 646713 Carolina 15 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 67 MS Carolina small size safety spectaclesv ( goggles ) 646713 Carolina 15 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 68 MS carson mm-480 zorb digital microscope 591722 Carolina 3 No Substitute 65.00                          195.00              MM-480
Flinn Scientific 68 MS carson mm-480 zorb digital microscope 591722 Carolina 3 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 68 MS carson mm-480 zorb digital microscope 591722 Carolina 3 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 69 MS carson pro series CP-90 magniflex Pro magnifier 602018 Carolina 3 No Substitute 80.00                           240.00             S13548
Parco Scientific 69 MS carson pro series CP-90 magniflex Pro magnifier 602018 Carolina 3 No Substitute 118.00                       354.00              CP-90
Flinn Scientific 69 MS carson pro series CP-90 magniflex Pro magnifier 602018 Carolina 3 No Substitute No Bid -                  

1 Fisher Scientific 70 MS dropper vials, glass, screw top 1oz pack of 12 716438 Carolina 6 No Substitute 10.52                             63.12               S24567
Parco Scientific 70 MS dropper vials, glass, screw top 1oz pack of 12 716438 Carolina 6 No Substitute 16.00                          96.00                UNBDPSC-1OZ
Flinn Scientific 70 MS dropper vials, glass, screw top 1oz pack of 12 716438 Carolina 6 No Substitute No Bid -                  

NB Flinn Scientific 71 MS Hot Pot 974062 Carolina 3 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 71 MS Hot Pot 974062 Carolina 3 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 71 MS Hot Pot 974062 Carolina 3 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 72 MS hydrochloric acid, 12.1M, in plastic coated safety bottle ACS 2.5L 867793 Carolina 2 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 72 MS hydrochloric acid, 12.1M, in plastic coated safety bottle ACS 2.5L 867793 Carolina 2 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 72 MS hydrochloric acid, 12.1M, in plastic coated safety bottle ACS 2.5L 867793 Carolina 2 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 73 MS nitrile disposable gloves, extra large box of 100 706338 Carolina 1 No Substitute 6.00                            6.00                   ID1004XL
Flinn Scientific 73 MS nitrile disposable gloves, extra large box of 100 706338 Carolina 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 73 MS nitrile disposable gloves, extra large box of 100 706338 Carolina 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 74 MS nitrile disposable gloves, large box of 100 706337 Carolina 1 No Substitute 6.00                            6.00                   ID1004L
Flinn Scientific 74 MS nitrile disposable gloves, large box of 100 706337 Carolina 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 74 MS nitrile disposable gloves, large box of 100 706337 Carolina 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 75 MS nitrile disposable gloves, medium box of 100 706336 Carolina 1 No Substitute 6.00                            6.00                   ID1004M
Flinn Scientific 75 MS nitrile disposable gloves, medium box of 100 706336 Carolina 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 75 MS nitrile disposable gloves, medium box of 100 706336 Carolina 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Parco Scientific 76 MS nitrile disposable gloves, small box of 100 706335 Carolina 1 No Substitute 6.00                            6.00                   ID1004S
Flinn Scientific 76 MS nitrile disposable gloves, small box of 100 706335 Carolina 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Fisher Scientific 76 MS nitrile disposable gloves, small box of 100 706335 Carolina 1 No Substitute -                  No Bid

1 Fisher Scientific 77 MS petri dishes, polystyrene, disposable, sterile, 100x15, case of 500 741251 Carolina 1 No Substitute 75.79                            75.79               S43583
Parco Scientific 77 MS petri dishes, polystyrene, disposable, sterile, 100x15, case of 500 741251 Carolina 1 No Substitute 129.00                       129.00              MK1004J3-500
Flinn Scientific 77 MS petri dishes, polystyrene, disposable, sterile, 100x15, case of 500 741251 Carolina 1 No Substitute No Bid -                  

NB Flinn Scientific 78 MS polypropylene lab tray, pack of 10 629385 Carolina 4 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 78 MS polypropylene lab tray, pack of 10 629385 Carolina 4 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 78 MS polypropylene lab tray, pack of 10 629385 Carolina 4 No Substitute -                  No Bid

NB Flinn Scientific 79 MS Pyrex glass griffin beaker, low form, heavy duty 250ml 721249 Carolina 30 No Substitute No Bid -                  
Parco Scientific 79 MS Pyrex glass griffin beaker, low form, heavy duty 250ml 721249 Carolina 30 No Substitute NO BID -                     
Fisher Scientific 79 MS Pyrex glass griffin beaker, low form, heavy duty 250ml 721249 Carolina 30 No Substitute -                  No Bid
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