

<b>ADDENDUM TO THE BID DOCUMENTS</b>		Page: 1	Total Pages: 31
<u>Addendum No:</u> # 1		<u>Date this Addendum Issued:</u> <b>October 9, 2024</b>	
<u>Issuing Office:</u> Matanuska-Susitna Borough School District (MSBSD) Purchasing Department 690 Cope Industrial Way Palmer, Alaska 99645 Phone: (907) 861-5120 Facsimile: (907) 861-5184		<u>Previous Addenda Issued:</u> None _____ _____ _____ _____	
<u>Return Acknowledgment To:</u> <b>Issuing Department</b>		<u>Date and Hour of Bid Due Date:</u> <del>October 15, 2024 at 2:00 p.m.</del> <b>October 17, 2024 at 2:00 p.m.</b>	
<u>Bid Title:</u> <b>Snow and Ice Removal and Sanding Services</b>		<u>As Advertised (Frontiersman):</u> <b>September 25 &amp; 27, 2024</b>	
<u>Bid No:</u> <b>B25-02</b>		<u>As Advertised (ADN):</u> <b>September 22 &amp; 25, 2024</b>	
<p><b>The following corrections, changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and/or clarifications are hereby made a part of the contract documents. In case of conflicts between this addendum and previously issued documents, this addendum shall take precedence. The bidder must acknowledge receipt of this addendum in the space provided on Appendix #1. Failure to do so may subject the bidder to disqualification.</b></p> <p>This addendum incorporates the attached 30 pages.</p> <p><b>Clarifications:</b> The revised bid opening is <b>Thursday, October 17, 2024 at 2:00 PM.</b></p> <p><b>General Questions:</b></p> <p>1. Q: Regarding B25-02, can I get the previous Bid Tabulations for the snow and ice removal and sanding for B21-02?</p> <p>A: Attached are the previous bid tabulation sheets for Bids B18-13, B21-02, and B23-03.</p> <p>2. Q: We would like to request the records for the past three bid cycles for the Matsu Schools snow removal.</p> <p>A: Attached are the previous bid tabulation sheets for Bids B18-13, B21-02, and B23-03.</p> <p><b>Attachments:</b></p> <p>Bid B18-13 Tabulation Sheet (10 pages)</p> <p>Bid B21-02 Tabulation Sheet (10 pages)</p> <p>Bid B23-03 Tabulation Sheet (10 pages)</p> <p style="text-align: center;"><b>END OF ADDENDUM #1</b></p>			

APPROVED BY: Beth Munson	DATE: October 9, 2024
--------------------------	-----------------------

**BASE BID**

**SERVICE AREA I:**

Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Talkeetna Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$659.00	\$6,590.00	<b>\$320.00</b>	<b>\$3,200.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	\$659.00	\$7,908.00	<b>\$335.00</b>	<b>\$4,020.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
2	Trapper Creek Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$419.00	\$4,190.00	<b>\$350.00</b>	<b>\$3,500.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	\$419.00	\$5,028.00	<b>\$360.00</b>	<b>\$4,320.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
3	Su Valley Jr./Sr. High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$869.00	\$8,690.00	<b>\$825.00</b>	<b>\$8,250.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	\$869.00	\$10,428.00	<b>\$470.00</b>	<b>\$5,640.00</b>	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA I</b>				\$42,834.00		<b>\$28,930.00</b>		Non-Responsive		NO BID	

**SERVICE AREA II:**

Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4	Beryozova School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$301.00</b>	<b>\$3,010.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$301.00</b>	<b>\$3,612.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
5	Willow Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$519.00</b>	<b>\$5,190.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$519.00</b>	<b>\$6,228.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA II</b>				<b>\$18,040.00</b>		NO BID		Non-Responsive		NO BID	

**SERVICE AREA III:**

Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
6	Big Lake Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$420.00</b>	<b>\$4,200.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$475.00</b>	<b>\$5,700.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
7	Houston High School and Houston Middle School Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$1,490.00</b>	<b>\$14,900.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	<b>\$14,400.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
8	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$575.00</b>	<b>\$5,750.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA III</b>				<b>\$52,150.00</b>		NO BID		Non-Responsive		NO BID	

**SERVICE AREA IV:**

Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
9	Dena'ina Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$650.00	\$6,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$550.00</b>	<b>\$5,500.00</b>
		Sanding	12	\$650.00	\$7,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>
10	Goose Bay Elementary and Knik Elementary School Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$1,490.00	\$14,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$1,800.00</b>	<b>\$18,000.00</b>
		Sanding	12	\$1,425.00	\$17,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>

<b>SERVICE AREA IV (Continued):</b>				Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
11	Redington Jr./Sr. High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$1,490.00	\$14,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$1,100.00</b>	<b>\$11,000.00</b>
		Sanding	12	\$1,200.00	\$14,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>
12	Snowshoe Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$600.00	\$6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$550.00</b>	<b>\$5,500.00</b>
		Sanding	12	\$600.00	\$7,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA IV</b>				\$88,800.00		NO BID		Non-Responsive		<b>\$60,400.00</b>	

<b>SERVICE AREA V:</b>				Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
13	Sutton Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$669.00</b>	<b>\$6,690.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$669.00</b>	<b>\$8,028.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA V</b>				<b>\$14,718.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

<b>SERVICE AREA VI:</b>				Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
14	Butte Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$891.00	\$8,910.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>
		Sanding	12	\$891.00	\$10,692.00	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	<b>\$300.00</b>	<b>\$3,600.00</b>
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VI</b>				\$19,602.00		NO BID		Non-Responsive		<b>\$9,600.00</b>	

<b>ADDITIVE ALTERNATE:</b>				Ficklin Construction		D&S Road Service		Spain Excavation		Sockeye Asphalt	
Bid Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Machetanz Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$899.00</b>	<b>\$8,990.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
		Sanding	12	<b>\$899.00</b>	<b>\$10,788.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL ADDITIVE ALTERNATE</b>				<b>\$19,778.00</b>		NO BID		Non-Responsive		NO BID	

**ADDITIONAL RATES:**

**SERVICE AREA I:**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
A	Talkeetna Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>	Non-Responsive	NO BID
		Loader (L)	\$105.00	<b>\$175.00</b>		
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$1,250.00	<b>\$300.00</b>		
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Loader (L)	\$105.00	<b>\$175.00</b>		
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		B	Trapper Creek Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>		
Grader (G)	\$105.00			<b>\$190.00</b>		
Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$175.00</b>		
Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$150.00</b>		
Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>\$190.00</b>		
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>\$150.00</b>		
<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$1,250.00			<b>\$450.00</b>		
<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>						
Grader (G)	\$105.00			<b>\$190.00</b>		
Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$175.00</b>		
Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$150.00</b>		
Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>\$190.00</b>		
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>\$150.00</b>		

**SERVICE AREA I (Continued):**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
	C Su Valley Jr./Sr. High School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>	Non-Responsive	NO BID
		Loader (L)	\$105.00	<b>\$175.00</b>		
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$2,500.00	<b>\$450.00</b>		
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Loader (L)	\$105.00	<b>\$175.00</b>		
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00	<b>\$190.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		

**SERVICE AREA II:**

	D Beryozova School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>	NO BID	Non-Responsive	
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	<b>\$1,000.00</b>			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			

**SERVICE AREA II (Continued):**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
E	Willow Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	NO BID	Non-Responsive	NO BID
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$2,000.00			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			

**SERVICE AREA III:**

F	Big Lake Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$850.00			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			

**SERVICE AREA III (Continued):**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
G	Houston High School and Houston Middle School Complex	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	NO BID	Non-Responsive	NO BID
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$2,550.00			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00					
H	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$1,275.00			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00					

**SERVICE AREA IV**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt	
I	Dena'ina Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	NO BID	Non-Responsive	<b>\$200.00</b>	
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$700.00				<b>\$500.00</b>
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00				<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>		
J	Goose Bay Elementary and Knik Elementary School Complex	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			<b>\$200.00</b>	
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$2,550.00				<b>\$1,100.00</b>
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00				<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>		



**SERVICE AREA IV (Continued):**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt	
K	Redington Jr./Sr. High School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	NO BID	Non-Responsive	<b>\$200.00</b>	
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$2,550.00				<b>\$750.00</b>
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00				<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>		
L	Snowshoe Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			<b>\$200.00</b>	
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$850.00				<b>\$500.00</b>
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>					
		Grader (G)	\$105.00				<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00				<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00				<b>N/A</b>		

**SERVICE AREA V**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
M	Sutton Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>					

**SERVICE AREA VI**

N	Butte Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00	NO BID	Non-Responsive	<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	\$1,200.00			<b>\$500.00</b>
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	\$105.00			<b>\$200.00</b>
		Loader (L)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$105.00			<b>\$120.00</b>
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$105.00			<b>N/A</b>		

**ADDITIVE ALTERNATE - ADDITIONAL RATES**

Bid Item No.	School Location		Ficklin Construction	D&S Road Service	Spain Excavation	Sockeye Asphalt
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>	NO BID	Non-Responsive	NO BID
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>	<b>\$950.00</b>			
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>				
		Grader (G)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Loader (L)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Dump Truck (DT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG))	<b>\$105.00</b>			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	<b>\$105.00</b>			

0 Machetanz Elementary School

**BASE BID**

**SERVICE AREA I:**

SERVICE AREA I:				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1.	Talkeetna Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$520.00	\$5,200.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$3,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$435.00	\$5,220.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
2.	Trapper Creek Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$550.00	\$5,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$3,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$460.00	\$5,520.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
3.	Su Valley Jr./Sr. High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$1,025.00	\$10,250.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$3,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$570.00	\$6,840.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA I</b>				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		<b>\$49,030.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

**SERVICE AREA II:**

SERVICE AREA II:				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4.	Beryozova School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$230.00	\$2,300.00	\$475.00	\$4,750.00		\$0.00	\$450.00	\$4,500.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00	\$150.00	\$1,500.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$230.00	\$2,760.00	\$375.00	\$4,500.00		\$0.00	\$299.00	\$3,588.00		\$0.00
5.	Willow Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$425.00	\$4,250.00	\$1,025.00	\$10,250.00		\$0.00	\$650.00	\$6,500.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$350.00	\$3,500.00		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,400.00	\$570.00	\$6,840.00		\$0.00	\$499.00	\$5,988.00		\$0.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA II</b>				NO BID		NO BID		<b>\$13,210.00</b>		\$29,840.00		NO BID		\$24,076.00		NO BID	

**SERVICE AREA III:**

SERVICE AREA III:				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
6.	Big Lake Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$450.00	\$4,500.00	\$320.00	\$3,200.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$75.00	\$750.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	\$200.00	\$2,400.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
7.	Houston Jr/Sr High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$1,400.00	\$14,000.00	\$900.00	\$9,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$75.00	\$750.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$425.00	\$5,100.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
8.	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00	\$515.00	\$5,150.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$75.00	\$750.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$6,000.00	\$250.00	\$3,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA III</b>				NO BID		\$52,300.00		<b>\$30,100.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

<b>SERVICE AREA IV:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
9.	Dena'ina Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00	<b>\$515.00</b>	<b>\$5,150.00</b>		\$0.00	\$800.00	\$8,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$250.00	\$3,000.00	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>\$2,700.00</b>		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$6,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
10.	Redington Jr./Sr. High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$980.00	\$9,800.00	<b>\$875.00</b>	<b>\$8,750.00</b>		\$0.00	\$1,800.00	\$18,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	<b>\$500.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>		\$0.00	\$1,200.00	\$14,400.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA IV</b>				NO BID		\$26,600.00		<b>\$24,100.00</b>		NO BID		\$56,400.00		NO BID		NO BID	

<b>SERVICE AREA V:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
11.	Goose Bay Elementary and Knik Elementary School Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$1,700.00	\$17,000.00	\$1,450.00	\$14,500.00	<b>\$1,100.00</b>	<b>\$11,000.00</b>		\$0.00	\$2,500.00	\$25,000.00		\$0.00	\$1,324.00	\$13,240.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10	\$300.00	\$3,000.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00		\$0.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00
		Sanding	12	\$500.00	\$6,000.00	\$500.00	\$6,000.00	<b>\$490.00</b>	<b>\$5,880.00</b>		\$0.00	\$1,200.00	\$14,400.00		\$0.00	\$624.00	\$7,488.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA V</b>				\$26,000.00		\$22,500.00		<b>\$17,630.00</b>		NO BID		\$44,400.00		NO BID		\$23,478.00	

<b>SERVICE AREA VI:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	\$195.00	Extended Price
12.	Snowshoe Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$475.00	\$4,750.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00	<b>\$515.00</b>	<b>\$5,150.00</b>		\$0.00	\$800.00	\$8,000.00		\$0.00	\$519.00	\$5,190.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10	\$150.00	\$1,500.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00		\$0.00	\$195.00	\$1,950.00
		Sanding	12	\$275.00	\$3,300.00	\$225.00	\$2,700.00	<b>\$225.00</b>	<b>\$2,700.00</b>		\$0.00	\$600.00	\$7,200.00		\$0.00	\$250.00	\$3,000.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VI</b>				\$9,550.00		\$9,700.00		<b>\$8,600.00</b>		NO BID		\$20,200.00		NO BID		\$10,140.00	

<b>SERVICE AREA VII:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
13.	Sutton Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	<b>\$529.00</b>	<b>\$5,290.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00		\$0.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00		\$0.00	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VII</b>				NO BID		NO BID		<b>\$9,040.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

<b>SERVICE AREA VIII:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
14.	Butte Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$470.00	\$4,700.00	<b>\$515.00</b>	<b>\$5,150.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$519.00	\$5,190.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$195.00	\$1,950.00
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$325.00	\$3,900.00	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$4,200.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VIII</b>				NO BID		\$10,600.00		<b>\$8,900.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		\$11,340.00	

<b>SERVICE AREA IX:</b>				Northland		Adams Inc.		Ficklin Construction		AK Resource Group		Sockeye Asphalt		Spain Excavating		Victory Ent Inc.	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
15.	Machetanz Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	\$825.00	\$8,250.00	\$750.00	\$7,500.00	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$824.00	\$8,240.00
		Sidewalk Snow Removal	10	\$375.00	\$3,750.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$195.00	\$1,950.00
		Sanding	12	\$775.00	\$9,300.00	\$600.00	\$7,200.00	<b>\$350.00</b>	<b>\$4,200.00</b>		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$400.00	\$4,800.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA IX</b>				\$21,300.00		\$16,700.00		<b>\$10,950.00</b>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		\$14,990.00	

**ADDITIONAL RATES:**

**SERVICE AREA I:**

Item No.	School Location		Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.
A.	Talkeetna Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)				\$175.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)				\$150.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)				\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)				\$150.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)				\$200.00			
		Loader (L)				\$175.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)				\$150.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)				\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)				\$150.00			
		B.	Trapper Creek Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
Grader (G)	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Loader (L)						\$175.00			
Dump Truck (DT)						\$150.00			
Belly Blade Grader (BG)						\$200.00			
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)						\$150.00			
<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>									
<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>									
Grader (G)						\$200.00			
Loader (L)						\$175.00			
Dump Truck (DT)						\$150.00			
Belly Blade Grader (BG)						\$200.00			
Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)						\$150.00			
C.	Su Valley Jr./Sr. High School			<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>					
		Grader (G)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)				\$175.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)				\$150.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)				\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)				\$150.00			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)				\$200.00			
		Loader (L)				\$175.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)				\$150.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)				\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)				\$150.00			

**SERVICE AREA II:**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.	
D.	Beryozova School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	NO BID	\$185.00	\$200.00	NO BID	\$140.00	NO BID
		Loader (L)			\$185.00	\$175.00		\$130.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00	\$150.00		\$125.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$145.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00	\$150.00		\$145.00	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
					\$600.00	\$325.00		\$999.00	
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$140.00	
		Loader (L)			\$185.00	\$175.00		\$130.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00	\$150.00		\$125.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$145.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00	\$150.00		\$145.00	
E.	Willow Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	NO BID	\$185.00	\$200.00	NO BID	\$140.00	NO BID
		Loader (L)			\$185.00	\$175.00		\$130.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00	\$150.00		\$125.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$145.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00	\$150.00		\$145.00	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
					\$600.00	\$525.00		\$1,999.00	
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$140.00	
		Loader (L)			\$185.00	\$175.00		\$130.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00	\$150.00		\$125.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00	\$200.00		\$145.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00	\$150.00		\$145.00	



**SERVICE AREA III:**

Item No.	School Location		Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.
F.	Big Lake Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
				\$850.00	<b>\$600.00</b>				
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
G.	Houston Jr./Sr. High School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
				\$2,550.00	<b>\$900.00</b>				
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
H.	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
				\$1,275.00	<b>\$600.00</b>				
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				

**SERVICE AREA IV**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.		
I.	Dena'ina Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>								
		Grader (G)	NO BID	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>			\$500.00	<b>\$600.00</b>		\$1,000.00		
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>								
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
J.	Redington Jr./Sr. High School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>								
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00	NO BID	NO BID	
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>			\$750.00	<b>\$1,000.00</b>		\$1,500.00		
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>								
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			

**SERVICE AREA V:**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.		
K.	Goose Bay Elementary and Knik Elementary School Complex	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	\$195.00	
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00		\$115.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00		\$120.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A		N/A	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A		N/A	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>		\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00	<b>\$1,000.00</b>		\$1,800.00		\$1,295.00
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			

**SERVICE AREA VI:**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.		
L.	Snowshoe Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	\$200.00	NO BID	\$195.00	
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00		\$115.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00		\$120.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A		N/A	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A		N/A	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>		\$500.00	\$500.00	<b>\$600.00</b>		\$1,000.00		\$645.00
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			\$195.00
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>		\$200.00			\$115.00
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>		\$200.00			\$120.00
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			N/A
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>		N/A			N/A

**SERVICE AREA VII**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.	
M.	Sutton Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	NO BID	\$185.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		Loader (L)			\$185.00				
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00				
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)			\$185.00				
		Loader (L)			\$185.00				
		Dump Truck (DT)			\$150.00				
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)			\$185.00				
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)			\$185.00				

**SERVICE AREA VIII**

Item No.	School Location	Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.	
N.	Butte Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>							
		Grader (G)	NO BID	\$180.00	\$185.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$195.00
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	\$185.00				\$115.00
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	\$150.00				\$120.00
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	\$185.00				N/A
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	\$185.00				N/A
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>							
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>							
		Grader (G)		\$180.00	\$185.00				\$195.00
		Loader (L)		\$115.00	\$185.00				\$115.00
		Dump Truck (DT)		\$115.00	\$150.00				\$120.00
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)		N/A	\$185.00				N/A
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)		N/A	\$185.00				N/A

**SERVICE AREA IX**

Item No.	School Location		Northland	Adams Inc.	Ficklin Construction	AK Resource Group	Sockeye Asphalt	Spain Excavating	Victory Ent Inc.	
O.	Machetanz Elementary School	<b>Spring Clean-up \$/hour to remove snow</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$195.00	
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				\$115.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				\$120.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				N/A	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				N/A	
		<b>Spring Clean-up \$/occurrence for sweeping</b>		\$975.00	\$950.00	<b>\$800.00</b>				\$850.00
		<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>								
		Grader (G)	N/A	\$180.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				\$195.00	
		Loader (L)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$185.00</b>				\$115.00	
		Dump Truck (DT)	\$115.00	\$115.00	<b>\$150.00</b>				\$120.00	
		Belly Blade Grader (BG)	N/A	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				N/A	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck (BT)	\$115.00	N/A	<b>\$185.00</b>				N/A	

**BASE BID**

<b>SERVICE AREA I:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
1.	Talkeetna Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$950.00</b>	<b>\$9,500.00</b>		\$0.00		
		Sanding	12	<b>\$450.00</b>	<b>\$5,400.00</b>		\$0.00		
2.	Trapper Creek Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$1,000.00</b>	<b>\$10,000.00</b>		\$0.00		
		Sanding	12	<b>\$515.00</b>	<b>\$6,180.00</b>		\$0.00		
3.	Su Valley Jr./Sr. High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$1,450.00</b>	<b>\$14,500.00</b>		\$0.00		
		Sanding	12	<b>\$625.00</b>	<b>\$7,500.00</b>		\$0.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA I</b>				<b>\$53,080.00</b>		No Bid		Non-Responsive	

<b>SERVICE AREA II:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
4.	Willow Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10	<b>\$1,050.00</b>	<b>\$10,500.00</b>	\$1,029.00	\$10,290.00		
		Sanding	12	<b>\$450.00</b>	<b>\$5,400.00</b>	\$475.00	\$5,700.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA II</b>				<b>\$15,900.00</b>		\$15,990.00		Non-Responsive	

<b>SERVICE AREA III:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
5.	Big Lake Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>\$4,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$290.00</b>	<b>\$3,480.00</b>		
6.	Houston Jr/Sr High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$950.00</b>	<b>\$9,500.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>		
7.	HMS/HHS Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$6,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>\$4,800.00</b>		
8.	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$550.00</b>	<b>\$5,500.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA III</b>				No Bid		<b>\$43,480.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA IV:**

<b>SERVICE AREA IV:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
9.	Dena'ina Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$550.00</b>	<b>\$5,500.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>\$3,000.00</b>		
10.	Redington Jr/Sr High School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$900.00</b>	<b>\$9,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>\$9,600.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA IV</b>				No Bid		<b>\$27,100.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA V:**

<b>SERVICE AREA V:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
11.	GBE and KNE School Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$1,250.00</b>	<b>\$12,500.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>\$9,600.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA V</b>				No Bid		<b>\$22,100.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA VI:**

<b>SERVICE AREA VI:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
12.	Snowshoe Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$700.00</b>	<b>\$7,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$340.00</b>	<b>\$4,080.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VI</b>				No Bid		<b>\$11,080.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA VII:**

<b>SERVICE AREA VII:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
13.	Sutton Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$1,100.00</b>	<b>\$11,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$490.00</b>	<b>\$5,880.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VII</b>				No Bid		<b>\$16,880.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA VIII:**

<b>SERVICE AREA VIII:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
14.	Butte Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$900.00</b>	<b>\$9,000.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$600.00</b>	<b>\$7,200.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA VIII</b>				No Bid		<b>\$16,200.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA IX:**

<b>SERVICE AREA IX:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
15.	Machetanz Elementary School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	<b>\$840.00</b>	<b>\$8,400.00</b>		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	<b>\$850.00</b>	<b>\$10,200.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA IX</b>				No Bid		<b>\$18,600.00</b>		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA X:**

<b>SERVICE AREA X:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
Item No.	School Location	Bid Item	Est. Qty.*	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
16.	Warehouse/NS Complex	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$1,700.00	\$17,000.00		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$650.00	\$7,800.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA X</b>				No Bid		\$24,800.00		Non-Responsive	



**SERVICE AREA XI:**

<b>SERVICE AREA XI:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
17.	Fronteras Spanish Immersion Charter	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$550.00	\$5,500.00		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$4,200.00		
18.	Admin Annex West	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$475.00	\$4,750.00		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$4,200.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA XI</b>				No Bid		\$18,650.00		Non-Responsive	

**SERVICE AREA XII:**

<b>SERVICE AREA XII:</b>				D&S Road Service		Ficklin Construction		Denali Snowplowing	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Bid Item</b>	<b>Est. Qty.*</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
19.	Birchtree Charter School	Snow and Ice Removal	10		\$0.00	\$850.00	\$8,500.00		
		Sanding	12		\$0.00	\$350.00	\$4,200.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID - SERVICE AREA XII</b>				No Bid		\$12,700.00		Non-Responsive	

**ADDITIONAL RATES:**

**SERVICE AREA I:**

<b>Item No.</b>	<b>School Location</b>	<b>Hourly Equipment Rates</b>	<b>D&amp;S Road Service</b>	<b>Ficklin Construction</b>	<b>Denali Snowplowing</b>
A.	Talkeetna Elementary School	Grader	<b>\$250.00</b>	No Bid	Non-Responsive
		Loader	<b>\$350.00</b>		
		Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grade	<b>\$250.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Pickup Truck	<b>\$110.00</b>		
		Sweeper Truck	<b>\$195.00</b>		
B.	Trapper Creek Elementary School	Grader	<b>\$250.00</b>		
		Loader	<b>\$350.00</b>		
		Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grade	<b>\$250.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Pickup Truck	<b>\$110.00</b>		
		Sweeper Truck	<b>\$195.00</b>		
C.	Su-Valley Jr/Sr High School	Grader	<b>\$250.00</b>		
		Loader	<b>\$350.00</b>		
		Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Grade	<b>\$250.00</b>		
		Belly Blade Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>		
		Pickup Truck	<b>\$110.00</b>		
		Sweeper Truck	<b>\$195.00</b>		

**SERVICE AREA II:**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
D.	Willow Elementary School	Grader	<b>\$250.00</b>	\$325.00	Non-Responsive
		Loader	<b>\$350.00</b>	\$325.00	
		Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>	\$185.00	
		Belly Blade Grade	<b>\$250.00</b>	\$325.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck	<b>\$225.00</b>	\$325.00	
		Pickup Truck	<b>\$110.00</b>	\$185.00	
		Sweeper Truck	<b>\$195.00</b>	\$200.00	

**SERVICE AREA III:**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
E.	Big Lake Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	
F.	Houston Jr./Sr. High School and HMS and HHS Complex	Grader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	
G.	Meadow Lakes Elementary School	Grader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA IV**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
H.	Dena'ina Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	
I.	Redington Jr./Sr. High School	Grader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA V:**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
J.	Goose Bay Elementary and Knik Elementary School Complex	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA VI:**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
K.	Snowshoe Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA VII**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
L.	Sutton Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA VIII**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
M.	Butte Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA IX**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
N.	Machetanz Elementary School	Grader	No Bid	<b>\$325.00</b>	Non-Responsive
		Loader		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Dump Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Grade		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		<b>\$325.00</b>	
		Pickup Truck		<b>\$185.00</b>	
		Sweeper Truck		<b>\$200.00</b>	

**SERVICE AREA X**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
O.	Warehouse/NS Complex	Grader	No Bid	\$325.00	Non-Responsive
		Loader		\$325.00	
		Dump Truck		\$185.00	
		Belly Blade Grade		\$325.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		\$325.00	
		Pickup Truck		\$185.00	
		Sweeper Truck		\$200.00	

**SERVICE AREA XI**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
P.	Fronteras Spanish Immersion Charter School	Grader	No Bid	\$325.00	Non-Responsive
		Loader		\$325.00	
		Dump Truck		\$185.00	
		Belly Blade Grade		\$325.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		\$325.00	
		Pickup Truck		\$185.00	
		Sweeper Truck		\$200.00	
Q.	Admin Annex West	Grader		\$325.00	
		Loader		\$325.00	
		Dump Truck		\$185.00	
		Belly Blade Grade		\$325.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		\$325.00	
		Pickup Truck		\$185.00	
		Sweeper Truck		\$200.00	

**SERVICE AREA XII**

Item No.	School Location	Hourly Equipment Rates	D&S Road Service	Ficklin Construction	Denali Snowplowing
R.	Birchtree Charter School	Grader	No Bid	\$325.00	Non-Responsive
		Loader		\$325.00	
		Dump Truck		\$185.00	
		Belly Blade Grade		\$325.00	
		Belly Blade Dump Truck		\$325.00	
		Pickup Truck		\$185.00	
		Sweeper Truck		\$200.00	