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At MWHS, school spirit goes beyond the field, and last
Friday’s football game against Morro Bay was a shining
example of what happens when our teams, clubs, and
administration unite for a common goal—creating an
atmosphere that radiates energy and pride.

ASB led the charge with their innovative "Maroon March,"
a pre-game rally that brought together students, staff, and
fans in a spirited procession from Conyer Avenue to the
Mineral King Bowl. The streets were filled with maroon as
students proudly displayed MWHS tattoos, face paint, and
school gear, creating an electric environment before they
even reached the stadium (Cont. Pg 2)



(Cont.) Cheer and Dance played a crucial role in this lively
march, leading the way with chants and routines that set
the tone for the evening. Their enthusiasm was contagious,
building excitement and anticipation as the crowd gathered,
ready to support the Varsity team.

Once inside the stadium, the collaboration didn’t stop.
While our Varsity boys dominated the game, quickly
establishing a commanding lead over Morro Bay, the real
magic was happening in the stands. ASB, Cheer, Dance, and
Band worked seamlessly together, keeping the crowd
engaged, entertained, and on their feet. Whether it was the
spirited cheers, the thrilling halftime performances, or the
steady rhythm of the band, the energy never waned.

Thanks to the coordination between our head football
coach, the dedicated cheer and dance teams, ASB, band,
and the administration, the game was not only a win on the
scoreboard but a victory in school spirit. This level of
teamwork highlights what MWHS does best—creating a
sense of unity and pride that extends far beyond the game
itself.
It was more than just a football game; it was a celebration of
everything that makes MWHS a community.
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Senior Pioneer Angelique Alfaro

attended our first game and shared

her excitement about the

experience:

"Last year, the games weren't that

exciting. We were lacking school

spirit, and no one would dress up for

the themes because they told us

about them too late. 

This year, the music was exciting,

everyone was dressed up, and I

literally lost my voice from

cheering! A lot of my friends came

this time, and we’ll be at every home

game."

Already pumped for the Red, White,

and Blue theme, Angelique

expressed her appreciation for

MWHS administration mailing out

the home game themes during the

summer, giving students time to

prepare. She mentioned how she

was able to plan her outfits in

advance for the season.

Looking back, Angelique regrets not

attending games when she was an

underclassman. Her message to all

Pioneers: "We’re only in high school

once—go to every game and connect

with everyone in the student

section. Let’s make other schools

jealous of our school spirit!"

SEE YOU THIS FRIDAYSEE YOU THIS FRIDAYSEE YOU THIS FRIDAY


