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AGENDA

The Campbell County Board of Education will meet in regular session on Tuesday, March 12,
2024, 6:00 p.m., at the courthouse in Jacksboro, Tennessee.

Prayer.
Pledge of Allegiance.

L Roll Call and Call to Order

II. Recognition of Guest
Issac Jones — CCHS CTE student

Amelia Hatmaker — JHS CTE student

IIl.  Public Comment (Agenda Items Only, Max 2 speakers/Viewpoint & Max 3
Minutes/Speaker)

Iv. Consent Agenda

A. Minutes of the previous meetings. (Attachments)
1. February 13, 2024, regular session meeting.
2. February 20, 2024, building/athletic committee meetings.
3. February 20, 2024, special called meeting.

B. Approve Campbell County High School Softball Team to travel to Pigeon Forge, TN
for softball games on April 12, 2024, through April 14, 2024.

C. Approve Campbell County High School FBLA to attend state conference in
Chattanooga, TN on April 7, 2024, through April 10, 2024.

D. Dilapidated items: CCHS cafeteria — 16 booths, 9 round tables, 1 square table, 46
rectangle tables, and 314 chairs. These items cannot be declared as surplus.

V. Approval of Regular Agenda



VL Comments from the Chair

VII. Director’s Monthly Report

VIII. Legislative Report

IX. Recognize Jeff Marlow. Director of Finance

A. Monthly Financials. (Attachment)

B. Approve Budget Amendments and Resolutions. (Item will be sent under separate
cover)

C. Reviewing of Bids. (Attachment)
1. E-Rate Mini Bid Internal Connections

D. Request permission to advertise Bids.

1. Painting of gymnasium, concession stand, hallway to concession stand,
and locker rooms at Wynn Elementary School.

2. Painting of gymnasium, corridor to hallway, girls, and boy’s locker
rooms at LaFollette Middle School.

E. Request permission to accept renewal of contracts. (Attachments)
T&T Produce/Produce Products
Mayfield Dairy Farms/Milk/Milk Products
Cox’s Septic Services/Septic Services
Institutional Wholesale/Food/Non-food/Smallwares
X. Iterns for Action:

A. Consider naming gymnasium floor at White Oak Elementary School the Angie Baird
floor.

B. Consider proper notice to extend the Director of Schools contract at the April 4,
2024, regular session meeting.

XI.  Items for Discussion: Nothing at this time.

XII.  Discuss Legal Maljters: |



XIII. Recopnize School Board Members:

irector of Schools




MINUTES
The Campbell County Board of Education met in regular session on Tuesday, February 13,
2024, 5:00 p.m., at the courthouse in Jacksboro, Tennessee. The following school board
members were present; Chairman Steve Morgan, Johnny Byrge, Crystal Creekmore,
Lisa Fields, Randy Heatherly, Josh James, Ronnie Lasley, Brent Lester, Jeffery Miller, and
Sharon Ridenour.
Prayer by Lisa Fields.
Pledge of Allegiance led by Ronnie Lasley.
L Roll Call and Call to Order
1L Recognition of Guest

II.  Public Comment (Agenda Items Only, Max 2 speakers/Viewpoint & Max 3
Minutes/Speaker)

V. Consent Agenda

A. Minutes of the previous meetings.
1. January 8, 2024, athletic commitiee meeting.
2. January 9, 2024, regular session meeting.

B. Executive Actions. (Attachment)
1. Approve CCHS Advanced Choir to attend Lee University Honor Choir at Lee
University in Cleveland, TN on February 8, 2024, through February 10, 2024,

C. Approve Campbell County High School FFA grades 9-12 to travel to Gatlinburg,
TN for FFA State Convention on March 24, 2024, through March 27, 2024.

Motion by Byrge, second by Ridenour to approve the Consent Agenda,
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

V. Approval of Regular Agenda

Motion by Ridenour, second by Creekmore to approve the Regular Agenda with the deletion of
name Dana Early on item X-C.

Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.
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VL Comments from the Chair

Chairman Morgan thanked board member Ridenour for filling in as Chatr during his absence of
last month’s meeting.

Board member Byrge asked Director Fields for an update on the new entrance at Jacksboro
Elementary. Director Fields stated nothing new has developed and is waiting on the expansion

program.

VII. Director’s Monthly Report

Director Fields informed the board of the following:

Fencing projects at Jellico Elementary School and Jellico High School are now finished. Jellico
Utilities is currently working on extending electricity from Sunset Trail to the welding shop at
Jellico High School. MBI is finalizing drawings for the welding project, preparing for the
bidding phase. The Lewis Group has updated the final specifications for the Jacksboro
Elementary School gym and cafeteria expansion. Orders for gym bleachers at White Qak
Elementary and Jacksboro Middle School were placed but the supplier has closed; arrangements
are being made to order from Toadvine. Savings from roofing project rebidding have enabled
additional purchases: School security enhancements are underway per Homeland Security
recommendations, including adding cameras at all school sites and on buses. Following ESSER
guidelines, additional tables will be purchased to maintain the districts one-to-one device ratio,
accommodating enrollment growth and providing replacements. Campbell County High School
cafeteria renovation is set to begin on April 25", with completion expected by April 27,
Installation of cameras has been successfully finished at JHS, Jellico elementary and LES.
Training sessions for School Resource Officers (SROs) on camera usage are set for March 6%,
The removal of old cabling at CCHS has been completed. All ongoing technology projects
have been successfully finished. Working on writing a $10,000.00 grant for our annual Anti-
tobacco Health Fair on May 16"™. Working on getting telehealth in the Jellico Schools for the
upcoming 2024-2025 school year. Working on Dayspring Health to administer free sports
physicals for Jellico High School, Jellico Elementary, Elk Valley, Wynn, and White Oak
athletes on May 14™ at JHS and JES. Director Fields welcomed new board attorney, Chris
McCarty.

VIII. Legislative Report

Board Chairman Morgan stated he appreciated Director Fields defending the voucher program
Chairman Morgan stated he was opposed to the voucher program. Board member Fields stated
Director Fields did an excellent job defending our schools on vouchers.
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IX.  Recognize Jeff Marlow, Director of Finance

A. Monthly Financials.
141General Purpose School Fund. Balance Sheet as of December 31, 2023.
Cash with Trustee - $14,896,183.94
Total Revenues - $27,098,390.53
Percent of Budget — 51.4%
Total Expenditures - $25,047,477.71
Percent of Budget — 44.6%

142 School Federal Project Fund. Balance Sheet as of December 31, 2023.
Cash with Trustee - $1,837.244.57

Total Revenues - $3,968,411.90

Percent of Budget — 35.4%

Total Expenditures - $3,968,411.90

Percent of Budget — 35.4%

143Central Cafeteria Fund. Balance Sheet as of December 31, 2023
Cash with Trustee - $3,937,436.40

Total Revenues - $2,380,435.48

Percent of Budget — 48.9%

Total Expenditures - $2,410,420.18

Percent of Budget - 45.2%

Karen Henegar gave a detailed summary of the December 31, 2023, Monthly Financial Reports,
and request if there were no questions they be approved at this time.

Motion by Byrge, second by Fields to approve the December 31, 2023, Monthly Financial
Reports.

Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

B. Approve Budget Amendments and Resolutions.

A total of 5 February 2024, Budget amendments and resolutions were voted on and approved
separately.
2-1:

The Campbell County Director of Schools has reviewed the amendment(s) described herein and hereby
recommends approval of same by the Campbell County Board of Education, and:

the actual flu vaccine program costs were less than anticipated with funds being returned to the
LaFollette Medical Foundation and appropriations being reduced accordingly.
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Motion by Ridenour, second by Heatherly to approve Budget Amendment 2-1.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

2-2

The Campbell County Director of Schools has reviewed the amendment(s) described herein and hereby
recommends approval of same by the Campbell County Board of Education, and;

the school system has received insurance recovery proceeds relative to water damages to the CCHS
baseball equipment and uniforms and these funds are being appropriated for use in conjunction with
realignment between accounts to provide for deductible costs to enable the replacement of the items.

Motion by Byrge, second by Fields to approve Budget Amendment 2-2.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

2-3

The Campbell County Director of Schools has reviewed the amendment(s) described herein and hereby
recommends approval of same by the Campbell County Board of Education, and;

the vendor awarded the bleacher projects at the Jacksboro Middie and White Oak Elementary schools is
no longer in business due to health issues and the prior year purchase orders were voided with
$144,100 (consisting of $107,000 for JMS and $37,100 White Oak) closing to the equity account and
these funds are being reappropriated for these projects, and; another vendor (Toadvine) has provided
present cost estimates for the projects through the TIPS consortium with the Jacksboro Middle project
estimated at $134,005 and White Oak at $55,589 which is greater than the prior year amounts and
additional funds are being realigned from the school roof projects to provide for the increased costs for
the bleacher projects.

Motion by Byrge, second by Heatherly to approve Budget Amendment 2-3
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-ves,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

2-4

The Campbeil County Director of Schools has reviewed the amendment(s) described hersin and hereby
recemmends approval of same by the Campbell County Board of Education, and; at their January
meeting the Board allocated a total of $1,700,000 for totai project costs, inclusive of architect

and other costs, for a multi-sports complex at Campbell County High School (identified by cost center
CCO1W) and $300,000 for total project costs for fieldhouse renovations and upgrades at Jellico High
School (identified by cost center CC09K), and; debt service funds of $2,000,000 were set aside for future
debt service needs with $64,000 of these appropriations previously realigned for transportation contract
increases with remaining funds being realigned for the above identified projects in conjunction with
realignment of existing capital outlay program funds.

Motion by Byrge, second by James to approve Budget Amendment 2-4
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.
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2-5

The Campbell County Director of Schools has reviewed the amendment(s) described herein and hereby
recommends approval of same by the Campbell County Board of Education, and;

the State has awarded an additional grant allocation under the USDA's Supply Chain Assistance
program {no local match) to assist Food Service operations in meeting supply chain issues and cost
increases with funds to be used to Buy American minimally processed foods, and;

the State Consultant previously recommended the funds to be used primarily toward milk purchases to
make tracking easier and fully in compliance with the grant, and, Food Service will manage the program
and maintain a spreadsheet to track the purchases by school site in case that information is needed.

Motion by Ridenour, second by Fields to approve Budget Amendment 2-5
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

Board member Millers asked Director Fields how many proposals she received on the sports
complex. Director Fields responded 2. Board member Miller asked if Director Fields was
aware of any other proposals. Director Fields stated Jay Henderlight there was one, but he
could not remember who made the request, but it was done at no charge. Stan Marlow reached
out for the 1.7 million. In June there was a commiitee meeting, and one was discussed for 2.5
to 3 million dollars which was not approved. Board member Miller stated 3 proposals have
been brought before the board. Board member James stated a person in the community had
built one for less and he would not vote to support MBI. Board member Byrge stated 10 to 12
years ago the board had same problem to build the Alternative School. The board used CCHS
building Trades class and in the end had $400,000 to $500,000 in the building. Our kids at
CCHS need a weightroom. Chairman Morgan asked if the board member to identify an
architect. Board member Byrge stated we have local people to do architect and contracts.
Board member James stated he was in a favor of a new building at CCHS, and constituents are
in favor also. Attorney McCarty stated he has reviewed the minutes from previous meetings
and no motion or vote was made to approve the repairs. An architect has to be chosen and will
put together a bid packet. Chairman Morgan stated the board could hold a special called
meeting and do a budget amendment. Director Fields recommended holding a joint building
and athletic committee meeting. Attorney McCarty added to do architect hiring before the
meeting.

Board member Fields asked for an explanation if it’s a multi-sports complex how can it happen
if it has turf. Board member Byrge recommended to change it to multi-purpose. Board member
Fields asked if everyone could use the weightroom. Board member Heatherly recommended to
build as large as they could and has spoken to principal Foust and Athletic Director Brad
Collette to make sure everyone could use, and all sports have a schedule.
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C. Reviewing of Bids.
1. Caryville Elementary Roof Replacement.
Dixie Roofing - $803,800.00 Standard Adhered
Ridge Roofing - $820,000.00 Self-Adhered
Genesis Roofing - $875,000.00 Self-Adhered
Eskola Roofing — No Bid
Morristown Roofing — No Bid

Recommendation to award lowest and best bid to meet specifications to Dixie Roofing. This is
also the recommendation of Roof Management and the Director of Schools, Jennifer Fields.
Motion by Byrge, second by Creekmore to approve Caryville Elementary Roof Replacement.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

2. Latbollette Elementary Roof Replacement. This item was voted and approve
on first.

Dixie Roofing - $$932,240.00 Standard Adhered

Genesis Roofing - $1,019,000 Standard Adhered

Eskola Roofing - No Bid

Ridge Roofing — No Bid

Morristown Roofing — No Bid

Recommendation to award lowest and best bid to meet specifications. This is also the
recommendation of Roof Management and the Director of Schools, Jennifer Fields.

Motion by Byrge, second by Heatherly to approve LaFollette Elementary Roof Replacement.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,
Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

D, Request permission to advertise Bids.

School Nutrition Program

1. Hood Systems/Fire Extinguishers

2. Pest Control

3. Ice Cream

4. Commodity Processing

Technology Department

1. Mini bids for E-rate (MIBS) managed internet broadband services

2. E-rate internal connections for labs and outdoor Wi-Fi
Motion by Creekmore, second by Fields to approve advertisement of bids for
School Nutrition and Technology Departments.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-
yes, Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.
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E.

Request permission to accept renewal of contracts. Nothing at this time.

X. Items for Action:

A,

Motion by

Consider approving purchase of modular classroom for STEM lab at Elk Valley
Elementary School.

Motion by Byrge, second by Fields to approve purchase of modular classroom for
STEM lab at Elk Valley Elementary School.

Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes,
Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

Consider approving new gymnasium floor and a design of a new pump system in
gym storage room at Jellico Elementary to also include new gymnasium bleachers at
Jellico Elementary School.

Board member Byrge asked if it was ever determined where the damage came from.
Stan Marlow stated the pump in the gym had malfunctioned due to a power outage
and did not kick back on.

Motion by Creekmore, second by Miller to approve new gymnasium floor and a
design of a new pump system in gym storage room at Jellico Elementary to also
include new gymnasium bleachers at Jellico Elementary School.

Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creckmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes,
Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

Consider approving the 2023-2024 Tenure list.

CCHS - Emie Clawson, Brandon Clawson

Jacksboro Elementary — Candace Anderson, Rhonda Cross, Jillian Johnson

Jellico Elementary — Hiroko Day

Jellico High School - Rebecca Carender, Lindsey Carroll, Roy Napier, Chad Seibers
Valley View Elementary — Abby Baird, Kaitlin Sowder

LaFollette Middle School — Martha Meredith

LaFollette Elementary School — Kelsey Chapman

Creekmore, second by Fields to approve the 2023-2024 Tenure List with the deletion

of Dana Early.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creckmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes, Lasley-yes,

Lester-yes,

Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

X1, Items for Discussion: Nothing at this time.
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XII.  Discuss Legal Matters:

XIII.  Recognize School Board Members:

Board member Miller stated field house at LaFollette Middle School needed to be addressed.
Board member Miller also Valley View Elementary and others on obtaining tenure and was
please on the savings on the roof bid of $800,000.00. Board member Lasley stated the
LaFollette Middle School field house needs to happen. Board member Lasley stated he did not
appreciate being accused and the show that was put on the month before and took offense to it.
He stated he has never been accused of not caring about kids. Board member Creekmore
thanked board member Miller for his hard work and last month was accused by a county
commissioner for not caring for the kids. Personal attacks need to stop board member
Creekmore added. Board member Ridenour thanked Director Fields on her presentation
regarding vouchers. Board member Byrge thanked Director Fields for representing our system
and congratulated all teachers who obtained tenure.

Steve Morgan Jennifer Fields
Chairman of the Board Director of Schools



MINUTES

The Campbell County Board of Education building and athletic committee met in a
Joint session on Tuesday, February 20, 2024, 3:30 p.m., in the lower-level
conference room of the Central Office. The following school board members were
present: Chairman Steve Morgan, Johnny Byrge, Crystal Creekmore, Lisa Fields,
Randy Heatherly, Josh James, Ronnie Lasley, Brent Lester, Jeffrey Miller, and
Sharon Ridenour.

L Approve Agenda.
Motion by Morgan, second by Fields to approve the agenda.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes,
Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

Il Discuss/Recommend Repairing CCHS Weightroom Building.

Building chairman Miller stated he would like to put this issue to rest. Comments
were made in previous meetings where the funds would come from. Board
member Miller initially thought Undesignated Fund Balance but after a discussion
with Mr. Jeff Marlow, an email from Mr. Marlow identified funding. A total of
$550,000 is available. Mr. Walsh with MBI was introduced. Mr. Walsh informed
he inherited the project from Jay Henderlight who has retired. Full removal of half
of the building and removal of foundation in the original project was estimated to
be $400,000 to $500,000 to complete the project. This price is still in ballpark
figure. Chairman Morgan asked what this facility would be used for. Mr. Foust
stated storage, other sports, and prioritizing other needs. Director Fields asked
where the funds were identified. Board member Miller stated there were no
ESSER funds involved.

Board member Byrge stated the building had been there for 30 years and there
were no problems until the rock quarry. Stan Marlow stated it had been monitored
due to the quarry at the end of the football field. Stan Marlow also stated it was
found a year and a half ago of the damage of the weightroom. Board member
Lester stated at one time there were drain issues on the football field. Director
Fields stated she was in complete support and a facility to add to if needed. Board
member James asked if it would be more cost savings to rear down and start from
scratch. Board member Heatherly stated it would be a great idea to have extra
space, but the price seems high. Chairman Morgan stated Jellico needed turf and
also a design was needed to meet the budget.
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Motion by Lasley, second by Creekmore to move forward with the current project
of repair of weightroom at Campbell County High School.

Morgan-yes, Byrge-no, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-no, James-no
Lasley-yes, Lester-no, Miller-yes, Ridenour-no. Motion Failed.

Board member Heatherly stated for record the reason of his no vote was due to the
wording.

IlI.  Discuss/Recommend plans and hiring of Architect for Campbell County
new multi-sports complex.,

Athletic Director Brad Collette addressed the board regarding the complex, Mr.
Collette stated they had hoped for dimensions of 235 long and 150 wide. Mr.
Collette stated they were not ready to hire an architect at this time. They are
undecided on what they want and request the board give them more time to work
on this project and to be patient with them. Their plan is to start by summer.
Chairman Morgan asked if this was a multi-purpose facility. Mr. Collette stated
yes and the projected time to have more information to the board would be in
April. They are getting things donated which will be a savings factor. Board
member Byrge stated he appreciated the work that is going into this project.

Motion by Lasley, second by Creekmore to adjourn.

Meeting adjourned.
Jeffrey Miller Jennifer Fields
Building Committee Chairman Director of Schools

Ronnie Lasley
Athletic Committee Chairman



MINUTES

The Campbell County Board of Education met in a Special Called meeting on
Tuesday, February 20, 2024, 4:30 p.m., in the lower-level conference room of the
Central Office. The following school board members were present: Chairman
Steve Morgan, Johnny Byrge, Crystal Creekmore, Lisa Fields, Randy Heatherly,
Josh James, Ronnie Lasley, Brent Lester, Jeffrey Miller, and Sharon Ridenour,

L. Roll Call.

II.  Approve Agenda.
Motion by Ridenour, second by Fields to approve the agenda.
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes,
Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

IIl.  Review and consider approving bid document from Lewis Group
Architecture for the Jacksboro Elementary gymnasium and cafeteria
expansion.

Chairman Morgan stated the board had received and email regarding the project
manual which consisted of over 400 pages from the Lewis Group Architectural
firm for the boards review. Director Fields had a sample board of color schemes
for the board to also review. Chairman Morgan asked how long it would take to
complete the project. Bord member James stated it was originally said between 18
months and 2 years. Chairman Morgan stated this has been a need for a very long
time.

Motion by Morgan, second by Miller to approve bid document from Lewis Group
Architecture for the Jacksboro Elementary gymnasium and cafeteria expansion,
Morgan-yes, Byrge-yes, Creekmore-yes, Fields-yes, Heatherly-yes, James-yes,
Lasley-yes, Lester-yes, Miller-yes, Ridenour-yes. Motion Passed.

Motion by Ridenour, second by Lasley to adjourn.

Meeting adjourned.

Steve Morgan Jennifer Fields
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JOHNNY BYRGE CAMPBELL COU NTY RANDY HEATHERLY

1005 Rose Hill Drive 145 Dogwood Lare
LaFdiete, TN 37766 Jacksbora, TN 37757

g o HBoard of Edbucation s

140 Mourtain View Rd.
LaFolette, TN 37766 Jacksboro, TN 37757

1048 Doorteld way 172 Valiey Street 102 Brocn G Rt
aFolet, TH 37768 Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757 Caryville, TN 37714
JEFFREY MILLER Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562 CRYSTAL CREEKMORE

209 Glade Springs Road

112 Old Standard Hollow Road
LaFollette, TN 37768

Newcomb, TN 37818

BRENT LESTER ’ Jennifer Fields STEVE MORGAN-CHAIR
i 118 Whistle Creek Road
a0 L Director of Schools Noweant, T
To: Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schools

Ms. Lisa Bowlin, Deputy Director/Purchasing Agent
From: Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor
Date: March 12, 2023
Re: Contract renewals for food service vendors

I request the contract for Institutional Wholesale, to be renewed as per bid for the 2024-2025 school
term. As per attached sheet, the company agrees to the renewal.

i recommend this renewal as advantageous to the system and the program’s operation. This renewal
meets the conditions of the bid contract.

Mrs. Jennifer Fieids, Director of Schools Date

Mr. Jeff Mariow, Director of Finances Date

Mr. Steve Morgan, Board Chairman Date
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CAMPBELL COUNTY

RANOY MEATHER
1405 R, o 5 Dogcos tar
LaFdinte, TN 37785 ’ Jachshore, TN 37757
SHARON REENCUR.CO.CHAR ﬁnaﬂ] of QEI‘[[][HI’U]]‘[ £ s
LaFoliete, TN;’;"I;u Jacksboro, TN 37757
%A FELDS 172 Valley Street 1D B o
Lo, T 77 Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757 Caryville, TN 37714
mmmw Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562 1 g&g‘rﬁm«:ﬁ
LaFclletia, TN 31785 Newcomb, TN 27319
BRENT LESTER Jennifer Fields STEVE MORGAN-CHAR
Lotena, o oot Director of Schools e, e
February 3, 2024

Institutional Wholesale Co, INC

535 Dry Valiey Road

Cookeville, TN 385086

Dear Sir:

The Campbe!l County Board of Education will be asked to approve the renewal of the
Food/Non-Food/Smallware’s/Chemicals bid with Institutional Wholesale for the 2024-2025 school term,
at the regular meeting on Tuesday March 12, 2024, at 6:00 p.m. at the Campbell County Courthouse.

If this is agreeable to your company, please sign this form and return to Jamie Gillum by 2:00 p.m.
March 8, 2024.

Enclosed is an approved calendar for the 2024-2025 school term.

Sincerely,

Jamie Giilum, School Nutrition Supervisor
Campbell County School System

Company Name:Institutional Wholesale Co., Inc. Signature:mm Mm
1

Company Address:_535 Dry Valley Road Title;__Contract Sales Manager

Cookeville, TN 38506 Date: March 8, 2024




JOHNNY BYRGE
1005 Rosa HHl Drive
LaFaolleths, TN 37756

SHARON RIDENOUR-CO-CHAIR
355 Middesboro Road
LaFdlete, TN 37766

USA FIELDS
1049 Doerfield Way
LaFolletie, TN 37766

JEFFREY MILLER,
209 Glade Springs Road
LaFolletie, TN 37766

CAMPBELL COUNTY

Board of Education

172 Valley Street
Jacksbaro, Tennessee 37757
Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562

BRENT LESTER Jennifer Fields
Larciate, T e Director of Schools
To: Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schools

Ms. Lisa Bowlin, Deputy Director/Purchasing Agent
From: Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor

Date: March 12, 2023

Re: Contract renewals for food service vendors

RANDY HEATHERLY
145 Degwood Lane
Jackshoro, TN 37757

JOSH JAMES
140 Mourtain View Rd,
Jackstora, TN 37757

RONNIE LASLFY
102 Bruce Gap Road
Caryville, TN 37714

CRYSTAL CREEKMORE
112 OId Standard Hollow Road
Newcomb, TN 57819

STEVE MORGAN-CHAIR
118 Whistle Cresk Road
Newcomb, TN 37819

I request the contract for T & T Produce, to be renewed as per bid for the 2024-2025 school term. As per
attached sheet, the company agrees to the renewal.

| recommend this renewal as advantageous to the system and the program'’s operation. This renewal
meets the conditions of the bid contract.

Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schools

Mr. Jeff Marlow, Director of Finances

Mr. Steve Morgan, Board Chairman

Date

Date



CAMPBELL COUNTY

RANDY HEATHERLY
1005 Rosa Hill Drive 145 Dogwood Lane
Jackshoro, TM 37757

LaFollette, TN 37788 y ,
T IS NEEmTT ReER - T hHowWmmin ViewRd,

LoFalletiz, TN 37756 Jacksboro, TN 37757

JCHNNY BYRGE

1043 Derriat wiay 172 Valley Street 1102 Brots 2eg P
LeFalietts, TN 37766 Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757 Caryvilla, TN 37714
JEFFREY MILLER Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562 CRYSTAL CREEKMORE
205 Glade Springs Road 12 Old Standard Haollow Road

LaFdleite, TN 37766 Newcomb, TN 37819
BRENT LESTER Jennifer Fields STEVE MORGAN-CHAIR
et ik Director of Schools e Crook Roed

February 9, 2024

TE& T Produce

P.0O. Box 5756

Ft Oglethorpe, GA 30742

Dear Sir:

The Campbel! County Board of Education will be asked to approve the renewal of the
Produce bid with T & T Produce for the 2024-2025 school term, at the regular meeting on Tuesday
March 12, 2024, at 6:00 p.m. at the Campbell County Courthouse,

If this is agreeabie to your company, please sign this form and return to Jamie Gillum by 2:00 p.m.
March 8, 2024.

Enclosed is an approved calendar for the 2024-2025 school term.

Sincerely,

Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor
Campbell County School System

Company Name: T:f T QCOCJ( tAC o Signature: W

Company Address:? @) ?Dv\_t 3196 Title: (W Candvcat 60
g“i’u CQL{M'LOH\?Q Rk 07 - pate:_ -1 - 2 Y




JOHNNY BYRGE
1005 Rose Hll Drive
LaFolletts, TN 37786

SHARON RIDENOUR-CO-CHAIR
386 Middeshore Road
LaFolletie, TN 37766

LISA FIELDS
1048 Dearfiold Way
LaFallstte, TN 37766

JEFFREY MLLER
209 Glade Springs Road
LaFciletts, TN 37765

BRENT LESTER
180 5, Vilage Lane
LaFolletis, TN 37768

CAMPBELL COUNTY

WBoard of Education

172 Valley Street
Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757
Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562

Jennifer Fields
Director of Schools

To:  Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schoals
Ms. Lisa Bowlin, Deputy Director/Purchasing Agent
From: Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor

Date: March 12, 2023

Re: Coantract renewals for food service vendors

RANDY HEATHERLY
145 Dogwead Lane
Jacksbora, TN 37757

JOSH JAMES
140 Mountain View Rd.
Jackaboro, TN 37757

RONNIE LASLEY
1102 Bruce Gap Road
Caryvitie, TN 31714

CRYSTAL CREEKMORE
112 Old Standard Hollow Road
Newcamb, TN 37815

STEVE MORGAN-CHAIR
118 Whistle Cresk Road
Newcomb, TN 37819

| request the contract for Mayfield Dairy, to be renewed as per bid for the 2024-2025 school term. As
per attached sheet, the company agrees to the renewal.

| recommend this renewal as advantageous to the system and the program’s operation. This renewal
meets the conditions of the bid contract.

Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Birector of Schools

Mr. Jeff Marlow, Director of Finances

Mr. Steve Morgan, Board Chairman

Date

Date



JOMNNY BYRGE
1005 Rose Hift Diive
1aFdlelte, TH 37768

SHARDY RIDENOUR-CO-CHAIR

Caa LS

Ao Rt
Laldleilo, TN 37766

USA FIELDS
#0349 Dparfigld Vay
LaFdlaite, TH 37768

JEFFREY MRLER
209 Glada Springs Road
LaFcllelie, TN 37766

BRENT LESTER
100 5, age Loo
LaFdlgllo, TH 37765

CAMPBELL COUNTY

Poard of Education

172 Valley Street

Jackshoro, Tennessee 37757
Phane: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-b66-7562

Jennifer Fields
Director of Schools

RANDY HEATHEFILY
145 Dogwood Lone
Jacksbora, TH 3TTET

JOSH JAMES

40 Movot iewr R ——- - -

Jacksbora, TN 37767

ROUN E LASLEY
1102 Bawco Gap fload
Caryvlle, TH 31714

CRYSTAL CREEXMORE
112 Ofd Standard Hellow Road
Neweomb, TH 37819

STEVE MORGAM-CHAR
118 Whise Cresk Froxd
Neweomb, TH 37840

February 9, 2024

Mayfield Dairy, LLC
P.O. Box 310
Athens, TN 37371-0310

Dear Sir:
The Campbell County Board of Education will be asked to approve the renewal of the
Milic/Milk Products bid with Mayfield Dairy for the 2024-2025 schoo! term, at the regular meeting on

Tuesday March 12, 2024, at 6:00 p.m. at the Campbell County Courthouse,

If this is agreeable ta your company, please sign this form and return to Jamie Gillum by 2:00 p.m.
March 8, 2024,

Enclosed is an approved calendar for the 2024-2025 school term.

Sincerely,

Jamie Glllum, School Nutritlon Superdsor —
Camphell County Schoal System

DFA Dairy Brands Fluid, LLC/

Company Name: Mayfield Dairy Signature: —
®) Pay
Company Address; 806 East Madison Ave Title;_3eneral Manager
Athens, TN 37303 Date: 02.22.2024

* Please see attached request for Producer Products Price Increase for the 2024/2025
school year.



CAMPBELL COUNTY

JOHNNY BYRGE RANDY HEATHERLY
1005 Rose Hilt Drive 145 Dagwood Lane
LaFollgtle, TN 37766 r Jackshoro, TN 7757

. JOSH JAMES
e opia o PBoard of Education o
LaFdlete, T™ 37756 Jacesbora, TN 37757
LiSA FIELDS RONMIE LASLEY
1049 Deerfisld Way 172 Va"ey Street 1102 Bruco Gap Road
LaFallate, TN 37765 Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757 Garyvile, TN 37714
JEFFREY MILLER Phone; 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562 CRYSTAL CREEKMORE
200 Giade Springs Road 112 Ofd Standard Haltow Resd
LaFolletie, TN 37768 MNewcomb, TN 37819
BRENT LESTER Jennifer Fields s1'§\.v;.:"r :gmxc:m
. 1 isthe Cr oad
Larolts, T 3770 Director of Schools e oorhists Creek R

To: Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schogls
Ms. Lisa Bowlin, Deputy Director/Purchasing Agent
From: Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor
Date: March 12, 2023
Re: Contract renewals for food service vendors

| request the contract for Cox's Septic Service, to be renewed as per bid for the 2024-2025 school term.
As per attached sheet, the company agrees to the renewal.

I recommend this renewal as advantageous to the system and the program’s operation. This renewal
meets the conditions of the bid contract.

Mrs. Jennifer Fields, Director of Schools Date

Mr. Jeff Marlow, Director of Finances Date

Mr. Steve Morgan, Board Chairman Date



CAMPBELL COUNTY

JOHNNY BYRGE RANDY HEATHERLY
1005 Raose Hill Drive 145 Dogwaod Lane
LaFallatte TN 377865 , Jacksboro, TH 37757

suegirosion oo Board of Chucation o s

386 tor-Reed O Moukair VoW RE— -

LaFaoiiette, TN 37766 Jacksbors, TN 37757
USA FIELDS RONNJE LASLEY

1048 Coerota gy 172 Valley Street 1102 Bruce Gep Roed
LoFolletie, TN 37756 Jacksboro, Tennessee 37757 Caryville, TN 37714
JEFFREY MILLER Phone: 423-562-8377, Fax: 423-566-7562 CRYSTAL CREEKMORE

204 Glade Springs Raad 112 Qld Standard Hollow Raad
LaFdlette, TM 37786 Newcomb, TH 37819

BRENT LESTER Jennifer Fields STEVE MORGAN-GHAR

180 5, Village Lane . 118 Whistle Crask Road
LaFdIdnf aTg’:m Director of SChOO'S Ngwm: TN 37818

February 9, 2024

Cox’s Septic Service

P.O. Box 1877

Corhin, KY 40702

Dear Sir:

The Campbell County Board of Education will be asked to approve the renewal of the present
Septic/Grease Trap bid with Cox’s Septic for the 2024-2025 school term, at the regular meeting on
Tuesday, March 12, 2024, at 6:00 p.m. at the Campbell County Courthouse.

If this is agreeabie to your company, please sign this form and return to Jamie Gillum by 2:00 p.m.
March 8, 2024.

Enclosed is an approved calendar for the 2024-2025 school term.

Sincerely,

Jamie Gillum, School Nutrition Supervisor
Campbell County School System

Company Name:{_(j/}/ < 54’%7// C _54’./\46//6/_ Signature:ﬁ(’/%g'" M
Company Address: ypd /50/)’ [ &7 Title: (9 &/‘,{/f'f_ﬂ
C/()ﬁﬁ// /ﬁ/ K/U;ﬁL Date: '—37 7 7’ 0’2“/




