



Daniel P. King, Ph.D.
Executive Director

Region One Education Service Center

1900 W. Schunior, Edinburg, TX 78541 ♦ Ph (956) 984-6000 ♦ Fax (956) 984-7655

TO: Region One Purchasing Cooperative (ROPC) Members

FROM: Lori Atwood Ramos, Purchasing Director

SUBJECT: **Region One Purchasing Cooperative Janitorial Supplies, Paper, and Plastic Products RFP 23-23-0134, Extension 1 of 4**

DATE: June 18, 2024

This request for proposal (RFP) allows Region One Purchasing Cooperative (ROPC) members the opportunity to procure goods and/or services on an as-needed basis from a pre-qualified list of responsive and responsible vendors, known as company or firm whose purpose is to provide janitorial supplies, as well as paper and plastic products on an as-needed basis, this includes, but is not limited to: cleaning and sanitizing chemicals/supplies, hair nets, disposable gloves and aprons, trash can liners, trays, plates, cups, food containers, flatware, straws and napkins. Item descriptions, specifications and/or technical requirements and estimated quantities and pricing, and/or price lists and/or catalogs have been provided by each vendor enclosed. ROPC members are required to conduct a cost or price analysis for the procurement of goods and/or services not listed in the items tab, and within the scope of services offered with this bid solicitation. Cooperative members are responsible for the selection of goods and/or services available to meet their needs.

On May 31, 2023, the Region One Education Service Center Purchasing Department received fourteen (14) proposals for Janitorial Supplies, Paper, and Plastic Products RFP 23-0134. Proposals were evaluated to select the best qualified vendors based on the established criteria. School Specialty LLC was not awarded due to incomplete submissions as well as delivery minimum requirements, and unable to meet the needs of ALL of the ROPC cooperative members. Thirteen (13) vendors are being recommended for award. Vendors recommended for awarded had complete request for proposal submissions with an evaluation score of 70 or greater.

On August 17, 2023, the Region One ESC Board of Directors met to review and approve the recommendation of the ROPC Janitorial Supplies, Paper, and Plastic Products, Request for Proposal 23-0134. The term of this proposal is effective September 1, 2023, through August 31, 2024, with four (4) one-year extension options if parties agree.

On May 16, 2024, the Region One ESC Board of Directors met to review and approve the recommendation of ROPC Janitorial Supplies, Paper, and Plastic Products RFP 23-0134, Extension 1 of 4, effective September 1, 2024 through August 31, 2025, with three (3) one-year extension options remaining if all parties are in agreement. Hollywood Janitorial and Restroom Supplies, LLC – Dallas, TX and Safeway Supply, Inc – San Antonio, TX did not respond to the extension emails therefore was removed.

The following vendors were awarded:

1. Amano Pioneer Eclipse Corporación – Carol Stream, IL
2. Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. – Palmhurst, TX
3. Gateway Printing & Office Supply Inc dba Liberty Office Products, Daniel Office Products, Gorilla Office Supplies – San Antonio, TX (formerly as Liberty Office Products)
4. Gulf Coast Paper Co. – Victoria, TX
5. Interboro Packaging Cor – Montgomery, NY
6. Labatt Food Service, LLC – San Antonio, TX
7. Oliver Packaging & Equipment – Walker, MI
8. Pyramid School Products – Tampa, FL
9. Sysco Central Texas – New Braunfels, TX

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

10. Unipak Corp. – West Long Branch, NJ
 11. Valley Grocers, LLC – Brownsville, TX

Please note the following Addendum for Janitorial Supplies, Paper, and Plastic Products RFP 23-0134, Extension 1 of 4:

| Bid Item # | Vendor Name | Correction/Change | Change to award |
|------------|----------------|--|---|
| #0-3 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from alternative product Handgards: 303764613, 500ct #5330899 \$42.36 | No change to award |
| #0-4 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price \$70.00 to \$60.00 | No change to award |
| #0-6 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$7.34 to \$7.70 | No change to award |
| #0-6 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$9.94 to \$9.89 | No change to award |
| #0-7 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$11.85 to \$11.18 | No change to award |
| #0-8 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$16.93 to \$16.55 | No change to award |
| #0-9 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$18.34 to \$19.20 | No change to award |
| #0-9 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$39.76 to \$36.67 | No change to award |
| #0-10 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$12.74 to \$12.97 | No change to award |
| #0-11 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$39.85 to \$34.72 | No change to award |
| #0-12 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$63.68 to \$60.79 | No change to award |
| #0-13 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$78.74 to \$71.12 | No change to award |
| #0-14 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$14.68 to \$14.36 | No change to award |
| #0-15 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$11.49 to \$10.98 | Yes, change award to primary |
| #0-16 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$11.86 to \$10.59 | No change to award |
| #0-17 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$13.22 to \$18.12 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-18 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$20.74 to \$20.25 | No change to award |
| #0-18 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$12.63 to \$12.56 | No change to award |
| #0-20 | Devin | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$18.23 per case | No change to award |
| #0-20 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$26.25 to No bid | No change to award |
| #0-20 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$27.96 to \$26.15 | No change to award |
| #0-22 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from brand and price \$90.39 to \$72.29 | No change to award |
| #0-23 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$14.32 to \$15.04 | No change to award |
| #0-23 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$33.09 to \$32.22 | No change to award |
| #0-23 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$24.17 to \$23.20 | No change to award |
| #0-25 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$6.22 to \$5.99 | No change to award |
| #0-27 | | Addendum #7 change award based on pricing | Yes, change award to Interboro primary; Sysco secondary |
| #0-28 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$6.78 to \$6.44 | No change to award |
| #0-30 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$7.15 to \$6.99 | No change to award |
| #0-56 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from brand and price from \$96 to \$37 | No change to award |
| #0-56 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$29.25 to \$27.64 | No change to award |
| #0-57 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from brand and price from \$104 to \$44 | No change to award |
| #0-57 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$32.29 to \$31.59 | No change to award |
| #0-60 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$190 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-60 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$116.95 to \$115.78 | No change to award |
| #0-61 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$94.92 to \$101.16 | No change to award |
| #0-62 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$25.12 to \$25.10 | No change to award |
| #0-62 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$24.60 to \$48.72 | No change to award |
| #0-64 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price \$57 to \$10 | No change to award |
| #0-64 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$6.18 to \$6.29 | No change to award |
| #0-68 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price \$67.80 to \$11.30 | No change to award |
| #0-68 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$8.33 to \$8.09 | No change to award |
| #0-69 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$13.45 to \$14.19 | No change to award |
| #0-71 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | No change to award |
| #0-71 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$44.17 to \$55.27 | No change to award |
| #0-74 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$3.80 to \$4.23 | No change to award |
| #0-75 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$168.55 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers |
| #0-76 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$200.76 to \$16.73 | No change to award |
| #0-76 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$25.72 to \$25.65 | No change to award |
| #0-77 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$99.78 to \$98.71 | No change to award |

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|---|-------------------------------------|
| #0-78 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$67.80 to \$11.30 | No change to award |
| #0-79 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from unit price \$6.99 to \$7.98 | No change to award |
| #0-81 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$3.57 to \$3.75 | No change to award |
| #0-82 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from unit price \$7.99 to \$8.59 | No change to award |
| #0-83 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$3.24 to \$2.80 | No change to award |
| #0-84 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from unit price \$6.99 to \$7.79 | No change to award |
| #0-87 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$126 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers |
| #0-90 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$11.48 to \$12.07 | No change to award |
| #0-91 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$13.34 to \$13.95 | No change to award |
| #0-93 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$247 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-93 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$249.33 to \$214.60 | Yes, change award to Sysco |
| #0-94 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$60.55 to \$60.49 | No change to award |
| #0-96 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$64.55 to \$64.54 | No change to award |
| #0-98 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$46.18 to \$45.68 | No change to award |
| #0-100 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$217 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-100 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$26.08 to \$25.89 | No change to award |
| #0-101 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$541.92 to \$41.90 | No change to award |
| #0-102 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$54.86 to \$54.80 | No change to award |
| #0-103 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$86 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-103 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$96.72 to \$96.69 | No change to award |
| #0-104 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$50.82 to \$50.80 | No change to award |
| #0-110 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$119 to \$125 | No change to award |
| #0-110 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$107.58 to \$106.89 | No change to award |
| #0-128 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$38.75 to \$40. | No change to award |
| #0-117 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$13.74 to 14.44 per quart | No change to award |
| #0-130 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$95.47 to \$99.29 | No change to award |
| #0-131 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$103.09 to \$107.21 | No change to award |
| #0-132 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$44 to 44.50 with and alternative option Colgate Palmolive #45118 #CPC45118 a 9/20oz 4pack for \$36.00 | No change to award |
| #0-133 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$47.91 to \$49.34 | No change to award |
| #0-137 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$47.91 to \$49.34 | No change to award |
| #0-138 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$65.60 to \$53.00 | No change to award |
| #0-138 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$47.91 to \$49.34 | No change to award |
| #0-145 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$31.10 to \$32.03 | No change to award |
| #0-155 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$54.74 to \$56.39 | No change to award |
| #0-157 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$120.31 to \$123.93 | No change to award |
| #0-158 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$124.11 to \$129.07 | No change to award |
| #0-159 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$47.91 to \$49.34 | No change to award |
| #0-166 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$61.38 to 57.00 | No change to award |
| #0-167 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$42.14 to \$43.40 | No change to award |
| #0-168 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$24.43 to 44.50 | No change to award |
| #0-169 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$120.31 to \$123.93 | No change to award |
| #0-169 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$82.97 to \$86.29 | No change to award |
| #0-170 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$32.32 to \$31.25; Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Sysco |
| #0-135 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$78 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Labatt |
| #0-146 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-143 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$53.00 to \$58.00; Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-148 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$15.22 to \$17.21 | No change to award |
| #0-112 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$54.15 to \$55.42 | No change to award |
| #0-129 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$54.15 to \$55.42 | No change to award |
| #0-152 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$48.42 to \$49.56 | No change to award |
| #0-153 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$51.74 to \$64.00 | No change to award |
| #0-154 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$48.88 to \$51.88 | No change to award |
| #0-165 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$59.86 to \$65.50; Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-172 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$76.40 to \$79.40 | No change to award |
| #0-173 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$54.15 to No Bid; change in award to No Bids | Yes, change award to No Bid |
| #0-183 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$54.15 to \$55.42 | No change to award |
| #0-184 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$32.69 to \$70.70 | No change to award |
| #0-139 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|--|---|
| #0-115 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from pack size and price from \$71 to \$77 | No change to award |
| #0-175 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-140 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$59.30 to \$42 | No change to award |
| #0-176 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-177 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$28.08 to \$29.20 | No change to award |
| #0-179 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change award to Gulf Coast |
| #0-190 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$31.10 to \$32.03 | No change to award |
| #0-114 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from item is discontinued replaced with TUFF-JOB W923 item #6810066 from \$28.88 to 20.43 | Yes, change award to Labatt primary and Devin secondary |
| #0-121 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | No change to award |
| #0-121 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from item is discontinued replaced with TUFF-JOB W920 item #6747020 from \$28.88 to \$24.61 | No change to award |
| #0-123 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$16.70 to \$49 | No change to award |
| #0-123 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$23.90 to \$25.09 | No change to award |
| #0-150 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$35.00 to \$7.10 | No change to award |
| #0-150 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$4.58 to \$4.50 | No change to award |
| #0-160 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$16.59 to \$16.48 | No change to award |
| #0-180 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$35 to \$8.28 | No change to award |
| #0-180 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$4.89 to \$5.12 | No change to award |
| #0-180 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$11.44 to \$12.14 | No change to award |
| #0-193 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$63.50 to \$50.98 | No change to award |
| #0-194 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$58.20 to \$57.59 | No change to award |
| #0-195 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | Yes, Valley Grocers secondary |
| #0-196 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$61.44 to \$49.12 | No change to award |
| #0-197 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$73.00 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-198 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from product item to S12THCWSYS, and price from \$21.05 to \$58.64 | Yes, Valley Grocers secondary |
| #0-200 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$38.38 to \$30.15 | No change to award |
| #0-200 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$33.01 to \$31.79 | No change to award |
| #0-201 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$42.54 to \$33.96 | No change to award |
| #0-201 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$28.05 to \$36.00 | No change to award |
| #0-202 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$61.76 to \$48.52 | No change to award |
| #0-202 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$28.05 to \$27.38 | No change to award |
| #0-203 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$37.68 to \$29.64 | No change to award |
| #0-204 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$25.74 to \$20.24 | No change to award |
| #0-204 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$25.71 to \$23.62 | No change to award |
| #0-205 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$29.98 to \$23.80 | No change to award |
| #0-206 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$28.72 to \$26.83 | No change to award |
| #0-208 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$27.05 to \$21.36 | No change to award |
| #0-208 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$23.85 to \$23.12 | No change to award |
| #0-209 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$45.50 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Devin |
| #0-210 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$22.49 to \$17.74 | No change to award |
| #0-213 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$23.68 to \$22.25 | Yes, change to primary |
| #0-216 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$23.20 to \$21.92 | Yes, change to primary |
| #0-218 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$38.93 to \$55.42 | No change to award |
| #0-219 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$23.20 to \$21.92 | Yes, change to primary |
| #0-220 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$40.45 to \$30.63 | No change to award |
| #0-224 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$75.45 to \$53.64 | Yes, change to secondary |
| #0-225 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$29.32 to \$27.72 | Yes, change to primary |
| #0-226 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$46.36 to \$43.82 | No change to award |
| #0-228 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$52.98 to \$50.15 | No change to award |
| #0-230 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$151.78 to \$150.80 | No change to award |
| #0-231 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$109 to \$129 | No change to award |
| #0-238 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$31.12 to \$29.34 | No change to award |
| #0-238 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$18.83 to \$18.45 | No change to award |
| #0-239 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$31.15 to \$27.32 | No change to award |
| #0-240 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | No change to award |
| #0-240 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$90.36 to \$72.99 | No change to award |
| #0-241 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$41.76 to \$35.95 | No change to award |
| #0-242 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$25.22 to \$23.98 | No change to award |
| #0-242 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$29.84 to \$14.08 | No change to award |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|---|--|
| #0-244 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$185.00 | No change to award |
| #0-244 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$99.83 to \$89.99 | No change to award |
| #0-246 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$39.78 to \$35.99 | No change to award |
| #0-247 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$10.08 to \$9.27 | No change to award |
| #0-248 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$14.32 to \$12.82 | No change to award |
| #0-249 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$23.98 to \$23.96 | No change to award |
| #0-249 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.22 to \$18.86 | No change to award |
| #0-252 | Devin | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$78.84 | No change to award |
| #0-252 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$34.85 to \$37.88 | No change to award |
| #0-253 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$96 to \$52.29 | No change to award |
| #0-255 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$92.79 to \$92.59 | No change to award |
| #0-256 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$65 to \$70.65 | No change to award |
| #0-256 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$64.59 to \$222.25 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers |
| #0-257 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$62.25 | No change to award |
| #0-257 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$57.39 to \$50.72 | No change to award |
| #0-258 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$41.46 to \$41.45 | No change to award |
| #0-259 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$60.98 to \$49.97 | No change to award |
| #0-260 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$35.28 to \$29.30 | No change to award |
| #0-261 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$32.64 to \$26.86 | No change to award |
| #0-261 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$23.61 to \$22.83 | No change to award |
| #0-262 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$45.39 to \$37.64 | No change to award |
| #0-262 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$33.73 to \$31.47 | No change to award |
| #0-263 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$51.46 to \$42.35 | No change to award |
| #0-263 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$48.51 to \$45.59 | No change to award |
| #0-264 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$57.39 to \$47.24 | No change to award |
| #0-264 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$57.94 to \$53.83 | No change to award |
| #0-266 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$32.74 to \$32.10 | No change to award |
| #0-267 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$65.96 to \$62.45 | No change to award |
| #0-268 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$59.78 to \$59.76 | No change to award |
| #0-268 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$75.31 | No change to award |
| #0-269 | Devin | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$56.99 | Yes, change award to Devin |
| #0-270 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$68.29 to \$68.28 | No change to award |
| #0-272 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$35.89 to \$35.88 | No change to award |
| #0-273 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$49.99 to \$49.98 | No change to award |
| #0-274 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$40.98 to \$33.39 | No change to award |
| #0-274 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$36.95 to \$36.33 | No change to award |
| #0-275 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$21.22 to \$17.49 | No change to award |
| #0-275 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$20.51 to \$19.44 | No change to award |
| #0-276 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$81.10 to \$66.38 | No change to award |
| #0-277 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$36.45 to \$29.99 | No change to award |
| #0-277 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$35.21 to \$34.21 | No change to award |
| #0-278 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$82.02 to \$82.00 | Yes, change award to Sysco primary |
| #0-278 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$96.77 to \$87.27 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers secondary |
| #0-279 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$83.67 to \$78.33 | No change to award |
| #0-280 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$83.67 to \$81.42 | No change to award |
| #0-281 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$54.28 to \$52.48 | No change to award |
| #0-282 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$65.86 to \$65.85 | No change to award |
| #0-284 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from Incorrect manufacturer and product number listed. Updated to Atrium #21552 change award to Valley Grocers primary and Sysco secondary | Yes, change award primary to Valley Grocers and secondary to Sysco |
| #0-285 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$72.42 to \$41.98 | No change to award |
| #0-285 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$56.69 to \$53.83 | No change to award |
| #0-286 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$17.99 to \$19.28 | No change to award |
| #0-288 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$36.96 to \$36.75 | No change to award |
| #0-290 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$69.76 to \$69.74 | No change to award |
| #0-291 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$26.19 to \$28.64 | No change to award |
| #0-293 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$59.37 to \$64.53 | No change to award |
| #0-293 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$35.98 to \$34.36 | No change to award |
| #0-294 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$50.39 to \$50.29 | No change to award |
| #0-295 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$68 to No bid | No change to award |
| #0-295 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$61.69 to \$61.59 | No change to award |
| #0-296 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$22.20 to \$24.13 | No change to award |
| #0-296 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$16.84 to \$16.24 | No change to award |
| #0-296 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$22.91 to \$20.00 | No change to award |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|---|---------------------------|
| #0-297 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$26.45 to \$26.44 | No change to award |
| #0-298 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$22.20 to \$24.13 | No change to award |
| #0-298 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$16.84 to \$16.24 | No change to award |
| #0-298 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$22.91 to \$20.10 | No change to award |
| #0-299 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$22.20 to \$24.13 | No change to award |
| #0-299 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$16.84 to \$15.65 | No change to award |
| #0-299 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$22.71 to \$20.10 | No change to award |
| #0-300 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$50.52 to \$50.49 | No change to award |
| #0-300 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$38.66 to \$38.07 | No change to award |
| #0-303 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$37.54 to 62.15 | No change to award |
| #0-304 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$62.24 to \$44.69 | No change to award |
| #0-306 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$63.42 to \$63.40 | No change to award |
| #0-307 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$52 to \$56.52 | No change to award |
| #0-309 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$58.15 to \$43.20 | No change to award |
| #0-312 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$36.42 to \$36.24 | No change to award |
| #0-313 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No bid to \$35.00 | No change to award |
| #0-315 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Hotpack packaging/11lb-#100 from \$23.16 to \$19.14 | No change to award |
| #0-316 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Hotpack packaging/ 1/2lb-#100 from \$19.49 to \$19.90 | No change to award |
| #0-317 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$24.85 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-318 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | No change to award |
| #0-320 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Hotpack packaging/ 1/2lb #50 from \$27.49 to \$20.60 | No change to award |
| #0-321 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$22.23 to \$27.96 | No change to award |
| #0-322 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Hotpack packaging/ 300lb-#300 from \$21.90 to \$17.67 | No change to award |
| #0-323 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$28.87 to \$28.40 | No change to award |
| #0-323 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Hotpack packaging/ 5lb-#500 from \$33.21 to \$25.12 | No change to award |
| #0-324 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$42.78 | No change to award |
| #0-325 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$74.32 to \$74.12 | No change to award |
| #0-325 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$81.45 to \$74.12 | No change to award |
| #0-326 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$50.09 to \$48.47 | No change to award |
| #0-327 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$51.49 to \$51.48 | No change to award |
| #0-327 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$57.54 to \$51.31 | No change to award |
| #0-328 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$43.35 to \$45.99 | No change to award |
| #0-328 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$51.79 to \$47.03 | No change to award |
| #0-329 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$87.88 to \$87.86 | No change to award |
| #0-329 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$97.99 to \$87.00 | No change to award |
| #0-330 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$58.82 to \$58.80 | No change to award |
| #0-330 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$64.89 to \$62.15 | No change to award |
| #0-331 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$60.78 to \$58.80 | No change to award |
| #0-331 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$67 to \$60.50 | No change to award |
| #0-332 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$66.25 to \$61.17 | No change to award |
| #0-333 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$33.55 to \$31.81 | No change to award |
| #0-334 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$32.32 to \$32.29 | No change to award |
| #0-334 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$36.25 to \$31.82 | No change to award |
| #0-335 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$34.85 to \$33.04 | No change to award |
| #0-336 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$70.29 to \$70.26 | No change to award |
| #0-336 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$74.75 to \$74.19 | No change to award |
| #0-337 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$41.59 to \$37.23 | No change to award |
| #0-339 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand from \$21 to \$15.00 | No change to award |
| #0-339 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$55.00 to \$52.44 | No change to award |
| #0-340 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand from \$21 to \$15.00 | No change to award |
| #0-340 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$55.50 to \$52.44 | No change to award |
| #0-341 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand from \$21 to \$15.00 | No change to award |
| #0-341 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$8 per 1,000 to \$36 per 10,000 | Yes, change award primary |
| #0-341 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$55.50 to \$52.44 | No change to award |
| #0-342 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$8.99 to \$9.99 | No change to award |
| #0-343 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$8.99 to \$9.99 | No change to award |
| #0-344 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$45 to \$38.00 | No change to award |
| #0-344 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$19.20 to \$17.50 | No change to award |
| #0-345 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand from \$23.50 to \$15.00 | No change to award |
| #0-345 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$0.84 per 100 to \$36 per 10,000 | Yes, change award primary |
| #0-346 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$45 to \$38.00 | No change to award |
| #0-346 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$19.20 to \$17.50 | No change to award |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|---|--------------------------------|
| #0-347 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$88.78 to \$74.68 | No change to award |
| #0-348 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$6.00 | No change to award |
| #0-348 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$88.78 to \$74.68 | No change to award |
| #0-351 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$45 to \$38.00 | No change to award |
| #0-365 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$45 to \$38.00 | No change to award |
| #0-357 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$47.64 to \$47.59 | No change to award |
| #0-359 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$24.74 to \$24.55 | No change to award |
| #0-362 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$132.06 to \$132.00 | No change to award |
| #0-368 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$78.87 to \$82.02 | No change to award |
| #0-388 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$16.40 to \$15.98 | No change to award |
| #0-376 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$560 to \$18.00 | No change to award |
| #0-383 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$44.95 to \$49.90 | No change to award |
| #0-370 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$64.92 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Sysco |
| #0-373 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$5.85 to \$5.84 | No change to award |
| #0-390 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$69.78 to \$31.69 | No change to award |
| #0-391 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$4.12 to \$4.10 | No change to award |
| #0-404 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$46.15 to \$50.16 | No change to award |
| #0-404 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$30.99 to \$25.56 | No change to award |
| #0-405 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$42.53 to \$42.52 | No change to award |
| #0-406 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$21.20 to \$23.00 | No change to award |
| #0-407 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$34.69 to \$34.68 | No change to award |
| #0-409 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$18.95 to \$16.25 | No change to award |
| #0-410 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$22.20 to \$24.13 | No change to award |
| #0-410 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$18.95 to \$16.25 | No change to award |
| #0-411 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$24.28 to \$27.98 | No change to award |
| #0-413 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Empress EPCID1 from \$14.13 to \$12.92 | No change to award |
| #0-414 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$18.61 to \$17.99 | No change to award |
| #0-415 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$25.20 to \$25.00 | No change to award |
| #0-416 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Prime Source #75000643 from \$31.60 to \$25.00 | No change to award |
| #0-418 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Empress EPC100 from \$18.53 to 14.62 | No change to award |
| #0-419 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from No Bid to \$27.00 | No change to award |
| #0-419 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.11 to 19.04 | No change to award |
| #0-420 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.01 to \$18.40 | No change to award |
| #0-421 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$31.67 to 31.00 | No change to award |
| #0-422 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$34.75 to \$34.37 | No change to award |
| #0-423 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$68.70 to \$53.89 | No change to award |
| #0-424 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Prime Source #750013129 from \$63.20 to \$41.49 | No change to award |
| #0-425 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$41.59 to \$39.40 | No change to award |
| #0-426 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$52.89 to \$49.62 | No change to award |
| #0-431 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-432 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-434 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-435 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-436 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-437 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$840 to No Bid | No change to award |
| #0-439 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$31.71 to \$33.50 | No change to award |
| #0-439 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$22.12 to \$18.64 | No change to award |
| #0-439 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Genpak #10500 from \$23.99 to 22.68 | No change to award |
| #0-440 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$22.12 to \$18.64 | Yes, change award to primary |
| #0-440 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Manufacturer #SLT5 from \$23.99 to \$23.74 | Yes, change award to secondary |
| #0-441 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$39.99 to \$35.59 | No change to award |
| #0-442 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$28.89 to \$23.98 | No change to award |
| #0-442 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$22.12 to \$18.65 | No change to award |
| #0-442 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from PACIV/YTH1-0500-SGBX 1 from \$23.99 to \$22.55 | No change to award |
| #0-443 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$30.52 to \$30.25 | No change to award |
| #0-443 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from REYMA SLT6 from \$34.85 to \$28.13 | No change to award |
| #0-444 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$30.52 to \$30.25 | No change to award |
| #0-445 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$25.26 to \$25.19 | No change to award |
| #0-447 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from Item number change from 2703151 and #3893 to item number 1608635 and #3897 from \$178.89 to \$12.89 | No change to award |
| #0-448 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$10.52 to \$10.49 | No change to award |
| #0-450 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$10.52 to \$10.49 | No change to award |
| #0-452 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$11.15 to \$10.98 | No change to award |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|----------------|---|---|
| #0-454 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$10.52 to \$10.49 | No change to award |
| #0-456 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$14.80 to \$14.76 | No change to award |
| #0-458 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$20.40 to \$18.48 | No change to award |
| #0-465 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$15.78 to \$15.49 | No change to award |
| #0-466 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$16.59 to \$16.56 | No change to award |
| #0-468 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$34.12 to \$33.70 | Yes, change award to Sysco primary |
| #0-468 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$73.12 to \$72.58; change in award to Valley Grocers secondary | Yes, change award to valley Grocers secondary |
| #0-469 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$10.52 to \$10.49 | No change to award |
| #0-470 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$5.30 to \$5.28 | No change to award |
| #0-471 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$5.30 to \$5.28 | No change to award |
| #0-474 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$42.94 to \$45.40 | No change to award |
| #0-475 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$67.00 to \$72.00 | No change to award |
| #0-477 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 78000338 from \$40.89 to 35.00 | No change to award |
| #0-478 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$42.06 to 39.41 | No change to award |
| #0-479 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 780000004 from \$23.20 to \$22.82 | No change to award |
| #0-482 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$18.25 to \$18.15 | No change to award |
| #0-483 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 78000335 from \$11.76 to \$11.63 | No change to award |
| #0-485 | Valey Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 78000327 from \$30.49 to \$29.41 | No change to award |
| #0-486 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand same price | No change to award |
| #0-486 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$16.68 to \$16.49 | No change to award |
| #0-487 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$39.56 to \$40.34 | No change to award |
| #0-488 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$23.79 to \$23.49 | No change to award |
| #0-489 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$21.29 to \$19.32 | No change to award |
| #0-490 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$44 to \$34.89 | No change to award |
| #0-490 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 780000008 from \$23.87 to \$22.99 | No change to award |
| #0-493 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, same price | No change to award |
| #0-494 | Hollywood | Addendum #7 change from Hollywood no extension | Yes, change to No Bid |
| #0-496 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 78000338 from \$40.79 to \$35.00 | No change to award |
| #0-497 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$39.50 to \$33.50 | No change to award |
| #0-497 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from Right Choice 780000004 from \$22.89 to \$22.50 | No change to award |
| #0-499 | Devin | Addendum #7 change from award due to brand not matching specs | Yes, change to Gulf Coast primary |
| #0-504 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$66.98 to \$66.50 | No change to award |
| #0-505 | Sysco | Addendum #7 change from \$38.25 to \$36.45 | No change to award |
| #0-507 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$108 to \$122.40 | No change to award |
| #0-507 | Pyramid | Addendum #7 change from \$107.88 to \$143.88 | No change to award |
| #0-508 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand, pack size, and price from \$153 to \$30 | No change to award |
| #0-510 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$129 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-511 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$54 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-512 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from \$46.50 to No Bid | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-513 | Gulf Coast | Addendum #7 change from full brand and price from \$108 to \$122.40 | No change to award |
| #0-516 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$18.84 to \$20.31 | No change to award |
| #0-517 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$18.68 to \$20.15 | No change to award |
| #0-518 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$11.82 to \$12.61 | Yes, change award to Interboro secondary |
| #0-518 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$12.97 to \$11.60 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-519 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.86 to 17.75 | No change to award |
| #0-520 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$13.74 to \$14.53 | No change to award |
| #0-520 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$12.41 to \$11.04 | No change to award |
| #0-521 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$11.61 to \$10.64 | No change to award |
| #0-522 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$13.02 to \$11.94 | No change to award |
| #0-523 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$11.71 to \$10.50 | No change to award |
| #0-524 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$29.32 to \$31.46 | Yes, change award to Interboro secondary |
| #0-524 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$30.30 to \$27.28 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers |
| #0-525 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$9.98 to \$10.68 | No change to award |
| #0-525 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$9.49 to \$8.55 | No change to award |
| #0-526 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$8.72 to \$7.50 | No change to award |
| #0-527 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$15.84 to \$16.99 | No change to award |
| #0-527 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.63 to \$16.60 | No change to award |

Region One Education Service Center does not discriminate on the basis of age, race, color, national origin, gender or disability.

| | | | |
|--------|------------------|--|--|
| #0-528 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$12.24 to \$13.02 | No change to award |
| #0-529 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$18.48 to \$19.81 | No change to award |
| #0-529 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$18.62 to \$17.10 | No change to award |
| #0-530 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$20.92 to \$22.68 | Yes, change award to Interboro secondary |
| #0-530 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$23.96 to \$20.68 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-531 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$19.99 to \$17.40 | No change to award |
| #0-532 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$18.99 to \$17.25 | No change to award |
| #0-533 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$11.68 to \$12.54 | No change to award |
| #0-533 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$12.88 to \$11.20 | No change to award |
| #0-534 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$24.72 to \$26.78 | Yes, change award to Interboro secondary |
| #0-534 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$25.67 to \$23.79 | Yes, change award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-535 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$27.57 to \$25.10 | No change to award |
| #0-536 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$14.24 to \$11.93 | No change to award |
| #0-537 | Interboro | Addendum #7 change from \$17.72 to \$18.99 | Yes, change award to Interboro secondary |
| #0-537 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$20.74 to \$17.21 | Yes, change in award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-538 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 change from \$18.46 to \$16.20 | Yes, change in award to Valley Grocers primary |
| #0-541 | Labatt | Addendum #7 change from \$35 to \$36.07 | No change to award |
| #0-552 | Unipack Corp | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Unipak Corp primary |
| #0-552 | Sysco | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Sysco secondary |
| #0-553 | Oliver Packaging | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Oliver Packaging primary award |
| #0-554 | Oliver Packaging | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Oliver Packaging primary award |
| #0-555 | Oliver Packaging | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Oliver Packaging primary award |
| #0-558 | Oliver Packaging | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Oliver Packaging primary award |
| #0-559 | Valley Grocers | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Valley Grocers primary award |
| #0-560 | Oliver Packaging | Addendum #7 new item added | Yes, Oliver Packaging primary award |

For your convenience, the order guide has been revised on posted on the Region One Purchasing Cooperative webpage at [Purchasing - Region One Education Service Center \(esc1.net\)](http://Purchasing - Region One Education Service Center (esc1.net)), Awarded Bids & Proposals. For additional information or questions, please contact the Region One Purchasing Cooperative at eBuyOne@esc1.net:

Lori Atwood Ramos, Purchasing Director, Phone: 956.984.6123
Kristina Carrizales Escobar, Purchasing Cooperative Specialist, Phone: 956.984.6012
Daisy Cuevas, Purchasing Cooperative Specialis, Phone: 956.984.6217
Robert Meave, Purchasing Cooperative Specialis, Phone: 956.984.6249
Idania Gonzalez, Purchasing Technician, Phone: 956.984.6204