
Addendum
BUUSD Board Meeting 

August 21, 2024



Superintendent Notes:

August 19, 2024

Since our last School Board meeting I have met with several community members and have
heard some additional thoughts from some of you about the last budget proposal. After one last
meeting with Directors this morning, I have decided to bring forward to you the same budget
presented during the August 14, 2024 meeting.

My goal was to bring forth a budget that would result in full board support. However, I
understand that this may not happen. Whether you fully support this budget or not, please
remember that once you adopt a budget we should all speak with one voice. We should talk
about what this means at our next meeting.

I am hoping we can now all turn the page, reset and focus our attention on building a budget for
FY26. Should you wish additional information or further discussion before budget adoption, we
can delay the budget vote until August 28, 2024. I will await your response at the meeting to
determine how to proceed.

Developing a public engagement plan will be very important in our next steps. At the meeting
please be prepared to discuss what information should be included on the postcard sent home
and brochures we can use to distribute at important events. Below you will find some important
dates. My hope is that some of you can join me in attendance at these events.

BTMES - Meet & Greet - August 26th, 4:00-5:00 p.m.

SHS - Meet & Greet - August 28th, 7:45 a.m.-12:15 p.m.

BCEMS - Meet & Greet - August 26th, 3:30-4:30 p.m. (PreK - August 30th 10:00-11:00 a.m. and

12:00-1:00 pm.)

Barre City Council Meeting - August 27, 2024 at 6:00 p.m.

Music in the Park (Currier Park) - September 5, 2024 at 5:30 p.m.

Attached to this communication you will find the results of the RFP for propane, oil and wood
chips. My text to you was to solicit involvement of a few board members so that you could see
how the process is done. Please remember not to reply all when using text. Going forward, if the
full board thinks it is prudent to have a School Board Member or two involved in decisions like
this we would be fine with that. Additionally, we would like to discuss if you would like to ‘lock in”
on our contracts for multiple years. We will put this on the agenda for August 28, 2024.

Lastly, you will see an Open Meeting Law complaint on the agenda. The complaint is attached.



 

 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

JoAn Canning 
Superintendent of Schools 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
A rock solid education for a lifetime of discovery. 

Spaulding High School 
Spaulding Education Alternatives 

Barre City Elementary and Middle School 
Barre Town Middle and Elementary School 

 120 Ayers Street, Barre, VT 05641 
   Phone: 802-476-5011 

   Fax: 802-476-4944 or 802-477-1132 
Website: www.buusd.org 

 
 

Results of Request for Proposal 
FUEL OIL and PROPANE 

 
 
Vendor Fuel Oil Propane Woodchips 
VT Natural Forest 
Products 

   
No Bid 

 
Cousineau Forest 
Products 

  $73/ton-Fuel 
surcharge over 
$5.00/gallon 

 
Limlaw Pulp Wood 

  No Bid 

Irving  Fixed $2.655 Fixed $1.342  
Suburban Fixed $3.0547 Fixed $1.565  
Trono Fuel No Bid   
Conti Fuel No Bid   
Gillespie Fuels Fixed $2.78 Fixed $1.86  
Whites Heating No Bid   
Bournes  No Bid No Bid  
Packard Fuels No Bid No Bid  
 
Supt. Recommends: Cousineau and Irving, both under state contract pricing for 
FY24. Irving prices are valid until 11:59 PM on August 19th. 
 
Prices last year: Woodchips $71/ton, Fuel Oil $3.483, Propane $1.518 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.buusd.org/


PLEASE RESPOND ON AUGUST 19th by 10:00 AM to 
lperrbsu@buusd.org   
 
This Request for Proposal (RFP) is intended to solicit bids on fuel oil and propane for the Barre 
Unified Union School District (BUUSD) from September 1, 2024-June 30, 2025.   
 
The following grid provides the estimated usage: 
 
  

CO Usage 
 
BCEMS Usage 

 
BTMES Usage 

 
SHS Usage 

 
Fuel Oil 

 
3,000 Gals 
 

 
NA 

 
10,000 Gals 

 
15,000 Gals 
 

 
Propane 

 
NA 

 
25,500 Gals 

 
1,000 Gals 

 
2,000 Gals 

 
Wood Chips 

  
725 Tons 

 
775 Tons 

 
1,400 Tons 

   
During the RFP response period all questions may be addressed to:   
 
Jamie Evans, BUUSD Facility Director  
Phone:  802 476-8119  
Email: jevanbsu@buusd.or 
 
Bids accepted via email on August 19th, 2024 by 10:00 AM to: 
 
lperrbsu@buusd.org 
 
Barre Unified Union School District 
Lisa Perreault, SFO, Business Manager 
120 Ayers Street 
Barre, VT 05641 
 
 
 
The Board reserves the right to waive any formalities in the bid and reject any or all 
proposals in the best interest of the district.   
 
 

mailto:lperrbsu@buusd.org
mailto:lperrbsu@buusd.org


The winning bidder will be notified by 12:00 PM on August 19th and will also be required to agree to 
the following considerations:  

• The term of the purchase price will begin on  September 1, 2024 through June 30, 2025 
• Payment Schedule: 

o Invoiced monthly, payment within 30-days 
 
       
 
The bidder certifies that the prices in this offer have been arrived at independently, without 
consultation, communication or agreement, for the purpose of restricting competition, as to 
any matter relating to such prices with any other bidder or with any competitor. The prices, 
which have been quoted in this offer, have not been and will not be knowingly disclosed by the 
bidder prior to opening of the bids. No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to 
induce a person or firm to submit or not to submit a bid for the purpose of restricting 
competition. 
 

 



FY25 BUDGET NARRATIVE-VOTE 4, September 17, 2024
Updated August 21, 2024

Our Strategic Plan guides the work of every member of our community.

General Fund Budget expense total of $53,308,338 an increase of
$3,692,704 or 7.4% higher than last year.

Ballot Language

ARTICLE 1
Shall the voters of the Barre Unified Union School District approve the
school board to expend $56,808,338, the amount the school board has
determined to be necessary for the ensuing fiscal year? It is estimated that
this proposed budget if approved, will result in education spending of
$11,036 per Long Term Weighted Average Daily Membership (LTWADM) per
pupil spending.

Tax Rate Calculation

REVOTE #4

FY2024 FY2025 VARIANCE

General Fund Expenses 49,615,633 $53,308,338 7.4%

Expenses w/Grants 55,615,633 $56,808,338 2.1%

Revenues w/Grants 15,970,237 $15,936,936

Education Spending 39,645,396 $40,871,402 3.09%
Equalized Pupil/

LTWADM 2,205.25 3703.48

Per Pupil Spending 17,978 $11,036 -38.61%

116.4% 111.6%

Tax Rate 1.164 1.116
District Tax Rate with
Discount (FY25 -$.03) 1.164 1.086

BC CLA 82.76% 76.62%

BC Adjusted Tax Rate 1.407 1.417 $0.010 .72%

BT CLA 95.87% 86.93%

BT Adjusted Tax Rate 1.214 1.249 $0.034 32.8%
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Proposed Reductions

Substitutes: $63,107

Supplies: $6,000

Gen Ed. Student Tuition: $20,000

Co-Curricular: $25,000

Travel/Conference: $50,000

4 to 5 Positions: $400,000

Grant Coordinator: $60,000

CARES-Modified Program: $210,000

Custodian Overtime: $20,000

Leased Vehicle: $14,000

Transportation: $60,000

Total: $991,214

Proposed Addition

SHS SRO: $50,000

Vote 1 11.6% Proposed budget-Failed

Vote 2 Reductions, $720,197, See below:

Tech Ctr Tuition Reduction $31,639

SHS Behavior Interventionist $60,000

Leased Vehicle $20,000

Directors Phase 2 Increase on Metric $43,456

2nd Electrician $80,000
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SHS SRO $50,000

SEA Barn Contracted Serv. $20,000

1 SEA Teacher-New Position $100,000

1 Special Educator-New Position $100,000

Travel/Conference-District-wide $62,100

Grant Writer Elevate Grant Coordinator $30,000

Facility back to $.75/sq ft $123,000

$720,195

Additional Tax Stabilization $686,450

Vote 3 Reductions: $473,891, See below:

Reduction during 5/21/24 Finance Committee Meeting

SHS Tech Tuition, Overchrg credit in FY25 $ 53,910.00

SHS Gen Instruction Course Reim $ 6,000.00

SHS Contracted Services $ 20,000.00

SHS Art Supplies $ 2,250.00

SHS Art Dues $ 100.00

SHS Health and Wellness Supplies $ 1,900.00

SHS Music Temp Wages $ 2,500.00

SHS Music Uniforms $ 500.00

SHS PE Supplies $ 1,000.00

SHS English Books $ 1,000.00

SHS Science Books $ 500.00

SHS Field Trips $ 500.00

SHS Phoenix Supplies $ 250.00

SHS Co-Curric Supplies $ 500.00

SHS School Counselor Printing $ 300.00

SHS School Counselor Field Trips $ 1,000.00

SHS Principals Repairs and Maint $ 500.00

SHS Principals Postage $ 4,000.00

SHS Principals Printing $ 2,000.00

SHS Facility Snow Removal $ 5,000.00

SHS Facility Rubbish $ 2,000.00

SHS Facility Repairs and Maint $ 5,000.00

SHS Facility Telephone $ 500.00

SHS Facility Propane $ 2,000.00

SHS Facility Fuel Oil $ 10,000.00
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$ 123,210.00

BC Social Worker, Project Serv to cover this ESSER

position $ 100,000.00

BC Student Tuition $ 150,000.00

BC Gen Instr Sub Wages $ 20,000.00

BC Gen Instr Contr Srvcs $ 6,000.00

BC Gen Instr Supplies $ 2,000.00

BC Art Supplies $ 1,000.00

BC Music Books $ 400.00

BC School Counselor Supplies $ 500.00

BC Pysch Services $ 10,000.00

BC Behavior Support Contr Srvcs $ 10,000.00

BC Library Contr Srvc $ 1,000.00

BC Principals Advertising $ 1,500.00

BC Principal Dues $ 500.00

BC Principal Bank Fees $ 300.00

BC Co Curric Transportation $ 10,000.00

BC Long Term Debt $ 5,000.00

BC Facility Sub Wages $ 3,000.00

BC Facility Snow Removal $ 3,000.00

BC Facility Telephone $ 500.00

BC Facility Custodial Supplies $ 2,000.00

BC Facility Propane $ 15,000.00

$ 341,700.00

BT Transportation for field trips, historically have

not spent down this line $ 10,000.00

BT Textbooks $ 15,000.00

BT General Ed Contracted Services $ 5,000.00

BT Student Tuition $ 5,000.00

BT Health and Wellness Supplies $ 250.00

BT World Language Supplies $ 200.00

BT Music Repairs and Maint $ 500.00

BT Design Lab Supplies $ 3,000.00

BT School Counselor Contracted Services $ 2,500.00

BT Health Supplies $ 500.00

BT Library Repairs and Maint $ 200.00
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BT Principals Contracted Services $ 2,000.00

BT Principals Repairs and Maint $ 500.00

BT Principals Postage $ 1,000.00

BT Facility Sub Wages $ 3,000.00

BT Facility Sewer $ 3,000.00

BT Facility Snow Removal $ 3,000.00

BT Facility Repairs and Maint $ 5,000.00

BT Facility Telephone $ 500.00

BT Facility Propane $ 500.00

BT Facility Woodchips $ 10,000.00

$ 70,650.00

SEA supplies $ 10,000.00

SEA Maint. supplies $ 10,000.00

Sped Para Course Reimb $ 2,000.00

BI Courses Reimb $ 3,000.00

Sped Field Trips $ 2,000.00

Sped SLP Assist $ 4,877.00

Sped SLP Dues $ 1,000.00

Sped Postage $ 250.00

Sped Supplies $ 1,000.00

Sped ECSE BI Wages $ 2,000.00

Sped ECSE ESY Teacher $ 1,500.00

Sped ESCE ESY Para $ 11,000.00

$ 48,627.00

Board Advertising $ 1,000.00

Business Office Postage $ 1,000.00

Business Office Supplies $ 3,000.00

Business Office Bank Fees $ 1,000.00

Human Resources Sub $ 4,000.00

Human Resources Advertising $ 5,000.00

Human Resources Dues $ 800.00

Tech Instructional Equipment $ 25,000.00

Tech Course Reimb $ 1,200.00

Tech Training $ 2,500.00
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Tech Repairs and Maint $ 4,500.00

Tech Books $ 500.00

Tech Ink Toner $ 5,000.00

Tech Audio Visual $ 9,000.00

Early Ed Admin Supplies $ 500.00

Curric Supplies $ 10,000.00

Curric Books $ 1,000.00

Curric Dues $ 500.00

Facility Water Sewer $ 700.00

Facility Repair and Maint $ 500.00

Facility Constr Srvc $ 20,000.00

Facility Electricity $ 2,500.00

SEA Facility Snow Removal $ 1,100.00

SEA Facility Constr $ 2,500.00

SEA Facility Telephone $ 500.00

SEA Facility Maint Supplies $ 10,000.00

SEA Facility Propane $ 1,000.00

SEA Facility Equipment $ 5,000.00

$ 119,300.00

Items added at the 5/29/24 Board Meeting

BT CoCurricular $45,000

BT CoCurric. Contr Serv. $1,500

BT CoCurric. Supplies $1,000

SHS Substitute $38,107

BC Intervention $1,039

BC CoCurric. Contr Serv. $2,500

BC Graduation $1,100

Spec. Ed. Tuition Reimb. $45,000

ECSE Tuition Reimb. $4,000

SHS Supplies $6,000

Tech Communication $8,000

SEA Electricity $10,000

BT Tech Ed. Supplies $3,000

Travel & Conf. $62,100

BC Postage $2,250

$230,596
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Vote 4

Reductions: $991,214
Additions: $50,000

Local School District Comparison

District LTWADM Tax Rate
(Discounted)

BUUSD 11,036 $1.08

Montpelier/Roxbury 13,754 $1.29

Echo Valley 10,466 $1.06

Paine Mountain 11,641 $1.17

Orange Southwest 12,847 $1.29

Harwood 15,250 $1.45

Rutland City 12,408 $1.25
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