



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

1 Hourly rate per service/training. If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please enter the HOURLY RATE. If not paid per hour, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the hourly rate in the Comment

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendations
Brandon Villarreal	1	EA	\$40.00	Recommended
Carlos Botello	1	EA	\$50.00	Recommended
Back on Track English Academy	1	EA	\$60.00	Recommended
Winn Innovations (Winn Innovations, LLC)	1	EA	\$65.00	Recommended
Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$65.00	Recommended
Candor Consulting and Diagnostics, LLC	1	EA	\$89.00	Recommended
Trevino Occupational Therapy	1	EA	\$100.00	Recommended
David Mitchell	1	EA	\$110.00	Recommended
CAPS Intervention Academy	1	EA	\$125.00	Recommended
FERNANDO CORNEJO	1	EA	\$125.00	Recommended
South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$125.00	Recommended
Admore Behavioral Therapy	1	EA	\$126.76	Recommended
Autism Education	1	EA	\$225.00	Recommended
Anissa Moore (Anissa Moore Educational & Behavioral Consulting)	1	EA	\$250.00	Recommended
Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$250.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

Hourly rate per service/training. If you are to be paid PER HOUR, please enter the HOURLY RATE. If not paid per hour, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the hourly rate in the Comment

1

Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)						
1	EA	\$250.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$300.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$300.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$350.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$350.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$395.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$400.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$400.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$500.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$500.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$541.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$550.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$553.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$750.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$1,050.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$1,250.00				Recommended
1	EA	\$1,750.00				Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024
RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

2 1/2 day rate per services/training. If you are to be paid 1/2 day rate, please enter the 1/2 day rate. If not paid 1/2 day , please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the hourly rate in the Comment

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendations
Carlos Botello	1	EA	\$250.00	Recommended
Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$260.00	Recommended
Winn Innovations (Winn Innovations, LLC)	1	EA	\$260.00	Recommended
Back on Track English Academy	1	EA	\$300.00	Recommended
Candor Consulting and Diagnostics, LLC	1	EA	\$333.75	Recommended
ValidateME! (VALIDATE ME! LLC)	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
David Mitchell	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
FERNANDO CORNEJO	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
Gregorio Garcia	1	EA	\$700.00	Recommended
Janet Martinez	1	EA	\$900.00	Recommended
Summit K12 Holdings, Inc.	1	EA	\$995.00	Recommended
Gallegos Education Consulting Services	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended
Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

1/2 day rate per services/training. If you are to be paid 1/2 day rate, please enter the 1/2 day rate. If not paid 1/2 day , please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the hourly rate in the Comment

2

Rivera Educational Consulting (Rivera Educational Consulting LLC)	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended
Elliott Quezada	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended
CARE, LLC (Collaborative Autism Resources & Education (CARE, LLC))	1	EA	\$1,200.00	Recommended
247productions	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Trice Education Resources Inc.	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Patricia Valenzuela	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Education, Inc.)	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Rosa Linda Cruz Counseling & Wellness Services, LLC	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$1,700.00	Recommended
Liberty Source	1	EA	\$1,800.00	Recommended
Seidlitz Education	1	EA	\$1,900.00	Recommended
Clarity Center, PLLC	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Ballroom Dance Company	1	EA	\$2,750.00	Recommended
World Class Training	1	EA	\$2,950.00	Recommended
Dina Sabnani	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC (Lakeshore Parent, LLC)	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
Frog Street Press, LLC	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
Seesaw Learning, Inc	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
Catapult Learning West, LLC	1	EA	\$3,750.00	Recommended
Comprehensive Training Center	1	EA	\$4,500.00	Recommended
Curriculum Associates	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
Mike Veny, Inc.	1	EA	\$20,000.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

3 Full day rate per service/training. If you are to be paid PER DAY, please enter the DAILY RATE. If not paid per full day, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the daily rate in the Comment section. A day would be defined as 8 hours, so if the daily rate is less hours, indicate the number of hours that would be billed as a day.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendations
[ALT1] CAPS Intervention Academy	1	EA	\$299.00	Recommended
ValidateME! (VALIDATE ME! LLC)	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
Carlos Botello	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
Bacck on Track English Academy	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
Winn Innovations (Winn Innovations, LLC)	1	EA	\$520.00	Recommended
Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$520.00	Recommended
South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$600.00	Recommended
Candor Consulting and Diagnostics, LLC	1	EA	\$667.50	Recommended
FERNANDO CORNEJO	1	EA	\$800.00	Recommended
David Mitchell	1	EA	\$800.00	Recommended
Gregorio Garcia	1	EA	\$1,200.00	Recommended
Janet Martinez	1	EA	\$1,800.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

3 Full day rate per service/training. If you are to be paid PER DAY, please enter the DAILY RATE. If not paid per full day, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the daily rate in the Comment section. A day would be defined as 8 hours, so if the daily rate is less hours, indicate the number of hours that would be billed as a day.

Rivera Educational Consulting (Rivera Educational Consulting LLC)	1	EA	\$1,900.00	Recommended
CARE, LLC (Collaborative Autism Resources & Education (CARE, LLC))	1	EA	\$2,000.00	Recommended
Elliott Quezada	1	EA	\$2,000.00	Recommended
Galgos Education Consulting Services	1	EA	\$2,000.00	Recommended
Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$2,200.00	Recommended
Anissa Moore (Anissa Moore Educational & Behavioral Consulting)	1	EA	\$2,250.00	Recommended
Kelly Harmon & Associates Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$2,400.00	Recommended
Martha Morales. Consulting	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Intercultural Development Research Association	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Liberty Source	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
The Writing Academy, LLC	1	EA	\$2,540.00	Recommended
Trice Education Resources Inc.	1	EA	\$2,550.00	Recommended
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	EA	\$2,800.00	Recommended
Summit K12 Holdings, Inc.	1	EA	\$2,890.00	Recommended
Rosa Linda Cruz Counseling & Wellness Services, LLC	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended
Patricia Valenzuela	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended
ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Education, Inc.)	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

3 Full day rate per service/training. If you are to be paid PER DAY, please enter the DAILY RATE. If not paid per full day, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the daily rate in the Comment section. A day would be defined as 8 hours, so if the daily rate is less hours, indicate the number of hours that would be billed as a day.

Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended
247productions	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended
School Specialty LLC	1	EA	\$3,150.00	Recommended
Imagine Learning LLC	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
Teach Us Texas (Versidi, Inc.)	1	EA	\$3,600.00	Recommended
Frog Street Press, LLC	1	EA	\$3,650.00	Recommended
Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc.	1	EA	\$3,800.00	Recommended
World Class Training	1	EA	\$3,950.00	Recommended
Seesaw Learning, Inc	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
Next Level Prep	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
DMR Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
frEdTechnology	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company	1	EA	\$4,200.00	Recommended
Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC (Lakeshore Parent, LLC)	1	EA	\$4,500.00	Recommended
Catapult Learning West, LLC	1	EA	\$4,750.00	Recommended
Curriculum Associates	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
Clarity Center, PLLC	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
Dina Sabnani	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
Seidlitz Education	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
Teacher Created Materials, Inc.	1	EA	\$5,500.00	Recommended
Ballroom Dance Company	1	EA	\$5,500.00	Recommended
Instruction Partners	1	EA	\$5,820.00	Recommended
Comprehensive Training Center	1	EA	\$6,500.00	Recommended
Mike Veny, Inc.	1	EA	\$30,000.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

4 Per Event. If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please enter the PER EVENT RATE. If not paid per event, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the per event rate in the Comment section.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Momentum_ED, LLC	1	EA	\$175.00	Recommended
ValidateME! (VALIDATE ME! LLC)	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
Carlos Botello	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$520.00	Recommended
Imagine Learning LLC	1	EA	\$750.00	Recommended
Patricia Valenzuela	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended
Brandon Villarreal	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Back on Track English Academy	1	EA	\$1,500.00	Recommended
Kaplan Early Learning Company	1	EA	\$1,530.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

4 **Per Event.** If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please enter the PER EVENT RATE. If not paid per event, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the per event rate in the Comment section.

Anissa Moore (Anissa Moore Educational & Behavioral Consulting)	1	EA	\$1,800.00	Recommended
Elliott Quezada	1	EA	\$2,000.00	Recommended
Galgos Education Consulting Services	1	EA	\$2,000.00	Recommended
Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$2,200.00	Recommended
Kelly Harmon & Associates Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$2,400.00	Recommended
Next Level Prep	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Dina Sabnani	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)	1	EA	\$2,500.00	Recommended
Rosa Linda Cruz Counseling & Wellness Services, LLC	1	EA	\$3,000.00	Recommended
Trice Education Resources Inc.	1	EA	\$3,500.00	Recommended
[ALT3] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$3,600.00	Recommended
[ALT5] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
[ALT2] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
Crisis Prevention Institute, inc.	1	EA	\$4,499.00	Recommended
World Class Training	1	EA	\$4,950.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

4 Per Event. If you are to be paid PER EVENT, please enter the PER EVENT RATE. If not paid per event, please check NO BID for this line item. This would be the maximum rate that will be paid for services rendered. Quotes may be requested at time services are required. Describe the service(s) that apply to the per event rate in the Comment section.

[ALT4] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$5,000.00			Recommended
Ballroom Dance Company	1	EA	\$5,000.00			Recommended
247productions	1	EA	\$5,000.00			Recommended
College 1st Program (Vision Ed Group)	1	EA	\$5,500.00			Recommended
[ALT6] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$5,700.00			Recommended
Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	\$6,000.00			Recommended
Clarity Center, PLLC	1	EA	\$6,000.00			Recommended
[ALT7] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$7,500.00			Recommended
Teacher Created Materials, Inc.	1	EA	\$8,500.00			Recommended
[ALT8] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$9,500.00			Recommended
[ALT1] HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$10,000.00			Recommended
HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston)						
Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	\$10,000.00			Recommended
[ALT1] Educational Research Institute (ERI Funding Group, Inc.)	1	EA	\$10,000.00			Recommended
Martha Morales. Consulting	1	EA	\$12,000.00			Recommended
Mike Veny, Inc.	1	EA	\$15,000.00			Recommended
Teachstone Inc.	1	EA	\$35,000.00			Recommended
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	EA	No Bid			
The University of Texas at Austin High School	1	EA	No Bid			



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

5	Estimate Travel Expenses : Total fee is inclusive of all expenses, hotel, flight, etc.				
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendations	
Janet Martinez	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Imagine Learning LLC	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
College 1st Program (Vision Ed Group)	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Patricia Valenzuela	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
CARE, LLC (Collaborative Autism Resources & Education (CARE, LLC))	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
247productions	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Lexia Learning Systems LLC	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Region One Education Service Center	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
lead4ward, LLC	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Intercultural Development Research Association	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
World Class Training	1	EA	\$0.00	Recommended	
Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC (Lakeshore Parent, LLC)	1	EA		Recommended	
Catapult Learning West, LLC	1	EA		Recommended	
Autism Education	1	EA	\$25.00	Recommended	
Rivera Educational Consulting (Rivera Educational Consulting LLC)	1	EA	\$100.00	Recommended	
South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$150.00	Recommended	
ValidateME! (VALIDATE ME! LLC)	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended	
Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended	
Kelly Harmon & Associates Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended	



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

5	Estimate	Travel Expenses	:	Total fee is inclusive of all expenses, hotel, flight, etc.	
	Martha Morales. Consulting	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
	Ballroom Dance Company	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
	Brandon Villarreal	1	EA	\$600.00	Recommended
	Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	EA	\$600.00	Recommended
	engage2learn (Engage! Learning, Inc.)	1	EA	\$630.00	Recommended
	friEdTechnology	1	EA	\$750.00	Recommended
	Winn Innovations (Winn Innovations, LLC)	1	EA	\$850.00	Recommended
	Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$1,000.00	Recommended
	Trice Education Resources Inc.	1	EA	\$1,200.00	Recommended
	Next Level Prep	1	EA	\$1,250.00	Recommended
	Mike Veny, Inc.	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

6	Percentage discount on training supplies & materials	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommendations
	Supplier				
	Martha Morales. Consulting	1	EA	20.0%	Recommended
	Clarity Center, PLLC	1	EA	20.0%	Recommended
	Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
	South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
	David Mitchell	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
	Intercultural Development Research Association	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
	Back on Track English Academy	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	The Writing Academy, LLC	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	engage2learn (Engage! Learning, Inc.)	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Winn Innovations (Winn Innovations, LLC)	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Seidlitz Education	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Patricia Valenzuela	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Rosa Linda Cruz Counseling & Wellness Services, LLC	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC (Lakeshore Parent, LLC)	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Ballroom Dance Company	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Candor Consulting and Diagnostics, LLC	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Mike Veny, Inc.	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
	Sharon Wells Mathematics (Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc.)	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	AVID Center	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	College 1st Program (Vision Ed Group)	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Gallegos Education Consulting Services	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	CARE, LLC (Collaborative Autism Resources & Education (CARE, LLC))	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Elliott Quezada	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 6, 2024

RFP# 25-006 Consultant/Contractor Services District-Wide

6	Percentage discount on training supplies & materials						
	HOUSTON EDUCATION LEADERSHIP PARTNERS (Houston Education Leadership Partners, LLC)	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Curriculum Associates	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Imagine Learning LLC	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Instruction Partners	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc.	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	247productions	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Frog Street Press, LLC	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	lead4ward, LLC	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	ValidateME! (VALIDATE ME! LLC)	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Teacher Created Materials, Inc.	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Summit K12 Holdings, Inc.	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Seesaw Learning, Inc	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Education, Inc.)	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Crisis Prevention Institute, inc.	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Lexia Learning Systems LLC	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Knowsys Educational Services, LLC	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Liberty Source	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Savas Learning Company LLC (Gateway Education Holdings LLC)	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Carlos Botello	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Region One Education Service Center	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended
	Janet Martinez	1	EA	0.0%			Recommended