BOARD OF EDUCATION
BALLSTON SPA CENTRAL SCHOOLS
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020

BID ANALYSIS
ITEM BID: 2024-2025 Teaching, Office and Art Supply Bid
DATE ADVERTISED: SARATOGIAN 4/29/2024
DAILY GAZETTE 4/29/2024
DATE OF BID OPENING: 5/29/2024
NUMBER OF VENDORS CONTACTED: 26
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 12

SOURCE OF FUNDS:

BIDDERS:

Please see attached Vendor Mail List

LOW BID: (indicate name and address)

Staples Art Supplies Really Good Stuff
National Art Pyramid Amazon

Quill WB Mason

Blick Cascade

Lakeshore Metco

Award by item to the lowest responsible bidder as per attached

BOARD APPROVAL DATE:



2024-2025 Awarded Bid
Teaching, Office & Art Supplies Bid

Awarded
Item # Description Item # Price Vendor
Catalog Discount
7.5% Lakeshore
35.0% Cascade
7.5% Really Good Stuff
25.0% Amazon
Batteries
1 9 Volt Duracell Battery 2/pk PC1604 $5.20 National Art
2 Duracell Battery - 12 Packs Only
a AA - 12 Pack 479067 §5.21 Staples
b AAA - 12 Pack 479074 $6.24 Staples
c C-12 Pack PC1400 $7.12  Quill
d D - 12 Pack PC1300 $9.83 Quill
Binders
3 Avery Heavy Duty One Touch
EZD View Binder
a 1" Black 79699 $4.45 Quill
b 1" White 79199 S4.68 National Art
c 1" Blue 79809 S4.68 National Art
d 1" Red 79170 S4.68 National Art
4 Avery Heavy Duty One Touch
EZD View Binder
a 11/2" Black 79695 $5.83  Quill
b 11/2" White AVE79195 $6.96 WB Mason
c 11/2" Blue AVE79805 $6.96 WB Mason
d 11/2" Red 79171Q $10.10 Quill
5 Avery Heavy Duty One Touch
EZD View Binder
a 2" Black 2820966 $6.38 Staples
b 2" White AVE79192 $7.96  WB Mason
c 2" Blue 79842 $6.84 Quill
d 2" Red 79225Q $7.08 Quill




6 View Binder - D Ring

w/Pockets Inside Front & Back

Covers
a 1" White AVE09301 $1.48
b 11/2" White AVE090401 $1.63
c 2" White AVE09501 $1.91
d 3" White AVE09701 $3.67
7 View Binder - D Ring

w/Pockets Inside Front & Back

Covers
a 1" Black 374816 $1.48
b 11/2" Black 374813 $1.76
c 2" Black 374810 $2.05
d 3" Black 374809 $2.86
8 Vinyl Looseleaf 3 Ring 374815 $1.48

w/View Front & Back Cover

Pockets

1" White

Index Card

9 3" x 5" - Unruled
a White UNV47200 $0.66
b Blue 112287 $0.75
10 4" x 6" - Unruled

White 121578 $0.89
11 5" x 8" - Unruled

White 121580 $1.25
12 3" x 5" - Ruled
a White UNV47210 $0.64
b Assorted 038377 $1.05

Neon 108787 S0.68
13 4" x 6" - Ruled

White 121579 $0.89
14 5" x 8" - Ruled

White 121581 $1.25

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples

Staples

WB Mason
Cascade

Cascade

Cascade

WB Mason
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade

Cascade



Chalk

15

16

Clays

17

18

Prang - Dustless
White (12/box)
Yellow (12/box)
Assorted Colors (12/box)

Crayola -Washable Sidewalk
Chalk (48 Assorted Colors)
Amaco No 25 White Art Clay

50 Ib - No Substitutes

Lakeshore Non-Hardening Modeling
Clay Bucket (13 Colors/3lbs)

Clips, Fasteners & Rubberbands

23

24

Paper Clips
Regular 1 1/4" (100/box)
Jumbo 3" (100/box)

Binder Clips

Mini 1/4" Capacity (12/box)
Small 3/8" Capacity (12/box)
Medium 5/8" Capacity (12 box)
Large 1" Capacity (12/box)

Butterlfy Clips
#1 11/2" Clip (50/box)
#2 21/2" Clip (50/box)

Velcro Brand 3/4" Sticky Back

Hook & Loop Fastener
Dots - 3/4" Clear (200/pack)
Dots - 3/4" White (200/pack)

Command Hook with 4 Strips
Medium, 2lb Clear 2/pack

Velcro Poster Hanger

703594 $0.36
31344 $0.40
61400 $0.49

51-2048 $3.82

026428 $29.80
RA442 $12.94

201E $0.23

301E $0.54
BC10/UNV10199 $0.26
BC20 $0.25

BC50 $0.60
UNV10220 $1.08
525881 $0.11
1250 $0.83

031375 $11.50

191857BOX $14.32

2495893 $10.18

$2.69
17040QQQ $4.21

Staples
Art Supply
Pyramid

Art Supply

Cascade

Lakeshore

Pyramid
Pyramid

National Art/WB Mason
National Art

National Art

WB Mason

Staples
Pyramid/National Art

Cascade

Quill
Quill

Staples

Quill



25

26

27

28

29

30

31

36

Scotch Removable Mounting
Squares 1" x 1" (16/pack)

Scotch Restickable Dots 7/8"
(18/pack)

Scotch Restickable Tabs 1" x 1"
(R100) (18/pack)

Magnetic Rubber Strips
1/2" x 10' Roll
1" x 10' Roll

Scotch Removable Mounting Putty
20z

Elmer's Adhesive Putty

Reinforcements - Self Adhesive (box)

Push Pins - Clear (100/box)

Looseleaf Rings
1" (100/box)
11/2" (100/box)
2" (50/box)

3" (10/box)

Rubberbands

Size 16 (2 1/2" x 1/16") 1/4 Ib
Size 18 (3" x 1/16") 1/4 1b
Size 18 (3" x 1/16") 1 1b
Size33(31/2"x1/8")1/41b
Size 54 (Assorted)1/4 Ib

Size 54 (Assorted) 1 Ib

Rubberbands 7" x 1/8" - Multicolor
(12/box)

Rubberbands - Assorted 2 oz Bag

634834UNI $1.98
368104 $2.42
030073 $2.29
025598 $3.38
DD735005 $4.95
602158 $1.35
99C302pky $1.39
91200 $0.69
3675 $0.47
1162 $3.15
1804213 $4.19
1798864 $2.85
1804212 $1.46
UNV00416 $0.84
UNV00418 $0.84
UNVO00118 $1.96
UNV00433 $0.84
UNV00454 $0.84
UNV00154 $1.96
121185 $1.03
120190 $0.99

Quill

Staples

Cascade

Cascade
Pyramid

Staples

Pyramid

Pyramid

National Art

National Art
Staples
Staples

Quill

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

Cascade

Cascade



Correction Supplies

37

38

39

40

BIC Wite Out EZ Correct Correction
Tape

BIC Wite out Quick Dry Correction
Fluid

BIC Wite Out Extra Coverage
Correction Fluid

BIC Wite Out Shake N Squeeze
Correction Pen

Computer Accessories & Data Storage

41

42

43

Crayons

H
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Anti-Static Monitor Wipes
Mouse Pads (1/4" x 7 1/2" x 8 3/4")

Flash Drive - Safe-Store 4GB

Crayola Crayons - Boxed
8 Color Set

16 Color Set

24 Color Set

48 Color Set

96 Color Set

Crayola Construction Paper
Crayons Classpack (400/set)

Crayola Refill Packs (8/pack)
Red

Blue

Green

Yellow

Orange

Purple

Black

Brown

BICWOTAPP11 $1.33
BICWOFQD12EA $0.78
BICWOFEC12WE $0.78

450852 $1.61
RR1209 $5.45
125624 $2.24
029534 $2.84
52-3008 $0.36
52-0016 $0.66
52-3024 $0.89
52-0048 $1.95
52-0096 $4.59
1617 $32.34
836-38 $0.87
1142 $0.87
1144 $0.87
1136 $0.87
1134 $0.87
1140 $0.87
1151 $0.87
1107 $0.87

WB Mason

WB Mason

WB Mason

Staples

Pyramid
Cascade

Cascade

Pyramid
National Art
Pyramid
Pyramid
Pyramid

Art Supply

National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
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Envelopes

49

50
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Erasers
52
53

54

55
56

57

White

Gray
Carnation Pink
Peach

Gold

Silver

Crayola Multi-Cultural (24/Pack)

Sakura Cray Pas Junior Artis Set
25 Color Set

White #10 Official 4 1/2" x91/2"
(500/box)

Quality Park Redi-Seal Envelope
#10 Window Contemporary White

Manila Envelopes

6" x 9" Gummed & Clasp (100/box)
9" x 12" Gummed (100/box)

10" x 13" Gummed (100/box)

10" x 13" Clasp/Gummed (100/box)

12" x 15 1/2 Clasp/Gummed
(100/box)

Chalkboard Eraser
Whiteboard Eraser

Multi-Purpose Eraser 2" x 2"
(12 Count)

Cleaning Cloth- NXT Technlogies
Dry Erase Cloths (10/pk)

Expo Wipes (50/Tub)

1153 $0.87
1152 $0.87
1110 $0.87
1133 $0.87
1183/836-83 $0.99
1184/836-84 $0.99
52-0108 $1.19
XEP25 $2.29
787385 $11.81
21318 $26.34
WBM35260 $6.67
194969 $7.90
187039 $11.24
WBM35267 $10.76
472902 $13.58
109924/P/10454 $0.70
ST-104 $0.57
033380 $2.42
24300449 $0.50
034533 $5.02
462515 $4.44

National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art/Pyramid
National Art/Pyramid
National Art

Art Supply

Staples

Quill

WB Mason
Staples
Staples
WB Mason
Quill

Pyramid/National Art
National Art

Cascade

Staples
Cascade

Staples



58

59

60

61

Folders

62
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Expo Whiteboard Spray 8oz Bottle
Pencil Cap Eraser (144/box)

Papermate Pink Pear Eraser
(36/box)

Papermate White Pearl Eraser
(3/pack)

5 1/4" Expanding File- Globe Weis
91/2"x 11 3/4" (Each)

Blue

Green

Red

Yellow

File 1/3 Tab Cut - Leter (100/box)
Manila

Assorted

Blue

Green

Red

Yellow

Orange

Gray

Purple

Reinforced Hanging File Folders
1/5 Letter (25/box)

Green

Blue

Red

Yellow

Orange

Violet

Assorted

Pendeflex Extra Capacity Reinforced
Hanging Box Bottom File Folder
3" Letter Standard Green (25/box)

SAN81803 $1.87
10859 $1.11
024711 $1.05
70624 $1.19

24383661 $4.88

2366397 $3.67

2548672 $3.87

2366396 $3.67
121268 $6.55
022977 $7.78
121639 $8.10
121640 $8.10
121638 $8.10
121641 $8.10
121643 $8.22
433664 $6.66
535559 $6.66
121628 $8.11
121627 $7.18
121624 $9.48
121626 $7.18
121625 $7.18
508368 $16.34
123662 $7.37
418376 $13.69

WB Mason

National Art

Cascade

National Art

Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Staples

Staples

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Quill

Cascade

Staples
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Hanging File Folders 1/5 Cut
Legal - Green (25/box)

Double Pocket Folder w/Fasteners
81/2 x11 (25/box)

Blue

Red

Yellow

Assorted

Double Pocket Portfolio Folders
81/2 x 11 - No Fasteners (25/box)
Red

Light Blue

Dark Blue

Yellow

Green

Burgundy

Assorted

Extra Large 2 Pocket Folders

9" x 12" - No Fasteners (25/box)
Light Blue

Green

Red

Yellow

Assorted

Oxford Portfolio with 8 Colored
Pockets 8 1/2 x 11 Assorted Color
Each

Laminated Oxford Twin Pocket
Folders (25/box)

Green

Navy

Black

Crimson

Gray

Purple

Red

White

121667 $7.83
028180 $5.20
028178 $5.20
028177 $5.20
028176 $5.20
028162 $4.25
028165 $4.25
028164 $4.25
028161 $4.25
028163 $4.25
57557Q $6.28
028160 $4.25
028170 $4.30
028169 $4.30
028168 $4.30
028167 $4.30
028166 $4.30
028281 $0.95
027010 $23.68
027013 $23.68
51706 $17.96
51718Q $23.67
51705 $18.30
027012 $23.68
51711 $17.43
51704 $18.14

Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Quill

Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Quill
Quill
Quill
Cascade
Quill
Quill
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Glue

74

75

76

80

81

Laminated Oxford Twin Pocket
Folders - High Gloss (25/box)
Black

Red

Green

Purple

White

Gray

Oxford Metallic Laminated Double
Pocket Folder (25/box)

Metallic Purple

Metallic Copper

Elmer's All Purpose Glue Sticks
.21 oz Clear (Each)
.77 oz Clear (Each)

Elmer's Extra Strength Glue Sticks
.21 oz (12/pack)

Elmer's Extra Strength Glue Sticks
Washable (4/pack)

Elmer's Classroom Pack .24 oz
Clear Glue (30/pk)
Disappearing Purple (30/pk)

Elmer's Glue All
4 oz Bottle
Gallon

Elmer's School Glue
4 oz Bottle

7 5/8 oz Bottle
Gallon

Elmer's Wood Glue - 8 oz

Rubber Cement w/Brush 4oz
Elementary Level - Teacher Use

OXF51706 $18.56
OXF51711 $18.56
OXF51717 $18.56
OXF51726 $18.56
OXF51704 $18.56
OXF51705 $59.27
027000 $7.26
027003 $7.26
E510 $0.31
E516 $0.84
TT505Z $8.32
EPIE554 $10.16
831987 $8.18
E555 $9.40
EPIE1322 $0.95
E1326 $13.10
EPIE304 $0.71
EPIE308 $1.27
E340 $13.10
120731 §2.91
473595 $1.46

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

Cascade
Cascade

National Art
National Art

Lakeshore

WB Mason

Staples
National Art

WB Mason
National Art

WB Mason
WB Mason
National Art

Cascade

Staples



82

83

84

85

86

Gorilla Epoxy 0.8 oz

Gorilla Super Glue Gel 0.5 oz
Glue Sticks - All Temp (45/pack)
(for glue gun)

Elmer's Glue Gun - Full Size

Super Bonder - All Temp

3M General Purpose 45 Spray
Adhesive 10.2 oz

Index Dividers
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89

90

91

Avery - Ready Index Tab Dividers
Multi-Color

5Tab

8 Tab

10 Tab

12 Tab

Avery 8-Tab Extra-Wide Binder
Dividers Easy Print & Apply Clear
Label Strip w/White Index Maker
Tabs (5 Sets/Pack) AVE11440

Insertable Reference Dividers
Double Gold Reinforced

8 Tab - Multi-Color (8/set)

8 Tab - Clear (8/set)

Tab Dividers 9" x 11"
January - December (12/set)

Avery Plastic Tab Dividers
8 - Tab Multi-Color AVE-23084

23632-1025 $5.58
2681657 $4.46
DT50 $6.00
023745 $7.28
607892 $5.78
AVE111109 $0.49
111111 $0.76
384674 $2.36
11141 $2.63
11440 $21.88
11484 $0.65
11486 $1.05
026844 $3.62
036209 $1.32

Blick

Staples

Metco

Cascade

Staples

National Art/WB Mason
National Art

Staples

Quill

National Art

National Art
National Art

Cascade

Cascade



Ink

Labels

94

95

96

97

98

99

Stamp Pad
Black
Red

Pre-Inked Stamps
"COPY" X-Stamper
"RECEIVED" OffiStamp

Avery Flexible Adhesive Name
Badge Labels 2 1/3" x 3 3/8"
White (400/box)

White Laser Labels
1/2" 13/4" (25 sheets)
1" x 2 5/8" (25 sheets)
2" x 4" (25 sheets)

Avery Easy peel White Mailing
Label 1" x 2 5/8" AVE-5160
30/Sheets)

Avery Press-A-Ply Laser & Inkjet

Labels 2" x 4" (10/sheets)

Avery 2" x 4" Shipping Labels
w/True block - White (250/box)

Avery 5266 File Folder Labels
Assorted

Laminating Materials

100

101

Scotch Thermal Laminating

Pouches 8 9/10" x 11 2/5" Clear 3 Mil

50 Pack
100 Pack

Scotch Laminator Pouches
Letter Size 5 Mil (50/pack)

92220 $1.29
92230 $1.29
2022 $7.74
321598 $2.69
538504 $23.01
5267 $8.90
5260 $8.00
2163 $5.53
AVE30600 $7.26
30603UNI $7.68
771964 $10.23
132778 $7.56
677045 $8.57
MMMTP3854100 $11.41
TP590020UNI $3.61

Pyramid
Pyramid

Quill
Staples

Quill

Quill
National Art
Quill

WB Mason

Quill

Staples

Cascade

Staples
WB Mason

Quill



Markers
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107

108

109

110

111

Sharpie - Ultra Fine - Dozen
Black

Blue

Red

Green

Sharpie - Fine Point - Dozen
Black

Blue

Red

Purple

Berry

Turquoise

Sharpie - Metallic Ink Permanent
Marker Fine Point Silver (4/pack)

Sharpie - Ultra Fine - Marker Sets
12 Color Set
24 Color Set

Sharpie - Fine - Marker Sets
4 Colors

8 Colors

12 Colors

24 Colors

Sharpie - Chisel Tip - Assorted 8 colors

Permanent Marker - Chisel Tip -Black

Dozen

Permanent Marker - Large Chisel
Tip Dozen - Green

Sharpie Flip Chart Marker (4/set)
(Red, Blue, Green, Black)

EXPO Low Odor Dry Erase Marker
Fine Tip - Black (12/pack) 86001

SAN37001 $5.76
SAN37003 $6.00
SAN37002 $6.00
37114 $7.20
SAN30001 $5.76
SAN30003 $6.00
SAN30002 $6.00
30008 $6.80
30128 $8.79
30133 $15.00
39100-4 $4.04
37175 $6.83
SAN75847 $§12.11
30174 $2.49
SAN30078 $4.37
SAN30072 $5.70
SAN75846 $12.23
SAN38250PP $4.63
UNV07051 $2.60
828002 $1.69
SAN22474 $2.39
86001 $6.96

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
National Art

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
National Art
Pyramid
National Art

National Art

National Art
WB Mason

Pyramid

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

WB Mason

Staples

WB Mason

National Art
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113

114

115

116

117

118

119

120

Dry Erase Board Markers - Low
Odor - Chisel Tip (Dozen)

Black (80001)

Red (80002)

Blue (80003)

Green (80004)

EXPO Dry Erase Board Markers -
Low Odor - Chisel Tip

4 Color Set - Assorted (80074)
8 Color Set - Assorted (80678)
12 Color Set - Assorted (80699)

EXPO Dry Erase Board Markers -
Low Odor - Bullet Tip

4 Color Set (82074)

(Blue, Black, Red, Green)

EXPO Dry Erase Marker - Neon
Assorted Pack (5/pack) (17522276)

EXPO Vis A Vis Wet Erase Marker
Black - (12/pack)
4 Color Set - Assorted

Felt Tip Markers - Assorted Color
(12/pack)

Bic Mark It Gripster Permanent
Markers - Fine Tip - Assorted
(12/pack)

Mr Sketch Scented Markers -
Chisel Tip

8 Color Set

10 Color Set

12 Color Set

Mr Sketch Scented Stix Makers -
Fine Tip - 10 Color Set

SAN80001 $5.89
SANS80002 $6.12
SAN80003 $6.12
SAN80004 $6.12
SAN80074 $2.15
5200 $2.59
58-6545 $6.99
SAN82074 $2.19
1752226 $5.76
SAN16001 $8.23
SAN2134341 $2.96
80000 $3.09
GPMAP12-AST $5.99
SAN1905070 $3.19
1905313 $3.64
SAN1905069 $4.35
SAN1905313 $2.78

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

WB Mason
Art Supply
Art Supply

WB Mason

Quill

WB Mason
WB Mason

Pyramid

National Art/Pyramid

WB Mason
National Art
WB Mason

WB Mason
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126

127

128

Paper

129
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Crayola Classic Markers - Broad
8 Color Set
12 Color Set

Crayola Classic Markers - Fine
8 Color Set
10 Color Set

Crayola Bold Marker Set - Broad
(8/Set)

Crayola Classic Orignal Marker
Classpack - Broad (256/pack)

Crayola Washable Multicultural
(24/set)

Crayola Washable Marker
Classpack (200/pack)

Crayola Metallic Markers (8/set)

Crayola Washable Poster Marker
Chisel, Assorted Colors (8/pack)
(58-8173)

Pacon Tru-Ray Construction Paper
9" x 12" - 76lb (50/sheets)
Atomic Blue

Black

Blue

Brilliant Lime

Dark Brown

Dark Pink

Electric Orange

Festive Green

Festive Red

Gray

Holiday Green

Holiday Red

Light Yellow

58-7708 $1.60
509012 $1.81
58-7709 $1.58
58-7725 $1.89
58-7853 $1.95
58-8201 $45.95
58-7802 $4.59
58-8200 $46.70
58-8628 $4.15
874586 $2.80
912345C $2.54
912575C $1.55
PAC103022 $1.73
PAC103432 $1.83
912505C $1.70
912205C $2.36
413113 $2.50
91275C $1.98
PAC103431 $1.68
912555C $1.65
PAC102960 $1.78
PAC102993 $1.68
413103 $2.48

National Art
Staples

National Art
Pyramid

Pyramid

Pyramid

Pyramid

National Art

Art Supply

Staples

Art Supply
Art Supply
WB Mason
WB Mason
Art Supply
Art Supply
Staples

Art Supply
WB Mason
Art Supply
WB Mason
WB Mason
Staples



n Lilac 413099 $1.97 Staples

o Lively Lemon 912255C $2.54  Art Supply
p Magenta PAC103000 $1.81 WB Mason
q Orange PAC103002 $1.68 WB Mason

r Pink PAC103012 $1.68 WB Mason
s Pumpkin 413113 $2.50 Staples

t Purple PAC103019 S$1.73 WB Mason
u Red 826199 $1.31 Staples

v Royal Blue PAC103017 S$1.73 WB Mason
w Shocking Pink 912155C $1.77  Art Supply
X Sky Blue PAC103016 $1.56 WB Mason
y Slate Gray 912565C $1.68  Art Supply
z Turquoise 91285C $1.86 Art Supply
aa Warm Brown PAC103025 $1.55 WB Mason
bb White PAC103026 $1.55 WB Mason
cc Yellow PAC103004 $1.63 WB Mason
dd Assorted PAC103031 $1.84 WB Mason
ee Assorted Brights 032327 $2.19 Cascade

ff Assorted Cool Colors 032329 $2.19 Cascade
gg Assorted Hot Colors 24507230 $7.60 Staples

ii Assorted Primary Colors 413116 $2.36 Staples

jj Assorted Warm Colors 032331 $2.19 Cascade
130 Pacon Tru-Ray Construction Paper

12" x 18" - 76lb (50/sheets)

a Atomic Blue 1218345C $4.86  Art Supply
b Black PAC103061 $2.83 WB Mason
c Blue PAC103054 $3.33 WB Mason
d Brilliant Lime PAC103425 $3.52 WB Mason
e Dark Brown 1218505C $3.30 Art Supply
f Dark Pink 418816 $4.77 Staples

g Festive Green PAC103038 $3.67 WB Mason
h Festive Red PAC103432 $3.08 WB Mason
I Gold PAC102998 $3.04 WB Mason
j Gray PAC103059 $3.04 WB Mason
k Holiday Green PAC102961 $3.42 WB Mason

I Holiday Red PAC102994 $3.21 WB Mason
m Light Yellow No Bid liscontined

n Lively Lemon 1218255C $4.86 Art Supply
o] Magenta PAC103032 S$3.46  WB Mason
p Orange PAC103034 $3.21 WB Mason
q Pink PAC103044 $3.24 'WB Mason




r Purple PAC103051 $3.31 WB Mason
s Red 894715 $2.21 Staples
t Royal Blue PAC103049 $3.33  WB Mason
u Sky Blue PAC103048 $3.04 WB Mason
v Turquoise PAC103039 $3.48 WB Mason
w Warm Brown PAC103057 $2.94 WB Mason
X White PAC103058 $2.71 WB Mason
Y Yellow PAC103036 $3.16 WB Mason
z Assorted Brights 032328 S$4.32 Cascade
aa Assorted Cool Colors 032330 $4.32 Cascade
bb Assorted Pastel Colors No Bid
cc Assorted Primary Colors 1218005C $3.81  Art Supply
dd Assorted Warm Colors 032332 S$4.32 Cascade
131 Pacon Tru-Ray Construction Paper
18" x 24" - 76lb (50 sheets)
a Black 1824575C $6.95 Art Supply
b Blue 1824335C $8.19  Art Supply
c Brilliant Lime 016081 $8.67 Cascade
d Holiday Green 035226 $8.67 Cascade
e Holiday Red 035227 $8.67 Cascade
f Magenta 029766 $8.67 Cascade
g Orange 182435C $7.86  Art Supply
h Sky Blue 1824215C $6.96  Art Supply
i White 035236 $6.60 Cascade
j Yellow 182455C $7.24  Art Supply
k Assorted 1824005C $8.96 Art Supply
132 Pacon Tru-Ray Construction Paper
24" x 36" - 76lb (50/sheets)
a Black 826097 $9.39 Staples
b White 812546 $12.31 Staples
133 Pacon Multicultural Construction 3670R $2.70  Art Supply
Paper 12" x 18" (50 Sheets)
134 Paper-81/2 x 11 20lb (500/ream)
a Light Green WBM22201GN S$4.82 WB Mason
b Light Blue WBM22201BE $4.82 WB Mason
C Light Pink WBM22201PK $4.82 WB Mason
d Bright Orange 490881 $9.21 Staples
e Bright Blue 490955 $9.21 Staples
f Bright Green 490879 $9.21 Staples
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Bright Yellow
Salmon
Orchid
Canary

Astrobrights Paper - Card Stock
81/2 x 11 65Ilb (250/pack)

Gravity Grape
Gamma Green
Vulcan Green

Outrageous Orchid

Re-Entry Red
Terrestrial Teal
Celestial Blue
Fireball Fushia
Lift Off lemon

Planetary Purple

Pulsar Pink
Stardust White
Plasma Pink
Rocket Red
Blast-Off Blue
Solar Yellow
Venus Violet
Lunar Blue
Eclipse Black
Martian Green
Cosmic Orange
Orbit Orange
Terra Green

Sunburst yellow
Happy Assortment
Brights Assortment
Vintage Assortment

Astrobrights Paper - 24lb (500/pk)

81/2x11
Cosmic Orange
Lunar Blue
Solar Yellow
Terra Green
Fireball Fuschia
Rocket Red

490954 $9.21
678824STP $4.20
EAGL22201LV $5.02
WBN22201CY $4.82
WAU21971 $12.94
495483 $11.31
2657429 $11.83
WAU21951 $12.94
477582 $9.81
WAU21855 $12.94
WAU22861 $12.94
22881UNI $12.24
508038 $11.31
679891 $10.88
495484 $11.31
22408 $13.96
812508 $10.88
508041 $11.31
21911UNI $12.20
477580 $9.51
WAU22091 $12.94
477581 $9.51
WAU2202401 $12.94
WAU21811 $12.94
495481 $9.51
22761UNI $12.87
404620 $9.51
2657426 $12.81
507445 $6.69
24447811 $15.53
22003 $14.14
491617 $8.03
WAU22521 $10.60
491164 $8.03
507430 $8.53
634645 $10.69
560490 $10.29

Staples
Quill

WB Mason
WB Mason

WB Mason
Staples
Quill

WB Mason
Staples
WB Mason
WB Mason
Quill
Staples
Staples
Staples
Quill
Staples
Staples
Quill
Staples
WB Mason
Staples
WB Mason
WB Mason
Staples
Quill
Staples
Quill
Staples
Quill

Quill

Staples
WB Mason
Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples
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Blast-Off Blue
Gravity Grape
Outrageous Orchid
Vulcan Green
Stardust White
Martian Green
Pulsar Pink

Plasma Pink

Galaxy Gold

Venus Violet
Gamma Green
Planetary Purple
Celestial Blue

Lift Off Lemon
Happy Assortment
Neon assortment
Brights Assortment
Cool Color Assortment
Vintage Assortment

Card Stock - 67lb (250/pack)
White
Blue
Green
Cream
Yellow
Pink
Orchid
Tan
Buff
Canary

Southworth Fine Parchment Paper
8 1/2 x 11 24Ib Stock - Ivory
(500/pack)

Graph Paper 8 1/2 x 11 - White
4 Boxes/Inch (Ream)

Graph Paper - Double Sided -

81/2 x 11 - White 1/2" Rule
(500/pack)

5 Subject Notebook - College Ruled

WAU21906 $10.60
366203 $9.09
WAU21946 $10.60
WAU21859 $10.60
WAU22301 $10.60
WAU21801 $10.60
491620 $8.82
WAU22119 $10.60
WAU22571 $10.60
WAU22081 $10.60
WAU22541 $10.60
507438 $9.17
WAU22661 $10.60
507437 $8.82
507445 $13.38
733097 $11.91
2657389 $15.62
2657434 $15.32
507444 $12.15
490882 $5.96
81042 $10.05
490886 $6.48
620700 $7.06
758875 $11.63
24582659 $10.36
958668 $15.95
620700 $7.06
490885 §7.25
490884 $6.91
479057 $18.86
111306 $4.82
720364 §7.25
167634 $3.44

WB Mason
Staples
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
Staples
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
Staples
WB Mason
Staples
Staples
Staples
Quill

Quill
Staples

Staples
Quill

Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples
Staples

Staples

Cascade

Staples

Staples
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149
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152

Legal Ruled Pads 8 1/2" x 11 3/4"
Canary (dozen)
White (dozen)

Jr Legal Ruled Pads 5" x 8"
Perforated Top - Canary (dozen)

Steno Books 6" x 9" Spiral - Dozen

Looseleaf Notebook Filler
81/2" x 11" - College Ruled
3 Hole Punch (100/sheets)

Filler Paper 8" x 10 1/2"
Red Margin 3/8" Ruling
3 Hole Punch (100/sheets)

Composition Book - Skip-A-Line
93/4"x73/4"

Grade 1 - Green (48 pages)
Grade 2 - Blue (100 pages)
Grade 3 - Red (100 pages)

Roaring Springs Composition
Notebook - Black
81/2" x 7" (48 sheets)

Flexible Cover Marble Composition
Book 8 1/2" x 7" (48 sheets)

Primary Composition Notebook
93/4" x71/2" (100 sheets)
Drawing & lllustrating Space
(Top of Each Page) & Writing
Space on Each Page (Bottom)

Marble Black Composition Book
93/4" x 7 3/4" - Flexible Wide
Rule Red Margin Lines

(48 leaves/96 pages)

Marble Black/White Composition

163840 $6.49
005226 $6.32
163832 $2.20
163485 $5.51
580509 $2.51
326530STP
108824 $1.26
017375 $0.69
108799 $0.75
108806 $0.75
018733 $0.59
018733 $0.59
127173 $1.08
73-2400 $0.94
73-2100 $1.04

Book Ruled 9 3/4" x 7 1/2" Hard Cover (200 Pages)

Staples
Cascade

Staples

Quill

Quill

Quill

Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade

Cascade

Staples

National Art

National Art



153

154

155

156

157

158

159

160

161
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Sentence Strips - Rainbow Assorted

24" x 3" 11/2" Ruled (100/pack)

Sentence Strips - White 1 1/2"

Guideline Ruled 24" x 3" (100/pk)

Easel Pads Flip Chart 27" x 34"
Ruled (50/sheets)

Easel Pads Flip Chart 27" x 34"
Unruled (50 sheets)

Unruled Chart Tablet 24" x 32"
White - 25 sheets/pad

1" Lined Chart Tablet
24" x 32" - 25 sheets/pad

Newsprint Drawing Paper 30lb
18" x 24" (50 Sheets)

Scratch Pads - Colonial White
4" x 6" (100 sheets/pad) Dozen

Telephone Message Pad
11" x 5 1/2" Carbonless
(400 sheets/pad)

Post It Notes - Original - Canary
11/2" x2" (12/pack)

3" x 3" (12/pack)

3" x 5" (12/pack)

4" x 6" Lined (12/pack)

Post It Notes - Ultra Colors
11/2"x2" (12/pack)
3" x 3" (5/pack)

Pot it Notes - Neon Colors
11/2"x2" (12/pack)

3" x 3" (5/pack)

4" x 6" Lined (3/pack)

166378 $2.30
131121 $2.03
V44976 $20.18
019596 $7.17
030769 $3.50
166393 $3.50
R330157 $4.42
163444 $3.74
745400 $4.08
6539/MMM6539YW $1.19
6549 $2.29

6559 $3.58

6609 $6.58
653-AV/MMMG653AU $5.25
130927 $5.24
653-AN $5.18
167216 $5.24
MMM6603 $6.20

Cascade

Cascade

Quill

Cascade

Cascade

Cascade

Art Supply

Staples

Quill

National Art/WB Mason

National Art/Pyramid

National Art
National Art

National Art/WB Mason
Cascade

National Art
Cascade
WB Mason
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Post It Notes - Pastel Colors

11/2" x2" (12/pack) 653-AST $5.39
3" x 3" (12/pack) 6549A $2.42
Post It Notes-11/2" x 2"

(12/pack)

Marseille 490633 S5.78
Post It Notes 3" x 3" (12/pack)

Bali No bid

Helsinki 654RPA $14.20
Jaipur 034576 $15.10
Post It Note - Cubes

3" x 3" - Blue Wave 599337 $17.51
3" x 3" - Aqua Wave 565769 $1.94
3" x 3" - Seafoam Wave 650741 $13.79
Post it Flags (100/pack)

Standard Page

Yellow 680YW $3.70
Green 680GN $3.84
Blue 680-BE $4.00
Orange 026803 $3.24
Bright Pink 680-BP $3.70
Bright Green 680-BG $4.00
Bright Blue 379116 $3.91
Bright Purple 680-BP/680PE $4.00
Post It Page Markers

1" x 3" Assorted Bright Colors 130929 $2.23
(200/pack)

1/2" x 2" Assorted Bright Colors 431996 $3.85
(500/pack)

Post It Tabs - File Tabs - Lined 026813 $5.00
1"x11/2" Green/Blue/Red

22 Each Color 66 Tabs 1 Dispenser

Pacon Fadeless Art Paper 12" x 18" 5750-4 $7.63

Assorted (60 Sheets)

National Art
National Art

Staples

Quill
Cascade

Staples
Staples
Staples

Quill

Quill

National Art/Pyramid
Cascade

National Art

National Art/Pyramid

Staples
National Art/Pyramid/Qu

Cascade

Staples

Cascade

Art Supply
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178

179

180

181

Fadeless Art Paper Roll 24" x 60'
Apple Green

Canary

Brown

Brite Blue

Orange

Violet

White

Flame

Pink

Tracing Paper Pads - 25Ib
9" x 12" (50 sheets/pad)

Watercolor Paper 90lb - (50 sheets)
9" X 12"
12" x 18"

Drawing Paper - 70lb (500/ream)
Extra White Sulphite

9" x 12"

12" x 18"

Drawing Paper - 90lb
White Sulphite

9" x 12" (500/ream)
12" x 18" (500/ream)
18" x 24" (500/ream)

Tissue Paper 20" x 30"
Assortment (100/pack)

Spectra Deluxe Bleeding Tissue
Paper 12" x 18" Assorted Colors
(100/pack)

Yasutomo Student Oragami Paper
Classpacks - (500/pack)
6" X 6"

Tagboard - Medium Weight
Manila
9" x 12" (100/sheets)

115677 $8.17
115673 $8.17
115710 $8.17
109511 $8.17
115675 $8.17
109514 $8.17
115666 $8.17
115668 $8.17
115691 $8.17
030783 $1.92
09605-1123 $8.86
V52287 $14.76
3173R $8.23
PAC3409 $12.61
PAC104082 $10.77
24545669 $18.49
PAC104084 $39.94
5851-6 $8.77
5953-0 $4.46
63258-1006 $11.95
111767 $3.27

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade

Blick
Quill

Art Supply
Quill

WB Mason
Staples

WB Mason
Art Supply

Art Supply

Blick

Cascade



182 9" Paper Plates (100/pack) 721666 $2.42 Staples

183 White Facial Tissues - Flat Box 24538575/MRC293030BX $0.89 Staples/WB Mason
(100/box)

Paints & Glazes

184 Crayola Watercolor Set -
a 8 Color 53-0525 $1.55 Pyramid
b 16 Color 53-0555 $2.25 Pyramid

185 Crayola Artista Il Liqguid Washable
Tempera Paint - Quart (320z)

a Black 3132-51 $3.70 National Art
b Orange 3132-36 $3.70 National Art
c Violet 3132-40 $3.70 National Art
d Peach 3132-33 S4.80 National Art
e Blue 3132-42 $3.70 National Art
f Brown 3132-07 $3.70 National Art
g Red 3132-38 $3.70 National Art
h White 3132-53 $3.70 National Art
i Yellow 3132-34 $3.70 National Art
j Green 3132-44 $3.70 National Art
k Magenta 3132-69 $4.80 National Art
I Turquoise 3132-48 $3.70 National Art

186 Crayola Premier Tempera Paint

Quart (320z)
a Yellow 1232-34 $4.70 National Art
b Red 14185 S4.70 National Art
C Orange 1232-36 S4.70 National Art
d Green 1232-44 S4.70 National Art
e Turquoise 1232-48 $4.70 National Art
f Magenta 1232-69 $7.00 National Art
g Brown 1232-07 S4.70 National Art
h White 1232-53 S4.70 National Art
i Yellow 1232-34 S4.70 National Art

187 Tempera Paint - Quart (320z)
a Black - Prang 104875 $2.32 Cascade
b Purple - Prang 104873 $2.42 Cascade
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AMACO Teachers Palette Glazes
Classpack #3 12 Pints

(Gray TP, Sky Blue TP, Blue Green
TP, Caramel TP, Fudge Brown TP,
Mint Green TP, Grape TP,
Raspberry TP, Pig Pink TP, Brick
Red TP, Lemon TP & Carrot TP)

AMACO Teachers Palette Glazes
Classpack #5 12 Pints

(Coal Black, Cotton, Midnight Blue,
Medium Blue, Robin's Egg, Frog
Green, Granny Smith, Green Leaf,
Lilac, Scarlet, Maize & Pumpkin)

Pencils & Sharpeners

190
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192

193

194

195

196
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Papermate Sharpwriter Mechanical
Pencil #2 Lead (Dozen)

Dixon Ticonderoga #2 Pencil
#1388 (Dozen)

Ticonderoga Beginner Pencil #2
Eraser Tip (Dozen)

Prismacolor Ebony Pencils
Graphite (12/pack)

Prismacolor Colored Pencils
72/pack

Prismacolor Scholar Pencil Set
48/set

Prang Colored Pencil Set
24 Assorted Colors
Classpack (250/Pencils)

Crayola Colored Pencil Set
12 Assorted Color
24 Assorted Color
36 Assorted Color
48 Assorted Color

30476-XXX6 $174.48 Blick
30476-XXX6 S$174.48 Blick
303013 $3.12 National Art
499392 $1.19 Staples
13308 $3.33  Quill
14420 $4.18 National Art
2070334 $43.15 Quill
92807 $19.38 National Art
424772 $31.53 Staples
68-4012 $1.28 National Art
68-4024 $2.39 Pyramid
68-4036 $3.69 Pyramid
68-4050 $5.89 Pyramid
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Pens
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Classpack (240 Pencils)

Crayola - 8 Multicultural Color
Pencil Set

Handheld Manual Single Hole
Cylinder Pencil Sharpener

X-Acto Boston 1799 Powerhouse
Heavy Duty Electric Pencil
Sharpener

Pencil Sharpener - Vertical -
Electric 6"H x 4"W

X-Acto Ranger #55 Manual
Pencil Sharpener

Single Hole Pencil Sharpener
Classpack Assorted Colors (24/pk)

BIC Ultra Round Stic Grip Ballpoint
Pen 1.2mm (dozen)

Black

Blue

Red

Purple

BIC Cristal Ballpoint Pens 1.0mm
Medium - Dozen

Black

Blue

BIC Gelocity Quick Dry Retractable
Gel Pen - Dozen

Black

Blue

BIC Gelocity Pen Med Pt (0.7)
Retractable - Assorted
8/set

68-7506 $26.95
4208E $1.20
211672 $0.25
E1799 $23.65
380806 $10.71
24497200 $9.40
2622134 $3.14
BICGSMG11BK $1.56
BICGSMG11BE $1.56
BICGSMG11RD $1.56
BICGSMG11PE $1.86
BICMS11BK $1.63
BICMS11BE $1.63
RLC11BK $6.39
RLC11BE $5.96
2625469 $8.25

Pyramid

Art Supply

Staples

National Art

Staples

Staples

Quill

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

WB Mason
WB Mason

Quill
Quill

Quill
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BIC Velocity Ballpoint Pens
Black (dozen)
Blue (dozen)

Papermate Flexigrip - Fine - Dozen
Black
Blue

Papermate Flexigrip - Medium
Dozen

Black

Blue

Papermate Ink Joy Gel Pens
Medium Point (0.7mm) Assorted
14/pack

Papermate Flair Medium - Dozen
Black

Blue

Red

Green

Papermate Flair Felt Tip Pens
Medium Point Assorted 8/pack

Papermate Flair Ultra Fine - Dozen
Black

Pilot Easytouch Retractable
Ballpoint Pen - Medium Clear
Black

Blue

Pilot G2 Fine Point - Dozen
Black

Pilot G2 0.7mm - Dozen
Black

Blue

Red

Green

BICVLGB11BK $4.94
BICVLGB11BE $4.94
85582 $7.89
85583 $7.89
85580 $8.16
85581 $8.16
2722428 $13.22
PAP8430152 §7.29
PAP8410152 $7.29
PAP8420152 §7.29
PAP8440152 $7.29
PAP89061 $5.89
PAP8330152 $9.19
32220 $6.89
32011 $6.88
026252 $13.52
G27BK $9.40
424575 $9.52
G27RD $9.24
G27GN $11.09

WB Mason
WB Mason

Pyramid
Pyramid

Quill
Quill

Quill

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason

WB Mason

WB Mason

Pyramid
Quill

Cascade

Quill
Staples
Quill
Quill
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Punch

224
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Rulers

226

227

Uni-Ball Vision - Fine - Dozen
Black
Majestic Purple

Uni-Ball Signo 207 Retractable Gel
Pen - Medium - Dozen

Black

Blue

Secure A Pen

Secure A Pen - Replacement Pen
Fine Point

BIC Brite Liner Grip Highlighter
Chisel Tip

Yellow - Dozen

5 Color Pack (Pink, Orange, Green,
Blue & Yellow)

Sharpie Accent Tank Style
Highlighter - Dozen
Yellow

Blue

Orange

Green

Pink

Assorted Pack - 6/pack

Swingline Heavy-Duty Lever
Handle 3 Hole Punch

1 Hole Punch w/Grip 1/4" Hole

12" Plastic Ruler 1/16" - Dozen

6" Plastic Ruler - Each

60126 $13.24
60382 $14.87
33950 $10.80
33951 $10.80
123007 S0.80
No Bid
BICBLMG11YW $3.57
BL51W-AST $1.97
SAN25005 $4.20
SAN25010 $4.20
SAN25006 $4.20
SAN25026 $4.20
SAN25009 $4.20
024583 $2.13
74030 $17.79
1292 S0.75
24538667 $0.91
031950 S0.56

Quill
Quill

National Art
National Art

Cascade

WB Mason
National Art

WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
WB Mason
Cascade

National Art

National Art

Staples

Cascade



Scissors
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Fiskars 8" Precision Bent Scissors

Scotch 8" Precision Straight
Scissors

Westcott Bonded Titanium
Non-Stick 7" Scissors - Pointed

Fiskars Scissors - Universal Handle
5" Blunt

5" Pointed

Caddy w/12 Pointed Scissors
Caddy w/12 Blunt Scissors

Sheet Protectors

232

233

234

Top Loading Reinforced Strips
w/Binding Edge 8 1/2 x 11
Premier (50/box)

C-Line Sheet Protectors - Top
Loading 8 1/2 x 11 (100/box)

Dry Erase Pocket 10 Pockets
Assorted Colors

Stapler, Staples & Staple Remover

235

236

237

238

239

Swingline 747 Business Stapler
Black

Swingline Stapler Soft Grip
Handheld Stapler Heavy Duty

Bostitch Impulse 30 Sheet
Electric Stapler

Swingline SF4 Staples (5000/box)

Swingline Heavy Duty Staples
3/8" Length (1000/box)

24380498 $4.15
1408 $1.36
14851Q $12.24
153520 $0.68
105580 $0.68
194300-1070 $19.50
57027-1009 $15.29
487791 $1.94
022936 $2.69
031238 $5.70
SWI174701 $8.02
29950 $12.59
02210 $26.39
112284 $0.57
587393 $1.62

Quill

National Art

Quill

National Art
National Art
National Art
Blick

Staples

Cascade

Cascade

WB Mason

National Art

Quill

Staples

Staples
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Tape
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247

248

249

250
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Bostitch B8 Staples

Staple Remover

Scotch Magic Tape
1/2" x 1,296' Roll
3/4" x 1,296' Roll

Scotch Transparent Tape
3/4" Roll

Scotch Masking Tape
1/2" Roll

3/4" Roll

1" Roll

2" Roll

Scotch 2090 Blue Painters Tape
1x60

Scotch Book Tape
2" Roll

3" Roll

Scotch Indoor Mounting Tape
1/2" x 75" Roll

Scotch Packing Tape Dispenser
2/2 Rolls of Tape (2/pack)
1.88" x 54.6yds

Scotch 3850 Heavy-Duty Tape
Refills (6/pack)
1.88" x 54.6yds 3" Core Clear

Carton Sealing Tape
2" x 55yds Roll

Filament Strapping Tape
1" x 60yds

STCRP2115/14 $1.79
1111384 $0.39
MMM810121296 $1.46
310-3140/MMM81034129¢  $1.95
765004 $1.11
2600.1/2/MMM260012A  $0.90
0.3/4/2600-18/MMM2600 $1.05
2600.1 $1.31

2600.2 $2.68

2090-1 $3.57

845-2 $4.60

845-300 $6.95

110 $2.38

38502ST $17.42

483072 $4.08
3710/230992 $1.09
688666 $2.80

Pyramid

Pyramid

WB Mason

National Art/WB Mason

Quill

National Art/WB Mason
National Art/Pyrmid/WB |

National Art
National Art

National Art

National Art
Pyramid

National Art

Quill

Staples

National Art/Pyramid

Quill
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Tape Dispenser - 1" Core
Non-Skid Base

Transparencies

253

Transparency Film - Copier
w/Removable Sensing Strip
(100/pack)

Miscellaneous Office/Teaching Supplies

254

255

256

8 Digit Battery/Solar Calculator

Clipboard 12 1/2" x 9" Letter Size
11/2" Capacity

Gloves - Vinyl - Non-Latex - Box
Small

Medium
Large

Craft Supplies

257

258

259
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Craft Paper Bags - Flat Bottom

Assorted Colors - 28/pack
Small-6" x 11"

Craft Bags - Flat Bottom - White
6" x 11" - 100/pack

Chenille Craft Stems - 100/pack
12" Assorted

12" Black

12" Brown

12" Dark Green

12" Red

12" Dark Blue

12" White

Jumbo Stem Multi-Purpose
Pipe Cleaner 1/4" x 12"
Assorted - Sparkle 100/pack

123221 $1.35
10-110 $23.95
120125 $1.50
1671406 $0.79
24471543 $2.84
170613 $2.73
24471546 $4.10
034149 $11.48
GW6590 $10.40
7112-A/1218841 $1.09
7112-BIL $1.09
7112-BR $1.09
7112-GN $1.09
7112-RD $1.09
7112-BE $1.09
7112-WH $1.09
711601 $2.76

Cascade

Pyramid

Cascade

Staples

Staples
Cascade
Staples

Cascade

Metco

National Art/Pyramid

National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art
National Art

Art Supply
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270
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Jumbo Craft Sticks - 500/box
6"x3/4" x 1/12"

Wood Economy Non-Toxic Craft
Stick - Natural 4 1/2" x3/8" x 1/2"
(1000/box)

ColorSplash Assorted Shapes
Decorating Foam Assorted Sizes &
Colors 800/pack

ColorSplash Non-Toxic Foam
Sheet 9" x 12" Assorted Bright
Colors (10/pack)

Natural Feather Assortment
(150/pack)

Wiggle Eyes
12mm
15mm

Assorted Sizes - Black & White
Assorted Sizes - Assorted Colors

Pony Beads - Multicolor - Opaque
(850/pack)

Pom Poms - Assorted 1/2" to 3"
(1200/bag)

Foil - Aluminum 12" x 75' Roll
Foil - Aluminum 36 Gauge 10' Roll

Sealable Art Cup - Clear - Medium
3.250z (100/pack)

Art Cup Lids - Clear - Medium
3.250z (100/pack)

Happy Birthday Pencils

Happy Birthday Crowns

25370 $5.57
66510/169930 $4.79
LC2831 $12.02
026092 $5.40
163022 $1.53
024763 $1.05
179699 $1.20
179698 $1.54
124413 $1.86
184102 $3.84
24011905 $14.38
1501 $14.38
169827 $5.20
P325 $13.62
P3256 $9.90
24391521 $0.38
24507156 $0.63

Art Supply

Pyramid/Cascade

Lakeshore

Cascade

Cascade

Cascade
Cascade
Cascade
Cascade

Cascade

Staples

Metco
Cascade

Metco

Metco

Staples

Staples
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Mini Dry Erase Boards 16x11

Polyester Sponges - Large
6" x41/4"x11/2"

Calendars & Planners

277

278

279

Desk Pad Planner - 16 Month
17" x 22" Blotter Non-Refill
September 2023 - December 2024

Class Record & Lesson Plan Book
81/2" x 11" 7 Subject/9-10 Week

Period Lesson Plan Book
8 Period (40 Week)

M1116 $7.20
ACS663 $1.49
24545367 $2.99
119850 $4.73
LL949 $16.22

Metco

Pyramid

Staples

Cascade

Lakeshore



2024-2025 Vendor Mail List - Teaching, Office & Art Supplies

Quiill Corp

300 Tri State International Dr Ste 300
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
800-982-3400

800-789-8955 Fax

bid@quill.com

Metco Supply

81 Kiski Ave

Leechburg, PA 15656
822-521-8844
deanna@metcosupply.com

Standard Stationery Supply
2251 Foster Ave
Wheeling, IL 60090
847-870-1335

S & B Office Supplies
17 Wood Road Unit 700
Round Lake, NY 12151
518-877-9500

National Art & School Supplies
2195 Elizabeth Ave

PO Box 1134

Rahway, NJ 07065

Bid Dept

732-381-5001
levy@nationalartsupplies.com
gitty@nationalartsupplies.com

Cascade School Supplies
1 Brown Street

PO Box 780

North Adams, MA 01247
800-628-5078

School Specialty

140 Marble Drive

Lancaster, PA 17601

888-388-3224 800-675-1775 fax
bideastnotices@schoolspecialty.com

Pyramid School Products
6510 N 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610
800-792-2644
biddept@pyramidsp.com

WB Mason Co
29 Mill Street
Albany, NY 12204



888-926-2766
jason.foote@wbmason.com

Lakeshore Learning Materials
2695 E Dominguez St

Carson, CA 90895
310-537-8600
biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

Nasco Education

901 Janesville Ave

Fort Atkinson, WI 53538
800-558-9595
800-372-1236 Fax

S & S Worldwide

Bids Dept

PO Box 513
Colchester, CT 06415
800-642-7654 ext 4800
860-537-2563 Fax
bids@ssww.com

Blick Art Materials

PO Box 769

Galesburg, IL 61402-1769
800-704-7744
800-621-8293 Fax
sales@dickblick.com

Art Supplies Wholesale
4 Enon Street

Beverly, MA 01915
800-462-2420
978-922-1495 fax
info@allartsupplies.com

Excelligence Learning Corporation

Really Good Stuff

5 Research Drive Suite 150

Shelton, CT 06484

203-261-7920

203-268-1796 Fax

800-466-1935
ReallyGoodStuffSales@ReallyGoodStuff.com

epeters@excelligence.com

ODP Business Solutions

9501 Amberglen Blvd Ste 200
Austin, TX 78729

Lisa Sanchez



lisa.sanchez@odpbusiness.com
512-872-4907

The Bach Company
760 San Antonio Road
Palo Alto, CA 94303
800-248-2224

Larry Bach
Accounting@edtg.com

Education Intelligence Inc
PO Box 773

White House, TN 37188
615-972-1856

JP Das
ipdas@eii-usa.com

Staples

125 Mushroom Bivd
Rochester, NY 14623

John Simatovich
John.Simatovich@staples.com

Allied Solution Enterprise

300 Veterans Way

Carmel, IN 46032

1-877-328-4432
contracts@alliedsolutionenterprise.com

Book Source

1230 Mackind Avenue
Saint Louis, MO 63110
800-444-0435

Jennifer Held
jheld@booksource.com

Savvas
proposals@savvas.com

RYE Consulting
Jess Hopkins
jhopkins.ryeconsulting.com

Moby Max Education LLC
Cheryl Sarafin
rfp@mobymax.com

Shachihata

20775 S Western Ave
Suite 105

Torrance, CA 90501
jw@biddesk.com
mclemente@xstamper.com

Amazon



deviemil@amazon.com
Emily Devin
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