



F5-9	Pepper, Jalapeno Sliced Reference Brand: Packer	6#10	10	DEL SOL	209918	DS00115		6#10	6	\$ 29.310	10	\$293.10	\$	4,885.00	Our House	6934	HS572	----	6-#10	6	\$ 22.260	10	\$222.60	\$	3,710.00	LAS PAL	4510830	7463348	6 / #10	6	\$ 64.360	10	\$643.60	10,7267	
F5-10	Pickle, Chips, Dill 1/8" thin crinkle cut, gallons Reference brand: Kruger, Homemade, Cylfair, Heinz	4/1 gal	10	MRS KLEIN PICKLE	249294	65041		4/1GAL	4	\$ 26.960	10	\$269.60	\$	6,740.00	Kruger	1615	KR18111	----	4-1GAL	4	\$ 21.530	10	\$215.30	\$	5,382.50	BBRLCLS	4368140	664BB	4 / 1 GAL	4	\$ 26.040	10	\$260.40	6,5100	
F5-11	Olives, sliced Reference Brand: Choice, Del Destino	6#10	2	JACKPOT	209849	OLIVE601		6#10	6	\$ 48.190	2	\$96.38	\$	8,031.77	Ambrosia	2730	16914	----	6-#10	6	\$ 43.600	2	\$87.20	\$	7,267.00	AREZIMP	5875990	5875990	6 / #10	6	\$ 60.120	2	\$120.24	10,0200	
F5-12	Pineapple Chunks, Grade B in Juice USA Made Reference brand: Dole	6#10	10	DOLE	248708	389000468		6#10	642	\$ 49.970	10	\$499.70	\$	0,0778	Ambrosia	4912	19063	----	6-#10 107oz	642	\$ 34.260	10	\$342.60	\$	6,0514	DOLE	2604570	1473	12 / 20 OZ	240	\$ 20.270	\$0.00	0,0845		
F5-13	Sauce, Soy Reference: Nippon	64.7	60					MFG DISC						Lucky	6729	712646	Market	4-1GAL 128oz	512	\$ 18.410	52.87	\$973.34	\$	6,050.00	JDMTCLS	7179125	13009D0179	6 / 64 FOZ	384	\$ 37.090	\$0.00	0,0966			
F5-14	Sauce, Soy Garlic Glaze Reference: Nippon	64.7	60	NIPPON SHOKKEN	254752	696		64.7LB	714	\$ 94.330	60	\$5,659.80	\$	0,1421	Nippon	901207	000696	Special Order	6-4.7#	714	\$ 94.540	60	\$5,672.40	\$	0,1324	STARPOR	7145296	444	4 / 1 GAL	512	\$ 117.470	53	\$6,225.91	0,2294	
F5-15	Sauce, Teriyaki Reference: Nippon	64.9	60	NIPPON SHOKKEN	239365	3		64.9LB	29	\$ 41.640	60	\$2,498.40	\$	1,4163	Nippon	7167	00003	----	6-4.9#	29	\$ 41.730	60	\$2,503.80	\$	1,4194	NIPPON	0801403	3	6 / 4.9 LB	29	\$ 48.370	60	\$2,902.20	1,6452	
F5-16 *	Sauce, Spaghetti	6#10	60	CHH	210250	1018		6#10	6	\$ 23.210	60	\$1,392.60	\$	3,8683	Our House	1781	H6029	----	6-#10	6	\$ 21.430	60	\$1,285.80	\$	3,5717	SYS CLS	7219277	#####	6 / #10	6	\$ 35.700	60	\$2,142.00	5,9500	
F5-17 *	Sauce, Marinara	6#10	10	CHH	210249	41297		6#10	6	\$ 23.210	10	\$232.10	\$	3,8683	Our House	6609	H5609	----	6-#10	6	\$ 22.260	10	\$222.60	\$	3,7100	FULLRED	7189296	1.081	6 / #10	6	\$ 38.210	10	\$382.10	6,3683	
Category 6 Dairy Products																																			
F6-1	Cheese, Parmesan Shredded Reference brand: Arrezzo, Messina, Rumiano	10# bag	50	PACKER LABEL GREEN MOUNTAIN	305578	24144-5/492137		4.5LB	20	\$ 90.660	25	\$2,266.50	\$	4,5330	Lakeview	605345	605345	Market	4.5#	20	\$ 69.400	25	\$1,735.00	\$	3,4790	GR LAKE	7256869	35745	2 / 5 LB	10	\$ 45.550	50	\$2,277.50	4,5550	
F6-2	Cream Cheese, Cup Plain 1 oz Reference brand: Philadelphia, Raskas, Smithfield, Hahn, BBRIMP	100 case	670		300211	FG83405		100-1OZ	100	\$ 21.830	670	\$14,626.10	\$	0,2133	Raskas	13278	13278	Market	100-1OZ	100	\$ 24.860	670	\$16,656.20	\$	0,2486	WHLFLS	4807432	STK13517	100 / 1 OZ	100	\$ 29.250	670	\$19,597.50	0,2925	
F6-3	Yogurt, Tube Strawberry, 1M Reference brand: Yoplait	96 case	585	YOPLAIT	305575	49295	1M	96ZOZ	96	\$ 32.800	585	\$19,188.00	\$	0,3417	Yoplait	49293	49295	.5MMA	96-2OZ	96	\$31.90	\$ 585.00	\$18,661.50	\$	0,3323	YOPLAIT	4850588	70470-49295	96 / 2.0 OZ	96	\$ 31.34	585	\$18,333.90	0,3365	
Category 7 Lunch: Center of the Plate																																			
F7-1	Burger, Vegetarian, 2MMA Reference brand: Morning Star	48 case	700	MORNING STAR	144043	28989-10409	2MMA	48-2.5OZ	48	\$ 31.970	700	\$22,379.00	\$	0,6660	Morning Star	1890	10409	2MMA	48-2.5oz	48	\$ 31.960	700	\$22,372.00	\$	0,6658	MORNSTR	2324978	2898997325	48 / 2.25OZ	48	\$ 37.690	700	\$26,383.00	0,7852	
F7-2	Corn dog, Chicken IW Reference: Foster Farms	96 ct	150	FOSTER FARMS	409717	94124		96-4OZ	96	\$ 69.480	150	\$10,422.00	\$	0,7238	Foster Farms	6292	94124	2g, 2MMA	96-4oz	96	\$ 70.200	150	\$10,080.00	\$	0,7090	FOSTRFM	7212405	95157	72 / 4 OZ	72	\$ 46.000	200	\$9,212.00	0,6397	
F7-3	Dumplings, Chicken and Vegetarian, 2MMA/1G WG Reference brand: Schwans	8/2.5lb case	490	SCHWANS FOOD	141458	60585	2MMA/1G	8/2.5LB	20	\$ 63.170	490	\$30,953.30	\$	3,1585	Chef One	1995	60585	2MMA/2G	384-83oz	20	\$ 62.980	490	\$30,860.20	\$	3,1490	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID / NO BID	NO BID					
F7-4	Hot dog, Beef 6", 2MMA Reference brand: Millers	80 svgs	340	MILLERS	140080	5968	2MMA	2.5LB	80	\$ 46.090	340	\$15,670.60	\$	0,5761	Millers	3348	5268	2MMA	80-2oz	80	\$ 41.800	340	\$14,212.00	\$	0,5225	MILLER	1552561	5268	1 / 10 LB	80	\$ 43.550	\$0.00	0,5444		
F7-5	Vegan Nuggets 2M Reference brand: Morning Star	50 svgs	570	MORNING STAR	110671	381631/97762	2MMA	212-76 OZ	53	\$ 50.130	570	\$28,574.10	\$	0,9458	Rebellyous	1854	KNFC212	2MMA	265-6oz	53	\$ 42.380	570	\$24,156.60	\$	0,7996	MORNSTR	7338718	2898997762	212 / 75OZ	53	\$ 50.150	570	\$28,585.50	0,9462	
F7-6 *	Vegan Meatball 2M Reference brand:	50 svgs	570	CONAGRA	141484	74267-00071	2MMA	50-3EA	50	\$ 50.130	570	\$28,574.10	\$	1,0026	Dr. Praeger's	MMBIN	Special Order	208-75oz	52	\$ 34.170	548	\$18,725.16	\$	0,6671	SMPLYPB	5122507	73473064134	1 / 10LB	56	\$ 49.490	\$0.00	0,8838			
F7-7	Chicken Nuggets Gluten Free Reference brand: Mr. Sips	10#	2	MR SIPS	139700	543033/300433		2.5LB	29	\$ 63.470	2	\$126.94	\$	2,1896	Mr.Sips	1560	300433	IG, 2.5MMA	10#	29	\$ 63.500	2	\$127.00	\$	2,1897	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID / NO BID	NO BID					
F7-8	Noodles, Chow Mein, Frozen WG Vegetarian, Pre-cooked Reference brand: AMOY, Ling's, Chef's Corner, Fortune	20#	50	CHEF CORNER	134302	0FC-2192		6.5LB	153	\$ 64.730	34	\$2,200.82	\$	0,4231	Yang's	6131	003016	2G	14#	80	\$ 33.800	72	\$2,433.60	\$	0,4225	FORTUN	6496590	FF3855	8 / 3 LB	24	\$ 41.750	42	\$1,753.50	1,7396	
F7-9	Pupusas, Cheese, Bulk 1 MMA/2G Reference brand: Del Real	40	140	DEL REAL	303556	705	1MMA/2G	8/5CT	40	\$ 47.620	140	\$6,666.80	\$	1,1905	Del Rael	900473	702	Special Order	40-5.5oz	40	\$ 46.470	140	\$6,505.80	\$	1,1618	DELREAL	3346691	705	8 / 5 CT	40	\$ 49.260	140	\$6,896.40	1,2315	
F7-10	Rice, Vegetable Fried Frozen WG Reference brand: Minh	6/5#	836	MINH	143962	59372		4/3LB	12	\$ 52.590	2090	\$109,913.10	\$	4,3825	Minh	1037	69074	2G	6-5.1#	30	\$ 51.650	836	\$43,179.40	\$	1,7217	YANGS	7133636	8.52724e+11	1 / 28 LB	28	\$ 77.280	896	\$69,242.88	2,7600	
F7-11	Sandwich, Soy Butter & Strawberry Jelly IW 1M/1G - Custless 2.4 oz Reference brand: Abie's	72 case	760	ALBIES FOODS	134543	607	1M/1G	72-2.4OZ	72	\$ 50.380	760	\$38,288.80	\$	0,6097	Abie's	907558	609	IG, 2.5MMA	72-2.4oz	72	\$ 57.880	760	\$43,988.80	\$	0,8039	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID / NO BID	NO BID					
F7-12	Tamale, Chicken and Cheese in Red Sauce Bulk 2MMA/2G Reference Brand: Del Real	48	435	DEL REAL	138025	767	2MMA/2G	48-5OZ	48	\$ 51.900	435	\$22,576.50	\$	1,0813	Del Rael	7435	767	2G	48-5oz	48	\$ 52.860	435	\$22,994.10	\$	1,1013	DELREAL	3822424	767	12 / 4CT	48	\$ 51.150	435	\$22,250.25	1,0656	
F7-13	Taquitos, Beef Bulk, Gluten Free Reference Brand: Michael B's Bestway	100	5	MICHAEL B'S	140397	BTB61		100-2.2OZ	100	\$ 54.670	5	\$273.35	\$	0,5407	No Bid												NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID / NO BID	NO BID				
Category 8 Assorted Frozen & Refrigerated Items																																			
F8-1	Beef, Carne Azteca Reference Brand: Lowers Food	10lb	40	LOWER FOODS	TBD	CASISTCA		10LB	10	\$ 106.680	40	\$4,267.20	\$	10,6680	Carne Azteca	901208	TACO10125 CA	Special Order	10#	10	\$ 40.620	40	\$1,624.80	\$	4,0620	CAZTECA	7182230	CASISTCA	4 / 2.5 LB	10	\$ 91.350	40	\$3,654.00	9,1350	
F8-2	Ranch Dressing, Buttermilk Ranch Reference: T Marzetti	4/1gal	12	KRAFT HEINZ	TBD	1002100643544		4/1GAL	4	\$ 56.870	12	\$682.44	\$	14,2175	Marzetti	7040	83796	----	4-1Gal	4	\$ 55.360	12	\$664.32	\$	13,8400	MARZETI	4278073	80060	4 / 1 GAL	4	\$ 55.620	12	\$667.44	13,9050	
F8-3	Cesar Dressing, Bulk Reference brand: Cardini's, T. Marzetti	4/1gal	12	KENS FOODS	201316	827		4/1GAL	4	\$ 68.490	12	\$821.88	\$	17,1225	Marzetti	7031	80508	----	4-1Gal	4	\$ 67.910	12	\$814.92	\$	16,9775	MARZETI	5458019	80508	4 / 1 GAL	4	\$ 68.310	12	\$819.72	17,0775	
F8-4	Egg Patties, Scrambled 3.5" Reference Brand: Papetti's	120/1.5oz	20	MICHAEL FOODS	406921	14616-70202-00		120-1.5OZ	120	\$ 35.060	20	\$701.20	\$	0,2922	Abbotsford	600346	70202	1.25MMA	120-1.5oz	120	\$ 33.910	20	\$678.20	\$	0,2826	ABBTBFD	5064183	14616-70202-00	120 / 1.5 OZ	120	\$ 33.580	20	\$671.60	0,2798	
F8-5	Paperroni, bulk Reference brand:	10lb	5	BONICI	100562	10050140269		10LB	10	\$ 45.020	5	\$225.10	\$	4,5020	Armour	1666	22021	Market	10#	10	\$ 43.810	5	\$219.05	\$	4,3010	AREZIMP	2544831	4831-071	1 / 10 LB	10	\$ 44.070	5	\$220.35	4,4070	
Category 9 Breakfast: Center of the plate																																			
F9-1	Bagel, Plain Frozen IW, 3 oz WG Sliced 2G, Ovenable packaging List available flavors Reference brand: Tony Roberts	72 case	960	TONY ROBERTS	PLEASE SEE ATTACHED LIST FLAVORS	19322 60012	2G	72/3OZ	72	\$ 28.680	960	\$27,532.80	\$	0,3983	No Bid												BKRSCLS	4383071	28001	12 / 6 CT	72	\$ 21.880	960	\$21,004.80	0,3039
F9-2	Bread Slices, Banana, IW WG 2G, 4oz List available flavors Reference brand: Integrated	54	544	INTEGRATE D	134413	CS9104	4G	54-4OZ	54	\$ 54.420	544	\$29,604.48	\$	1,0078	Integated	2301	CS9104	2G	54-4oz	54	\$ 54.470	544	\$29,631.68	\$	1,0087	ENER-G	3392471	EF3006	6 / 14 OZ	21	\$ 60.080	350	\$21,028.00	2,8610	
F9-3	Breakfast Bar, Mini Teen Pack, IW 2G Reference brand: Sky Blue Bakery							MFG DISC						MFG Disc												KELLOGG	5523816	3800035745	48 / 1.3 OZ	48	\$ 24.790				

