

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FINISH	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	FUN & FUNCTION TOTAL PRICE	JT HOMES TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
F06	FireKing Classic Lateral File Cabinet - 1-Hour Fire-Rated & High Security - 4 Drawers	FireKing	KU: 4-4422-XX	TBD	52 3/4 Hx44 1/2 Wx22 1/8 D	3	NO BID	\$27,720.00	\$19,440.00
M12	Manhasset Symphony Stand Black Box of 6 (13 packs of 6 each =78 stands)	Manhasset		Finish: N/A	20"x12.5"x26"-48"	13	NO BID	\$9,893.00	\$1,001.00
M14	Manhasset Music Stand Cart	Manhasset	1910	Finish: N/A	92"lx22"wx43"h	3	NO BID	\$2,991.00	\$1,395.00
M19	Prang mobile classroom art cart	Cassie Stephens Prang			41.5"L x 28"W x 36"H	2	NO BID	\$5,358.00	NO BID
ME01	Clinton Hardwood Leg couch	Clinton	3620-27	TBD	783/4 X471/4X817/8"h	2	NO BID	\$2,248.00	\$1,108.00
ME02	Chrome base stool with round foot ring	Clinton Chrome Base Stool	2102	TBD	14" Seat dia. 19.5" Base dia. 18.5"-25.5" Height range.	1	NO BID	\$324.00	\$174.00
ME03	Clinton Family Practice Table with Step Stool	Clinton	8890	TBD	28.5"wx58"/72" ext. lengthx31" h StepStool19.5"wx16.875"dx7.75"h	1	NO BID	\$2,006.00	\$1,099.00
ME04	Harloff M-Series Standard Width Short Emergency Crash Cart Five Drawers with Breakaway Lock	Harloff M-Series	H-MDS3024B05	TBD	36.75"wx22"dx37.25"h	1	NO BID	\$3,151.00	NO BID
ME05	Clinton Mobile Bedside Cabinet	Clinton	8720	TBD	17.25"wx15.75"dx29.25" h	3	NO BID	\$2,652.00	\$1,593.00
OT-4	Therapro Norco Therapy Ball	Norco Therapro	CS56803		17 3/4" dia.	1	\$22.78	\$56.00	\$30.00
OT-5	Therapro Norco Therapy Ball	Norco Therapro	CS56804		21 1/2" dia.	1	NO BID	\$58.00	\$43.00
OT-6	Therapro Norco Therapy Ball	Norco Therapro	CS56805		25 1/2" dia.	1	\$26.66	\$372.00	\$53.00
OT-7	Therapro Norco Therapy Ball	Norco Therapro	CS56806		29 1/2"	1	\$30.54	\$379.00	\$58.00
OT-8	Southpaw Climbing Ladder Tower Ladder, Top Safety Snap, (2) mat straps and (4) quick clips	Southpaw	1200		17"w x 90"H	1	NO BID	\$734.00	\$600.00
OT-9	Frog Swing	Southpaw	1925		56"h	1	\$40.73	\$765.00	\$606.00
OT-10	Southpaw Snuggle Swing	Southpaw	120005		64"L	1	\$315.72	\$310.00	\$278.00

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FINISH	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	FUN & FUNCTION TOTAL PRICE	JT HOMES TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
OT-11	Southpaw Moon Ball Swing	Southpaw	120175		22"wx60"h	2	NO BID	\$1,534.00	\$1,496.00
OT-12	Southpaw Moon Swing	Southpaw	140D2		18"diax48"L	1	NO BID	\$423.00	\$393.00
OT-13	Southpaw Flexion Disc Flexion Disc Swing	Southpaw	1909		24"diax35"H	1	NO BID	\$1,167.00	\$597.00
OT-14	Southpaw Bounce Disc Heavy-Duty Bounce Disc	Southpaw	151171		36"dia x 6.167"H	1	\$203.69	\$840.00	\$854.00
OT-15	Southpaw Therapy Rope	Southpaw	150		6'L	1	\$96.99	\$61.00	\$34.00
OT-16	Southpaw Height Adjuster w/Safety Snap	Southpaw	5000			3	\$404.49	\$642.00	\$564.00
OT-17	Southpaw Safety Snap	Southpaw	100		4"H	15	\$509.10	\$5,715.00	\$345.00
OT-18	Southpaw Safety Rotational Device	Southpaw	2000		7"H	3	\$152.73	\$726.00	\$324.00
OT-19	Southpaw Resistance Tunnel	Southpaw	3970		15'L	1	\$40.73	\$367.00	\$352.00
OT-20	Southpaw Peek-A-Boo I- see-U Tunnel	Therapro	256015		19"diax6"L.	1	\$34.91	\$83.00	\$84.00
S12a	Fomcore Armless Series Curved Bench 30	Fomcore	F108	Grade 1 Fabric	31"wx34.75"dx 16" Seat height	10	NO BID	\$17,100.00	\$9,820.00
S12b	Fomcore Armless Series Curved Sofa-In	Fomcore	F020	Grade 1 Fabric	31"x67"x33" Seat height =16"	1	NO BID	\$5,243.00	\$3,113.00
U4	Grasshopper Bench	Landscapeforms		TBD	63" l x 18" d x 18" h	8	NO BID	\$20,360.00	\$23,208.00
U5	Strata Beam Table	Landscapeforms		TBD	87" l x 37" d x 31" h	1	NO BID	\$4,300.00	\$5,550.00